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Divorce billionaire heiress chapter 2606-Wen Xiang smiled, and seeing that Su 
Yifeng was in a better mood, she stood up and went to the kitchen, “ 

I’ll go see what I’m going to prepare for tonight, will you come back tonight?” 

Su Qi responded with a smile, “Sister-in-law, don’t be busy, she’s afraid that pregnancy 
will change her mind.” Fat, I have to think about everything I enter for a long time.” 

The atmosphere gradually improved. 

in the car. 

Fu Yechuan received a call from Chen Mian. 

“The appraisal result came out?” 

Su Yifeng’s result here was not smooth, but the other appraisal results were all smooth. 

“Yes, there is no one we are looking for.” 

Chen Mian’s words made the atmosphere in the car completely cool down. 

Ning Yue’s eyes dimmed slightly. 

She was a little disappointed. 

In this way, their hope still falls on Su Yifeng. 

Fu Yechuan grabbed Ning Yue’s hand, 

“Don’t worry, there will be a solution.” Ning Yue nodded, “I don’t think Su Dong is that 
kind of person.” 

His sons and daughters are in harmony. 

A rare wealthy family. 

Things were on hold for two days. 

Ning Yue’s body recovered quickly. 



With the scar removal products sent from abroad, Ning Yue couldn’t even see the scars 
after using them. The light pink color meant that she was recovering. 

Ning Zhenzhen disappeared. 

The uncle and aunt of the Ning family finally sensed something was wrong and came to 
Ning Yue. 

Ning Yue couldn’t sit still. After her health recovered, her biological father over there had 
no clue, so she could only follow up with Xiao Chen about the bar. 

The eldest aunt directly found the location of the new bar. 

Ning Yue is checking the wine category list with Xiao Chen. 

The eldest aunt came over, different from the previous domineering, and finally with a 
little bit of caution. 

She probably also knew that today was different from the past, and that Ning Yue would 
not be easy to mess with Fu Yechuan’s influence. 

“Ningyue, the eldest aunt is here, and she has nothing else to do. Zhenzhen hasn’t 
been home for a long time. Since I came back from your wedding, we haven’t contacted 
her again, and there is no reply to my calls and messages. 

I I’m a little worried about her, do you know where she went?” 

Xiao Chen came over with a glass of water, looked at Ning Yue’s impatient expression, 
and didn’t say anything. 

There is no rejection of customers, it is their professional habit. 

Ning Yue twitched the corners of her mouth, “Auntie, how would I know? I was still at 
the wedding at the time, and I couldn’t see Ning Zhenzhen at all. It’s really strange, she 
came back with you, and you couldn’t find her , but came to ask me?” 

The aunt’s face was awkward, “I just asked casually, maybe she went back again.” 

Ning Yue looked at the aunt with cold eyes, “So you know that she has returned to the 
wedding scene?” 

The auntie paused, as if she realized that she had slipped her mouth, she covered her 
mouth in a panic, “I… I just doubt it.” 

“I don’t know her whereabouts, but auntie, I have a question to ask You.” 



“Tell me.” 

“Do you know who my real father is?” 

The aunt was taken aback for a moment, her face changed, “How would I know who 
your real father is? The old man has kept your background very well , we only started to 
suspect it after you returned from abroad, and then we heard the old man talk about it 
by accident, and he didn’t deny it, so we were sure.” 

Ning Yue lowered her eyes, not knowing what she was thinking. 

She twitched the corner of her mouth, “I don’t know where Ning Zhenzhen is. You are 
asking the wrong person. I still have things to do. Please go ahead! 

” I know, otherwise I wouldn’t have allowed the old man to love you so much before, 
but… but I heard the old man said before that your biological father is a powerful 
person, he seems to be an executive of a large group, otherwise you can’t take it Your 
mother cheated you!” 

Ning Yue raised her eyelids, her face indifferent, 

“I want to see my mother’s things, do you know where it is?” 

“I know, your parents’ things were left by the old man when they got married In the villa, 
no one has lived in that villa for a long time, and it can’t be sold at a good price. Buy. 
I’ve been worrying about this for a long time, won’t it just fall into my hand? You can go 
to see it.” 

The aunt couldn’t wait to say, “It’s best to take all your parents’ things away. The old 
man’s will has already been given to us, you can’t take it away.” 

Seeing Ning Yue’s ugly face, she added with a smile, “You are Mrs. Fu now, if you don’t 
want anything, naturally you don’t like that poor house. It’s gone, right?” 

Ning Yue stood up with her bag in her hand, “Xiao Chen, I’ll go, you’re here to watch.” 

“Don’t worry, but are you alone? Or find someone to go with you?” 

Xiao Chen looked Glancing at the eldest aunt, she was always uneasy. 

Ning Yue glanced at her aunt, smiled and said, “Don’t worry, I’ve already told Fu 
Yechuan to pick me up there.” 

The aunt’s face froze slightly, and then she smiled again, “Don’t worry, what can I do? 
But can you ask Boss Fu to help me find out where Zhenzhen is? Boss Fu should take 
care of this little matter.” Easy work, right?”  



Ning Yue smiled, “Okay.”  

The auntie breathed a sigh of relief, “Okay, okay, let’s go to the villa first.”  

As soon as Ning Yue got into the car, she sent a message to Fu Yechuan. 

She is not someone who disregards her own safety, so be careful. 

Ning Yue has no memory of the villa where Ning Yue’s parents lived before. 

She was raised by the old man. Yes, everything was brought by the old man. 

But when she stood at the door, the overgrown courtyard wall, and the courtyard that 
had been left unattended for a long time, she seemed to return to the past for a 
moment. 

Those things that were suppressed in the deep memory The emotions seem to be 
drawn out. 

The walls of the villa are covered with green plants, covering the mottled walls with 
verdant greenery. 

Those mossy bricks and painted windows seal the long-sinking inside. The past. 

The door was locked. 

The aunt anxiously unlocked the door, “It’s all rusty, what’s going on? “ 

Ning Yue stood there, looking at the swing frame in the yard, as if she saw her little self 
sitting on it for a moment, a gentle, generous and intellectual woman with a smile on her 
face, bending over to support the little child. 

Sunset Under the western mountain, the twilight light enveloped the whole person, and 
the picture in the memory was frozen. I don’t know if it’s true or not. I don’t know when 
her tears fell out, but I felt an inexplicable sadness in my heart. 

That kind of indescribable, sudden The sadness made her feel very uncomfortable. 

It was as if her chest was pounded heavily by those dusty memories. 

The aunt was relieved in front, “It finally opened, and asked someone to change the lock 
later. 

She turned her head to look at Ning Yue, Ning Yue lowered her eyes to hide her 
emotions, then walked in with her head down. 
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