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Chapter 361 Don’t Come Here 

Fu Yechuan was silent for a while, his eyes were sour, his heart seemed to be 
entangled by thin threads, and he had difficulty breathing. 

Su Nan followed him with no respect at all. 

Every time I think about it, it’s suffocating. 

Su Nan doesn’t care anymore. She knows very well that those three years were a self-
impression for her, and she rushed forward with a solitary voice. 

When it’s over, it fades away. 

“Su Nan…” 

Fu Yechuan stared at her, his eyes were dark and sour, and he felt that he couldn’t 
breathe when he saw that she was speaking calmly. 

His hands were clenched into fists, and he said with difficulty and obscure, “It won’t 
happen again in the future.” 

He will put her in the most important position, take care of her carefully, and dare not 
show any slights. 

Su Nan just smiled without any reaction. 

They have no future. 

In those clear and clean eyes, there will never be a shadow of him again. 

Su Nan picked up the cup and took a sip of tea. 

“Let’s talk about the main point.” 

After all, she didn’t come here to listen to his useless nonsense. 

Fu Yechuan lowered his eyes, narrowed his brows, and for a moment only lowered his 
head, his emotions gradually faded away. 

He smiled and slowly opened his lips: 



“The reason why Jiang Cheng is so confident is because he has caught a line.” He 
raised his 

head and looked at Su Nan: “Shang Qian’s housekeeper.” 

Su Nan frowned in surprise, ” Butler?” 

Fu Yechuan nodded, “Although he is only a butler, Shang Qian trusts him very much, 
and sometimes he can influence Shang Qian’s decision with a few words.” 

“Isn’t that the same as…” Isn’t it similar to the 

eunuch? 

Su Nan hesitated, but Fu Yechuan smiled and continued: 

“This housekeeper comes to Z country to do business for Shang Qian, and he always 
meets with Jiang Cheng, because Jiang Cheng’s mother is the housekeeper’s adoptive 
mother.” 

Su Nan was shocked . Looking up, there is still such a relationship? 

No wonder Jiang Cheng dared to use all his wealth to give his son Jiang Xuan this 
opportunity! 

If this housekeeper is so important in front of Shang Qian, then getting this cooperation 
is a sure bet. 

She took a deep breath, it seemed that she was really in danger this time! 

When the food was served, Fu Yechuan’s tone relaxed. 

“Let’s eat first.” 

Su Nan looked at a few dishes, which were exquisite and beautiful, but had no appetite. 

Fu Yechuan served her dishes with public chopsticks, and Su Nan stepped back to take 
back the tableware. 

“I’ll just do it myself.” 

Fu Yechuan’s hand stopped in the air, paused, and put it down gently. 

“Okay.” 



She didn’t eat anything in the morning. Although she didn’t have any appetite, she ate a 
lot. 

On the contrary, Fu Yechuan didn’t eat much and kept watching her eat. 

He sat there, looking at Su Nan’s gentle eyebrows, beautiful and could not bear to break 
it. 

He didn’t even understand that he had told Su Nan all the secret materials he had finally 
dug up, in exchange for having a meal with her? 

Such a humble act, just to please her? 

Also worth it! 

Fu Yechuan knew why he became like this. Since he couldn’t change, he could only 
accept himself like this and sink step by step. 

I don’t know when it was raining lightly outside. 

The raindrops hit the landscape pool, and the splashing water and the fish jumped and 
rejoiced together. 

Seeing that she had almost eaten, he got up. 

“I’ll take you back.” 

Su Nan stopped him, “Fu Yechuan, you don’t need to waste your time on me.” 

Her resistance was obvious. 

With her, there is no further possibility. 

Fu Yechuan was wearing a dark gray coat and was proud and slender. 

He said it lightly, as if he really didn’t care. 

“Waste it, waste it, I’m willing.” 

He clearly had a lot of things waiting to be dealt with behind him, but he was still here 
patiently accompany her to eat and decrypt. 

Fu Yechuan felt that he must be possessed! 

⋯ 



Chapter 362 He doesn’t pick up trash 

Chapter 362 He doesn’t pick up rubbish 

Su Group. 

Su Nan intends to discuss with Su Jin about Shang Qian. 

As soon as I entered, I saw a familiar woman sitting in the reception area. 

Xu Minghui! 

She also saw Su Nan. 

Xu Minghui’s face was gray and sallow, and there were obvious slap prints on her face. 
She ran over a few steps and was stopped by the security guard. 

“Stop…” 

Xu Minghui looked at her eagerly, “I don’t do anything, I just ask if Qin Ming’s contact 
information can be given to me, I thought about it, I should return the money to him …” 

Su Nan couldn’t help laughing, Xu Minghui’s face stiffened. 

“Give it to me, I’ll hand it over.” 

Su Nan reached out and raised an eyebrow. 

If it wasn’t for Wei Cheng changing his bride and Xu Minghui’s disguise broken, would 
she be able to repay the money in a hurry? 

It’s false that she pays back the money and wants to hook up with Qin Ming, the only 
son of SW Group. Is it true that the old love is revived? 

Xu Minghui was stunned, “I want to give it back to him in person.” 

Su Nan stepped forward, “You know my relationship with him, and you still asked me for 
his contact information, because you have nowhere to go, right?” 

Xu Minghui was taken aback by her words Excited, he looked up at her suddenly. 

But she didn’t dare to start with Su Nan, what was she? 

“I guess you don’t have these hundreds of thousands in your hands. You were dumped 
by Wei Cheng, and you are going to start thinking about the next person?” 



Su Nan was straightforward, and Xu Minghui became angry. 

“I don’t!” 

Su Nan raised an eyebrow, Xu Minghui gritted her teeth and held back. 

“I just wanted to apologize to him.” 

Su Nan took out her phone, “Okay, I won’t interfere in your troubles, you wait.” 

Xu Minghui’s eyes lit up. 

Su Nan called Qin Ming directly. 

After a few beeps, he picked it up. 

“Miss Su Nan, what are you doing?” 

Xu Minghui’s expression was taken aback for a moment, she glanced at Su Nan, and 
then concealed her lost gaze. 

Su Nan: “Hey, Miss Xu is waiting for me in my company. I want your contact 
information. If you want to pay back the money, can I give it?” The 

other party was silent for more than ten seconds. , a spontaneous coldness and disgust. 

Qin Ming slowly opened his lips, and his voice became obviously colder. 

“Just give you the money, just treat it as the cleaning fee for dirtying your company’s 
floor.” 

With a bang, Xu Minghui’s bag fell to the ground. 

Her voice choked sadly. 

“Qin Ming, I know it was my fault in the past, I’m sorry for you, can you give me a 
chance, I want to tell you in person…” 

Qin Ming’s voice was terribly cold, and he could hear it as soon as he heard it Out of Xu 
Minghui’s purpose. 

“Do you think I am a garbage collection station? I don’t pick up garbage!” 

Xu Minghui wanted to say something, but Qin Ming interrupted her. 

“Su Nan, I’m busy, call back.” The 



next second, he hung up the phone. 

Su Nan looked at Xu Minghui with light eyes, and took back the phone. 

“Have you heard?” 

She was impatient with this woman. 

“Miss Su, can you… help me?” 

Su Nan glanced at her with a hint of sarcasm in her tone. 

“Where did you get such a big face?” 

After she finished speaking, she turned around and went to the direction of the elevator, 
while instructing the security guard. 

“Ask the person out, or go to the police station.” 

“Yes!” 

Su Nan went upstairs and went directly to Su Jin, telling him everything he knew from 
Fu Yechuan. 

Su Jin was silent for a full minute before he smiled suddenly. 

“Fu Yechuan is quite confident.” 

“Huh?” 

“He is sure you will lose…” 

Otherwise, why would he tell you? 

Su Nan looked at his own brother speechlessly, dare he be watching the fun all the 
time? 

“It’s about my wealth, I have to win.” 

Su Jin took out a letter from the drawer. 

“I just found out what you said before you came back. 

I have an address here, which is where this housekeeper frequents every time he 
returns to China.” 



Su Nan took a look and frowned. 

“Playground?” 

⋯ 

Chapter 363 I’m going to live with her 

Chapter 

363 She is going to live with her. Su Nan has an appointment with a group of people, 
but no one really wants to accompany her to the playground. 

Qin Yu and Ning Zhi refused very simply! 

She could only bring Su Xiaohu out. 

In order to disguise it, she changed it into a big orange cat’s clothes, which really looked 
like a cute kitten. 

Su Xiaohu was lying in her bag, sticking his head out from time to time. 

“Wow, I also want to play a Trojan horse…” 

“I also want to play a roller coaster…” 

… 

Su Nan: “You have to calm down, you are a tiger!” 

Su Nan Xiaohu was wronged and pulled her 3 million bag. 

“Aim…” 

Su Nan couldn’t help laughing and patted its head, “Good…” 

She came here for business, she didn’t get the housekeeper’s In the photo, it is 
estimated that he should be slightly older, so he has been staring at the older man. 

But the people here don’t look like it, because they all come with children… 

Su Nan walked around, and suddenly a person wearing a doll clothes ran over and 
hugged her leg, “Pretty sister. ……” 

Su Nan was startled, listening to the voice, like an eight or nine-year-old boy. 



“You… Who are you?” 

She looked around. Has anyone lost a child? 

“It’s me, beautiful sister, why don’t you remember me?” His voice was young and lost. 

Su Nan: “…” 

She reached out and tapped the doll hood on his head, “Little lion?” 

“Ah!” 

He suddenly remembered something, and was in a hurry to take off the things on his 
head. Su Nan helped him and looked at him with a smile. 

She has clear eyes and beautiful eyes, but a lovely little Zhengtai, who looks like she is 
eight or nine years old, and she is not as tall as her legs. 

With golden hair, azure blue diamond-like eyes, and clear water like a lake, he is a 
foreign child. 

At this time, he smiled and hugged Su Nan’s leg, “Beautiful sister, I finally found you!” 

Su Nan liked this child at first glance, but judging from his appearance, did he admit the 
wrong person? 

“Are you separated from your family? Do you need me to help you find family?” 

Xiao Zhengtai immediately shook his head, like a rattle, looking at her angrily, suddenly 
very sad. 

“You really don’t remember me, I’m Mike…” 

He pouted, with two crystal tears in his eyes. 

Should she remember? 

Su Nan was afraid that he would really cry, so he took him to the service center and 
wanted to help him find family members. 

Xiao Zhengtai put away his grief in an instant, and he couldn’t enter in life or death. 
Under everyone’s attention, tears were streaming down his face. 

“Sister, I will be obedient, you don’t want me…” 

Everyone watched this scene, and their hearts were melting. 



An eldest sister came up to persuade her, “You can’t scare the child like this, take your 
brother away…” 

Su Nan looked confused: “…” The 

two stood at the exit of the playground, Su Nan didn’t understand yet, but the business 
was not done, but instead he picked up a child. 

Xiaozheng took Su Nan’s hand happily, smiling, with a bit of cunning in his eyes. 

“We go home?” 

Su Nan pursed his lips, “Whose house are you going back to?” 

“Your house, you raised me and I will marry you.” 

Su Xiaohu poked his head out of his bag when he heard it. 

“Ah, when did you grow up?” 

Xiao Zhengtai looked at Su Xiaohu in surprise, “Cat? Can I play with it?” 

Su Xiaohu shook his head decisively, “No!” 

But Xiao Zhengtai has already reached out and removed Su Xiaohu from her I took it 
out of the bag and held it by the neck, and the facial features were deformed. 

“What a cute cat!” 

“It’s a tiger!” Su Xiaohu hummed in resistance. 

“You’re a talking cat!” Xiao Zhengtai kissed him happily, “What…” 

Su Xiaohu was held in Xiao Zhengtai’s arms, and there was no room for resistance at 
all. 

Su Nan couldn’t help but smile, “Well, you go back with me first, and I will let you find 
your family.” 

Xiao Zhengtai nodded immediately, and his heart was overjoyed. 

He is finally moving in with his beautiful sister! 

⋯ 

Chapter 364 I don’t like them 



Chapter 364 Don’t like them 

Su Nan took pity on him, a child who was separated from his family. He first took him to 
the Su Group, and asked Yu Lou to contact the police station with his photo to find his 
family. 

Mrs. Mike Xiaozheng has always been obedient, holding her hand tightly and never 
letting go. 

Just as he was about to leave, he suddenly saw Jiang Cheng and Jiang Xuan’s father 
and son coming in one after the other, looking excited and proud. 

When he saw Su Nan, he was stunned and walked over. 

“Miss Su, I heard that you had a busy day at the playground today?” 

Su Nan raised her eyebrows, hehe, he knew it quickly! 

Jiang Cheng smiled meaningfully and couldn’t hide his confidence: “Miss Su, don’t be 
too busy, this time the cooperation with Shang Qian has been negotiated with Jiang 
Xuan, which is also the honor of the Su Group, you are still the leader of our Su Group. 
Miss.” 

Jiang Xuan couldn’t help laughing at the back, “Of course, even if Miss Su doesn’t work 
in the company, you are still the largest shareholder of our group.” 

Listening to their tone, it seemed that the victory was already in hand. 

Su Nan chuckled, “Then I wish you…success?” 

She didn’t say much, and left with Mrs. Mike. 

“Beautiful sister, you don’t like them.” 

He said cutely, and he clearly heard them talking about Shang Qian’s name. 

That is his own daddy! 

Su Nan snorted, “A group of flies and shit, sooner or later they will be driven out!” 

“Then I don’t like them either.” 

He hates whoever the pretty sister hates! 

Su Nan touched his head, “Yeah.” When the 



two returned home, everyone else went out, even the housekeeper followed Su Yifeng 
out. 

She is the only one to take care of Mike Xiaozheng! 

… 

in the Presidential Suite of the prestigious Hilton Hotel. 

A bodyguard and a maid stood there, cautiously looking at the man who was reading 
the documents at the desk, tremblingly feeling the low air pressure. 

Standing next to him, a man who looked like a housekeeper who was a little older, hung 
up the phone and said, 

“I have already contacted, the young master was taken away by a woman, I will 
immediately send someone to bring the young master back, and by the way, sue the 
woman and give Let her teach her a lesson!” 

“Don’t…” The maid hurriedly said, carefully looking at the face of the man in front of the 
desk. 

“Maybe…it’s what the young master wants…” The 

housekeeper snorted coldly, “How old is the young master, what does he know? It must 
be that woman who abducted our young master and planned to take the opportunity to 
deceive us. Money! 

President Shang, we can’t let that woman go!” The 

maid looked at the bodyguard beside her in embarrassment and hesitated. 

The man in front of the desk looked awe-inspiring, looked mature and stable, had a 
domineering temperament, and was not angry or arrogant. 

His eyes swept over the maid and bodyguard coldly, “Tell me the truth!” The 

two of them shivered, and immediately forgot what the young master had ordered, and 
blurted out with their eyes closed. 

“Mr. Shang, in fact, the young master didn’t let us follow. He said he liked that beautiful 
sister and wanted to go with her…” The 

room was extremely silent. 

“I’ll go pick him up.” 



Shang Qian knew his son. If he didn’t voluntarily, who could be taken away under his 
nose? 

pretty sister? 

What a hell! 

“President Shang, do you want to teach that woman a lesson?” the butler asked 
impatiently. 

Shang Qian glanced at him, “Housekeeper, do your own thing well.” 

This sentence is a warning. 

The butler froze, and replied embarrassingly, “Yes.” 

Su’s house. 

Su Nan watched Xiaozhengtai Mike and Su Xiaohu have been playing together, and the 
two of them were running around on the carpet, excited. 

She was about to make some food when she heard someone open the door. 

Su Nan turned back and looked at a man with deep and three-dimensional features, 
standing at the door with a stern face, with a gesture that was similar to Fu Yechuan, 
with a powerful and compelling aura. 

She frowned, she didn’t remember knowing this person… 

“Who are you?” 

⋯ 

Chapter 365: The blind date arranged for you 

Chapter 365 How did the blind date arranged for 

you come in? 

Su Nan suddenly remembered that she didn’t close the door! 

Shang Qian glanced at her lightly, his eyes were slightly cold, and finally settled on the 
blond little Zhengtai behind her. 

His voice was low. 



“Come here…” 

Xiaozheng Taimeng walked over, smilingly reaching out to hug his thigh, “Daddy…” The 

two of them are together, although the facial features are somewhat similar, but 
Xiaozheng is from a foreign country The appearance of a person, his father is the 
appearance of a Chinese. 

But that doesn’t stop Su Nan from being surprised by the super high looks of the two 
fathers and sons! 

Shang Qian had become accustomed to this little brat’s methods, and picked him up 
with one hand. 

“Throw people away and run away by yourself, are you good at it?” 

Xiao Zhengtai kicked his legs and struggled aggrievedly. 

“People saw the beautiful sister, I want to be with her, I like her, I don’t want to be 
separated from her, Daddy, you can’t hit the mandarin ducks!” 

Su Nan was so shocked by Mike Xiaozheng that before he could explain, Shang Qian 
sneered. 

“Didn’t you always like Muse? Changed?” 

“She is! She is Muse, my beautiful sister…” 

Shang Qian was stunned, looking straight at the person standing there. Su Nan’s 
complexion instantly became complicated. 

Su Nan paused, not understanding what they meant at all. 

She coughed, “Are you really his daddy? I met him at the playground, and there was no 
one around him, so…” 

Shang Qian narrowed his eyes slightly and looked down at Mike. A little soft and 
helpless. 

“I know.” 

His cell phone rang suddenly, Shang Qian looked at the number, his face changed, and 
he walked out with Mrs. Xiaozheng in one hand. 

“Farewell, Miss Su.” 



“No, no, I don’t want to leave my beautiful sister, I like her, I’m in love…” 

Su Nan listened to the voice drifting away, and it was a little strange, but look at the 
man’s Dressed up, not an ordinary person, to find this place so quickly, and knowing 
that this is Su’s house, must have known in advance. 

After they left, she didn’t take it seriously, Su Xiaohu stood at the door wagging his tail 
regretfully, thinking about it, he was a little reluctant. 

Su Nan closed the door and went upstairs to apply a mask, ready to relax with a 
massage. 

She lay on the chair and looked at the pad, Su Xiaohu lay lazily on her lap. 

“Mama, in order to find a boyfriend for you, I searched the system for the world-class 
handsome guy list, and selected ten people with extremely high overall quality…” 

Su Nan bowed his head in surprise, “Find it for me. Boyfriend?” 

“What handsome Su Qi said.” 

Su Nan: “…Which ten?” 

“Excluded married people, excluded people over thirty-five years old, and excluded ten-
digit net worth. The following, excluding those with poor physical fitness, is left with the 
one with the best overall quality…” 

Su Nan raised an eyebrow and asked it with great interest. 

“Who is it? Give me his phone number, and I’ll call him for a date?” 

Su Xiaohu wagged his tail. 

“No problem, dialing…” 

It has so many functions! 

Su Nan was stunned for a moment, but before she could react, someone really 
answered the phone. 

“Hello?” The 

voice was deep and familiar. 

Su Nan was surprised, and Su Xiaohu jumped up and down. 



“Baba, mom said she’s looking for you on a date…” 

Su Nan jumped up from the chair in an instant, furious: “Su Xiaohu!” 

Su Xiaohu blinked at her cutely, Su Nan took it I hugged it, but I couldn’t find the button. 
Where can I turn it off? 

But there was a hint of laughter in the male voice of the other party. 

“Su Nan, do you miss me so much?” 

Fu Yechuan! 

She glared at Su Xiaohu angrily, suspecting that it was intentional! 

Su Nan gritted his teeth angrily, “I miss you, you made a mistake!” 
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Chapter 366 Their young masters are different 

“I made a mistake? Who do you want to date?” 

Fu Yechuan’s voice was magnetic and pleasant. 

“It’s not you anyway.” 

She was so angry that Su Xiaohu was still understanding why she was so angry? 

Fu Yechuan was silent for a few seconds, then spoke again, a little low. 

“Didn’t you like me very much before?” 

He mentioned the past, which was really long enough. 

She was about to forget how hard it was when she liked him. 

Su Nan paused, and his tone was not good. 

“I liked it before, but now I have self-knowledge.” 



“You don’t have to…” Before 

Fu Yechuan finished speaking, Su Nan grabbed Su Xiaohu’s tail, “Hurry up and turn off 
the phone!” 

Su Xiaohu hung up the phone very obediently, tears of grievance coming out. 

Su Nan couldn’t bear it anymore, let go of his hand again, and touched its head. 

“You little thing, don’t you know that I hate him? Who told you to call him?” 

“Mama said that she wants to date the person with the highest overall quality…” 

It justified in disapproval. 

Su Nan snorted, “He is also married for the second time. You didn’t exclude him, you 
are cheating!” 

“But he is married to Mama, which means that all aspects are in line with your 
aesthetics and can tolerate this defect.” 

“Shit, it’s impossible!” 

Su Nan was decisive, Su Xiaohu said “oh”, and huddled in her arms obediently, shaking 
his little tail, daring not to make trouble! 

Before going to bed, a text message came to the phone. 

She glanced quickly. 

“Don’t date anyone else!” 

Is it okay? 

Su Nan snorted disdainfully, and then fell back to sleep. 

… 

the Presidential Suite at the Hilton Hotel. 

Mike Xiaozheng took off his clothes and ran out the door, and was picked up by the tall 
and mighty bodyguard. 

He opened his throat and cried without tears: “I want to sleep with my beautiful sister…I 
don’t want to stay here!” The 



bodyguard silently put him in the living room, and the maid came out of the bathroom to 
dress him . 

“Little young master, Mr. Shang won’t let you run around. If you run again, he will lose 
his temper!” 

Mike Xiaozheng didn’t care, he pouted: 

“I don’t care, I’m going to sleep with beautiful sister!” 

Chubby The maid thought for a while, “You will scare the girl like this. You have to 
pursue her first and make her like you, so that you can be together.” 

Mike Xiaozheng digested the maid’s words very hard, and blinked Jingying. Clear eyes. 

“Really?” The 

maid nodded firmly, and the bodyguard also nodded with a glass of milk: “Yes!” 

… 

Late at night. 

After Shang Qian finished his work, he returned to the hotel. The bodyguard and the 
maid guarded the door to prevent him from sneaking out. 

As soon as you heard the door open, you immediately went up to it. 

“Mr. Shang, you’re back…” The 

maid lowered her voice and went over to get him a coat. 

Shang Qian let out an “um” and looked at the sleeping little boy, his eyes were soft and 
soft. 

Before leaving, he paused, “If he wants to find Miss Su tomorrow, there is no need to 
stop him.” The 

maid and bodyguard widened their eyes in shock. 

Mike Xiaozheng on the bed muttered, “Beautiful sister, tah…” The 

three of them: “…” Early the 

next morning, Xiao Zhengtai put on an evening dress , suit shirt with bow tie, and even 
sprayed hairspray on his hair, the whole person is cute and energetic! 



The maid complimented him on the side: “You are so handsome, young master, the 
girls must like it!” 

Xiao Zhengtai raised his head, “As long as the beautiful sister likes it, I will show her.” 

He hurriedly urged , “Uncle bodyguard, have you found a way to chase girls?” The 

tall and mighty bodyguard held the iPad with a determined look. 

“Yes, send flowers.” The 

chubby nanny: “Old-fashioned, send jewelry!” 

Mike Xiaozheng interrupted them: “All!” The 

two went to prepare separately, and the bearded bodyguard went to the store. The clerk 
thought that Who did you offend. 

“You… What would you like?” The bodyguard: “Rose… No, chrysanthemum 

, our young master is going to take a different path from others!” 

Full. 

Salesperson: “Madam, what do you want?” 

“Take your heaviest gold bracelet!” 

Their young master’s shot must be weighty! 

⋯ 
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Chapter 367 You are too stingy 

International Convention and Exhibition Center, a black luxury nanny car appeared at 
the door. 

In the car, the nanny and bodyguard handed things over to him, and Mike Xiaozheng 
was so happy that he was full of confidence. 

Nanny: “Would you like me to accompany you in.” 

Mike Xiaozheng immediately refused: “No, only children will be accompanied!” 



“Okay.” 

Mike Xiaozheng was happy with a bunch of chrysanthemums and a red velvet jewelry 
box went in. 

The lady at the front desk saw that this child was so cute and cute! 

“Children, who are you looking for?” 

Mike Xiaozheng, who was called “Little Boy”, had a strong smile, “I’m looking for a 
beautiful sister…” As 

he was talking, Su Nan and Fu Yechuan came out of the elevator one after the other. 
To participate in this meeting together, the apparent harmony still has to be maintained. 

When Mike Xiaozheng saw Su Nan, he immediately ran over and hugged Su Nan’s leg. 

“Beautiful sister…” 

Su Nan was stunned for a moment. Is it that little cutie from yesterday? 

“Mike, why are you here?” 

Xiao Zhengtai’s eyelashes are long, her eyes are clear and blue, and her tender face is 
shy. 

He took out the flowers in his hand, “Give it to you.” 

Looking at the bunch of white chrysanthemums, Su Nan’s eyelids twitched fiercely and 
looked at Xiao Zhengtai in surprise. 

“This flower…” 

“I specially selected it carefully and gave it to my beautiful sister. I think this flower is 
very beautiful, especially suitable for you. Beautiful girls will definitely like it.” 

Su Nan was silent for a few seconds, I thought to myself, not every beautiful girl will like 
it! 

After all, she has not received white chrysanthemums. 

The meaning of this is a bit hard to explain… 

But looking at Xiao Zhengtai’s expectant eyes, she thought about it, what does a child 
know? 



Su Nan smiled and took it over with a gentle voice, “Thank you.” 

When he saw the chrysanthemum, Fu Yechuan’s expression froze slightly, and the 
corner of his mouth twitched. 

He squinted his eyes, his face as flawless as a sculpture was a little hard to describe at 
this time, hehe, I really want to throw him out with one hand! 

An eyesore! 

“Who’s kid?” 

“His name is Mike, I just met yesterday.” 

“Hello, uncle.” 

Mike Xiaozheng said obediently, with an innocent look. 

Fu Yechuan raised his eyebrows, his face darkened a bit, calling him uncle? 

He had just heard that he called Su Nan “beautiful sister”. 

Looking down at her watch, “The meeting is over, let’s go have tea together?” 

“No.” She decisively refused. 

Fu Yechuan: “I have Shang Qian’s schedule.” 

“Go.” 

Su Nan looked down at Mike, “Where’s your father?” 

Mike shook his head and took her hand, “I want to go with you.” 

That The look in the eyes of the uncle looking at the beautiful sister is clearly malicious! 

He can’t let his beautiful sister be taken away by a bad uncle! 

“No.” 

Fu Yechuan refused. 

What if two people go on a date with a strange child? 

Mike snorted coldly and pouted towards Su Nan coquettishly. 



“Beautiful sister, people want to drink tea…” 

Su Nan paused, her heart was about to melt, she was cute and cute, and she had no 
resistance! 

“Okay.” 

Su Nan laughed and took his hand. 

Mike Xiaozheng was so happy that he was kicking his legs when he walked. The pretty 
sister is so fragrant… 

His clear eyes slyly glanced at Fu Yechuan, he even made a face and stuck out his 
tongue! 

Fu Yechuan: “This child is not cute at all.” 

Su Nan sneered, “You’re so embarrassed to speak ill of a child?” 

Fu Yechuan: “…” 

Little Mike raised his chin proudly. 

As soon as he lowered his head, he realized that he was still holding the red velvet box. 
Just as he was about to give it to her, Fu Yechuan had already changed the subject. 

Well, send it later. 

The tea room that Fu Yechuan chose was quiet, clean and full of extravagance. 

The three sat down, and little Mike sat next to Su Nan, watching Fu Yechuan vigilantly. 

Fu Yechuan took out a blue box and smiled, “I took it back from country F before, and it 
suits you very well.” 

Su Nan frowned and didn’t even look at it. 

“I do not want.” 

⋯ 

Chapter 368 Do you want a kiss? 

Chapter 368 Would you like to kiss him, 

“Open it and take a look.” 



Fu Yechuan’s brows and eyes were gentle, and his profile was like being outlined by a 
paintbrush. 

Su Nan opened it speechlessly and saw that it was a bracelet from a famous luxury 
brand, the only one in the world that is limited. 

It is indeed beautiful, more delicate and extravagant than the promotional pictures. 

She didn’t even have time to make a reservation, but it was in Fu Yechuan’s hands? 

Fu Yechuan raised his hand clearly, poured her a cup of tea, raised his eyebrows and 
looked at the kid next to him, and reluctantly brought him a cup. 

Little Mike moved up excitedly, but fortunately, the bracelet was not as thick as his! 

“Uncle, you are too stingy, how can you be afraid of spending money to send girls?” 

Fu Yechuan raised his eyebrows: “…” 

Little Mike confidently took out his red velvet box. 

“Beautiful sister, I gave this to you.” 

After speaking, he opened the box, and a large gold bracelet the size of a thumb came 
into view. 

There was a momentary stagnation in the air. 

Little Mike sat next to her, “Girls like gold, the heavier the better, uncle, do you 
understand?” 

He looked disgusted. 

Fu Yechuan twitched the corners of his mouth, “Oh?” 

Su Nan’s eyelids jumped. 

“You bought this?” 

Although it was not much money to her, is it too expensive for a child? 

Little Mike nodded and looked at her with a smile. 

“Of course, I can buy anything beautiful sister likes, I have a lot of money!” 

His father also has a lot of money! 



Su Nan frowned, “I can’t accept it, how can a child give gold casually?” 

Although his appearance is not impressive, it feels heavy in his hand. 

Little Mike was very unhappy with his eyes closed, and looked away awkwardly, 
aggrieved. 

“Well, my dad said it can be given.” 

It turned out that his dad agreed. 

Is it to thank her for picking up his son yesterday? 

Su Nan breathed a sigh of relief. When he saw that he was unhappy, his facial features 
were all wrinkled together, and he couldn’t bear it anymore. 

“Okay, then I’ll take it.” 

Little Mike looked at her expectantly with sparkling eyes. 

“Then do you like it?” 

Su Nan was silent for two seconds, “Well, I like it.” 

Little Mike pointed to the limited edition bracelet that Fu Yechuan gave. 

“Do you like him?” 

Su Nan was silent for two seconds, “I don’t.” 

Little Mike smiled happily, leaned over to Su Nan, stretched out a little finger, and 
tapped his little cheek, which was bright red , shy and immature. 

“That pretty sister, would you give me a kiss?” 

The gaze from Fu Yechuan on the opposite side turned cold in an instant. 

This nasty child is even more annoying! 

Although he looks only eight or nine years old, the woman who covets him must not be 
a good person! 

Su Nan looked at him helplessly, how could there be such a cute child? 

She held his little head, kissed his forehead, and rubbed his little face with a smile. 



“Okay, my sister is going to talk about business, will you sit down and sit?” 

Little Mike, who was kissed, was in a trance for a moment, then lowered his head 
happily, and rubbed his clothes awkwardly and shyly. 

Really a little boy who likes to blush. 

Fu Yechuan looked away coldly, holding back the gloomy anger in his chest. 

He can’t compare to an eight-year-old! 

Su Nan pushed back the blue velvet box in front of him. 

“You keep this, I can’t take it.” 

Fu Yechuan paused, his eyes narrowed slightly. 

“You don’t like it?” 

He just saw the surprise flashing in her eyes! 

No reason not to like it. 

She can even accept the ugly bracelet of the eight-year-old child, why should she reject 
this jewelry from her favorite brand? 

And it is a limited edition that is unique in the world. 

Something money can’t buy. 

Su Nan hooked her lips, “You gave it, I don’t want it.” 

Direct enough. 

Fu Yechuan’s face stiffened slightly, and then he regained his gentleness. 

“Your father said that we want to communicate normally, isn’t it normal to send 
something?” 

Su Nan glanced at him, “Don’t tell me, don’t tell me I’m leaving?” 

Fu Yechuan opened his lips helplessly. 

“Shang Qian will hold a private business dinner in a few days, and Jiang Xuan will also 
attend.” 



Su Nan raised his eyebrows, Jiang Xuan is quite capable, so he got on this line so 
quickly? 

It seems that I have to work harder! 

“how do you know?” 

⋯ 

Chapter 369 This is my girlfriend 

Chapter 369 This is my girlfriend 

Fu Yechuan hooking her lips, “Because the invitation has already been delivered to 
me.” 

Su Nan: “…” 

Her heart skipped a beat, the Su Group and the Fu Group There are similarities in this 
project, and they are evenly matched and evenly matched. 

There is no reason to give the Fu Group but not the Su Group. Has Shang Qian already 
decided? 

Seeing that her face was not very good, little Mike immediately tugged at her sleeve. 

“Pretty sister, if you want to go, I can invite you…” 

Anyway, it was held by his own father, so he could invite his friends to participate… 

Fu Yechuan looked at little Mike, a pair of Outrageous look. 

Su Nan didn’t take it to heart at all, thinking that it was Little Mike who comforted her 
intimately. 

She twitched the corners of her mouth and looked at Fu Yechuan coldly. 

“So, Fu always comes to show off?” 

Fu Yechuan frowned slightly, “I still lack a female companion, you can…” 

Su Nan put down the teacup in his hand, “No need, I will think of other ways. .” 

Although it was the easiest to be his female companion, at that time she would only be 
in a passive state. 



This is not what she wants. 

Su Nan stood up, and little Mike couldn’t wait to hold her hand, “Sister pretty, I want to 
play at your house…” 

She touched his head, “Okay.” 

Fu Yechuan stood up, Seeing little Mike jumping around, he took Su Nan’s hand and 
left. 

His hands clenched into fists, and a few strands of broken hair covered his cold brows, 
which faded gently, full of struggle. 

At that moment, he really wanted to give up the opportunity. 

As soon as he went out, the bodyguard’s voice came from the miniature earphones in 
little Mike’s ears. 

“Little young master, it’s time to invite her to dinner, you can’t let girls go hungry.” 

Little Mike nodded, holding Su Nan’s hand with a smile. 

“Beautiful sister, before we go home, shall we go to dinner?” 

“I’ll let the servant cook it for you?” 

“No, I want to eat…” He rolled his eyes, “Ice cream.” 

Su Nan couldn’t help but smile, and he was indeed a child. 

“Okay.” The 

dull mood just now was swept away, let’s accompany this little Zhengtai to fill his 
stomach first. 

Su Nan took him to a nearby fast food restaurant. The clerk came to order food and 
couldn’t help but glance at Little Mike. 

“Miss, is this your brother? He looks so cute!” 

Little Mike’s face was dark and ugly, and he corrected her in a straight-forward manner. 
His voice was immature and he pretended to be mature. 

“I’m her friend, boyfriend!” 

Although she is called a beautiful sister, she doesn’t really consider her a sister! 



She is the one who wants to be his girlfriend! 

Su Nan smiled, “Bring him a children’s meal and two ice creams.” 

Little Mike snorted in a milky voice, with deep grievances in his blue eyes. 

“I don’t want children’s meals, I’m not a child!” 

Su Nan couldn’t help laughing, “Then what do you want to eat, boyfriend?” 

Little Mike’s face instantly turned red, and he tugged at the corner of his clothes 
awkwardly. Excited and excited! 

God, is the pretty sister willing to be his girlfriend? 

“Ladies first, you decide.” 

If you listen to your girlfriend, you will grow up quickly! 

Su Nan blinked at the clerk, everything was business as usual. 

The clerk immediately understood that this strange-tempered little Zhengtai really 
became more and more cute as she looked at it! 

Su Nan just ate ice cream, and little Mike ate everything else. Sure enough, when he 
was growing up, he ate quite a lot. 

They finished eating in a while, and Su Nan waved, ready to let the clerk come over to 
check out. 

Little Mike stopped her immediately, his voice was cute and imposing. 

“How can I let a girl check out when I go out to dinner with my boyfriend?” 

Su Nan looked at him in surprise. He rolled up his sleeves, revealing his children’s 
watch and the ROLEX brand logo on the watch. 

I was slightly surprised that the value of this brand of children’s watches was 
comparable to her bag. 

As soon as his watch was aligned with the QR code, the clerk’s machine automatically 
said, “You have paid 790 yuan.” 

Little Mike put down his sleeves indifferently. 



It seems that Mike’s daddy who appeared in front of her house yesterday was really not 
easy to come by! 

Su Nan: “Who is your father?” 

⋯ 

Chapter 370 is just a scumbag 

Chapter 370 Just a scumbag 

little Mike blinked his eyes and was about to introduce himself, but an eager voice 
suddenly came from the miniature earphones in his ears. 

Nanny: “I can’t say I can’t say it, you say she likes your Daddy!” 

Compared with Daddy, little Mike felt that he had no other advantages besides being 
young. 

Pretty sister can’t be hooked up by Daddy! 

No, absolutely not! 

Little Mike’s open mouth was tightly closed again, and his sly eyes rolled. 

“My daddy is a rich man, but all his money is mine, so it’s fine if you like me.” 

Su Nan smiled helplessly, her heart soft. 

I guess he’s really rich, right? 

Su Nan took him back. Su Xiaohu was so excited that he circled around little Mike. 

“Mama, I like little Mike so much!” 

Little Mike picked it up, put it in his arms and rubbed its tiger head. 

“I like you too, cat!” 

“It’s a tiger!” 

Su Xiaohu wagged his tail in disapproval. 

Su Nan went to the kitchen to pour water, and little Mike carried Su Xiaohu by the neck. 

“I’m pretty sister’s boyfriend, you call her Mama, then you should call me Daddy!” 



Su Xiaohu’s facial features were ferocious: “…” 

“No, Baba is Fu Yechuan, he is The most handsome man in the world!” 

This position, it should be a tiger! 

Little Mike put it down angrily, but was afraid that it would sue. 

“I don’t care about a cat with you, she’s mine anyway!” As 

he said, the phone rang from his children’s watch. 

It is Shang Qian. 

Little Mike picked it up reluctantly, “Daddy!” 

Shang Qian’s low voice came over. 

“Where?” 

“I’m at the beautiful sister’s house, Daddy, you are not allowed to come here!” 

If the beautiful sister likes Daddy, wouldn’t she be out of the game? 

Shang Qian laughed a few times, “If you don’t come back within 30 minutes, I’ll go pick 
you up.” 

Going against his son seemed to be a lot of fun. 

Little Mike was anxious and angry, almost stomping his feet and acting like a baby! 

“No, no, I want to sleep with my pretty sister!” 

“Who are you talking to?” 

Su Nan went out with two glasses of milk. 

Just as little Mike was about to turn off the phone, Shang Qian had already spoken in 
advance. 

“I want to talk to her.” 

Little Mike raised his hand reluctantly. Only then did Su Nan realize that his phone 
watch showed that he was on a call… 

“Is it your father?” 



“Miss Su, it’s me. .” 

Su Nan’s voice was calm and calm. 

“Hello.” 

“Miss Su, I’m sorry. Someone will pick him up later. If he doesn’t want to go, just keep 
him out of the door. Don’t be soft-hearted.” 

Su Nan glanced at the angry little Mike , smiled, “That’s really cruel.” 

“For a boy who only wants to sleep with girls, he is… a scumbag.” 

After that, Shang Qian hung up the phone. 

Little Mike’s eyes widened, his face flushed brightly, “Stinky Daddy!” 

How dare you smear his image in the heart of the beautiful sister? 

This stinky daddy! 

Su Nan couldn’t help laughing and quickly comforted him. 

“Don’t be angry, I know our little Mike is not this kind of person!” 

Su Nan comforted him for a while before little Mike gradually relaxed. 

After a while, the doorbell rang. 

Su Nan went to open the door. 

A slightly chubby maid stood at the door and said with a smile, 

“Excuse me, I’m here to pick up our young master…” 

Little Mike walked over cutely, and the maid handed the dessert in her hand. go up. 

Eyes blinked as if they were twitching. 

“Master, this is the dessert you ordered me to buy.” 

Little Mike was stunned for a moment, then quickly responded. 

“Pretty sister, this is for you…” 
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