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Chapter 46: Recruiting Master Beauty to

After collecting the crystal coins, Di Ping opened the system again, and a virtual interface appeared 
in front of him. Every time he opened the system, Di Ping felt illusory and unreal, like a dream, just 
like Zhuang Zhou’s dream of butterfly, who is in who dream He couldn't figure it out himself.

It’s not the time to think about this. He puts up his mind and directly clicks on the tavern recruiting 
interface to enter the hero recruiting interface. The interface is blurred, and three heroes are slowly 
revealed. As expected, luck is not always good, three D-class potential heroes. Appears in the 
system recruitment interface.

Di Ping now only has five crystal coins, which is not enough to refresh. Fortunately, he is going to 
recruit D-class heroes this time to verify his guess.

These three heroes, the first shooter, are excluded directly, why? You must know that these heroes 
are recruited with naked makeup and no weapons, so where can he shoot them?

The second one is still a barbarian, but Di Ping has already recruited a barbarian Boogie, and now 
he is doing it again.

The third one is a mage, and she is also a female mage. This is more in line with Di Ping's idea. She 
is a warrior. It would be better to have a long-range attack class to cooperate.

Click directly to select the mage and confirm the recruitment. He has heard from the tavern 
manager Wu An before that the recruitment can be carried out directly in the system. It is not 
necessary to recruit on the third floor of the tavern. As long as the system is confirmed, the 
recruitment tower on the third floor of the tavern will automatically start. After completing the 
recruitment task, Di Ping completed the recruitment in the bath.

Red light surged in the system, enveloping the female mage, and instantly the female mage 
disappeared from the interface.



At this time, the recruiting tower on the third floor of the tavern suddenly lit up, and the densely 
packed mysterious runes on the pillars gleamed one by one, and bursts of energy flowed in the 
mysterious runes, and then the pillars lighted up, illuminating the entire third floor, three The prism 
opens slowly, and the bigger it opens up, the energy surges in it, and the energy mist clusters in the 
middle of the column, and the electric light swims in the dense fog, like thousands of thunder 
snakes.

The fog cluster became denser and denser, and became larger and larger, gradually spreading 
outward to form a large fog cluster tightly wrapping the three prisms. One minute later, a faint 
thunder sound was heard in the thick fog, and the fog cluster suddenly accelerated and enlarged. 
Then it suddenly retracted and compressed back between the three prisms to form a human-shaped 
light group.

The thick fog gradually dissipated, and the light slowly dimmed. A tall man with a black cloak 
appeared in the column space. The entire body was tightly covered, and even his face was hidden in 
it. The figure paused for a few seconds. Then he walked out, and Wu An, the steward of the tavern, 
had already greeted him in the lobby on the third floor.

At this time, Di Ping did not see all of this. He saw the female mage image disappeared in the 
recruitment interface, and a hero appeared below the barbarian Boogie in the tavern hero interface, 
Gina Female Mage Level One, weapons The positions were all empty, it was determined that the 
recruitment should be successful, and then Patton was summoned to bring the female mage Gina.

This castle does not look like an ancient building, but it is like a science fiction movie. It has a 
complete artificial intelligence system. Di Ping slept in the bath and just told the air to arrange for 
Patton to pick up someone from the tavern, and Patton received it. At the beginning, Di Ping was 
not used to the notification of the castle's intelligent system. After Barton's repeated explanations, 
he really found it too convenient. If such a big castle does not have this set of intelligent things, it 
would be troublesome to find someone.

When Di Ping was washed and dressed neatly and came to the living room, Patton was already 
waiting here, beside him was a female mage wearing a black cloak.



The female mage has removed the hat covering her head and put it on the back of her head. Her 
golden hair is naturally curly, and she is simply draped over her shoulders. Her skin is very white 
and thin. Her eyes are blue and starry, deep and far away, seemingly endless. The suction force 
seems to **** the human soul in. The eyelashes are slender and curved, soft and smooth, and the 
eyebrows are straight and thin, like a willow flying obliquely, the nose is erect, and the bridge of the 
nose is like a sword cut, and it looks clear. The mouth is not big but extremely full, the corners of 
the mouth are slightly upturned, and a smile is always on the face, the face is thin and long, the 
shape of a melon seed, the lower horse is pointed, the double cheek lines are obvious, the whole 
five views and the face shape match Not only makes the person extremely beautiful, but also has a 
kind of magical charm. Although the figure is covered in the big robe, you can still see the faint 
curve. The figure should also be very good. It does not have the thin and cold feeling of the wizard 
in the novel. Instead, there is a kind of heroic spirit.

"Master! Gina obey your greetings!"

The female mage Gina looked at Di Ping for two seconds, her eyes changed instantly, showing 
respect in an instant, her face suddenly panicked, she knelt down on one knee, lowered her head and 
raised her right hand on the towering chest in salute.

"Haha! Please get up soon!" Di Ping was very happy, smiled and raised up the female mage Gina 
who was on her knees, and said enthusiastically, "Gina welcome here!"

Although I was a little shocked by Gina's beauty just now, he still reacted quickly and didn't lose his 
ugliness. It would be a shame if he was lost because of his subordinate's appearance! Although the 
heroes I recruit are respectful and respectful to myself, it is better to behave a little.

It’s just that when you put your hand on Gina’s arm, even though it’s separated from the fabric, you 
can still feel the softness and warmth that makes your heartbeat, and there is a refreshing faint scent 
that lingers at the end of your nose. Di Ping suddenly felt a sudden burst of heart, and he was full of 
restlessness Hot, you have to know that although he had been in love, but at that time, the university 
was still pure and Su Xiao, that is, hugging and hugging relatives, so now he is still the first brother. 
Although Su Xiao is also very beautiful, the beauty is Belonging to the youthful beauty and the 
peach-like mature Fengyun woman like Yu Shujie has a much weaker impact on young men, but 
this Gina is different from Liu Bingyu's natural tenderness, she is enchanting and charming, 
especially matched The faint fragrance on the body, my heart rose like fire when I smell it.
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