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After that, they did not communicate much until the ball was pushed into the last hole. 

Andrew and Tilda were already wi 

“Not bad!” Andrew praised them. 

waiting there 

Although Edwin won, the gap between him and Sharon was not big 

Tilda glanced at Sharon without bai 

thatting an eyelid. She hurriedly ran to Edwin and said, “Look, you’re sweating so much” 

She took out a towel to wipe Edwin’s sweat. 

Edwin did not wait for her to wipe his face. He reached out to take the towel and wiped it 
himself. 

“Hurry up and get our Sharon a bottle of iced water,” Andrew instructed his assistant 
behind him. 

He smiled and looked at Sharon with an anniable gaze. 

Edwin looked at this scene and his heart skipped a beat. 

It seemed that Sharon was very popular outside. 

Previously, there were Randall and Rocky, and now Andrew. Each of them showed 
great enthusiasm for her. 

On this side, Andrew and Sharon had already walked out side by side. 

It was just a chance encounter, so there was no need to calk for a long time. 

Edwin was still in a daze when someone grabbed his arm. 

“Edwin. I just had a long chat with Mr. Marcus. He’s not as difficult to get along with as I 
thought. He’s quite easy–going. There was a hint of excitement on Tilda’s bright face. “I 
even told him about your performance over the years and your plan in detail. He 
seemed to be very interested” 

Although she didn’t say it out loud, what was written all over her face was, “Come and 
praise me. Come and praise me 



“Thank you,” Edwin said. 

He was not good at praising people 

With that, he strode out. 

On the other side, Andrew and Sharon were walking side by side. 

Sharon drank the iced water mouthful by mouthful. 

Although she wore a sun hat, the sun was quite bright today. 

Her rosy face was dyed with sparkling sweat, and even her eyelashes were wet. 

Her eyes were moist and bright because of the sweat 

“It’s him, right?” Andrew suddenly opened his mouth and asked inexplicably. 

Sharon turned to look at him and frowned slightly. 

“He’s the man you liked before but divorced later, right” Andrew explained further, 

Sharon’s puzzled gaze immediately turned into surprise. “How did 

w did you know?” 

Banway. 

She could not help but recall carefully. No matter how she thought about it, she could 
not remember where she had given herself a 

Andrew did not explain. 

He had seen countless people, and he had been deeply hurt by love. What he could he 
not tell! 

aron immediately understood. She lowered her eyes and nodded. “It’s him” 

“Since you’re already divorced, why are you still helping him?” Andrew stopped before 
the car and looked at her with a dark gaze. 

Sharon pursed her lips and smiled. “It’s not to help him. It’s just that I owe someone a 
huge favor. Coincidentally, he is in a cooperative relationship 
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with that person.” 

Andrew nodded and did not say anything else. 

He lowered his head and got into the car. Sharon stopped outside the car and said 
goodbye to him. 

Andrew’s car had just left when another one drove over. 

Edric and Ray jumped out of the car. 

When Edric saw Sharon, it was as if he had seen a pile of shit. His face and heart were 
filled with extreme disgust. 

He swayed his body and walked over, not forgetting to cover 

er his nose with his hand. “What’s going on? Your golf course receives all kinds of low- 
class people 

These words were meant for the staff who welcomed them, but they were directed at 
Sharon. 

The stad member felt awkward and could not refute him. They smiled apologetically. 

Sharon pretended not to hear him. She did not even look at him as if she didn’t see him. 
She only continued to do what she was supposed to 

“Edric, watch your language! If you don’t know how to speak, shut your mouth Ray 
came down. When he heard Edric’s unpleasant words, he could not help but reprimand 
him. 

“What? Do you feel sorry for her because of what I said? If you feel sorry for her, marry 
her!” Edric was used to being unreasonable and did not have much upbringing outside. 
He always said whatever he wanted. 

Ray glared at him and could not be bothered with him anymore. He walked straight to 
Sharon and said. “Ms. Cress. I didn’t expect to meet you 

here 

“Is that strange” Edric interrupted again with an arrogant look. “Now, wherever Edwin 
goes, she follows. Either she wants to cause trouble for Tilda and Edwin or break them 
up 



Sharon originally did not want to bother with this unreasonable man. But when she saw 
him keep mocking her, she did not want to tolerate it 

anymore, 

She could not help but look at him and smile. “Wherever Edwin and Tilda are, you’re 
also there. It seems you also want to make things difficult for them, or do you want to 
break them up?” 

“You… Edric’s face was filled with anger. The veins on his forchead twisted. 

Sharon was not frightened by his appearance at all. Her gaze was calm and indifferent, 
and her lips curled into a faint smile. 

The 

more she looked at him like that, the more guilty Edric felt 

He felt embarrassed like his heart had been seen throught 

“What nonsense! I’m not your le suddenly flew into a rage and roared on the spot, 
“Don’t judge me with your dark thoughts. It’s disgusting” 

Looking at Edric, who lost all his composure and could only cover it up with his anger, 
Sharon suddenly felt he was pathetic 

He liked Tilda bu hud to pretend to be noble and upright. 

Sharon looked up and saw Edwin and Tilda walking over side by side. 

Not wanting to interact with them, she ignored Edric and walked to the other side. 

Her car was parked elsewhere, and the caddie went to get it. 

She would have to wait a few more minutes before he came over. 

Sharon would have walked over to get her car if she had known she would meet 
someone she didn’t want to see there. 

Right now, she just wanted to stay as far away from them as possible. 

“Edric, Mr. Gildon” Tilda seemed to be especially excited. Her nightingale–like voice 
was clear and bright. “Do you know who we bumped into? It’s 

Mr. Marcus 



She ran to the two of thein in a few steps and couldn’t help showing off again. “Mr. 
Marcus is very polite. He’s not as difficult to get close to as others say. I analyzed the 
pros and cons of your plan and cooperation for him in detail. He seems to be a little 
interested.” 

“Tilda, you’re something?” Edric was Tilda’s brainless fan. When he heard her say that, 
he immediately praised her. 

Chapter S1 

Edric’s support made Tilda feel even better. “In my opinion, Mr. Marcus’s so–called 
non–cooperation with businessmen from Hatherland is not permanent. What he lacks is 
someone to convince him.” 

-excitement and said it in 

a completely 

Tilda did not forget her goddess image at all times. When she said this, she tried her 
best to suppress here rational tone. 

Kay listened to her twisted logic and did not say anything. He only sneered. 

He ignored Tilda and walked toward Sharon again. “Where are you going? Do you need 
me to send you?” | 

“No need,” Sharon was very pole to Ray, 

However, they had only driven one car over. She did not want to have anything to do 
with Tilda and Edric 

Edwin had been standing far away. There were so many people, but it seemed he was 
standing there alone. 

It was not until Ray walked to Sharon that Edwin looked up. 

His gaze locked onto the two of them. 

He frowned again. 

Previously, when Ray said that he was not worthy of Sharon, he had only taken it as a 
joke. 

But now, Ray seemed to be especially close to Sharon. 



Tilda was constantly paying attention to Edwin. Her heart skipped a beat when she saw 
Edwin’s gaze was on Sharon and Ray 

Her fingers were already pinching under her sleeves as she thought, What is wrong with 
Edwin? Why is he paying more and more attention to Sharon! 

After Tilda retumed, she became sensitive. 

Moreover, there were so many people around. How could her pride allow her to watch 
Edwin stare ar Sharon only? 

“No, I must think of a way to shift Edwin’s attention from her to me. His gaze can only 
land on me Tilda thought. 
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As Tilda was thinking, Ray’s phone rang. 

“Mr. Marcus Ray said in a low voice and answered the call. 

Hearing this, everyone held their breatht 

Ray took less than ten seconds to answer the call. When he was done, his expression 
had already changed. “Mr. Marcus said that he’s willing to 

cooperate with us” 

“Oh, my God, that’s great” The first to jump up was Tilda. 

She clapped her hands, feeling that God was helping her. 

Tilda looked so excited as she ran back to Edwin with shining eyes. “Edwin, I told you 
Mr. Marcus has already been tempted. I’ve convinced him?” 

“Tilda you’re amazing!” Edric’s voice immediately sounded as he made a praising 
gesture to Tida 

He looked at Edwin meaningfully. “Tilda is now a great contributor to Genesis Group. 
Edwin, you have to treasure her more. Otherwise, she will be snatched away by others 
if she is too outstanding 

Tilda was touched by Edric’s words and said shyly, “You flatter me too much. I just said 
a few words to persuade him. I’m not that good” 

Although she spoke humbly, the light in her eyes betrayed her thoughts. She already 
considered herself a hero. 



Tilda deliberately curled her hair and fixed her gaze on Sharon 

Edric also noticed Sharon again. He snorted and laughed. “Some people put in a lot of 
effort and used some shady men’s connections to cause trouble for our project. They 
wanted to show their ability, but Tisda defeated them. What’s not presentable will never 
be presentable. A monkey in a dragon robe is still a monkey. He can’t be of any use 

These words were so harsh that it was too unpleasant to hear. 

Although he didn’t say the specific name, his meaning was clear. He was talking about 
Sharon, 

Tiida needed such a spokesperVOIL 

Edric said everything she wanted to say to Sharont 

She felt great! 

For the past few days, Tilda had been suppressed by Sharon’s various outstanding 
performances. Tilda felt extremely comfortable now and smiled. 

However, she did not forget to scold Edric. “Edric, don’t spot nonsense” 

“Am I wrong” Do you dare to say that she didn’t come from Hatherland here only to 
cause trouble?” This time, he was openly targeting Sharon. 

Sharon smiled without saying anything Just then, a car arrived. 

Ray looked at Edric as if he was looking at a stupid pig. When Sharon opened the car 
door, Ray said, “Mr. Marcus said that he joined the Genesis Group’s project all because 
of Ms. Cress.” 

King 

His voice was not loud, but it was like a freezing mixture. Other than Sharon, everyone 
present was frozent 

Edric’s mouth was wide open in disbelief. Tilda could not maintain her image and 
blurted out, “How is this possible?” 

“That’s right, how is 

is that possible!” Edric immediately followed. “Hay, aren’t you being too biased toward 
Sharon? How can you make up such a lie! Who are you on the same side with?” 

Ray did not want to waste his breath on him. He pressed a button on his phone. 



Immediately. Andrew’s unique, steady, and slow voice came from the phone. “Mr. 
Gildon, I’ll give the businessmen from Hatherland a chance. You have to thank Sharon. 
She was the one who let me see the quality of Hatherlandian. With her quality, I believe 
there’s nothing wrong with the prople she recommended. Also, remind your partner to 
keep his eyes open when he looks for a girlfriend” 

He had just recorded these casually. 

It was just a habit for all these years. He did not expect it to come in handy in the end. 
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Sharon was not surprised by Andrew’s words. She had already guessed the outcome. 

she lowered her head and got into the car. 

The car left. 

Edwin’s gare slowly landed on Sharon’s car. His eyes were dark and his lips were 
pursed tightly. 

This result had completely exceeded his expectations: 

Although he didn’t have as many guesses as Tilda and Edric and felt that Sharon came 
over to target him, he didn’t expect that one day in his life, at an important point, this ex–
wife, whom he had never taken seriously, would give him a big surprise. 

He never expected her to… help him. 

And she had even helped him successfully! 

At this moment, Tilda was completely speechless. It was as if she was mute. 

What did she dol 

She arrogantly attributed the credit of Andrew agreeing to cooperate to her, and even 
allowed Edric to belittle Sharon! 

Now that she thought about it, she felt like a clown 

She had been purting on the most clumsy performance, but she had no idea! 

She even thought she had performed outstandingly! 



More importantly, this clown’s image was completely displayed when Edwin was 
present! 

It was too embarrassing! 

She wanted to find a hole to hide in! 

Tilda was too ashamed to stay any longer. She covered her face and ran away. 

When Edric saw she had run away, he became anxious and shouted at Ray, “What do 
you mean? Can’t you say these things earlier? You did it on purpose, right?” 

After shouting, he chased after Tilda 

Ray shrugged helplessly. 

He wanted to say, but Edric and Tilda were acting and talking non–stop. How could he 
have the chance to say it? 

Moreover, he did not want to say it in front of Sharon. He had wanted to save their pride 
and dignity. 

But their words were too harsh. 

He felt Sharon shouldn’t be insulted by them like that. 

In the end, he told the truth in front of Sharon. He wanted to remind the two of them. 

However, these two people insisted on saying that he was lying. 

He had no choice but to play the recording and pull off their last cover. 

Sharon returned to the hotel and took a comfortable shower. 

The mission was completed. It was finally time to go back. 

Although Andrew did not specially treat her to a meal, he got someone to send a lot of 
local specialties over. 

They were all bought from the best places. 

Purchasing the most authentic goods was much more troublesome than directly 
spending money to buy them at the shop. 

And these were personally chosen by Andrew. 



He did not like to show his emotions on the surface, but just from this, it could be seen 
how much he cared about Sharon, 

The only person who could make Andrew put in so much effort was probably Sharon, 
his benefactor, friend, and junior. 

Sharon looked at the pile of local specialties and felt touched and helpless She could 
not help but think of the last sentence he had said to Ray in the fronding 

On the surface, he did not care much about her love life, but he was quite protective of 
her. 

Sharon felt touched. 

After being touched for a while, Sharon prepared to bring some gifts for Irene, her 
father, and Alanna 

With that thought in mind, she walked out. 

Sharon opened the door and saw a figure standing at the door. 

His figure was slender and straight, exuding an elegant aura. 

His face was as beautiful as the moon and handsome as a god. 
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Other than Edwin, who else could be so handsome? 

Sharon was quite surprised that he would be standing at her door, 

She couldn’t help but raise her eyebrows and say, “Mr. Stanley, what brings you here? 
What’s the matter?” 

It was a completely formal tone…. 

Edwin frowned slightly. I’m here to thank you.” 

With that, he took out a document. “This time, you helped Genesis Group win the 
cooperation with Mr. Marcus. Genesis Group will give you 202 of the profits. This is the 
contract. It will take effect after you sign it” 

Sharon looked down at the contract and pursed her lips imperceptibly. 

“There has never been anything new about hour Edwin deals with business. He likes to 
deal with most things with money Sharon thought. 



She gently pushed the contract out. “Mr. Stanley, you don’t have to be like this. I didn’t 
come out to look for Mr. Marcus for you or Genesis Group. It’s entirely because of Mr. 
Gildon, so I don’t want these! 

After saying that she walked past Edwin and left with light footsteps. 

Behind her, Edwin stared at her back. His gaze became darker and darker. 

The paper in his hand was also pinched bit by bit and crumpled in his palm 

She had given him so much affection in the past that he was not used to it 

But now, she was treating him coldly and distantly. However, he could not get used is it 
either 

“Why is Edwin standing at Sharon’s door? What does he mean” Not far away. Tilda was 
helped back by Edric. 

Edrics affectionate and gentle gaze landed on her, but she locked her gaze on Edwin. 

Her eyes trembled again. 

“Sharon knows how to act” Edric said in dissatisfaction. His words were fed with disgust 
for Sharon “She did so much just to attract Edwin’s attention! I can’t believe Edwin fell 
for ” 

“Can you not make such wild guesses?” Ray followed behind. Hearing Edric’s baseless 
guesses, he felt annoyed. 

“Ms. Cress helped us out of goodwill. Edwin went to look for her to thank her. That’s all” 
Ray said. 

“Bullshit” Edric would not believe it. “In my opinion, she’s not giving up on Erhein. She’s 
playing hard to get Thas woman has no real ability, but she is full of schemed If Edwin 
continues to be like this, he’ll fall into Sharon’s trap sooner or later! At that time, he’ll 
regret it for the rest of his life!” Edric said without thinking 

“Don’t look down on Sharan so much. She’s not someone ordinary people like us can 
reach Ray didn’t want to stay with the two of them anymore. He stepped into the room 
first. 

Edric did not like to hear Ray defending Sharon. He growled, “What does be mean? 
Who is he talking about? Who can’t reach Sharon? Does he have a brain? With 
Sharon’s annoying appearance, 1 don’t even want her to clean my shoes! 

– “Stop talking.” Tilda stopped him softly. “Sharon is Topspeed” 



“Topspeed: Topspeed, the racer! When Tilda said this, Edric was still clearly shocked. 

He also played racing 

He knew how to race mainly because Tilda liked it 

Tilda was a supreme goddess in his heart. He always wanted to practice something that 
she liked as a hobby so that he could have a common language with her. 

His driving skills were not bail, so he naturally knew the existence of Topspeed. 

However, Topspeed rarely showed her face. In addition, Edric did not go last tune. Until 
now, he did not know that Sharon had such an impressive identity. 

“You must be kidding” Edric sull found it hard to believe. 

I 
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“Do you think I’m that boring?” When facing Edric alone, Tilda didn’t have much 
patience. 

As she said this, she frowned in annoyaner. 

Edric’s mouth opened wide again. This is unbelievable.” 

When Tilda saw even Edric looked like he was about in admire Sharon to death, she felt 
even more annoyed. 

She told him about the car race. 

“What? Sharon hid her identity and humiliated you? Does Sharon think she can do 
whatever she wants just because she is Topspeed! She even dares to do such a thing. 
Shameless Edric was enraged again 

How could be tolerate his goddess being bullied like this? 

Tilda, don’t worry. I’ll go and look for the competition association and expose this 
matter. I want her to stop competing forever!” Edric said Indignantly 

“Don’t be like that. There’s no need for such a small thing” Tilda looked like she did not 
want to argue “Well, what I don’t understand the most now is her relationship with 
Bisney Entertainment’s boss. Although it’s quite infuriating that she ruined my 
relationship with Edwin in that way back then, I don’t want to argue about such 
nonsense. But everyone will be happy if she can be with Bisney Entertainment’s boss. 



But Em afraid she has nothing to do with Bisney Entertainment’s boss, and her previous 
actions were all to confuse everyone. When the time comes. 

This Sharon is so evil. What can she not do!” Edric was slandering Sharon again. 
“However, with her looks, how can Bisney Entertainment’s boss like her! This is mon 
likely a show directed and acted by herself 

“That’s hard to say,” said Tida. 

“Don’t worry. Leave this matter to the. I’ll investigate, I want to see if Risney 
Entertainment’s boss has anything to do with her Edric patted his chest loudly. 

Tilda’s matter was 

matter was his matter. He had to investigate in thoroughly! 

Tilda nodded in satisfaction. 

She hated Sharon now. 

She had not done anything too out of line for so long because she was worried about 
Bisney Entertainment’s Imas’s attitude 

If the facts were confirmed and those so–called relationships were all fabricated by 
Sharon, without her saying anything, Edric would help her deal with Sharon! 

“Go and investigate it first,” Tilda urged him anxiously. 

Edric was worried about her. “What about you?” 

I still have Edwin, don’t I? After Tilda finished speaking, she walked toward Edwin 
elegantly. 

Edric suppressed the emotions in his eyes and left in resignation. 

“Edwin.” Tilda walked up to Edwin and called out sofily. 

Edwin looked up with a faint gaze. 

Seeing him like this, “Tilda looked aggrieved but didn’t show much. She only said, “I’m 
sorry, I originally thought I had already convinced Mr. Marcus. I didn’t expect that. I’m so 
sorry. 

you should apologize to Sharon Edwin said, 

“You didn’t let me down. However, y 



Tilda’s eyes suddenly widened, and she immediately felt aggrieved. “Edwin, what do 
you mean by this? From the beginning to the end, it wasn’t me who said anything bad 
about Sharon. Why do you want me to apologize to her? Just became she helped you 
get this project! Edwin, how could you do this to me?” “Tilda’s eyes immediately turned 
red, and tears welled up in her eyes. 

Edwin looked at the pitiful Tilda in front of him. For some reason, he could not feel any 
pity for her. 

“Just because you don’t say it doesn’t mean I don’t know. Think about it carefully. What 
did you say to Andrew Edwin looked serious. 

“What can I say?” Tilda cried out, but her face was already pale, and her body trembled 
uncontrollably. 

“Did Sharon complain to your Her words can’t be trusted” Tilda had thought about it. 
How could a big shot like Andrew talk nonsense? It could only be sharon’s doing. 

Tilda wanted to say something, but Exhwein raised his hand and revealed his palm. 

Something was lying in his palm. 
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“My carting“” Tilda immediately touched her car. She had indeed lost an earring 

Your earring fell in the coffer house at the golf course, When the manager called me to 
pick it up, coincidently, I heard someone talking about you and those words you said to 
Andrew so derogate Sharon Edwin explained slowly. 

His every wond revealed the dirty hear that Tilda had buried under her skin! 

Tilda gripped the earning fightly, and the color on her face quickly faded. 

Her face was so pale that it was beyond recognition! 

She bit the comer of her lips tightly and her mouth was Billed with embarrassment! 

When talking to Andrew, she did not deliberately avoid others because she knew these 
staff had nothing to do with Edwin 

However, she had forgotten that there was something called comedence in this world. 

Coincidentally, her earring fell off. Edhrin happened to be there, and those people 
happened to be talking about her…- 



How did that happent Tilda was stunned. 

When the saw that Andrew was not as unapproachable as she had imagined, she 
pretended to mention Sharon after mentioning the collaboration. 

Her words were euphemistic, but the meaning behind them was deep 

Tilda had always maintained her image as a goddess perfectly, but because of this 
small mistake, it was completely ruined! 

“The reason why I said that was because I thought… Sharon didn’t want you to do 
business and thought she was here to cause trouble. I didn’t want Mr. Marcus to believe 
her, so I reminded him. Edwin, I did it for you and the company’s good. Tilda explained 
quickly 

She looked at Edwin with tears in her eyes. “You have to believe me.” 

Edwin did not say anything, but his eyes were coll 

Some things didn’t need to be said. 

However, a cultured person would never badmouth others in front of another person. 

Moreover, that person was a big shot like Andrew. 

Edwin did not understand what Andrew meant when he said Echen had to keep his 
eyes open when he looked for a girlfriend. It was only when he heard those discussions 
that he undersicol 

His silence was like a piece of iron pressing into Tilda’s chest. It was so heavy that she 
couldn’t breathe. 

Annoyed, she grabbed her hair and thought, “What is wrong with me? Whenever it 
comes to Sharon, I lose my composure. I knew the danger of gossiping in front of 
others, but I still couldn’t hold is in” 

“Go and rest first. I will have things to do Edwin said coldly and walked out. 

Tilla’s heart was filled with endless uneasiness. How could she let him go? She held his 
arm tightly. “Edwin, you have to believe me. I’m doing this for you and the project. I was 
just too anxious and wanted to help you. That’s why I went too far. But Sharon was also 
in the wrong about this thing. She appeared here coincidentally and kept targeting you 
and me. I naturally shought that she wanted to cause trouble. It makes sense for me to 
remind Mr. Marcus to pay attention to her. Besides, I think Sharon has a reason to help 
us. She only wants to break us upf 



Even at this point, she still did not forget to defend herself. 

When she defended herself, she did not forget to disparage Shuron again. 

Tilda” Edwin did not show any special emotions. Even though he was extremely 
disappointed in her, he did not show it. 

However, she still did not take her mistakes seriously and continued to crincize others. 
Edwin could not tolerate it anymore. 

He said, “Before you let your imagination run wild about others, straighten yourself first” 
His tone was harsher than ever. 

Even when she cheated on him and embarrassed him, he had never been so strict 

Tilda was so frightened that her body trembled and she did not dare to say anything 
else. 

She sensitively looked at Edwin’s expression and saw his disappointment. Her heart 
thumped again! 

0 
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Oh no! Edwin had seen through me and hated me! Where is he going in such a hurry? 
To chase Sharon! Sharon’s performance is so outstanding now. If he falls in love with 
her… Tilda felt a sense of insecurity she had never felt before. She was even more 
unwilling to let him leave. 

However, it would only make Edwin hate her even more if she forced him to stay… 

In her panic, Tilda’s mind suddenly lit up. Then, she covered her eyes tigluly and 
revealed a painful expression. “Edwin, my eyes don’t seem to be feeling well. They’re 
turning black. It’s so uncomfortable.” 

Edwin had already walked out. When he heard Tiida say her eyes were not feeling well, 
he suddenly turned around and held her 

“Don’t be afraid, I’m here. I’ll send you back to your room first” His voice immediately 
became nervous. He bent down and picked her up before striding toward the room. 

Tildar 



a wrapped her arms around his waist and buried her face in his chest 

Fortunately, Tim quick–witted. My eyes will become the best sword in my life. No matter 
what I do wrong in the future. I’ll be able to make him submit if I say my eyes don’t feel 
well. Good, Tilda thought 

Sharon returned to Hatherland early the next morning, 

After she got off the plane, she immediately saw Alanna’s hot and passionate figure 

Alanna did not avoid the crowd. She hugged Sharon passionately and shouted, 
“Darling, I missed you so much.” 

“Don’t be so mushy Sharon quickly avoided her and looked around. 

She could not let outsiders capture this scene. Those who did not know would think she 
had some shameful relationship with Alanna 

Well. Other people aren’t important, but Rbke is quite terrifying Sharon thought. 

The specialties Andrew gave her were not delivered so quickly. Sharon only brought a 
simple suitcase. 

She walked out side by side with Alanna 

Alanna had a hot figure and was dressed boldly 

Sharon’s body was slender and her clothes were elegant 

One quiet and one passionate. They were both tall and beautiful, attracting the attention 
of many people. 

The two of them were used to it and chatted as they walked. 

As they chatted. Alanna suddenly snapped her fingers. “Sharon, do you know how 
important a secret I’ve learned recently?” 

She deliberately kept Sharon in suspense to attract her attention 

Sharon looked over cooperatively. “Tell me about ” 

Alanna leaned her head closer and lowered her volume. “Do you remember the day I 
brought you to check your eyes we met Edwin and Tilda?” 

“Yes,” Sharon said flady. 



Sharon could meet these two people a few times a day in the past few days. She felt 
nauseous. 

Alanna’s expression became even more mysterious. “Do you believe it? Tilda’s vision in 
one eye is zerof 

“Zero vision?” Alanna’s words still shocked Sharon. 

She had never heard of it before 

“Tilda appears on TV V every day. Do you believe that her vision in one eye is zero? I 
don’t believe in Alanna pointed as her most vicious eyes There’s no need for a machine 
to verify it. Based on my eyes, I can tell she can’t be blind!” 

“What Are you going to report her! But she didn’t tell anyone that there’s something 
wrong with her eyes, Sharon replied without much interest. 

“That’s the problem!” Alanna clapped her hands. “Think about it. Tilda usually presends 
to be a goddess. She even shows off some damage to gain the fans‘ concern and often 
makes up fake inspirational stories to trick the fans into crying. Now, Tikla is blind in one 
eye, which means Tilda has an inspirational story. However, she never talks about it. Do 
you think it makes sense?” 

Sharon had never been willing to talk about Tilda, so she naturally would not sturdy her 
too much. However, she knew Alanna would not guess anything out of thin air, so she 
looked at her. “So. 

“Therefore, I made a bold guess. Tilda was not blind at all. That day, she went to check 
her eyes and said that she was blind. She only said it for 

Edwin to heart 1 can guarantee that no one else knows about this other than Edwin!” 

“So what?” Sharon asked. 

“That’s a big problem!” Alanna’s expression had already turned serious. She suddenly 
held Sharon’s hand… 
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“Sharon, have you ever thought that Tilda’s true motive for doing this is to snatch credit 
from you?” Alanna asked. 

“Snatching credit?” Sharon’s heart skipped a beat. 

She already understood what Alanna meant. 



But this thing 

“In the end, it’s just a guess. It’s not good to talk nonsense,” she reminded Alanna 

The corners of Alanna’s lips curled up. “Whether it’s a guess or not, won’t we know after 
investigating? We don’t want to get involved with ti 

these scumbags now, so we can let bygones be bygones. But this doesn’t mean we 
should let her take the credit and do nothing about it? 

Alanna was indignant about this. “It’s what it is. Tilda stepped on you four years ago and 
got a moment of peace and prosperity for a few years. Now, after four years, we can’t 
let her step on you again and be with Edwin forever!” 

Alanna was right. 

Sharon could forget what she had done for others in the past, but it did not mean that 
others could offend her as they pleased 

*TIE investigate this matter myself.” She did not want to involve Alanna in these messy 
affair. 

“Ive already sent someone to investigate. Moreover, there should be a result soon!” 
Alanna raised her eyebrows and said meaningfully. 

As soon as she finished speaking, her phone rang 

It was from Blake 

After hearing Blake’s words, Alanna raised her eyebrows one after another. The results 
are out?” 

Sharon followed Alanna back to her residence 

In the room, Blake was already waiting. 

He was wearing a steel–gray shirt and tie. It was obvious that he had just returned. 

When he saw Sharon, he raised his chin as a greeting 

Before Sharon could speak, he served her her favorite latte. 

“Hurry up and tell me Alanna was an impatient person. Before she even sat down, she 
urged. 

Blake shook his head helplessly at her, hiding the affection in his eyes. 



He was already used to Alanna’s impatience and knew there was no cure. 

“I went to the hospital to check. On the surface, the data shows that Tilda’s eyes are 
normal,” Blake said as he pushed Alanna to sit down 

“However, I found something interesting. Someone overheard Tilda’s medical 
examination doctor and nurse discussing that her left eye’s vision was zero. They also 
said that she didn’t want Edwin to know, so she deliberately hid it. What’s even more 
interesting is that Edwin happened to hear. it. At the same time, Edwin sent someone to 
find out who donated the cornea back then, but after Tikla checked her eyes, there’s no 
further information about this matter” 

Blake worked in many professions, but he was a detective in the first place. 

He had formed a dense network of detectives after operating for many years. It was not 
difficult to obtain this information 

“Therefore, we can almost confirm that Tilda took your credit. She is pretending to be 
blind and a cornea donor in front of Edwin! This woman is shameless!“* Alanna 
slatomed the table loudly. She was so angry that she wanted to pull Tilda over and cut 
her into pieces! 

“No, I’ll get her over now and expose her worldwide! Alanna was the kind of person who 
would immediately take action if she decided on something. She jumped up and wanted 
to catch Tilda 

Blake stopped her helplessly. “So what if you catch her now? So what if you expose her 
to the world? Her report says that her eyesight is normal. If you catch her like this, you’ll 
be affected” 

“Then what should we do? Should we just let her bully Sharon like this?” Alanna roared, 
her eyes suddenly turning red. 

She looked over at Sharon. Her heart felt like it was being twisted by a knife when she 
thought about how one of her eyes would never see again. 

Chapter 1 

“Alanna, Blake is r 

is right” Sharon also stopped her and comforted her. “Tilda is fine on the surface. We 
don’t have anything on her.” 

“This woman is too smart!” Alanna’s heart was filled with hatred. 

Sharon did not want to bother about this matter. 



Back then, she had donated her cornea voluntarily. She had also voluntarily kept it a 
secret and did not want Edwin to know. There was nothing to fuw about. 

Now that Edwin was willing to be a fool and was deceived by Tilda, she didn’t want to 
interfere. 

However, when she saw Alanna was so agitated, she was worried Alanna would take 
revenge for her without even caring about her future. So, she parted Anna’s shoulder 
and said, “Don’t worry, I’ll deal with this matter myself.” 

Alanna held her hand with heartache. “Sharon, I know you don’t want to have anything 
to do with Edwin anymore, but why should we give our credit to others? What’s this? 
Tilda is too shameless. We can’t spoil her! She used you four years ago to get out of 
trouble, but she didn’t appreciate it. She still wants to use you four years later, but I 
won’t let her! So, promise me that youll teach her a good lesson? 

“I promise you” Sharon nodded seriously, 

She knew that Alanna’s heart ached even more when it came to her. 

Moreover, Tilda was indeed shameless for doing this. 

After the discussion, Blake sent her off in place of Alanna 

“Alanna is a line impulsive. I’ll persuade her. You’re divorced from Edwin, so it’s 
inappropriate for you to fight head–on. Don’t force yourself to do anything you don’t 
want to do. Of course, I’ll do my best if you need me.” Blake was slightly older than her 
and Alanna. He could be said to be a big brother of the two of them. 

His concern came from the bottom of his heart. 

Sharon smiled and nodded. “Don’t worry, I won’t fight Edwin head–on. You don’t have 
to do this either.” 

“What do you want to do? Blake couldn’t help but be curious. 

Sharon looked at a figure not far away “Naturally, someone will help. 

Blake also saw the person at the door and nodded. “You’ve always been smart, but you 
still should be careful. Call me immediately if there’s a problem.” 

I know. Thank you, Blake” Sharon said goodbye to Make and walked out 

“Hey, isn’t this my ex–sister–in–law, Sharon!” As soon as she reached the door, she 
received a mocking voice. 



Tina twisted her body and walked over. She crossed her arms and looked at Sharon 
arrogandy. 

Behind her were a few lackeys. 

When she saw Tina, Sharon’s expression was indifferent. She didn’t greet her. 

Her behavior mude Tina extremely dissatisfied. She immediately thought of the 
humiliation she had suffered from Sharon. 

Tina walked over and gave her a hard push. “Who do you think you are? Wife of Bisney 
Entertainment’s boss? Stop lying to me. I’ve long heard that Bisney Entertainment’s 
boss dumped you!” 

“Growth fund of 40 million dollars? Divorce for you? It’s all a gimmick! He only wants to 
use you. After using you, he threw you away a long time ago” Tina looked at her 
provocatively. It was as if she was looking at a rag thrown to the ground. 

Sharon was firmly planted on the ground and was not moved because of her push 

She looked at Tina with a faint sanile. “Clara told you this, right? Why do you trust her 
so much? 

Tina was so stunned that she forgot to vent her anger. 

She was surprised that Sharon knew she had a helper! 

Sharon smiled faintly. “There are two things to remind you. Firstly, if you bully people 
here, it will be easy for others to see. The name of the sister of Genesis Group’s CEO is 
a little famous. It will easily attract attention online. Secondly, your helper isn’t as smart 
as you think. There’s someone behind her. If you trust her that much, you won’t even 
know how you died one day? 

“Impossible!” Tima refused to believe it 

Sharon smiled. “Why don’t you take these lackeys who are used to scare me to scare 
her and see if she will tell the truth! Also, there’s one more important thing to remind 
you.” 

“What’s that?” Tina didn’t even notice Sharon had led her thoughts. 

The corners of Sharon’s lips curled up slightly as she slowly spoke. 
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“What you need to care about isn’t whether Bisney Entertainment’s boss is related to 
me but when your new sister–in–law and your brother be married, Sharon said 

“New sister–in–land” Tina was confused. “What nonsense are you talking about? My 
brother hasn’t been going on blind dates recently. How can have a new sister–in–law?” 

“It seems like your news is lagging behind mine.” Sharon intentionally put on a mocking 
expression. “Your brother and Tilda are a couple. Everyone. around your brother knows 
that she is about to become your new sister–in–low. She is Tildar Sharon said calmly 

Tina felt like she had eaten a fly at the word “Tikla“. 

“she 

“Is my brother crazy!” she blurted our 

The incident of Tilda cheating on Edwin four years ago is still vivid in my mind. In the 
blink of an eye, she is marrying Edwin! Once they get married, who knows how many 
people will be talking about what happened four years ago? How embarrassing it’ll be 
for me Tins thought furiously 

“Sharon, if you dare to be to me. til beat you to death!” She still had a trace of caution. 

Sharon’s expression was indiferent. “Theard that Tilda donated cornea to Edwin many 
years ago. One of her eyes lus zero vision. Under such circumstances, if your brother 
doesn’t marry her, he will be criticized by the world” 

“She donated cornea years ago? Zero vision in one eye! Are you kidding me?” Tina felt 
that these words were too ridiculous 

Sharon pursed her lips and did not say anything else. She got into a car by the roadside 
and left. 

Outside the car, Tina was still stomping her foot. 

Sharon’s gaze was light. 

The perion Sharon was looking for to deal with Tilda was Tina 

She felt Tma should not disappoint her. 

After Tilda returned to Hatherland, she immediately went to look for Edric 

“How’s the investigation going?” Edric was originally sitting on the chair with his body 
tilted. When he saw her, he immediately stood up and the laziness on his face 
disappeared. 



“There’s too little information left on this matter. It’s not easy to investigate, Edric said as 
he scratched his head. He was a little embarrassed to meet Tikla. 

It was rare for Tilda to give him a mission, 

1, but he did not complete it well. 

“To help you investigate this matter, I made a trip to Pinevale, Sharon’s hometown. 
However, no one there has seen the boss of Risney Entertainment. That person has 
never been there either.” This meant that Edric had not found anything 

Edric was so useless. Tilda was indescribably annoyed. 

“Although I didn’t find anything, I did find out about you and Edwin. It turns out that the 
two of you have known each other long ago,” Edric said again. When he spoke, huis 
voice was already embarrassed. “I was always curious why he treated you so well back 
then. I thought that he fell in love with you at first sight. It turns out that the two of you 
fell in love with each other over time.” 

“Over time?” Tikla was about to leave when she suddenly heard his words and was 
stunned. 

She was completely confused and could not understand the situation at all. ‘I knew 
Edwin after Edric. Wasn’t in love at first sight? 

Edric was immersed in his thoughts and did not notice the expression on Tilda’s face at 
all. He sighed and said, “So you two met when Edwin had a problem with his eyes. 
Edwin hasa cokl personality. It’s difficult for ordinary people to get close to him, 
especially for women. It’s apparent that you didn’t leave him back then, which made him 
fall deeply in love with you.” 

Edric’s words were getting more and more off 

0 

He was talking about her, but she had never experienced it before! 

“I even went to the hospital and heard from the doctor. Back then, Edwin refused to 
cooperate with the treatment. It was all because you persuaded him. His family ignored 
him because he was find. It was also you who accompanied him every day. Later on, he 
decided to treat his eyes well. It was also you who encouraged him.” The more Edrit 
spoke, the more disappointed he became 
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“Why wasn’t me the one who lost my sight back then! If it was me, would I also 
encounter Tilda? This way, Edwin wouldn’t snatch her away in advance, right Edric 
thought 

When Tilla beard him say this, she felt her head buzzing 

Edric did not know, but she understood something. So, before I met Edwin, Edwin had 
fallen for another woman. That woman had such a relationship with him. Edric 
acknowledged me as that woman 

“No wonder. Back then, I asked Edwin why he liked you so much and pursted you the 
moment he saw you, He said that although it was the first time you met, you had known 
each other for a long time. The desolation in Edric’s voice could not be concealed. At 
that time, I felt these words were awkward and inexplicable. Only today did I completely 
understand. Speaking of which, Edwin is impressive. He recognized you just from your 
voice 

Tilda was stunned. 

Not only did Edric recognize her as that woman, but even Edwin…. 

“No wonder Tilda had always been unable to figure out some problems, but after 
hearing Edric’s words, she suddenly understood. 

No wonder Edwin was cold to everyone except her 

ven when he was so impatient. Even if 

No wonder he would indulge her and dote on her no matter how willful and pretentious 
she was in the past, even angry, he would not say anything barsh on her 

No wonder that even though she had cheated on him in public and embarrassed him, 
he still agreed to her requests. 

It was for no other reason than… he had recognized the wrong persand 

He mistook her for the benefactor who had never left him. 

Tilda’s heart skipped a beat. Realizing this, her face turned pale! 

It turned out that she was not the person Edwin liked for real. 

He loved her only because of a misunderstanding 

How ironic 



Tilda’s horizons were broadened because of Edwin over the years. She was also 
extremely arrogant 

As arrogant as she was, she suddenly realized that all her willfulness was because of a 
misunderstanding. This was undoubtedly a slap in her face. 

It was painful, unbearable, and extremely frustrating! 

She suddenly felt she was a thief who had stolen everything from others without a word. 

Tilda could not take this outcome. She held her head tightly. “How, how could this be 

How can I accept someone else’s inexplicable gift! I’m a specially privileged person. I 
can get Edwin’s love by my ability! Damn it, why did so many misunderstandings 
happen? With those thoughts in mind, Tilda ran out to tell Edwin the truth 

She didn’t want to be a substitutel 

She did not want to accept this inexplicable charity! 

Tilda had just taken a step when Edric’s voice sounded again. “That’s strange. That 
doctor said that your family makes shoes, I remember that undle didn’t make any shors. 
There must be a mistake” 

The speaker was unintentional, but the listener was interested 

Tilda froze in mid–step 

Her face was deathly pale! 

Indeed, her uncle’s family did not make shoes. 

at she remembered her grandmother saying that Sharon was the shoemaker’s 
daughter, 

“Could it be “Tilda did not dare to think further. She covered her head forcefully. 

“Tilda, what’s wrong? Only then did Edric realize that something was wrong with Tilda. 
He ran over to support her. 

When he touched Tilda’s hand, he felt extreme coldness. 

it your 

Only then did Edric realize her face was as white as a sheet 



you 

Terrified, he nigged her tighter. 1 get you to the hospital now” 

Just as he was about to bend down and pick up Tilda, Tilda grabbed his collar rightly. 

She used force and pulled it to her eyes. 

Edric was stunned. “Tilda… you?” 

Tilda bit her lip hard and said, “Listen!” 
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“Edwin and I hate this past, especially Edwin! If you don’t want him to hate you, don’t 
mention this in the future!” Tilda said it in a completely commanding tone. 

Not only did Edric not have any suspicion, he even nodded. “Don’t worry, I won’t 
mention it” 

He did not care how much Edwin did not want to talk about it, but as long as Tilda did 
not like it, he would not do it! 

Seeing how serious he was, Tilda finally let go. She turned around and walked out. 

She did not dare to let Edric see her sorry state. She only closed her eyes in pain when 
she got into the car. 

No matter how hard she tried, she could not hide the extreme shock and despair in her 
eyes. If that person was Sharon… Then what am I All the love Edwin gave me turned 
into something I stole from Sharon. The thing I have been proud of for so many years 
was given to me by SharontTM 

Tilda might not have cared so much if it were any other woman. 

And she wouldn’t have such a big reaction 

But it was Sharon. 

The woman she had never taken seriously had suddenly become her happiness giver. 
This was even worse than slapping her face. 

It was like sipping on her and rubbing her against the ground: 

No, it was a hundred times more humiliating, or ten thousand times more! 



She was the noble and outstanding Tilda. How could she withstand Sharon’s charity? 

She wanted to tell Edwin the truth immediately! 

Tilda wanted to let Sharon know that even without these, she was sull Edwin’s treasure! 

Tilda quickly took out her phone and called Edwin’s number, 

However, the moment she pressed the button, she suddenly hung up! 

In the end, she covered her face dejectedly 

In the past, the might have had a chance of winning. 

However, the Current Sharon was unbelievably outstanding. 

Not only did she know how to race, but she also had a very close relationship with a big 
shot like Andrew. 

After the divorce, Sharon had always trampled on her. Tilda had already lost several 
times. 

Under such circumstances, she had no confidence in winning against Sharon! 

Losing to Sharon was no different from asking her to die! 

Tilda’s mind was still in a mess. She was immersed in the humiliation brought by the 
truth and could not decide whether to reveal the truth to 

Edwin. 

But her phone rang. 

A female voice came from the other end. “Ms. Gill, Mr. Stanley Group 

Stanley has something important to discuss with you. Can you please come to Genesis 

“Alright” Tilda’s mind was in a mess. She had no energy to consider why Edwin asked 
her to go to Genesis Group. 

She started the car and went to Genesis Group 

When the got downstairs, she touched up her makeup in the car. She put some blush 
on her pale face and deepened her lipstick 



Seeing that she had regained her original bright image, she pushed the door open and 
walked down. 

She went straight to the top floor. 

Tilda, what are you doing here?” In the corridor, Tilda met May, and May asked in 
surprise. 
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Tilda raised her eyebrows. “Didn’t Edwin call me over?” 

“Mr. Stanley?” May thought about it and recalled it “No” 

She was Edwin’s most capable assistant. If he were looking for Tilda for official 
business, he would go through May: 

And Edwan could have made this call himself if it was a private affair. 

“Don’t tell m 

you’ve been deceived,” said May. 

Previously, Tilda’s mind was in a mess and she did not have time to think about it 
carefully. Now that May reminded her, she also realized the problem. 

May was a sensitive person. She reached out and pulled her back. “Follow me in first. 
I’ll call you after I find out the situation.” 

As she spoke, she pulled her into the client’s room 

She had just reached the door when someone rushed out “Why are you in such a 
hurry? Why are you hiding?” 

Tilda and May looked up and saw a beautiful figure. 

That person was dressed in branded clothes and had a graceful figure. However, the 
pickiness on her face made one feel uncomfortable 

“Miss Tina?” May was the first to call our 

It was none other than Tima. 



“What brings you here! May knew that Tina was not someone to be triffed with, so she 
probed. 

Tina’s eyes were fixed on Tida. T’m here to show my concern for M. Gill” 

“So, you were 

you were the one who called me here?” Tilda finally understood 

Tina nodded with a smule. “That’s right. I heard something was wrong with your eyes, 
so I paid a high price to hire a good doctor to treat your eyes” 

After saying that, she pointed at the doctor beside her. 

When Tilda saw the doctor, her head exploded. Her face could not hold it in anymore 
and turned pale again! 

May’s face did not look much better either. If it were not for the fact that she had been 
by Edwin’s side for many years and had seen many emergencies, she would have 
collapsed long ago! 

She quickly restrained her nervousness and faced Tina Miss Tina, how considerate you 
are! Tilda has a specialist ophthalmologist. You don’t have to worry about that” 

“But, I’ve already invited the doctor. I can’t just leave empty–handed.” Tina smiled 
faintly. 

Her expression was calm, but she hated Tilda to death 

She had just followed Sharon’s instructions and went to look for Clara. That woman had 
indeed told her a lot 

Tina thought she had cleverly used Tilda, but the truth was, she was used instead! 

Not only was she used, but even the falling out between the boss of Bisney 
Entertainment and Sharon was told by Filda 

The goal was to use her hand to mess with Sharon! 

Although Tina wasn’t smart, she had a strong sense of self–esteem. How could she 
swallow her anger after being used like this! 

She had found an ophthalmologist to expose Tilda thoroughly! 

“My eyes are fine. I don’t need to be treated!” Tilda had also recovered and coldly 
refused. 



In any case, the fact that her eyes weren’t good hadn’t spread to the outside world. She 
thought if she insisted that her eyes were fine, Tina didn’t 

dare to mess around. 

When Tina heard this, she nodded and seemed to believe her. 

rg and was about to leave. 

She raised her leg 

Tilda and May were about to heave a sigh of relief when they heard Tina call out, 
“Edwin, did you hear that? Ms. Gill said her eyes are fine, and there’s no problem with 
her eyes!” 

This shout shocked Tilda and May. When they turned around, they saw Edwin walking 
out from the door at the side. 

The two of them were stunned. 

Edwin walked out expressionlessly and looked at Tilda. 

Although he did not say anything, his gaze was too oppressive, making it difficult for her 
to breathe. She almost could not stand steadily. 

Tilda would have fallen to the ground if not for May’s support. 

May secretly pinched her and shook her head almost imperceptibly. Then, she greeted 
Edwin, “Mr. Stanley. I don’t know who is spreading rumors that there’s something wrong 
with Tilda’s eyes. If word gets out, Tilda will be guessed by her fans.” 

There was a hidden meaning in her words. She told Edwin they shouldn’t make it public 
that something was wrong with Tilda’s eyes. 

Before Edwin could say anything. Tina snorted and said, “Tilda, don’t you like to show 
your weakness in front of your fans? You even broadcasted a small cut on your finger to 
ask for their concern. Now that you’ve ruined an eye for the man you love, what’s there 
to hide? If you tell the public, the fans will probably pity you even more. They might even 
help you force my brother to marry you.” 

Well..” Tilda lowered her eyes, afraid that she would reveal the nervousness in her heart 

She clenched her fats tightly, showing her disgust for Tina 

“Tilda cherishes her relationship with Mr. Stanley very much. How can she bear to let 
the fans interfere? Those fans are hot–headed and might do something rash. If they 



force Mr. Stanley to marry Tikla, their relationship would change, right?” May was 
quick–witted and planned every step perfectly. 

Tilda nodded. “Tina, I only want a quiet relationship with your brocher. Let us deal with 
our business ourselves, okay?” 

“No.” Tina shook her head violently. 

Tilda’s heart was filled with hatred. Her fingers pinched her palm again and again. 

However, she did not want to show 100 much on her fer. She looked at Edwin 

Her eyes were watery and she looked extremely aggrieved 

She tried to expel Tina through Edwin 
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Tina turned around and walked up to Edwin, “Edwin, Tilda donating cornea to you is not 
just about you, It concerns the entire Stanley family! She has made a great contribution, 
so the Stanley family can’t let her lose, right? I heard that there’s a world–class 
ophthalmology medical team that has successfully treated many ophthalmology patients 
who have been sentenced to death by doctors. Let’s give Ms. Gill a good checkup. If 
there’s something wrong with her eyes, we must treat her even if we have to spend all 
the Stanley family’s money” 

As soon as she said this, Tilda and May free again, their minds buzzing, thinking. How 
could Tina be so kind she must have heard something from somewhere and was 
looking for trouble. 

“Tina, this is a matter between your brother and me. We’ll settle it ourselves, okay?” 
Tilda maintained her goddesslike image and restrained her worry as she spoke softly. 

Her elegant and noble appearance made Tina seem insensible, noisy, and 
unreasonable. 

Tina was so angry that her blood was about to come out. She raised her head and 
wanted to say something, but Edwin had rubbed his eyebrows and said, “Tina, you 
should go back first” 

“Edwin!” Tina stomped her foot in anger. 

However, she knew Edwin’s temper. She did not dare to say anything else and could 
only leave angrily. 



After Tina was successfully chased away. Tilda’s tense heart finally relaxed. She finally 
felt alive. 

May also felt relieved. 

Edwin looked at May. “Ms. Moira, prepare two cups of coffer 

“Okay” May left quickly. 

“Edwin.” Tilda ran over and hooked his arm with a smile on her face. Tina has the 
temper of a child. Don’t hold it against her.” 

Edwin did not say anything. He pushed the door open and brought her into the office. 

With a click, he closed the doar 

Seeing him close the door, a shy smile appeared on Tilda’s face. 

She thought that he wanted to make out with her alone 

Ever since they returned to the country, Edwins said that the two of them would start 
over, but he did not do anything intimate to her other than hold hands 

She had long wanted to be closer to him. 

She took the initiative to lean forward and was about to offer her lips. 

Edwin dodged and pressed his long Engers on the table. “Tilda, I bring you to check 
your eyes.” 

“What?” Tilda was immersed in the joy of being alone with Edwin. When she heard this, 
she froze on the spot 

The nerves that had d just relaxed tensed up again! 

Edwin made a call in front of her. “Arrange for the best ophthalmologist!” 

“No!” Tilda was scared out of her wits. She jumped over and snatched his phone away. 
She shouted, “I’m sorry, we don’t need an ophthalmologist here. Im sorry, I dialed the 
wrong number 

She said that quickly. 

It was not until she finished speaking that she realized something was wrong. 

She couldn’t help but look up at Edwin. 



She saw the deep gaze in his eyes press over. 

on the phone in her hand 

Her gaze was fixed on 

As if someone had turned it on in slow motion, she lowered her hand and looked at the 
phone screen slowly. 

There was nothing there. 

Edwin did not dial any number just now! 

Band! 

Something hit the back of her head hard, and Tilda was stunned. 

Her mind was completely blank! 

Her eyes were blank and emptyt 

Fear, uneasiness, guilt, and embarrassment quickly surfaced in her eyes. 

She bit her lip silently. The next moment, she rushed to him and pulled his sleeve 
tightly. “Edwin, let me explain!” 

Edwin did not say anything 

No scolding, no growling, no shouting, no arstions asked. 

The more he acted like this, the more afraid Tilda wa 

She felt like millions of stones were pressing against her heart, and her only straw broke 
with a 

She was completely defeated. She suddenly covered her face and said, “I’m sorry. Em 
sorry” 

Edwin looked at her calmly 

There was no 

was no surprise in 

сукі. 



This was because he already knew the answer from the test just now, 

However, the disappointment in his eyes was heavy 

“How did you become like thid?” he asked sotily, 

His tone was cold: 

Tilda’s body trembled. She was too ashamed to see him! 

However, she suddenly remembered that even though Edwin had long suspected her, 
he still seat Tina and May away because he didn’t want her to make a fool of herself. 

She believed he still had feelings for her 

She immediately became spirited again. She pulled him pitifully and cried, “Actually. 
Well, I’m like this because 1 care too much about you. Edwin, it’s because I love you” 

Edwin lowered his eyes and looked at her hand pulling his sleeve. His gaze was cold. 

He raised his fingers and broke off her fingers one by one. 

Tilda’s hands missed. She staggered and cried even harder. “Edwin, is it wrong for me 
to cherish you now? I know it is wrong, but my feelings for you are real. Didn’t you also 
want me to treat you wholeheartedly? I’m trying, Edwin!” 

“Tilda, your efforts are too nauseating Edwin finally spoke. The words that came out of 
his mouth were as cold and hard as see! 

Tilda looked at him in disbelief. He didn’t see much anger on his tense cheeks, only 
coldness! 

This coldness was even more scorching than fire, making her heart tremble and ache! 

It made her head buzz! 

She was so anxious that she threw herself into his arms, trying to hug him 

Edwin stretched out his long fingers and pressed her down. 

The distance between the two of them was as long as an arm. Edwin was unwilling to 
let her get close to him again. 

*Is it fair for 



for you to do this to the girl who donated her cornea to me for free?” he asked in a low 
voice. 

Tilda was too embarrassed to show her face. 

She was also a proud girl and did not want to do such a thing. 
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She did not say this because the overwhelming fear was drowning her! 

Edwin was a sentimental person. If he wanted to find the girl who donated her cornea 

ea for free, would she still have a place to stand? 

She gripped Edwin’s wrist nervously. The more desperate she was, the more she 
wanted to find an exit. She shouted again. “Didn’t you say the girl donated cornea for 
freet She did everything willingly. No one forced her. She didn’t take the credit herself. 
I’m just borrowing it to ease our relationship. What’s wrong with wanting our relationship 
to be deeper?” 

After shouting. Tilda suddenly came to a realization. What did I say?” 

Even though these were her heartfelt words, she could never say them to Edwin 

But she had already said it… She could not take it back. 

As expected, the disgust on Edwin’s face deepened. He retracted his hand and did not 
look at her anymore. “I’ll get May to send you back.” 

Although he did not say anything else, Tilda had already realized that their relationship 
might be over. 

Unwilling to give up, she looked at him. “What about us? When are we getting 
engaged?” 

Edwin placed his hands by his side and only looked at her. 

He didn’t give her any response. 

Tilda was the first to feel ashamed. 

How could Edwin accept such a thing if she couldn’t get through it herself? 



How could he be engaged to her 

“May, send Ms. Gill back.” Edwin turned around and made a call. 

After the call, he walked out without saying anything else. 

Tilda looked at his cold back and her e emire world collapsed! 

“It’s over! It’s over for real! But this is not the result I want? Tilda thought dejectedly. 

Just as May pushed the door open and Edwin was about to leave, Tilda suddenly 
rushed over and closed the door tighdys 

She pressed her back against the door and forced herself to look into Edwin’s eyes. 
“Edwin, you have no right to push me away!” 
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“Have you forgotten? I was the one who accompanied you through the tough times in 
Pinevale! I was the one who advised you to cooperate with the doctor and encouraged 
you to treat your eyes to drag you out of the mire! If it weren’t for me, you would still be 
abandoned by the Stanley family. You would still be blind! With so much company, can’t 
it compare to a pair of corneas! Now, you forced me to beg for your love by pretending 
to donate my cornes to you, and I’ve become someone even I despise. Isn’t it enough? 
Will you only be satisfied when you force me to my death?” After shouting this, she 
covered her face in embarrassment. 

Tears flowed endlessly from between her fingers. 

It was not so 

was not so much sorrow as embarrassment 

I have finally fallen to such a state. To keep a man, I did not hesitate to snatch the credit 
of the most unappealing enemy Tikda thought sell- mockingly 

Edwin lowered his head silently and looked at her. 

Although he didn’t say anything, the coldness in his eyes dissipated gradually. 

Tilda’s words were like whips to his heart.. 

Indeed, she had done many things that he co 

could not accept 



But she was also the person who had accompanied him through his most difficult times. 

They had promised to accompany each other for the rest of their lives. 

They even promised not to mention this mi 

matter for the rest of their lives and only remember it in their hearts. 

Now, he had forced her to disregard the agreement. 

Guilt rose in his heart. He slowly reached out with his fingers and brushed Tilda’s head. 
Finally, he pulled her into his arms and hugged her. Tm 

Sharon missed Irene and her father. Soon, she set off back to Pinevale 

As she was driving, she heard her phone buzz 

She took the opportunity when she went to the service area to refuel to check her phone 

It was an income 

was an income notification.. 

A large sum of money suddenly appeared in her bank account 

The corners of Sharori’s lips curled up slightly as she dialed Ray’s number. “Mr. Gildon, 
didn’t I say I was repaying your kindness by helping you with Mr. Marcus’s matter? Why 
did you transfer such a sum of money over!” 

Ray’s voice was filled with helplessness, “This is something that Edwin insisted on me 
doing. You know his temper. If I don’t do it well, he will be angry with me. He might even 
abandon the project” 

Edwin’s idear Sharon’s lips twitched slightly. 

She could tell he wanted to clear things up with her and didn’t want to owe her a dime 

“What should I do! I’m only doing this for your sake. It has nothing to do with him. Are 
you trying to humiliate me by sending me this money?” Sluron said half–jokingly. 

Ray didn’t know what to say 

He could not help but wipe his forehead, 

Cold sweat broke out 



One insisted on giving, while the other insisted on refusing 

Kay wondered what he should do. 

He wild, Just keep it. The things I did in the past were nothing.” 

He was telling the truth. 
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“But to me, it’s my life–saving grace, Sharon said solemnly. The brightness in her eyes 
had dimmed. If it weren’t for you, there wouldn’t be me or 

For some reason, Ray’s hran skipped a beat when he heard her words, followed by a 
sharp pain. 

He could not help but think of how she had fallen into the snow back then and frozen to 
the point of death. Her face was paler than the snow, the |tomers of her lips cracked, 
and she looked disheveled. 

Also, in the 

the hospital, she was covered in blood. She cried and knelt on the ground, begging the 
sector to draw her blood. 

The more he thought about it, the more his heart ached. 

“Why don’t you marry me?” Ray almost blurted out. 

“Mr. Gildon, don’t joke around.” Sharon did not take it seriously. Her tone was indiferent 
“You’ve done me a great favor. How can I tarnish your reputation! How about this? Ell 
return half of the money to you. Take it that I’ve accepted Edwin’s money and returned 
your favor.” 

Ray wanted to say that he was not joking, 

He wanted to tell her she wouldn’t tarnish his reputation if she chose to be with him. 
Instead, it was fulfilling his wish. 

He did not say it out loud. 

Through this period of interaction, he became more and more clear about Sharon’s 
personality. She would not change her mind once she made a 



decision. 

If he confessed, she might never meet him again 

“Alright.” In the end, Ray could only smile bitterly and nod. 

Sharon quickly transferred half of the money to Ray before returning to her hometown, 

At dusk, Ethan led Irene to have fun again after dinner. 

When the linle girl said she wanted to catch butterflies. Ethan brought her to do it in the 
wildflowers. 

Knowing that her faiber pampered his granddaughter, Sharon was too lazy to stop them 
and let them be 

She lay in the shelter chair under the melon vines in the courtyard, enjoying the 
tranquility of the evening for once. 

Knock, knock, knock 

There were sudden knocks on the door. 

Sharon thought a customer had come to retrieve his shoes, so she quickly opened the 
door. 

Brandon was standing outside 

His BMW SUV was also parked at the entrance. It was quite imposing. 

“Brandon, what’s the matter?” Sharon asked. 

Brandon nodded and took out a basket of fruits. This is a new variety from the orchard. 
Try it 

Sharon lowered her head and looked at the basket of fruits. All of them were smooth 
and big. It was obvious that they had been carefully selected. 

Brandon’s family managed many agricultural by–products. He had better taste than 
others, and many fruits of theirs were directly exported 

Overseas 

From the looks of it, these fruits were for export. 

It must be expensive. 



Sharon saw this and smiled. She did not take it immediately. “Why don’t I pay you 
money for this?” 

“Are you trying to humiliate me with money?” Brandon looked at her face and asked 

Sharon was speechless. 

It wasn’t that she didn’t understand what Brandon meant. Sie knew he still had feelings 
for her. 

However, she finally left the grave of marriage. She did not want to be in another 
relationship at all. 
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Brandon was a smart person. He knew she would refuse if he gave her something else, 
so he chose fruits. 

He would also give ordinary neighbors fruits. It wouldn’t be too abrupt, but it also 
expressed his sincerity. 

How could Sharon not understand what he was thinking? 

However, she did not refuse and took the fruits. 

Then, she took a few bags from specialties she brought back from Satisetion. Then, she 
placed them in his basket. “It’s impolite not to reciprocate. Try this 

Brandon’s muddy face showed a hint of discomfort. 

Although Sharon did 

not say a word, she had already used her actions to tell him that she would not give him 
any 

chance 

He silently took the bags of specialties and smiled bitterly. “You don’t like me because 
there’s someone else in your heart. If I’m not wrong, it’s that man, right?” 

He reached out and pointed in one direction 

Sharon followed his gaze and saw a figure standing by the door. 



The person stood there salently, adding a touch of color to the gray alley. 

The dark blue color was gloomy and eye–catching 

That person’s face was even more outstanding. His glowy skin made the surrounding 
scenery suddenly pale. 

“He’s indeed better–looking than me, and his car is also better than mine,” Brandon said 
in a defeated tone. As the richest man in this place, he felt a strong sense of inferiority 
this time. 

Sharon had already recognized that person. It was Edwin. 

‘Shouldn’t he be at home? Why is he here? she wondered. 

Brandon thought he had guessed right when he saw Sharon did not respond and only 
stared at Edwin Resigned to his fate, he nodded, got into his SUV, and left. 

Edwin was neither far nor close. Shuron was not sure if he was looking for her. She did 
not want to embarrass herself. So, she pretended not to see him and turned around to 
close the door 

A lund reached over and grabbed hers. 
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Sharon turned around and looked at him in confusion. 

“Mr. Stanley, what’s the matter? Seeing that Edwin was silent for a long time, she had 
no choice but to speak- 

Edwin let go of her hand. His gaze was heavy, 

“Why did you ask Tina to expose Tilda?” he asked 

So, Tina I went to do at Sharon wondered. 

It was not surprising that Tina would look for trouble with Tilda. What surprised her was 
that Edwin would come to her 

“From the beginning to the end. I’ve always been the one who ignored you. I’ve told you 
many times if you have any dissatisfaction, come to me. Don’t implicate other innocent 
people. Why won’t you listen?” he added. 

There was anger, impatience, and annoyance in his tone. 



When Sharon heard this, she understood a lot. 

Even if Tina exposed Tilda’s fake eye disease, he chose Tilda, 

Is that woman still the best in his eyes even if she commits murder and arson? Sharon 
wondered 

“Where do you get the confidence to think I have the time to be dissatisfied with you! 
Even if I’m dissatisfied, we’re already divorced. In not so prity as to bicker with you!” she 
said coldly 

Her words were heavy and her eyes were cold! 

Edwin looked at her with dark eyes 

She had said too many similar things after the divorce. However, she had said and done 
different things every time. He did not believe her! 

Sharon knew Edwin too well. 

She could guess what he was thinking from the change in his expression. 

Seeing his expression, her heart ached. 

People who went back on their word had always felt that others were just as 
untrustworthy as them Edwin was such a person. 

“I’m indeed targeting her. This is all because of the grudge between me and her. Mr. 
Stanley, don’t think too highly of yourself and let your imagination run wild. My 
relationship with her has nothing to do with you!” Sharon said furiously. 

She exposed Tilda, but it wasn’t even considered revenge, 

She only didn’t want her to take credit for it. 

Her expression was cold, and her eyes were even so 

In the past, her eyes were filled with starlight when she saw him. Now, there was no 
place for him! 

Edwin saw her cold and distant gaze, and his chest inexplicably swelled. 

“What grudge do you have against Tilda?” He suddenly wanted to know. 

Sharon smiled bleakly. “What grudge?” 



It was a huge grudge. 

Many images surfaced in her mind. 

The corners of her lips curled up. Not wanting to hide anything, she said, “She and L‘ 

As soon as she started saying. Edwin’s phone rang. 

He picked it up. It was unknown what the other party said, but his coll eyes suddenly 
narrowed as he said, “I’ll be right back!” 

With that, he hung up. 

Sharon looked at him. 
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Although she did not know what the person on the other end said or who it was, she 
knew that the person who could make Edwin so anxious must be Tilda 

For the sake of Tilda, he came over in the middle of the night to question and scold 
Sharon. 

Now, he ran back overnight for Tikia. 

Tilda was indeed lucky. 

“I don’t care what kind of grudge you have with Tilda. She is mine now. I will protect 
her!” Edwin was not in the mood to listen to her. 

With that, he got into the car and left!. 

Sharon chuckled as she watched the car drive away 

As she laughed, tears rolled down her face. 

She had already said that she would not shed another tear for Edwin. 

However, she was still injured when she heard him protect Tilda without any bottom 
line. 

He used these words to trample her under his feet and even turned all the things she 
had done for him into a joket 



She did not hesitate to lose her eyes to help him and turn herself blind, but he treated 
her as an enemy. 

Wasn’t that a joke! 

When Sharon was sad. Tüda was not very happy either. 

She lay on the bed with her eyes closed, her beautiful face full of sorrow… 

May sat beside her helplessly and touched her forehead again and again. “Didn’t you 
turn the situation around? Why are you still sad Look, as soon as I called Mr. Stanley, 
he immediately rashed over. He’s like before now. It’s a good thing that he values you.” 

“You don’t understand!” Tilda said weakly. 

No one understood what she was thinking 

The more Edwin cared about her, the more she felt like a thief who had stollen someone 
else’s credit and was enjoying it here. 

She had always been high and mighty However, she forced herself to become a thief! 

Her pride and self–esteem couldn’t allow her to accept it. 

“It’s all your fault! Why did you persuade me to pretend to be some comes donor? IF 
you hadn’t come up with this stupid idea, everything wouldn’t have turned out like this!” 
she growled, her voice full of resentment 

May was embarrassed and quickly: 

ickly admitted her mistake. “It’s indeed my fault. I didn’t expect Sharon to find out and 
get Tina to expose you. But 

Tilda, isn’t this matter over!! 

She did not know what had happened before between Sharon and Edwin, let alone that 
Edwin had mistaken Tilda for “Bir Eyes” from the past, that Tilda had replaced Sharon to 
live such a good life. 

May also did not know that Tilda knew all of this 

Tilda covered her face tightly. 

She still wanted to flare up. 



If it weren’t for May, Tina wouldn’t have exposed her, and she wouldn’t have taken the 
initiative to pretend to be “BIG Eyes” if she wasn’t exposed. 

Thut way, Tikda could still live goble and arrogantly. 

However, she knew very well that she could not flare up again. 

If she got angry again and aroused May’s suspicion, she would only be even more 
embarrassed if May exposed the past. 

She couldn’t tell May, her best friend, that Sharon was Big Eyes, and she was mistaken 
for Big Eyes, and she had taken the initiative to claim credit from otherd 

Tikda took a deep breath, looked at May, and said, “I’m sorry, May, I didn’t mean to get 
angry at you, and as for the cornea thing, you were doing 
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this for my good and wanted to help me. I was spouting nonsense on impulse. You’re 
not angry 

Her one was gentle and pitiful as she gently shook May’s arm. 

try with me, May, are you?” 

Tilda was the goddesslike girl in her heart, the perfect image. How could May be angry? 

She shook her head. “It’s my fault. If I hadn’t decided, you wouldn’t be in such an 
awkward situation today. Don’t worry, I’ll take the initiative to talk to Mr. Stanley and 
resolve your misunderstanding” 

“No, you don’t have to do this. May, you’re not in the wrong Tilda iried her best to 
persuade May. Things have already become like this. Let’s leave it at that Listen to me 
and don’t cause trouble 

again” 

The more Tilda acted like this, the more guilty May felt. She was even more determined 
to help Tilda clear her name 

She said nothing on the surface and stayed with Tilda for a while before leaving. 

Looking at the closed door, a faint smile appeared on Tilda’s beautiful face. 



She knew May well and knew that she would talk to Edwin and take the blame for 
everything 

Although Edwin forgave her because she was “Big Eyes“, this matter would eventually 
cause a rift between them. Only it M 

if May took the initiative to take the blame could the relationship between Edwin and 
Tilda return to normal. 

“May, this is your rotten idea. It’s not my fault Tilda thought that she could differentiate 
between gratitude and grudges. She did not feel guilty at 

all 

 


