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  Chapter 11 The Truth 

   In order for an intern agent to become a full-time agent, in 
addition to the appreciation and recommendation of the team leader, 
the most important thing is the signature of the team leader. Without 
the signature of the supervisor, even if he joins an investigation team, 
he can only get the salary of a trainee detective. 

  This is a matter of principle. 

   As far as Augustus is concerned, Roan's performance today is 
remarkable. 

From 12:00 noon to 7:00 p.m., Roan and Mona managed to catch the 
murderer in just seven hours. Although this efficiency did not break 
the record of the New York branch's case-solving time, it successfully 
broke the New York branch's intern detective time. Time record for 
solving crimes. 

Therefore, in the eyes of Augustus, today's inquiry is not a problem at 
all. As long as Roan's statement is reasonable and there are no 
mistakes in principle, he can help Roan solve some other problems, 
and finally let Roan become a full-time member and join the five 
investigation team. 

  But he didn't expect Brosen to jump out. 

   On the surface, this incident was aimed at Roan by Brosen, but in 
fact it was aimed at himself. 

  Augus' black face changed from matte black to matte black, his 
eyes were fixed on Bruno Sen, and his tone remained unchanged: 



   "Roan is an intern agent, and Roan has already done what an 
intern agent should do. Does Team Leader Brosen think that an intern 
agent should be better than you?" 

  Hearing this, Bruosen's tone remained unchanged, and he still 
smiled and said: 

   "No, I'm just helping you to say something, why are you so angry." 

   Papa— 

  The team leader Vernis picked up the pen and tapped on the table, 
turning a blind eye to the tit-for-tat confrontation between the two 
team leaders, looked up at Roan, and asked again with a blank 
expression: 

   "So you don't know the reason for the murder of Conrad, do you?" 

Augustus hastily gave Roan a wink, telling him to just nod. Again, 
Roan has done what an intern detective should do, and he didn't make 
any mistakes in principle. The turnaround is a certainty. There is no 
need to talk too much. 

   Talk more and make more mistakes, less talk about finding 
mistakes, it is applicable everywhere. 

   "No, I know why the murderer committed the crime." 

  Give Augustus a reassuring look, Roan reached out to Mona, and 
Mona immediately handed him a yellow notebook. 



   "Please look, everyone, this is the reporter Mike's note I got from 
the murderer Conrad. It records the important reasons why Conrad 
killed Mike and West." 

  The smile on Brosen's face slowly disappeared. 

   Six months ago, the wife of New York University professor West 
Watts died in pain one night after suffering from cancer for more than 
three years. 

  West sorted out his wife's belongings with a heavy heart. In the 
process, he suddenly found a small half bottle of white medicine with 
no label, no name, and no brand imprint. 

  West remembered that this bottle of medicine was the anti-cancer 
medicine his wife had to take every day in the ward for nearly a year. 
However, according to regulations, the name and label of the drug 
must be written on the tablet on the anti-cancer drug. In doubt, West 
called the hospital and asked which company produced the bottle of 
drug and what the effect of the drug was. 

   As a result, the doctor on the other end of the phone asked three 
questions, and finally said that he had never prescribed the medicine 
in West's hand, and then hung up the phone. 

  West is completely angry now, his wife took white medicine for a 
whole year, and now you tell me that you never prescribed this 
medicine? Where did this medicine come from? Was my wife's painful 
death related to this drug? 

  With a stream of angry questions, West began to investigate the 
source of the white drug bottle. 



   After a lot of hard work, West finally learned that this drug came 
from the "Morowe Pharmaceutical Company", and it was one of the 
anti-cancer drugs researched by this company. At present, this drug is 
still in the clinical testing and experimental stage, with high side 
effects and a high probability of causing death. 

Only using mice cannot quickly advance the test progress. In order to 
speed up the drug development and make the company go public 
soon, the person in charge of this company decisively chose to bribe 
the senior management of several hospitals and feed these drugs to 
cancer patients in the hospital. The response of these patients after 
taking the drug can speed up the speed of drug development. 

  Naked biological experiment! 

  Professor West's wife was naturally one of these experimental 
subjects. 

  Professor West, who learned the cause and effect, was knocked 
down by the truth and passed out for a day and a night. If it weren't for 
a student who came to visit his home, he might have lived in the small 
box in a few days. 

   After waking up in the hospital, West's first thought was to expose 
the company's ugly behavior and fully demonstrate what they did to 
the world! 

  After many inquiries, West found the war reporter Mike, hoping 
that he could expose the whole thing. 

  Mike agreed to West's request, but there was nothing to prove it. 
The two needed more strong evidence, so they began to collect 
evidence by their own means. 



   During the process of collecting evidence, Mike's actions were a 
bit big, and he was discovered by a senior executive of the Morrowway 
drug company. 

  In order not to expose this matter, and for the company to be 
successfully listed, the executive immediately contacted Conrad, a 
veteran, and bought Mike and West to disappear from this world for 
$500,000. 

"very good!" 

  After listening to the truth behind this incident, the corners of 
Verniss mouth slightly raised, and after a brief comment to Roan, she 
stood up from her seat and said to Augustus on the side: 

   "I'm going first, and I'll leave the rest to you." 

  After speaking, Vernis turned and left. 

   "Goodbye, sir." 

  Augus laughed loudly, grabbed the signature pen on the table and 
threw it aside casually, and just threw it on Bruno Sen's head 
impartially. 

   Without waiting for Brosen to get angry, Augustus hurriedly said: 

   "Sorry, I got up too fast, my hands are shaking!" 

  Glaring at Augustus, Brosen turned and left with a dark face. 



  Until Brosen's figure completely left the intern agent's office, 
Augustus laughed and walked to the front of the office, looked Roan 
up and down, and praised: 

   "You did a good job, boy, it looks a bit like me when I was young! 
Even my looks are similar to mine!" 

  Mona: "." 

  Everyone: "." 

  Looking at Augustus's big belly, thick lips and **** face, Roan 
didn't know for a moment whether Augustus was praising him or 
scolding him. 

   But it doesn't matter. 

   "Sir, I damaged a car in the course of a mission" 

   As soon as Roan spoke, Augustus waved his hand: 

   "It's okay, it will be deducted from the funds of our No. 5 
investigation team!" 

   "Thank you sir!" 

  The eyes of trainee agent Jody and his teammates turned red 
instantly. 

"correct." 



  Speaking of the problem of the car, Augustus suddenly 
remembered something, and said directly to the Mediterranean Sea 
beside him: 

   "The case has been solved. You immediately arrest the high-level 
executives involved in the case of Moluowei Drug Company. You must 
not let them know the news and leave the United States early." 

   "Okay, sir." 

  Mediterranean nodded in agreement, then pointed to Jody and 
said: 

   "Jodi, your team arrests people immediately, and don't let the top 
management of that company run away!" 

  Jordy's team: "." 

  The co-authorship credits are all from Luo An and the others, and 
all the chores behind are ours? ! 

   Ask for collection! Please recommend! 

  (end of this chapter) 

 


