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Chapter 2.Fight and explanations 

Annalise POV 

Future alpha Dalton starts to slowly walk toward me, a tactic used to scare 
weaker individuals or groups in a fight. I scoff and cross my arms over my 
chest. I send him a death glare which makes him take a step back. I start 
walking towards him keeping my head held high and my steps even paying 
close attention to his movements. He takes a swing at me once I am about 
two feet from him. I dodge grabbing his arm and yanking on it using his 
momentum to make him stumble forward and jump out of his way seconds 
before he crashes into the desk directly behind me. At this point both 
Charlotte and Samuel are standing, spectating the fight with the rest of the 
class. He gets back up and he is angry, good I think as I smirk at him. In a 
fight all anger does is get you hurt or worse killed. He takes two steps towards 
me, without thinking he swings completely blinded by anger and misses 
connecting with the wall behind me. Which gives me the opening I need to 
land a hit to his nose effectively breaking it as blood begins to gush down his 
face which only pisses him off even more. He starts throwing punches at me 
left and right, not landing one. I take a step back still blocking his punches and 
land a kick to his gut and a roundhouse kick to his head almost knocking him 
out. 

He’s still lying on the ground barely conscious a minute later when the alpha 
comes running through the door. It takes him all of ten seconds to figure out 
who put his son on the ground. I glance at Alpha Aiden who looks at me with a 
questioning gaze. “What happened? Why is my son laying on the ground 
barely conscious, with a broken nose?” Alpha Aiden asks. I sigh knowing I 
have no choice but to tell the alpha what happened so I do and the second I 
am done speaking the alpha is looking down at his son shaking his head in 
obvious disappointment .“Ok, everyone, class is dismissed for the rest of the 
day. You all may go home except Annalise, Charlotte and Samuel. I need the 
three of you to stay behind.” Alpha Aiden says. I walk over to my friends and 
we watch as everyone else rushes out of class and the pack doctor runs in to 
check on future alpha Dalton. Once everyone besides the three of us, the 
pack doctor, Alpha Aiden and the semi conscious future alpha Dalton left the 



room Alpha Aiden walks over to us. “I have linked your parents and your 
brother.” Alpha Aiden says and looks directly at me as he says the last part. 
“They are going to meet us at my office so we can discuss what happened 
today.” Alpha Aiden says and we nod in understanding as he leads us out of 
the room. We go to his office after stopping quickly to speak to the pack 
doctor who now has the future alpha on a stretcher. 

Less than 10 minutes later we arrive at the pack house which is really more of 
a mansion than a house. The exterior is a white washed brick and behind the 
pack house is a forest with a huge lake in the middle where the monthly pack 
runs are typically held. These runs are held on full moon nights for shifted 
members. Members who have yet to shift can still go and celebrate with the 
pack; they just can’t join the run until they receive their wolf. The pack house 
has five floors, the top floor being for the alpha and his family. The fourth floor 
is for the beta and his family. The 3rd floor is for the gamma and his family. 
The second floor is for guests and holds all of the high ranking members’ 
offices. The main floor is where pack members can come and hang out. It has 
a game room, a huge kitchen, a large dining room that can hold almost the 
entire pack and a large library. The basement houses the dungeons. We 
arrive at the alphas office where we are told to sit on the sofa in the sitting 
area on the far side of the room facing a window. We’ve only been waiting for 
about 10 minutes when Charlotte and Samuels parents arrive. I figured my 
brother would arrive sometime after them as he was in the human city when 
the alpha linked him. Charlotte and Samuels parents sit directly in front of us 
in complete silence, their parents eyes glazing over every few minutes 
meaning their mind linking one another. About 10 minutes pass before I can 
sense my brother and without saying anything to anyone I run out of the 
alphas office with everybody right behind me and straight into my brother’s 
arms needing his comfort. I can feel his tense muscles start to relax now that 
he knows I am ok. 

Connor POV 

I get a link from Alpha Aiden that my little sister was in a fight with the future 
alpha. She’s ok but I need to report to his office immediately. I quietly walk out 
of class making a note to email the professor, later. I run out to my car and 
drive to the pack house probably breaking the speed limit. At this point all I 
care about is getting to my sister as fast as possible. She’s all I have and 
although the alpha says she’s ok I won’t be able to breathe properly until I see 
that she is ok with my own eyes. Once I get to the pack house I park my car 
and walk as quickly as I can to his office. I am about ten feet from the door 
when it opens and my sister comes running out and into my arms nearly 



knocking me over in the process. I wrap my arms around her tightly and 
breathe a sigh of relief now that I know she’s ok. I don’t let her go knowing she 
needs the comfort as much as I do right now. I whisper soothing words and 
begin to feel her calm in my arms. I let her go after about two minutes when I 
realized everyone who was in the office followed my sister out. We all head 
back into the alphas office in silence. I sit with her friend’s parents directly 
across from them. “Before I explain why I called all of you here I would like to 
know how Annalise knew that you were outside the door, Connor.” The alpha 
says and everyone else in the room besides my sister nods their head in 
agreement. I sigh knowing it’s time to explain some things and link my sister. 

Mind link 

Me: “It’s time we come clean with what we know.” 

Annalise: “I know I was hoping we would have until you turned eighteen 
before we had to explain everything but now we don’t really have a choice.” 

Me: Ok then, you trust everyone in the room right?” I ask nervously 

Annalise: ”Yes of course I do, otherwise I would be trying to come up with a lie 
or something to get us out of here.” 

Me: ”Ok then I guess it’s time.” 

Annalise: “Yep it’s time.” Annalise says radiating confidence. 

End of mind link 

I take a deep breath and try to steal my nerves as my sister begins to speak. 
“I know you’re all curious as to how I knew Connor was in the hall without 
being able to scent him. As you all know Connor and I were left here by our 
parents when we were really young to keep us safe, during that time the close 
bond we already shared became even stronger to the point that it’s now 
unbreakable. With our bond being as strong as it is as long as we are within a 
ten-twenty feet radius of each other we can sense each other. I’ve honestly 
always found that odd but then we always knew we were different.” 

 


