
First Strong 1011

Chapter 1011 - Super heroine

When Shen Lang cut the radish, one by one, the extraterrestrial demon was chopped to the 
ground, and all the extraterrestrial demons reacted.

This yesterday, I discovered a very powerful human being, the most terrible enemy!

Suddenly, they no longer have to control the armored battle group, all of them are 
watching over the waves.

However, the speed of Shen Lang is ready, but what can they catch up with? After the 
reaction came over to the siege, Shen Lang quickly slashed a batch and directly cut the 
troll nearly 20!

This period of demon show, falling in the eyes of the outside world, is actually only a few 
seconds.

Directly everyone sees the breath, the atmosphere does not dare to say a word.

And Shen Lang dissipated the sword and light sword, and changed the performance with a 
new angle.

For the extraterrestrial demon who attacked the group, he fully exerted the speed. The 
naked eye could not see clearly. It was only a slight afterimage. It had already reached the 
top of a demon outside the field. He shot directly on the top of his head and then tens of 
meters. The trolls are unresponsive.

In the same way, in the other half of the troll attack, he has already reached the top of the 
opponent’s head, or the chest, the moment of hitting, is to completely absorb the core 
monster, so that palm, also It is just knocking down a huge body.

This time, you don’t have to fight like a sword, the speed of the sword is faster!



What everyone can see is that the waves are flashing and flashing. It has been after a 
dozen or so, and the ones that were hit before began to collapse.

On the other side, Shen Lang also keeps the spirit into the blue sea, letting her continue to 
manipulate hundreds of mechs to attack other extraterrestrial demons.

When the demon outside the field puts all the targets on the Shenlang, the melee battle 
group that is ignored will have room to play.

One is not enough, and ten is not enough!

One hundred to one madness, and soon a few trolls were smashed.

Shen Lang is very clear that their huge body is the host of evolution, the core is still the 
strange magic. If the body is smashed, it may not be able to kill it. Once you escape, you 
will be able to re-evolve when you come to a new host.

Therefore, when the rotten flesh flies, he will also fly to the vicinity “just inadvertently”, 
and absorb the magic object with the accuracy of the induction.

In the first few minutes, the extraterrestrial demon had scored 20 mechs.

The result was a sudden reversal. In less than a minute, Shen Lang and Bihai Huanqi 
Group, had already smashed half of the extraterrestrial demon!

Other extraterrestrial demon, uninterested in love, with the arrogance of the tallest, at least 
100-meter trolls, the extraterrestrial demons did not attack the sinking waves, while 
evading the bombardment of the mech, and began to move above the Great Rift Valley. 
Escape!

It is true that once they get up, there will be a missile waiting. But just a few tens of 
seconds of change is too crazy, compared with this mortality and speed, the danger of 
being bombarded by missiles is nothing.

Shen Lang knows that there will be missile attacks on the headquarters, but he does not 
want to be like this!



On the one hand, today is the big show of him and Bi Haihuan. In fact, the four hundred 
mechs are not essentially attacking the core, but are used to build momentum. If you rely 
on the assistance of the command missile, the influence will be reduced.

On the other hand, even if the demon outside the domain is blown up, the monsters may 
not be just killed. If they flee into the command, they will fly away from the ship and then 
flee to the city. Even if there is only one or two, many people will be in danger.

And their reaction, Shen Lang can fully guess, so when they fled, in fact only part of the 
mech is chasing, more has already flew to the top one step ahead, immediately weaving a 
powerful firepower network!

If they continue to go up, instead of waiting for the rift to meet the missile, they must first 
be fed by the armor.

At this time, Shen Lang continued to maintain a high-speed movement, and soon he was 
killed by him and fell from the air.

For the above-mentioned mechfire network, the extraterrestrial demon can still be hard-
pressed, and it will not necessarily be killed. But the intensive fire blockade directly affects 
the speed at which they escape!

Shen Lang is the real deadly killer!

So after discovering that the above is hard to escape, the extraterrestrial demons 
immediately changed to flee in the direction of the Rift Valley.

They are confined to a certain range, and there are missiles with strong firepower at both 
ends, but now they are not so much.

“Who are you! You are not their people, why should you help them! Nothing is innocent, 
why should we kill us!”

Suddenly a thought entered the consciousness of Shen Lang.



This is the greatest extraterrestrial demon, communicating through consciousness and the 
waves.

Now, it directly locks the armor of Bihaihuan, and grabs the armor correctly and makes it 
impossible to escape.

The biggest troll’s face looked at Shen Lang and seemed to be warning the waves. If he 
kept going, he would pinch the mech!

With its power alone, it can pinch buildings and machinery. Even if the armor materials of 
Bihaihuan are very good, they should be twisted and flattened. And with the volume of this 
troll, once the violent energy of the world is released, the consequences are unimaginable!

At the same time, the outside world also saw this scene, confirming that this is the armor 
of Bihaihuan, and the new world is hanging up!

Less than a minute ago  or only a small part of the people in the Bihai family’s territory 
was quite loyal to the people, and most people felt that they were acting as death.

However, the explosion of the Shenlang has made them dazzling. Bihaihuan manipulated 
hundreds of mechs to explode the extraterrestrial demon, which also caused everyone to 
burn.

So when I saw that Bihai was in danger, I worried and prayed for her.

What makes the troll and others unimaginable is that Shen Lang actually does not care 
about the situation here!

When the troll grabbed the armor and other sinking waves, Shen Lang continued to kill 
several trolls in a row. And Bihaihuan has not been affected, regardless of the individual’s 
body and death, manipulating other mechs, continue to fire blockade of the fugitive 
extraterrestrial demon!

In this scene, all the sergeants at the base were silent. The people around the world who 
watched the high-tech broadcast were excited to come up with tears.



The mech was controlled, but Miss Bihai was still fulfilling the mission of annihilating the 
demon outside the domain, completely ignoring life and death!

What is a hero? This is the hero!

Although she is a girl, she is the super family of the Bihai family, but at this moment, it is 
not inferior to the heroes in the history of the city!

A super heroine!

Generals of the command, this is also a quick discussion, do you want to start rescue?

Unfortunately, this is a very fast battlefield. The situation is changing rapidly. Even if they 
can agree, it will take a few seconds.

It is too late to dispatch a mech rescue. It is feasible to transfer the control of hundreds of 
mechs and let them concentrate their firepower to attack this biggest demon. It’s just that it 
will disrupt the plan and make Bihai’s joy become very passive.

Chapter 1012 - Half fairy

The people who were caught, and the people who were threatened, completely ignored it, 
and the strongest troll felt ridiculed.

It made a roar, squeezed the mech and added violent energy, ready to melt it, and at the 
same time stuffed the mech into the mouth, ready to swallow it directly!

Obviously, it also thought of it. Just destroying the mech, it is not necessary to kill the 
people inside, so only the people with the mechs swallowed together!

Because in addition to the sudden emergence of the waves, Bihaihuan is the most powerful 
human comprehension they have sensed in the theater, and certainly will not let go. What I 
want more is to devour Shen Lang.

Everyone watching the broadcast screamed.



The people in the theater were even more sweaty, and the mechs were very clear. They 
also have a sacred armor. Once the mech is in trouble, they can leave through the sacred 
armor and even continue to attack in a small degree.

The holy armor of Bihaihuan is definitely more advanced than them, but unfortunately…

Now the mech is being grasped by the biggest demon giant, and it is impossible to get out 
of the mech, and there is no armor to escape.

If you have been caught like this, the double protection of the mech and the armor can still 
last for a while. But now the devil outside the domain, is to eat the mech!

This has no chance to live.

In the process, Shen Lang did not look at this side at all, continued to flash quickly, and 
repeatedly killed several devils outside the domain!

At the bottom of the rift, it is already a corpse. In addition to the biggest one hundred 
meters, there are twenty trolls left.

It’s just that everyone is very anxious at this moment. Now, everyone is not trying to see 
him show his power, but to save Miss Bihai safely!

In addition to controlling hundreds of other fire-fighting blockades, Bihaihuan’s own 
artillery fire is also a huge body that is completely dumped in front of it.

However, the troll was not only physically strong, but also very quick to respond. The 
other hand directly pulled the mech into a smash, and the remaining trunk was swallowed.

This is the strongest troll, seeing the threat is hopeless, in addition to the devour of the blue 
sea, there is no hope for Shen Lang, and more delay will only be more partners to die.

So when the mech was stuffed into the mouth, it was also a fast running movement, and 
soon rushed to the back of the wave that was destroying the troll.



Everyone’s speed is very fast. Shen Lang just killed the troll who fled to the other side. He 
just caught up with the remaining twenty, and the huge demon also rushed up.

The current Shen Lang is equal to the extraterrestrial demon!

In the tall bodies where they are at least tens of meters high, the Shen Lang is very small. 
And hundreds of mechs, still above and in front of the fire suppression, to avoid letting 
them escape.

The strongest demon has already put the blue sea joy to the mouth, and the other hand is 
also buckled to the top of the Shenlang, and he will grab him.

The demon gods who fled before, probably know this situation, have stopped fleeing, and 
changed to enclose the Shenlang.

Today, for them, it is a heavy loss, it is unprecedented!

In addition to life-saving, this tone is not going to go down.

Their race, countless years are all vertical and horizontal universes, can be called 
destruction of the gods, wherever they go, are scorched. Even if there was a time when it 
was badly suppressed, it was also a more costly price for the opponent.

When was there a situation in which 70 or 80 people were killed by one person?

If you don’t turn over the waves, they will be depressed if they escape.

Now that everything is good, they are also watching the leader can swallow the waves!

When it was said that it was too late, the scene was just a moment of work, and there was a 
huge change right away!

Surrounded by Shen Lang, it seems that time has solidified. The fast-moving 
extraterrestrial demons have become very slow and slow. Don’t say anything else that has 



been brought around, the mech that has been sent to the mouth, just paused, put it in slow 
motion.

Grabbing the hand of Shen Lang, the speed is slowing down.

This scene can make the popularity of watching live broadcasts broken!

The people in the city-states of the river basin are screaming at this hard-working 
relationship and the strength to grab the media of the top-notch headlines. When is this, 
even when it is clipped into a slow-motion appetite?

The generals of the command center also roared and questioned who made the picture 
slow.

At this time, there is a scene that makes everyone stunned again!

When other people are as stagnate as slow motion, the speed of Shen Lang is still the same 
fast!

He took a shot at the brain of the greatest Tmall!

Everyone can’t see any reaction, and its big body has nothing to change.

But in fact, Shen Lang, this time I feel the surging influx!

He has been able to absorb those monsters, which has already been verified on the earth. 
The seven or eighty that have just been turned over have not been missed.

But it still just shocked him. This most powerful extraterrestrial demon is just like its body 
is much larger than others. The magical **** is also much more powerful.

Just like the rivers and rivers that roar this huge wave , like the quiet rivers, it is still 
impossible to change into the sea.



“What kind of person are you? This is impossible! Impossible!”

When the feeling of madness passed away, the consciousness of the troll once again 
reached the ears of Shen Lang. And this desperate cry, can’t change the situation, and soon 
disappeared.

It was just an instant, and the waves continued to fly to other trolls.

Under normal circumstances, his speed will be faster. Now everyone is in his field, and he 
is firmly restrained. Only he can do whatever he wants. In contrast, nature is more rapid.

The remaining twenty or more extraterrestrial demons, without exception, were all shot 
dead by Shen Lang!

The most crucial thing is to absorb the magical gods, leaving the body, and then can not 
afford half a fairy.

After the lap was over, the body of the strongest demon began to collapse, and the 
Shenlang arrived at its mouth in time. Liu Yejian swiftly waved, completely cutting off its 
huge fingers, and saved the broken and broken inside.

And lost the strong squeeze, Bihaihuan did not stop, opened from the inside, flew out, 
dressed in purple red armor, flying in the air.

Although she was in danger for a total of dozens of seconds, but in the hearts of all the 
people who are fully involved in watching the live broadcast, they are all in the same age, 
worried that the atmosphere will not dare to go out and pray for her.

Therefore, when she saw her safely coming out, she cheered up and the base command 
also spontaneously applauded.

There are only some generals whose faces are a bit complicated…

Shen Lang collected the field, and the trolls accelerated to collapse.



Under his gesture, people in the air of the sea and joy, began a high-profile victory speech.

Chapter 1013 - Huge win-win

Bihai is a child of the Bihai family. Although she is not as strong as a male, she has 
emerged in the past two years, especially after the last World War.

For speeches and the like, nature is no exception.

Now on this occasion, she does not know that someone has sold the information and is 
broadcasting live worldwide. So people in the air, telling a few impassioned words, just to 
listen to everyone in the theater base command.

Her speech is very simple, it is to boost morale.

“The river city is the home of all of us. No matter how powerful the heavens and the gods 
are, we will swear to defend our homeland! Today, I am here, and there will be more 
enemies in the day, and I will definitely go to the battlefield again!”

Although Shen Lang was extremely aggressive in stealing, his perverted strength, plus 
everyone thought he was from Xiandao, was another standard. It does not affect the feeling 
of Bihaihuan, and there is his contrast, but it seems that Bihaihuan is more real and more 
grounded.

Plus, it was beautiful when it was grown. At this moment, it is a purple-red bodysuit, 
which is a figure and a hero.

In conjunction with the collapse of the surrounding gods, all the people applauded 
spontaneously.

On this day, the influence of Bihaihuan, from the territory of the Bihai family, spread to 
the entire city of the river basin, becoming a super heroine that millions of people know 
and like.

At almost the same time, there was no sinking wave that was withdrawn from the spirit of 
Bihai Huan, and I felt the influx of countless beliefs!



It seems that the situation here has been broadcast live. Countless people in this world 
began to admire her, although it is very weak, but the number is huge.

In addition, he also discovered a problem. The power of this belief does not exist because 
of feelings. Like the current Bihaihuan, it is not felt, but it will still be absorbed, and will 
still strengthen her spiritual strength and spirit!

As far as he is concerned, if there are many people worshiping in the past, there is also the 
power of faith. It’s just that you can feel it now, knowing what comes from, knowing how 
much, and even knowing the source at close range.

This discovery also explains a lot of questions. For example, Hitler, why is there such a 
strong appeal and decision-making power, in addition to his personal abilities, his own 
charm, so that the worship of all the people in the country, is also more powerful, and in 
turn has a greater impact. force.

The daily stars and celebrities are also the more people who are madly worshipped, and 
often the aspects will be more and more smooth, except for a few who are dead. For 
example, Tom Hanks, Andy Lau, who have almost no negative news, can grow red for 
decades.

Such a crazy bureau of Shenlangbu, of course, is to let the people of the city-state can 
worship him, and can regard him as a god, thus gaining a steady stream of faith.

I did not expect that now, Bihaihuan has received a huge amount of faith!

However, she is not an outsider. Shen Lang is not embarrassed. She is very gratified. The 
stronger she is, the less chance she will face in the future.

The dust has settled, and Shen Lang has also recovered the Yuanshen.

Bihaihuan does not use Shenlang to teach, contact the base camp, let the commanders send 
soldiers to clean the battlefield. Then through the Holy Grail, manipulating the remaining 
three hundred mechs flew back to the base.

When they came back, the bases were up and down, and each post was seen as an applause 
and they were very appreciative.



“hero!”

This is the slogan that shouts the most.

This made Bi Haihuan a bit ashamed, because she felt that it was all the teacher’s credit, 
and that the teacher gave her such a hero. In fact, she was guilty of it.

And Shen Lang also felt the power of faith!

The first is the sergeants of the base. They are excited about the love of the sea, but they 
are awe of distance.

Then he began to feel the power of faith from afar.

Later, I began to feel that more and more faith came from far away.

It is true that the strength of the beliefs of the self-cultivators on the earth is much worse. 
The psionic masters here are not worth mentioning, and the power of ordinary people’s 
faith is naturally weaker.

But still that sentence, the number is better!

On earth, he is inconvenient and difficult to reach a wide range of faith gods, but I did not 
expect it to be reached here!

Originally, the Shenlang plan was to influence the upper and lower arms of the coalition 
forces, especially the elite mechs with the psionic mastership. This is also a considerable 
gain. After the video of the battlefield is released, it should be able to affect more soldiers.

I did not expect that the media was broadcast live, and now has a very large range of 
influence. This number may be a bit worse than the blue sea, but it is far better than his 
own estimate.

The generals once again greeted them with a warm applause and praise.



Bihaihuan and Shenlang really killed all the extraterrestrial demon. This crazy plan was 
really successful, completely disrupting the tacit understanding and plan of everyone.

However, this can’t be said on the table, and naturally it will change the plan. Now, of 
course, we must praise Bihaihuan and continue to hold this hero. At the same time  quickly 
arrange more of their own confidant soldiers to clean the battlefield.

What the top executive wants is the information of the demon outside the domain. It is 
hard to get when it is alive, only a little bit of grinding.

At that time, I would choose such a plan. It is a pity that there is no possibility of alive and 
can only be destroyed by weapons of mass destruction.

Now Shen Lang is killing them one by one, leaving a hundred bodies, that is, each family 
can divide a lot to study, it is an unexpected joy!

Let them be lost, just because of the blue sea.

I also hope that this rising star will not be killed, but it will be hit by the fiasco and the 
pressure of public opinion. I did not expect her to be a strong debut, and a qualitative leap!

How good it is to belong to your own family!

Like the Fenghaigu family, it belongs to the Bihai family. Of course, it is extremely 
exciting. However, the excitement is excited, the same is not dare to vague, and quickly 
dispatched a good man. In order to avoid cleaning the battlefield, other families took the 
lead and hid the benefits.

Shen Lang is a retreat, saying that it is better to let Bi Haihuan and the generals discuss the 
military affairs. He personally takes a break.

I have already arranged a dormitory for him last night, and now I am going back directly.



The commanders are also happy to see it. After all, they are under great pressure on such a 
godly character. No matter what you say, you have to look at his face, which will 
undoubtedly affect the prestige.

In case the Shen Lang wants to support the blue sea, the blue sea family is in the spoils 
(the extraterrestrial corpse), what is it like.

Congratulations to Shen Lang, then everything will be easier. This is the younger brother 
of Bihai, even if there is still a blue sea to immediately instruct, or Feng Yuegu and others 
help the negotiations, as long as more to give a part, it will not be too bad for others.

Chapter 1014 - All parties

Bi Haihuan knew later that she had been broadcast live and became a super heroine who 
worshipped the entire city.

She is very excited, but not excited for herself, but the teacher’s everything, has also been 
seen by hundreds of millions of people!

Originally, just like the last time, Shen Lang helped her to establish the military strength, 
and only know the relevant sergeants in the same field, and then will be sealed, the outside 
world does not know.

And like the Bihai family, of course, it will pack her achievements, and will not mention 
more waves.

This time she felt that she was just helping a little effort, all by the teacher. If the last 
military power is on her body, the teacher has no advantage, and even a reputation is not, it 
is too embarrassing.

Therefore, the military machine screen was spread out, and she did not think about the 
original intention. Even if she knew that someone wanted to make her a joke and let her be 
“dead” by countless people, it is not important now.

The teacher will at least get the reputation he deserves, and everyone will know how 
powerful he is.

In the past two days, the blue sea chasing is actually a one with great pressure.



Because Shen Lang was in contact with him, and then he did not have time to discuss with 
his father, he made a claim to send Shen Lang to the front. Originally, I wanted him to 
protect his sister. I didn’t expect to make such a big move, almost killing my sister!

When he was watching the live broadcast, he almost crushed his fist. Fortunately, the final 
result was wonderful, otherwise he would be killed by his father.

The blue sea is full of confidence in Shen Lang, and the island of Xiandao comes out, at 
least to ensure the safety of her daughter. Even if a daughter fails, it is not a big deal. It is 
good for young to suffer setbacks.

But this is not only a success, but also a great success that shocked the world!

The wars of the heavens and the devils in the past several times in history have all been a 
great victory. This time it was just a loss of some mechs, which really counted as a big 
win.

Shen Lang didn’t make a name for himself, and pushed his daughter directly to the stage. 
Of course, it was very happy.

The strength revealed by Shen Langzhan is more than once magical, and it also makes 
Bihai Chengtian want to firmly bind this **** man.

He did not dare to order, or directly invited, just let her daughter invite Shen Lang to go 
home to see it once, in the name of a banquet. Of course, he also hinted that the daughter 
grasps the opportunity, it is best to be with Shen Lang, recruited as a son-in-law, is the real 
binding.

For the father’s intentions, Bi Haihuan is a little annoyed, she is very respectful of Shen 
Lang.

It can be said that the emergence of Shen Lang has changed her life. If it is not a master of 
psionics, training is only routine, and it may not be developed in the army.



Up to now, she can even say that she has established a firm foothold, and she has a great 
influence. In the future, it will be stronger than the original.

But annoyed, she did not resist, because… she also wants to see the waves often!

This time, if it is not that she is in danger, Shen Lang will not come. Last time, I also knew 
that she was on the front line and worried that her safety would come. Otherwise, the 
teacher will not come to visit her from time to time. If “together”…

However, when she asked Shen Lang to invite Shen Lang to go to the house as a guest, she 
did not unexpectedly encounter the rejection.

In exchange for the concept of the country of the earth, the Bihai family is equal to a royal 
family, and Bihaihuan is equal to a princess. Such an invitation is also a great glory for any 
general-level general.

However, Shen Lang did not care about the identity of the Bihai family, but came to 
Huahai. It’s still not because she is still behind.

Her strength has reached the initial stage of existence, and according to the overall 
situation here, it is already a very high level. Shen Lang could have been relieved, let her 
slowly cultivate herself.

But now it is different, she has received a lot of faith!

Bi Haihuan is different from him. He does not have the identity of the “princess” that 
allows the people to look up. After leaving, he will not show up and will not feel the sense 
of existence, so he will not be able to maintain it for too long.

She is different, and Bihai will definitely build momentum for her. In the days to come, 
she will continue to receive the power of faith.

When Shen Lang comes next time, I don’t know when it is. If the realm can’t keep up, it’s 
going to be a problem if it’s top-heavy.



Therefore, he must first help the blue sea to improve the strength and push the problem 
back.

The realm of Bihaihuan is not very high for the current Shenlang, and it can help her 
improve. When she left last time, she sent a lot of Nedan.

Although they are all collections with years of age, the grades are not necessarily high, but 
after all, they are internal Dan, they can directly take refining, and the effect is much better 
than Lingshi.

This thing is not too much, it is not polite, let her ask for it through the family, and then 
began to help her absorb refining.

Shen Lang was eager to go back, in order to absorb the power of faith that was exchanged 
by Ling Shiyi, but now there is a huge harvest here, how many hundred trolls are! There is 
also the worship of the people of the city of the river basin  These are not thought of 
before.

And there is still a problem, that is, it does not affect the absorption of the earth, so those 
spiritual stones will not be white, so you can stay here for a while.

However, there was a problem soon, that is, the battlefield was cleaned up, but they were 
all high-tech, and the entire huge rift was completely tested again and again, and there was 
no abnormality.

In other words, you can’t find the door to the world outside the world!

If you can’t find the entrance, you can’t seal the entrance. And the next time it will appear 
from here, how long will it appear, there is no one to be sure.

In history, there are only a few times in the history of the devil. According to the laws of 
history, after annihilation, there will be no effect in guarding a hundred years.

However, in the contemporary era, people who have encountered the invasion of the 
heavens and the devils, how can they be reconciled?



So after the sum of their parties, please ask for a wave and help you find out if you can 
find that entrance.

According to their estimates, there should also be space cracks.

They also know that Shen Lang is easy to annihilate the demon outside the domain, but it 
is not for the power of the river city, purely because of the blue sea. Now this is the whole 
city-state thing. It should have allowed Bihai to go out and ask for help.

But in fact, every family wants to have a relationship with Shen Lang, and even if they 
can’t get it, they can’t offend. Otherwise, such a **** man does not need to destroy the 
millions of troops and directly destroy the family’s top ranks, thus changing the pattern of 
the entire city state.

Therefore, they asked Shen Lang to go out and take the initiative to make a profit, and said 
that whether they can find out, they are very grateful, they are all sent gifts.

Chapter 1015 - Again spar

The generals directly sent their gifts first, and first retire, to consider the time for Shen 
Lang.

Shen Lang opened the box that they sent over and found that there was ten inside.

Bihaihuan is still there, and it is a bit strange: “Crystals? How do they know that the 
teacher wants this thing?”

“It is not difficult to know. In the past, General Menglu sent me four more. The people 
who collected the information collected this information will not miss it. It is also possible 
to ask General Feng Yue for inquiries. After all, I have left less information. ”

Shen Lang checked it out. Before the meeting, these are called spar-like stones. In fact, 
they are some internals that have been circulating for more than a few decades. And these 
ten are really good, I can see that I have carefully selected them.

“On the last time General Monx collected some of them and only got three. The influence 
of the Bihai family can only reach a dozen. They can give ten, it is not easy.”



Hearing the feelings of Shen Lang, Bi Haihuan could not help but laugh.

“Teacher misunderstood, the last time General Monx and our family did not have much, 
not because it is precious. It is relatively rare, and the value is not comparable to the high-
grade spar, so there is no collection reserve.”

“These numbers are still quite a lot?” Shen Lang was slightly surprised.

Bihai nodded: “I later learned about it. It is said that these spar are from some of 
Warcraft’s bodies. There was a time when many forests had World of Warcraft chaos. 
Later, the military specially hunted many times, now the number It’s very rare. It’s 
estimated that it was cleared a lot at the time.”

Shen Lang didn’t know what to say. I didn’t expect it to be in the decades. The city-states 
of the basin had extinctions against the beasts and beasts.

It’s no wonder that before he appeared in the forest where hundreds of millions of rings 
appeared, he also encountered an iron armor, and the beasts were not dense. At that time, it 
was thought that it was the site of the Ironclad Red Dragon. Now it seems that there are 
not many places everywhere.

With the concept of the previous generation of Shen Lang, there is nothing to be so 
emotional.

However, this world is inevitably affected by environmental protection and animal 
protection. Human civilization has developed, and more importantly, it is rich, and when 
there is a broad living space and no shortage of food, these concepts will arise.

He himself is benefited by the inner Dan, and this world has also personally hunted the 
beasts, but after hearing the history of hunting and clearing, it is considered to be a 
concentration of extinction, or a bit embarrassing.

“It seems that for those World of Warcraft, it also brought back a lot of things. It has a very 
good effect on the research of bionics, genes, medicine, etc. This thing does not know 
what it is, it is a bit like spar, it is called It is a spar.”



Bi Haihuan continued to introduce what she learned: “So many of these were collected as 
souvenirs by the soldiers at the time, and there are many resales and so on. Now I have 
collected them, but I can collect a lot.”

Then she smiled again: “The one I gave you before was collected by myself this year. The 
family has not been sent yet.”

Shen Lang put away that point, showing a happy smile.

“Thank you. You know that I need spar, I pay attention to the spar. When I come over, I 
will send me a lot of spar. I know that I like this kind of spar and collect this for me.”

Affirmed by Shen Lang, Bi Haihuan was a little excited on the face, and a little 
embarrassed to say: “But the teacher is still used on me.”

“Yes, these are also used on you to make you stronger! But, you know…”

Shen Lang smiled.

Bi Haihuan nodded quickly, and Shen Lang taught her how to absorb energy directly from 
the spar. She kept secrets, even if she didn’t say anything to her father, just saying that 
Shen Lang helped her improve.

Those who can give the Bihai family are the basic cultivation methods taught by Shen 
Lang in the dead forest. At that time, I felt that I would not see you again, allowing her to 
teach sharing, and wondering if it would form a butterfly effect.

These people who have no psionic talents, have the opportunity to become masters of 
psionics, have already made the Bihai family very satisfied, and let many children 
practice.

These days, Shen Lang took her to practice, let her swallow the spar, teach her, help her 
refining, and let her know the secret that everyone does not know.

The teacher is likely to come from Xiandao, and these are the magical skills of Xiandao. 
The teacher fully trusts and teaches her. How can she leak out?



Shen Lang nodded: “That’s good.”

This is not his world after all. If he wants to leave the earth, he will go to the island of 
Nakajima, which is not the resident of the city. So even if there is anything, he is not very 
concerned.

叮嘱碧海欢, mainly let her enjoy!

If she is allowed to pass it out, a young girl like her is sure to have a soft root and not to 
say anything else, at least to tell the family. Once she loses her uniqueness, her status will 
not be taken seriously as it is now.

On the simplest, if Bihai chasing, or Bihai Chengtian can become a powerful psionic 
master, will he cultivate a woman with heart? The elders and elders of their family, of 
course, want to be healthy and want to live longer.

Ordinary cultivation, making them healthier  become a low-level psionic master, it does 
not matter. The core point is to let Bihai Huan enjoy it.

To let her get through the relationship, I need the authority and respect of his teacher.

“Let’s go. Take people’s money for disaster relief, or go check it out!”

Bihaihuan is ‘噗哧’ and laughed: “The teacher said that the market is awkward. In fact, 
you are more enthusiastic than anyone else. I am afraid that there will be extraterrestrial 
geniuses coming out to chase before they go to search.”

Shen Lang shrugged and did not explain much. She is thinking of others according to her 
own heart.

When I learned that Shen Lang had promised, everyone was very happy and immediately 
arranged to go to the Great Rift Valley to start a search.



They have already checked the place of the inspection by means of technology, and now 
they are cooperating with the waves. When there is any need, they will cooperate and dare 
not give him any advice.

Shen Lang started the carpet search with Bihai Huan.

He is not only a semi-sexual situation, but because of the magical combination of refining 
the previous three months, the sensory ability has leapt. This time, it absorbed a hundred 
monsters, and it made his power of the gods soar, and the range of sensing can easily 
spread to a large area.

However, this large rift is also very large, wide and deep, and the length is very long. 
Otherwise, you can’t trap so many extraterrestrial demons. You also have to have a 
garrison nearby and react quickly.

Shen Lang searched, but also thinking about where they came from?

According to the Bihai chasing, this is the study here. This is an aggressive race in the 
universe. They will only have different aggression, there will be no hometown, and a 
world will be harmed to find other ways.

So, are these, and the monsters coming in from Licao County, come from one place?

Chapter 1016 - Super luxury

What Shen Lang didn’t think was that after two or three days of uninterrupted carpet 
search, he searched the entire area back and forth, but like the coalition forces, there was 
no clue!

It seems that the hundreds of extraterrestrial demons in the past are appearing out of thin 
air.

Because they have stayed here for a long time, and before they fought, there are a lot of 
residual energy in the field, but there is no misleading about Shen Lang. In the end, he has 
already dealt with many times.

Under his very careful search, there is still no clue.



According to this situation analysis, there should be two possibilities. One was that 
because of some kind of accident, they forcibly crossed the space barrier and then 
recovered. And they have also suffered a lot of impact, and they did not leave the first 
time.

It has been a long time, so no traces have been found.

Another possibility is that it is similar to the one he came over there, and the original space 
from the overseas relics into the city of Tallow, there is a space for the transmission.

These extraterrestrial demons are going to invade and occupy a brand new world. They 
never thought about going back after a vote, so after they came over, they destroyed the 
transmission array, and with the bombing of the battle for so long, so there are traces. No 
more.

Shen Lang did not force it, directly told them the results of the search, and gave them the 
possibility of guessing.

This gave the coalition a sigh of relief.

They didn’t find the results before, and they had similar conjectures. But if you are afraid 
that there is something they can’t grasp, then you can’t care. Now, even the masters of 
Shen Lang who have easily eliminated these extraterrestrial demons are also at this 
conclusion, so that they can feel at ease.

Then the coalition forces can be evacuated, leaving the garrisons in the vicinity to continue 
to monitor, and the scientific research team composed of all parties continues to study in 
the Rift Valley.

Bihaihuan can also lead the army to triumph.

Shen Lang was busy searching for these days, and Bi Haihuan was also assisting. It was a 
few days of delay.

Bi Haihuan thought that he was leaving, very sad, but did not dare or force him to stay.



Seeing her like that, Shen Lang had to promise to go back with her first and continue to 
counsel her to practice. When the time comes to see the blue sea, it doesn’t matter if you 
see it once.

This makes Bi Haihuan very happy and excited!

I have to be more excited than I have defeated so many extraterrestrials.

After she was promoted to the Major General, she was no longer under the General of 
Monx, but her age and qualifications could not directly give her a military field, so she 
stayed in the family to receive more comprehensive training.

Including her more time to practice, but also from management, art, tactics and other 
aspects of training. This time, the coalition attacked the extraterrestrial demon, let her out 
to exercise the military.

So now, although she is leaving the army of the Bihai family, she personally went back to 
the family.

Feng Yuegu learned that Shen Lang will go back with them. Of course, he dare not 
neglect, not only arrange the itinerary, but also the first time to inform Bihai.

When they left, they were divided into two groups. In addition, the generals led the army 
to leave. Fengyuegu and some of the soldiers guarded Bihaihuan back.

Although the strength of Bihaihuan has already surpassed Fengyuegu, after all, the 
experience in all aspects is still insufficient, so it must be escorted.

Of course, there are deep waves, and basically there is no need to worry about safety, that 
is, escort.

On the returning spaceship, Bi Haihuan told him about some family things.

Her father is a sea of nature, not a contemporary owner of the Bihai family, but it can be 
regarded as one of the most powerful.



Their highest is the patriarch, and now her grandfather Bihai Chuntang. There are also the 
Senate, including some respected elders and the core of the core.

Using the global company system to make an analogy, Bihai Chuntang is the chairman of 
the board, the Senate is the board of directors, and Bihai is equivalent to the role of 
president and CEO.

But because they are a family, and the territory is huge, it is more like a large empire. The 
patriarch is like an emperor, and the Senate is a cabinet. The blue sea is like a prime 
minister of a specific administration, and has the identity of a Prince.

The location of the Bihai Family Headquarters is a famous metropolis in the city of the 
basin, called Haotiancheng. It has been a famous historical city since ancient times, and it 
is now a top-ranking metropolis with very developed aspects.

Two times before Shen Lang, I have seen some cities, even the small city of Talo, which is 
grand in scale. This time, Tiantiancheng is also psychologically prepared.

There are tens of millions of people in the metropolis on the planet, and skyscrapers 
abound.

However, when he arrived at Tiancheng, he was still a little shocked.

The scale of this city not only far exceeds the cities on the earth, but the metropolitan area 
of the Bay Area is also incomparable, and the high-rise buildings are soaring, the real 
towering into the clouds, the population size is afraid of hundreds of millions.

Fortunately, Shen Lang has seen many sci-fi movies in this world. With the spaceship, 
there is no comparison with the earth. Compared with the science fiction world, it is not 
surprising.

The place where the Bihai family is located is at the very center of Haotiancheng. The 
building is very sci-fi in the future, but on the scale, it is like a huge palace.



Even if it is on the outer layer of their website  Bihai “Imperial Palace”, there are still 
obvious layers of defense. It is conceivable that it is equipped with the most advanced 
weapons and the most loyal guardians.

The spacecraft landed at a base in Haotiancheng and then changed back to the small 
aircraft.

Bi Haihuan returned to her own home directly with Shen Lang. In this huge royal palace, 
there is a region belonging to her home. The status of the sea is natural, and the house is of 
course very prominent.

However, when she learned that she lived alone in a building with dozens of floors, Shen 
Lang was still a bit stunned.

Bihai Huan came back with Shen Lang, feeling excited, but also a little sensitive, afraid 
that the teacher felt that she showed a housework, did not take one visit, but also a brief 
introduction.

Like the building where she lives, different floors have different functions, such as some 
armor, some with aircraft, a swimming pool, a training area, an entertainment area, etc., 
and each is Luxury is huge.

Shen Lang also had to admit that compared with her family, the huge luxury dormitory 
that was seen in the training base of General Feng Yue was actually very simple.

Of course, other designs are also very high-tech. They don’t have to go upstairs for a long 
time. The vertical elevators are fast. There are various fast conveyor belts on the floor. If 
you want to go to other buildings, you can also directly transfer the floors you want to go 
from the air. Go around the past.

Bihaihuan is like this, like Bihai Chasing certainly has his own tens of layers of buildings, 
the blue sea is the main building of this area.

The rooms prepared by Bihai Huan for Shenlang are also directly layered. There are many 
large baths, big beds, and many sinking waves. The science fiction movies have not 
appeared, so he has to be embarrassed.

Chapter 1017 - Bihai family



When Bi Haihuan saw Shen Lang for the first time, he had been in the forest for a year and 
a half, like a wild man, and at that time he wanted a medium stone.

Therefore, in her impression, Shen Lang is of great talent and extraordinary strength, but it 
should be relatively poor.

At the time of the military camp base, it was okay to return to her home. The place where 
this huge palace is, even if it does not need to show off the rich, it will cause a big gap.

Therefore, she has the heart to let her pay attention, do not mention other luxury and 
expensive aspects, so as not to smash the waves.

When washing their clothes and changing clothes, Shen Lang also used the knowledge of 
God to inspect it, and made the sea of Bihai into a piece of heaven and the scope of the 
entire Bihai family. As seen in the appearance, it has very strict protection. If there are 
enemies close to it, even if it is mixed into the Tiancheng City, it will not be close to the 
Bihai family.

Everyone in the blue sea family, Shen Lang directly dealt with, and there is also Bihai 
chasing one.

However, there is a huge amount of information in the holy armor, and now it is able to 
connect to the network. Information like the Bihai family is, to a certain extent, public.

Looking for a bit, Shen Lang can also be seated.

For the core members of the Bihai family, there is a general understanding. Then he also 
discovered one thing, that is, Bi Haihuan’s father, Bihai, was not at home.

Of course, this is a favorite. If you meet with Bihai, you will inevitably talk and win. He 
doesn’t want to pay attention to it, but it is the father of Bi Haihuan, and it is inconvenient 
to make it embarrassing.

If you don’t need to meet with the blue sea, other people will be able to do it. Like the blue 
sea chasing, it doesn’t matter if you don’t need to give him a face. The patriarch Bihai 
Chuntang at this level, or other homes for the Senate, will not come to him in theory.



Just after Shen Lang had just finished bathing and changing clothes, I was going to go 
upstairs to find Bihai Huan, and I found someone coming.

The floor where he is now is the room of Bihaihuan, which is where her good friends will 
stay, just below the floor of her own bedroom.

She is going out to fight, and for a while, she came home. Even if the sea is full of seas 
and the blue sea is chasing them, her mother, or other relatives, come back to her 
immediately. It is normal.

So Shen Lang discovered that someone came close and didn’t care. Until now, it was 
discovered that he came directly to him!

A person who can move freely within the scope of the “Imperial Palace” is of course a 
“royal” person. They came over with a miniature short-haul aircraft that was a little more 
protective than the transmission between buildings.

This is the location of the Bihai family. The outer layers are tightly protected, and there are 
dozens of floors. Of course, there will be no security windows and the like.

They landed directly on the balcony outside the floor, and then did not say hello, they 
came in directly.

Shen Lang sat like this and watched them come in.

Two men and one woman, he also put on the holy armor after showering, but opened the 
invisible mode, did not show up.

At this moment, watching them come in, they immediately corresponded to the searched 
information, and immediately knew the identity of these two people.

They are all children of the Bihai family, and they are the same generations as Bihaihuan 
and Bihai. Judging from the age, it is the cousin of Bihaihuan.



The man is called Bihai Rufeng, in his twenties, the woman is called Bihai Ruyu, about 
30, is her sister.

What they can be publicly discovered is also a simple piece of information, such as how it 
relates to Bihaihuan. Of course, the outside world cannot find it.

“Two, Miss Bihai is on the floor above.” Seeing them, Shen Lang first said something.

This is because of the courtesy of the guests. Naturally, he is not humble or humble. There 
is nothing to be afraid of their identity.

After the two of them came in, they looked around and saw the waves, and they all 
gathered together.

“You are the super powerful psionic master? We are here to find you, not to find a happy 
girl.” Bihai Ruyu said with a smile.

When they spoke, the two of them had already come in and went straight to the front of 
Shen Lang.

A sea of blue sea is a very heroic man, dressed in a masculine style.

The blue sea is like a jade, it is a seductive and **** style, wearing a red dress. Dresses 
tailored to her size and requirements not only highlight the figure, but also reveal half of 
the shoulders and chest, and there are openings underneath. As the models move, a white 
leg flickers.

The opening is very high. When the movement is large, almost the whole leg can be seen, 
and once it is fixed, it can not be seen.

Shen Lang sat and watched them come over, of course, inevitably saw the scenery of her 
dress.

Since Bihai Ruyu is dressed like this, it is not afraid of others to watch it.



However, the blue sea is a bit uncomfortable, this is his sister, now a strange man sees the 
legs, sees the shoulders, even the chest…

“Looking for me to do something?” Shen Lang asked a faint sentence.

Bihai Ruyu has not yet opened, and Bihai is not angry with the wind: “As a psionic master, 
don’t you know what is polite?”

Shen Lang glanced at him: “You are blaming me for not coming up to meet you Still not 
giving you a stool?”

Of course, this is not the case when the blue sea is like jade. When the sister is wearing it 
like this, even if others look at it, it is not rude to stare at it.

But he did not believe that Shen Lang did not understand what he meant. Since Shen Lang 
was greeted with the stool and he was going to follow the excuse.

“of course!”

When his voice just fell, he found that his body flew up, he was so busy and screaming, 
but he found that he did not fall to the ground, but was placed on a seat.

“Is it polite?”

Shen Lang did not look at him and continued to say to Bihai Ruyu: “This Miss Bihai, do 
you want me to sit down?”

Bihai Ruyu is a charming smile: “You don’t have to master the master, I will come to sit 
next to you.”

She really stepped forward to Shen Lang and then sat down next to him.

In this close step, the amplitude of the hip sway is much larger, and the legs are more 
obvious.



The blue sea was a little shocked, and immediately angered, and jumped directly: “You 
play me!”

“Quiet!” Bihai as jade white gave him a look, whispered.

Shen Lang looked at her calmly. The two brothers and sisters were prepared, but they 
wanted to see what they had. Already already asked, he is no longer nonsense, waiting for 
her own expression.

After sipping the blue sea like the wind, Bihai Ruyu looked at Shen Lang with a smile and 
looked at his face carefully, and did not speak.

Although the blue sea was suppressed, but looking at her like that, it was even more 
unhappy, and came over from the chair that was thrown out, and went to stand next to 
them.

Chapter 1018 - Pull up

“You go first, keep it unsightly, I chat with the master.”

Bihai Ruyu looked at the blue sea like the wind, and stood upright. He couldn’t help but 
sneak out, and then smiled at Shen Lang: “The master has come all the way, it’s really 
hard.”

Shen Lang feels weird. If you live above the real world, you will be called a master. This is 
called the Master of Spirits.

However, he is generally referred to as “Master of Shen Lang”, “Master Shen”, “Master of 
Psionics” and the like. This is called “Master” alone. How to listen to it has the taste of a 
monk.

And Bihai Ruyu is now more like a fairy, so that he is a little bit of a goblin to remember 
the feeling of Tang Yan.

“I don’t mean it!” Bihai is like a temper, and then he is standing there, he is unsightly.

Bihai Ruyu can only glare at him with a cold eye: “You will inform Huan Er! I will go to 
the house to eat together later.”



The blue sea brows like a wind, but it seems to be a business, he can only leave.

Bihai Ruyu and the spring breeze smiled at Shen Lang: “The master does not blame, my 
brother is spoiled, more rude, I am not paying for you on his behalf.”

The way she lost her compensation to Shen Lang is closer.

Originally, she came to choose to sit next to Shen Lang, now only a few inches apart.

Shen Lang keeps a smile: “I don’t get in the way. According to my style, if I really see it, I 
will kill it directly.”

Bihai Ruyu looked at Shen Lang’s smile and listened to his words. He also kept a smile. 
When he heard the last sentence, he could not help but be sluggish.

Her words were undoubtedly just a slap in the face, and Shen Lang’s performance was 
thought to follow the steps of the guest. I didn’t expect it to be so faceless!

Who are they? Miss of the blue sea family, son! With the supreme blood, it represents the 
most powerful force.

However, in the case of knowing their identity, the man screamed and said, “If you really 
see it, kill it directly!”

This is a bit of a jealousy. It can be used as a joke, as a warning, or as a provocation and 
threat to the blue sea family.

However, the blue sea is like jade, but it has been sluggish for a while, and immediately 
piled up a smile.

“Shen Master’s iron-blooded man, killing and cutting, such as jade is naturally 
understanding, but also very admire.”



If Shen Lang is only a psionic master, this identity can be respected, but it depends on 
who, if it is to challenge the Bihai family, ten hundred and one do not know how to die.

However, Shen Lang is not an ordinary psionic master. It is just as a great psionic master 
who has been studying for a long time with him. It has become a very powerful psionic 
master in just two years.

However, this still requires a more strategic vision of Bihai Chengtian, in order to analyze 
the deep meaning behind it.

For Bihai Ruyu, the splendid waves are mainly reflected in the live broadcast of the 
previous days, almost one person’s power, annihilating all the extraterrestrial demon!

Bihaihuan, who is driving four hundred mechs, is already a heroic act that can be named in 
history, but under his glory, it can only be a supporting role.

The extraterrestrial demon can drag down the coalition forces of the major families of the 
city, struggle for a long time, consume countless ammunition firepower, and even the 
death of many sergeants, can not get it.

Shen Lang can solve it easily, and it can be seen that his strength is stronger than this 
coalition!

Such a person, killing a blue sea like the wind, really nothing to dare!

Even the Bihai family can only suppress hatred. For the time being, they have to blame the 
blue sea for the wind and dare not ask him for justice. Otherwise, he will invest in other 
families and directly assassinate the members of the Bihai family… that is to change the 
influence of the big city-state pattern!

In the end, it is the daughter of the Bihai family. Even if she does not have the heroic spirit 
of Bihaihuan, she may not be a brainless person. So it was just a thought that had made her 
secretly cold and sweaty, and immediately laughed.

Shen Lang nodded, did not say anything, indicating her face to the point.



“Oh, look at my abruptness, I haven’t introduced myself yet. My name is Ruyu. It’s just 
that my brother is like a wind. It’s a cousin’s cousin.”

Bihai Ruyu immediately smiled and introduced herself through self-introduction: “We are 
taking the opportunity to come to the door today. One of the purposes is to want to see my 
great hero!”

Then she showed her obsessive gaze, as if she had seen the idol still in her heart.

“Do you know? Your heroic position on the battlefield has been broadcast live, so that 
everyone in the city-state can see it. Not only me, you are at least the dream of the entire 
city-state nine billion girls!”

Shen Lang kept a faint smile and did not comment.

worship? idol?

The performance of the young lady seems to be ok, and all kinds of reactions are very 
tricky. But she is the big lady of the Bihai family. What kind of characters have not seen it 
before?

Of course, there are also true worship, Bihaihuan is. However, Bihai Ruyu is actually too 
calm. When it is necessary to “show worship”, it begins to show the appearance of 
worship. It used to be more like a tempting character.

Not to mention that Shen Lang is now fully sensible, and if she really comes from the 
heart of worship so close at hand, it should be clear that I can feel the power of faith from 
her.

The two of them rushed to the scene, plus the impatient appearance of the blue sea. Shen 
Lang estimates that this is like Miss Yu, I want to seduce him!

The blue sea is pulled over, in fact, it is to carry out the current task – go up and find ways 
to drag the blue sea joy, give her more opportunities to be alone.

As for why you should do it, it is natural for the benefit!



Bihai is in control of the power, and is already the role of the future successor of the 
“preserving the prince”. Can his other brothers and uncles really be willing to assist?

If you have become a patriarch, it is really the highest power, and other people want to 
seize power, it is equal to the position, it will cause a great ups and downs inside and 
outside.

But just the default successor, there are great variables.

Bihai Chengtian has cultivated his son Bihai very well. If he succeeds in the upper 
position, he will cultivate the blue sea chasing into the next successor in the future. This 
has already put everyone under pressure. Suddenly, the blue sea is born again, and one 
daughter is strong.

Coupled with the help of Bi Haihuan’s Shen Lang, this is probably the mysterious psionic 
master from Xiandao, whose ability is not only on the battlefield, but also influences the 
family’s direction!

Whether it is arranged by their father, or Bihai Ruyu’s own ideas, the purpose is to 
establish a deep relationship with Shen Lang, even if they can not get their side, they must 
report to the thigh.

Shen Lang and Bi Hai Huan have the chance to meet each other and have a gift for many 
years. This is hard to grab, and you want to cross a bar, it is best to have a leg!

Therefore, she came to show the beauty plan. Due to the time relationship, I had to let go 
of the comparable honor and go straight to the wind.

Chapter 1019 - Cold pair

Shen Lang laughed and said nothing, Bihai Ruyu was closer to a few points directly, not 
only the body was already close, but even the face was only a few inches.

In the realm of Shen Lang, the facial features are much more sensitive than the average 
person. When she came over, she felt the aroma of her body and did not need to wait so 
close to smell.



He didn’t think much about it. After all, this is also a super-big lady of the princess and the 
county owner. The fragrance of makeup, toiletries and other aspects is indispensable.

But now, at a close distance, from the eyes of Bihai Ruyu, he saw a rush!

In combination with the previous guess, she came to show the beauty plan, then this is 
anxious… Is it because I want to come before the blue sea joy?

Shen Lang is a bit speechless, is this fast? Even if I eat this set, I will underestimate my 
persistence!

After discovering and thinking about this, he immediately manipulated the sacred 
reconnaissance and analyzed the scent of her body.

“Call the master to give up a little bit, it is better to call your little brother. Do you know if 
the little brother has a girlfriend?” Bihai Ruyu eyes are discharging, lips biting, with 
obvious charm.

Shen Lang will use the analysis of the holy armor because he can clearly determine that 
the fragrance is not poisonous.

Of course, in his current realm, the poison of the average person can not be poisoned if he 
eats it directly. And the blue sea is like jade, it is impossible to poison him.

The biggest possibility, this is the hypnotic drug!

Then he has no way to confirm, and the holy armor has all kinds of information on this 
side.

The detection of this with the sacred armor of the micro-super warfare system is 
undoubtedly an anti-aircraft gun and a mosquito, and its speed is almost synchronous.

As she continued to say this, Shen Lang knew it.



As he suspects, the fragrance of Bihai Ruyu is not only a fragrance such as skin care 
products, shampoo and shower gel, but a drug with a chemical composition. In short, it 
stimulates the human body. Secretion of hormones such as hormones, pheromones, and 
enthusiasm.

However, it is only the air spread, not the service, the dose is actually relatively small, and 
the role will of course play a role in stimulating catalysis, and will not cause people to get 
out of control.

In fact, Bihai is not bad, and the body is good, and now the clothes, and when I came over, 
I have already sold my body. Now I am so active and suggesting that I am already a man. 
It is.

She knows that Shen Lang is not an ordinary person, so she added such a layer of 
insurance. The combination of the two is similar to the catalysis of drinking.

Of course, at this scale, it should not be anxious and Shen Lang to come here, but want to 
let Shen Lang can not help but get some intimate contact with her, she can better arrange 
the next step. It is.

“That is a private issue. Miss Bihai has seen me, can say the second one.”

Shen Lang refused to answer, and jumped directly to the topic, so that Bihai Ruyu was a 
little helpless.

However, her face still smiles and smiles: “The second purpose, of course, is to invite my 
little brother to come to me to play. You can visit my room and help me with suggestions.”

A woman, inviting men to visit the boudoir, and using “go to play”, it is even more 
suggestive.

And Bihai Ruyu is still very clever, and she will not let him get bored if Shen Lang does 
not show any interest.

So after I finished speaking, I will continue to laugh and continue.



“Just kidding. You should have no interest because my uncle is not at home, so my father 
specially replaced his uncle and hosted a banquet to entertain the master. The aunt has 
come to our house, and I and the wind are coming to invite the master and the joyful past.”

The hint came, and immediately regained the charm, a little bit of everyone’s show.

Shen Lang nodded: “It turns out.”

“Masters won’t… refuse? The rice always has to eat.” Bihai Ruyu still maintains a good 
attitude.

Shen Lang is undecided: “I have not eaten for a few months, and there is no problem.”

“…”

This words smashed the blue sea like jade.

If any other person dares to brag about her like this, she will directly find someone to lock 
him up, hungry for a few months to see if it is not loaded.

But now she is talking about Shen Lang, she is not afraid of what. More importantly… she 
even thought it might be true!

After all, this is a big man from Xiandao. You can look at it with the eyes of a mortal. 
There is nothing miracle in him. It is nothing.

“Don’t be like this. We both come to ask you, if the wind is rude, I sent him a notice to 
cheer, this is my task. If you can’t please, then I will go back.”

She put away her smile and changed to a pitiful look.

Looking at her acting like a drama, Shen Lang secretly sneered, a little want to slap her out 
of the building.



“Bihai Huan and Bihai are like the wind.”

He reminded me that there was nothing to bear with her.

Bihai, like a jade, smiled and put away the poor appearance of the clothes. It also slightly 
opened the distance between the waves and the waves, and kept it to a foot.

But just for a moment she is getting closer again, this time it is already keeping her clothes 
swaying.

Compared to the previous deliberate temptation, it now shows a very natural look, as if 
their relationship has been very intimate and arbitrarily squatting.

Her obvious movements, Shen Lang can not know? Not only the action, but the intention 
behind it is also clear!

Immediately after the reminder, she immediately took back the disguise and kept a little 
distance. Explain that everything she had just made was deliberately made. This is the real 
reaction.

But she immediately figured it out, that is, let Bihai Huan see that she and Shen Lang are 
already very close!

Soon, Bihaihuan and Bihai went down like a wind, and then came over here immediately.

“Like Yujie!” When Bihaihuan saw Bihai as a jade, he called out as a cousin.

Then her gaze naturally saw the close posture of the blue sea like jade and Shen Lang.

Not to mention the blue sea, he saw it when he came over, and it was even more 
uncomfortable. I feel that Shen Lang is cheaper than the old lady, and the older sister is 
taking the initiative to stick it up.

“Sister!” His voice was a little bigger, a little reminder of the taste of Bihai Ruyu.



“Okay, people are together, we can go.”

Bihai Ruyu smiled and clap his hands, then stood up, naturally went to the front of 
Bihaihuan, took her hand and smiled and said: “Happiness is too heroic, my sister envy 
you!”

The steps she took to Bihaihuan were back to Shenlang, intentionally or unintentionally 
twisting, forming an obvious hip wave.

“Where, where.” Bihaihuan also smiled, but a little bit stiff. “Teacher, such as Yujie, 
invited us to eat in the past…”

Shen Lang directly waved his hand: “I will not go.”

Chapter 1020 - Life and death warning

Seeing that Bihaihuan had a bit of a stiff smile, Shen Lang knew that she was still not good 
at concealing, and that there was no such thing as a blue sea.

What made her embarrassed, of course, was not to go to dinner, but to see that they were 
so close when they first met.

When Shen Lang said this, let the eyes of all three of them look over.

“This, this…” Bi Haihuan has not finished yet. She originally wanted to talk about the 
situation. She did not expect Shen Lang to refuse directly.

Bihai Ruyu is a look of embarrassment.

She just sacrificed the color of the hue, not only did not let the waves of the heart, or even 
give face!

Just now she said that she couldn’t go back to the meeting, it was naturally fake, but it 
would be true to lose face. To be charming and charming, it is necessary to show the poor 
and weak, and Shen Lang actually refused so directly!



The two of them were stunned, and the blue sea, which was so uncomfortable, could not 
help but directly worry about it.

“What are you special about? Our family invites you to eat, is to lift you! Do you think 
you can do whatever you want? Do you believe that I will take you now…”

When he spoke, he strode forward and rushed to the side of Shen Lang.

But I haven’t waited until the blue sea is happy, and I haven’t waited until the blue sea jade 
opening restrains him. I found that my body flew up and then I was thrown out and flew 
out from the outside balcony!

“what!”

Bihai Ruyu and Bihaihuan were both surprised. Not to mention the blue sea that was 
thrown out, it was the two of them. They did not think that Shenlang would actually throw 
people out.

This is a few dozens of floors, in the family headquarters, the blue sea will not wear 
equipment such as the holy armor, this goes out, it is directly to fall!

Under the two screams, they rushed to the balcony to see what was going on outside.

Both of them are experiencing rapid heartbeat, and they are afraid that seeing the blue sea 
below has already fallen into a rotten meat!

Needless to say, Bihai Ruyu, that is her younger brother.

Bi Haihuan is also very nervous. If the blue sea is killed like this, and it can only be 
regarded as a verbal offense, the family must not spare the teacher.

She must help the teacher to leave immediately!



What makes her nervous the most is not the conflict between the family and the teacher, 
but the teacher must avoid the danger and can’t come back. It may not be seen in the 
future!

When the two of them rushed out, they saw that the blue sea was falling like a wind, and 
the body was coming across and falling against the ground! But when they were about to 
fall a few inches to the ground, they all thought that they would flesh and blood, and 
almost closed their eyes and couldn’t bear to watch.

Suddenly, the body of the blue sea flew up quickly, and soon came to them, and then flew 
back into the house under their incredible gaze.

Bihai Ruyu and Bihaihuan both had a strong heartbeat, but it was finally a heart.

As long as there are no dead people, even if they are offended by the children of the Bihai 
family, they are still recoverable!

At this point, Bihai can understand that the more mature blue sea and jade are more 
understandable.

Otherwise, her brother’s death is a pain and loss, and she will be angered by this matter!

They ran back again and saw the blue sea as the wind had fallen from the sky, letting him 
stand.

However, after the invisible support was gone, his feet could not be supported at all. When 
it was soft, he stumbled directly in front of Shen Lang and then sat down on the ground.

Just that scene, almost scared him to death!

Just throwing him out of the upstairs, I almost had a urine, only one thought: this time I 
finished!

Then he fell out, not his feet down, nor his head and feet, but fell to the ground. This 
makes him want to escape and there is no way to directly see the ground getting closer!



In those few seconds, it was a long fear for him, as if waiting for the death of the dead, 
never thought that time would pass so slowly.

If you close your eyes, you don’t have to look at it. You don’t have to look at it, you will 
be even more afraid. Even if you die, it will take another second to watch one second!

When he fell to the ground a few inches, he obviously felt the airflow that hit the air, 
which stirred up the slight dust on the ground and directly hit the surface. At the same 
time, the nose slobber that was scared out was dropped directly on the ground.

Waiting for him to react, the body jumped again!

At that time, he was fortunate enough to have no time to react, but felt that he wanted to 
pull him up several times and then let him fall to death.

What is more helpless is that even if he is on the edge of life and death, he wants to scream 
and scream, and he can’t make a sound, as if he is covered by a mouth, which is 
undoubtedly more painful.

When I got back to the house now, ten minutes before and after, it seemed like a half life 
for him.

If you want to say something hard, you can’t say it at all, your body is completely 
disobedient, your feet are soft and weak, you stumble, stumble, completely uncontrollable, 
and you are trembling.

“You are all right, don’t scare me!”

Bihai Ruyu fell to the side of Bihai Ruyu I swayed him a few times, and forgot that she 
was scared and shivered.

Then turn to Shen Lang: “Master, like the wind, he is young and ignorant, you don’t have 
to know him, ask you, ask you…”



“Teacher…” Bi Haihuan is also a weak opening.

“He’s fine.” Shen Lang shrugged: “He just said what I am, I don’t know what I am. But if 
you want to do whatever you want, let him experience it.”

Said that he gave a gesture to the blue sea, let her be a good person.

Bihai nodded a bit, and in the past it injected a glimmer of energy into the blue sea.

She is now a monk who lives in the real world. Although it is the first time, it is not 
difficult for her.

With the help of vitality, the blue sea, which is almost in a state of semi-shock, has 
returned to the soul, at least the body is calm. Of course, the shadows in the depths of the 
soul will be hard to destroy.

“I, I…” He quickly touched his face with his hands and confirmed that he had not smashed 
his face and looked at his hands and feet.

“Snapped!”

A slap in the sea like a jade fan is on the face of the blue sea.

“Sister! I woke up!” The blue sea that screamed in pain, screamed, and thought that Bihai 
Ruyu was to wake him up.

“Hurry to apologize to the master!” Bihai Ruyu was cold and screamed.

When the hanging heart was just put down, she remembered one thing. Just now, Shen 
Lang said to her, if it is really strange, it will be killed directly!

Obviously, people are not afraid of the blue sea family, and this guy is uncomfortable, is 
really dare to kill the people of the blue sea family!



Therefore, it is just a matter of personal experience, so that the blue sea is like a long-term 
memory, but also gives her a clearer warning.
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