
First Strong 1131

Chapter 1131 - Cooperative tomb

Mu Tianhai said the information as soon as possible, and then looked at Shen Lang, 
waiting for his feedback.

“What else?” Shen Lang asked faintly.

“and also?”

“You are talking about common sense. This does not mean your sincerity. I think you 
admire the family, you should have some information, or you will not come all the way.”

From the words just now, Shen Lang has summed up some information.

There are multiple entrances in the meditation domain. It has been opened for several 
years, and it is not a rare thing. Plus the risk is very high, the rate of return into the inside, 
or the price is not very high.

Therefore, there are some family sects. They are not too lazy to come over because of the 
distance. Instead of taking better information and greater grasp, they will not take risks. 
There are still plenty of opportunities after that.

Some may have been there many times, or entered somewhere else a few years ago, and 
some things were not obtained, and they came here again.

Mu Tianyu Haineng is well prepared, and certainly there is certain information that has not 
yet been said.

“This……”

Seeing that Shen Lang did not say anything, but let him completely confide, Mu Tianhai is 
somewhat reluctant.



Shen Lang shook his head and seemed to emphasize his sincerity. If this is the case, then 
don’t cooperate.

“Wait a minute…” Mu Tianhai quickly screamed.

He did not think that the information just lost, in fact, it is really common sense, it is 
information that can be heard. – Of course, he does not know that Shen Lang lacks these 
common sense.

“When our family was last opened, I have been here. I have confirmed that the seal of a 
mausoleum is very weak and will be unsealed within a few decades. So this time, we want 
to find the tomb.”

Mu Tianhai said their secrets, but only this, will not give more detailed information, so as 
not to be swayed by Shen Lang.

Shen Lang’s pretending question was casually asked: “A few decades… Are you sure you 
will come across this time? Or will it be advanced by others?”

“No! It’s an estimate for decades. When we come in this time, even if we don’t unblock it, 
it’s almost the same. It can be opened by external force. As for people entering other 
places, in general, the scope is too big, seven days. Not enough to explore other areas.”

This made Shen Lang have a better understanding. Although every entrance leads to the 
meditation, the seat is fixed. The scope of the meditation is very large, so people coming in 
from other entrances may not be able to get here.

After listening to Shen Lang, he nodded and said nothing, then did not speak again.

“How? Your meaning is…” Mu Tianhai couldn’t help but urge it. The time here is 
precious, and it takes a while to waste a little.

“Transaction is good, cooperation is worth it. I am acceptable, but I am afraid that you will 
feel bad. After all, you have clues, but I… not as you guessed, and there is no clue in Qiu 
Lin Jianzong. “”



Shen Lang smiled and told the truth.

This statement directly makes the expression of Mu Tianhai a bit petrified.

He did not expect that Shen Lang would have such a direct statement. If there is really no 
clue, it is really the loss of the Mutian family!

However, he immediately launched Lenovo: If Shen Lang has no clue at all, it should be 
bluffing, pretending to have clues, will be the most beneficial to him!

Now directly saying that there are no clues, they will have to take advantage of them. 
Doesn’t this mean deliberately let them push cooperation?

What good is that for him?

The biggest possibility is that he has better clues and may be related to their clues, so he 
deliberately said this and didn’t want to share with them!

Mu Tianhai is going to cooperate with Shen Lang. It is not easy to put down the grievances 
and grievances before. Naturally, it is because of the consideration of interests.

Now, since I guess there must be better clues on Shen Lang, of course, I will not miss this 
opportunity.

“Forget it, there is no more! Working with you, at least can increase our strength. Whether 
it is the enemy of the meditation domain, or other forces with dissent, we can have greater 
control. The same is true for you. ”

Shenlang eyebrows pick one: “Mu Tian old man, you are not like a magnanimous person. 
Really no other thoughts?”

Mu Tianhai did not say good things: “I said that cooperation is good. You can only listen to 
my message clues. I have nothing. What else can I think? It will make you a hitter. We are 
together, others. If you want to swallow you, you need to re-evaluate.”



“It sounds a bit reasonable. But don’t say that the thugs are so ugly, it’s better to work 
together as a bodyguard.”

“Then you promised?”

“accepted!”

The two men were still alert, just nodded, even if they reached a cooperation, the 
handshake did not hold.

Although I still feel that Shen Lang has a secret, I may know more about the clues about 
the meditation domain, but Shen Lang’s unwillingness to disclose the attitude is still a bit 
uncomfortable for Mu Tianhai.

But as he said, if they cooperate, it is equal to double the strength and good for everyone.

And if it is really related to the mausoleum, once his clues are not used, Shen Lang must 
also say it.

Mu Tiansong Yun two, this Shen Lang is of course more unhappy. However, they are not 
too young, they can still control their emotions, and they are completely obedient to the 
arrangement of the world.

It’s just that the whole process will not have much communication with Shen Lang, and 
friends are impossible.

Shen Lang originally had no place to go. Now Mutian has a direction, and everyone is 
together.

And he naturally uses the sacred record to record the trajectory, and record everything 
along the way, when you can use these to return.

The place where everyone appeared before is a wilderness, and everyone else has 
disappeared. Now they are four people, and they quickly left the local area.



The feeling of giving people along the way is still cloudy and smoky. Under the dark, there 
is no scene of life.

In a hurry,  traveled for a long time. When I crossed a hill, Mu Tianhai suddenly snorted 
another two people, let them wait for the rest of the world, and follow him. Behind.

Even if you didn’t specifically talk to Shen Lang, you can guess what it is. When coming 
all the way, Mu Tianhai is no matter the observation and comparison of the surrounding 
situation, apparently confirming the route.

When I came to this hill, what was confirmed, it goes without saying that the other side of 
the mountain should no longer be calm all the way, but it will be dangerous, so we need to 
envy the two days.

Of course, in addition to the concern for his own people, Mu Tianhai should feel that there 
is no need to smash the waves. After all, Shen Lang is a level with him.

During the talk, the four people have reached the top of the mountain, and they are greeted 
with a sigh of relief!

Chapter 1132 - Mysterious river

Between this hill and the opposite hill, there is a river below. The width of the river is quite 
large, and the length is even more marginal on both sides.

To get to the other side, you must first spend this river. With their strength, even if it is a 
few days, it is sure to fly over the river.

What surprised them was the edge of the riverbed on both sides, which extended to the 
hillside and was a lot of dead bones!

Can let them look at the side, of course, not the ordinary forest bones, but the living bones!

These white bones are slowly moving in disorder, up and down in the mountains, like the 
numbness of walking dead. If the light is one, it is a bit embarrassing to look at it.



But now it is all over the mountains, from the hillside to the edge of the riverbed below, 
the opposite is also the same, spread to both sides is very far away, so thousands of 
activities with bones, it makes people a little scalp.

And the four of them just appeared on the top of the hill, and immediately the squat on the 
hillside was immediately noticed, and all of them came to this side!

Their movements were still slow, but it seemed to wake up and move straight like a rabbit, 
and the scope was getting bigger and bigger, and they were chasing them from afar.

This also means that no matter which side they want to go from the left and the right, it is 
impossible. As long as they show up, they will be chased in all directions.

Look at it like this, at least tens of thousands! There are so many opposites, not only the 
human form, but also some animal shapes, even birds, which is a bit horrible.

“Follow me!”

The whole person of Mu Tianhai has become very serious. After saying something to the 
two of them quickly, he immediately rushed down the hillside!

This behavior makes Shen Lang slightly puzzled.

There are a lot of cockroaches on the hillside below, and there are so many rushes. Want to 
avoid them crossing the river, flying directly is the right way!

However, Shen Lang did not rush to fly directly, because not only the sky, but also the two 
of them, and they are honest, and there is no suggestion. It is obvious that they have all 
understood the situation here.

When Shen Lang thought about it, people followed the past.

“Reassured! My post!”

This sentence of hiss is indeed to let the former Mu Tianhai reassured a lot.



Because he wants to open the road ahead, he can only let the two tribes follow closely. 
Once hundreds of thousands of piles are piled up, they may not be able to take care of 
them.

Shen Lang said that he would be behind the temple, and naturally it was a promise. The 
two of them were sandwiched in the middle, which is undoubtedly much safer.

Between the talks, they have already rushed out a dozen steps below, and the first wave of 
those rushing over, the first wave, also pushed to the face of Mu Tianhai.

The dark waves are behind, the situation is a little better, but with the degree they wash, it 
will be a maximum of one second.

At a critical moment, one second, I can already let him observe a lot of things!

For example, now.

Shen Lang did not understand the behavior of Mu Tianhai, but still followed, but did not 
forget to pay attention to the surrounding situation, including the opposite.

As a result, there are some birds in the shape of a bird, waving the bones and wings, and 
actually flying over here! There are also some more fierce embarrassing, and then come 
over here.

Those who fly, some flutter farther, and some less than half fall directly into the river. But 
no matter how far or near, they flew out, and in the process of going forward, they all went 
down.

Only those flying cockroaches kept a relatively flat angle and came over here.

When I said that it was too late, I had seen various situations before Shen Lang faced it!

Those who can’t escape the river and fall down, he is not surprised at all.



As he suspected, the river below, like the stagnant pool that the former king had taken with 
him, was a completely similar stagnant water, directly disintegrating those skeletons, and 
the water and sound were not shocked.

What surprised him was the birds!

They want to fly from the air, and it’s also a way to use it before. But the result was that it 
didn’t fly far, it seemed to “crash the wall”, and then fell below, too late to change and 
react, so that they also fell into the stagnant water.

A few consecutive ones are the result, and I immediately let Shen Lang understand a few 
points.

This river, like a level, wants to go to the other side, you must pass it. From the hills on 
both sides, to the river below, there should be a ban, not a flight, but a certain degree of 
control.

This is the analysis of the situation of Shen Lang combined with Jin Daigu, which is about 
100 meters in the air ban.

In other words, you are at the top of the mountain, up to a hundred meters in the air; in the 
flat, in the deep valley, it is also about 100 meters. It is based on the surface, not the unity. 
If there is a big tree of 100 meters on the flat, standing at the highest point, it has reached 
the height of the ban, not counting from the top of the tree.

The situation here should be similar, but from the point of view of the situation, the height 
is up to ten meters!

Just now they all came all the way, they all flew forward, so it did not mean that the entire 
ban will be banned, but only the prohibition of this river.

Mu Tianhai has been here because of the family’s predecessors. I don’t know which 
generation of the first generation, and I have suffered losses, so I made records and 
warnings, so they know the problem.

The reason why I didn’t confess with Shen Lang was probably that he thought it was clear!



Shen Lang didn’t blame him for anything, and didn’t say much more. He followed him 
anyway, and he didn’t want to challenge himself. It was enough to learn.

At this time, he must also face the sly attack, and the dozens of cockroaches have arrived 
at their side!

Whether it is the front of the sea, the sea, or the middle of the two, they all took out the 
weapons, and quickly waved their own protection.

In the heart of Shen Lang’s heart, is it possible to enter this “level”, in addition to the 
height of the forbidden flight, and the prohibition of spells?

He immediately released a thunder out!

The result is now in my palm, and sure enough, not only the general spells, but even the 
techniques of lightning that he learned in the chaotic space can not be displayed.

However, the more bizarre and strange, the more he is interested, let him look forward to 
the trip to the meditation.

In an instant  Juyue Sword and Liuye Sword appeared in the hands of Shen Lang at the 
same time!

One left and one right, he danced with two swords and immediately appeared a very 
spectacular scene!

On the other side of the Liuye sword, it is gently picking up the gap between the bones, 
and quickly picking them down into the river.

On the side of Juyue Sword, it is the power of overbearing, and the touch directly touches 
it!

So one side is just approaching, and flies past the river, and the other side is broken bone 
powder flying all over the sky.



After the Shenlang Temple is not just taking care of himself, the double sword is also more 
than enough to protect the first two together.

Chapter 1133 - Artillery

Mutian Bohai opened the road in front, the pressure is very big, almost facing the shackles 
of the skull and face, naturally it is impossible to take into account the two ethnic groups.

But as long as they are close, he is opening the road ahead, and there will be no problem 
between the gap of one or two seconds.

But now it is found that there are two behind the temple, there are two of them, there is no 
need to worry, even their self-protection, it really becomes a defense. Because those 
cockroaches have not yet arrived, they will be crushed by the smashing waves, or they will 
fly down the river.

It can even be said that Shen Lang is also helping him!

Because on the hillside where they are going down now, there is also a prohibited area of 
up to ten meters. Therefore, Shen Lang vigorously dials out, and they are not afraid that 
they will fly too high. A large number of people, flying fast to the river below, naturally hit 
a lot of front rushing to the sea, but also fell down the river.

Under the protection of the two strong players, the speed of the four-person squad can be 
advanced. But it’s just “yes can be” because there are too many of them!

In addition to many, their speed is also very fast, here Shen Lang just smashed a wave with 
the Juyue sword, and immediately there is a wave of it!

For the living, it seems that they have the great attraction of instinct, so that they are not 
afraid of death.

However, if you say it again, it’s already done, and you’re afraid of dying? Perhaps no 
soul, this instinctual wisdom is also caused by this special environment.

After moving for a while, I arrived in the middle of the mountain. The number around is 
increasing!



More behind, Shen Lang also had to split a part to slash the back of the shackles, so as not 
to accidentally said.

More and more people are on the left and right, and the cockroaches that let him dial out 
are difficult to fly down to the river below. They hang directly on the raft below, and then 
re-push to the front of the sky.

He pays attention to a wide range, and there are still a lot of cockroaches coming from 
afar, this is really thousands!

They are now caught in the army.

He has been very addicted and has become impatient since he started. The front of the 
Mutian Bohai is not a bit lazy, in the case of not being able to use the spell, he can only 
play the power.

The speed at which Mu Tianhai moves down in front is slower and slower.

This makes Shen Lang secretly frown. If this continues, all the beds will be blocked. Even 
if you can kill a road, there are countless cockroaches coming over and dragging your legs. 
It is more troublesome to spend the Deadwater River within a height of ten meters.

And ten meters is only his estimate, maybe the top is ten meters, and crossing the river 
may be lower or not.

The power of the stagnant water can make these blame quickly decompose invisible, and 
the scales of the king’s dragons are quickly eroded. He really does not want to get 
contaminated.

They admire the sea and naturally have this worry, so they are desperate. With too much 
enthusiasm, there are two places in the world, and there is room for play. I dare not let out 
the slightest slack, and try to move faster.

But the reality is that the pace of moving in the sky is getting slower and slower, because 
he has broken the first ten shatters, and immediately filled twenty or thirty, and there are 



one hundred and two hundred piles behind. Come, simply don’t give him a chance to kill a 
path.

Shen Lang can’t do this, and he immediately changed his strategy.

This is not a time to help the world, it is his own, but also has to go, or else it is very 
troublesome to get stuck here.

“Ready to go from the left to the bottom!”

The words of Shen Lang have made the three people in front of the Mutian family 
inexplicable.

Now it’s all in all directions, let’s not say the left side, there’s no gap in the head to make 
you rush.

At this time, Shen Lang immediately pulled out a cannon from the fold space of the sacred 
armor and slammed it out to the left!

The powerful shock wave, a few of them were almost overturned, and the numerous piles 
of squadrons were immediately opened up with a big gap!

Mu Tianhai was really shocked. I don’t know what kind of magic weapon, but I can still 
display it where I can ban spells.

But at this time, there was no time to think about it. He immediately rushed out along the 
gap on the left!

Mu Tiansong Yun was whipped by the shock wave, but the good guys are also comparable 
to the peak of the gods, still able to withstand.

They don’t need to admire the sea or the sea, but they also rushed out.



What everyone wants to fight for is that it is less than a second. Otherwise, even if it 
smashes and smashes a bunch of cockroaches, it is only a very small wave, and there are 
still a lot of them to continue to make up.

Fortunately, everyone has grasped it, and when the latter is added, they have already 
rushed to the edge of the riverbed.

“Fly as soon as possible! Control within a height of one foot! Never touch the water 
below!”

Mu Tianhai screamed and the man had already swept over the water!

Within a mile! Shen Lang secretly stunned, and it was much lower than he estimated.

Countless cockroaches rushed over and the hills ran down, and they were a little faster.

After the first two follow, Shen Lang also followed the fly.

The whole time of crossing the river was very short, and their speed was not slow. With 
this width, they soon reached the other side.

However, when the three of them were still above the river, they found that there was a 
problem in front of them. A lot of shackles on the other side of the river saw that they had 
to cross the river, and they blocked the past in advance!

Those who have been on the other side  want to fly over here. In the end, it was still 
controlled, and only a few fell into the river. But they are completing the process of 
gathering, directly on the other side of the river is a dense pile!

Seeing that the speed of the sky is much slower, it is going to be caught up by them.

They are trapped in it, and they can fight as much as possible, but now they have no 
foothold. Once they are dragged into the water, they will be in trouble.



Shen Lang didn’t think about it, let the body shift a little, avoiding the first three people, 
and it was a shot!

Countless pelicans on the shore to the hillside were blown up!

Mu Tian’s spirit is in full swing. As long as they have a foothold, they are not afraid. They 
can slowly go to the top.

“Follow me!”

When Mutianhai fell to the other side, Shen Lang had crossed the two days of Mutian 
Songyun, and arrived one step ahead of Mutianhai.

When I finished this sentence, Shen Lang began to rush to the top of the hillside, and the 
holy armor was unwelcome and then shot!

The vast army of mountains and plains, directly to the top of the mountain, immediately 
opened a dense passage between the dense.

Mu Tianhai, they have something to say? Of course, I will follow the Shen Lang and rush 
to it!

Chapter 1134 - Valley of the Winds

Before, they were four people, from the top of the mountain to the middle of the mountain. 
Although the actual time was not too long, it felt very long.

In the last half of the journey, crossing the river, and now on this hillside, it seems that it is 
coming in an instant.

And these are undoubtedly due to the shelling of Shen Lang.

Under the condition that it is impossible to use force, the effect of shelling is almost 
sweeping.

When I reached the top of the mountain, I looked back and looked at the sky with them.



And when they passed, the madness chasing their embarrassment, as if they had lost their 
goal, did not chase it again, and returned to the same state as before.

Mu Tiansong Yun two people, the mood at the moment is very complicated.

Originally, they had opinions on Shen Lang. Even if they did not object to the arrangement 
of Mu Tianhai, there were some snacks in their hearts.

However, just after Shen Lang really exhibited a force that was far better than them, the 
countless squadrons really made them think about it. If there is no such thing as admiring 
the sea and the sea, it is their own words, I am afraid that they will not be smashed.

For this kind of sinking wave that helped them a lot, they want to thank and can’t say it.

Everyone came out of the tight state, not rushing to fly, but to slow down the slope.

“Sure enough, I did not misread, Shen Lang’s strength is extraordinary!” Mu Tianyuhai 
made a sigh of emotion.

Shen Lang smiled faintly, of course, he would not say what method he had done. If it is not 
to solve this problem, he does not want to show the sacred armor in front of outsiders. It’s 
the earth, and I don’t know if he has this thing.

Mu Tianhai is also a striking person. No matter what kind of magic weapon that others are, 
it is impossible to tell you in detail, so he did not ask much.

“It’s no wonder that you don’t have much worry about being alone. I understand now, you 
really have this confidence.”

“Good to say.” Shen Lang nodded.

Mu Tianyuhai smiled and said: “We just thought that if we cooperate with you, we will 
suffer a little, but we need more than one ally. Now it seems that we may take advantage of 
it.”



Shen Lang shrugged: “It doesn’t matter. I am a very good person to talk to, people respect 
me, I let him a foot. The same, insult me, I may also pay back ten times!”

These words gave them a few thoughts, and then remembered their encounters with Mu 
Tianzheng…

“Please rest assured that you will never be harmful to your heart. You don’t mind losing, 
we are very admired and thankful.”

Shen Lang glanced at him and smiled and said: “That would tell me a little bit of 
information. I certainly don’t know much about this field.”

In the eyes of Mu Tianhai, the words of Shen Lang must be half-truth.

With his age and experience, there is some information that is unclear, and that is possible. 
But it may not be less than them. Maybe you still want to test it out and see if there is any 
sincerity!

After just one battle, Shen Lang show reveals the mysterious strength, and the help of 
them, so that Mu Tianhai has been completely relieved.

“Although our information is also common sense, but the Mutian family also has some 
secret clues from the ancestors. For example, where we have just experienced…”

Mu Tianhai said this time is more in-depth.

The river that just passed, called the Deadwater River, is about the same nature as the 
Deadwater Pool that I saw before.

Perhaps Kim Jong-Guo will be called the Deadwater Pool, and the name is from the 
Deadwater River in the meditation area. As for whether it is figured out, no one knows. 
After all, no one can sneak into it to investigate.

And this is really the first level they went to the mausoleum.



This level can’t stop everyone, like the people who have been to the Mutian family before, 
but they have passed away, just to spend a little time and strategy, and to cooperate.

Its most critical role is because of the strangeness and difficulty that many people are 
discouraged and go directly to other directions.

This is a screening to avoid a large number of people coming over here.

According to the information of their predecessors, there are two levels in front of them to 
get to the land of the tomb.

The first level is called the “Dead River”, the second level is called “The Valley of the 
Wind”, and the third level is “The Forest of Deception”.

Because of the shots of Shen Lang, the time for them to pass the “Dead River” was greatly 
shortened than expected. So you can easily go down the mountain, but the extra time, of 
course, is best used in the mausoleum. It may take more than an hour to get more benefits.

Therefore, everyone did not have much ease, and then they rushed to the “wind valley” 
under the lead of the search for the sea.

Like the Shenlang, they entered the Qiangjialing. Because of the limited time, with their 
realm, of course, they will not waste time on sleeping and rest. There is no way to hurry.

There is no obvious day or night change here, it is all the same. Shen Lang is from the time 
of the Holy Grail, when it was confirmed to the Valley of the Wind, it was already the 
morning of the next day.

From the distance of the trajectory, it is indeed a long way away. However, according to 
Mu Tianhai, as long as the Valley of the Wind has passed, there is no need to catch too 
many roads ahead.

The key to the “wind valley” is to go in from the mouth of the valley.



The entire valley mouth is a straight passage, as smooth as a knife and axe, with cliffs on 
either side. The width in the middle is about ten meters, and the length of this channel is up 
to ten miles according to the records of the seniors of the Mutian family!

Now they have reached the mouth of the valley, looking at the passage from the passage, it 
is not at first sight.

“It’s here, we just have to walk in, and we have passed this pass. There is no such thing as 
attacking us at this level, and there is no danger of life or death. But just like in the area of 
the Deadwater River, once you enter, you have a little mana. Can not be used, must rely on 
the flesh, smashed the wind like a knife!”

The special point of the Valley of the Wind is – the wind!

Originally such a narrow passage, it is very conducive to the flow of air, it will be the 
“wind vent” that people often say. Generally, this kind of place will make ordinary people 
feel a little embarrassed. They will scrape and flip the umbrella, but it will not be too 
exaggerated.

According to Mu Tianhai, the wind of the Valley of the Winds can no longer be described 
by the wind, and it is so strong that it is incredible and even awkward.

Shen Lang thought about the wind standard of the earth  hurricane” standard is generally 
more than 25 meters per second, often can pull up trees and destroy houses.

More than 28 meters per second is a “storm” that can blow away houses. More than 32 
meters per second is a “typhoon” and a “hurricane”, which can often create huge disasters. 
This is also the 11th and 2nd grades, followed by strong typhoons and strong typhoons.

The strongest typhoon with a maximum of seventeen levels has a wind energy of more 
than 60 meters per second.

However, no matter how many levels of typhoon, it is often said that the center’s 
maximum wind, and is above the ocean, once boarded 6, the wind will weaken and reduce.



A typhoon can affect thousands of miles. Here, it is concentrated in the mouth of the 
valley. It can cause headaches in the semi-fairy realm. In the end, how big will the wind 
be?

Chapter 1135 - Resistance to wind

“Go and feel it.”

Standing in the valley of the Valley of the Winds, Mutianhai took a smile and gestured to 
Shenlang to feel the “channel of the wind” in the past, but also nodded to Mu 
Tiansongyun, indicating that they can also experience it.

They are now standing in Taniguchi, and they can feel the wind blowing, but it is not too 
surprising.

If people drink water and know themselves, this kind of thing must feel for themselves.

Mu Tianyu Hai can let his people feel, naturally because there is no danger.

Mu Tiansong and the two people looked at each other and immediately stepped on 
thousands, ready to grab the experience before Shen Lang.

It’s not a matter of rushing, but you want to prove yourself!

Shen Lang is also starting, he is faster, although the two of them preempted, but the three 
people almost simultaneously joined the channel of the wind.

There will be ten miles in front of them. They don’t expect to be able to rush forward. 
They want to see how far they can go this time, mainly to feel how big the resistance of 
the wind is.

As a result, there was a situation in which all three of them were surprised!

The three people who almost joined in at the same time, according to their expectations, 
can jump at least three or five feet away. Even if the wind is strong, returning a little, 
should you be able to go out two or three feet?



As a result, in addition to the moment they rushed out, they reached the body and 
immediately got scraped back by the wind!

The distance that rushed out was not three or five feet, and three or five meters did not 
reach…

In other words, the three of them basically rushed for about two or three meters, and then 
immediately hit back by the strong wind, directly to the outside of the passage.

“How do you feel?” Mu Tianhai looked at them with a smile.

“Do you know if you try it?” Shen Lang glanced at him. This guy is more aware of the 
strong wind and deliberately wants to make them ugly.

Mu Tianqi Haihaha smiled and said: “This wind is strong. After passing our conventional 
concept, I don’t have to try.”

This point of silence is confirmed, and indeed the concept of conventional wind is indeed 
realized.

When they first entered, all three of them were ready. Even if it is just a experience, at 
least it will not be scraped. But after it really went in, it was only after the wind was strong 
that it was far beyond the estimate.

It is the typhoon that can be used to scrape out the masters like them directly.

What is even more amazing is that the strong wind is only within the scope of the passage. 
Once it is scraped out, it feels stronger and stronger, and it is not so abnormal.

However, for this level, Shen Lang did not think it would be difficult, in the end it is also 
relative. This is unimaginably strong compared to the natural wind, but when he is flying 
with the treble, the wind resistance is actually very large.

There is not much pressure on Mu Tianhai, he should be prepared.



“Let’s hurry up.” Mu Tianhai did not make a joke, and immediately took out some 
prepared tools.

“Sorry. Lord Shen Lang, we didn’t anticipate you, so I didn’t prepare for you.”

Seeing Shen Lang staring at him next to him, Mu Tianhai said a little embarrassed.

Shen Lang didn’t care about shaking his head: “Nothing, I will see how you have passed, 
maybe I can think of a way.”

Just now, Mu Tianhai also made it clear that they have experienced it lightly. It will have 
such a big impact. In addition to the special abnormal wind, there is another important 
reason, that is, once entering the passage area, the vitality is prohibited.

Can not use the vitality, can not use the mana body, can only fight through the pure body, 
that is to rely on strength and weight.

What will the Mutian family prepare in advance?

Is there a magic weapon like “Ding Fengzhu”?

Shen Lang is indeed a bit curious, after all, this side is higher than the earth, like the 
mythical legend of the peach, it is likely to come from here. Perhaps it is true that there is a 
mythical legend in the “fixed wind”.

However, after reading their “equipment”, Shen Lang almost laughed!

What equipment is this, and it is primitive?

Mu Tianhai took out the ropes and connected the three people together, probably in such a 
way to help each other. In addition, it is the same thing as six iron shovel, which is 
estimated to increase the total amount.

“Although simple, but effective.” He also saw that Shen Lang was laughing and explaining 
a bit embarrassing.



In addition, they also prepared a backpack for one person, which must also be a high-
density heavy object such as iron, used to press the weight.

Probably to prove his “effectiveness”, Mu Tianhai did not stop, and the three heavy people 
were on the edge of the passage.

Under the condition that they can still use the vitality, this is to add a few hundred pounds, 
and it has no effect on them.

Then they did not directly plunge into it, but fell to the ground!

The three people have been connected together, one hand and one “iron shovel”, and then 
began to move forward.

Shen Lang looked at the back and had to say that although it was a primitive stupid way, it 
still had a certain effect.

First, they are lying down and going forward, the method is right, so the area of the wind 
that is rushing in front is much smaller, and the resistance is naturally much less.

Standing and being blown strongly, it is easy to retreat, which involves an instinctive 
reaction. When you are lying on the ground, you don’t need to worry about falling, and 
you won’t be embarrassed.

Moreover, it is impossible to pass a mile of gas, and now it is a more appropriate method 
to move slowly and slowly.

The things in their backpacks, the ones in their hands, should be dense and not too light, 
helping them to suppress a lot of weight. Coupled with the three people connected, the 
interaction has a good bonus.

The method reduces the wind resistance and adds weight to each other. The effect of one 
plus one reduction is undoubtedly ten times higher than before.



So, when their bodies climbed in, they paused for a while to adapt to the rhythm of the 
wind, and then the three men held the “iron shovel” in a unified way, then stretched over 
and then changed the other hand.

Of course, there is no such thing as a graceful gesture in this position. Plus the bag that is 
carried, plus this degree, it is really like a turtle.

However, it will not be scraped again, and it can move forward a little bit.

With their realm  even if they can’t use the vitality, the power of pure flesh is enough to 
support the climb.

Five meters, ten meters… watching them move in a little bit, Shen Lang also wondered 
how to get in.

By physical strength and weight, he thought about getting bigger, so that the tonnage could 
be pressed and there was enough strength to climb forward. If they are in front of them, 
they can still block the wind.

However, the bigger the body, the greater the wind resistance. If it is not good, it will be 
easier to be scraped back.

Just that can be regarded as an experience. If you are scraped out, it will be a bit lost.

Chapter 1136 - Rolling turtle speed

Gradually crawling forward in the channel of the wind, Mutianhai is also thinking about 
whether the waves can pass.

They are prepared, and then three people collaborate and are sure to pass.

In fact, it is just enough to tie the Shen Lang together. Even if there is no other thing to 
increase the weight, it is entirely possible to combine the existing integration of the three 
of them and maintain a whole.

That way, not only can the Shenlang follow the past, but the three of them also have one 
more weight.



However, Mu Tianhai did not invite Shen Lang together, but said that he did not prepare 
for him.

After all, they are not their own people!

Even if the shots of Shen Lang yesterday let them pass the dead river, they saved a lot of 
time and effort. That can only make them feel that Shen Lang is enough to cooperate, not 
to take advantage of them.

Not a friend, of course, can’t take him in with him.

This is actually not a sad thing. It is difficult for the average person to be unprepared and 
wait for great time and patience.

Therefore, no matter how Shen Lang himself has passed, can you pass it, they can take the 
lead in the first move!

Climb and climb, I finally feel that I have climbed nearly half. Mu Tianhai took time to 
look at the back, and did not see someone follow up, let him always comfort.

What about the genius?

How is Qiu Lin Jianzong optimistic?

Isn’t it time to slowly toss in the valley?

Especially when I think of Shen Lang, I still have to endure the jokes of their original 
methods. How is it now? Still not far from being stupid?

This idea is also reflected in the two people of Mutian Songyun.

So the three of them are full of motivation and fighting spirit. I didn’t climb a step, and it’s 
so cool to be ahead of the wave!



Besides, the swell of Taniguchi, in fact, he is not without a solution, but does not want to 
lead them so much!

This is not a scruples about their face, but he does not know the road ahead, what is the 
third level, and is ready to find the mausoleum, and the world is not completely said.

So even if he is over there, he will have to wait for them.

That being the case, then it is not anxious, let them climb out halfway, and then start to re-
enter the edge of the wind channel.

The way Shen Lang chooses, of course, is to use the holy armor!

When the Sanjiao supersonic flight, the wind resistance encountered may not be smaller 
than this, so he has the confidence to rush.

On the contrary, this distance is only about ten miles. Instead, we must control the speed, 
not too fast.

When he once again entered the channel of the wind, under the all-round protection of the 
sacred armor, the individual could not feel the wind like a torrent of water, can calmly 
adjust the speed according to the wind resistance, by the way, reconnaissance and 
appreciation This magical passage.

Even if the speed is pressed, the speed is only less than the wind resistance, but after all, 
the distance is not long. They take a long time because of the difficulty and the slow 
crawling.

Therefore, the long waves flying forward caught up with them in a short while.

He also kept his position in the prone position, but he hovered and flew directly over them.

They talked to them at this time, and they wouldn’t hear them. When Shen Lang surpassed 
them, they made a gesture to them and told them to go ahead and wait for them.



The three people of Mutian and Bohai had originally been full of power because they were 
able to lead the Shenlang. I didn’t expect that in the blink of an eye, Shen Lang actually 
flew in a miracle, and after a stroke, he flew away!

Looking up at the back of the waves and farther and farther away – no, the back can not 
see, this angle can only see the bottom of the foot.

For a time, the three people not only paused, but burst into tears!

This is not to be stimulated to cry, but because I forgot to bow my head, the wind blows 
my eyes and the instincts shed tears.

Depressed made their morale low, but slack almost slipped them back.

Helpless, everyone can only slowly climb to the front.

When I think of the superior strength of the past, I think of my own turtle crawling, others 
are flying from the air… The contrast makes them feel ashamed.

How did he do it!

Is this channel of the wind also cheating for him? No one else can use the spirit, but he 
can?

But no matter how angry they are, they have no way to blame this passage. I also 
understand rationally that it is definitely not a matter of using vitality. It should be a magic 
weapon to bypass the magic weapon that is banned here, just like in the river of death.

any idea? After all, Tangcheng’s famous weapon magic weapon manufacturer, “Tough 
Front”, is said to be the industry of Qiulin’s Jianzong. It’s not surprising that Qiulin’s 
swordsman can get magical magic.

Morale is low and you may be tired, so that they spend twice as long in the second half!



When they climbed out like their dead dogs, they saw that Shen Lang stretched out a lazy 
waist, as if he had to wait for sleep.

“Shen Lang’s lord is not a big deal, but there is a magic weapon that can be banned 
without fear.”

After the admiration of the scorpion of the sea, I couldn’t help but run a sentence.

“But we are all partners. Since there is such a magic weapon, why not take us together? 
Look at the jokes that we crawled over?”

Mu Tiansong Yun two people are also a little angry.

Shen Lang shrugged innocently: “You didn’t ask me either. Besides, you just said that you 
are confident, and immediately ran, and did not bring me. I am not sure, I will finally try.”

The face of Mu Tianhai is ugly.

This is a bit of a face…just they were afraid that Shen Lang would ask to be **** with 
them, so they refused, and then quickly left.

Even climbed to the middle, did not see the sinking waves to keep up, they did not have 
any concerns about their partners, but the gloating glory.

Now that people have a better way to blame, it is no wonder that others.

However, they have not done it clearlyThe gloating after the disaster did not let Shen Lang 
know, so this time it is ugly, not to apologize.

“Okay, in general, the progress is still beyond expectations. Let’s continue!”

Mu Tianhai broke the shackles and let everyone set off for the third level.



The third level of “confusing forest” is in this valley of the wind. The mausoleum they are 
going to explore is also in this valley.

Before going to the mausoleum, you must pass through a piece of wood, named “the 
confused forest”, and you can already guess what the situation will be.

The passage of the wind that is ten miles long is the entrance to the Valley of the Winds, 
and now it has entered the valley.

The valley range is far better than the valley of the yellow sand before, and there is no 
other way. They rushed forward for a while, and there was a forest in front.

“This is the third level we have to go through, through the woods here, and behind us is 
the destination of our trip.”

Mu Tianqi’s sea color is serious: “This is the real difficulty compared to the river of death 
and the passage of the wind!”

Mu Tiansong Yun two, should also be the defendant in advance, and this time all look 
solemn, ready.

Chapter 1137 - Confused forest

Because Shen Lang does not understand the specifics, he can only analyze the name as he 
thinks, and then waits for the story of Mu Tianhai.

“In short, entering this forest will affect everyone’s mind. If you are not careful, you will 
be mad at it. If you are not sure, stay here and still have time.”

In the last sentence, Mu Tianhai seems to be confessing to them, but it is undoubtedly a 
side reminder of Shen Lang.

For the confused forest, he is still very general, they must know more, and have more 
preparation. It was just that the wind was just overwhelmed by Shen Lang, and he was 
interested in hiding.

If Shen Lang is not prepared enough to stay here, it is naturally the result he is most 
looking forward to!



Because all the way, Shen Lang can help busy, waiting here, when you go back, you can 
also work together to help. What is specifically harvested in the mausoleum, but has 
nothing to do with Shen Lang.

“Come on, come and let us go!”

“Yes! We are ready to sacrifice, we are not afraid of death, there is nothing to be afraid of.”

Mu Tiansong Yun immediately stated his position, and Mu Tianhai also nodded, and then 
looked at Shen Lang.

“I don’t care. Or, you go first, I am following up?” Shen Lang looked at him with a smile.

Mu Tianhai is depressed for a while, let them go first!

Is this still going to continue to look at their jokes first?

However, depressed is depressed, but he is impossible to let Shen Lang go first. Because 
there is no other barrier behind, Shen Lang advanced, may enter the mausoleum directly, 
and then take the treasure.

“Go!”

Mu Tianhai is still the same as before, so that everyone is connected with ropes, so as not 
to lose inside, this is also to let him take care of them both.

However, unlike the previous tight binding, this time the rope distance has been greatly 
increased and there is more activity.

After watching the three of them go in, Shen Lang smiled.

Mu Tian, the sea, thinks, can he not see it?



But for him, it doesn’t matter, he doesn’t bother to care about it.

Like the second pass, Shen Lang did not keep up with them, but allowed them to leave 
first and then into the forest.

Since this is the only way, it has naturally been specially set up, and it is impossible to fly 
from above.

And entering the forest, it is immediately confirmed, and the same as the previous two 
levels, within the region, is also the use of restrictions, so that they can not move the magic 
weapon.

Shen Lang stepped into the forest, although it was only a step, but the whole picture has 
changed greatly. It is not a small forest area that I saw before. I can’t see the retreat. I can 
see it in the middle of a huge forest!

Illusion!

Since it is an illusion, just look at it. Mu Tianhai, what preparations they have, Shen Lang 
is not clear, but he is very clear, the actual area of this puzzled forest is not too big, just in 
it, is in the magic array, will make people go around.

Therefore, what he needs is not to confirm the direction of anything. As long as he keeps 
going straight in one direction and maintains a certain degree, he will soon be able to get 
out of the confused forest.

A very important way of illusion is to deceive you through the eyes, thus affecting the 
mind.

Because seeing is believing, the eye is one of the most dependent organs of human beings, 
even if it is known to be false, it will be affected.

For example, there is a psychological experiment: people pass a straight line through a 
room with lights, and the testers pass easily. The second time let everyone turn on the 
lights and pass, but no one dares to go, because the house is actually a crocodile pool, the 
passage is above the crocodile pool.



This is the effect seen by the eyes, even if the experimenter tells you that the crocodile will 
not bite or bite the passage, but watching them at the foot, still dare not go up.

Shen Lang immediately closed his eyes.

Don’t look at everything around you, whether it’s in the middle of a grove or a big forest. 
He walked directly like this, even if he would hit the tree, when he was close, he could 
reach out and avoid it.

With his ability, he can completely go straight. If you look at it, you may be confused and 
circled.

Not to mention that he can also view the trajectory of the sacred armor, and if there is a 
deviation, it can be corrected. Of course, nowadays, there is no more role for the holy 
armor here, and the reconnaissance is like a fantasy.

It is not a last resort, nor can he directly blast it here. And if the illusion is brilliant, flying 
directly with the sacred armor may also be circled.

When Shen Lang walked out of the third step, he heard a voice faintly.

“Lang brother! This array of methods is a piece of cake for you, you don’t need to close 
your eyes, you have to pay attention to the sky, they will not attack you!”

The sound of the cold autumn!

Shen Lang secretly sneered, this confusing Lin’s formation is really a bit clever, actually 
affecting him so quickly, this does not close the eyes, but directly affects his 
consciousness.

It is impossible to be here in the cold autumn, it is impossible to remind you here. This is 
to numb him and let him open his eyes.



After three more steps, even if you close your eyes, the Shenlang still seems to “see” to the 
river and appear in front!

“Shen Lang, you have killed me in order to occupy my two apprentices! Do you think that 
they can forgive you in the boat, Xiaoyan? If they don’t say anything on the surface, there 
is always a knot in their hearts!”

This can be said to be his own knot, because killing the river, no matter who is right or 
wrong, will make the canoe and the rain fall into disappointment, so now it is clear that it 
is the voice of his heart.

For the demons, whether it is in the form of high cold and autumn, or the way of falling 
down, Shen Lang does not care.

“Shen Lang, you are useless, this confuse Lin is all-round. Whether it is seeing, listening 
or smelling, it will affect you. You still go with us three!”

Three people from Mutianhaihai came over from the side and extended their hand to Shen 
Lang.

“roll!”

Although it is very real to “hear” his voice and “see” people come, but the waves are still 
very clear, they are all fake, it is the illusion that affects his mind.

He continued to move forward  but in front of it, the familiar long scorpion – the king of 
the dragon!

It seems to be in the forest of the Golden Valley. The king of the dragon seems to be 
sinking, and the speed is coming, the sound and the breath are getting closer and closer, 
everything is so real.

Will it be a confused forest, is it an entrance and exit, connected to the Golden Valley?

This thought just appeared, let Shen Lang throw away, which also made him realize a 
little, confused the influence of Lin, passed his expectations!



Shen Lang suddenly opened his eyes, so if you do, then face it directly! It is regarded as a 
spiritual cultivation.

Chapter 1138 - No word monument

On the cultivation of the mind, Shen Lang will not be afraid, and will never lose to Mu 
Tianhai.

However, they are prepared for the admiration of the sea, even if the magic weapon can 
not be used, it may also use some sedative drugs.

Now Shen Lang is to rely on his own heart to face.

When he just opened his eyes, he saw that he was still in the forest, and the picture that 
appeared in front of him was the king of the dragon who was coming from afar. In the 
vicinity, it was a troll that burned the fire demon, and went straight to him!

The whole picture is very realistic, and even the burning flame is felt, and it is falling from 
the height. In addition to the fire demon in front of you, there is a large group of 
extraterrestrial demons around the world step by step!

Shen Lang looked at it but secretly sneered.

This confuse Lin is a confusing mind. For him, he is also aiming at the fall of the river. 
Others, whether they are kings or dragons, have recently encountered powerful enemies.

It’s like a nightmare, something special that can make you afraid. If you are in a dream, 
everything includes feelings that are realistic.

The most difficult thing is that some people subconsciously know that they are dreaming, 
want to wake themselves up, but the body can not control, still be scared by the dream 
scene.

Shen Lang is now being sunk into such a state of dreams, but he is very calm and sober.

Whether it is a flame troll or other huge extraterrestrial demon, he was killed by him!



The king is also a defeated man, so he is not afraid at all!

If you are in a dream, you will not be hurt if you don’t scare yourself.

Therefore, he directly ignored the giant hand that was about to be photographed at the top 
of his head, and let the burning flame push down on his body. Still keep calm, step by step.

The sacred record of his walking trajectory is a way to determine the route. He adjusts it 
through a close-up zoom, with a slight offset, and keeps going straight regardless of what 
he sees and what obstacles he has.

This is a record based on his physical movement. It is naturally objective and has nothing 
to do with what he sees.

In fact, it is not easy to keep this straight.

Just the flame troll saw that he didn’t care at all. When he was near his head, he deviated 
and fell to the side, letting the ground scorched, as if he had lost his hand, and then chased 
him with other trolls.

In front of him, in this forest, there are some roads that look flat, and some boulders block 
the road.

Under the swaying of the waves, various situations have changed. Some have guided him 
to make a small turn, and there are cliffs, snake caves, and herds in front.

Everything is nothing more than trying to intimidate him and let him make a wrong 
judgment. Then follow the arrangement of this confused forest, so that he can not be 
separated.

But the wave is ignoring everything, the front is the stone wall, he just stepped forward!

In front of the cliff, he is not afraid of falling, still striding over!



Other dangers, he also ignored and went straight, even if they attacked the front, there was 
no reaction.

It is like someone, or artificial intelligence control. It seems that the Shenlang is not afraid 
of danger. When you change it, you will change the way to present a dangerous picture. It 
is no longer a straight road, but a guide to change and turn; straight A road is the real 
straight road.

Confused forest is probably a way to judge that Shen Lang is deliberately taking a 
dangerous road, so I changed a way. As a result, Shen Lang is of course the one that goes 
straight straight!

Shen Lang just did not fear all kinds of dangerous pictures. He did not deliberately choose 
a dangerous road, but he had a clear road!

The result is that this confuse Lin has no problem, all kinds of psychological intimidation 
and fear are used, Shen Lang is unmoved, and various environmental guidance can not 
trap him.

This forest—or the magic array—is limited in scope. When Shen Lang walks out of its 
scope, it naturally dissipates.

Stepping out of the forest, I have already reached the other side of the wave, looking back 
at the back, this confused forest and the other side seeing it, naturally there is no huge 
forest feeling in it.

Shen Lang looked around and did not see the three people in the world.

The front has reached the end of the valley, and in front of him is the tomb of a 
mausoleum.

This mausoleum is directly built on the mountain, and the tomb door is tall and several 
floors.

There is a monument in front, and when you go over and look at it, it is “no word 
monument”, and there is no trace left on it.



Shen Lang stretched out his hand and touched it. There is nothing strange about this word-
free monument, but he did not expect it. After all, this is outside the mausoleum. If there is 
anything, it has already been taken by people who have been there.

Then he walked over to the tomb and wanted to see how it opened.

Mu Tianhai certainly has more information, but he is not willing to share it with him. 
However, according to what was said before, the last time their family came, this is still 
sealed, when the seal is weak, it is expected to dissipate within a few decades.

Now the inspection of Shen Lang did not find signs of seals, that is, it should have been 
invalidated because of the age.

The tomb door can’t be opened directly, it looks like a complete boulder, integrated with 
the mountain. If you didn’t know that it was a mausoleum, you wouldn’t even think it was 
a tomb.

Shen Lang checked for a while and soon found the law.

The organ of the mausoleum should be on the wordless monument!

However, he allowed him to search for temptations from top to bottom, and he could not 
touch the organs and could not open the tomb door.

This process  He must also be careful to avoid ruining the stone with too much force.

After a fruitless, Shen Lang suddenly thought of a possibility.

Regardless of who set up the mausoleum, they should all want to protect it from being 
destroyed by later people.

And if there is something left in the tomb, left to future generations, it should also be given 
to those who respect the tomb.



Whether it is violent destruction or calculation by various agencies, it is not up to you to 
respect it.

I really want to respect the people in the tomb. When I come here, I should first take the 
gimmick!

With this idea, Shen Lang immediately retreated a little distance, and sure enough, the 
word-free monument is facing the tomb. In this case, if his descendants came here, it 
would be natural to bow first.

Of course, Shen Lang does not need to worship the real hoe, but analyzes the distance. In 
the approximate place, use the foot to tap the temptation.

The result is still nothing!

There is no word monument or no word monument, there is no change at all, and there is 
no organ button. The tombstone is also as usual, with no signs of opening.

He estimated that they should not have come out yet, they have three people, it is 
impossible to be as much faster than him.

Is that waiting for them here?

Chapter 1139 - Open the door and open the door

Drying is also boring, so Shen Lang continues to test.

From light to heavy, before and after, after and after the temptation, there is some doubt at 
the end. Is there something similar to monitoring, and cheating is impossible?

But in the end, let him hit it!

With a light weight just “small”, at an accurate point, the tomb door begins slowly.

Shen Lang did not rush into it. It is not known how many years have not been opened for 
thousands of years. The air is stale and will carry a lot of toxic gases.



However, after thinking about it, this tomb door will certainly not be opened for too long. 
In this range, the airflow that can be manufactured, that is, the doorway, is not enough to 
change the air quality inside the entire tomb.

Therefore, he still used his armor to protect himself and directly went in.

After entering, the tomb door began to close.

Shen Lang carefully observed it. Now his place can only be regarded as a tomb door to an 
area inside the real tomb. There is also a tomb door in front. When it is opened, it is the 
real entrance to the tomb!

When the tomb door was completely closed, Shen Lang vaguely heard their voices in the 
sky!

I can hear the sound, maybe the sound is not very good, or it may be a hole.

He immediately looked for it, and then saw a slight hole in the top of the tomb, and 
immediately flew to the body, and looked at it.

Outside the sky, the sea is pulling the other two, just out of the confused forest.

Although Shen Lang has already come out, it is not easy for them to come out so quickly.

At this moment, the three people of the Mutian family are a little embarrassed, the clothes 
are messed up, and they are a bit distracted.

The three stopped to rest for a while, simply sorted out the clothes and untied the ropes.

“That wave is not coming out!”

“He is still trapped inside!”

Mu Tiansong Yun two people are very excited and excited.



“Don’t be too happy!” Mu Tianyu poured a cold water on his face, his eyes patrolling 
around.

“Uncle, you are too cautious. We have prepared and made various rehearsal simulations. In 
this confusing forest, it took a lot of time. Can he still be faster?”

“Yes. I don’t think he knows anything about the domain, just want to apply our 
information!”

The person of the Mutian family is right. However, looking at his expression, it is not 
really guessing, but just a bit uncomfortable, Shen Bo deliberately said so.

Mu Tianhai did not pay attention to his heart, his eyes fell on the wordless monument.

“Accelerate!”

“Yes! We must hurry before the guy comes out, or else he has to follow us, it is not good to 
quit.”

“Do not worry, I don’t think he can’t come out. Maybe when we come out, he will be out 
of his head.”

Shen Lang looked at it and thought that Mu Tianhai wanted to let them two of them, but 
they did not expect to use other methods.

This is obviously not their temporary consideration, but the last time they came to the 
predecessor. Now that the mausoleum is still in a sealed state, it cannot be entered, and it 
has been studying the method of opening here. It may also be that for decades, they have 
found a solution.

I saw Mutian Bohai swimming around the wordless monument, and then according to it to 
the surrounding rock wall, to the tomb door, constantly positioning. Eventually it was 
retired to the back of the confused forest.



When Shen Lang was a bit strange, he found a small stone on the edge of the confused 
forest.

Shen Lang carefully stared at it. The stone was very inconspicuous on the ground, just like 
countless small stones. However, after being searched by Mu Tianhai, it was awesome, 
and it was like a narrow wordless monument!

After confirming this, Mu Tianhai slammed a bit and injected a vitality into it.

Immediately, this small wordless monument began to show a little change, and then led to 
the big wordless monument.

The big word-free monument has a hint of energy and directly reaches the top of the tomb!

In the dark waves behind the tomb, hurry to keep yourself alert. Once the tomb door is 
opened, he must step back and hide.

For the time being, he still doesn’t want to meet them like this, or else they will be a bit 
embarrassed.

At this time, Mu Tiansongyun and two people excitedly came to the front of the tomb, 
ready to wait for the opening of the tomb.

“Get out!”

The words of Mu Tianhai have not been finished yet. The huge tomb door, which was 
originally unremarkable, has emerged from several places, and then there is an empty 
mouth, and then a sneak out of the secret weapon!

Mu Tiansong Yun two people were shocked, and quickly evaded, Mu Tianhai also 
followed the past.

But even so, the two of them are still one’s arms, and one’s thighs are nailed.



When Mu Tianhai was in the past, he had already protected them and was also a defense 
against the front.

Then immediately took them both back a long way.

However, the designer of the tomb door seems to be prepared. If there is no hit, it will not 
make much sense to continue. Therefore, there is no second wave or third wave of hidden 
weapons.

Mu Tianyi Hai Xun’s hand slammed, forced the nails out of them, and then took out the 
bottles and cans.

“Uncle, please rest assured, I am fine, this little injury does not matter!” Mu Tiansong 
cloud injured his arm, and quickly stated.

“do not move!”

Admiring the cold and cold drink, and then giving the medicine to the thigh in the first 
step, it is a few drugs, it seems to be disinfected first, then hemostasis.

Shen Lang looked darkly and nodded. The old man was very calm and quite experienced. 
Even the hidden weapon, just ordinary nails, does not feed the poison itself. After 
thousands of years of vacancy, it may have been oxidized and rusted.

This is nailed into the body, and it is not the same as the fresh hidden weapon.

“bad!”

At this time, the tomb door is slowly opening!

It seems that they really found the right way and opened the tomb door in another way.

Mu Tianyu’s healing was very fast, but after seeing this situation, after a bad call, he 
couldn’t continue to heal, and one hand, grabbed them and flew back.



The tomb door is the same as the one encountered before, and after it has reached a certain 
level, it is slowly closed.

After coming in, the three people were relieved.

This is the purpose of his trip  is the opportunity to wait for decades, if they are 
unforgivable because of their two delays, they will also be very self-blaming.

They are just below the tomb, and the Shenlang is at a high place, because he did not think 
that he would be here, plus he is still healing, so he did not notice the waves.

Shen Lang took out the mysterious stone, collected his own breath, and then passed the 
same light as the surrounding environment.

This is a small camouflage function on the top of the holy armor. Similar to the wicker hat 
and camouflage suit, it is a simulation that integrates itself with the surrounding 
environment.

Inside, the tomb door is closed, and the light is dimmed a lot. The light is darker and the 
range is small. If someone looks over it, it will only feel that it is a shadow.

Chapter 1140 - Unable

Shen Lang originally didn’t want to wait for them. Since he arrived first, he would open it 
first.

But just the scene, let him change his mind.

The method used by Mu Tianyu is the normal method of cracking. The common sense of 
Shen Lang just now is completely different.

If the final “gimmick” is useless, then he took the time to crack, but also has to go to the 
method of admiring the sky.

Mu Tianhai can directly crack, because his predecessor spent a lot of time here to crack, or 
according to the record of the scene, cracked in decades, does not mean that he is superior 
to Shen Lang.



Two different methods, the results are completely different. The method of Shen Lang did 
not alarm the organs, but the method of admiring the sky and the sea encountered an 
ambush.

The explanation is the same as the guess before Shen Lang. If it is left to the recognized 
descendants, it is safe and feasible. For the tomb thief, it will be the defense of the organ.

Just getting started, the agency is not difficult for him.

But I can imagine that there are bound to be many institutions from here.

In this case, Shen Lang will not be able to walk in front of him, even if he follows the 
starting line of thinking, he can find a solution that will not touch the organs, but it will 
consume a lot of time.

Are they not prepared? Then let them take the lead!

Shen Lang waited for a while, Mu Tianhai had already treated both of them simply, and 
then three people began to go to the inside of the tomb.

The predecessors of their family did not come in the last time. But perhaps it’s a lot of 
knowledge, or decades of preparation, so they have a portal inside.

So when I came over, Mu Tianhai was not frustrated, and I was still prepared to start 
looking for an open institution.

Shen Lang is at the back of the moment, just look at them like this.

Two people, Mu Tiansongyun, took out their weapons and armor, and equipped themselves 
with armor and armed weapons.

I just took the road of the organs and let them pay more attention than the previous army.



Of course, it is still a matter of core, and it will not let other people know, so as to avoid 
the possibility of leakage.

Mu Tiansong Yun two, not so much his assistant, it is better to say that it is brought to 
practice.

Sure enough, it was prepared, this time it took more than ten minutes, and Mutian Bohai 
opened the tomb door inside.

After opening the door, all three of them retired a few steps and tried to be on the side. But 
at the same time, you are ready to rush in the event that the door will close.

“You can go in! No institutions!”

“Not closing the door!”

They are all excited, the door is not closed, so that they can come out later, no need to find 
a way to open the door. There is already a door outside, even if Shen Lang is out of the 
confused forest, it can’t be cheap.

In fact, even if the outer door is not closed, they will find a way to close the door and 
prevent Shen Lang from following.

“Take this detoxification pill first!”

Mu Tianhai took out a bottle of pills and gave them two.

The detoxification just now is a dressing for external injuries. This time, taking the 
detoxification pill, I am afraid that there is poisonous gas inside, and I will do a 
prevention.

Then three people tried to slowly enter inside.

After Shen Lang waited for them to walk for a while, Shen Lang landed from above and 
followed the past.



He is now going to have more leisure time. The road to the front depends on them, there 
are hidden weapons, and they will face them first.

But there is also a bad place to follow, that is, if there is any good thing, of course, others 
will get it first – this is why after the Valley of the Wind, Mu Tianhai is disregarding 
cooperation and trying to let himself go first. reason.

Their cooperation is certainly not solid, nor is it a level of friends, but everyone is not a 
sect. If someone first gets the item resources, the other party is not good enough to grab it 
directly.

To this end, Shen Lang did not open too much distance, keeping track of their progress. 
When necessary, you can come out and fight for it.

After entering the second door, there was almost no light. They walked in front and lit up 
with a bright pearl of light.

After entering the door, it was a straight passage. It went straight for dozens of meters and 
went deep into the mountain. The front changed.

“It’s another door!”

Mu Tiansong was a little discouraged, and the doors of the ones opened, which made their 
excitement a lot less.

Mu Tianhai, but it has more expectations.

If it is really too simple a tomb, there will be no good things. The more difficult it is to 
protect, the more important it is.

This door was not prepared by Mu Tianhai, and he began to feel helpless and tried.

For the latter Shen Lang, the inside door is a very simple and very common arrangement. 
When he looked at Mu Tianhai for more than half an hour, he couldn’t help it.



They can’t make it, he is also delayed in the back!

“Let me come!”

“who?”

In the words of Shen Lang, the three of them were taken aback and immediately turned to 
face him, full of alert.

“I.”

Shen Lang let them illuminate him.

“Shen Lang? You…have you come out of the confused forest?” Mu Tianhai was a little 
surprised.

They also have a little longer in this delay, the first two doors have not been used for too 
long, healing is also a hasty thing.

At the very least, Shen Lang has to open a door and be able to follow them here. It shows 
that after they came in, they have already come out of the confused forest.

“Shen Lang’s lord is really extraordinary. He easily walked through the confused forest, 
and easily opened the tomb door and admire it.”

After being surprised, Mu Tianhai’s false guest set a sentence.

“No! From the second door to here, it is not far, the door is not closed. If he opens the first 
door behind, we will not hear a little voice!”

When faced with Shen Lang, Mu Tian Songyun did not speak, represented by Mu Tianhai, 
but he just thought of a doubt.



This made them all gaze at the waves, and they just did not hear the sound of opening the 
door. The door is so huge, although there is no special loudness, the movement still has 
sound.

From the second door to here, it is a straight-through passage, and the road is sealed by the 
door. Not only should you hear the sound behind, you should even have a little echo.

“How did you come in?” Mu Tianhai couldn’t help but ask.

Shen Lang shrugged casually: “Of course it is more advanced than you.  This words 
immediately called Mutian Songyun two people.

“You are more confused than us, why don’t you wait for us?”

“You are advanced, but you are intentionally hiding behind them. Would you like us to 
block you in front?”

They are really angry, because they are all injured, Shen Lang also wants them to continue 
to block the gun in front, too shameless!
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