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Chapter 162 - Stone battle

Chu River has already known the speed of Shen Lang from Chu Yuncheng, so this time he did not 
have a big preemptive attack. He opened the police to express his demeanor, but in fact, when 
everyone heard the sound, the big stone had already arrived. In front of Shen Lang!

If the Yejia, Daxuanmen, Linghequan and other sects are present, they will find that this is quite 
similar to Shenlang’s shot in the Phoenix Valley.

When Shen Lang kicked the stone that hit Li Lao, it was much bigger. But frankly, it is still more 
difficult to kick out the stones in Chuhe!

Because the stones at that time were standing on the ground, as long as the force applied was large 
enough, they could be kicked out.

But just this is the stone that is set on the ground. The concrete has been connected together, and 
there is no gap. To kick the stone out, wait for the stone to be dug out. This is only done by one 
foot, and the difficulty is mostly.

Just like the floor tiles, a thin piece, ordinary people can pick up a piece of the cockroach, but it is 
necessary to smash the tile that is set on the ground, that is, the bleeding of the finger may not be 
able to do it.

There are no ordinary people on the scene, including the superb warriors, who understand this 
truth. After seeing this scene, many people directly applauded.

“It’s not a master of the Chu family. It’s just that we can’t match our strength!”

“Get it! You do your best? Who else can match the scene!”

It is Xie You, but also secretly nodded, this foot is really beautiful.

When it was said that it was too late, when everyone yelled for comments, the stone had already 
reached the front of the wave. The stone kicked out by the Chu River was far from the weight of 



the stone itself. It was already like the momentum of the millennium. The wind is so fast that it 
covers the dark waves.

And they also discovered that the people of Chuhe came with the stone, the speed is not slower, 
but the stone first stepped behind the sinking waves!

With a casual foot, it is even more exciting to use the stone on the ground and form a revenge 
against Shen Lang.

What surprised them was that Shen Lang did not move as if he had not responded. This makes 
everyone a little surprised. It is said that the strength of Shen Lang is not as good as that of Chu 
River. It should also be unusual. How can there be no resistance?

Is this guy boasting out? But if you brag, the Chu family does not have to send an important 
person to move him.

Yue Zhennan has sweated his hands and palms, and his fists clenched his fists. If at this time, he 
has a gun in his hand, maybe he will shoot at the Chu River! This is the only way to save the 
waves.

But now he can’t do anything, only to see that the waves are crushed!

The stone was already in full swing, and when it came to the Chu River behind Shen Lang, it was 
followed by a punch to his back, which made him have no way to escape.

Everyone is holding their breath and watching this decisive scene. Xie You is more concerned. If 
Shen Lang is really killed by the Chu River, it does not mean that his vision is not good, but it can 
be determined that the Chu River really broke through the realm!

Just when everyone is waiting for the results, I feel that there seems to be a change in the eyes, 
and the waves are moving in the shape of a general, magical to the back of the stone!

To do this, he must pass a large arc of one hundred and eighty degrees from the side of the stone. 
But no one has ever seen his figure movement, and the time should be between a few tenths of a 
second or even a fraction of a second.



At the crucial time, Shen Lang went to the back of the stone, and the situation inside the scene was 
immediately reversed!

Originally, I had to hit a punch in the back of Shen Lang, and the target became a big stone that 
came over! The stone that was supposed to smash in the waves was of course the Chu River 
behind the trend.

Chu River is just a preemptive shot, but also calculated very accurately, to determine his own 
attack this time, even if you can not take the Shen Lang, you can also force the Shen Lang very 
embarrassed, his post has also been ready.

But now this sudden change has made him unable to react and change his moves. He can only go 
on hard, and he has no strength, letting the stone squat on the fist…

“Oh!”, the piece of stone with concrete was directly shattered by a punch in the Chu River and 
scattered on the ground.

Many people on the scene were exclaimed. It seems that if the attack was successful, the damage 
to Shen Lang is greater, not the stone, but the punch of Chu River!

Breaking the stone, most people on the scene can do it. But to be specific, it depends on what kind 
of stone, density and size. Like the stone that has just been picked up, it is as big as a display, and 
it is marble, it is not easy to do.

This punch is effective, but also accumulates the momentum, but the stone is not static, he himself 
kicked hard, so down, the fist is also a painful and uncomfortable.

Others did not see clearly. The recent Chuhe himself only saw the shadow of the shadows, and 
Shen Lang changed positions. This made him realize that Chu Yuncheng did not lie, and the speed 
of Shen Lang was really fast!

In the case of the inability to use the magic weapon, one is to crush by force, and the other is to 
rely on speed.

Chu River realizes that it is very difficult to do it quickly, so you must seize every opportunity, or 
you will become very passive. Therefore, he did not care about his fist and had a close contact 
with the boulder, and continued to pursue the past.



Looking outside the circle, Chu River is now a fist shadow, directly blocking the front of the 
waves. As long as one or two punches are hit, it is enough for the waves.

At the moment, the Shenlang is already in the place where the Chu River stood before. I just 
kicked a stone on the ground At this moment, there was a pit. After the sinking wave arrived, the 
foot had already kicked up quickly. One stone after another was turned up and chased. The Chu 
River has passed away!

Originally, the Chu River was a fast attack, but now it has to struggle to cope with the stone in 
front of it. If you want to punch these stones with a punch and punch, he can do it, but the fist will 
be a very bad result.

Therefore, it can only be turned into a palm, shot and pushed, so that the power required is not so 
large, and the hand will not be injured. In this way, the stone is flying to the side, even falling out, 
some close, and almost being beaten.

The square that was originally flat, experienced a day of competition during the day, and there was 
no major damage. Now it is like a three-footed excavation, all messy.

After Shen Lang kicked a dozen stones in a row, he did not continue. Instead, he used the 
“Phantom Meteor Step” to quickly catch up with the last stone, and added a palm to the top, 
pushing the stone to the Chu River. Smashed the past!

Chu River piece by piece and opened and used, with a cleverness, not much consumption, hands 
together, but also busy. But now it is a stone behind, suddenly accelerated, and beyond a few 
stones, directly to his face!
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