
First Strong 1921

Chapter 1921 - Borrow your magic weapon

Everyone doubted that all of them were searched here, and that they were six people. 
Where did they come from?

If you are not an acquaintance, you should start as an enemy!

Now I heard that Shen Lang said that it was coming from another space. It was really 
shocking and happy!

“Sink, sink… Are you coming from other places?”

“Where is there? Where is that? What is this place?”

Others were excited immediately.

I want to hear a good news from Shen Lang.

Shen Lang can come, they are good news for those who have no way to sleep here.

And Shen Lang has no injuries at all. It is definitely not a strong relationship. It may be 
that he is safer to go to, or something that can be quickly recovered.

As a result, of course, they all want to follow Shen Lang.

Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Yi are depressed…

Originally, he still felt that he had torn his face anyway, and he did not need to slap the 
waves. He could say nothing.

Now that Shen Lang has mastered the way out, they still need to rely on it. Isn’t it 
necessary to recapture?



“This should be the holy place of Yungong. Here, maybe it is one of the rooms in the 
Yungong Holy Land, and I am in another room, almost the same size. Other people may be 
in other rooms. I don’t know. How many such rooms are there.”

This is said to make everyone surprised again.

There are ten miles in both the horizontal and vertical directions. The scope is already very 
large. If this is a space, it will be nothing more. This turned out to be just a “room”!

However, the Yungong Holy Land has been so mysterious for thousands of years. Has it 
created so many powerful people, there will be such a huge, what is so strange?

“So how did you come here? Can you take us to your side?”

They began to come to the sinking waves, and the harsh cold environment here is an 
objective condition. More importantly, I hope to get a good chance in a good environment.

These are the amnesties that have been at least a hundred years old. As a result, no enemy 
has seen it. Nothing has touched any of the organs, and it has created a heavy blow and 
directly hit their self-confidence.

In the face of this unknown environment, I have not seen any resources, they have begun 
to regret it!

Shen Lang smiled slightly: “Of course I have the means I have come, but I can’t take you 
to my side. There are people injured, but can’t come over.”

When I heard this answer, everyone was disappointed.

Originally they were here, they have accepted this status quo, and the worst part is the part 
of the death of the Jinyun Palace.



However, the arrival and discourse of Shen Lang gave them great hope. The flame just 
burned up and was poured out in a pot of cold water. It was even more discouraging than 
not burning it.

Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Zhi are two, and they are already struggling to get rid of the 
waves. As soon as I heard this, I had a new idea!

“Shenlang little brother, you are a little misunderstood to us, a bit uncomfortable, we can 
understand. But some of their ancestors are innocent! You can’t keep them here no 
matter!”

“I know, it must be that the ancestors of the high cold autumn gave you the magic weapon 
that you can pass through these barriers. Can you lend them a loan?”

“If you don’t allow us two, we have no complaints!”

When Zhisheng spoke up, a set of ones immediately began to dig up the sinking waves.

These words sounded like he was bitter and pleading for the waves, even regardless of his 
own life and death, just out of morality, and did not want the other four ancestors to have 
an accident.

But in fact, it was named to the other four people. There are magic weapons that can 
penetrate the barriers!

Originally, Shen Lang was already mysterious. Besides, it was given to him by Gao 
Hanqiu. Everyone naturally believed.

In addition to his words, he showed that Shen Lang is unwilling to save them. He is 
helping others to ask for help. Ask Shen Lang to lend them the magic weapon artifacts.

Will Shen Lang borrow?

Certainly will not borrow!



What do the other four people think?

You are going to watch us die!

In the next step, you don’t need to be confused. The four of them will naturally stand up 
and deal with the waves.

He and Tong Xian Weng can join it very naturally, for the justice of the four ancestors!

Although they were injured, there are six people. Even if they are in good health, Shen 
Lang is only a person, and it is a peak of Daxian, which is worse than them.

The other four on the scene did not appear outside the Kunlun School, and did not 
personally see the strength of Shen Lang. This is where wisdom can be fooled.

Shen Lang can not know?

I heard the trick of this old boy!

“You are right, I am not good for the two of you. If you really want to save people, I will 
save them a few, but you two, you still need to think about it.”

Shen Lang sighed, and did not care about his provocation.

Because the other six people are seriously injured, he is in good condition!

The other four people, who have just listened to Zhisheng, have already entered the 
bureau.

After being poured cold water by Shen Lang, they all have a common mind: no one can 
stand it, only if they master it, it is the real mastery!

Shen Lang can penetrate the magic of barriers. Only by “borrowing”, several of them are 
truly safe.



Now the sentence of Shen Lang, although it is said that it may save them, but there is no 
promise that it will be saved.

I was still pleading for a few ancestors of Shen Lang. Immediately, I had already made a 
decision on the evil side.

There is no need for negotiation or tacit understanding at this time, because the interests of 
the six people are the same.

Even if they are bound by morality and principle, it is more natural for a person to live six 
people than six people.

And if you die here, what is the meaning of justice and injustice?

So they have all been out, and there is no psychological burden.

There is no direct hands at this moment, just to find a safer opportunity.

“Shen brother, can you use your magic weapon? We guarantee that if you return, you want 
to be rewarded. After we go back, we must offer it. Just borrow it!”

“Why?”

Although the other side is already a polite tone, Shen Lang is still directly asking a 
question.

Why?

My magic weapon, do you want to borrow it? Have you borrowed yet?

Tong Xian Wen immediately sighed: “Shen Lang! Don’t deceive too much! We are on the 
age each can be your grandfather more than enough. You should have a minimum respect 
for us, really want to take us Is it dead?”



Zhimin has already hinted that Shen Lang does not borrow magic weapons, that is, “see 
death and not save.”

Now Tong Xian Weng has been upgraded, and it will not save them, just to kill them!

If it is normal, sensible people can realize that this is not a concept.

But now several other people are in desperate need of a breakthrough because of the 
pressure here. Shen Lang is a breakthrough!

They have been successfully guided by them, and they feel that Shen Lang wants to force 
them to take their things, and even win their martial art in the future!

After the brains of such paranoia paranoia, their expressions were cold, and they quickly 
took out their weapons and magic weapons and faced the waves together.

Chapter 1922 - Dark history?

These ancestors are all decent figures with heads and faces. The normal principles, ethics, 
and shame are still there.

If they suddenly attacked the sinking waves, they would be a little embarrassed to start to 
win the magic weapon on the other side.

But the words of Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Zhi are not only guiding them, but also helping 
them find excuses!

This is to force them to this old man!

This is because Shen Lang does not respect the old, but also hides the scourge, then no 
wonder they are.

“Wait!”

Watching them prepare for the battle, Shen Lang quickly stopped.



Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Xin are actively guiding everyone to fight against Shen Lang. Of 
course, this is not the case after the people, so as to avoid the number of people.

But they are still more sensible. If they can force Shen Lang to hand over the magic 
weapon, they don’t want to risk it.

“Shen Lang, I know that you are very powerful. At your age, it is the first in the world. 
Now we are also a little injured, but we have six people!”

“Six people act together, but not six plus one, there will be a great synergy effect!”

The two of them are both pressure on Shen Lang and confidence in several other 
ancestors.

Others listened and made sense. Although everyone was injured, there are six people. Even 
if everyone has only one or two percent of strength, plus three or four magic weapons, the 
six people will definitely be better than two. Great God ancestors!

They have not seen the hands of Shen Lang, and they are still seriously underestimated for 
the strength of Shen Lang.

Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Yu’s words gave them great confidence.

Shen Lang ignored both of them, but looked at one of the ancestors.

“What I want to say is that this magic weapon in your hand is what I am giving back to 
you? You are now using it to deal with me?”

Everyone has seen it before, but there is no special contact, and the impression is average.

Shen Lang just saw that they took out the weapon magic weapon and immediately 
remembered it. One of them took him and robbed him from the quicksand slaves.



Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Xin have to deal with him. Shen Lang can understand it. After 
all, everyone has torn their faces. As long as you see him, the other party will feel 
embarrassed and have a chance to get rid of it, of course at any cost.

The other ancestors are misunderstood and have worried about their own safety.

However, this has just received his favor, there is no need for one side, actually want to use 
his magic weapon to deal with him!

Asked by Shen Lang, the old ancestor immediately became red.

When he spoke, he was actually polite and respectful to Shen Lang. Just thinking that Shen 
Lang clearly has a way out, but not leaving them; obviously there is a way to recover, but 
they don’t care about them, which makes him go out.

Now, after being asked, let him become the same state of mind as Tong Xian Weng and 
Zhi Zhi, and be ashamed and angry!

“This is what you sent back, but who knows the savior, is it that you hired? Otherwise, if 
many of us suffer, you can easily catch him and lie to anyone?”

This is what he really is going to do, and his face is gone. Anyway, I am not sure who the 
savior is hired. When it comes to Shen Lang’s head, he does not need to be embarrassed.

“If you are not the behind-the-scenes employer, why can you catch him alone? Why are 
you so generous to return, not even a little benefit? That is because you are planning, the 
purpose is to make us grateful to you!”

These words are said to make it easy for him.

Regardless of the truth, this is to find a fig leaf for himself, and he has rationalized it 
himself.

Others don’t need any truth. They just have to work together to get rid of the waves. When 
they escape, what they say is the truth!



“Humanity!”

Shen Lang sighed.

He suddenly understood the legend of the Yungong Holy Land.

Why are the powerful people who went back to the cloud do not talk about the Yungong 
Holy Land?

The world thinks that they don’t want to be known by more people, or who have answered 
the Holy Land, or are afraid that everyone will go to death.

But never considered another possibility.

That is the evil of human nature!

It’s just now that we’ve just come in. Everyone is just separated. I haven’t encountered any 
monsters or organs attacking. It’s just that the two sides have a picture, and there is a scene 
of guilt.

If you wait longer, there are more dangers, and more benefits arise, then the possibility of 
everyone attacking each other is even greater!

The worst result is that a large number of strong people who came in in ancient times, 
most of them died in their own hands!

The only thing that survives is a small part. The magic weapon and resources that most of 
them carry are covered by that small part of the grassroots!

Even… the majority of people who died, I am a great resource!

Was eaten directly, was swallowed up by the gods, was smelted into medicinal herbs, 
etc…



If this is the result, then a small group of people who are alive and alive will actually eat 
the meat of other people. If it is several times more, it will naturally be a big increase.

However, such a process cannot be said and is not willing to face it. Therefore, everyone 
has agreed, and all of them are silent.

Even they can no longer face the previous divisions, families, or other sects. The final 
result is to re-establish themselves.

When their generation passed, the Yungong Holy Land became a legend.

They are all big men in the contemporary era, and later they became the ancestors of many 
sects. No one naturally questioned them. The less information they reveal, the more they 
pass in the direction of mystery.
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“It’s not easy to learn from you. It’s rare to be a British name. As long as you are on the 
verge of a cliff, I can let you go, as nothing has happened.”

Shen Lang finally gave them a goodwill Perhaps… those who survived in ancient times 
may not be evil, or they may be forced to fight back.

Shen Lang looked at the injured ancestors, really do not want to bully them!

It is a pity that many of them have solidified at their age.

For example, I don’t believe that Shen Lang can force them. Before I witnessed it, even if 
someone said it, I would feel that it was helping the Shen Lang.

For example, confidence in one’s own strength, that is the self-confidence accumulated in 
one or two hundred years.



The words of Shen Lang’s kindness are seen by them as a manifestation of guilty fear.

The more guilty the other party is, the more it means the greater!

Suddenly, the six ancestors immediately had a tacit understanding, and without saying 
anything, all attacked Shen Lang!

Chapter 1923 - Unstoppable!

Since they have chosen to shoot, Shen Lang has nothing to say, and what he said has 
already been said, and they are not owed to them!

At the scene of the six people, three of them, Shen Lang has no bad feelings, but the other 
three, it is already a clear sense of evil.

Two of them are Zhisheng and Tongxian Weng, that is, they engage in things, for their own 
selfishness, so that everyone can die with him.

The other one is to get his favor, but also to beat the guy.

The white-eyed wolf is talking about this kind of person.

Shen Lang thought of a move, the sword of the king has appeared in his hand.

“Give me to die!”

Shen Lang is very simple to rotate the body, and then surrounded the sword in the 
surrounding 360 degrees.

His speed is very fast, because he is in good condition and directly surpasses the speed of 
these six ancestors!

What they said before was not wrong. The power of the six people to attack together is 
more than six simple additions. But after subdividing, there are still many problems.



For example, in terms of speed, because of the serious injury, they have to make a discount 
for six, which cannot be superimposed.

The enemy only needs to say that the speed surpasses them. In theory, they can kill them 
before they finish the shots!

Of course, in normal terms, a sword can kill one, and it is already very good. Because it 
can lead six people, it is not equal to six times the speed.

However, Shen Lang’s sword is the sword of the king, which is surrounded by three 
hundred and sixty degrees!

He can attack six people, but it is actually just a sword!

Although the sword of 360 degrees is completely finished, it is a little slower than the 
sword directly in front, but it is still faster than their serious injury!

And because of serious injuries, they can no longer rely on power weapons to attack, must 
rely on magic weapons.

The magic weapon has a certain time lag, which is the magic weapon of the artifact of the 
Three Realms. It also takes a little time to start.

The result is that the sword of the king is coming to them faster!

First and foremost is Zhimin.

For the speed of Shen Lang’s sword, it was also a shock to him. The original attack had to 
stop first, and quickly reached out and played it!

Not only is it fast, but it is also a breath on the sword that makes him a little shudder.

Therefore, he did not dare to care about it. For a time, there was no better way to block it, 
that is, the finger hit the sword and the body was pulled back.



It is extremely rare for a sword to push Zhizhi to this extent.

However, he thought he valued it, but it was still seriously underestimated!

Underestimating the strength of Shen Lang, lowering the power of this sword!

As a result, he did not play, nor did he have time to retreat. He was directly cut into two 
paragraphs by the sword of the king!

The sword of the king cut his body, just like cutting tofu, there was no delay at all, maybe 
he was actually bombed, and there may be a little delay.

The result is to the side of the child fairy!

Although everyone is the ancestor of the realm of the great gods, the strength of Tong Xian 
Weng is still above the wisdom.

It’s just… under the result of the heavy losses of all of them, the strong one is nothing.

For example, if Zhisheng is one of the remaining strengths of one hundred, then even if 
there are one hundred and twenty-four, the child Xianwen may have thirty or forty.

As long as there is a hundred strengths to attack the past, Shen Lang can still kill him, let 
alone the sword of the king.

Of course, the specific to the scene, it will not be such a simple calculation method, a little 
one who has a wrong judgment, may cause additional results.

Even if Shen Lang is far ahead, if he does not do well, he may be killed.

However, the result now is that Tong Xian Weng is also hurrying back after feeling the 
extraordinary sword of the king!



Because there is still a Zhimin block in front of it, Tong Xian Weng has withdrawn from 
his position several times!

This is the experience of Tong Xian Weng, and he is also quick to respond to the old 
tycoon.

If you have more than one position, you will at least avoid more than one meter. The 
difference is a thousand miles. At this critical time, the difference of one meter is often 
equal to one life.

It is a pity that he did not think of the sword. When he cut it to him, he actually grew a lot!

The result is that even if he retreats more than a meter, he has not escaped the ending of 
being stopped.

In fact, the sword smashed the two of them. It is a very weak time. If the scene is the 
ancestor of the realm of the gods, you can’t even see or feel the gap.

In the back of the other ancestors, in fact, just just felt the power of the sword of the king.

Not waiting for them to feel the killing of Zhisheng and Tongxian Weng, they have already 
responded quickly, and the weapons and weapons in their hands have been blocked.

Can you kill the Shen Lang, now it is secondary, perhaps this sword is the artifact of the 
cold autumn to Shen Lang!

Gao Hanqiu is the founder of Qiu Lin Jianzong, and certainly has an extraordinary place in 
the collection of Excalibur.

They can’t recognize the sword, but just when they come out, they feel the power.

This made them give up the attack on Shen Lang became a defense.

And this result, that is, after Zhizhi and Tongxian Weng were successively cut off, they 
were able to withstand it.



It is a pity that the weapons or magic weapons in their hands are not enough to see in front 
of the sword of the king!

A magic weapon can’t stop, one body can’t stop, two or three are also like this!

The white-eyed wolf ancestor is because on the other side, the sword is going to circle him 
before he comes to him.

Because there are three people in the six people who have a bad feeling in Shenlang, and 
they are in different directions on both sides, so they are just two to one. They first 
attacked Zhizhi and Tongxian Weng, and they left the white-eyed wolf behind.

Every time that was killed is very short, but after all, there are five people in front. In the 
end, there is still a chance to escape.

And to the back of several ancestors, are all on the magic weapon to resist, how much 
delays a little time.

This makes his magic weapon, has been successfully released!

His magic weapon is a scorpion knife, a mouthful of thirty-six mouths!

These thirty-six scorpio knives were originally very mighty, plus a change of thirty-six, 
which often killed the enemy by a surprise. If you don’t recognize it, it will usually be very 
dangerous.

Now this little time has already allowed him to successfully sculpt the Scythe.

Originally, these thirty-six knives were to be attacked by swords. But when the sword of 
the king came out, he also felt a huge threat.

Now that the body is weak, it is still safe first, so it is divided into two immediately, with 
18 knives to attack Shen Lang, and another 18 knives to protect around.



But after the operation, he immediately regretted it!

But regret is too late!

Chapter 1924 - 1 sword 5 ancestors

The combined strength of these thirty-six scorpio knives is great, but it is not a multiplier 
effect like the eight-needle.

But even so, splitting thirty-six knives into two, the power will be half.

His current strength has been greatly reduced, and he is counting on the magic weapon to 
be effective. If the thirty-six knives are together, under the influence of other people’s 
interference, it can achieve miraculous effects and kill the smashing waves in one fell 
swoop.

After being divided into two parts, it is very likely that the attack of the Shenlang will not 
be effective, and the protection effect will not be optimal.

However, regretting that he is too late, can only be just the thought of regret, because it is 
impossible to manipulate it.

After seeing the sword of the king smashed Zhizhi and Tongxian Weng, he regretted it 
again!

I just regretted not attacking Shen Lang with all my strength. Now I realize that there is no 
meaning in the full attack!

He realized that the magic weapon of the previous few people could not withstand the 
power of that sword!

All the tangles, regrets, shocks, etc., are actually completed in an instant, and only the 
strong people in their realm of the gods can distinguish so much, the average person will 
be embarrassed, and then there will be no more.

It’s like a second. For the average person is a “drip-answer-” process, the stopwatch can be 
subdivided into smaller ones, and the supercomputer can be subdivided into smaller ones.



But even if this ancestor can feel so many differences, he is now seriously injured and 
weak, and certainly can not keep up with the speed of thinking.

So when Swordsman went to Tongxian Weng, he regretted regretting him and he had 
decisively made a decision that he had never thought of before!

Immediately fell to the ground!

And at the same time, gave up control of the Scorpio.

The Scorpio has already started, whether it is attacking the waves or the defense of his 
body, it is already in operation.

He wants to re-operate all the thirty-six scorpions to attack the smashing waves. It’s too 
late, and it’s too late to protect them all.

But he can still give up!

It’s like a computer. When you are watching a small piece, someone is coming. If you 
want to close the program, you will be too busy.

Even the direct shutdown button may not be too late. At this time, you can also unplug the 
power…

When the old ancestors landed, they gave up control of the magic weapon, just like the 
effect of unplugging the power supply. The thirty-six scorpion knives that had to be 
attacked and defended had lost their direction and lost support. Only landed.

It’s too late to say it!

They are all between the electric and the flint, and they can’t wait for the fall of the 
scorpion knife. Even the fast-growing ancestors have not yet landed.



After the sword of the king has killed three other ancestors, he has already reached his 
body!

His speed is not fast enough, but the victory is in the pre-judgment and decisive, coupled 
with the life and magic of the three partners, for him to get a little time.

So when the sword came over, he had already gone down, and the sword of the king took 
the shudder of his cold sweat and swept over his back!

Shen Lang used the sword of the king, and it was such a fast sword that he was actually 
hiding by this guy, or let him be a little surprised.

However, it is already the achievement of Zhen Gu Shuo today that he can cut off the five 
ancestors of the great gods with one sword!

After returning to the sword, Shen Lang fell directly on top of his head.

“Please spare your life!”

At this time, the ancestor fell to the ground, and the voice of forgiveness was also said, and 
the thirty-six scorpion knives that lost control were also landing one after another.

“what did you say?”

If Shen Lang wants to kill him, just following the second sword, he can directly split his 
head in two.

Just put it on top of his head, of course, I still want to vent a few more anger.

“I am wrong! It is me wrong! I should not be a gentleman’s belly! I am damn!”

He has just been able to make a white-eyed wolf, and now he will make a wall-to-wall act, 
which is not surprising.



“Then go to hell!”

When Shen Lang spoke, the sword of the king smashed!

The ancestor directly scared the urine, and wanted to continue to ask for mercy, but the 
voice was dumb, and I couldn’t make a sound.

But the sword of the king was in the middle of his head, but it turned and turned into his 
head.

He was in a coma, but before he was in a coma, he still felt it. He was not directly smashed 
in half, so he was relieved.

After Shen Lang stunned him, he looked at the other five people on the ground.

They were originally a heavy effect, and now they have been cut off, this time it is really 
dead.

And before the impact of the impact, as long as there is enough time, you can still recover. 
But now that two cuts are made, even if they give them time, they can’t recover.

At this moment, everyone is ashamed.

“You killed us! Anyway, you are also a murderous little devil!”

Tong Xian Weng sneered a sneer, but unfortunately his weakness at the moment has made 
this sneer no momentum.

“It’s natural to kill you, but before you kill, use waste!”

Shen Lang talks  directly to extract their spiritual power!



The five of them have no resistance at all. They can only see that they are getting weaker 
and weaker. This kind of step-by-step approach to death is more uncomfortable than going 
directly to death.

In the hands of Shen Lang, there is a heart bubble immediately!

He himself has returned to the peak with the help of the power of the dog god, and even if 
they absorb their mental power, they are also an excessive supply.

Therefore, they are forced out of their spiritual strength, but they are made into spiritual 
bubbles and can be used by others.

After a while, I felt that they couldn’t hold it anymore. Shen Lang absorbed the two half of 
their bodies, including the broken magic weapon, and absorbed them into the tower.

This is really waste utilization and it is also cleaning the battlefield.

The remaining ancestor, Shen Lang just did not kill him, that is, thinking about the value 
of this layer of use!

After they stopped the sword, they became more weak, and their mental strength declined 
at a visible rate, wasting a lot.

This ancestor is only the trauma of the past, although the mental strength is only a few, but 
relatively sudden death, it is still much better.

Of course, he was not polite with him at this time, and directly under his coma, forcibly 
extracted his mental strength.

Such a means is a bit sinister.

But Shen Lang has already given them a chance, but they don’t want it at all, and this is 
the first thing to kill him. Tong Xian Weng and Zhi Yi are not the first time. Such an 
enemy can no longer be kept!



In a place where no one can speak morality, it is not bad for seven people in the same 
industry to maintain mutual trust.

After draining him, Shen Lang threw it into the tower of the tower, and the sword was 
collected.

Chapter 1925 - Ice monster

Before Shen Lang had no intention of swallowing their magic weapon, so I didn’t 
understand the three magic weapons.

Just watching this ancestor used the Scorpio Knife, it seems that the effect is still good, 
anyway, people have already been included in the tower. If the Scorpion Knife is also 
thrown in, the effect after natural refining is better.

But it is too wasteful. This magic weapon has not been damaged, and it can still be used.

This is what they want to kill him. There is nothing to say about Shen Lang, and he is not 
afraid to face any public opinion.

After cleaning the battlefield, Shen Lang did not rush to go back to the next layer. Since it 
came up, I still understand the situation of this layer.

He just didn’t read their memories anymore, but from their words, they probably got a 
little bit of understanding.

These six people are not as holding as they are, so they are not in one place.

Comparing the influence of the records in the holy armor, the six of them are standing next 
to each other, so no matter how time or space they are, they are not far apart.

Just because they are not involved, so when they land, they are still separated, within the 
scope of this ten-mile square.

This is somewhat worthwhile. You can guess the ending of other people. It is likely that 
five or six, or seven or eight, fall within the same area.



Other areas may be one or two layers that continue from here…

However, it is not entirely true that the place where they are located may not be the lowest 
level, and it may be upwards or downwards.

From the perspective of the environment here, the environment of each layer above may 
also be different.

Before they were on the lower level, it was like a wilderness, but on this level, it was like 
an ice hole.

Shen Lang can almost guess, in every other layer, perhaps a completely different 
environment style.

Now this experience has already brought him to the upper level, and it is possible to go 
one step further, or the next level.

But what about it?

What kind of situation will it be when the walls on all sides are broken?

They have already searched here, and there will be no gains, so Shen Lang stayed, and 
only searched a little, and then went to the middle.

When he came up, he was here for the sake of safety and for his convenience. Also, 
because it is only a private possession, it may not be possible to do so. If it is unsuccessful, 
it may hit the enthusiasm of others.

It is now certain that if you just go back, it doesn’t matter.

Falling from the middle, in theory, will also fall in the middle of the next layer, which can 
give them great confidence.



Shen Lang is coming out to explore the road. Now it is not a way to find a way out. It has 
to be continued. However, the mental bubbles that have just been harvested will be sent to 
them and they will be of great help.

This is complementary, the mental strength recovers faster, it can also help the recovery of 
vitality, and vice versa.

Just when he had just arrived in the middle of the position, he had not waved the shovel 
and heard some strange sounds!

He immediately swept around and circled, and the gods also explored the largest range.

This can’t be surprised!

A few hundred meters away, a group of ice people appeared!

It is said that it is an ice man. In fact, it is not like a person. It is a monster that is piled up 
in ice. It is more appropriate to say that it is not ice.

These ice monsters are about two meters high. Naturally, they don’t have facial features. 
They don’t look like they have the ability to think.

But they are coming to this side quickly.

And as they ran, the ice on the ground began to rise again and quickly became a new ice 
monster!

That is to say, when Shen Lang just heard the sound, it was the sound that the ice cubes 
“crawled” from the ground and piled up into ice monsters.

And when he looked at the past, a group of ice monsters had formed around him!

When these ice monsters ran over, they began to appear more irregular ice monsters!



What’s happening here?

No one has discussed with Shen Lang, but he can guess it by himself.

This cloud palace holy place, since it will be so mysterious for thousands of years, should 
not only be the reason for his guilty death.

The “big house” of the ten-mile square is extremely spectacular. The environment of each 
floor is different. The thickness is also 500 meters. Is it just a simple environment?

This ice monster should be the guardian of this layer!

Perhaps like the game of Shaoguan, to officially leave the trouble, only the monsters 
guarding the level will be killed.

He just came up here, came through a small shovel, and used the nature of cheating.

As for the few of them who have not encountered the ice monster before, it is also very 
good, because before the next level, there is no encounter with anything, this should be 
after a certain period of time.

Thinking of this, Shen Lang immediately frowned.

If this is the case, there will be ice monsters here, and the next layer, there may be 
monsters!

But I think there is still a cold autumn, and there is snow and snow. The two of them are 
powerful, the injuries are not so heavy, and they are healed for others. The overall situation 
is better than here is also a little relieved.

In between this moment, these ice monsters are already close to a few tens of meters!

Shen Lang looked at the ice monster that came “running”, and there was a magical feeling 
in my heart.



It should be said that there is a familiar feeling!

Because these ice monsters are ice cubes, it seems that something is pulling them and 
bringing them together.

This reminds Shen Lang of the kind of mysterious black particles that I encountered in the 
depths of the Tianshan Mountains!

Mysterious black particles are also a substance, because because of their existence, they 
can quickly accumulate stones into stone people and attack people.

When the attack was over, when the black particles left, they fell apart.

Later, Shen Lang put it into the tower of the tower, and the flame troll, the extraterrestrial 
demon, also rely on the magic of a mysterious creature, this yin and yang two extreme 
objects, finally finally refining .

At that time, the Ba Tian Tower, not to the extent of the current tower, was really a crack.

Looking back now, I think that the mysterious sphere after the fusion, the huge impact, is 
also a kind of recovery to the Ba Tian Tower.

Now these ice monsters are the same thing right away?

As far as his current induction is concerned, he does not realize the existence of the 
mysterious black grain.

The current Shen Lang is far from being comparable in the past, and it will not be too 
expensive to meet the mysterious black grain.

Of course, these ice monsters are certainly not simple.

Shen Lang now decides to use them to sacrifice the knife – the scorpion knife that has just 
been received.



This Scorpio knife is strictly a set of three-in-one magic weapon. Once it is manipulated, it 
has an extraordinary effect on both a single raid and a large-scale attack on the group.

Chapter 1926 - Large stamping

Shen Lang was the first to use this day’s sickle, and did not read the memory of the 
ancestors, just to see him used once.

However, when this magic weapon is started, it is directly controlled to it, and everything 
is in order.

Just like an old driver getting started with a car that hasn’t touched it, all that is needed is a 
little bit of understanding. The rough operation is not wrong.

Now he wants to use these ice monsters to sacrifice his sword. It is a practical operation.

When these ice monsters have recently reached tens of meters, there are still generations in 
the back, and there are hundreds of meters in the back. The farther places should not be 
sensed by God. I don’t know the specifics. It is estimated that there are also.

Or these ice monsters can sense the range of people, but also a few hundred meters.

Thirty-six scorpio knives have appeared in the air and swiftly swung up. Over a dozen 
meters away from the sinking waves, a spherical protective layer was formed.

This quantity can already cover a large range, and the speed of the spin is fast enough to 
achieve a complete protection.

When the Scythe was in place, the first batch of ice monsters had arrived. They were really 
unconscious. When they saw such a dangerous situation, they did not stop, or they rushed 
to the deep waves inside.

As a result, like the soya-bean milk machine and the juicer, the ice monster that I just 
touched was immediately turned into a myriad of ice **** by a high-speed scorpion knife!

However, it was a moment of work, and immediately on the ground more than ten meters 
away, formed a high point of ice slag!



Shen Lang is now using thirty-six Scorpio knives, which are completely used on defense, 
and his state is much stronger than that of his ancestors. The natural power is much 
stronger than what he has seen before.

He is also very satisfied with this effect.

But there is also a constraint, that is the scope!

This range is now estimated by him and has just been verified. However, if the scope is 
expanded, the density between the knife and the knife will become even worse.

The larger the diameter, the more the speed will be affected, even if it maintains the same 
speed.

To expand a few meters, more than ten meters, he feels no problem, but if you want to 
expand to tens of meters, it is estimated that there will be a net of fish coming in.

After playing for a while, Shen Lang was already familiar with the manipulation of the 
Scorpio Knife, and there was no more time wasted.

Because the circle of more than ten meters blocked the ice monsters, more and more ice 
monsters came over, and they all piled up outside the circle. The density of ice monsters to 
be shredded by the Scorpio knife also increased.

At this moment, the waves are smashing the scorpion knives, not forming a protection 
circle!

Originally, these ice monsters were driven by unconscious madness. Before they came 
over, they broke. Now that there is no such pressure, they all rush to the place where Shen 
Lang is standing!

Because it was coming from all directions, it had already piled up into mountains in a 
dozen meters. Now it quickly covered the waves and formed a hill formed by ice monsters.



And within tens of meters, the density is the biggest, the most, but farther away, still 
coming over…

At this time, the waves have already arrived in the air!

The height of a ceiling can be about one kilometer, and the sense of God is beyond a few 
hundred meters, so his height is not too high.

The ice monsters that are piled up below are actually high in height, but they are only a 
few tens of meters. It is just a sudden stacking of this effect, which is still very spectacular.

At the moment, Shen Lang has already manipulated another magic weapon.

Printed in the sky!

This magic weapon has not been used for a long time, because it is generally not used.

The degree of the moon is half-sensible, it is very crushing, but there are great restrictions 
on the gods, the peaks of the big fairy, and even the big fairy.

Because of its advantages of large area and gravity rolling, it is a disadvantage in terms of 
speed and flexibility. The larger the volume, the more obvious the target, the harder it is to 
adjust, as long as the speed is fast enough, it is easy to dodge.

At the beginning, Shen Lang himself was dealing with Zhou Wei.

So he used this magic weapon for them, but then he was afraid that he was in danger. 
When they left the earth, they all brought the magic weapon to him.

Now dealing with these dense ice monsters that piled up into mountains, Shen Lang will 
be shipped with this eclipse!

These ice monsters rushed to the place where the waves were standing. Because there was 
a delay, they used to be “positioned” before, but they were blocked. The back blocking 
disappeared, of course, the fast past, so as not to disappear.



It was just that the speed of the waves was very fast, and they immediately reached the top 
and calmly avoided them.

But if you give a little more time, it is possible that they will jump in the air or change the 
way.

So after Shen Lang came up, Chaotian Yin had already flown out and became a few tens of 
meters!

This thing is like a hill, it is directly crushed!

The heap of ice monsters piled up into hills below was immediately crushed and layered 
down, and soon they were all pressed into a thick layer of ice.

Shen Lang continued to manipulate the Chaotian Seal. After crushing the most dense piles, 
it rubbed the past around!

These ice monsters, I don’t know the danger, I don’t know how to dodge, and it’s too late 
to run in such a huge pressure.

After a while, all the ice monsters within one or two hundred meters have been crushed on 
the ground, making the ice layer thicker.

Shen Lang once again flew down, fell down and waited for the ice monsters to come close 
in the distance, while the Chaotian Seal began to fly and was ready to wait in the air.

Before the ice monsters in the distance, I felt the breath of the waves, still flying fast, but 
after a round of crushing, the density has been much lower.

As they approached the waves, Shen Lang leaped again, stepping on the sky and printing 
all the tens of meters.

Look at the other has been sparse, and Shen Lang did not continue to manipulate the sky, 
but changed to a scorpion knife.



Thirty-six scorpion knives, began to try the offensive drill!

These knives spurt out in all directions, and all the ice monsters encountered are broken 
into slag!

For a moment,  annihilated all the larger ice monsters.

Now, the ice monsters that can be seen and can be sensed by a few hundred meters in 
radius can already be scarce. There is still no fog in the distance, and it is not known for 
the time being.

But now one thing is clear, it is that these ice monsters in the vicinity have not continued 
to build!

According to the pattern generated by these ice monsters, even if it is crushed into ice slag, 
it should continue to be regenerated.

However, it is estimated that such a dense elimination has reached a certain degree, and the 
law here has been put into effect and will not continue.

After waiting for a while, there are no new ice monsters coming from the fog in the 
distance, and some are the few remnants visible in sight.

These remnants of the ice monsters that were close to each other were once again crushed 
by the scorpion knives.

The entire frozen space, once again restored the previous silence, and then began to 
change!

Chapter 1927 - Tornado

Shen Lang had already reached the middle ground because he had been fighting with these 
ice monsters. Although it is not necessarily at the center, it is also in the center.

What is changing at the moment is the central area!



After discovering the change, Shen Lang immediately took the magic weapon and flew 
into the air, maintaining the defense and distance, and then observing the concrete.

This change is in the middle of the place, suddenly there is a whirlwind, wrapped in 
countless ice and snow!

It is like a tornado appeared out of thin air, and the scope of this tornado is not large, it is a 
few meters wide and a few tens of meters high.

Shen Lang is not close to the past. The environment here is too weird. He can’t confirm 
safety. He won’t take risks.

If this is the real cloud palace holy land, then it is the tomb of many ancient gods!

His uniqueness is caused by a lot of information asymmetry. If you really talk about it, you 
can’t say that it is stronger than all the predecessors. It is now a lot of ancestors, and the 
real strength is stronger than him.

In short, be careful to drive the ship for thousands of years.

After watching it for a while in the air, the more and more urgent tornado began to slow 
down and stopped.

Feeling the surrounding space and there is no abnormality, Shen Lang began to defend 
close to a little, let yourself observe the situation behind the tornado.

As the tornado gradually dissipated, Shen Lang has also observed clearly.

In the center of this tornado, there is actually only a small piece of moving objects!

This object is like a small snake, but from the sense of the gods to the naked eye, it can be 
seen that it is not a living thing.

To say that it is not a living thing, but it is active again.



And it seems to be spiritually swimming.

Shen Lang has already felt that it is very unusual.

As for what is in the end, what is wrong with it, what is the role, take it first!

According to his analysis, after killing these ice monsters, there should be a place similar 
to the exit, so that you can leave.

But just after the end, there is a tornado, and the tornado is obviously protecting this thing, 
or the tornado is just the momentum it appears.

It can be seen that if you use the customs clearance game, this should be a reward for 
smooth customs clearance.

Seeing that it is spiritual, the waves instantly block the space around it by the field, and 
then quickly approach it, and you have to catch it directly!

At this time, the small snake-like object seemed to realize that something was wrong and 
immediately swam away.

What surprised Shen Lang was that he had just had a small space for blockade, but his 
power was extremely strong. It was the ancestor of the Great God level who was trapped 
and will be restrained.

However, the object of this little snake is completely obstructed, as if it had no effect on it.

Shen Lang immediately made adjustments!

This is not a living thing. It should be called a spiritual thing. It may not be able to block 
him in the field. Then you can only catch up with the fast speed!

However, while grasping, he also released thirty-six scorpio knives and formed a larger 
encirclement.



This is still like the effect of killing those ice monsters just now.

He basically expressed an effect. If you can’t catch it and let it run, it’s better to cut it off!

Anyway, I won’t come here often, I missed this opportunity, and it should not be possible.

Must be successful!

In addition to the blockade of the Scythe, he himself chased the past quickly.

This spirit seems to feel the power of the Scorpio, so when it is close to the edge, it quickly 
changes direction.

It’s just that it’s too flexible and too fast. Even if it’s already stuck in a small range, the 
Shen Lang is still a few times to catch it, or is hiding.

However, after seeing that it was scrupulous about the blockade of the Scythe, Shen Lang 
was relieved.

As long as it doesn’t run away, there is no problem!

Shen Lang is completely confident that he can catch up with it, because the field is not 
effective for it, but it is still effective for himself!

He intended to trap the other side of the blockade. If you can’t do it, then speed yourself 
up.

In his field, everything is what he wants. His speed is fast, and under the support of the 
field, it is instantly possible.

This spirit is more flexible, and it is still caught under the chase of Shen Lang.

Before Shen Lang couldn’t figure out what it was, he first collected it into the storage 
space and collected it.



After getting it, Shen Lang received the scorpion knife.

At this time, I saw a round hole a few meters wide in the middle!

Sure enough, there is an export!

Originally he was going to go down from here, and now he has opened the exit, which is 
of course more convenient.

However, before he jumped in, he still did a lot of protection, and did not dare to make the 
speed too fast, so as not to have any problems to react.

While jumping into the room, Shen Lang also had a leisurely analysis of the encounter in 
this space.

Although these ice monsters, at his level, seem to be very unhelpful and do not seem to be 
playing an important role in protection.

But thinking carefully, it is normal.

Because it is not normal, Shen Lang himself!

Originally, everyone came in, it was a serious trauma, that is, the cold and autumn was 
also injured, and Tong Xian Weng was weak and could not get 20% of the power.

In that case, countless ice monsters rushed together, even if they had magic weapons, they 
were too tired.

For example, the same is done with a scorpion knife. After the ancestors were seriously 
injured, they would not reach the effect of Shen Lang. The same is true for everyone else. 
If there is no magic weapon, it will only be more stressful.

If the ice monster has already been killed in the first round before the ice monster appears, 
the consequences will be even worse, and there are not many who can survive.



And even if you survive, how confident you are, can you grasp this spirit?

In this way, Shen Lang seems to have done all this easily, based on his healthy and sound 
foundation.

And this is more than an hour more than others, taking the inner scorpion of the giant 
python, absorbing the spirit, and the dog **** at all costs to give his mental strength, 
vitality to force him to infuse the effect.

Such a situation cannot be copied by others.

In addition, Shen Lang also thought about other memories  including the elk, the thief 
grass and even the retributing slaves about the memory of the Yungong Holy Land.

Heaven and Earth Essence!

This keyword was captured.

Legend has it that the ancestors who came back from the Yungong Holy Land got the 
essence of the heavens and the earth, and thus their strength!

It’s just that since ancient times, everyone thought that this was a set of words, just like 
saying that I tried hard to do so.

Broadly speaking, the aura of cultivation and absorption is the essence of heaven and 
earth.

The sinking waves that fell in the channel thought of a possibility.

Will it… the essence of heaven and earth, is the name of a certain substance?

The spirits that have just appeared in the tornado will be the “Essence of Heaven and 
Earth” with a miraculous effect?



Chapter 1928 - Flame Mountain

If there is a similar item in each floor space, and they don’t know what it is called at the 
beginning, everyone may see it differently. It is also possible to call it “the essence of 
heaven and earth” in the end.

If the essence of this world is the key to letting their strength rise, it is indeed a good thing.

However, Shen Lang did not go deeper, no matter what the name, this is definitely a good 
thing, it can’t run.

Now that he has retracted his mind, he is concentrating on watching the landing.

According to his estimation, it has already dropped about 500 meters. Compared with the 
previous distance, it should be over.

but……

How do you feel that the following is a bit wrong?

All the way down is safe, and Shen Lang has also speeded up a bit.

Immediately, the passage was over, and it fell from it, and the surrounding area suddenly 
became bright.

And Shen Lang has not yet fallen, he has already understood the situation, and can not 
help but frown.

After coming out, looking down, it is also a smog. According to the one kilometer, the line 
of sight and the gods can’t be finished.

But the whole feeling is different, it is very hot here!

There is almost no heat in the slightest moisture!



The layer on the previous level is a feeling of a wasteland. The overall feeling is still 
relatively good, and there is no obvious discomfort.

So, this is either another layer of space, or a big change in the time he left!

It used to be up one level. Now it is also down to the next level. It is also determined to be 
about 500 meters. It should be back to the original layer.

But if you want to say something wrong, there is only an ice monster on the top, and the 
big environment has not changed.

Now I can’t figure out that Shen Lang can only keep the alert, then slowly speed up and 
sink down to see what is going on below.

After sinking for hundreds of meters, Shen Lang can already sense the general situation 
under the light fog, and it feels that it is not hot, it is a bit hot!

The expression of Shen Lang is also dignified.

This is not because the environment has changed, it is really another layer of space!

This layer of environment is completely different from the wilderness and ice, like to the 
Flame Mountain!

As the Shen Lang landed lower, the following is also more clear, visible in the range of a 
few hundred meters, from time to time to see the flame melting tens of meters high!

It seems to be on the edge of a volcano, and the surrounding ground, there are many 
burning flames, no burning place, or black, or red, can be seen that the temperature is not 
low.

The place where it landed is the middle of this layer. If it is the original one, you should 
see Gao Hanqiu and others here.

Now there is no figure, but it is definitely coming to another layer.



Why is it clear that the next layer and the next layer will go to another layer?

This is not completely incomprehensible. For example, the place he is on, and the place 
below, are not in one place, and may cause differences.

In addition, the “upper and lower layers” here are all analyzed according to conventional 
thinking, and this cannot be viewed conventionally.

The problem now, on the one hand, is to look for it and see if there are people living on 
this floor. If not, look at what you need to face here.

Think of this as a good thing, then try to complete it, go to the next level, it is impossible 
to endless, always look for them in the cold autumn.

Moreover, just after harvesting a wave of “Essence of Heaven and Earth”, maybe there are 
other heaven and earth essences?

Thinking of this, Shen Lang is also excited.

The upper level is an ice cave. Here is the flaming mountain. Compared to this, the danger 
here is even greater!

Because when they fall, people should be in a state of serious injury and coma, and then 
watch the strength of the level of waking up and down.

Falling on the ice layer will not die immediately, but if it falls in this high-temperature 
melt, it will be swallowed up directly by the fire tongue. If you have not recovered, you 
may have gone to sleep forever.

Shen Lang didn’t waste much time, or speeded up and searched the entire area.

Although he is more expecting the harvest of the essence of heaven and earth, but after all, 
they are all coming together. If they are in danger here, he will be able to save.



Of course, the premise is that at least don’t think about hurting him, don’t think about 
robbing him of his magic weapon to save his life.

This requirement can be said to be very low.

After two layers of experience, it is estimated that the size of this layer will be the same, so 
Shen Lang can directly search for carpets.

Along the way, he also discovered the situation. The whole layer seems to be above the 
volcano, but there are still some places to settle. If it is not directly in the fire pit, and it has 
not encountered other attacks, it should survive. .

But as he searched all the way down, he didn’t see a person!

He was able to observe the range sensed, that is, a few hundred meters in radius. In order 
not to miss every place, it was searched in order.

The result is that from the middle of the past, relying on one of the sides, and then looking 
to the corner, began a search for the road.

When Shen Lang was a little disappointed, I came to the last corner. I haven’t arrived yet. I 
found out that there are several people there!

That corner, compared to other places, a little more space, there are now four people, all 
sitting there cross-legged.

When the Shen Lang appeared, they were also taken aback.

Shen Lang has been able to guess a general, I don’t know how many, but it must have 
survived and searched each other around, and finally merged together.

Compared to other places, the space where I can settle is a little bigger, so everyone finally 
retreated to this corner.



When Shen Lang went from the middle, it was in the opposite corner. If you come to this 
corner first, you will find them first.

“Is it a wave?” Someone screamed in surprise. “Shen brother!”

Shen Lang nodded and speeded up and leaped around the fire pit.

These four people, one is Helan ancestors, one is Yu Yu two other people, one of them is 
also the ancestor of Shen Lang sent back to the magic weapon.

“You are all okay? Is there anyone else that has an accident?”

On the ice above, there are six people who fall. According to the reason, there should be 
five or six, six or seven, and four are a little less.

Helan’s ancestors and Yu Yu’s together are not unexpected.

“We woke up and arrived here, and then found ourselves seriously injured. Everyone is 
scattered in different places, all the way down, only four of us.”

Helan ancestors briefly told Shen Lang about the general situation.

“Shen brothers, you? Gao Laozu, Xue Xianzi, they…” Another ancestor asked carefully.

They don’t have any personal relationships with Shen Lang, but Helan’s ancestors called 
Shen Brothers. They also followed and called, and they seemed close.

Chapter 1929 - Fire monster

“Gao Xiong, Xue Zhangmen, Qiu Lin Jianzong, and Yao Chi are all good. We landed in 
the same place, but everyone was injured.”

Shen Lang said a little.

And absorbed the previous experience, he now also play a vaccination in advance.



“I was also injured. But I just happened to have a Nei Dan, a **** of the beasts. After I ate 
it, I recovered quickly.”

Of course, they can also see that Shen Lang is fine. He heard that Gao Qiu Qiu was 
injured, but he was fine. It would be doubtful.

But now that the words are spoken, everyone will understand.

Shen Lang has always shown that it is a big deal, and everyone has added his vinegar to 
the background of his deification. He feels that he will carry the eternal beast, and it is not 
impossible.

At a critical moment, this can save a life!

They are the older generations of such a large age. They come here to explore. Before they 
are sure of safety, it is of course inconvenient to carry too many resources of the family 
and the martial art.

But the Shen Lang is different. This is the youngest and most top-notch genius. The forces 
behind it are definitely willing to come up with resources to save lives, so that he can go 
back safely.

As for the ability to absorb recovery so quickly, and perhaps the help of the cold autumn is 
not necessarily.

“How are you…” Because the friendship is not enough, other ancestors will stop talking, 
but it is enough to ask the question.

“We are not willing to be trapped, find a way to cross the top. Finally, on the other layer, 
the layer is frosty…”

When it came to this, Shen Lang searched for a “water drop”.

This is a huge squad, most of which are traded to the Kuafu, and Shen Lang has also made 
a little play.



Now I have applied a protective cover to cover everyone, and then release the water inside 
the water drops a little.

A lot of water evaporates, so that the surrounding temperature is lowered and the humidity 
is rising. Everyone feels much better.

The harsh environment here is nothing to the ancestors of the Great God level. But now 
they are seriously injured, it is not the same, the environment is too bad, it is also a 
torment.

Everyone is very grateful for the careful action of Shen Lang.

Because it is their identity, it is difficult to say it, and others will feel that you are wrong.

And like them, I don’t know how many years have not been hurt. How many years have 
not reached such a harsh environment, of course, it is forbearance, but there is a better 
environment and a lot of comfort.

When Shen Lang released the water drops, he also told them about the ice layer.

After listening to his words, the four people on the scene were all angry and angry.

“There are children who have lost their lives, and they have always had a good name. I 
didn’t expect it to be such a despicable person!”

“It’s a white-eyed wolf that is not as good as a beast! The Shen brothers helped us to 
recover the magic weapon. We are all grateful. He even said this! Shen brother, today I put 
my words here, my life is yours!”

“They are all dead and dead! This has just entered the Yungong Holy Land, and they can’t 
stand the test of humanity. If there are huge treasures, then you have to?”

Including the sorrowfulness that has not been spoken, it is also a shameful statement.



“Shen brother, the old man was faint in his mind before, but he also made a slap in the face 
of you. Fortunately, he was prevented by Helan brother. It didn’t make a big mistake. 
Going back to Lijiang, I am deeply introverted. This time, what do you have to tell, old? 
Going to the fire and not saying anything!”

Shen Lang’s heart is secretly funny.

These are all old people, and there are so many indignations in the middle two!

This is just a performance, it is to express his attitude to him.

The above six people were all killed by Shen Lang. Although they did not elaborate on the 
process, the result was enough to hold them four people.

Because it seems that Shen Lang still has no injuries at all, indicating that the six people 
have not affected him at all!

They are now in a state of injury, and they are definitely not the opponents of Shen Lang.

Shen Lang has the ability to leave the space where he is, and to visit other space, then they 
should have a good knot, and hold the thighs well, why bother to find their way out?

Regardless of whether they had such a mind or not, they heard the above-mentioned 
encounters completely dispelled, and completely decided to hold the thighs.

“Right, Shen brother, you said that you are on the first floor, just another channel has 
emerged?”

Helan ancestors also know that this attitude can not be too much, it is too fake, so just the 
right transfer topic.

Shen Lang said the ice monster, did not say the essence of the heavens and earth, and then 
the weird where it fell.



“I don’t know. I’m sure I’m going in a corner, and then in the middle of the top, there is a 
passage, but I didn’t go back to the level I was on, but I came here.”

There is no concealment in Shen Lang’s sentence. He does not know exactly what it is.

I heard that all four people smiled and laughed.

“It seems that we are really in the holy place of Yungong. The environment here is more 
complicated than we think. Even if there is another passage here, I don’t know where it 
is.”

“According to the Shen Brothers, there will be ice monster attacks on it. Will there be a 
fire attack here?”

Everyone’s face changed slightly.

Since every layer of the environment here is different, the danger should also arise for 
different environments.

If you come to a large group of fire monsters, how much can you resist with the severity of 
their current injuries?

“I am also wondering. If these monsters appear according to time, if all the time is similar, 
then they should have already encountered it in the cold autumn, and it should have been 
encountered here.”

The sentence of Shen Lang makes everyone even more vigilant.

The specific rules, we do not know, can only guess and explore.

Without knowing more clues, it can only be guessed for a certain period of time, and a 
monster attack will occur.

If this is the case, the time should have arrived, and the monsters on this layer may be 
attacked at any time!



And when everyone was on guard, they found that monsters had already appeared in the 
distance!

The above can be called ice monster then here can also be called fire monster.

It is the whole body that is braving the flame, unable to judge what it is, it seems that a 
high-temperature melt that has been sprayed out has become!

They don’t know where to start, but now they are already in their sight!

Shen Lang also looked at the past and carefully sensed it and compared it.

He immediately had a clear understanding that the fire monsters generated by these flames 
were probably more difficult than the ice cubes, so they appeared slower for a while, and 
their speed was slower.

“How to do?”

Everyone is anxious to see the waves.

They were all the core of their respective sects, but they are so serious that they have not 
been seen for a long time. At this moment, it is intact, and it has already become a target 
for their hopes.

Chapter 1930 - Fire attack

Shen Lang is actually waiting for them!

If these monsters have already appeared before, it means that the “Essence of Heaven and 
Earth” on this layer has already appeared.

If you escape, you can’t find it again.

If it is won by them, and I am embarrassed to do it again, or what is the difference between 
them and Tong Xianwen?



Now that I see these fire monsters, of course he is obliged to stand up!

Since it is possible to protect the four of them and will not be injured again, they can also 
win the essence of the heavens and the earth.

“Excuse me, all the ancestors are injured. The most important thing is to take time to 
recover. These small and unruly ancestors are not allowed to deal with the ancestors. 
Although I am dealing with the same nature, it is also experienced. It is better. Give it to 
me to deal with it?”

This sentence is said to directly let them a few very happy, almost directly applauded!

Shen Lang not only helps them deal with these fire monsters, but also maintains their face 
of dignity, saying that they do not need to be shot, is there better than this?

“How does that make it? Although we are injured, the old bones can still move!” Helan 
ancestors immediately said.

“Yeah! Even if we can’t deal with that much, we can help the sinking brothers to share 
some pressure.”

Shen Lang naturally understands that they are a slogan, and they really want them to 
accept a shot from a younger generation, and they are very thick.

These four are still much better than Tong Xian Weng.

“All of you, I must be saved. It is not good to say that if you are hurt more or if you are not 
recovering well, then it will be more difficult for me to save you.”

This is directly said, making everyone’s face a bit embarrassing.

“So, let me come now, these little things!”



“Hey, hey!” Helan ancestors sighed: “In this case, we are also welcome. Everyone has to 
work hard to recover more, try not to delay the sinking brother!”

“Good! Thank you, Shen brother!”

This is a candid acceptance.

Shen Lang did not say anything more, because in a few words, those fire monsters are 
approaching a lot even if they are not as fast as ice monsters.

He jumped out and jumped quickly, then crossed the first batch of fire monsters from the 
air and landed behind them!

“Is this going to be…” There was an ancestor who couldn’t help but slammed.

Although I haven’t finished it, the meaning is very clear. – Will Shen Lang be an excuse to 
shoot alone, in fact, I will run the road first?

According to Shen Lang, he has a way to walk to other levels, and it is entirely possible to 
leave them here to die!

This does not require cumbersomeness and does not require any psychological burden.

“The sinking brother is going to help us to lead these fire monsters!”

Helan’s ancestors were the ones who had the deepest friendship with Shenlang at the scene
—although not too deep, so naturally he had to maintain this special, and this time he was 
trying to support the waves.

When they spoke, they saw that Shen Lang began to attack these fire monsters in the back, 
and they all turned around.

Then I saw Shen Lang going to the distance, and these fire monsters are also chasing after 
them!



They can probably guess that these fire monsters come directly from the living.

It was because they were all here, so they looked for it.

Now that Shen Lang has gone out, the distance from them is much closer. They are far 
apart here. There is also a protective cover and a water mist environment. They should also 
be unhappy.

So all went after the waves.

“Shenlang this child is really derogatory!”

“Yeah. In fact, he can ask for compensation to help us.”

“No matter what, we can’t be a white-eyed wolf!”

“Yes! Whether we can save us successfully, we can’t be blind.”

Looking at the dark waves that attracted all the fire monsters, they have already come out 
of their sensing range and disappeared into the faint fog. Several ancestors were stunned.

At the moment, Shen Lang did not care what their thoughts were and did not hear what 
they said.

He really wants to take these fire monsters away!

On the one hand, to help them, don’t let the fire monsters attack them.

On the other hand, he is the experience of absorbing the ice monster above.

The tornado above is in the middle. These fire monsters follow people, but if the 
eradication is over, the essence of heaven and earth appears very quickly, then it is 
necessary to get close as soon as possible.



So he is going to bring these fire monsters all in the middle.

The speed of these fire monsters is much slower than the ice monsters. They are led to 
them, and the waves are even impatient.

In the process of introducing them, of course, he also attacked them and tried to 
understand their situation as much as possible.

Judging from the traces of the ground after the passing of these fire monsters, like the 
evaporating melt, they are all hot, and it is very dangerous to touch.

But it is also limited to this.

Like the ice monster, it depends on the particularity, then the madness that does not fear 
death, and the number is huge.

For the human after the serious injury, these are not very powerful, but they will be very 
difficult enemies, and the result is likely to be very bad.

But for Shen Lang, these are still relatively weak.

After coming to the middle, Shen Lang had already had a plan in mind, and he prepared a 
plan that was completely different from killing the ice monster above!

Earth fire!

This is what I got in Chengdu. It was the excavation and the transaction. It is said to be the 
fire of the heart of the land.

For the power of this thing, Shen Lang has been verified, and a little release, the grass 
vines after the execution of all the thieves’ spells are burned clean.

Take and refine this thing. Of course, Shen Lang is not afraid to take risks. It may be 
effective to throw it into the tower, but it may be wasted.



So it has always been a separate collection.

Now, after reaching the middle section, he stood still, then took out the ground fire and 
placed it on the ground.

He also did not know how to describe this plan.

Perhaps it is called poison attack?

Look at the fire monster here, is it the opponent of the heart fire?

Just do an experiment See what the effect of fire on fire is. Anyway, he himself is fully 
defended. If the ground fire can’t fight, he will flash.

If the heart fire is out of control, he will immediately flash.

However, what happened now is that Shen Lang did not think of it!

After the local fire was placed on the ground, it suddenly let go of the light, and then 
began to appear a strange.

That is the flames nearby, the melt, or even the high temperature, all of which have 
flooded it!

This allowed the sinking waves that had stood on the safe ground, and could not help but 
fly quickly into the air to avoid being burned to the bottom of the foot.

At the same time, the fire monsters that were already catching up, they began to get out of 
control, and all flew over!

The goal is all the fire!
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