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Chapter 218 - Deep treasure hunt

For this megalithic temple, Shen Lang knows more than them.

Because that year, he came in from this “boulder temple”!

Because of this, he not only did not hear the name of the Death Valley Death Forest, but also went 
to the Death Valley and did not feel familiar. I was a little familiar and skeptical until I saw the 
map of Xie’s family.

Come here, it is also a revisited place.

Got a tall stone step and entered the temple.

Hundreds of years have passed, there is no change here. Those boulders that don’t know what time 
they have started are still stacked.

It is a temple. In fact, it is more like a huge pavilion structure. There are several entrances and it is 
not completely closed.

In the megalithic temple, of course, there is nothing, and the central is the entrance to a 
transmission array.

There is another difference between this and Death Valley. There is a one-way transmission array 
in Death Valley, which means that it is transmitted and sent out by the operation in Death Valley.

And inside this megalithic temple, it can be transmitted to the outside.

Of course, the premise is that you need to know how to start the transmission array and have 
enough energy (spirit) support.



Shen Lang entered the center of the temple and looked at the position of the transmission array. It 
was basically determined that it had not been opened for hundreds of years. Like other places, it 
has thick ash and some hay leaves.

Except for the boulder of tens of meters, there is nothing inside. So there is no competition for 
anyone here, and each family regards this as a reference for the orientation coordinates.

The purpose of Shen Lang’s coming is to find Lingquan, which has now been achieved and 
succeeded. In this temple, I feel a little more.

However, this time, it was different from the previous one. When he came in the past, his 
knowledge was not enough. At the time, like Ma Yansong, they were also stunned by this 
magnificent Stonehenge.

Now it is different. It can be confirmed that the cave is a man-made cave house. Lingquan and 
Shouyangshen are also artificially made.

It can also be determined that this is not a natural birth, nor a miraculous display, but a super 
strong one!

It took twenty-four hours to calculate the time, and the remaining time is about forty-eight hours.

Shen Lang did not make more mistakes here. Since he came, he will try to get more things back.

But before that, he still checked the harvest first.

Before Ma Yansong collected the things of the three people in Haitian Town, he also contributed 
his own.

Stacked on the ground and counted, the food and water are not collected, it is worthless. It’s just 
that the backpack is stolen, and the precious things are all in close collection.

Basically, they are similar to the Xie and Chu families. They don’t have much resources to come 
in. What they want is to get resources out of here.



The three homes in Haitian Town are different, but when they go out, they are staunch allies. 
Three people came in together and were not afraid of being attacked, so they were not prepared to 
save their lives.

They have a little spiritual stone, but there is also a medium spiritual stone!

The inspection of Ma Yansong’s parcel is not worth any money. This makes Shen Lang suspect 
that it is a medium-spirited stone. It is Ma Yansong’s initiative or helpless vote of sincerity!

After all, he is alone, and he needs to get something worthwhile to redeem when necessary.

However, it does not matter, a medium Lingshi, a few elementary Lingshi, other bottles of cans, 
Shen Lang did not look at it.

Sure enough, if you want to rob, you have to wait until the last day to return, otherwise you really 
have nothing to gain.

After Shen Lang settled down, he left Stonehenge and began to search quickly.

The place where I am now is the place where the death valley has come two hundred miles away. 
It is the edge that they have explored. The resources have not been excavated.

However, this is the case. Shen Lang searched for more than half an hour. He only saw some 
medicinal herbs that were not long in the years. The spirit beast did not see one, not to mention the 
mineral deposits.

Shen Lang began to think about it. The radius of two hundred miles is also a very large range. The 
time is limited. It is impossible to search. Since the chance of hitting Tiancai Treasure is much 
smaller, it is better to continue deeper into the two hundred miles!

However, the former has the advantage of searching for resources while searching for Chu Yunfei. 
Once it is encountered, it can be killed.

After considering it, he decided to go deeper!



Chu Yunfei is a murderer, but he can’t spend two days looking for him, just like yesterday did not 
follow the past. Since everyone has to go back to the place where they are transferred, they can go 
back in advance and ambush and kill.

Now you can search for at least two hundred miles away.

After the decision, he confirmed the direction and continued to go deep into the area two hundred 
miles away.

Now it is necessary to search for elixir, spirit beasts and the like. It is not possible to keep on the 
road as usual. The average speed is much slower, and the scope of search cannot be taken straight, 
depending on the actual environment.

In this way, the average straight line distance is about ten miles in about one hour. Sure enough, 
the chances of finding a cure are greatly increased, and many of them are more than a hundred 
years old, and even occasionally get herbs for hundreds of years.

Although there is no such thing as a thousand-year-old Yangshen along the way, the harvest is also 
quite large. For them, a family sect is even more valuable.

Shen Lang has a storage ring, which is more convenient than other ones. After picking it, it is 
directly thrown into the ring space. He did not dig a strain, and all were picked.

Just like the thousand-year-old yangshen it may be exclusive to dig, but leaving the environment is 
basically difficult to transplant. It is better to keep it and give future generations a chance.

The beast also saw some, but he did not chase. Because it is a flexible thing, knowing to hide and 
evade, the speed is fast, and it will attack. He does not want to raise a beast, nor does he have to 
have their bones and blood. Naturally, it is more cost-effective to pick herbs.

In the evening, Shen Lang has already met the harvest. It is estimated that it will advance by 
another seven or eighty, and it is not ready to move forward. If you continue to go deeper, you will 
not encounter a super powerful beast and beast. It is hard to say.

In addition to the distance, the return journey also needs to take into account the direction. In the 
dead forest without roads, it is extremely easy to get lost. It is necessary to reserve a little more 
time.



He plans to find a place to take a break around this evening and start returning tomorrow morning.

Just as he was about to find a place to spend the night, God knew vaguely that someone was 
nearby!

When he focused on the detectives, he immediately found a figure in front of him. The flash 
disappeared and the speed was very fast. He left the scope of his knowledge.


	First Strong 218

