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Chapter 234 - Half-year change

Shen Lang looked at this Stonehenge, and there was already a lot of dust, which proved that it was 
a long time since I came here.

With a hint of excitement, he placed ten medium-spirited stones and tried to open the transmission 
array.

Standing in the middle of the center, Shen Lang is also a little nervous.

If this time is not enough, then he will really be very depressed!

The reason why he can keep calm is because he is sure that he can go out here, and the only thing 
missing is the Lingshi energy. If this road is blocked, you can only go back to Death Valley and 
wait for the rabbit.

Every second seems like a long year…

Fortunately, after a few seconds, I finally waited for the effect he expected!

Feeling the change of the transmission array, Shen Lang’s hanging heart was put down, but there 
was no degree of excitement of tears, but before I took it away, I finally saw this death forest.

Carefully counted, from the time he began to awaken the memory of his past life, his time in this 
dead forest must be much longer than outside.

Therefore, even if there is only one person, it is very boring and lonely, but when you leave, there 
is still some feelings.

The array method is transmitted, which is at the top of a mountain.

What mountain is called here, Shen Lang does not remember, anyway, it is not a famous 
mountain.



Standing on the top of the mountain, he immediately felt different, the air and the aura were 
completely different, and there was too much difference.

This feeling is like the scenic area with very good air quality, just like the smog area with serious 
pollution.

Just coming back in three days, the gap will be smaller. He has lived in it for a long time and is 
used to it, so he will feel a big gap.

However, this shows that it is already back.

I looked around again at the top of the mountain. Although it was still this place, after a few 
hundred years, the environment has changed significantly and I have not given him any familiar 
feelings.

Reinforcement strengthens the memory so that you can find it next time, and then you leave.

Shen Lang did not fly with the holy armor, but searched for a mountain waterhole, and took a 
shower. Throw the broken clothes, put on new clothes, and can’t return to the world with the 
savage face.

As long as there is no one, he uses the “Phantom Meteor Step” to fly quickly until he leaves the 
mountainous area and is at a township at the foot of the mountain.

Look at the time is almost dark, he did not rush to leave, but found a hotel in the town to stay.

First, hang up the phone and charge it, then go out and have a good meal.

Although the restaurant in this town is of a general level, it is based on the local flavor of the local 
cuisine, and there is no chef. But compared to the days of living wild fruits and beasts in the dead 
forest, it is really delicious!

After eating, return to the hotel room and turn on the phone that has already been charged.



In fact, when I checked in, the date given by the hotel to his deposit receipt had already hit the 
waves.

Now that the phone is connected to the Internet, the date and time are synchronized, and the 
confirmation of the business is confirmed.

Last time I entered the dead forest, it was still at the end of June, and now it is already December!

With his body, there is no problem in bathing in the mountains. Of course, wearing thin is not 
cold. Others are already autumn and winter clothes. Seeing that he is wearing less, he thinks that 
he is a young man.

It is not the most critical for the summer to span the winter.

The most important thing is not the same year, this is already the second year of December!

In other words, he has been in the dead forest for a year and a half!

There is no sun and moon in the mountains, he can feel that it has been a long time, certainly not 
just a few months.

Now that I have confirmed that it has been a year and a half, letting Shen Lang is a bit tangled, I 
don’t know how my parents are doing. At the same time, the fire is also bigger, which is caused by 
Chu Yunfei!

Shen Lang is a bit strange, his mobile phone card has not been stopped!

Because I have never thought of disappearing for a year and a half, there are hundreds of calls in 
the mobile phone. If the monthly rent package is deducted for one and a half years, the call charge 
should have been deducted.

It is estimated that someone else has charged him a fee!

After booting up, Shen Lang immediately called his father’s mobile phone, and the second strange 
thing appeared. He reminded him that it was an empty number!



Then call the mother’s mobile phone, it is also an empty number!

This makes Shen Lang have a bad feeling. Generally speaking, the phone number will not be 
replaced casually.

However, his parents used to save money, and the mobile phones used were all charged for the 
call, and they were the cheapest package.

With the factory behind, the business will definitely increase. With such cards and packages, it is 
estimated that it will not be possible to change the phone number.

So comforted by myself, Shen Lang is busy logging in to WeChat. The former classmates are also 
nearby, and should be able to hear a little bit of information.

After opening, the phone began to receive information, and it took a while for the information to 
be collected.

Like some group information, because too much accumulation, you can only see 999+, certainly 
not a year and a half before, there is no time to check them one by one.

The key is to look at the information of private chat. If you don’t get it, ask someone alone.

The latest information received will jump to the front, because there is too much information, and 
it keeps beating. Shen Lang did not look at it, waiting for it to be completely finished, only to look 
down one by one.

As a result, his face changed completely!

All the information was last year and was just received from the server. There are a lot of 
information sent by the students. They basically give him condolences. Later, they are worried 
about his situation. They have not responded. Later, they did not send it and the reason He 
expressed his condolences, and the reason was also clearer in the information of Yue Zhennan.



Yue Zhennan was waiting for him to open, and it was only after half a year that he had to smash 
the grain, and he opened the solar array from the underground palace. Then he knew what was 
happening and reported to Shen Lang.

In the beginning of July last year, the factory he bought for his parents, there was a fire, because it 
was during the working hours that only a small number of people escaped in time, dozens of 
deaths and injuries! Shennan Han Fengying and his wife worked hard to save the fire because of 
the assets of the factory. The result was that they both died!

At that time, Shen Lang could not be found. The company’s assets were not enough for the 
compensation for the death and injury of the employees. The relatives were of course drawing a 
clear line. Yao Shuji also did not control, reported to the Yue family, Yue Gang came forward to 
deal with the aftermath of the Shennan couple, and all compensation.

Subsequently, Yue Baichuan Yue Bailun brothers suddenly violent, Yue Gang Yue Qiang Yue 
Sheng and other Yue family core generation, but also suffered accidents. Ye Jia, Daxuanmen, 
Linghequan, etc., which had been suppressed by Shenlang, reunited their hands and received the 
rapid encroachment of all aspects of Yuejia.

When Yue Zhennan came out from the Palace of the Tomb of the King, the Yue family had fallen 
in a few months!
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