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Chapter 2581 - Heli

The attack of the heart fire is not enough to inform the cold autumn, the dog god, let them have no 
room to play.

However, their reaction speed is very fast. The cold and cold autumn was originally in conjunction 
with Shen Lang, and the state of cutting together was cut. The wound that was now opened was 
covered by flame. He immediately turned the wound up and down in a big way. Pull it bigger.

Originally these fingers have been close together, and they are completely like a wall, and the 
defense will naturally be much stronger. And just opened a hole, is to tear the mouth of defense.

In the cold autumn, if you throw out a sword and a sword, you will pull the wound bigger, so that it 
is convenient to leave, and the flame that erupts inside can spread better.

In fact, this has fully demonstrated the power of this unknown enemy.

To know that the ruins of the year, the killing warriors broke out from the snow peaks, stood up to 
two or three kilometers, and braved the blazing flame, the cold autumn rushed from the hundred 
miles, just a sword to control it Living.

The current cold autumn is not as strong as it was at that time. Just not only his countless swords, 
but also the waves, can also prove that this is too powerful.

In the three-pronged attack of Shen Lang, Gao Hanqiu and Earth Fire, the tearing hole continued to 
widen and instantly reached the range of 100 meters.

This is equivalent to the huge palms that wrap them up, and have already opened one side directly!

But even so, Shen Lang did not mean to take them out of the hole in front.



He still has to continue to verify!

If a palm is really a few hundred meters, then proportionally, this should be a giant of 10,000 
meters, then they can not escape.

It’s just a palm of the hand that escapes. When you go out, there may be another palm in your hand 
waiting to be killed.

Therefore, he and the cold autumn together, the sword of the king slashed and cut out on the other 
side, and led the flame of the fire of the earth to a larger extent.

The dog **** is finally involved!

When their sword cuts a large wound and the flame has not yet flown in, the dog **** drills directly 
into the wound!

It is the route of the Green Devil before starting to learn!

The huge body has a strong advantage, but it is very powerful and sometimes very helpless. For 
example, it is almost impossible for humans to shoot flies. It is also very fearful to be covered by a 
group of ants and bees.

It also realized that this palm is so huge, and it is also a small witch, so use the Green Devil!

The Green Devil can turn the dragon into a skeleton from inside. It has only one person and can’t 
achieve this effect, but it can also help them from the inside.

The two of them kept slashing their swords, widening the wounds, and extending the flames of the 
fire of the earth, and of course the dog gods did not want to be accidentally injured.

So after it has been drilled in, it will quickly drill down and drill in the direction of the palm to 
avoid being in the same direction.

After entering the inside, it immediately opened fire!



The mouth of the mouth is crazy, biting and smashing everything, while a lot of vines are tentacles, 
and they are stretched out!

These vine tentacles play three roles. One is to fix the body and avoid being shocked out; the other 
is to absorb the blood quickly; the last one is to inject the venom.

These are the control of the current dog god, as you like, without stopping, just like a drill bit, 
drilling fast inside.

And its biting and swallowing and absorbing blood are a direct consumption of the enemy. 
Although the scope of the wound is not as strong as the deep wave and the cold autumn, it is 
constantly deepening, it is an internal attack, and it is devastated. Blood vessels, nerves or 
something, may not be worse than a wide range of epidermal wounds.

The toxin power of the poisonous grass seed is very extraordinary. With the huge body and strength 
of the dog god, it was directly stunned at the beginning.

This is bigger than it, and its endurance is definitely stronger, but it is continuously injected from 
the inside. The dose is enough, and it will definitely have a huge effect.

When they reach this realm and fight at the fastest speed, one second is a very long time, just like 
the time of running on the earth for 100 meters, it will be accurate to one hundredth of a second, and 
one second will have a big difference.

It is the same now, Shen Lang, their crazy counterattack, all in one second. Shen Lang and Gao 
Hanqiu’s sword, the dog’s attack, can be measured in microseconds.

This super giant, of course, will not be slow!

When the waves were cut by the waves, it violently smashed the madness of everyone, and then 
they smashed their attacks. It was also clear, but it was big enough and strong enough to feel that 
even a finger was cut. It is nothing but a skin injury.

It is still going to pinch them a few!



But I did not expect that the power of Shen Lang plus the cold autumn is so big, it is not a skin 
injury, but the degree of one or two finger joints.

I didn’t even think that there was such a crazy flame, and it ignited its palm directly. And the other 
beast, went into the wound along the finger and drilled in, and went straight to the hand!

Everything happened too fast, and it exceeded its expectations. When it comes to responding, it has 
lost a little chance.

Just when everyone was attacking wildly, there was suddenly a huge shock like a whirl!

This change, no doubt is that this super giant has a counterattack, everyone is maintaining a high 
degree of defense, to avoid being hurt, and then continue to attack, try to consume the other side as 
much as possible, and then try to get close together.

If you are together, even if the final power is too great, Shen Lang will have a chance to pull 
everyone.

Now that he and Gao Hanqiu are in the air, they can also receive the fire at any time. Only the dog 
**** who entered the interior is difficult to withdraw.

But don’t wait to find the dog **** huge vibration, there has been an unforeseen change!

They were still swaying their swords with huge fingers, including the flames burning, but now that 
the vibrations of this day have turned, all disappeared!

The huge palm that clung to it disappeared, leaving only a lot of mud falling from the sky, including 
a lot of vegetation on it.

There is no doubt that the enemy has already taken this hand away!

I took away the injured palm, and then it should be another palm attack!

Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu also found the dog **** who also fell in the air. It was inside the finger. 
After being taken away, it was released from the cockroach.



They naturally quickly moved closer together.

Just the first battle, has fully witnessed the strength of the other side. It’s just that one hand has 
already been. If you want to confront this super giant, it will still be too different. It is time to 
disappear.

But at this time, they saw a scene of horror!

Chapter 2582 - Voidless

Because everyone can see, the range of the sense of God, it is about a hundred meters, so if that 
hand is taken away, they can not be traced.

According to the proportion of people, this palm has a few hundred meters, just pull it to the side, it 
will be outside the kilometer, it can not be sensed.

The other hand, whether it was buried in the soil or in other places, would be at least a kilometer 
away.

Therefore, they can only be passive defenses. To attack, they must be close to a hundred meters to 
be sensed.

Under such circumstances, it is natural to go to the top.

However, if you want to use the door of the Three Realms at this time, it is estimated that it will be 
too late, so you must first hide it in the space of Tianshu, wait for it to leave from here, or wait until 
it does not pay attention, and then leave.

But when they were concerned about the surroundings, they saw a figure in the sand falling. This 
figure was less than two meters, which is the figure of ordinary people!

In this ancient cold world, Shen Lang met the people closest to the Terran, that is, the sand people in 
the sand country, which is similar to the Terran.



Or the sand people, the fish people and the barbarians are counted in the human race, but they are 
different ethnic groups in the human race.

Approximation is even a big difference between mermaid and barbarian. Compared with dragons or 
other beasts, there are traces of human race.

But now, in the depths of the magic forest on this day, on the edge of the Shadow Forest, I saw a 
standard human race!

This is almost impossible!

According to the multi-faceted information that Shen Lang now has, no one can take the risk to 
come here. It is even more unlikely that coincidence will appear here, all can only explain one 
thing, this is illusory!

The biggest possibility of this human race is the master of the huge palm who just played against 
them, the suspected super giant turned out!

As the large amount of mud in the range of one or two hundred meters falling down has fallen, the 
situation in the air has become more clear.

The appearance of the Terran, it seems a bit strange, there is a feeling of familiarity, but it is not 
familiar with where.

“This person… looks and clothes, it’s like a combination of the two of you.”

The dog **** sent a thought to come over and reminded Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu.

Because before encountering the phantom demon, the demon king and the queen he met later, 
directly according to the appearance of Shen Lang to transform the five senses.

Both the demon king and the queen still maintain a huge body, and the head is still like a giant 
drum. On the flat “face”, there are five facial features similar to the deep waves.

So it is not very similar, but I can see that it is coming from the sun.



With this preconceived impression, when I saw this person in the morning and the cold autumn, I 
naturally went to find out if it was like a swell, but it was not like it, and I felt a little weird.

Now I get a reminder from the dog god, and I will react.

This is the combination of the two of them!

According to the painting, it is not very similar, and it can be seen what it is.

Combining the essence of two items, I always feel familiar, and I don’t see what it is.

Now this person, that is, clothing, body, appearance, etc., is a combination of Shen Lang and Gao 
Hanqiu.

After the reminder, Shen Lang immediately passed the sacred armor and merged him with the 
image of Gao Hanqiu, and he got a similar look.

Looking at this, their hearts suddenly became clear.

This should not be a super giant of 10,000 meters, perhaps a more powerful phantom demon, just a 
huge palm, but it is a result of its illusion.

It may be embarrassing, or it may be its ontology.

It is judged from being hurt, there will be pain, etc. It is more likely that it is a kind of 
representation of its body, so under the smash of the sword, the fire and the dog god, it will take 
back the magical power and let its body Pull out.

This can also explain why the huge palm left, and the dog **** inside the finger was not taken 
away, but appeared in the air.

Shen Lang sneered: “It is also a phantom demon in the district, still pretending to be a ghost!”



Recognizing that it was just a welcome demon, they all breathed a sigh of relief.

Everything is contrasted.

The demon is more powerful than the general beast god. The last time the demon king, but also a 
group of scorpio demon, entangled everyone, but also Shen Lang locked it up.

The existence of the demon in the demon is to make everyone jealous.

But what has just appeared here is a huge palm. It can hold the two hundred meters in the palm of 
the hand. It is such a real scene that everyone thinks that it will be a super giant who is lying 10,000 
meters.

No matter what race, it is very unbelievable to achieve such a degree.

Therefore, in the battle against each other, it has greatly increased the degree of attention, and it is 
much more powerful than the demon.

Unknown enemies tend to be even more terrible.

Now that it’s just a demon, that’s fine.

The devil has also seen the face, the queen and all the phantom demon family have been face-to-
face, not a great thing.

Even if this is a more powerful phantom demon than the previous demon, there are still obvious 
references.

“Childish! Phantom Demon is like me, nothing is! I am nothing!”

The person who merged Shen Lang and the Alpine Autumn recognized that it was a demon, but 
corrected the difference.



Before coming here, according to the information of Meng Jin, I only know that this is the Tianmo 
Lin, there is the existence of the demon. But for the demon, there is no reliable saying, there are 
many different legends.

It is the stone carving information of the Fuxi, and only a more accurate record of some 
information, such as the Shadow Forest will have the devil.

But what is the classification of the specific demon, what it is, but it is not known.

The previous phantom demon  is also the self-proclaimed devil, or they are not clear.

Now this demon, who claims to be a vain, and sounds more advanced than the phantom demon.

No matter what race, or different branches of the same race, you will praise yourself and even 
belittle others to elevate yourself.

Just like Meng Jin also thinks that their valley is much stronger than the sand country, the owner of 
the sand country is not worthy of being compared with him.

Therefore, this imaginary demon said that the phantom demon is incomparable with him. On the 
one hand, it is indeed stronger than the previous demon. On the other hand, there should be such a 
factor.

In any case, Shen Lang is relieved a lot, don’t be afraid of the control of each other within 10,000 
meters.

If you want to fight hard, just continue to observe.

As they talked a few words, the muddy trees that were held up by the emptiness were returned to 
the ground, and they were in a state of confrontation in the air.

“Hand over the Pearl of Shadows!”

Chapter 2583 - Tianluo

When I heard the shadow of the pearl, Shen Lang’s eyes lit up.



It turned out to be the pearl of the shadow!

This place is the edge of the Shadow Forest. It used to enter the Shadow Forest from here. The 
positioning of the Gate of the Three Realms is not wrong.

And they came here to be random, it is impossible to hide in the ground in advance, or just to the 
top of it hiding.

When they come back, they are also temporary, and it is impossible for the emptiness to hide here in 
advance.

Combined with these analyses, perhaps this illusory, originally on the edge of the Shadow Forest. 
When they came over, they found out, but they didn’t start with them, but waited for them to go in.

When you come normally, dare to go into the shadow forest, it must be a picture, prepared, not 
blindly chaotic. In the dark, the return of the original road is a great possibility.

So this illusory, will be guarding around here, waiting for them to come back.

If they can’t come back, there is no loss to it. Once you come back, it’s possible to gain something 
and return in vain!

As for being able to hide in this underground, it is not too strange to be a giant palm. Because Shen 
Lang has a limited range of perceptions, he has experienced the hands of the barbarians before.

If the other party is more familiar with the environment and can be freely shaped, it is possible that 
God will sneak into the ground without knowing it.

But why is this vain waiting to ambush them here?

With the strength of their outsiders, entering the forest of shadows, the possibility of coming out is 
very small, the possibility of gaining less is better, and the pearl of the shadow can be obtained, not 
to mention.



From this point of view, there is only one possibility, that is, nothingness is even more taboo for the 
Shadow Forest!

Otherwise, with the strength it shows, you can go in and fight the phantom demon, and the direct 
robbing is just fine.

Now, it looks more like waiting for the rabbit on the edge of the Shadow Forest. This time, they will 
also kill their dead horses.

Although this is speculation, it is really possible to combine the big wild five dragons that were 
previously kept outside the funeral dragon valley.

As for the more powerful and illusory, why can’t you enter the Shadow Forest, you don’t know.

Perhaps different demons and sub-branches, there are wars, competition for the territory and the 
like, the phantom demon may not be able to beat the emptiness of the devil, was forced to escape 
into this shadow of the gods do not enter the shadow forest.

After the cost of death and injury, evolution adapted to the shadow forest, and later found the pearl 
of the shadow.

And they should also go out, the news will spread, let the emptiness of the devil want to capture the 
pearl of the shadow.

Shen Lang is a bit regrettable. Although he got a pearl of shadow, he didn’t know what it was, and 
he didn’t know its origins and the grudges behind them.

Perhaps… In the eyes of the Phantom Devils, they are the ones who are looking for nothing. It is no 
wonder that the Queen finally offers the Shadow Pearl directly to redeem the Demon King, and the 
Devil will be so angry.

The illusory sorcerer has a pearl of their shadow, which should come from two aspects.

On the one hand, they suddenly transmitted it, instead of withdrawing along the way. It is obvious 
that they are full of treasures and are in line with speculations.



On the other hand, they talked to the barbarians and said that they “have to work hard” and can 
prove it sideways.

And because the barbarian looked at the shadow of the pearl, Shen Lang only said that “the 
ridiculous land has nothing to gain”, the shadow of the forest is used “the harvest is not 
proportional” “too dangerous, not much harvest” and so on.

If the imaginary sorcerer guesses that they are coming to capture the pearl of the shadow, then these 
words are equivalent to fully identifiable.

“What is the shadow of the pearl?”

All the information and analysis was done quickly in the brain of Shen Lang, and he responded with 
a sly expression on the surface.

“You don’t have to install it, we have nothing to do, and the level of illusion is higher. Your 
expression has proved that you know the pearl of the shadow, and it is possessed.”

The words of the emptiness of the devil are not like exaggeration.

Because the former demon, although it can morph a lot of cockroaches, it can turn the body into a 
huge palm.

The demon king can transform the five senses of Shen Lang. It can instantly merge the image of 
Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu into one.

These are enough to prove that it is not inferior to the phantom demon in this aspect of illusion.

I have confirmed that there are shadow beads on Shen Lang. It is known through expressions, or it 
is not important to swindle him. It is determined that Shen Lang is there, and denying will also 
move them.

“There is no evil, you are not weak, but you have already tried it. Are you sure you have played 
three of us?”



Shen Lang smiled and gestured to the Shadow Forest. “We can also go inside and do it.”

For this temptation, the imaginary demon has no expression reaction.

“I have given you a chance, you have angered me. If you do not seize this opportunity, I will not 
give a third chance!”

When it was talking, the surrounding environment began to change. There was a dark protective 
cover that appeared around it and contracted from those fogs.

That is to say, the first thing that appears is 100 meters away. When they are aware of the waves, 
they have already received within 100 meters.

This should be similar to the existence of an enchantment when it was grasped before, but it has 
been materialized, obviously thicker and stronger.

It seems that the imaginary demon is worried that they will send away the usage treasure. It has 
already been secretly laid out such a shield. The words just spoken are not necessarily to persuade 
them to offer, but to delay the time.

With the shape of the palm before it can be seen hundreds of meters underground  This dark 
protective cover should be like a net, not only above and around, but also underneath.

Put an end to them and send away! Of course, it is also to avoid letting them enter the forest of 
shadows.

This situation appeared, Shen Lang was also slightly surprised, he did not know whether the door of 
the Three Realms could cross this defense.

But knowing that this is a demon, he is still not so worried compared to the 10,000-meter super 
giant. If time permits, you can still try the transmission of the door of the Three Realms.

If you can’t do it, you can hide it through the space of heaven.



“It looks like you haven’t been heavy enough to cut it. You want to hold you apart and you will 
die.”

Shen Lang also carried the sword of the king in his hand and mocked it.

Now this imaginary demon is turned into a look of him and the cold and autumn, and naturally there 
is no damage.

But the huge palm just now is the body of it. The one that was hit was not a finger, but its body has 
been hit by the sword of two people, burned by the heart, and smashed by the dog god. meat.

It is no wonder that the sword of the king penetrated into the “palm” below, which would make it 
have a clear reaction. It should actually be stuck in its body, perhaps the damage of the trunk and 
internal organs.

At the end of the slash, it will be normal.

Chapter 2584 - Sword

The taunting of Shen Lang was just finished, and the dog **** spoke up.

After the dog **** was conquered by Shen Lang, he was very convinced to him. He was 
completely obeying the arrangement of Shen Lang. Especially when there were outsiders, he would 
not interject and support his leadership.

Last time, in order to conquer the old dragon, he even took the initiative to call Shen Lang the 
master.

Now when confronting the enemy, whether it is a powerful enemy or a relatively controllable 
enemy such as a barbarian, they are all represented by Shen Lang. In any case, it will not have a 
better decision than Shen Lang.

But now, it is open.

Finally there is a chance to open it!



“How long can you hold? The body of the chop, you can hide it by illusion, the damage you 
receive, you can hold it hard. But what is the toxin injected into your body?”

Hearing this, Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu are both spirited.

Don’t look at the low-keyness of the dog god. People are a master of the world. If you are not sure, 
you will not say anything unreliable.

When they were fighting, they all saw it. The dog **** entered the “finger” wound and went into 
the “palm”.

At that time, when the toxin was injected, even if the enemy is strong enough, there is no on-the-
spot attack. The longer the drag, the more the luck and the more fighting, the more the attack will 
be!

The dog **** should speak at this moment, it should be sure.

“If you change a form directly, and we continue to fight, the toxins have not yet been distributed. 
But you are adult, then you are talking about delaying time and want to block us. The result…”

Needless to say, behind the dog god.

You know, it has just been dosed according to a 10,000-meter super giant!

If the body is only a few tens of meters and a few hundred meters, the proportion of the injected 
component is much higher and many times higher.

In addition, when the other party delays the time, it is to arrange the protective cover in the dark, 
that is, the continuous operation, only the toxins will flow faster and wider.

In this regard, only the dog **** knows the most.

But actually how to feel, or to see this imaginary individual.



Because in this ancient cold world, a lot of common sense is no longer universal, perhaps these 
demons are immune to toxins.

Therefore, when the sharks mentioned the toxins in the dog god, they immediately paid attention to 
the imaginary demon, and they should pay attention to all the expression changes.

Now the dog **** is talking, a few words down, and a few more seconds.

If there is a toxin attack, it should have a significant reaction!

The result is no discovery!

The emptiness of the devil looks at them because they are like this, and any slight changes in their 
expressions, or no changes, can be analyzed.

But the emptiness of the demon is now presented in the form of Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu.

This is not there, and there will be no real reaction to it. Now even if there is a reaction, it may not 
be true.

“The result is that you are looking for death! Want to delay the time? What benefits can you bring?”

The disdain of the imaginary demon, as if the toxin had no effect on it.

The dog **** has no experience in negotiating. I just said it calmly because I am sure.

As a result, the other party did not care at all, and even did not fear that it would take a little longer 
to continue speaking, which made it stunned.

Because of the strong toxins, the gap is very large every second. If the evil spirits are poisonous, 
even if they are well loaded, they will not delay the time. In one second, it will suffer a loss.

Gao Hanqiu also spoke up, and he laughed with a heroic dry cloud.



“We are all top-level existences, and few enemies can let us work together. Since you are a vain and 
want to fight hard with us, then fight to the end!”

The sword in his hand was crossed, with the momentum of sweeping the army.

Gao Hanqiu’s own blade is no longer needed. Because after reaching the realm of great deities, 
there is no difference in whether he has weapons.

But still keep a sword, is an ordinary sword, it is a status symbol of a sword repair.

But even if it is just an ordinary sword, in his hands, it is not inferior to the sword, it is to let him 
play a more powerful sword.

The battle of just three partnerships reminded him of the semi-finished dragon that had been 
resurrected in the funeral dragon valley and fighting with snow and snow.

The dragons have done it, and the gods have fought before, how about?

The momentum that erupted from the cold autumn at this moment made one of his gas fields 
change, like killing a god, like a supreme mountain!

Shen Lang is naturally passing the sword of the king.

“this is for you!”

The sword of the king is one of the four great artifacts of the ancient times, and its power is 
incomparable.

In fact, in the hands of Shen Lang, you can’t exert your full strength. Basically, you can only have 
two characteristics: size and invincibility.

This is his artifact, and it is too late to transfer to the cold autumn. But it is only for the cold 
autumn, there is no problem.



It is equal to the cold autumn now has the right to use, not ownership, as long as the owner of this 
ownership does not interfere, the cold autumn can be used normally.

It is true that the best state is not achieved, but the sword of the king is still playing a bigger role 
than the Shen Lang in the hands of the cold autumn!

In the relationship of their brothers, there are some things that are understood and there is no need 
for more verbal communication.

For example, Gao Hanqiu’s accomplishments in Kendo have surpassed the previous waves. But he 
read this grace and never mentioned it.

I will not discuss any related aspects of kendo with Shen Lang, that is, to avoid hurting the self-
respect of Shen Lang.

Shen Lang also understands this, and he also sees it because he is not specialized in kendo.

However, since Gao Hanqiu avoided it, he did not take the initiative to talk, so as not to appear 
deliberate.

At this moment, on the eve of a very powerful enemy confrontation, Shen Lang handed over the 
sword of his artifact to the cold autumn, which is tantamount to using action to clarify, admitting 
that the cold autumn is better than him on the kendo.This time they are not allowed to feel guilty, 
but for the cold autumn, it is still a little excited.

This is his accomplishment for hundreds of years, and he is now recognized by his most respected 
stalwart like the teacher.

He will not refrain from resigning anything. Shen Lang will give him the sword of the king. He just 
thinks that he will play and the role can be even greater.

This is for everyone’s safety. If you quit, it may hurt everyone.

Gao Hanqiu quickly picked up the sword of the king.



It is also strange to say that just a long sword has a cold autumn that sweeps the army. At this 
moment, the sword of the king starts, but all the momentum seems to converge!

He didn’t have the state of killing God. He didn’t have the momentum of a mountain, as if… it 
doesn’t exist!

This does not exist, not the existence of the flesh, but it seems that this sword is integrated with 
him, appearing in front of everyone, as if it is just a sword that is waiting for an opportunity, has no 
such person.

Chapter 2585 - War of illusion

This change in the cold autumn has directly made the imaginary demon, obviously more cautious.

For this sword, it still has a deep understanding.

At this time, Shen Lang’s hand has one more thing, which is a water ripple stick.

This thing was taken by the mermaid patriarch, although he could not play the best role, but this 
thing is extraordinary, it was passed down from the ancestors of the Hanze mermaid.

It is the sword of the king that can’t open it!

The dog **** is also ready to fight, it put so much poison, I thought it was a success, can play a key 
role.

I didn’t expect the other party to care at all, let it feel very lost, and must regain face!

The two sides are confrontational, and they are on the verge!

The emptiness of the devil seems to be ready, but it has not seen any obvious changes.

Just at the moment when I was about to start the war, Shen Lang was opening another sentence.

“Wait a minute! The pearl of the shadow you said, is this something?”



When the gaze of the emptiness of the gods attracted the past, he saw a **** ball next to him.

It is staring at it. This is naturally the pearl of the shadow that it wants. The shape is exactly the 
same, but it feels that it is not the pearl of the shadow, let it frown.

If it weren’t for the Pearl of Shadows, this Terran could not be prepared to make almost the same 
thing in advance.

If it is the Pearl of Shadow, there is only one appearance, it seems that no energy can be sensed.

But… Is this the speciality of the Pearl of Shadow?

In the hands of this human race, there will be no reaction. Only in the hands of the demon can the 
effect be achieved?

“You hand it over, I can spare you!”

Between the words, the one that was already approaching, the protective cover, was pulled out for a 
while.

This is his sincerity to show that he really will let them go.

“it is good!”

After Shen Lang agreed, the Pearl of Shadow began to drift slowly toward the emptiness.

The main attention of the imaginary demon is divided into a few points at the moment.

It doesn’t feel so simple, the other party is likely to play tricks, it may be used as a cover, actually 
sneak it!

Therefore, in addition to paying attention to the pearl of the shadow, in order to avoid the other side 
to recover, it is also the most important thing to watch the cold autumn.



The shadow of the pearl is not fast, and the closer it is, the more clearly it can pay attention to all 
the details.

What makes the vain magic wonder is that this pearl of shadow is not only without energy, but it 
seems to be completely transparent!

That is to say, when it is visible to the naked eye, this really has a shadow bead coming over, but it 
goes to induction, but it has nothing but nothing.

This scene is too weird. As a very accomplished illusion, it is of course to be destroyed!

“you wanna die!”

When it used the method of phantom to find out, it was discovered that this is a virtual shadow, a 
thing that deceives its vision!

The reason why it is deceived, besides the other party’s means is too clever, but also because it is 
preconceived, the pearl of the shadow is not controllable by the human race, the more unresponsive 
it is, the more mysterious.

This makes it angry and angry!

“Calm, calm, just try to see you, see if you have really seen the shadow of the pearl, the devil is 
nothing, let me try it out, you have never seen it! You are not afraid of me giving you fake Is it?”

The good attitude of Shen Lang, let the imaginary demon who almost ran away, first stopped, and 
did not attack.

“You see, this time is true. However, since you claim to be more illusory than the phantom demon, 
then of course I have to test you, you can find out which one is true!”

When Shen Lang waved his hand, immediately in the space of the front large film, there appeared 
one after another shadow beads!



These shadow beads are exactly the same as the actual shadow beads. They have been at least 
dozens of time, and they are swimming in the air, surrounded by the emptiness.

Although the cold and cold autumn decided to fight hard, Shen Lang also gave him the sword of the 
king, and he took out the water ripple stick, but he decided to try again.

He is the only one who has witnessed the venom of the poisonous grass in the Dragon Valley. It is 
the dog **** himself, and he does not know the specifics.

He still thinks that since the dog **** has injected a lot of toxins, it is definitely effective. The other 
party is only more powerful and can still survive.

So he decided to delay a little longer and let the toxins play more time.

The first pearl of the shadow that has just been presented is actually projected by the Holy Black 
Technology. Because it will be affected by the environment, when he sends it, it is slowly drifting 
over, so as not to be seen later.

And he is also concerned about the reaction of the emptiness.

The other party does not believe him, he also sees it, and also knows that the high cold autumn 
holding the sword of the king is the key defense object of the other party.

Therefore, in the case that the Pearl of Shadow has not been seen, he has secretly applied the pen 
and made some arrangements.

When the other party is irritated after seeing it, there are already illusions around, and the scenes 
that have been presented are already true and false.

Shen Lang does not give the other party a chance to carefully investigate, and immediately guides 
the other party’s emotions with the pearl of the shadow it cares about.

When he releases dozens of shadow beads in the name of the illusion test, it is the true fantasy of 
Zhengda Bright.



At that moment, when the other party was attracted by these dozens of shadow beads, the 
replacement of the real fantasy was completed.

That is to say, the three waves of Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu, which are seen again by the illusory, 
are no longer true. They have changed.

“Don’t dare to play with me!”

Of course, the emptiness of the emptiness is clearly seen. No one is true. All dozens are used to 
confuse it.

This time, it is really irritating on the one hand, and excited on the other.

Because the first appearance of the virtual shadow, it can be said that the other party may have seen 
the illusion of the shadow of the pearl, and now can illusion dozens of, basically the same, it shows 
that impressed, it is very likely that you really have this thing.

So at this point it wants to catch the waves!

But it immediately found  The two people and one beast that are now seen are fake and illusory!

“The worms are small and dare to show off in front of the ancestors!”

It sneered a little, and his hands waved forward, and all the real illusions that were illusory by the 
pens disappeared.

It can not only be illusory, but also illusion!

But what is a bit of a surprise is that after several of their real illusions have disappeared, the real 
people have disappeared! I didn’t see them when I saw them, as if the entire space now has one.

However, the emptiness of the devil, is not a barbaric reincarnation, the ability to illusion, so that it 
is much more sensitive to the observation of the environment.



And it’s not a panic at all, you can patiently observe all the subtleties.

Immediately it found a problem, the front looks emptiness, but it seems a bit different.

And soon it was judged, and the front seemed to be a mirror reflection!

Chapter 2586 - Virtual mirror

Yes, Shen Lang’s manipulation is not alone.

The black technology projection of the holy armor, together with the real fantasy of the magic pen, 
plus the mirror to illuminate a space, the three layers are accompanied.

So when the projection and the real illusion disappeared, the three of them were actually behind his 
mirror.

From their point of view, you can clearly see the move of the former emptiness.

But when the emptiness of the devil sees them, it is a large space projected by the mirror. If it 
comes, it will enter the mirror world directly!

Everyone was originally in the air, so the situation of mirroring is actually more difficult to 
distinguish, and it can only be judged by the canopy of the trees that land below.

In the case of the illusion, as long as the other party is anxious, it is very likely that they will devote 
themselves to it.

Before Shen Lang, in the devil of the Phantom Demon, he successfully used this trick to trap the 
other side. Now re-apply, I want to see if it can be effective again.

Even if it doesn’t work, it can’t break the mirror, or it can delay a lot of time.

It is a pity that the emptiness is not only more careful, but also more understanding of the 
environment, and very familiar with the illusion.



When it sneaked into the ground, it saw the barbarian attacking the waves!

“This is the illusory mirror that we have lost in the illusory, and it is in your hands! Very good, I 
have to take it back!”

Before the Shen Lang was satisfied, it was the enemy of the emergency, and the barbarians who 
entered the mirror world were annihilated, which would interfere with the impression and make 
people feel that this is a defensive magic weapon.

But just after it was intentionally observed along the illusion, Shen Lang is not saying that it is 
necessary to test its illusionary power?

The natural tendency is different, and then the space in front of the mirror is discovered, and the 
origin of this thing is discovered.

No mirror!

Before Shen Lang was to erase the spirituality of the mirror, naturally I don’t know what it is, I 
don’t know what it is.

Just because it is a mirror-like magic weapon, it can make a mirror world, so it is called a magic 
mirror.

Is the virtual mirror the original name?

If so, you can confirm by listening to the name. This should really be something of the genius.

However, I know that it is not a vain name to be named.

Doesn’t this occupy the moral high ground? This is to take back your own baby, but not to **** 
someone else!

The three of Shen Lang are behind the mirror, and they can see the movement of the emptiness.



But seeing it didn’t come close, obviously not a scam, but really saw the space.

Then it is beginning to recite a few spells!

When it chanting a spell, the eye is looking at the mirror’s direction, and it seems that it really 
wants to summon the mirror back.

Shen Lang’s hands almost shook.

Because this thing is hard to get, the effect is also very good, in case it is really a virtual mirror, it is 
really summoned back by the other party, then it is a big loss.

At this moment, he really had a dim sum, and he wanted to put the mirror away.

But it was stable soon, because he found the mirror to be unaware!

In an instant, he figured it out.

The emptiness of the devil should not be bluffing at this time, and the delay is its time. There is only 
one possibility, that is, the spell that manipulates the mirror is invalid!

As for why it will fail, it is naturally because of his relationship.

Originally, this is spiritual, and the spell is the communication with the mirror. In essence, it is the 
spiritual communication with the mirror.

But the last time he was too spiritual, he wanted to encroach on him, and he was killed by him.

For example, if the mirror is a computer, then the spell is the administrator password; and the last 
time, it is equivalent to formatting it, or canceling the password.

Although he did not reset the password, but the computer is under his control, the password that had 
already been canceled, of course, can no longer be successfully logged in.



When Shen Lang figured it out, it was accompanied by the imagination of the emptiness!

Of course, it also thinks of the same situation. Since the virtual mirror has already reached the hands 
of others, will it still remain as it is?

Has been controlled by others, and then use the magic of the mirror, how can I manipulate it?

If you want to regain control, you must first take back the virtual mirror!

However, in the current situation, let it not dare to care about it. If this one is not careful, it will 
enter the virtual territory of the virtual mirror. At that time, if you want to come out, you must look 
at the wishes of the other party.

And it also saw that the barbarian’s hands just got in and took it, but the ones that came out were 
without arms.

The imaginary demon calmed down, looked at it carefully, and then let the shield come closer.

According to his speculation, these people are still here, that is, after the virtual mirror, but its shield 
forced to come still can be effective.

“Give me the shadow of the pearl and the mirror without any mirror. What benefits do you want, as 
long as there is something in the demon forest, I can give it to you!”

“Come out, this time I am not forcing you. I am talking to you about trading. You are coming to the 
Tianmolin, isn’t it just to get some treasures? I can give you what I want!”

The imaginary magic can’t be hard to come by, and it becomes a two-pronged approach. On the one 
hand, it pushes forward, on the other hand, it changes to attract them to trade.

If it is the beginning, it comes out to talk about the deal. Shen Lang, who has no understanding of 
the Pearl of Shadows, may be replaced by some more practical ones.

But to this extent, may you believe it?



At this moment, the emptiness of the demon feels the response of the other party!

The virtual mirror seems to be approaching directly!

The speed of this approach is much faster than the full-scale approach of its shield. If it does not 
recede, it will soon come to it.

The mirror world was discovered in the front, and it avoids going in, so there is no problem.

But now the mirror world is chasing it directly, and that is to reverse it.

The imaginary demon has to retreat at the same speed.

The direction in which it retreats cannot go to the shadows, and it must be bypassed. And the shroud 
it controls is also rotated with it as the core.

“I have released goodwill as much as possible Don’t force me to kill you!”

The imaginary demon is a little anxious, and it did not expect to be forced to step back by the 
virtual mirror.

It’s just that this virtual mirror can make its imaginary scope show up. The environment here is not 
very big, but at least a hundred meters or so.

If it is going to go around, the speed must be very fast, because if you want to go around, you have 
to circle a circle, and others can continue to defend it as long as they turn around.

There is no such thing as a virtual mirror, but it is also impossible to start, making it very boring.

After a period of retreat, the emptiness of the genius broke out again!

In an instant, the body that originally appeared in the image of Shen Lang and Gao Hanqiu seems to 
have dissipated, and immediately disappeared into the dense fog, and even the dark protective cover 
disappeared instantly!



Before it could be presented on the ground with giant hands, it may have turned into any form of 
existence at this moment, and it is more likely to hide in the thick fog of 100 meters away, waiting 
for the opportunity to move!

Chapter 2587 - King's Power

There was a magic mirror in front, and the three waves were like in the dark, but they were able to 
guess.

Now this emptiness has disappeared, and that is it is in the dark.

And what shape it is embodied in, is far from the scope, and it is impossible to know that it is the 
real body in the dark.

However, Shen Lang does not care.

When dealing with the barbarian before, it has been successfully used. As long as the speed is fast 
enough, when the enemy attacks, the magic mirror will be greeted, and the other party will be 
allowed to enter the mirror world in an instant.

Even if this imaginary demon understands this, it will not count, but it will force it to rush back. 
This is an effect that no other attack or defense can achieve.

Of course, the premise is to be fast enough!

The other side has to go from the front to the back of them, he has to change hands, you can take a 
lot of calm. But if it is behind him, or if you have already lurked under your feet, it will be much 
harder to use the mirror again.

Not only Shen Lang, Gao Hanqiu and the dog god, can think of this, everyone is also very vigilant.

Especially in the cold autumn, holding the sword of the king, he is actually a little bit tempted, and 
wants to show it.



This is like a car with superb skills. Even if you reach the realm of the car god, you will want to try 
it if you have never seen a car that has never been opened.

For a moment, there was an inexplicable gust of wind, and I have already felt the fierceness of it 
before I arrived!

This gust of wind is a comprehensive coverage, in all directions, even in the direction of the mirror!

All three immediately understand that this is the attack of the emptiness, and all the squalls are its 
illusion, the scope of the wind cover is its body, it can appear anywhere at any time!

In this case, it is not so easy to capture it.

For example, the mirror, in the direction of the opposite, if its body does not go in, just a burst of 
attack into it, there is no harm.

“open!”

The first shot of Gao Hanqiu, the sword of the king who had already been ready to go, swiftly 
waved out in his hand!

In an instant, the sword of the king went out to the front and opened a large space. It was curved 
out, and in the place where the blade was not yet drawn, there was a sword and a step forward. !

His sword is equal to the main attack on the front of a large circle, and then the swordsman flies out 
and draws directly to the rear. The attack also reached three hundred and sixty degrees!

The opponent’s attack is a globular all-round attack, and the sword of the high cold autumn is equal 
to the ball, and all of them are cut.

In this case, no matter which aspect of the emptiness, you can encounter a blow.

Of course, this only covers a relatively large scope, and can not cover all of them. For example, if 
the body of the emptiness is lurking in the corner, then it will not be attacked.



However, the sword of Gao Hanqiu has already produced an extremely powerful momentum. The 
fierce wind has been firmly suppressed without being close.

If the imaginary demon wants to continue to attack in the same way, it has already unloaded the 
momentum and needs to make changes.

The dog **** is still very clever. Since the cold autumn has been attacked in advance, it will be 
surrounded by defense.

It is a lot of stinger vines that burst out and spit out above and below. If the other side wants to 
sneak from below or in the air, it will pass it.

Shen Lang is calculating the time!

That’s right, time.

Starting with the use of magic mirrors is a strategy of Shen Lang. He did not expect the mirror to be 
able to shut down the illusion of the genius. After all, the phantom demon was already a lucky 
component.

But it can delay the time, the purpose is to let the toxins further attack!

At the beginning, apart from the dark shield, there was no genius, and there was no attack. The use 
of power was still a lot less.

However, under the persecution of the Mirror, the disappearance of the whole body disappeared, 
and now the all-round offensive is further exercise.

The calculation time, on the one hand, is to calculate how long the toxin is injected, and on the other 
hand, to see how long it takes to end after it disappears.

After the toxin is injected, it is precious that they are precious for one second now, of course, it is 
also excellent for many and a half seconds.

The time of patience can reflect the effect of toxins on it!



If it really has no effect, then in this day, in the magic forest, the emptiness of the demon is more 
home-court advantage, and their race age, time, and certainly longer, not to race against time.

To put it simply, if it is not poisoned by injuries, it should be a patient delay, and it will be 
impatience and weakness.

Now, it was that it quickly couldn’t help but started the attack in the form of a gusty wind.

As a result, Shen Lang concluded that it was poisoned, and the impact of toxins on it has become 
more and more obvious, so let it not dare to neglect.

“Nothing, you still want to continue? Do you think this will hold me?”

With two attacks and one defense, Shen Lang began a verbal attack.

“You have been poisoned very deeply! Only we can save you! You want the pearl of the shadow, 
but you also need to have a life!”

When you heard the waves, the dog **** could not help but burst into a roar!

It was originally full of confidence, but did not expect the other party to show that it was not 
poisoned at all, making it sullen and depressed.

Now the analysis of Shen Lang makes it regain confidence.

“I will only give you a chance! Do you want to die? If you want to die, be honest! To be the shadow 
of the pearl, you can exchange sincerity, I am very negotiable.”

Both threatened and attracted.

Continue to fight, you may die, and you may lose both, but there is absolutely no win-win result.



If you give up, you can solve the toxins, ensure that your life is not worrying, and then through the 
transaction, you may be able to change what you don’t need  to the most needed.

The key is that these words are said, and after a few seconds, the toxins spread further!

There is no verbal response to the emptiness, but Shen Lang can guess that it is definitely entangled.

Gao Hanqiu is not just a blow. After a blow, he has already started the second wave of attacks. With 
the sword of the king, he has created a powerful sword net, covering the front space!

Although this time can not guarantee the back, but there is also a mirror world in the mirror can be 
blocked.

He is also an additional division after just a full-scale attack.

The sword of the king, under the application of the cold autumn, it is really a stone-shattering effect, 
directly let the violent wind that has not yet dissipated, and got a further suppression!

“How can I trust you?”

The voice of the imaginary demon sounded up, and it was actually sent out from the ground, that is, 
the ground hundreds of meters that had just been lifted by the sky.

Chapter 2588 - Strategy

It seems that the all-round hurricane attack is a scorpion of it, a temptation to see how they fight 
back.

In fact, all are just the power of attack, and its body is not in it.

Now its voice has spread, and it is also on the entire large ground, and it is impossible to determine 
where it is.

“You don’t believe me, it doesn’t matter, but you have to trust your strength, how long can you 
last?”



Shen Lang said in an understatement: “Don’t forget, the mirror is in my hands, the pearl of the 
shadow is in my hands, do you still pay enough attention to me? Also feel that you can grab it?”

“…”

The emptiness of the heavens was immediately silenced.

It is not clear about the origins of these outsiders, but it is simply not enough to look at two people 
and one beast.

Whether they are directly getting news, or what people are behind them, they are just a group of 
people working.

So in its view, it would be the hand to come, but I did not expect it to be turned over in the gutter.

No matter whether it is a positive battle or a battle in illusion, others will not fall.

And as this sentence says, they can win the mirrorless, can get the shadow of the pearl, is it really 
luck?

So can’t you explain their strength?

If you want to shun the enemy again, then you are really looking for death!

In fact, when it was blocked in the mirror space, it had changed its tone, but it was only in the tone. 
Once the other party gave them these two things, it would naturally not stop.

But now it’s different. The other party has already determined that it has a toxin, and it is not afraid 
of it at all, then it can no longer bluff, and can not delay.

“I believe in you, since you also said, this is what you have taken. These two things are 
fundamentally our illusory, and should be returned to us.”

“Do you think it is possible?” Shen Lang sneered.



Everyone knows that it is impossible.

“So, what do you want? I don’t want your destiny, I don’t want your other gains, I only need these 
two things. What do I need to pay!”

The emptiness of the devil, perhaps because the influence of toxins is getting bigger and bigger, 
maybe it is a bit impatient, quite a bit of direct money.

This allowed Shen Lang to open the conditions, and Shen Lang couldn’t really open it, because he 
didn’t know the specific role of the Pearl of Shadows. The virtual mirror was still known because he 
went in and used it.

If he is allowed to open the conditions, he does not know what the emptiness can give.

However, since this is a negotiation, it is also a delay. The longer the time is answered, the better it 
will be for them.

The emptiness of the devil also understands this, so it will be so direct.

“I want to hear what you can give me?”

The imaginary demon is listening to the unhappy, the other side has a virtual mirror, the shadow of 
the pearl, and naturally understand the situation inside the Tianmo Lin, then this pretense is not 
known, it is procrastination time.

However, there is no way at this time, only to respond.

“What do you want, I can give it!”

“Are you sure?” Shen Lang asked one.

“I am sure!” The emptiness is impatient.



“Then you come out first, I want your memory!”

Shen Lang finally opened his own conditions.

nonsense! If you want something, you must first know what is there, or else you will be completely 
casual.

He didn’t have the chance to get the memory of the Devil’s Demon King, and he didn’t have the 
chance to get the Queen’s memory. Even because it was too fast, even the memory of the Devil’s 
Devil was not captured.

If you can get the memory of this emptiness, then you can have a general understanding of this day.

“You dream!”

For the emptiness of the devil, this is an offense, it is equivalent to saying that it is its life!

Where are the conditions to remember?

As this sentence is said, it also gave up the peace talks with Shen Lang and changed it to a direct 
attack!

The large amount of mud trees that had flown up and down before, flew again!

It’s like someone dug a big pit of a few hundred meters and smashed all the dirt together.

Just in the conversation between Shen Lang and the following land, Gao Hanqiu is ready.

The possibility of negotiating the talks is extremely small, and he is ready to continue fighting.

Therefore, at this moment, the other side violently launched the attack, the sword of the high-cold 
autumn king sent first, and at an invincible speed, smashed out from the top down!



This sword with a sigh of breath, the impact of an instant burst, the strong hit the center of the fly 
below the soil,

This large piece of soil with a radius of 100 meters has only just flew up a few meters, and it was 
instantly bombed into an explosion, splashing out around!

“No use, do you want to go in?”

At the moment when the sword was released in the cold autumn, Shen Lang spoke and turned to the 
mirror.

The incarnation of the emptiness of the devil at this moment is simply invisible and colorless, 
almost approaching their heads.

The reason why there is no attack first is to be afraid of stunned snakes, ready to use the momentum 
of the whole ground below to attract their attention. When it comes close to the shot, the enemy will 
not be able to defend and escape.

As a result, with the words of Shen Lang, the emptiness of the mirror has come to the front of it, 
and the light is shining in the air. The imaginary demon who is about to approach, almost slammed 
into it.

This sudden change, so that it can not take care of the other, quickly and quickly left.

If this is not stopped, the other party will definitely wait for an opportunity to fight back, then the 
trouble is big.

As a result, Shen Lang did not counterattack, so he allowed it to hide – after all, it was invisible.

“You confess! If you still want to struggle with me, it will only be the last chance, not for you. By 
then, I will not only want your memory, but also your life!”

Shen Lang has a bitter look, and he doesn’t look up. It just just turned around.



But the imaginary genie who just fled, but did not dare to think so, it always felt that he was now 
stared at, and felt that the other party could fully know its specific location.

This makes it hurry to continue to dodge.

But at this time, a wave of water ripples in the first step blocked its way, let it hit it up!

Of course, it is still Shenlang There is a cold and autumn as a pioneer, plus a dog **** to cover, 
Shen Lang does not need to distract to go to the enemy, you can use more thoughts in the analysis 
and thinking.

With this illusion, how can it be so easy to show its hiding place?

This land has been hidden once, and it was attacked by him. How can it be hidden for a second 
time?

In terms of combination, this can only show that this is intentional. Deliberately use the following 
huge attacks to attract their attention, the real purpose will naturally be to attack them in the 
opposite direction!

Therefore, he calmly used the magic mirror to block the past.

This can be analyzed, of course, it can be analyzed that the other party can also avoid it, so I made a 
preliminary judgment and made an attack on the most likely escape in advance with a water ripple 
stick.

Chapter 2589 - Nowhere to escape

Originally, with the power of the emptiness, it is very difficult for Shen Lang to hit it with a 
corrugated rod. Even if it hits, it can be blocked by it.

But this time, because of the emptiness of the devil, it was almost an invisible attack of emptiness, 
but it was still put out of a cage in advance, and he was helplessly retreating.

At this time, there was a ripple of energy waiting for it to make it evasive and directly hit it.

In an instant, the invisible emptiness of the demon, was hit in the air.



It shows the appearance of the body, or the incarnation of the combination of Shen Lang and Gao 
Hanqiu.

The cold autumn that just opened the bottom completely, I also understood that I was doing the 
most superficial work. The enemy would throw the hundreds of meters of land as a stone, and it was 
very powerful but it was difficult to hit them.

Therefore, even if his sword is powerful, it is like a performance, and it has no decisive role.

And his observation of the surroundings is not stopped for a while, and the reaction of Shen Lang, 
he is also completely clear.

In the early attack of the water corrugated rod, the moment that the imaginary magic is played, the 
sword of the king of the cold autumn is also coming!

This time, he is not willing to come!

He is not trying to prove that he is stronger than Shen Lang, but to prove that he has not insulted 
this artifact!

If you can’t defeat the enemy with a common long sword, it’s still okay. However, Shen Lang gave 
him the sword of the king of the artifact, but it did not work for two consecutive attacks. It was not 
the problem of the sword, but his problem.

So this blow is not so loud, but the speed is even faster than the previous two!

It is impossible to see the sword shadow at the scene, even if it is like the sword of the king, it is too 
late to draw a trace of the afterimage, and it has already slashed the sword to the side of the 
emptiness!

The imaginary demon is almost violently jumping.

When did it have such a dangerous battle?



This time it has been exhausted, carefully lurking, prepared in advance, and various means to 
display one by one, but still suppressed everywhere!

I have just set up a bureau, and the other party has entered it. How can it be calculated?

I almost slammed into the territory of nothingness, and it has already left it with a lingering fear. It 
has just been successfully withdrawn and has not had time to breathe a sigh of relief.

Although this wave of attacks is not terrible, it is also making it visible.

A hit that can be killed right away!

The cold autumn that took the sword of the king was originally the one that made it the most taboo. 
It just threw a few hundred meters on the ground, in order to attract the firepower of this strongest 
output.

Unexpectedly, the other party’s ability to adapt is so strong, the speed of the transfer is so fast, and 
soon the sword has come to its side, so that it wants to dodge, it is too late.

The most important thing is that because it is fast enough, even if it is invisible at this time, it will 
be stabbed!

But who is it?

Nothing is evil!

Their greatest advantage is not illusion, but nothingness!

Invisibility is only a form of nothingness. It is also a form of any form. The most important thing is 
that it can be quickly dispersed, just like the avatar!

This is the reason why it suddenly disappeared before it disappeared.



This moment is also the body of the body that is incarnate in the waves, the cold and the autumn, 
and it is too late to want to dodge. But it directly spreads the body as nothing, showing the strongest 
side of the emptiness.

In this way, it does not need to dodge, because it has been “scattered”, the sword of the king who 
has already stabbed, that is, the space in which it was originally located.

This sword seems to be unremarkable, but it allows the cold and cold autumn to contain the fastest 
speed, and it can penetrate into the other’s body.

The result is that at the moment of penetration, the other’s body disappeared directly!

This made the cold autumn almost a little depressed.

However, in the end, Gao Hanqiu is the ancestor of the ancestors, and the combat experience is very 
rich. Although the level of his enemies in the battle was far from comparable, the experience can be 
analogized.

Just the emptiness of the devil has not been manifested. It was manifested by the attack of Shen 
Lang, and the moment that he was attacked disappeared again, so it is very likely that it was hidden 
again.

Invisible words are just invisible, not non-existent. As long as the speed is fast enough, you can 
continue to attack it before invisible!

Therefore, he did not feel discouraged, but let the sword of the king cover the piece and completely 
strangle it!

“I said, it’s useless, you can’t escape!”

When Shen Lang spoke, the eyebrows were light and locked in one place!

The scattered imaginary demon, in the direction of avoiding the magic mirror and the sword of the 
king, just re-condensed, the body has not yet manifested, and it was hit by the light!



This is to directly pierce its body through a hole, and this blow directly makes it visible.

“How can you find me!”

It couldn’t help but scream, and it was incapable of killing it. It was impossible to kill, but it was 
impossible to find it, but why the other side could hurt it!

In fact, according to its incarnation method, it really has this effect, just like the sword of the king 
who just had a cold autumn, but it is stabbed.

But the means of Shen Lang are too many!

Just after hitting it through the water ripple rod, there was a cold autumn top, and he did not 
participate directly, but focused on the field of God that had been distracted.

The field of God wants to lock this emptiness, and naturally does not agree, because it will kill the 
snake, as long as the other party leaves the scope, it will not affect.

But Shen Lang is only used to observe through the field of God!

Because the fog affects all aspects, it is far worse. It is extremely difficult to capture the traces of 
the other party, and the emptiness is unpredictable and fast.

Those who have worked just now are all a pre-judgment attack achieved through analysis.

The use of the realm of God is tantamount to making a great blessing. Within this range, any 
fluctuations are detectable.

It is not easy for him to shackle the emptiness, but it is much simpler to find it. The words in his 
mouth are spoken in advance, because they are sure.

Shenguang is already ready.



When the illusionless re-condensation, there is a change there, with energy fluctuations, even if it is 
still invisible.

Shen Lang directly attacked the past with Shenguang, which is to let it not have the opportunity to 
disperse again.

After the trauma, just like the impact of the water rippled stick, let it appear.

Gao Hanqiu just missed a hit, but regarded it as invisible. He was strangling the blockade and found 
that the other party had shifted direction and was captured by Shen Lang.

This made him admire, but also once again, the sword was sealed!

Chapter 2590 - I am willing to trade

The sword of the king of the cold autumn once again quickly reached the imaginary demon, and 
sealed the road around it!

This time, he was even more rigorous, and the previous one-shot defeat was successful, and he 
realized that he could not only be fast.

But at this moment, the imaginary demon is once again turned into a smoke!

When the sword of the king smashed the past, it also killed an empty, blocked, that is, a little 
smoke, there is no effect at all.

There was still a faint smile on Shen Lang’s face, and he was not in a hurry.

“Do you still want to escape? I can catch you once, you can catch you twice, three times, you are 
struggling in vain, it will only make your toxins attack faster and more serious!”

“You didn’t force the attack, but you were at large, because you realized this, and you can’t hold it 
anymore?”

The words of Shen Lang seem to be speaking to the air.



The imaginary demon has been incarnate and scattered around, but it is still in this film, still 
knowing this, just in a way that others don’t understand.

Specifically, how to do it, I don’t know for a while, but Shen Lang decided that it was listening and 
looking for opportunities.

After saying these words, it is actually a little bit of time passed, and the influence on the imaginary 
demon has deepened.

“Revisit the conditions!”

The imaginary demon appeared again, but this time it was on a tree 100 meters away!

In the time when Shen Lang spoke, it was already far away and found a safe distance.

Although it does not know how Shen Lang found its clues, it is also possible to guess a general, so 
naturally opened the distance.

Now the distance of about 100 meters is already on the edge of their reflection, even if it can affect 
it, the effect is much weaker.

This distance from the cold autumn will also give it a more relaxed escape.

“Wait!”

Shen Lang immediately sent a message to Gao Hanqiu.

Once again, the failure of Gao Hanqiu felt that his face was damaged. Naturally, he had to sigh with 
relief. This time, he will definitely break out the most powerful blow he has learned in his life.

However, Shen Lang does not want to kill the imaginary devil now. This is still valuable. It is 
necessary to get the value and say it, but you can’t use it.



And compared to the fact that they are only attacking, the other party has been scarred and bruised, 
and it is even more without face.

“What conditions?”

Shen Lang looked at each other and expressed a kind smile. Gao Hanqiu received the sword of the 
king and did not attack. The dog **** was also guarding.

All of this expresses his sincerity to talk about conditions.

The emptiness of the genius is not good, because its entire body is now illusory, so no matter 
whether it is a big hole that was bombed before, or the body that the **** of light wears, it is not 
reflected.

But there is no doubt that these injuries have also affected it, and it is the culprit that has caused its 
state to fall sharply.

It has no domineering and confidence after the appearance of the show, and it has to be talked 
about.

“You, the Terran, come to the Tianmo Lin, naturally to find some treasures. Although I don’t know 
what you need, you let me say, I can’t say what you need, but I can give all my collections. You 
look at it, just pick it!”

In order to express more quickly and save more time, the imaginary **** did not pass the dictation, 
but directly transmitted this meaning.

Then, after they finished thinking, they sent another idea.

This paragraph is not what it has to say, but a small section similar to memory.

It is the thing in the treasure house of its collection.

Even if it’s just a small clip that flashes past, it can be seen that almost all of the high-quality things 
can be collected by the imaginary demon.



There are three categories, one is the Ling mine class, similar to the essence of the heavens and the 
earth; the other is the plant class, which is the eternal medicinal material of the celestial body; and 
some, it should be within the level of many beasts. Dan and the like.

These are presented together and indeed are a huge asset.

This should not be a collection of it, it may be the devil of the emptiness, this is the collection of the 
whole family of the emptiness.

Of course, it may also be because of the different life spans. This may be just a collection of 
personal accumulations for a long time.

It shows these things, that is, to show its “financial power”, perhaps the same two can’t move them, 
but all of them are put out, there will always be a group that can impress them.

“These things should be all your family’s request. As long as you leave me the mirrorless and 
shadow beads, other things, whatever you pick, the number is also free to take, I have nothing to 
say!”

“If you want to say something about my memory, my life, and so on, then we all can only be a 
deadly battle!”

“You just have two things, but you also saw it, you can’t kill me. But I can hide and kill you!”

These words are transmitted continuously and with strong emotions.

Today should be a tragedy that it does not know how long it has not been encountered, and it has 
made it unbearable.

But for the pearl of the shadow, in order to recover the virtual mirror, it must be calm, to bow, to be 
able to get back through the transaction, and always have a lot of life.

Shen Lang smiled and said: “I think these things are really a little bit useful, but my appetite is not 
so small.”



“If you have been trading with me peacefully from the beginning, you have already left here with 
the Pearl of Shadows, and I am leaving with your things. But you want to kill us, this is not so good. 
Account!”

“What do you want to be?”

If it is not true that the toxin is getting worse and worse, why is it that this head is low?

Now the other party is holding it and wants to make it more conditions, making it very 
uncomfortable.

“I said, I only want your memory, I don’t want your life. I want your memory, not to deal with you, 
just want to know more about Tianmo Lin. Don’t worry.”

Shen Lang said it well  but no one can believe his words.

When the imaginary devil decides how to respond to the swell, suddenly his face changes.

Then Shen Lang heard a word, coming from the direction of the Shadow Forest.

“You have to remember to say it! Do you want to know about Tianmo Lin? I am willing to trade 
with you. As long as you take the life of this emptiness, I am willing to give you memories!”

This voice is the voice of the Devil of the Phantom Devil!

When they came out, they thought about staying here for a long time, and would not attract the 
phantom demon.

After all, this is only on the edge of the Shadow Forest, and the Devil is still likely to find it.

I didn’t expect it to come, and it came so soon!
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