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Chapter 1.Me,A flame,got a system 

“I’ve reincarnated?” 

Lin Yan woke up.Right after,a large amount of information went into his mind.He 
seemed to have obtained the information when he was crossing overAfter going over 
it,Lin Yan couldn’t help but take a deep breath.He really had reincarnated.This was no 
longer the world he was familiar with.It was a vast and boundless continent surrounded 
by Gods! 

This continent was also called the Continent of the Gods!There were as many gods as 
stars in the sky.These Gods support churches on the mainland,establish kingdoms,and 
gather believers to enhance their divine power.Therefore,on this continent,there were 
also extremely large and small countries.There were not only humans but also a large 
number of weird races.Dwarves,goblins,elves,orcs,underground people,and even 
dragons,giants,and other legendary creatures! 

However,human beings were the most powerful force in the Continent of the Gods.They 
were the race that occupied the largest part of the continent!Because of this,mankind 
was the Gods’main object of contention! 

“This world is wonderful!”Lin Yan couldn’t help but feel overjoyed that he came to such a 
world 

Before crossing,he was an orphan and a genius.He had become a billionaire before 
graduating from university,but he didn’t like an overly plain life.And this world was just 
as he dreamt! 

After clarifying the situation in this world,Lin Yan was going to take a look at his body.At 
this time,he realized that his physical condition seemed a bit wrong.Immediately 
afterward,he immediately knew the source of the error’F*ck’Lin Yan cursed inside 

He found that he had become a fire!Yes,a fire!A gradually extinguishing wildfire!If this 
trend continued,he would soon die out! 



If you looked around,you would find that in the wilderness,the flames above a few 
pieces of deadwood were moving about abnormally.At the top of the flames,there 
seemed to be a small face! 

“Would you look at this?I,Lin Yan,a genius,a self-made billionaire under the age of 
20.Some trash can reincarnate to become Royal Princes and Nobles.They can also get 
an awesome system.I have reincarnated!I became a fire!What’s more,a fire that is about 
to go out!” 

Lin Yan was extremely speechless’Even if I became a fire,shouldn’t I be a fire that’s not 
about to be extinguished!’Lin Yan looked broken.He had already understood the 
situationThere were no dead branches or dried leaves.Everything was green grass and 
trees.In other words,after the dead branches sustaining him were burnt,he would be put 
out.Then GG! 

“Other people receive a cheat when they reincarnate.Where is my cheat?”Lin Yan 
shouted”Ding,the system is activating…”at that time,a wonderful voice said out of 
nowhereFor Lin Yan,this voice was indeed wonderful!’The system is finally here!’ 

He,Lin Yan,was a wildfire with a system! 

Right after,the system sounded,”Ding,the system has activated.” 

In Lin Yan’s vision,a transparent panel appeared【Host:Lin Yan 

Flame core level:Rank 1 Wildfire 

Number of Flame Layers:3 

Maximum temperature:500 degrees 

Evolution points:0 

Energy points:20 

Current income:2 points per second 

Current consumption:1 point/sec 

Skills:Berserk Burning,Eye of Detection 

Others:None】 

“This is my status?”While Lin Yan was looking at his status window,he then received 
information from the systemThrough this information,Lin Yan understood the origin and 
usage of this system.This system was formed by Lin Yan’s mind fusing with some 



special energies during his reincarnation.It was specially designed to serve Lin 
YanThere was no system A.I.in this system.The system was also very simple.Lin Yan 
could obtain different energy points by burning different objectsEnergy points represent 
the energy that Lin Yan could control.The more energy points,the longer Lin Yan could 
burn and the more prosperous he could be!For example,Lin Yan now burnt a few dead 
branches and was earning 2 energy points per secondHowever,while Lin Yan burnt,he 
would also consume certain energy points.It’s just that income was greater than 
expenditureAfter acquiring the system,he would not die out even if the dead branches 
burned out,as long as the energy points he had were not consumedIf Lin Yan burnt 
some special substances,he could also gain evolution points.Swallowing other flames 
could allow him to gain a lot of evolution pointsLin Yan could also exchange energy 
points for evolution points,but the exchange rate would continue to increase as his level 
increased.And through evolution points,Lin Yan could increase the level of his flame 
core.As long as there were enough evolution points,Lin Yan could evolve infinitely! 

“Ding,the newbie gift package is being issued…” 

“Ding,the newbie gift package has been distributed.Congratulations.You get 1,000 
energy points,50 evolution points,30%water resistance,virtual godhead,and 100 cubic 
meters of exclusive storage space,”The system sounded 
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Chapter 2. Are you looking for death 

“What is a virtual godhead?” Lin Yan asked softlyAfter receiving the newbie gift bag, Lin 
Yan “saw” a transparent pyramid-shaped object on his flame core. However, this thing 
didn’t seem to be activated yet. There was no movement 

Lin Yan put it aside and looked at his status. Now, he had over a thousand energy 
points and fifty evolution points. At the bottom of the skill bar, a new column was added

【Resistance: 30% water resistance.】 

Water-resistance could reduce Lin Yan’s energy consumption by 30% on rainy days. 
Yes, Lin Yan could also burn in the rain, but the energy consumption was extremely 
high! 

Lin Yan decided to spend his evolution points【Flame Core Level has been upgraded 

successfully. 10 evolution 

points consumed. Successful upgrade to Rank 2 Wildfire.】 

【Flame Core Level has been upgraded successfully. 20 evolution 

points consumed. Successful upgrade to Rank 3 Wildfire.】 



Reaching Rank 4 Wildfire required 30 evolution points. Lin Yan’s evolution points were 

insufficient. But after upgrading, Lin Yan’s status changed greatly【Host: Lin Yan 

Fire Core Level: Rank 3 Wildfire 

Number of Flame Layers: 3 

Maximum temperature: 700 degrees 

Evolution Points: 20 

Energy Point: 1026 

Current income: 1/sec 

Current consumption: 2/sec 

Skill: Berserk Burning, Eye of Detection 

Resistance: Water resistance 30% 

Item: Virtual godhead (not activated) 

Others: None】 

After reaching Rank 3 Wildfire, Lin Yan’s consumption increased and his income had 
decreased. The reason for this was very simpleThe temperature of the Rank 3 Wildfire 
was even higher, it burned even more vigorously. Those withered branches were about 
to be scorched in the blink of an eyeSomething struck him, Lin Yan took the initiative to 
shrink the flame, reducing his consumption. Even though he still had more than a 
thousand energy points, if he did not receive any income, he wouldn’t be able to hold on 
for an hour even if he contracted the flameLin Yan activated his skill, Eye of Detection. 
His vision increasedThe place he was in was a boundless wasteland where no human 
beings could be seenThe wilderness was covered in lush vegetation and was home to 
many poisonous insects and vipers. There was not a trace of human activity. Lin Yan 
discovered that there were still some dead branches several dozen meters away from 
himHowever, Lin Yan was not happy to discover these withered branchesAs a genius, 
Lin Yan’s head spun rapidlyEven if he moved to burn the dead branches, they would 
merely last for at least a few more minutesHe couldn’t even solve the problem of his 
survival, so what was there to talk about evolution! 

“Why don’t we have a wildfire burning the plains!” Lin Yan said to himselfThis was his 
style. If he wanted to do it, he would do it! 

Yes, it was surrounded by grass and trees, and now it looked like it was spring and 
summer. The vegetation grew very luxuriously, but so what! 



Lin Yan looked at his status window. The Berserk Burning skill! 

This skill allowed Lin Yan to instantly increase the temperature by several times and 
burn rapidly! 

Although he would consume quite a bit of energy, Lin Yan’s benefits would be far 
greater than his consumption as long as the fire spread! 

“Awoo!” 

Just as Lin Yan was planning to start a wildfire, a black-haired beast that looked a bit 
like a wolf walked closer. Raising its hind leg, it prepared to pee on the small flame that 
Lin Yan had shrunk into! 

“This fellow has chosen a very good position.” 

Lin Yan’s energy points were limited and he was planning a wildfire to start as a prairie 
fireTherefore, he did not intend to waste his energy points to compete with this wild wolf. 
He used his “legs” and moved a bit to the side. Yes, he was a fire that could move by 
itself”Ao!” 

Seeing Lin Yan move, the wolf lowered its head curiously and looked at Lin Yan. Its 
eyes were filled with doubt. It was probably wondering why the flame was moving by 
itselfAfter looking at it for a few seconds, the wolf didn’t understand what was going on, 
so it withdrew its head and moved to the side. It raised its head and retreated again. 
Looking at its appearance, it was prepared to wipe Lin Yan out”F*ck!” 

Lin Yan was furiousOriginally, he didn’t want to fight this animal, but in the end, it had to 
push itself further, right? 

Lin Yan didn’t hesitate any longer and activated the Berserk Burning Skill”Bang!” 

The flames immediately shot up and even emitted a muffled explosionThat wild wolf 
was instantly engulfed by flames! 

“Awoo!” 

The wolf cried out in pain, rolling on the ground, but it was unable to extinguish the 
flames because Lin Yan had already jumped onto its body, catching and burning itThe 
wild wolf ran about, but it was uselessIt also brought flames everywhere, igniting a few 
scattered branches, but it didn’t cause a large fireNot long after, the wolf was burnt to 

ashes【You have burnt a wild wolf, evolution points +2】 the system notification 

soundedLin Yan saw that this wave of Berserk Burning had consumed over a hundred 
energy points. However, the reward he received was over two hundred points, which 
was equivalent to a net profit of one hundred energy points! 



Apart from that, he also obtained two points of evolution! 

“As expected, burning constantly is the greatest path of evolution.” 

This wild wolf gave Lin Yan hope 

“Now, let’s start a wildfire to burn the plains!” 

Chapter 3: The fire burned for three days 

Chapter 3. The fire burned for three days 

Lin Yan suddenly scurried to a patch of dense grass. 

Under the heat of several hundred degrees, the nearby grass quickly turned yellow and 
burned. 

However, if he wanted to start a prairie fire, it was far from enough. He couldn’t even 
completely ignite this piece of grass! 

Lin Yan waited patiently. 

Dozens of seconds later, he saw the grass wave in the distance. 

The wind came! Moreover, it’s a gale! The time has come! 

The wind would only take ten seconds to reach Lin Yan. 

“Let’s begin!” 

Lin Yan activated his Berserk Burning Skill. 

“Boom!” 

Following that, a small flame shot up a few meters high. 

There was a muffled explosion. 

The small flame burst into a pillar of fire, completely igniting the grass and clumps 
where Lin Yan was. Then, he quickly spread to the side. 

“Bigger, bigger!” 

Lin Yan used up more energy, increasing the fire. The consumption of energy points 
had reached over ten points per second. 



At this rate of consumption, a thousand points of energy would burn for less than a 
hundred seconds 

However, with such a large amount of fire, the energy points were rapidly advancing. 

His income could be used up! 

But the balance of payments was no longer Lin Yan’s goal. He used all the energy 
points he earned to activate the Berserk Burning Skill, and after a short period, the fire 
had already ignited all the plants and vegetation around him. Then, the wind arrived. 

This was the reason why Lin Yan did not hesitate to increase the fire. 

Only by increasing the intensity of the fire to the maximum before the strong wind 
arrived would he be able to use this strong wind to start a wildfire and complete his 
original accumulation of energy points! 

“Boom!” 

A strong wind blew, and flames began to spread wildly. 

Lin Yan walked through the burning flames, increasing the temperature of the 
surrounding flames. 

Under the Berserk Burning Technique, the temperature of the surrounding flames was 
too high. Regardless of whether it was the verdant grass or the sturdy trees, they could 
not stop the flames from spreading! 

The wind helped the fire spread! 

Soon, the flames in the wilderness burned in groups. Then, it burned into a line and 
quickly spread in the direction of the wind. 

It was unknown how large this wasteland was, and there were quite a few poisonous 
bugs and vipers in the wilderness. 

【You burned a poisonous bug, evolution point +0.5.】 

【You burned a poisonous snake, evolution point +1.】 

As the fire spread, the poisonous bugs and vipers that did not have time to escape were 
continuously burned to death. The sound of evolution continuously sounded. 

【You burned a Spirit Heart Grass, evolution point +1.】 



Occasionally, Lin Yan would burn some medicinal plants that had special effects, and 
he would be able to obtain evolutionary points. 

As for the energy points, although he could not receive the notification, Lin Yan could 
see that the energy points rising. 

Every second, the energy points that Lin Yan was able to obtain reached a few dozen 
points. Moreover, this value was constantly increasing. 

Lin Yan’s consumption was also increasing, but his income was far greater than his 

consumption. 

“Continue, burn this wasteland!” 

Lin Yan looked at the continuously beating evolution points and energy points on the 
panel. It was full of energy. 

In just over an hour, Lin Yan had accumulated enough evolutionary points to raise the 
flame core to Rank 4 Wildfire. 

Although the consumption of wildfire increased after the level of wildfire increased, the 
temperature also increased, and the speed at which the wildfire spread in the 
wilderness also increased. 

Lin Yan kept scurrying around the edge of the fire. He could use up energy points to 
strengthen all the flames, which spread the fire even more. 

More than an hour later, the entire wilderness was covered by unstoppable flames! 

Lin Yan let out a sigh of relief. 

Finally, he could sit and collect the mon– err, energy points, and evolution points! 

However, Lin Yan did not relax. From time to time, he would wander around the edge of 
the flames and ignite some difficult targets. 

After another two hours, Lin Yan’s evolution point was enough for him to reach Rank 5 
Wildfire. 

The fire spread too quickly, and the poisonous snakes and insects had no time to 
escape. After burning for a few hours, night arrived. Flames surged into the sky of the 
wilderness. 

Even the sky was dyed red! 



Within this monstrous flame, a very high flame was swimming in the middle. Wherever 
this flame passed, not a single blade of grass grew. Even the ground was charred black. 

Lin Yan was not tired and burnt day and night. 

In the blink of an eye, he had burned for three days and three nights in this uninhabited 
wilderness. 

Chapter 4: It was like a God descending into the world! 

Chapter 4. It was like a God descending into the world! 

“Thunderbolt!” 

A streak of lightning tore through the sky. Following that, bursts of thunder rang out. The 
rain poured down, extinguishing the flames in the wilderness. 

On the edge of the wasteland, Lin Yan was burning above a stone without restraint. He 
saw the pouring rain as nothing. 

“The consumption in the rain isn’t great either,” Lin Yan said to himself. 

With such heavy rain, Lin Yan’s consumption was about 10 energy points per second. 

Of course, this was Lin Yan’s consumption. If Lin Yan wanted to ignite an object in the 
rain, the consumption would be much greater. 

10 energy points per second. If it had been three days ago, the rate of consumption 
would have been terrifying. However, it was a drizzle to the current Lin Yan! 

Although the rain had extinguished the fire in the wilderness, Lin Yan had already burnt 
the wilderness in three days and three nights. 

He had already obtained the greatest benefit and had completed his original goal of 
accumulating energy points. 

In the process of burning the wasteland, Lin Yan also obtained a large number of 
evolutionary points and had gone through a rapid evolution. 

At this moment, Lin Yan had already advanced from Wildfire to Earth Flame. 

His status had changed greatly. 

【Host: Lin Yan 

Fire Core Level: Rank 1 Earth Flame 



Number of Flame layers: 8 

Maximum temperature: 2000 degrees 

Evolution Points: 138 

Energy Points: 800,000 

Current income: 0 points/sec 

Current consumption: 10 points/sec 

Skill: Berserk Burning, Eye of Detection 

Resistance: Water resistance 30% 

Item: Virtual godhead (not activated) 

Others: None】 

800,000 energy points. If Lin Yan wasn’t in the rain, he would still be able to hold on for 
a few days even if he didn’t burn anything. Even in the rain, it was enough to last for a 
long time. 

“Energy points aren’t a problem. You can obtain a large number of energy points by 
burning anything. However, evolution points are a problem,” Lin Yan said softly. 

Energy points were equivalent to eating. They were needed for life. Evolution points 
were needed for evolution. 

Lin Yan had already discovered that the more powerful a creature was, the more 
evolutionary points it would give. 

He had burnt a rank 5 poisonous snake in the wilderness and obtained a total of 50 
evolution points. 

In this world, the very first one to ten levels were equivalent to an apprentice. After that 
was the First Rank. Each Rank had ten levels. The Sixth Rank was the King Rank, and 
the Tenth Rank was Sage Rank. 

As for the Tenth Rank or above, that would be the domain of a god. 

“First, dodge the rain.” 

Lin Yan knew that he couldn’t move quickly, so had to be prepared to wait for the rain to 
lighten up before leaving. 



“Roar!” 

At this moment, a roar sounded out. Following that, dense footsteps could be heard. Lin 
Yan saw that it was some Orcish with tails.[1] 

However, these Orcish looked very similar to humans. The difference was that they had 
furry tails and looked rather cute. 

Before Lin Yan could take a closer look at the beastmen, a huge monster rushed out. 

The Orcish ran even faster when they saw they were rushing. 

“I’m going to eat you Fox people! Roar!” Shockingly, that enormous creature was a giant 
bear. 

At this moment, the giant bear spoke human words, and it seemed extremely valiant. 

“Run! This is a rank one bear!” 

. 

The Orcish with tails ran even faster. From what the giant bear had said, they were the 
Fox people among the Orcish Race. 

A first rank bear! 

Hearing those Fox people’s words, Lin Yan’s spirit was refreshed! 

A rank one bear should contribute quite a lot of evolution points. 

This bear didn’t notice the burning Lin Yan on the rock. It didn’t even bother to think 
about why a flame was burning so vigorously on a rainy day. 

It ran under the stone. 

“Now is the time!” Lin Yan seized the opportunity and leaped towards the bear. 

Soon after, Lin Yan activated his skill, Berserk Burning. 

Boom! 

Flames that were several meters tall immediately shot up at the bear. The flame was so 
powerful that it instantly surrounded the giant bear. 

“Ao!” 



The giant bear was suddenly attacked and stunned. 

It had never expected that such a heavy rain would ignite flames on its body. 

Moreover, the flame was burning extremely fiercely. The temperature was too high, and 
it almost instantly burned its fur. 

The giant bear was in pain all over the ground, but even if it rolled into the water, the 
flames would not go out. It was like maggots attached to its bones, burning tightly 
against it! 

“What kind of fire is this?” 

This was the only thought in the giant bear’s mind. 

“Look!” 

At this moment, the fleeing Fox people noticed the situation. 

They all stopped in their tracks and stared at the giant bear, which had turned into a ball 
of fire. They couldn’t understand what was going on. 

At this moment, a Fox person seemed to have seen a faint human face above the 
flame. That human face was dignified and sacred. It was as if he wanted to control the 
flames and devour the giant bear. 

In the sky, lightning flashed, thunder rumbled, and rain poured down. However, in the 
heavy rain, the flame was burning without restraint. 

This scene was like a god descending into the world. 

That Fox people were deeply shocked! 

——————- 

TL note;- 

(Orcish, the demi-humans, their body have a few animal characteristics) In the Orcish 
race, there are a lot of branches, such as Fox-Orcish, Tiger-Orcish, Bear-Orcish, 
Minotaur, and others… Therefore Orcish = Demi-Humans 
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Chapter 5. Holy Maiden 

In the pouring rain, Lin Yan continuously activated his energy. 



His flames were even brighter. 

The giant bear rolled in the rain in pain, knocking down several trees. 

Finally, the giant bear’s injuries were too heavy, and it drew its last breath. 

【You burned a first-rank giant bear to death and gained 100 evolutionary points.】 

The system’s voice rang out. 

“It’s finally settled!” 

Lin Yan let out a light breath. 

When he did this, the flames suddenly extended a large portion. 

After the giant bear died, Lin Yan continued to use the flames to completely incinerate 
the giant bear. 

There was quite a lot of energy in the giant bear’s body. Even though it had consumed a 
lot of energy in the heavy rain, the income was still quite high. After deducting the 
consumption, there was still a surplus. 

“A God! It’s a God!” 

At this moment, the Fox people nearby finally reacted. A Fox person shouted. Its voice 
caused the faces of the surrounding Fox people to freeze. 

Soon after, the Fox people fell to the ground one after another, their faces filled with 
extreme fear. 

What they feared was the might of a God. Seeing a God was not a good thing. 

Gods! They couldn’t get close. Gods would not save people for no reason. Especially a 
God you don’t believe in! 

Gods were dignified, and Gods were also easily angered. Gods would only be slightly 
gentler towards their believers. 

To these Fox people, the flames that could be ignited in the water on a rainy night, the 
flames that violently burned the first rank giant bear to death, and the flames that had a 
faint human face inside of it, what else could it be other than a God? 

Although this might only be a trillionth of the power of a God, it was still enough to kill 
these Fox people who were not even at the first rank. 



That was why they were so terrified. These Fox people were prostrated on the ground. 
No one dared to raise their heads. 

Even the sound of rain disappeared in their ears. Only the sound of flames burning 
could be heard. 

They didn’t even dare to run. They could only submit their lives to God with the most 
humble attitude. 

… 

Lin Yan did not pay any attention to these Fox people. Their level was too low. It was 
not worth it to burn them during the rainy night. 

Finally, the giant bear was completely burnt. 

Lin Yan suddenly shrunk, and then with a light leap, he borrowed a gust of wind and 
flew towards a cliff not far away. 

He was going there to hide from the rain. 

. 

… 

On the ground, only after half an hour had passed since the sound of the flames had 
disappeared did those Foxes dare to raise their heads. 

These Fox people surrounded the giant bear that had turned into ashes. Their faces 
were filled with shock. 

“A few days ago, a fire suddenly ignited in this wilderness,” a Fox said. 

Her words caused the surrounding Fox people to immediately look at each other. The 
fear in their eyes grew even more intense. That wasteland, which was filled with 
poisonous gas that never disperses, had burned for three days and three nights, and all 
the plants and vegetation were burned to ashes. 

Thinking back to what they had just witnessed, they immediately knew why the Misty 
wasteland had burned for three days and three nights! 

“Let’s go report this news!” a Fox girl said. 

This group of Fox people traveled along the way and took quite a bit of time to return to 
their tribe. The tribe wasn’t small. There were many Fox people. When they were out, 



they were targeted by that first-rank giant bear. As he chased after them, they fled to Lin 
Yan’s vicinity. 

The Fox people quickly found the Chief. 

“Mother, we just met a God!” Among the Foxes, a young and beautiful Fox girl walked 
out and said to the chief. 

“What? A God? Are you telling the truth?” the Chief of the Fox race asked. 

The young Fox girl told her about what she saw. 

“Take me to take a look.” 

The Fox clan leader’s gaze became grave as she rushed to the place where the 
incident had occurred overnight. 

“There’s no trace of magic power. It’s not done by a mage, nor is there any fluctuation of 
battle qi. It was not done by a knight. It’s a flame that can burn even on a rainy night. It’s 
a flame that burned the entire wilderness. Heavens, it might really be a God!” 

After the chief of the Fox race personally inspected the scene, her expression became 
even more serious. 

On the way back, the chief of the Fox race did not say a word. 

However, this night, a simple temple in the Fox tribe was constructed as quickly as 
possible. 

On the altar in the temple, a symbol of fire was exceptionally bright. This Fox tribe 
intended to worship the Flame God that had burned the entire wilderness and the giant 
bear during that rainy night. 

At dawn, the young Fox girl, the daughter of the Fox clan leader, wore a simple white 
robe and walked into the temple. 

“Mother, I’m willing to become the Holy Maiden to serve my God and keep my body 
pure for the sake of my God!” 

The young Fox girl’s face was hidden under the veil as she looked at the Flame symbol 
on the altar. 

As the Holy Maiden of a Divine Spirit, not only must she maintain a Holy Body for a 
God, even her face could not be seen by others! 



The chief of the Fox race grabbed her daughter’s hand and took out a small knife. She 
lightly tapped it on her finger and a drop of blood fell out. 

“We’ve been expelled from the main clan, and we’ve come to this remote place. No God 
is willing to look after us. This God might not be able to respond to us. We’ll know if he’s 
a God or not.” 

After the Fox race’s chief finished speaking, she placed the drop of blood from the 
young Fox girl on the altar. 


