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Chapter 8: Passion-filled Date 

Where am I? …When I came to I was in my own bed and it was already morning. Trying 
to move made me realize that my body is sore all over reminding me of last night’s 
session with Zak. My pussy is feeling the intense after effects of serving both Zak and 
Black Zak. I’m so sore…I should take a warm bath and find something to eat. It must be 
near noon already… 

*Ping* A text message? I reached over to grab my mobile. 

“Get on the pills. I only do it raw.” 

Edward…I don’t want to meet him ever again. I let out a sigh and headed to my 
bathroom. 

One look at my naked body in the mirror and I knew that yesterday was too rough for 
me. Both Edward and Zak…I feel like an overused and underpaid prostitute. 
Shit…Zak’s bite on my shoulder left an ugly red mark. His possessive nature always 
drives him to leave some mark on my body whenever we fuck. 

After my bath, I slipped on a white dress with pink rose printing with a skirt flowing down 
to around my knees. The least I can do is look pretty and cheerful for my love, Lucien. I 
head downstairs with a spring in my steps to look for Lucien, looking forward to a quiet 
weekend at home together with him. 

“Finally, my princess is here!” Lucien greeted me from the living room’s sofa with a 
brilliant smile. We embrace and I pecked him innocently on the cheeks. If only, I had the 
courage to do more… 

I felt eyes on us… 

“Oh, Edward is here to take you out shopping. He mentioned there were various things 
you needed for your internship,” Lucien mentioned casually as Edward strode in 
confidently. 

I hate his guts, but couldn’t deny how dashing he looks in his navy blue 3-piece suit. He 
gives off a different vibe compared to when he was in his lab coat while working in the 
lab…but why is he really here? 

“Natalia! We’re going to have various important meetings with our key clients next week. 
Let’s go shopping together, I want to buy you something as thanks for your hard work 



as well. My treat,” Edward said with a smile and leaned in to plant a small kiss on my 
left cheek. I froze… 

“What about you, Lucien? Would you like to join us?” I asked Lucien. Please save me… 

“I would love to but I have an appointment with Angela and her father…you two have 
fun.” 

This is crazy…he’s not able to come with me because he has to meet her? This is flat 
out pissing me off. 

“Well, I’ll enjoy my date with my beautiful niece then,” Edward turned to me with a gentle 
smile but I did not miss that glint of mischiefs sparking in his green eyes. 

Might as well get this over and done with. I marched right to his car but as I was about 
to get the door, his hand beat me to it as he opened the door for me. This gentlemanly 
act was making me more frustrated. I refuse to thank him as I got into the passenger 
seat. If I was not trained to behave like a lady, I would be throwing a fit right now. 

“What’s all this stuff at the back?” I asked eyeing the many shopping bags from top tier 
brands on the back seat. 

“They’re yours. I got them all for you,” Edward replied with an innocent smile. 

“…but aren’t we going shopping today?” I did not follow and I had a sense of 
foreboding. 

“I got all the stuff we were supposed to shop for already so we can spend this time 
doing other pleasurable things. Isn’t that what you’ve been looking forward to? …you 
did get my text right?” 

Without another word, he started driving. 

“Where are we going?” I asked in panic. He did not reply. 

I sat there in uncomfortable silence while he drove until he stopped at a red light. 
Without warning, he leaned over and nibbled on my ear, sliding his hot wet tongue into 
my ear while making sucking noises. 

“Ah…no…stop!” I protested and tried to use my hands to push him away. That only 
made him laugh teasingly before taking my chin in his hands and crushing his firm lips 
onto mine. He pushed his tongue against my closed lips aggressively to gain access to 
my wet depths. My moans of protests only spurred him on more as our tongues danced 
together. The honking of horns brought us back to reality as the light turned green. His 
lips slowly left mine while staring deep into my eyes making my heart beat faster. I felt 
an ache in my lower belly and warmth seeping out in between my legs…no…I 



squeezed my thighs together tightly. I can’t let myself be seduced by him again plus my 
body is still so sore from last night. 

He grabbed my hand and placed it on his crotched, squeezing my hand so that I was 
grabbing his rock-hard member through his pants tightly. The fabric did nothing to hide 
the shape of his long pole. Oh lord, he is already this hot and hard from kissing me? I 
swallowed hard as my pussy clenched up inside with anticipation. 

“Princess, suck my dick…,” he commanded while keeping his eyes on the road. We 
were now on a tollway that seemed to be heading towards the outskirt of the city. 

I shook my head in response and tried to yank my hand away which resulted in him 
yanking my hand back with such force that my body tumbled against him. Suddenly, he 
stopped the car on the side of the road. 

“Suck my cock now…or I fuck you right now in this car. Your choice,” he turned to me 
with a cunning smile on his lips. He was enjoying himself too much and it scared and 
excited me… 

There are so many cars passing by outside the window, if he fucked me now, we would 
surely be seen. My choice huh? What choice? 

Sensing that I am now willing to comply to his wishes he started driving again and 
yanked my hand against his swollen member once more. I slowly unzipped his pants 
and pulled down his boxers to unleash his cock. His thick rigid member stood up 
proudly, pointing me in the face as if inviting me to suck on its head. This is the first time 
I’ve seen his cock up close and just like Lucien’s; it was invitingly beautiful. My pussy 
clenched instinctively and I felt a hot rush of my love juices between my legs. There was 
no denying that my step uncle was turning me on and my body wanted to seek pleasure 
from him. 

I started stroking his dick up and down slowly causing him to groan in a deep voice and 
shift his hips upwards, inviting me to pleasure him further. He was hot and twitching in 
my hand and with my every stroke he grew in size until his tip was a deep reddish-
purple color. 

“Faster…move your hands faster…harder!” he commanded while thrusting his hips up 
and down all the while keeping his eyes on the road. I moved my hand up and down his 
shaft in jerking motions faster and faster as I enjoyed his reaction. He was panting hard 
now and moaning my name. I wanted to bring him over the edge so I bent over and 
lowered my face towards his hard cock. A smell similar to his cum filled my senses as 
my face approached closer and I could see his precum forming at the small hole on his 
tip. I eased my tongue out from between my lips and slowly flicked it across his tip to 
take his precum into my mouth. I felt his hand pushing my head down towards his cock 
as he begged me silently to take his length in. I entered his tip into my mouth using my 
lips to make sucking motions while I run my tongue in circular motions around his tip 



before lapping more at his oozing precum. It’s strong smell and taste filled my mouth 
reminding me of the semen he buried deep in my core just yesterday. All the while 
jerking my hand up and down the length of his pole, I slowly lowered my head to take 
even more of his cock into my well lubricated mouth. 

–To be continued… 

 

 


