
Full-Level Rich Daughter Makes a Strong Comeback  

 

Chapter 17 

Insights 

“Alright then!” Although Li Zhaohui was disgruntled, she still agreed. 

“Remember to tell Pingping when he comes back.” Ye Shen said, “Tell him to get close 
to Ye Leng’an. When the time comes, everything will be his.” 

“Got it.” 

Ye Leng’an brought her mind back, and there was a cold smile on her lips. 

She did not expect that Ye Shen and Li Zhaohui were a double-faced couple though 
they looked quite honest! They met each other today for the first time, yet they already 
had designs on her things. If they coveted her property, just brought it on! Came and got 
it if they really could. 

However, she was very interested in the matter they wanted but were hesitant to say. 
Since they were so reticent about it, how twisted and bizarre the story of her life was! 

In fact, she did not care too much about her life story. Perhaps, she used to care a lot 
about family ties, but after experiencing her life as an immortal cultivator and seeing too 
much of the world, she had long let it go. 

Of course, she would finally know it after the investigation. After all, she also wanted to 
know where she came from. 

Early the next morning, she showed up at school. 

The school she had attended was one of the top elite schools in the capital, Sheng’an 
High School. Those who could enter this school were either rich or noble. Back then, 
that Ye family had put in a lot of effort to arrange for her to enter this school. 

Walking on the familiar yet unfamiliar school road, she had a contented smile on her 
face. It had been a long time since she felt so relaxed. Ever since the news of her and 
Ye Xiyuan being swapped was exposed in her first life, she had been in deep trouble. 
She had never been happy until her death. 

There was no need to mention her life in the cultivation world. In that world where only 
the powerful would be respected, the weak could only be trampled under others’ feet. 
Therefore, she did not dare to stop for a moment. She worked hard to cultivate every 



day and did not dare to stop for even a minute. It was a pity that in the end, she failed at 
the Ascension Stage because of the internal demons in her first life. 

Now that she was back in this world, she decided to enjoy her life. Although she would 
never let go of those who had harmed her, she would not let herself fall into hatred. 

It was rare to have a second chance in life, so she naturally wanted to live her life to the 
fullest. 

Relief flooded through her suddenly. She felt as if the heavy burden placed on her body 
had suddenly disappeared. 

“I didn’t expect that I suddenly gained insights.” Her lips curled into a smile, and there 
was an amused look on her face. . 

It was surprising that she just figured something out and then gained insights. Insights 
were important for cultivators, but it was not easy to achieve that. It needed a proper 
opportunity. 

People froze after glancing in her direction. 

They didn’t notice her presence at first. Here at Sheng’an High School, handsome boys 
and beautiful girls could be seen everywhere. After all, one could have good looks as 
long as he or she had money. 

However, for some reason, they were suddenly attracted to this girl. Her unique 
temperament kept their eyes fixed on her. 

It was only then that they realized that this girl was one of the prettiest in this school. 

She had nice eyebrows, twinkling eyes, a prominent nose, and a small mouth. It was 
impossible to ignore her delicate features and her unique personality. 
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