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Chapter 6 

The Lady of Destiny 

“Host, I’m here.” The mechanical voice came up, “Ye Leng’an has left the Ye family and 
is out of control. It’s not a good thing for you.” 

“Then why didn’t you think of a way to help me just now?” Ye Xiyuan sounded a little 
impatient. “Besides, it’s better that she left. Even if she left, I won’t let her off.” 

“Host, Ye Leng’an has a charmed life. Only by taking away all of her energy can you 
become the female lead of this world and the lady of destiny.” 

“I know.” Ye Xiyuan was determined to win. “I definitely won’t lose to her. I will never 
forget the lesson from my previous life and will make her life much more miserable.” 

She felt that she was the protagonist of this world. Otherwise, how could she have the 
chance to start over? She was almost the prophet of this world now, and moreover, she 
had the help of the system. How could she possibly lose to Ye Leng’an? 

After staying in the small house for a few days, Ye Leng’an had a good rest and sorted 
out her thoughts. 

She checked her bank balance and sighed. 

When she left the Ye family, she didn’t take anything with her except for a few clothes. 
She didn’t want to take away the things that didn’t belong to her. 

However, one could do nothing without money. To be precise, she was still underage! 

Of course, she had never thought of returning to the Ye family. Whether it was the 
wealthy one or the poor one. It was not her home. 

Despite what she thought, Ye Leng’an still decided to pay a visit to the house of Ye 
Shen and Li Zhaohui recently. Even if she didn’t plan to go back, she should at least go 
and take a look at them. 

In her previous life, she had never been to their house. She had only met them a few 
times. 



But Ye Shen and Li Zhaohui’s attitude towards her was actually very strange. They did 
not treat her like their biological daughter at all but more like a guest. Moreover, there 
seemed to be a flicker of fear in their eyes, when she thought about it. 

She gave it little thought in the past, but now that looked so suspicious. . 

“Forget it, and don’t think too much about it first.” Ye Leng’an stood up. “I’ll save it for 
later! The most important thing now is to make money! Otherwise, I can’t afford any 
food soon.” 

She didn’t expect to be bothered by her financial situation even though she was already 
a powerful cultivator at the Ascension Stage. 

Although her space was also moved here, there were spell restrictions to get some of 
the things stored inside and she could not remove them at all with her current strength. 

And it was not the right time to take out the things she could retrieve. 

Therefore, the most important thing for her now was to earn money. 

With a flip of her hand, a porcelain bottle appeared in her palm. 

If someone happened to see this, he would definitely be amazed. It was impossible to 
tell what material this bottle was made of, but this was definitely not an ordinary item 
according to its appearance, not to mention how precious the things stored inside were. 

In fact, the bottle only contained the commonest Beauty Pills. 

Back in the cultivation world, Ye Leng’an was an alchemist. This was just a very 
common medicinal pill. She practiced her skills of making them when she first started 
learning alchemy. 

This kind of pills did not have much use in the cultivation world. Because as a woman’s 
cultivation base was improved, she could remain young and beautiful and didn’t need to 
take those pills. 

However, those pills must be very popular in this world! 

. 

 
 

 


