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Chapter 671 The Alpha's Night (1/3)

Not long after Evelyn is able to satiate her yearning for Rex's presence beside her, the next thing she 
knows the person that she wanted to meet the most went stiff and falls to the ground with a loud 
thud.

Albeit her worries, Flunra only laughs aloud seeing Rex in this state.

For someone with a vast amount of experience like him, he has never in his life seen an Alpha 
coming out of the first trial, clearing it, and reaching the first ascension to get hit instantly by the 
absolute coldness of the Ice and Snow Full Moon.

Every Werewolf knows that this would happen, but they just have never seen it happen.

The feeling of gladness mixed with happiness from Flunra seeing that Rex came out of a level six 
championship first trial makes his mood better, and the fact that he was shown this kind of silly 
situation also made him unable to contain his laughter.

"Why are you laughing? Help him!" Evelyn exclaimed in absolute confusion.

Rex out of nowhere falls to the ground with a stiff body after going through the first trial, and she 
was feeling a little bit angry that Flunra is laughing at him when he might be hurt from whatever 
happens during the first trial.

For all she knows, Rex might suffer a grievous injury unseen by the eyes.

But Flunra slapped away her negative thoughts, "You don't need to be worried, if Rex is able to 
clear the first trial then that kind of injury shouldn't be a problem for him" Flunra turns to his back 
intending to get back to his bed chamber, "he's probably frozen due to the Ice and Snow Full Moon"

While looking at Flunra's back that is going further away, Evelyn is still frowning in confusion.

"Then what should I do? Will it go away eventually?" Evelyn shouted before Flunra can disappear 
into the corner, and her shout made Flunra stop on his track before turning his head towards her. A 
teasing smile appeared on his face.

Flunra then replied meaningfully, "Rex needs his Luna, I think you know what I mean"

After saying that Flunra disappeared leaving Evelyn and the frozen Rex, she was stunned for a 
moment before she looks back at Rex that is also eyeing her. It seems his body can't move, but his 
eyes are still able to move.

Upon realizing that Rex is looking at her, she turns her head away bashfully with reddened cheeks.

'Why am I being nervous, it's not even our first time...'

A moment later, Evelyn carried Rex like a princess into an empty bed chamber to do her 
responsibility as the Luna of the Silverstar Pack. Along the way, Rex is dying of embarrassment as 
he was manhandled by Evelyn like this.

But thankfully his stiff body forbids him from going to an embarrassing position.



Evelyn laid Rex down on the king-size bed before she made eye contact with him again, her eyes 
looks shy but she can't hide the burning desire deep within the soul of her eyes. It was blazing, and 
Rex can see through her eyes easily.

Not one bit of sound can be heard aside from the sound of Evelyn's quickening breaths.

Despite knowing what to do to help Rex break free from his frozen state, she has never been the one 
actually leading Rex on the bed. He's always the one to initiate, the one that leads, and along the 
way she can finally get the bravery to do things that made her embarrassed after the deeds.

It's always been like that, but now she was the one that needs to move and initiate.

Under the intense eye contact, she finally is the first one to break it as her face blushes like a 
tomato, she even looks down to try to hide her face. Evelyn can feel her face burning, even her eyes 
flickered with her dark red fire element. Showing her riled emotions.

While looking at Evelyn's blushing face, Rex started to not mind the absolute coldness.

At first, he was hoping the system would block the Ice and Snow Full Moon effect a little bit longer, 
but now he's starting to feel that it's not that bad. Especially since he just got out of that tough spot, 
a little bit of forced rest is not a bad deal.

Rex is grinning inside his head, wanting to know how Evelyn is going to do this.

But soon enough Evelyn takes a huge deep breath before she tries to look at Rex, she didn't say 
anything before suddenly she flicked her fingers. Out of nowhere, her body burned with dark red 
flames that engulfs her completely.

It didn't reach the ceiling, and the dark red flame is not violent as it usually was.

Upon seeing this Rex is intrigued as to what Evelyn is doing, 'Is she hiding inside the flame in 
embarrassment? or is she doing something?' he wondered inside his head, he can't do anything in 
this state except watch the dark red flame.

Like a flame vortex, the dark red flame spiraled before it soothingly dispersed.

Not even a glimpse of heat from the dark red flame can be felt by Rex, he can only feel a light brush 
caressing his cold body. But soon his eyes slowly started to widen when the dark flame dispersed 
and exposes Evelyn's figure.

Coming out of the dark red flame like a beautiful phoenix, Evelyn's entire attire changed.

Evelyn is now wearing somekind of red fiery night dress that reveals most of her soothing silky skin 
which incites Rex's craving almost instantly, her deadly curves on the right spots made her entire 
appearance enchanting to no end.

Rex's eyes scanned her from top to bottom, he did it automatically as his eyes glowed red.

Matching with the entire night dress is her blazing red long hair that is tied into a ponytail, and her 
eyes are droopy, showing her arousal from the next half-hour fantasy inside her mind. Maybe due to 
being separated for more than one week, Evelyn feels her entire body burning.

Going down, Evelyn's plump, succulent, and luscious lips made Rex unconsciously gulps.



Tracing his eyes away from the alluring lips that would gladly embrace his lips if he made a move, 
he was greeted by Evelyn's exposed neck. It's appetizing, and it feels the reverie of begging Rex to 
leave love marks.

If not for the frozen state that he's in right now, Rex would ravish her inviting neck.

Leaving countless love marks to declare who she belongs to is the first thing he would do if he can 
be freed from this torturing state,  he couldn't do anything despite wanting very much to do myriads 
of things to Evelyn, he curses the absolute coldness inside his head.

Soon both of his lustful eyes find their way to her perfect mounds and slit belly button.

Although he was not a rookie in this section ever since his first time doing it with Adhara, he has 
never felt his desire erupting to this state. It was probably due to the fact he was tempted but 
simultaneously can't do anything to ease his desire.

But the last threat broke when Rex's eyes falls on her lower parts.

Evelyn has always been the most athletic out of the women Rex has ever been, her tight exposed 
long legs are the exact showcase of that. Alongside her exposed legs, he also saw the transparent 
part of the nightdress below her belly button.

Rex feels his mind heavy and the veins around his neck bulge with desire.

Knowing that she has caught Rex's attention, Evelyn slowly climbs the bed before sitting on top of 
his chiseled abs. Her weight presses against Rex's body, and that does nothing except make him 
want to grab her.

"I've learned this trick jokingly from a friend, I never thought it'll come in handy" Evelyn mutters.

Upon hearing this Rex instantly thanked this friend that teaches Evelyn to use this glorious spell, 
he's even willing to reward that person with a high elemental affinity and a great spell if she so 
wants to.

Looking at Rex's struggling expression, she smiled sweetly before she leans down to Rex's face.

Evelyn puts her lips against Rex's lips and started to kiss him passionately, the warmth transferring 
from her body can be felt clearly by Rex beneath her. In this situation, he can only relax and enjoy 
as Evelyn does her thing.

Amidst the passionate kiss, she moans into Rex's mouth seductively.

Those captivating sounds are like drops of oil into the flames of both of their desire for each other, 
and the heat slowly filled the entire place. Opening his eyes again when she pulled away, Rex was 
surprised to see Evelyn's appearance right now.

Unlike a moment ago, her red hair has turned purplish white similar to the symbol on her forehead.

Small poking horns on her head can be seen and her body also started to emit sparkling purple dust 
as her transformation is exposed and takes effect. Without pause, Evelyn trailed her fingernails 
down to his rippled chest filled with scratches.

Not only her fingernails that now turn sharp, but her lips also don't want to lose out.



Wherever her sharp fingernails leave red traces downwards on Rex's chest, her plump lips and 
tongue follow, licking and soothing the scratched skin. Kissing her way down, wet alluring traces 
were left all over Rex's chest filled with love.

At this point, the sparkling purple dust started to fight off the absolute coldness and bring warmth.

Even before the intimate deeds actually started the absolute coldness started to be oppressed by the 
Luna's warmth, Rex slowly regains his mobility starting from his face. It wouldn't take long before 
the Ice and Snow Full Moon effect got completely neutralized.

When Evelyn is done with his chest, she slowly sinks to the bottom toward his lower part.

Now that Rex can finally move his head with the dispersing absolute coldness, he gazes down and 
finds Evelyn's mouth is in line with his warm bulging junior trapped inside his pants that reacted 
even in the frozen state.

"My... it looks to be in so much pain" Evelyn mutters seductively, she refrains from letting it out.

Deliberately letting Rex junior still encased inside the boxer, she smiled provokingly while looking 
at the swell that is desperate to get out. Evelyn brings her face closer and gave a light kiss right 
beside the swell.

Rex moan roughly finding that she was teasing him.

Although she knows that he's on the verge of erupting, she didn't put her attention to his thing 
deliberately, amplifying the craving and desperation he's feeling right now. Her tongue then slithers 
out from between her lips again.

Brushing lightly every place but Rex junior, she teases until the verge of explosion.

Following the current peak of the moment as Rex's body tries to fight the absolute coldness 
automatically, the sparkling purple dust started to swirl following the red kingly energy that is 
slowly sizzling out of Rex's body.

Under the intense kingly energy, some of his wounds started to close up.

"Rrgghh!" Rex grunt strugglingly with his eyes glowing red brightly, but Evelyn ignored him.

Nothing seems to be going through her mind except pleasing and teasing the person that she really 
glad to see right now, she then takes a moment to slip her fingers inside Rex's boxer and looks up at 
him.

Evelyn looks at Rex who is in a dire crisis right now, she smiled sweetly upon seeing this.

Without warning, she suddenly gives a gentle kiss right to Rex junior which makes the red kingly 
energy coming out of Rex's body even more violent. Slowly the sound of ice breaking can be heard, 
it was the stiffness from the Ice and Snow Full Moon that is breaking.

Going up once again, Evelyn lays her hands on Rex's chest before she leans to his ear.

"I wanted to let set you free from the full moon effect first, but sorry I can't wait any longer" Evelyn 
whispered which made Rex's entire body reign with goosebumps, she then pulled away and sits on 
his stomach once again.

Her naughty hands then went to her back and slowly let the beast out of the shackling cage.



Upon setting Rex junior free, she wraps her hand around it without even looking at it. Even the 
feeling alone makes her face redder, and her breathing heavier. Not looking at it gives her a sense of 
weird pleasure, and her heart beats even faster in response.

Rex can only watch her moaning above him while stroking his erected beast gently.

Soon Evelyn can't help but move her hips back and forth, his stomach was then stained by a sticky 
love substance from her being aroused to the absolute peak. Evelyn then burns the lower part of her 
night dress and lifts her perky bottom to line it with the erected beast.

The gate of heaven is an inch away, and Rex is looking at it intently, he didn't even blink.

"I missed you in me, Rex..."

With that short confession that reverberates like a seductive rhythm into Rex's ears, Evelyn puts the 
erected junior into her most sacred place and vulnerable spot before letting out a loud moan as she 
got filled with ecstasy and looks up to the ceiling.

Chapter 672 The Alpha's Night (2/3)

Mutated animals and cursed creatures can be seen going back to their places due to the uneasiness 
they are feeling from the blue glaring eye in the sky, the Ice and Snow Full Moon brightly light up 
the sky with the natural color blue despite being shrouded by darkness.

Its illumination is like a grand light, brushing everything with its majesticness.

Every nook and corner of the Humming Damned Forest got blessed with this grand light. Only the 
Werewolves and some other Supernaturals are affected by the full moon, but that doesn't mean other 
creatures can't feel the change in the air.

Knowing that a Supernatural phenomenon is ongoing, many preferred to stay hidden for the night.

Seeping through the broken window on the second floor of the castle, the energy coming from the 
Ice and Snow full moon was blocked completely by a mix of red and purple energy, intertwining 
together like two mating snakes.

No matter how much the full moon tries, its grand blue energy can't penetrate the mixed energies.

Going inside through the broken window is a bed chamber with a king-sized bed in the middle 
where two people can be seen making love, disregarding everything around them completely.

Enchanting sounds of their heated bodies pounding into one another filled the entire bed chamber.

Rex can be seen having a hard time enduring the rough treatment he's getting, he can't move his 
body which is already too much for him to handle but there's also no mercy given to him by the 
Luna that is riding on top of him.

Loud moans and Evelyn screaming his name accompany the pounding sounds.

'It's tight...' Rex thought with one of his eyes closed strongly, trying his best to handle the pleasure 
he was being overwhelmed with. Most of his injuries are healed right now, and the ones that are left 
were the most gruesome ones.

But despite the lingering pain, he can't feel anything right now except of Evelyn's meaty insides.



Adding to the unbelievable temptation and the ignition from the Ice and Snow Full Moon itself, 
Rex's eyes glowed red incredibly brightly as his lust is insinuated to the absolute limit. More and 
more red kingly energy seeped out of his body, creating more cracking sounds.

Evelyn has been indulging in her longing fantasy, focusing solely on the junior inside of her.

Her sacred place that is craved and fantasized about by many other men that have set their eyes on 
her now swallowing Rex's erected beast greedily, the rhythm of her hip movement only gets even 
faster as her eyes burned with love.

Steamy breaths and moans escaped her rosy mouth, her mind is already blank.

"Grrghh...!" At the brink of explosion, Rex feels the last stiffness get broken by his red kingly 
energy.

In the first second that he regained back his bodily movement, Rex immediately flipped their 
position and slam Evelyn to the soft bed. She gasped some air realizing that she was at the bottom 
right now, and she was fully exposed in her defenseless position.

Rex can finally take a breather, straightening his body that is covered in both of their sweats.

Beads of sweat that are emerging on his chest slowly drizzled down to his chiseled abs seductively, 
the sight puts Evelyn completely at the edge and her breathing heavier. She can't take her eyes off 
him as Rex takes his entire clothes off.

Turning her head to the side shyly, Evelyn uses her hands to spread her legs open invitingly.

Compared to the first time they are doing this, Rex realized that she's now way bolder than before. 
Evelyn's perfect-sized breasts hasn't been covered by the lingerie for a while now, and her bright 
pink lower mouth is demanded to be punished.

Due to the beautiful scenery that Evelyn showed him right now, Rex is completely stunned.

With the heaven's gate welcoming him, his eyes are unblinking.

"I'm still bothered that you forgot about me..." Evelyn suddenly said whisperingly.

Upon hearing this Rex was stunned as he knows what she was talking about, it was the fact that he 
forgot to pick her up due to the crazy situations that he's dealing with these last couple of weeks. It 
was definitely his fault.

Rex was at a loss for words as he feels guilty, "Evelyn, I..."

Just as he was trying to say something to explain for doing what he did, Evelyn suddenly puts her 
index finger on his lips while also covering her face with her hair. "Don't apologize through your 
words, I don't want to hear it" she then steal a glance at Rex before she continues, "Pound me as 
hard as how much you want me to forgive you..."

At that moment, Rex was stupefied for a few seconds.

Blinking his eyes a couple of times and realizing that Evelyn really meant it through the look in her 
eyes, he sucked in a cold breath before he suddenly clamped their bodies together and thrust his 
junior straight into Evelyn once again.



Evelyn was surprised and gasped, the sudden thrust caught her off guard.

"Okay, I'll warn you now that I'm not going to stop once I start" Rex whispered into her ears, but he 
didn't let her answer and started moving his hip back and forth strongly. In response, Evelyn 
wrapped her arms around Rex's neck while biting her lower lip.

Her desire for Rex is reflected through how hard she's clamping their bodies together right now.

Both of her arms are like two snakes wrapping their bodies around prey, they wouldn't let go no 
matter what happens. Not only that but her fingernails also dug into Rex's back, but he didn't mind 
it and keeps on thrusting.

Everything becomes a mess, the bedsheet, the bed legs, and even the headboard are not spared.

If it weren't for the fact that the entirety of the castle is made by the system and has power 
corresponding to it, the king-sized bed would've broken apart. Even now, the bed legs and 
headboard are already on the brink of collapse.

Rex feels the animalistic instinct hidden deep inside of him is being brought out.

Out of the times he did it only Evelyn managed to rile up the hidden beast nature inside of him, it's 
probably due to her energy as the Luna but it can also be something else. But simply put, Rex has 
never felt like this if not with her.

Evelyn's odor is like an intoxicating aroma that has its sole purpose of igniting Rex's lust.

Not wanting to be stuck in one position, Rex flipped her body and do her from behind.

"Mmmfhh...!" Evelyn moaned loudly through the pillow pressed onto her face.

Wanting nothing but to give the man that she loved the utmost pleasure that she can give, she lets 
him do whatever he wants and even lifts her perky bottom for a smoother entrance. For everything 
that has happened to them, this kind of thing is always a luxury.

It's hard to find time for pleasure with the condition they are in right now.

Because of that Evelyn started being grateful every time they did it, and even Rex's presence in 
general knowing how hollow her life would be without him. Evelyn is already in too deep, she's a 
part of this life now.

Grabbing both of her arms, Rex started to increase his speed as he was nearing his limit.

From the inside, Evelyn can feel Rex's thing swelling inside of her showing that he's on the verge of 
climax. In the midst of ecstasy and the euphoria of the moment, she can't help but blurted out, "I- 
Inside! D-Don't take- Don't take it out!"

Under this kind of circumstance, no man can resist the temptation.

Rex has completely engrossed at the moment as the only thing on his mind is reaching the end goal, 
his face started showing signs of weakness as he gives one last drive and keeps his erected beast 
inside.

A rough groan escape his mouth while Evelyn moaned loudly in satisfaction.



White marbling substance poured into her inside and filled it completely, Evelyn's messy expression 
was hidden by the pillow, and only her intoxicated eyes can be seen. Both of them stayed for a 
moment before Rex let go of her arms as she falls to the bed with rough breaths.

Despite his climax, his beast didn't settle down and still stand upright mightily.

Just then he suddenly sensed something and take a glance at the door, there he finds a figure 
peeking through the door. Rex was surprised for a moment but that surprise quickly turns into a 
grin.

"Gistella, come here" Rex said with a commanding tone and his eyes glowing bright red.

Knowing that she was caught and definitely can't refute his order, especially with that kind of tone 
that doesn't want to be rebutted, Gistella slowly opens the door and walks in shyly. She kept her 
head down to look at the floor.

Upon hearing this, Evelyn raised her head to look to the side and finds Gistella there.

Evelyn was worried for a second knowing that she passed out not too long ago and is definitely 
hurt, but doesn't seem to be in any kind of pain as she stopped beside the bed. It's clear that the icy 
effect of the full moon is affecting her.

Her walk looks very stiff and slow, she had to be still affected by the absolute coldness.

Compared to Evelyn that has already done the deeds with Rex and pleased him albeit unfinished, 
she feels her body is not stiff anymore. Even the absolute coldness can't be felt by her anymore, it's 
completely gone.

While standing beside the bed, Gistella steals glances at Evelyn's state.

Just from seeing the mess she's in from doing it with Rex, her expression reddened completely as 
she now sees with her own two eyes the notorious act of reproduction that a previous Undead like 
her has never experienced or even consider a thing.

But now, by looking at Evelyn alone she feels her heartbeat quicken and her sacred place itchy.

Rex saw her expression and the way she was standing so bashfully really attractive, he knows that 
for some reason Gistella turns out to be very beautiful after being freed from her Undead 
appearance. It even caught him by surprise the first time he made her one of his pack members.

Since she's looking down, her silvery hair falls down like a beautiful sparkling waterfall.

Gistella is bigger compared to Adhara and Evelyn, her body size is more suitable for Rex at a 
glance. Not only that she also has sweet curves that are in the perfect places, but the air of 
innocence is the most prominent as it gives rise to the feeling of conqueror inside of Rex.

It's like exploring a new land, and that made Rex's eyes sparkle vibrantly.

Just when he was worrying about the Ice and Snow Full Moon before he got pulled into the first 
ascension trial, he already bought the necessary information to fend off the Ice and Snow Full 
Moon's effect from the system.

Rex was quite surprised, but the system summarized it into something called 'the Alpha's Night'.



Basically, every male member of the pack needs to be in the vicinity of the Alpha, while the female 
member of the pack needs to have sexual intercourse with the Alpha or simply be intimate with the 
Alpha if they only want to lessen the likelihood of them being forced into hibernation.

Due to that, Rex looks at Adhara when he learned that. But if it's necessary then so be it.

Upon giving one look towards Gistella that is currently playing with her hands shyly, she instantly 
knows what that means as her heart started to flutter. Even the heat inside her body starting to blaze, 
she can feel it heating up her entire body.

With a face that is completely red, Gistella started stripping her clothes off.

Evelyn was quite surprised to see that Gistella is that brave to strip in front of Rex like that, she 
assumed that both of them has ever done it before so this is surprising. But contrary to what she 
thought, Gistella is fueled by her obedience more than bravery.

Nothing Rex said or insinuate that she would decline, she's the most obedient of them all.

After completely stripping to the last undergarment that she's wearing and revealing a striking sight 
that Rex has never seen before. Gistella uses her arms to cover her two big mesmerizing breasts and 
also her netherworld's gate, it's clear that she's very shy but she can't help but do what Rex wanted.

Upon seeing this, Rex gulped harshly as he was not expecting to get this aroused.

'I- I can't hold myself back!'

Rex can't hold the erupting beast once again that hasn't been satisfied yet and pulled Gistella and 
kissed her passionately in front of Evelyn, this caught her by surprise and also caught Gistella in 
surprise as it was quite sudden.

But her eyes turns droopy before she slowly closed her eyes, fully submitting herself to Rex's 
wishes.

Chapter 673 The Alpha's Night (3/3)

Due to her past that essentially doesn't let her feel anything that living beings feel every single day, 
the sensation and pleasure that she's feeling right now are completely new. Nothing in her previous 
life can be compared to what she's feeling right now.

It was the worldly pleasure that she never thought existed, a completely foreign sensation.

Gistella can feel the mix of red kingly energy belonging to Rex and the purple sparkling dust from 
Evelyn seeping through the entire castle, she's feeling better due to the concoction Flunra made and 
also this mix of energy that made her body feels warm.

Oblivious to where this desire came from, she followed the source of this mixed energy.

Loud moaning sounds can be heard from beyond the door in front of her, Gistella was surprised to 
hear the intoxicated moans that belong to Evelyn and Rex. Both seem to be in somekind of 
pleasurable experience, she can hear it through their moans.

Feeling curiosity burning inside her body, she braces herself to knock on the door and open it.

Despite her knocking on the door not wanting to peek at their activity, Rex and Evelyn don't hear 
the knock as Gistella was exposed to the scene where both of their bodies are clamped together 
tightly.



It was a sight to see, she has never seen the expressions they are wearing right now.

Unconsciously she was stuck in front of the bed chamber's door and watched the deed from start to 
end, she feels weird all over her body just from watching Evelyn and Rex indulging in the act of 
lust and pleasure.

Gistella wondered what the both of them are feeling right now.

But when she was just at the tip of the sensation that they were feeling, she already feels 
overwhelmed with sensual pleasure that caught her off guard. Rex is now kissing her passionately 
which surprises her to no end.

Soon she surrendered herself to the pleasure and to the Alpha.

Rex can feel the inexperience kiss from Gistella's stiff movement but that ignites his lust even more, 
he then snaked out his tongue and infiltrates her mouth. Not letting her pull back out of surprise, 
Rex wrapped his hand around her waist and pulls her closer.

Under such stimulation, Gistella is completely at a loss for what she's doing.

With gentle movement Rex forced her tongue to dance with him, he was like a teacher trying to 
teach the basic thing to the oblivious student. In a moment, it can be seen that Gistella is already 
engrossed in the act.

Both of them started to avariciously yearn for each other.

From the side Evelyn is watching the intimate scene while still feeling the heightened climax she 
did before, she can't take her eyes off Gistella right now. 'S-She's beautiful...' Evelyn commented, 
there's no other word to describe her right now.

Although she's a woman, she can't help but acknowledge that Gistella is really beautiful.

Evelyn's long hair is now white with a purplish hue all over due to her transformation, but Gistella's 
hair is soupy silver that compliments her innocence very well. It's like she was the fairy of the 
moon, flawless to the core.

Rex savors the taste of his obedient Beta and pulls back when he's satisfied.

While pulling back she can feel Gistella leaning forward not wanting to part with him, she then 
opens her eyes showing her eyes that showed that she has not had enough. It made Rex smile lightly 
seeing this new side of her.

Pulling her arm gently, Rex made her lie down on the bed beside Evelyn.

It was not done deliberately by him but he handled her with care, the innocence she emitted made 
him instinctively do that, and also knowing the fact that this is the first time she has felt something 
like this also added to his instinctive gentle response.

Upon lying down on the bed, her face becomes red again realizing that Evelyn is looking at her.

The embarrassment she had a moment ago came back again, she covered the sensitive parts of her 
breasts with her arm and also the netherworld's gate. But out of every beautiful thing he sees right 
now, his eyes were attracted to one thing.



Rex saw the Silverstar symbol in between her breasts and feel his lust heightened because of it.

Maybe due to the fact that the Silverstar symbol is the sign that she's a member of the Silverstar 
pack, meaning that she belongs to the Alpha. With that, Rex leans down and gives a gentle kiss on 
the Silverstar symbol in between her breasts.

In response, she let out a light embarrassed moan.

Knowing that Gistella really liked kissing him, Rex decided to give her another taste while his hand 
gently pushes her arm away and started playing with her beautiful mounds that are exactly how they 
looked, firm yet soft to the touch.

Seductive moans escape her mouth in between their kiss, it's like music to Rex's ears.

Rex's brave hand then had enough of her breasts and slowly travels down slowly, brushing and 
feeling her soft skin while making its way down to the netherworld's gate that is untainted by 
anything.

Naughty sounds are instantly created when his hand reaches the drenched sacred place.

Gistella wanted to let out her voice desperately but she tried her best to hold it in, this made Rex 
finds her reaction very adorable and cute which is the product of her innocence. But that is also the 
last thing that cuts Rex's patience short.

Straightening his back, Rex positioned his upright beast to the netherworld's cave.

Looking down at her place that she has never thought would be penetrated in her entire life, her 
heartbeat started to become faster. "I'm going to put it in now, Gistella. There's no need to hold back 
your voice, just let it out" Rex said with rough breaths.

Upon hearing this, she nodded her head lightly as the tip started to pierce into her.

Just from that alone her vision started to become blurry and her mind started to become blank, she 
was overwhelmed by the stimulus that her body experienced for the first time. Rex junior thrusts in 
gently, it takes a break once as it gets in deeper.

Soon blood started to come out showing that it had already passed through her hymen.

"Mmmpfhh!!"

When the entire thing is inside Gistella lets out a loud muffled moan as she was covering her 
mouth, the feeling of fullness that reaches her stomach completely surprises her. Now she knows 
the feeling that Evelyn felt earlier.

It was painful but the pain didn't last long, her inside adjusted to the pain rather easily.

Rex started to move his hip unable to contain his natural rough animalistic instinct, he did it in a 
slow rhythm but each thrust is powerful and forced out a moan from Gistella's mouth. The pain 
slowly turned into pleasure, and Gistella began to feel the sensation many crave.

Her innocence is finally tainted by her own Alpha as the tempo got increasingly faster.

At this point, they are already doing sexual intercourse fully and Rex is already back to his lust 
fulfillment process, but the tempo is nowhere near as rough as the tempo he did with Evelyn earlier 
due to the unbelievable teasing done by Evelyn.



Just then two arms wrapped around his upper body, it was Evelyn that is already recovered.

"How unfair, you don't have this kind of mercy when you're doing it with me the first time...", 
Evelyn whispered to Rex's ear while watching him doing Gistella, she pouted slightly from the 
gentle treatment that Gistella is getting.

But Rex didn't even glance at her, "If I do it to you gently, you're not going to be satisfied"

Upon hearing this Evelyn can only chuckle as Rex's erected beast is going in and out of Gistella's 
netherworld's gate, it becomes faster in a blink of an eye showing that Rex is nearing his limit 
again. Out of nowhere, Evelyn grab him by the face before she started kissing him from the side.

It was a sensation that even spiked Rex's lust even higher, and he was nearing his limit faster.

Rex grabs Gistella's wrists quickly as he thrust in one last time powerfully, he then takes his erected 
beast out and pours the white marbling juices onto Gistella's nigh-perfect body. 'I've never thought 
that I would do this with her' Rex thought while seeing the scenery in front of him right now.

Doing it with Gistella? It's not something he thought about.

Although there are some instances that a brief thought about doing it with her passed his mind, he 
never paid much attention. But now he actually did it with her, and he should've known that this day 
would eventually come.

"Let me clean it up for you..." Evelyn bent down in line with Rex junior before started sucking on 
it.

Rex looks down at her doing that with great interest, but then Gistella also sits up and joins in with 
Evelyn, "I- I want to try doing it too, master seems to like it" she said which caught Rex completely 
off guard.

"These two..." Rex mutters lightly, shaking his head out of sheer helplessness.

In the next second, the two girls yelped as the room is filled with their loud moans once again. The 
slapping sounds of their sweaty bodies pounding alongside the cries for help are the only thing 
decorating the night inside the Silverstar castle.

Meanwhile, inside the human territory. UWO Main Office.

Edward is sitting in his room which looks pompously luxurious for someone that should be 
considered a traitor to humanity, he's sitting at the edge of the bed with a pondering look at his 
reflection in the mirror.

There's a frown on his face remembering what Jasira said yesterday night.

~

"I've heard that there's a Werewolf from the Silverstar Pack that infiltrates our territory, who are 
they, and what happened to them?" Edward asked instantly when Jasira enters the living quarters 
where she was staying for the time being.

Ever since she left, Edward has been waiting for her here wanting to know about the situation.



Upon hearing this Jasira only chuckled with a mocking smile, she kept on walking while Edward is 
following her from behind, "I have the right to know, if Sebrof treated them in disrespect then the 
same occurrence will happen again. I'm here to prevent that!"

"President Serbrof, not Sebrof. Mind your words" Jasira replied coldly.

With that she arrived in front of her room and open the door through retina and fingerprint scan, the 
door then gets unlocked. Jasira wanted to get inside but Edward stopped her, "Please, I need to 
know what happened"

"I thought the Royal Black Prince is a ninth-rank realm, I think he regressed to the eight-rank"

"With that kind of strength, the incident that happened to Ratmawati City wouldn't happen again. If 
I have to say, I'm not that impressed. I thought the Royal Black Prince would give a fight, but it 
seems the quality of Awakened in Ratmawati City is just not that good" Jasira commented before 
closing the door on Edward.

Edward is stupefied as he stands in the hallway with a frown on his face.

~

"Regressed? Did Rex get weaker due to going berserk?" Edward mutters softly, he was confused as 
to what Jasira meant about what she said that night. But there's nothing he can do except try to 
decipher what she means.

Everybody wouldn't tell him a thing about the Silverstar Pack, not until he's strong enough at least.

Upon feeling dizzy from all the worry and thinking he has done throughout the entire day, Edward 
massages his forehead, "I hope the others are okay, and Evelyn is able to convince Rex on seeking 
revenge another way..."

"Speaking of them, they didn't bring Delta so she should still be here" Edward mutters inwardly.

Realizing that he then quickly takes a simple shirt and puts it on before he walks out of the room in 
the middle of the night when everybody is sleeping, hoping to recover what's left of his old friend 
that he can grasp.

Chapter 674 Humanity's Offensive

Somewhere in front of the Great Barricade near the newly conquered Demon Stronghold.

Lining up neatly like an unbreakable army wearing white futuristic armor with an emblem of the 
Elpida Alliance on their chests, tens of thousands of Cessation Knights are advancing forward 
beyond the Great Barricade, pushing the Supernatural territory's border.

Defensive-related Awakened are at the very front, creating a joined powerful aegis.

In each legion of Cessation Knights, there are at least two or three flying Awakened in their midst, 
emitting an overbearing aura that stampedes everything in their path. Each of them has the power of 
an eighth-rank realm, indomitable in their own rights.

Across the patch of plain flatland are the Supernaturals roaring and howling in anger.

Most of them are either Undead frontlines that burned with green flaming fire and also 
Shapeshifters that seem to be on the brink of anger explosion, they were showing their hostile 
nature which is quite new since Shapeshifters rarely be aggressive.



Something must've happened to ignite this kind of behavior from them.

"Keep your wits steady and determination like steel, you all are here to fight for the longevity of 
Humans! Advance forward, for the name of Cessation Knights, for the holy judgment of the 
Awakened, for Humanity!!"

Upon hearing the battle cries of the General, the army raised their weapons and roared.

Due to the sheer number, their roar makes the air tremble while the thousands of marching steps 
rumble the ground, their formation is compact without any hint of weakness. It's like their formation 
is giving an aspiration that it wouldn't break even if the entire world collapsed.

With union in mind, each legion made its way slowly toward the Supernatural territory.

One particular Undead located in the middle of the Undead that is emitting a horrifying amount of 
energy matching that of an eighth-rank look at the marching legions of Cessation Knight with 
worry, the sight of tens of thousands of compact soldiers going forward fearlessly give the Undead a 
notion that they wouldn't win the fight.

Growl!

Since the attack is sudden, they aren't prepared to face such massive armies.

Raising a green burning cutlass to the sky and also swirling a burning chain in its other hand, the 
Undead that seemed to be the Supernatural in charge in this section then roared, "Sanctuary! Fall 
back to the Sanctuary!"

Like a joined entity, the other lower-rank Undeads started to fall back following the instructions.

Even the Supernatural in the outpost signaled to other parts that don't see the armies of Cessation 
Knights yet to retreat back deeper into their territory, they are suddenly attacked by the Humans 
unexpectedly.

Despite their hesitance, the Undeads, even the high Undead Lords are falling back in response.

While making sure the Undeads are retreating back lest they would clash with the armies of 
Cessation Knights, the eighth-rank Undead noticed that the Shapeshifters are growling angrily with 
their bloodthirsty eyes.

From their demeanor alone, it's clear that they are anticipating a fight.

"Retreat back! Shapeshifters, retreat back!" the eighth-rank Undead tries to warn them but failed.

Just as he was about to attract the Shapeshifters' attention to him, a powerful shout reverberated into 
the air and seeped into the Supernaturals' ears, "Come and fight us, you filthy creatures! We're not 
afraid anymore, we will purge each one of you and punish your sins of existence!!"

Upon hearing this, the eighth-rank Undead glanced back to the front and saw a figure.

Flying way up in the sky with two fiery wings that made the figure looks like a phoenix can be seen 
taunting and letting out his overbearing aura of a ninth-rank Awakened, it was Denzel. With the fall 
of the Demon Stronghold, humanity has regained back the protection of the Great Barricade.

With that Humanity can now focus back on the offensive and not be defensive anymore.



Maybe this night with the Ice and Snow Full Moon shining brightly in the sky is the first step that 
humanity takes in reclaiming back their worlds, little by little they would try and fights back and 
takes the Supernatural's territory.

Seeing Denzel taunting the Supernaturals, the eighth-rank Undead feels boiling anger.

But thinking clearly the eighth-rank Undead knows that it was not Denzel's match, and their armies 
are clearly outmatched. Ignoring the Shapeshifters that are not moving from their spots, the eighth-
rank Undead flees away.

It would be bad if he were to be caught by Denzel, the Undead wouldn't be able to escape then.

Starking in response compared to the Undead that is retreating and regrouping so that they can 
contact the higher-ups and organize a counter-attack, the Shapeshifters were engulfed in anger as 
they charges forward straight to the armies of Cessation Knights.

Roar!!

Growl!!

Many of them started shapeshifting into animals, one of the transformations in their arsenals.

Some turned into humongous mutated elephants that are towering over the regular humans, some 
turned into mutated rhinos with big horns, and some even turned into fearsome mutated tigers and 
lions as they charged to the armies of Cessation Knights.

In response to this, the advancement of the Cessation Knights stopped.

Harnessing the power of the defensive-related elements, the Cessation Knights at the very front 
planted their shields into the ground before they activated a regulated union spell that is the basis of 
the Cessation Knights war spell.

Elipda Allaince Divine Protection.

Clang!

With one chant, the Cessation Knights at the very front planted their shields into the ground.

No matter if they have Crystal Element, Ice Element, Earth Element, or even Iron Element, the 
mana they concentrate on their shields merges together and spawns translucent barriers that become 
one with the barriers on either side.

On top of that, they also cast a spell that helped them stand their ground.

Many of the Cessation Knights used different spells in order to achieve their goals, but the most-
used ones are creating an elemental pole that connect their feet with the ground or a spell that 
strengthened their entire body and balance.

Clenching their shields tightly, the first wave of Shapeshifters crashes into them.

BOOM!

Clang!!

GROWL!!



Although there were more of the Cessation Knights compared to the Shapeshifters, there are still 
more than a thousand of them charging like feral beasts that have gone completely insane, the 
Shapeshifters attacked without minding their own selves.

Clawing and pushing berserkly, the sole thing inside their minds is to kill and kill.

But under the trained chemistry between the Cessation Knights, the barrier stands strong and none 
of the Shapeshifters managed to penetrate through the barrier. Even the sixth or seventh-rank realm 
Shapeshifters aren't able to go through the barrier.

Some of them try other tactics, digging into the ground hoping to ransack the center.

It was quite a clever tactic as if they can get to the middle of the Cessation Knights, then they would 
be able to weaken their defense from the inside. But that is prevented by the Cessation Knights 
located at the right and left edge of the formation.

Water Elementalists imbued the ground with their mana, it makes the ground beneath them harder.

Despite the best effort from the Shapeshifters that are inside the ground, they aren't able to dig out 
and do their plan to ransack the Cessation Knights' formation from the center. Each of them got 
stuck inside the ground and even got penetrated by water spikes instead.

Same for the Shapeshifters that are attacking from above.

A couple of rows of Cessation Knights at the front block the advancement of the Shapeshifters from 
the front, the Cessation Knights on the edges prevented an attack from below, while the Cessation 
Knights at the very back protected the armies' above from attacks from the sky.

It was an efficient tactic, and the Cessation Knights at the center are focusing on the offensive.

Many Cessation Knights in the middle have fire-related elements, their spells are destructive and 
take out many Shapeshifters in one go. It's a massacre, the Cessation Knights don't get hurt at all 
from the clash.

Even Denzel watching this from above sneered, "Shapeshifter is not a problem anymore"

"Just like the Werewolves, if the head, the Alpha is cut off then the bodies are going down easily" 
he then gazes at the far horizon finding not one ninth-rank realm Supernatural coming to confront 
him, "it seems they are avoiding the fight..." he added with a smirk.

Waving his hand, Denzel signaled to the Cessation Knights to end the Shapeshifters quickly.

For this night he aimed to take a couple of miles of the Supernatural's territory, nothing is going to 
stop them right now. Not with what happened earlier, the victory they achieved before, and the 
information they gained that made this possible.

~

Meanwhile, the Silverstar Pack Castle.

Rex wipes the sweat on his forehead feeling the fatigue starting to creep inside of him, he doesn't 
know how much time has passed but the Ice and Snow Full Moon is still shining brightly in the sky 
so it must not be that long.



'I think I overdid it...' he thought wryly while seeing the two women in front of him.

Since his lust was ignited fully he has been indulging in the sexual fantasy that he forgot how many 
times he did it, Evelyn and Gistella are lying face-first while panting heavily. Both of their sacred 
places still have traces of Rex's beast in them.

But it's already expected though, it's been a while so he's quite stacked.

While feeling quite exhausted from doing the two repeatedly in order to achieve the bare minimum 
of satisfaction, Rex sat at the edge of the bed. 'I'm really thirsty, going out is a pain. Let's just buy a 
drink from the system and checks on Flunra'

Now that he's satisfied, he can focus on other things.

Evelyn and Gistella definitely wouldn't be affected by the Ice and Snow Full Moon anymore, and 
he's also already recovered thanks to Evelyn. 'But first thing first, let's check the rewards I gained 
from completing the first ascension trial...'

From completing the first ascension trial, Rex gained three things.

Aside from leveling up two times, he also gained the Oracle of Moon Ability, Herald Mark, and 
Brutal Impulse. Out of the three, he knows that Herald Mark would put one of his pack members 
into the early ninth-rank realm.

But the other two items he got are unknown, and he was bout to learn the two right now.

<Oracle of Moon Ability>

Upon reaching the first ascension, the user can now learn to directly control the Blood Moon Kingly 
Energy directly. It's the essential skill before being able to use Moon Ability which is a higher form 
of spell for the Werewolf race. Oracle of Moon ability will allow the user to feel the flow of Blood 
Moon Kingly Energy to perform a certain Moon Ability, it will help the user master it quicker.

<Brutal Impulse>

Brutal Impulse is a Moon Ability associated with the Blood Moon. Gathering the Blood Moon 
Kingly Energy at certain parts of the user's body, the user can create a devastating sudden force that 
amplifies the user's attack in a whim. The user's attack is extremely powerful, but it will also strain 
the user's body heavily upon usage.

Rex reads through the entire description attentively without missing a single detail.

From what he can understand the Oracle of Moon Ability allows him to learn a Moon Ability 
quicker, while the Brutal Impulse is a Moon Ability that will increase his attacking strength for a 
brief moment but have a heavy drawback.

'It's a good additional skill, this will make it easier for me to catch my enemy's off guard'

Nodding his head Rex decided that he would quickly learn to control his red kingly energy and 
learn this Brutal Impulse Moon Ability, it's going to help him get stronger. With that, he takes one 
last look at the two and finds them both still dazed.

Chuckling lightly and imprinting the scene in his mind, he walks out of the room.



Upon reaching outside he remembered that he hadn't seen Adhara anywhere, he follows her scent 
and reaches his bed chamber. Since Evelyn doesn't want to disturb Adhara, she brought Rex into 
another room to do the deeds.

In front of the bed chamber's door, he saw Flunra standing there with his arms crossed.

"Rex? What are you doing here?" Flunra asked in surprise, he seems to be meditating earlier.

But this made Rex frown as he was confused why Flunra is asking him that, "What do you mean? 
I'm here to check Adhara of course, I haven't done it with her and she might still be in a frozen state 
right now" he replied.

Rex noticed that Flunra seems to be trying to block him from entering the bed chamber.

With his expression turning colder, he then commanded with a heavy tone that doesn't want to be 
rebutted, "Step away" he said, and Flunra doesn't have any choice but to comply. It would be bad if 
he blocked Rex's way longer.

As Flunra stepped away, Rex knocked on the door and entered the room.

Just as he entered the room, his footsteps stopped with his body instantly stiffens. Looking over his 
shoulder slowly, he gave a glare at Flunra and asked, "Who did this...?"

Chapter 675 Profound Words

Flunra walks in hesitantly into the room and saw Rex looking at Adhara lying on the bed.

A mix of red and purple energies from the intimate act he did with Evelyn is swallowing the entire 
castle, this helps prevents the others fights the effect of the Ice and Snow Full Moon. It also made 
the bed chamber Adhara is in quite misty.

Slithering through the misty room is Rex's cold tone that strikes fear into Flunra's body.

Not a glimpse of Rex's pressuring energy or presence can be felt directly by Flunra. But the absolute 
nothingness of emotions made Rex considered to be an even more dangerous entity by Flunra's 
instinctive natural sense.

In that regard, Flurna falls on one knee behind Rex's figure knowing that the Alpha is furious.

Rex looks at Adhara lying on the bed unconscious with both of his hands clenched into fists. Out of 
the time he has spent being accompanied by Adhara from the day he turned her into the first pack 
member of the Silverstar Pack, he has never seen Adhara in a worse state than this one.

Wounds are covering her entire body, showing that she has been through a brutal fight.

Her left arm is missing and her regenerative abilities are compromised and become weaker, the 
thought of someone hurting her makes his blood boils. But what made him angry more was the fact 
that he was not here when it happened.

It almost feels like the tragedy that happened to his parents all over again.

A heavy low growl that trembles the heart escapes Rex's mouth, he slowly turns his body around 
and gazes at the kneeling Flunra with his glaring red eyes. "Alpha... it's better to talk about this after 
the Ice and Snow Full Moon, you just got back and the problems can wait until tomorr-"

Before he can finish, Rex already grabbed him by the neck and slammed him to the wall.



Bam!

"Answer my question, Flunra. Who did this to her?" Rex asks again but this time with a threatening 
tone, anyone that touches those who are close to him would pay the price no matter what. Now that 
he's all alone, he must deal with everything himself.

Feeling the tight force choking his neck, Flunra groaned in pain while holding Rex's arm.

Rex already expected the worst as he glared at Flunra, he only needs confirmation before he would 
deal with this problem himself. It doesn't matter if today is the Ice and Snow Full Moon, that 
wouldn't stop him in the slightest.

"Is it the Supernaturals? Humans? Tell me!" Rex roared and puts more pressure on his hand.

Grunting heavily feeling that his throat would about be crushed if he didn't tell Rex what he wanted, 
Flunra then forced out the words conflictingly fearing that his neck is going to be crushed, "N- No... 
I-It was the curs- cursed creatures!"

Upon hearing this, Rex frown before he instantly lets Flunra go.

Falling to the ground Flunra coughs a couple of times, some of his coughs even contain blood 
which shows how hard Rex is choking him earlier. "A horde of cursed creatures attacked the castle 
when you are away, it happened when me and Kyran are picking Evelyn up too. But Adhara takes 
care of them alongside Gistella"

Rex glanced at Adhara before he sighs, he thought that the Supernaturals or Humans found them.

"Then why are you refraining from telling me if that's the case?" Rex asked, laying his eyes on 
Flunra suspiciously. If Adhara takes care of it then there should be no problem, so it doesn't make 
sense for Flunra to keep his mouth shut for the night.

With conflicted eyes, Flurna looks down to the ground while still holding his throbbing neck.

Just then the frown on Rex's face becomes even more evident as he realized something, he focuses 
on his senses to envelop the entire castle but that only makes his expression turns darker. "I don't 
sense Kyran around, where is he?"

Flunra can only gulp harshly knowing that it will eventually lead to this.

Knowing that Rex has gone through hell in the first ascension trial and even managed to take down 
a fragment of the Blood Moon Lunirich God, he wanted to let Rex rest for the day so that his mind 
can rest so it would take in the bad news better.

But this is completely unexpected, he thought that Rex would at least rest for the night.

Even though Flunra already makes a repercussion by standing in front of the bed chamber where 
Adhara is, who is he kidding? How can he stop Rex from getting inside, he was absolutely useless 
in stopping him.

"Kyran... Kyran is captured by the humans when we try to meet with Evelyn..."

Crack!

Boom!



Rex's aura leaked a bit and cracked the ground beneath him, the expression he was wearing right 
now is murderous so Flunra quickly added lest he would go confront the humans right now. "But it's 
unlikely that they're going to hurt Kyran, I think they're using him to bait you out. Evelyn said that 
Sebrof has asked for ninth-rank realm reinforcement from the neighboring major human cities"

"If you go there recklessly now, then we will all be doomed. Let's think about it first..." Flunra 
added.

Upon hearing this Rex clicked his tongue as he tries to breathe steadily to calm his boiling nerves, 
he sat on the edge of the bed and clasped his hands together to think about the problems that hit him 
right after he finished the first ascension trial.

But at this point, he's not surprised anymore. Problems always haunt him wherever he goes.

<Sudden Quest>

Retrieve back Kyran safely from the grasp of other prominent external forces. As the Alpha, it's the 
user's responsibility to always protect the members of the Silverstar Pack. Being unable to protect 
the pack members is shameful and is not fitting for the Alpha!

Time Limit: Unknown

Quest Reward: 500 Billion Exp and Confide of the Ice.

'Unknown...? That's not good' Rex thought with a frown, the system has never done this.

If there's a time limit then the system would tell him, if there's not then the time limit section 
shouldn't be there. But now, the system decided to put the time limit section there despite not 
knowing the exact time limit.

Rex is definitely troubled by this, but his eyes lowered to the quest reward.

'Confide of the Ice? Is that an item to break the force hibernation? I hope so...'

But at the very least the sudden quest indicates that Kyran is alive, and that is enough for him.

Suppressing back his leaking kingly energy, Rex glanced at Flunra way calmer than before and 
finally asked, "Okay, tell me everything from start to finish. I want to know what happened while I 
was gone"

A moment later, Rex is currently digesting the information he received.

Due today is the Ice and Snow Full Moon, Rex already knows that he has been inside the first 
ascension trial for more than one day. It's the first thing that he realized. Flunra then tells him about 
how Kyran is captured by the humans and also the problem regarding the cursed creatures that paid 
a visit here demanding some kind of curse inside Gistella.

'I'm angry at him for leaving Kyran, but that is the most sensible thing to do' Rex glanced at Flunra.

Although he's quite angry about Flunra's choice, he knows that there's nothing else to do besides 
that if Brigitta and this eighth-rank realm Awakened that fought against Kyran are there. If Flunra 
didn't make that hard choice then Evelyn wouldn't be here.

If Evelyn is not here, Rex and the others would've been forced into hibernation.



Well, essentially if Evelyn is not here Rex is the only one forced into hibernation. But if Rex is 
forced into hibernation, the others that needed his warmth would also follow in his footsteps which 
will end up with all of them in hibernation.

Flunra made the right call, it would be disastrous if that were to happen.

Pondering for a moment he looks at the wall trying to figure out their next move, 'We're severely 
lacking in information, if we want to make a plan then we need information about the current 
humanity. Maybe we can sneak in and save Kyran, but that requires thorough planning'

Just as he thought of that, it seems Flunra realized what he was thinking.

"When we're inside humanity's territory, we got scanned by a new technology of the modern 
humans called Intra. It immediately exposes our position, so I think infiltrating them would be way 
harder now" Flunra said, remembering the weird interface that appears back then.

Upon hearing this, Rex frowns. But he can already guess what it is, 'Supernatural Radar...'

Since the Silverstar Pack is basically one of the biggest contributors to the success of the 
Supernatural Radar, he knows that the Supernatural Radar should be ready to be activated. Now it 
seems Prof. K already finished running his tests.

'Our first step would be gaining information...' Rex thought before nodding his head.

Looking back at the kneeling Flunra in front of him, Rex then finally said after affirming his mind.

"We'll need to find out what humanity is up to right now, and how much reinforcement they gained 
from the neighboring major cities. It'll be best if we can also locate where Kyran is held." Rex 
paused for a second when he noticed something, his eyes squinted because of this, "Can you still 
fight, Flunra?"

It's not that hard to realize that Flunra seems to be weakened for some reason.

Rex becomes even more sure knowing that Flunra basically transported him and Evelyn back to the 
castle, and that is a feat comparable to the power he had when he still has the Banished Dark Moon 
King Mark.

Something that powerful should take a toll on him, and it seems he's right.

Nodding his head firmly, Flunra then said with absolute confidence, "I can still help no matter the 
condition I'm in, there's no need for you to worry about my well-being, Alpha" he referred to Rex as 
Alpha now.

Probably due to the fact that Rex is angry earlier, and it dragged on until now.

Upon hearing this Rex gave a firm nod before waving his head, telling Flunra to be ready as they 
are going to be departing right this instant. The faster they gain ahold of the information, the faster 
they can retrieve Kyran back.

"If I may, where will we start to search for the information we need?" Flunra asked from by the 
door.



Rex lifted his gaze, he paused for a second before he finally replied with a light smirk, "We're going 
to try and find out about humanity, what better way to find them out than through their number one 
rival?"

"I have just the Supernatural in mind" he added and Flunra nodded his head in understanding.

Just as he saw Flunra was about to leave, Rex looks back to the ground before he clenched his 
clasped hands stronger. 'All I want is to keep the others safe, I've suffered too much loss already. 
But they just have to drag me back in...' he thought feeling absolutely angry and desperate.

Ever since his parents' deaths, he wanted nothing to do with the prominent forces.

Due to the approaching Ice and Snow Full Moon, he only wanted to retrieve Evelyn back but that 
leads to this problem. Nothing seems to be working for him, the world just doesn't want him to live 
in peace for even the slightest moment.

While he was dwelling inside his mind, he didn't realize that Flunra is still standing by the door.

Upon seeing Rex frowning while sitting by himself, Flunra can't help but sighs before he opens his 
mouth, "I've lived countless years, probably the oldest Supernaturals alive right now. And through 
those years, I worked with powerful entities that can impact the whole world, entities like you. One 
thing I learned that applied to all of them without exception..."

Rex looks up to see Flunra in curiosity, he's curious as to what Flunra is about to say.

"For someone to possess power that can shake the entire world, you can't just hide away from the 
world. One way or another, you will always be pulled into the open" he added before smiling lightly 
and walking out of the door.

Flunra left Rex who is clearly stunned by what he heard, his eyes are completely round.

A couple of minutes later he can't help but chuckle lightly, he ridiculed himself while shaking his 
head, 'I can't hide away, huh...' Rex thought, trying to decipher those profound words that came 
from an ancient Werewolf.

Soon enough, he managed to realize what Flunra is trying to say before he nodded his head.

"So that is what it meant. If people that possess immense power like me can't simply hide away, 
then becoming an active force is the only way to go" Rex utters in realization, he then stares at 
where Flunra left, "it seems keeping Flunra alive is one of the best choices I made"

Chapter 676 Unforseen Visit

Like a restless mother bird that searched for food to feed its hatchlings no matter if there's rainstorm 
or snow, Rex is currently sitting on the throne in the great hall while applying ointment to the severe 
wounds he suffered from the first ascension trial.

It's true that he's weakened right now, the external foreign Origin energy is messing with his body.

But there's no time to waste for him to heal first for a couple of days before dealing with the 
problems. For all he knows, Kyran might be going through a horrendous moment right now that 
simply can't be let on for longer.

Rex is waiting for Flunra and Evelyn that are going to accompany him.



Although Adhara is still unconscious inside the castle, he simply has no other choice but to trust 
Gistella in protecting her. With the Ice and Snow Full Moon still activated, Rex still needs Evelyn's 
presence to block the direct exposure that is freezing for him.

With the Ice and Snow Full Moon still shining, any Werewolf pack is forced to stay together.

Despite trusting Gistella to protect the castle while they are gone, Rex wouldn't just let her alone 
here as he needs immediate information if the castle is being attacked. In that case, he can hurry 
back to help if the situation escalated.

Knowing that Rex walks out of the castle and stands on the bridge.

Instantly his entire body feels cold again but the leftover warmth from the intimate act he did with 
Evelyn is still protecting him, the absolute coldness doesn't feel as cold as the first exposure. But it 
will eventually freeze Rex if he keeps being exposed directly like this.

Looking up to the sky, Rex then shouted, "Devo!!"

Rex called out to his spirit with a thunderous voice that reverberated into the sky, and instantly after 
that a streak of black lightning descend from the sky and hits the ground in front of him, exposing 
Devo's misty presence.

"You called me?" Devo asked with his eyes fixated on Rex.

All this while Devo has already been sent out to search for the lightning stone mine, Rex needed it 
in order to make his castle stronger. It's been days but there are still no results, but Rex finds it 
natural as elemental stone mine is pretty much searched for by the Supernaturals.

Finding one lightning stone mine untapped is unlikely, but there's still a chance.

"I want you to stop searching for the lightning stone mine for a moment and keep track of 
movement around this place, make sure that there are no opposing forces that would attack the 
castle while I'm gone. If you notice a potential attack, inform me instantly. Can you do that?" Rex 
instructed with a serious expression.

But Devo didn't mind as he already got what he wanted, a little bit of freedom. "Yes, I can."

With that Rex wave his hands again before he turns around and heads back to the castle. Devo on 
the other hand also returns back into the sky, keeping his attention on the castle's surroundings just 
like Rex wanted.

Upon returning to the great hall, Rex finds that the others are already there.

Due to most of their items being left in the mansion inside sector 2, they don't have their battle 
equipment anymore. Rex bought Evelyn and Flunra a simple black combat suit for 10,000 gold 
each, it would provide them with basic protection for now.

Rex can't buy better equipment, he doesn't have the budget to do that right now.

"What about her?" Flunra asked while pointing at Gistella.

Shifting his attention to Gistella, he finds her blushing slightly and averted his gaze. Just a moment 
ago, they are trapped in pleasure so it's not that surprising for her to still have that stuck in her mind. 
Even Rex clears his throat in response.

Reaching out his hand, Rex then said, "Come here, Gistella"



With light steps Gistella take Rex's hand before his eyes sparkled as he scanned her with the system, 
'The cursed creature that demanded the curse, it definitely belongs to the Witch of Chaos. I've never 
seen her in person, but I have a feeling that she knows me and deliberately attacks the castle when 
she knows that I'm not available...'

'Just which side is she on? I have no idea' Rex thought with a frown.

<Scanning...>

<Scanning complete!>

<Gistella has been infected by an unknown curse that finds her a suitable vassal, her vital conditions 
are stable but there's no guarantee that she would stay like this. Curses are a different realm of 
power, not necessarily stronger but definitely more complicated>

Rex frowned when he read this, it seems Flunra is true to suspect the curse is inside Gistella.

'Can you find out what kind of curse is inside her?'

<No, the curse link with Gistella is still juvenile. Only when the link is established can the curse's 
identity can be explored, usually when the curse effect is starting to take a toll on the vassal can it 
finally be identified>

Instinctively, Rex looks at Gistella with a troubled look.

Although the system said that, Rex knows that there's nothing impossible for the system at this 
point, 'If that's the case, there must be a way to hasten the curse's growth without harming Gistella. 
Am I correct?'

<Yes, but the user doesn't have enough gold to search for the required items>

Just like he had already expected, there's definitely a way but he doesn't have access to it. 'I really 
need to search for elemental stones, maybe I can demand some from them? But that doesn't really 
work well in the long run, it would just give the relationship bad faith'

Shaking his head, Rex then said, "If you feel anything, lock yourself up in your bed chamber"

"There's a curse inside of you but I can't find out what it is, and the cursed creature that came here 
for the curse inside you might come back when I'm gone. But don't worry, I'll be here to save you if 
that ever happens" he added convincingly.

Gistella was quite surprised, but she nodded her head deciding to trust Rex.

It's worrying that a curse finds its way into her, but if Rex said it's fine then it should be fine. Out of 
the people here, Rex is the most reliable one in taking care of anything. Added to what happened 
earlier, she trusted him even more.

Nodding his head, Rex then looks to the other and heads out, "Let's go, we have things to do"

~

Meanwhile, the Great Tree of the Dark Elves.



Uncle Isniu alongside the other remaining Dark Elves that helped Adhara and Gistella against the 
horde of cursed creatures got back to their territory, they managed to go through the eyes of the 
Watchers and got inside their kingdom.

Not one of the Dark Elves here know what they did, and they wanted to keep it that way.

While heading deeper into the Great Tree where his house is located, Uncle Isniu chanted a spell 
before he gets on the withered flower. Just like an elevator or a lift, the withered flower revived 
again and brought him to a particularly big house attached to the tree.

But as soon as he reached the big house, he sensed Kendel standing in front of the door.

"Kendel? Why are you standing there?" Uncle Isniu asked, he was confused as to why Kendel is 
standing in front of the door awkwardly and not getting inside, he was the son of the owner of the 
house after all.

Glancing at Uncle Isniu, he then replied meekly, "F-Father is waiting inside..."

Upon hearing this Uncle Isniu's expression tighten realizing that Kendel's father is back, he nodded 
his head before entering the big house. Following the corridor, Uncle Isniu went straight to the 
small throne room.

Knock! Knock!

Giving a couple of gentle knocks, Uncle Isniu enters the throne room.

Sitting on the throne is a figure clad in black and steel armor, covering his head is a crimson hooded 
robe that also shrouded his face in the darkness. Realizing that Uncle Isniu is standing in front of 
him, the figure slowly lifted his face to look at Uncle Isniu.

Exposing his glaring bright yellow eyes, the figure stares at Uncle Isniu for a brief moment.

Despite being related through blood, the tension inside the throne room is building up to an 
insurmountable level. Even Kendel that just got inside the room feel the choking tension inhibiting 
his lungs to reach their maximum capacity.

Black ink markings can be seen decorating the figure's face in some kind of pattern.

The center of the figure's face alongside his forehead is dyed completely black, only the eye section 
of the face is his actual skin. Soon the corner of the figure's mouth quirks up a little into a smirk, "Is 
there something you want to tell me, Blind Isniu"

"Is there any merit in me saying when you already know what I did?" Uncle Isniu replied.

Upon hearing this daunting reply the figure chuckled as he stood up from the throne, he descend the 
stairs slowly while keeping his eyes on Uncle Isniu, "Due to that fool's action, the Tigerman found 
out about the Oath Pact. We're at the edge with them, and you decided to send a helping hand to the 
Silverstar Pack?

"Is it wrong for me to assume that you know if we got found out, we can't explain ourselves?"

Not wanting to back down from his resolve, Uncle Isniu replied sternly, "Not one of the races that 
are a part of the Oath Pact dare to make the first move, we can be the one to do that. If they know 
we're aligning ourselves with the Sivlerstar Pack fully, then they would follow our footst-"



"There's a reason why nobody wants to be the first, Isniu!" the figure intervened sharply.

With an obvious hint of anger in his eyes, the figure glared at Uncle Isniu. Grinding his sharp fangs, 
the figure then turns around, "The Dwarves are helping us desolate the Tigerman, but if ever one of 
them managed to escape then they would report us to the high-ranking races. You take many of our 
abled people and come back with only a handful when we can use their strength to focus on taking 
the Tigerman down, is that really wise of you?"

Although he knows the risk, he knows that half-determining things wouldn't get them anywhere.

"One of the Silverstar Pack Members visited us, I can see that he's trying to search for information 
regarding the Oath Pack. It's clear to me that he's on our side, we can develop a relationship with the 
Silverstar Pack, they'll make a mighty ally" Uncle Isniu defended himself.

But the figure already sat back on the throne still with angry eyes, "It's not your call to make"

"King Jonik is still hesitant but you decide something that is out of your jurisdiction yourself, and 
that is unacceptable. For putting the Kingdom in danger, you're sentenced to the Dark Nature 
Tribulation" the figure declared before two Dark Elves guards entered the room abruptly.

Instead of being riled up, Uncle Isniu smiled as he got apprehended by the two guards.

Just as he was about to be taken away from the house and brought to the Dark Nature Tribulation, 
the ground suddenly shakes which caught the figure and the others inside the throne room off guard.

"What's happening? Is it the Tigerman?!" the figure abruptly stands up from the throne.

Quickly the figure and Kendel went out of the house and looks down to the ground, their eyes then 
saw a Dark Elf running into the center of the inside of the Great Tree and shouting, "Humans!! 
Three humans landed in front of the walls!!"

"Humans...?" the figure mutters with a frown.

In response to this, the Dark Elf's noble head families jump down from their respective houses.

One of them wears a fancy black with crimson hue armor and a long royal cape, it's clear that he 
was King Jorik, the King of the Dark Elves. With hurried steps, they all went to the castle walls and 
finds three humans standing in front of their gate.

Amongst the three humans, the one sitting in the middle emits a very dangerous aura.

Excluding confidence, while staring at the wall with his bright red animalistic eyes that strikes 
terror even in King Jorik's heart, an entity that has the power they can't fathom has arrived at their 
doorsteps.

Chapter 677 Dark Elf Kingdom

"General Theodas, what happened to the Watchers? Why are there three humans here?" King Jorik 
asked while eyeing the three figures standing in front of the gate, none of the Dark Elves expected 
visitors this night.

In terms of appearance, King Jorik has the same features as the other Dark Elves.

Long silver straight hair falling down to his shoulders and ashy skin which are the main features of 
the Dark Elves, his royal armor is black equipped with black and crimson long royal cape, and he 
also wears a black crown that looks more like a circlet to a crown on his head.



With sizzling energy steaming out of his body, King Jorik has the presence of a King.

Even a King such as himself can't help but feel uneasy with the sight he's seeing right now, his red 
eyes turn black for a second but he instantly frowned while looking at the three figures who are 
shrouded in darkness and can't properly be deciphered.

Despite the ability that he used in his eyes, King Jorik can't see the three figures' faces.

Something is blocking his ability to see through the darkness of the night that should be easy for a 
Dark Elf like him who lived and thrive in the night, the Dark Nature can't help him identify the 
three figures that visited the Dark Elf Kingdom.

On King Jorik's side is another Dark Elf, bearing a similar aura to King Jorik himself.

Wearing a tight combat suit layered with some armor on his vital parts and also a crimson robe that 
covers the right side of his body which hides the blade he's holding in his right hand, General 
Theodas also frowned, "I can't reach them, my King. I think they have been neutralized"

Upon hearing this, King Jorik's expression tightens in response.

"Speak of your purpose of coming here, humans!" King Jorik shouted with an authoritative tone.

For a brief moment, there was only silence, and this made hundreds of Dark Elves with some riding 
mutated black panthers pour out of the gate and assume a battle formation with a simple command 
from General Theodas.

Many bows are pointing at the three figures shrouded in darkness.

Each of the arrows has already been imbued with dark nature energy that can leave corruption to 
anything that it hits, the potential damage that can be done by dark nature energy is way higher 
compared to nature energy.

It's one of the reasons why some feared the Dark Elves more than the Elves.

Receiving nothing in response, King Jorkin then asked once again but this time there was a fierce 
look on his face knowing that this might escalate to a big fight, "What did you do to the Watchers 
guarding our territory? Did you kill them all?"

Upon his loud question, one of the three figures moved and came out of the darkness.

Coming out of the darkness is a humanoid figure wearing a white dress and surrounded with purple 
sparkling dust that flutters from each of her steps, the violet eyes and silky white purplish hair 
showed that there's something magical to her.

Not quite a human yet not quite a Supernatural, even King Jorik doesn't know what she is.

"If you're worried that we killed your 'Watchers', then you don't have to worry because we didn't kill 
them" the woman replied with her soothing voice, she kept her eyes on King Jorik and continues, 
"we're here to talk with the King. Are you the King?"

King Jorik frowned when he heard this, he was completely clueless about this situation.

Before he can even answer the woman's question, General Theodas already answered her first, "We 
do not talk or discuss with humans. Leave our territory, or we'll be forced to kick you out by force!" 
he declared followed by the sound of armor from the Dark Elves in battle formation tightening their 
stances.



As if she finds General Theodas funny, the woman chuckled while covering her mouth.

Receiving such a reaction to his threat, General Theodas already gripped the hilt of his sword 
tighter intending to insinuate a fight. But then, the woman replied, "Well, we're not quite humans 
ourselves"

"Then what power are you speaking from?" King Jorik asked, pushing General Theodas back.

Finding that King Jorik is pushing him back with his arm, General Theodas looks at him in disbelief 
but King Jorik gives him a warning look to stand down. Reluctantly, General Theodas stepped back 
and watches the exchange from behind.

Looking at King Jorik with her violet eyes, the woman replied, "Someone that you don't mess with"

"Our Alpha has come here personally to speak with the Dark Elf King and a Dark Elf called Uncle 
Isniu, it'll be beneficial for your kingdom but you've wasted our time and even pointed your bows at 
us. It's displeasing for our Alpha" she added with a monotone voice, pointing and glancing back at 
the figure at the center.

Upon hearing this, General Theodas frowned, "Alpha...? Do humans have Alphas?"

Similar to General Theodas, King Jorik is also confused as to what the woman meant by that. None 
of the humans has any reference to an Alpha, which is exclusive only to Werewolves and 
Shapeshifters.

But contrary to the others, one of the Dark Elves widened his eyes in absolute shock.

The Dark Elf that punished Uncle Isniu was the first one to be caught off guard when he heard 
Uncle Isniu being brought up, 'Could it be...?' he thought but soo he notice the mark etched on the 
woman's nape when she turns to look back

It was the symbol of a star and its silver, showing exactly what power she represents.

Without wasting any time, the Dark Elf went over to King Jorik's side like a meek scared cat and 
quickly whispered to his ears, "My King, they are not humans, they are Werewolves from the 
Silverstar Pack. I'm sure of it!"

King Jorik's eyes were opened wide upon hearing this.

Not only King Jorik but the other noble Dark Elves that heard this also sucked in a cold breath.  
Each one of them has read the Oath Pact from Queen Shanaela, the Silverstar Pack is clearly written 
there and the Alpha is the Werewolf that insinuates the Oath Pact in the first place.

Pure terror can be seen in their expressions, they didn't expect to get a visit from such a figure.

Rumble!

Out of nowhere, the ground started rumbling uncontrollably under the immense pressure from an 
aura that contains vast energy that surpassed King Jorik himself, the ground in front of them started 
to crack and split which brings chaos to the Dark Elves.

King Jorik gazed at the figure at the center and finds it stepping forward into the light.



Like the embodiment of terror and death itself, a monstrous figure came out of the darkness 
exposing its body to the shining Ice and Snow Full Moon. Exposing only a fraction of his power, 
the figure already showed that there's a terrifying power hidden inside of him to the Dark Elves.

Of course, the figure is none other than Rex.

Rex came out of the blanket of the darkness to expose himself, he can already see the bleak aura 
coming out of every single one of the Dark Elves just from him exposing a little bit of his aura, 'I 
can't do much more than this or I'll expose my location' he thought inside his head.

With his eyes shifted to the most royal-looking Dark Elf, he scanned King Jorik.

<Jorik Inaran Myrathyndra>

Race: Imperial High Dark Elf

Power: Eighth-rank (Mid) - Son of Dark Nature

Mental: 5,500

Strength: 11,700

Agility: 21,150

Endurance: 9,150

Intelligence: 15,500

'Hmm... pretty strong and a ridiculously high mental stat. Well, he's a Dark Elf so that's not a 
surprise' Rex thought before he nodded his head, the other Supernatural races that aren't a part of 
the high-rank ones don't have a ninth-rank entity.

Without a ninth-rank entity, Rex is basically invincible. It's like a knight fighting farmers, 
unbeatable.

On that note even if there's a hidden ninth-rank realm entity that the Dark Elf had, he's not that 
worried since he just reach the first ascension. If he can fight two ninth-rank realm Supernaturals 
before, then one ninth-rank entity shouldn't be a problem for him.

Nothing can stop him this night in doing whatever he wanted.

Crack!

Under the energy leaking out of Rex's body, the Dark Elves' walls also started cracking.

"Do you not want to talk to me?" Rex asked boldly while staring down each of the Dark Elves, his 
eyes then ended at King Jorik which puts the King in a predicament. As a King, he needs to be 
perceptive of the situation.

Looking at the current situation he knows that if Rex wanted to, he can destroy the entire kingdom.

Not even him who obviously has a ninth-rank realm power, but nobilities from high-ranking 
Supernatural races can flatten their entire kingdom much less an entity higher than those nobilities.

Knowing that King Jorik realized that Rex definitely has something to say.



If he didn't have anything to say then why would he bother coming here? and even if he's a wicked 
being and wanted to kill for sport, why hasn't he killed them yet? King Jorik's eyes sparkled 
knowing that this might be a chance for them.

King Jorik then glanced to the side, "Prepare the great hall, we're going to receive them"

"My King, are you really going to accept them? We can get investigated soon, and the Silverstar 
Pack coming here won't do us any good" General Theodas replied hesitatingly, he still doesn't find 
bringing the Silverstar into their kingdom a good idea.

But King Jorik gave another look at General Theodas, "I understand..." he finally replied helplessly.

A moment later.

Rex and the others walked through the gate and catch the beautiful sight of the Dark Elf Kingdom, 
there are many natural glowing ornaments such as glowing flowers, glowing leaves, and even 
glowing mutated fireflies that flies around beautifully.

It's definitely a new sight for them that hasn't really been to any Supernatural Kingdom.

Upon stepping into the Dark Elf Kingdom, many citizens of the Dark Elves peeked from the glazed 
windows of their homes. But this kind of reaction is natural, Rex is a terrifying entity to greet and 
he doesn't rebut that.

"Do you really need me to act that way? I'm a soft person at heart you know" Evelyn mutters.

Glancing at her who is pouting from being told to act overbearing and mean. Rex smiled and pinch 
her waist which made her yelp and quickly slap his hand, "Stop it! Aren't you supposed to be hating 
Supernatural? Look at you now, teasing me inside the Dark Elf Kingdom!" Evelyn complained with 
her lips pursed.

"Well, I also feel weird doing this but I need to do this to protect you guys" Rex replied.

Even though he said that he would protect them all, Evelyn heard it differently and thought that he 
meant to protect her. She didn't believe that it was literal, but even in words already made her blush.

Looking at the two, Flunra sighs and shakes his head.

'Seems like the Full Moon effect is still affecting the two, the absolute coldness will force 
Werewolves to hibernation but if the Alpha is close to the Luna the absolute coldness will only 
heighten their lust...'

'Just look at these two, we're being watched by the Dark Elves for Origin's sake!'

While standing behind them, Flunra hides his face using his hand out of embarrassment. Rex 
should've just rested this night but he just had to find out about Adhara, but then again there's no 
stopping him.

As King Jorik and a couple of guards approaches, Flunra tries to keep his cool.

Realizing that Rex and Evelyn are still teasing each other, Flunra can't help but clears his throat.

Due to that Rex noticed that King Jorik is already nearing him, he puts on an indifferent look before 
he commanded, "Lead the way, King Jorik. I've many things to discuss with you..."

Chapter 678 A Nation Cut From The War



King Jorik frown for a moment from hearing Rex calling his exact name, but realizing that he was 
dealing with a Werewolf that has taken a human form made it all make sense. With his hearing 
senses, it's not a surprise for Rex to know King Jorik's name.

Under the gazes of many, Rex and the others followed King Jorik into the great tree.

Most of the Dark Elves that lived inside the great tree which shows their high status went outside, 
they were making a path to the great tree, neatly lining on either side alongside the guards that are 
holding their weapons ready at hand.

None of them pointed at Rex and the others though, but they are ready to fire at any given time.

Rex and Evelyn looked around the place as the air inside this place feel more refreshing than the air 
outside, it seems there was something about the great tree that have this kind of soothing effect on 
the air.

In a moment, they finally entered the great tree's entrance and stopped there.

'Hmm... they have houses inside this tree too, maybe for a diversion?' Rex thought while inspecting 
the place, he already bought information regarding the Dark Elves and basically know their cultures 
and power.

Knowing their exact lifestyle, Rex smiled and inspected down rather than looking up.

Evelyn, on the other hand, was looking up at the houses that are attached to the great tree, they look 
more like mansions than houses. Viewing such a sight is the first time for Rex and Evelyn, not for 
Flunra though.

At the center of the place is a long rectangle-shaped table made of dark wood.

King Jorik went to the further side of the table while Rex sat at the other, Evelyn and Flunra are 
standing beside his chair the same as General Theodas and one other Dark Elf standing beside King 
Jorik's chair.

Sitting leisurely with his leg crossed, Rex supported his cheek with his fist.

"Tell me, King Jorik. Which one is the Dark Elf called Uncle Isniu?" Rex finally opens his mouth 
and breaks the silence, he already knows what happened during the cursed creatures' attack from 
Flunra and this Uncle Isniu helped Adhara fend off the cursed creature.

Rex is not an unreasonable man, he would of course repay good with good.

Waving his hand to the guards on the side, they brought forth a Dark Elf wearing a loose crimson 
robe with a black combat suit underneath. Rex already scanned him and finds that he was quite 
strong for a Dark Elf, mid-seventh rank realm.

From one glance he can also tell that the Dark Elf is old, the wrinkles clearly show that.

"Greeting to the Alpha of the Sivlerstar Pack, I'm the Dark Elf that goes by the name Uncle Isniu" 
Uncle Isniu introduced himself and bowed his body slightly in respect, he's presenting himself in 
front of a powerful entity after all.

In the Dark Elves' eyes, Rex is an entity that has overwhelming strength.



Such an entity that can go against the likes of Kings and Queens of the high-ranking Supernatural 
races, even Queen Shanaela got submitted completely by the Alpha of the Silverstar Pack. In front 
of such a presence, they need to humble their arrogant nature inherited from the Elves.

Looking at Uncle Isniu, Rex caught sight of the black blindfold covering Uncle Isniu's eyes.

Wanting to know if the Dark Elf is really the one that helped Adhara defend the castle from the 
cursed creatures' attack, Rex glanced at Flunra before he nodded his head affirming that it was 
indeed the same Dark Elf.

"You've helped my Female Alpha to protect my castle, why?" Rex went straight to the point.

Although he was quite grateful for the fact that Uncle Isniu and a couple of other Dark Elves helped 
Adhara to defend the castle, he knows that every piece of kindness is never completely sincere, 
there are always motives behind it even if it's only a little bit.

Gazing at Uncle Isniu curiously, he then added, "Are you seeking my help?"

Upon hearing this King Jorik can't help but look at the Dark Elf that is the head family of Uncle 
Isniu's family, he doesn't know that Uncle Isniu sent help to the Silverstar Pack castle. More than 
that, he doesn't even know that the Silverstar Pack's castle is near their territory.

Receiving that gaze, the Dark Elf only shakes his head showing that it was not his order.

Without even pondering for too long, Uncle Isniu glanced at King Jorik, asking for permission to 
answer out of respect for him. After receiving a nod, Uncle Isniu then replied confidently and 
loudly, "I saw the movement of the cursed creatures, and decided to help out. I did all of that for the 
sake of creating a friendly tie between our kingdom and the Silverstar Pack"

"Our kingdom already signed the Oath Pact, and I think it's best to engage with you" he added.

"Oath Pact...?" Rex mutters in confusion.

King Jorik saw the confusion in Rex's eyes, he then signals to the guard to bring the Oath Pact 
scroll and explained, "It's the Oath Pact to not join in the war between humans and Supernaturals, 
Queen Shanaela from the Elves created saying that you have given her a chance to make a change"

'Queen Shanaela...?' Rex thought with a frown.

But soon he remembered that he lets go of an eighth-rank realm Elf when he first gain the Banished 
Dark Moon King Mark, it was Queen Shanaela asking him to give her a chance to end the war that 
is hurting both sides.

Rex shakes his head upon remembering this, he's a different man now compared to back then.

It happened when he was still on humanity's side, he told Queen Shanaela that he was not going to 
stop and told her to only save the low-ranking Supernatural races. Other than that, the Vampires, 
Werewolves, Demons, and the other high-ranking Supernatural races, Rex would destroy them all.

Now that the incident has happened, he has no desire in pursuing the war anymore.

Soon a Dark Elf brings the Oath Pact scroll and puts it at the table in front of Rex, but it's written in 
Dark Elf language. Rex already learned Dark Elf language before, so the language barrier is not a 
problem anymore as he takes the scroll and reads it.



Upon seeing this, King Jorik clears his throat, "We can translate it for you if you want"

"There's no need" Rex replied shortly as he reads through the scroll, and this caught the Dark Elves 
by surprise as they didn't expect a Werewolf can read their language. Even for the Elves, there are 
not many Elves that can read the Dark Elf's language.

Reading through the content swiftly, Rex finds that it was exactly as King Jorik said.

Inside the Oath Pact, it was written that the Dark Elf Kingdom agreed with Queen Shanaela's 
suggestion to essentially abandon supplying forces for the war done by the high-ranking 
Supernatural races at the appropriate time and simultaneously allying together.

Below the actual Oath Pact is the signature stamp of all Dark Elves' nobilities.

Something like this is not what he expected Queen Shanaela would do, 'Well I did tell her to save as 
many low-ranking Supernatural races as she can. On top of that, this might come in handy for me 
right now'

Putting down the Oath Pact, Rex then shifted his attention back to King Jorik.

"I'm curious, how many Supernatural races have agreed to this Oath Pact?" Rex asked, that is the 
million-dollar question. Coming here is him trying to make a relationship with the Dark Elves in 
honor of Kyran.

Kyran seems to really want him to trust the Dark Elves, and he came here to honor that.

On top of that, he also wanted to learn about the humans since the Dark Elves should be nearing the 
high-rank Supernatural races. Rex is certain that the Dark Elves know a thing or two regarding the 
state of the war.

Pausing for a moment, King Jorik then replied, "Only two races have agreed if I'm not mistaken"

"Dwarves and Ogres have already submitted fully to Queen Shanaela's cause, some of the Orcs 
Kingdom is about to agree but the other Kingdoms haven't responded anything yet. Including us, 
there would be three races that agreed" he added.

Although he was not expecting anything, Rex is quite surprised by the answer.

It's not that long ago since he let Queen Shanaela go, but she already managed to rake three races 
including the Dark Elves into her side. 'She must really want to end the war, but I can use this to my 
advantage'

Nodding his head, Rex then finally confirms what he's going to do with this.

"Back then it's true that I give Queen Shanaela a chance since I'm going to destroy the high-ranking 
Supernatural races, every single one of them I wanted to kill" Rex declared which makes the Dark 
Elves' that heard this feel their blood runs cold.

Saying something like that would instantly get them killed.

But since it comes from an entity like Rex, the declaration makes their spines shiver in utter fear. If 
he's the one that said it, then that actually can happen especially knowing that King Baralt and 
Queen Catsha failed to kill him.



Not only that, Rex even managed to injure them quite a bit.

It's just another proof of his overbearing reputation.

Despite never actually fighting with Rex on the battlefield, the story of him in many instances 
defeating the Supernaturals reaches the Dark Elves' ears. Most of them thought that the stories are 
fake, but some has already given Rex a nickname to satiate their fears.

Black Owl is the nickname used by the Dark Elves for Rex.

Since he has resulted in Supernaturals' defeat numerous times, the Dark Elves called him a Black 
Owl which simply means that he's a creature that brings bad luck to the Supernaturals. Even now 
some of the Dark Elves are uneasy to stand near him.

From the showcase of power Rex did in front, now they realized that the stories must be true.

More than that, the Dark Elves' nobilities inside the great tree right now feel like the stories are not 
only true but also watered down to not crush the Supernaturals' morale. Rex surpassed everything 
they expected him to be just by saying that nonchalantly.

"I've changed now, I don't want to be involved in the war again. I assume you also don't"

Upon hearing this the Dark Elves' has changed in expression showing that they also don't want to be 
sacrificed in the war fighting for the high-rank Supernatural races, they are content with what they 
have right now.

It might change in the future but right now they are living the best lives just by having a home.

Rex smiled lightly seeing their change of expressions, "With respect to one of my pack members" 
he mutters before he glanced at Uncle Isniu, "and you for helping to defend my castle. I suggest that 
we become allies, we'll protect each other from the backlash of our doings"

"We'll help each of us strife in the midst of the Chaos, creating an untainted place"

Gazing at King Jorik with his red eyes flashing brightly, Rex then added, "How about it, King 
Jorik? I can tell that you need my help, and this is your chance. If you refuse, there's no turning 
back in the future"

With that invitation, the Dark Elves burst into a discussion as they were not expecting this.

But despite their conflicting opinions Rex doesn't seem to be fazed as he believed that the Dark 
Elves would accept his offer. "I'm surprised that you wanted to become allies with a Supernatural 
Kingdom, are you sure?" Evelyn asked from the side.

Not even looking at her, Rex pointed at Flunra with his thumb.

"Flunra just said something interesting to me, he said that someone like me can't just pull away 
from the war that involved the entire world. If I know that I wouldn't be able to hide, isn't it better to 
face the problem head-on?"

"Because of that, I have come to a decision" Rex trains his hopeful eyes forward.

"I'll make a nation that is cut away from the war, and will fight both sides if necessary..."

Chapter 679 Alliance Negotiation



Due to the fact that he got involved with Kaiser which is one of the Lunirich Gods who is able to 
forcefully essentially kidnap him for days, coupled with the attack by the cursed creatures, Rex 
knows that he can't keep going like this.

Maybe he alone would be able to survive, but the others are not cut for this kind of life.

Although he's an invincible entity in this current time with a handful that can match his strength, the 
others are not that strong compared to him. Out of the four pack members, Flunra is still probably 
the strongest due to his ancient runic power.

It's not he's the strongest in terms of raw strength, but his power makes him a formidable enemy.

Kyran, Adhara, and Gistella are probably nearing in strength, having the ability to take on eighth-
rank realm opponents as long as they are fighting in the night and can transform into their Werewolf 
form. Each has its own strength against the other, Adhara is invincible against Werewolves, Kyran 
is good against others, and Gistella can survive better.

But with the current enemies the Silverstar Pack has, their powers are not enough.

If they aren't able to fight peak eighth-rank power equally then they would be in constant danger, 
Rex needs a piece of mind if he were to move from place to place. One disturbance of focus might 
just cost a hefty price for him.

Now he realized that Kyran was right, the Silverstar Pack needs allies.

'Either humans or Supernaturals, both have their own evils. I can't deny that anymore when Giana 
decided to kill me and my family. If I'm accepting that fact, then there's no reason for me to become 
allies with a Supernatural Kingdom' Rex thought and nodded inwardly.

Although it feels weird to do this, he needs to get used to it if he wanted to keep on going.

Dark Elves don't have the power he needed to actually help protect the castle, but they have the 
number and also information that he really needs right now. In exchange for a simple task they 
probably want in return, this is not a bad deal.

On top of that, Rex is also doing this for Kyran's sake.

It was Kyran that suggest allying with some other forces, and the Dark Elf is the most reasonable.

"Well if that's the direction you wanted to go, then there's no reason for you to refuse humans inside 
this nation you wanted to create, right?" Evelyn asked from the side while they give time for the 
Dark Elves to discuss the matters amongst themselves.

Taking a deep breath and exhaling roughly, Rex then replied, "Yes, no discrimination"

"If that's the case then I have great news for you, I'll tell you after we're done with the Dark Elves" 
Evelyn added with a mysterious smile on her face, and this made Rex curious but he'll know about 
it eventually.

From his right, Flunra bent his body and whispered, "My apologies for not being able to help"

Upon hearing this Rex waved his hand as if it was not a big deal that needed Flunra apologizing. 
Since they are discussing amongst themselves, the Dark Elves cast a sound barrier spell to block the 
discussion they are doing from being heard by Rex and the others.

Of course, this kind of spell can be easily broken by Flunra. But he can't help right now.



"Don't worry, they probably want something in return. I can see it in their faces, but we have the 
overwhelming advantage in this negotiation" Rex said nonchalantly, he was not that worried about 
the Dark Elves' discussion.

A moment later, the Dark Elves finally came to a conclusion.

With the sound barrier disappearing through diluting in the air, King Jorik sat back down again at 
the other end of the table. Constructing the words inside his head for a moment, he then finally said, 
"The Dark Elf Kingdom accepts the proposition, we accept to become an ally of the Silverstar Pack. 
I believe that it's a relationship that would benefit both sides, and is happy to go through with this"

"I'm happy to hear that, King Jorik. But I know that you must have conditions..." Rex replied.

Clearing his throat before putting on a serious expression, King Jorik then lay out the conditions of 
this proposition, "Yes, I want to make sure that our alliance works on collective security only. We 
would not associate anything that correlates with attacking high-rank Supernaturals or Humans"

Upon hearing this, Rex chuckled lightly in response.

"Of course not, our alliance would prioritize collective security. If one of us is attacked, we all got 
attacked. As for attacking high-rank Supernatural races or humans, I'm sorry to say this but your 
people are not strong enough to fight my enemies..." he replied and emphasizes his last sentence.

But King Jorik didn't find any offense in this, he understands it clearly.

The entities that are after Rex is not something the Dark Elves can handle, most of them are the 
Kings and Queens of the high-rank Supernatural races. Each of them has ninth-rank realm power, 
and they won't be able to do anything except buy a little bit of time by throwing themselves on the 
way.

As he said that, Rex suddenly remembered something, "Now that we're on this topic..."

"You must understand that this alliance tilts heavily to your side, King Jorik. Having the backing of 
someone like me, I think that's worth more than anything you can offer. But I'm determined to make 
this work, all I ask is for you to hand over some of your elemental stones to me" he added.

Most of the Dark Elves' nobilities burst into a discussion when they heard this.

Elemental stone mine is the source of energy for most of the Supernatural races, and even the races 
that don't benefit from elemental stones would still need them as it's a currency in the Supernatural 
world.

It's essential for a Kingdom, the demand is quite impactful for these Dark Elves.

Just like Rex said earlier they have an overwhelming advantage in this negotiation, the Dark Elves 
would gain the help of a ninth-rank realm entity if this goes through, and there's also the chance of 
Rex destroying them right here right now.

Nothing would be too much to ask right now, but it doesn't mean they would easily give it away.

Although Rex also in a sense need them to fortify the castle's defense by having them guarding the 
inside, the walls, and the Humming Damned Forest, the Dark Elves don't need to know about that.

In their perspective, Rex only gave them this chance out of respect for Kyran and Uncle Isniu.



Raising his hand, the Dark Elves' nobilities went silent again when they saw King Jorik signaling 
for them to stop their battering. "How much are you asking? and what kind of elemental stones are 
you looking for?" King Jorik asked.

With the hope of the demand is not too bad, King Jorik doesn't want to jump to a conclusion.

"Let's say you give me 50% of your entire elemental stones, I'm asking for the elemental stones 
only not the mine itself. As for what kind of elemental stones, I don't care but I prefer them to be 
high-grade elemental stones" Rex replied leisurely, he needs these elemental stones dearly.

Devo doesn't have any sign of finding one, so he needs to gain some from the Dark Elves.

But this made King Jorik frown as he was not expecting such high demand, half of the entire 
kingdom's storage is a lot to just gave it all away. Many of the Dark Elves' nobilities already show 
their disapproval.

At the end of the day, it was up to King Jorik to decide whether to accept or not.

Knowing that this would be a tough swallow, Rex then added to convince them further and avoid 
unnecessary conflict. After all, he's not that petty. "If you think this won't benefit you, give me 
5,000 high elemental stones right now and I'll show you"

Upon hearing this, King Jorik hesitated but he doesn't see any ill intent in Rex's eyes.

Signaling to one of the Dark Elf guards again, they came back with a huge sack of high wind stones 
filling the inside. General Theodas is already worried that they might be tricked, his hand is already 
at the hilt of his weapon.

Rex reaches for the sack of high-wind stones before out of nowhere the entire sack disappeared.

Each one of the Dark Elves' nobilities widened their eyes upon seeing this including King Jorik 
himself, they can't believe what they are seeing right now. It's been rumored that the Alpha of the 
Silverstar Pack has talent in magic too.

It's been said that the Alpha has lightning magic, which is very unusual for a Werewolf to have.

But this completely blew their minds, the Dark Elves' minds can't comprehend what they saw just 
now. Something that they never thought Rex would do, an element that is so rare that even most of 
them only knew that it was from a fairytale.

"Did the high wind stones just disappear...?"

"S-Space Magic?!"

"Impossible! That element is a myth! Moreover, how can a Werewolf use that kind of magic?!"

Most of them are caught by surprise went they saw Rex putting the high-wind stones inside the 
inventory. For them, it looks like he was using space elements but that's not the case, he was just 
converting the high wind stones into gold through the system.

Rex doesn't want to clear their misunderstanding though, it's working in his favor.

<Does the user wants to buy Dark Nature's Grasp for 5,000 Gold?>

'Yes...'



<The user has successfully bought Dark Nature's Grasp, please select a compatible target to be 
infused with Dark Nature's Grasp. Only works on entities that have affiliation with Dark nature>

Upon the notification from the system, Rex summoned the item he just bought from the system.

Swoosh!!

Out of nowhere a surge of brown energy started to create a subtle whirlwind around the place that 
once again surprises the Dark Elves, their jaws are on the floor seeing the root filled with an 
overwhelming amount of dark nature energy floating on Rex's hand.

It came out of thin air, but the Dark Elves blamed it that on Rex's 'space element'.

King Jorik looks at the Dark Nature's Grasp as his red eyes turned black again, he then raised his 
eyebrows in absolute awe when he saw the sheer amount of dark nature energy that the magical root 
contains.

Something like this should be considered a sacred artifact by the Dark Elf race.

But Rex just takes it out as if it was nothing, truly a power that goes beyond the comprehension of 
many. King Jorik is certainly tempted by the Dark Nature's Grasp, his eyes can't hide that fact 
despite bearing himself as a King.

"Dark Nature's Grasp, it will give the ability called Dark Hand when absorbed" Rex declared.

Glancing at each of the Dark Elves that are present here, he then continues, "Dark Hand ability will 
allow you to drain energy from your opponent's through a touch and convert it to dark nature 
energy, it will work to those similar in power or even a little bit higher than the user itself"

Upon hearing this, King Jorik instantly replied, "We agree with the 50% elemental stones"

'I can't blame him for yielding this fast' Rex smirked knowing that this is an item that is very 
beneficial to the Dark Elves, he asked the system for recommendations and the system suggested 
this one.

Rex asked for exactly 5,000 high elemental stones which are equivalent to 5,000 gold.

With that gold, he bought the Dark Nature's Grasp from the system's shop, and that allows him to 
quickly convince the Dark Elves that agreeing with his condition will benefit them. It's clear that 
they would not refuse anymore now.

Just as he thought that he was finished here, King Jorik suddenly continued.

"We'll accept to give you half of our storage elemental stones, but I also wanted a small thing in 
exchange. If you agree, I don't mind giving you 60 or 70% of our storage elemental stones" he said 
with a serious expression.

Rex's attention is piqued right now, he's curious about what King Jorik wanted.

Signaling for a female dark elf to step forward from the side, King Jorik then said, "I wanted to 
betroth this beautiful lady right here, her name is Naela. I hope you can accept this, for the goodwill 
of our alliance..."

Chapter 680 Misinterpretration



Expecting something vastly different from what King Jorik said, Rex was utterly speechless when 
he heard the small request that King Jorik wanted. It turns out that he wanted to betroth a Dark Elf 
to him, and that is something that blew his mind.

'How is that a small request... I should've expected this' Rex thought trying to keep his stoic face.

But out of nowhere a surge of energy exploded from the side catching everyone around the table in 
surprise, it was a surge of purple energy that went rampant and violent. It came from Evelyn that 
heard the absurd request that King Jorik offered.

Kaboom!

Following the explosion of energy is a violent wind shockwave that almost flipped the table.

With both of her eyes turning violet, she glared at King Jorik.

"Did you actually think that the Alpha would marry one of you? More than that, you asked that kind 
of request in front of me?! Not going to happen, don't make me laugh!!" Evelyn shouted angrily, she 
was flabbergasted by the request.

Due to her leaking purple dust due to the full moon, the Dark Elves knew she was the Luna.

Evelyn refused to believe that these Dark Elves doesn't realize that she was the Luna of the 
Silverstar Pack. If they knew about her, then how could they ask such a request in front of her? 
Something like that is insane.

It's like she got slapped on the face from being disrespected like that.

Sharing a man such as Rex with the others is a completely different thing than this, Evelyn started 
to feel the urge to tear King Jorik and the female Dark Elf apart. If Adhara or Gistella are here, they 
would probably do the same.

Even Flunra thought that it was a stupid request, King Jorik should've known that.

Most of the guards and the Dark Elves' nobilities instantly went into their battle stances, pointing 
their weapons at Rex and the others out of reflex. Of course, that sudden surge of energy catches 
them off guard.

While looking around and saw weapons pointed at him, Rex smiled nonchalantly.

Although none of these weapons are able to hurt him with the strength he currently had, the gestures 
are not appreciated at all. Shifting his eyes back to King Jorik, Rex gave him a warning look 
signaling for him to tell the Dark Elves to stand down.

"Lower your weapon, and do not do that again until this meeting is over" King Jorik commanded.

Upon hearing this the other Dark Elves obeyed and lower their weapons, even though Evelyn is still 
glaring at them all. If eyes can kill then she would've killed them ten times over, she seems to want 
to swallow them all from the absurd request.

Rex glanced at Evelyn, telling her to stand down and she did reluctantly.

Now that the place has become tranquil again despite the tension being very high as the Dark Elves 
are looking at Evelyn warily, Rex puts both of his elbows on the table before he inspected the 
female Dark Elf who just stepped forward.



Averting her eyes nervously, the female Dark Elf seems to be quite young for their race.

Nalea has glowing blue eyes and her face is quite delicate and tender, it makes her emit a 
comforting vibe. Her pointy ears are pointing downwards and she's gripping the edge of her dress, 
showing that she's nervous about the situation, especially Evelyn's glare that pierces her face.

Something that a young Dark Elf like her is not used to.

Her very long white hair tied into a ponytail is featured even more due to her black dress with long 
black feathers at the collar that made her look like a princess, the black dress fits her appearance 
and body perfectly.

On top of that, she also wears sparkling iron earrings and a beautiful necklace wrapping her neck.

Rex finds that she's quite attractive for a Dark Elf, but the clothes that she's wearing now catch his 
attention since it's almost as if Naela knows that he would come here and prepare a dress that would 
make her stand out.

After inspecting her, Rex then said, "I hope you know that what you asked is very offensive"

Even though Naela is a charming Dark Elf that could ensnare the hearts of men, Rex already has the 
others that don't pale in comparison. There was no need for another woman, and he made that pretty 
obvious through his expression.

While saying that, Rex is thinking inside his head, 'Something is off...'

 'I'm quite certain that King Jorik wouldn't say anything to offend me knowing that 
I could destroy this place entirely, so there's no way he wanted to betroth Naela 
to me. If so then he would be quite a fool to assume that I would agree'

But King Jorik instantly realized the misunderstanding as he raises his hand gently.

"My apologies for not being clear, I won't dare to betroth anyone to the Alpha in front of the Luna. I 
wouldn't even dare ask of such a thing even if the Luna is not here, all I'm asking is to betroth Naela 
to one of your pack members"

"I heard that there's one that is as young as Naela too" King Jorik explained clearly.

Upon hearing this Evelyn widened her eyes for a bit before she calmed herself down, she thought 
that King Jorik wanted to betroth Naela to Rex which is not going to happen. 'I was about to say, I 
can't believe he would say that' Evelyn thought while clearing her throat and retracting her energy 
back.

Rex also nodded his head, it seems he was right, something is off from that request.

'Wait, if that's the case is he talking about Kyran...?' Rex thought with a frown.

King Jorik sighed in relief when he saw Evelyn is already calmed down, it was just a simple 
misunderstanding. "Naela here and one of your pack members are already married in our eyes, but I 
know that others don't know of our cultures which is why I'm asking you properly for them two to 
be together. I hope you will give your blessing for them, this will certainly strengthen our bond"

"Married...? How did that happen?" Evelyn mutters in surprise on the side.



Not one of them knows how to react right now, they can't fathom how can this happen to Kyran.

Rex, on the other hand, can somewhat guess how this happen, he knows the Dark Elves' culture 
from the information he bought from the system. It's quite detailed, he make sure to read all of it 
since he was going to negotiate with them.

One of the things he learned is that Dark Elves are born with something unique.

Dark Elves are born with something called Blessing of Dark Nature or also called the Orb of Life.

Just like the Elves, the Dark Elves are born having fair skin and pointy ears. Most of them are 
talented in nature magic, but what sets the difference is that Dark Elves were born with the Orb of 
Life. With time, Dark Elves would have their appearance changed by this Orb of Life.

Soon their skin would become ashy, and their magic will start to lean more toward Dark Nature.

The Dark Elves consider the Orb of Life to be their own fate written by the Dark Nature, and when 
they reach their adulthood the Orb of Life will come out of their bodies and be used as an amplifier 
to their bows as it contains immense Dark Nature energy.

'Whatever happened, it must have something to do with her Orb of Life' Rex thought with a nod.

Looking back at Naela before King Jorik again, Rex finally said his piece, "I've never been against 
true love, if that's what Naela wants then so be it. But I'll only give my blessing if he also accepts 
this relationship"

"Marvelous, then it's settled. It's the birth of our alliance" King Jorik declared with an excited smile.

But instead of rejoicing at the successful negotiation, Rex's expression kept stern which caught 
King Jorik's attention, "Yes, but there's a slight problem with that. I hope the Dark Elves can help 
me with this problem..."

~

The next day.

As the matters with the Dark Elf Kingdom went smoothly, they are now back at the castle.

Rex is currently sitting on his throne in the great hall with both of his hands on the throne handles 
and his eyes closed, the new King Mark on his forehead is glowing with a subtle red hue as it seems 
he was in a dream-like state.

Since he needs to save Kyran, he would need to do one thing first before making his move.

Learning the Brutal Impulse Moon Ability that he had gained from the previous quest of the first 
ascension trial, he needs to master that ability so he can effectively deal with the problem that might 
arise along the way.

But right now, he's currently using the Oracle of Moon Ability item.

The system explained that the Oracle of Moon Ability is an item that would help Rex in learning a 
Moon Ability faster, he would be given a dream where he could use the said Moon Ability that he 
wanted to master.

It will allow Rex to feel the flow of kingly energy to cast the Moon Ability.



Rex's body would then be able to remember the flow and all he needs is to mimic the flow of kingly 
energy, this will make controlling the kingly energy in that particular flow way easier compared to 
trying it without the Oracle of Moon Ability.

'Wait for me, Kyran. I'm coming for you...'

Not only him, but the others are also either training or recuperating.

Evelyn is training to reach the next realm which is the seventh-rank realm that would allow her to 
summon her spirits' physical form, she's the Luna but she still needs to be able to protect herself 
when she's alone.

On the other hand, Gistella and Flunra are resting in their own rooms to get back to their 100%.

With Rex's presence back at the castle, a change happened.

Since the castle that Rex bought is a very powerful castle, it has some extraordinary effects but most 
of them are locked. It would be unlocked when the castle is upgraded using elemental stones, but 
for now, there's one effect that influenced the others greatly.

It was an effect called Godsend King Effect.

Godsend King Effect will allow the castle to gather or suck elemental mana, spirit energy, and other 
energies in the surroundings at an effective pace automatically when the Owner is present inside the 
castle. It basically means that anyone that trains inside the castle will have a 5x amplifier.

Adhara and Evelyn would be benefitted from this the most, their growth will receive a 5x boost.

Not only that but the mix of energies gathered by the castle makes the air inside the castle 
comfortable, it's not a powerful effect but a rather convenient one as they are surrounded by the 
Humming Damned Forest that is filled with cursed creatures.

Soon the dream ended, and Rex's eyelids started to tremble for a bit.

Opening and blinking his red eyes a couple of times, Rex adjusted his eyes to see the great hall after 
using the Oracle of Moon Ability. It's quite draining mentally, but he's determined to learn it as soon 
as possible.

At least he needs to know if Kyran is okay, if not he would be stressed out all the time.

Rex looks around the great hall and finds nobody, his mind is still stuck in the dream that he got 
earlier before a smile appeared on his face. Clenching his fists, his eyes glisten fiercely as he pities 
the person that decided to hold Kyran hostage.

"Brutal Impulse, huh... with it I think I can take on King Baralt and Queen Catsha easily" Rex 
grinned.
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