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Chapter 91 Eyes Of Terror

In the Vampire Kingdom,

"Princess, please, you have to drink at least this glass of blood, or I will be in trouble", a vampire 
wearing a maid outfit pleaded to Calidora.

Calidora threw her face away not intending to drink the blood in front of her.

The maid sigh helplessly, "Why princess? You hardly reject any blood in the past, why did you 
suddenly become like this?"

Calidora slapped the glass, the glass smashes to the wall before it shatters into pieces, "I already 
told you, I want that Werewolf blood! I don't like humans blood anymore", Calidora said angrily.

The maid was surprised, she never experiences this side of Calidora since birth.

It's not that she didn't want to get Werewolf blood for Calidora, it's just that it can spell civil war 
amongst the Supernatural kingdoms from one minuscule mistake.

The supernatural is also in a temporary peace with each other just like humans, and civil war during 
a war against humans is devastating for them.

Unknown to her, Calidora is talking about a different Werewolf.

She then started to clean the shattered glass when suddenly,

Creak...

The door opened revealing a stunning vampire wearing a black and red dress. The dress only covers 
her upper body, a red skirt decorates the dress covering her buttocks, and an extended flowery 
pattern blooms on her right shoulder. Black stockings cover her calves with black heels at the end of 
them.

Her pinkish hair, pink lips, and her pink fingernails mixed beautifully on her appearance. She is 
Nezera, Calidora's mother, and she is breathtaking, to say the least.

"Calidora, my daughter. Why do you refuse to drink human blood?", she said gracefully, her 
soothing voice echoed in the room.

The maid lowers her gaze and kneels on the ground respectfully.

Calidora glance at her mother and said, "I want that Werewolf blood, and I will get it!"

Nezera frowns, Calidora never acts like this in front of her especially when she always treats her 
good, "Is it because of the human-skinned Werewolf you met?"

"I WANT HIS BLOOD!!"

Tremble!

Calidora's voice makes the room tremble, her eyes glow blazing red with a weird pattern in them.

Looking at this, Nezera was taken aback, "Vam...Vampiric Eyes! Eyes of Terror!"

Nezera can't believe what she's seeing,



Calidora's eyes make even herself felt suppressed, Calidora's eyes are looking down on her as if 
she's an inferior vampire that is looking into a queen of vampires.

Her body trembles with excitement, "Wonderful! this is the time to celebrate! I will do all I can to 
obtain that Werewolf's blood", she said with a wide smile on her face, she wanted to go out and tell 
Solomon about this but stopped by Calidora's voice.

"No, I want to get his blood myself", Calidora said decisively, a crazed smile appear on her face.

Nezera stopped on her track and replied, "Yes, I will ask your father to do a Bloodfest ritual. After 
that, you can get that Werewolf's blood yourself"

After receiving the great news, Nezera left the room with a smile.

"Your highness, the Undead King, King Lax'rad has arrived and is waiting for you", a guard 
suddenly approaches her and said while bowing his head.

Nezera just got out of Calidora's room, she waved her hand, "Bring him to the throne room, treat 
him with respect"

After getting Nezera's command, the guard bowed before he left her.

Not long after, Nezera is already sitting on the throne beside the main throne where Solomon 
usually sits, the throne door then suddenly opens revealing Lax'rad and his guards.

Lax'rad is clad with a black robe that covers all of his body completely, his skeleton head has astral 
white hair that flutters every time he steps. a circle black runic pattern floats on his back, and white 
smoke came out of his inside making the ground misty.

The guards beside him are clad in full armor with a bluish aura around them, two horns came out of 
their skeletal heads, and they are all moving in sync.

Lax'rad spread his hands while holding a black staff that emits a death aura, "Nezera my beautiful 
friend", he greeted.

"Lax'rad, welcome to my humble castle", Nezera replied, she also spread her black wings as an act 
of dominance in front of Lax'rad.

Lax'rad chuckles with his astral voice as they both approach each other, although they look friendly 
one can feel the tension filling the air around them.

"I must say, your wing grew for quite a bit from the last time I saw them", Lax'rad said while 
holding his chin, his skeletal hand makes a weird cracking sound as he moves it.

He then continues, "Where's Solomon? I didn't quite see him for a while", Lax'rad stops a couple of 
steps away from the throne.

Nezera ignores Lax'rad's remark with a cold look, "You came here to see Demelza am I correct?"

"No pleasantries? Well whatever, indeed I came here to check on the spell research that your race 
claim to have managed to break through, allowing us to use different races spells", Lax'rad said 
with a doubtful look, his hollow eyes then notice a figure on his right.



Nezera smirked pridefully, "Well, how about you talk to her now? Demelza, please", she signals 
before a woman appears from the dark corner.

~

Meanwhile,

Rex is waiting for Kiru to get back with Edward, he's currently in thought, 'I bet everything on Kiru, 
if not then the next full-moon I will certainly go berserk"

His train of thoughts interrupted by Edward, "So, you're fighting Kevin huh?"

"Yeah, I promised someone to fight him so yeah, here I am", Rex replied nonchalantly, the scene 
where Rosie almost killed herself in the restaurant in front of her parents seeped past his mind.

Although he doesn't like being used like this, he can't help to admit that he felt something for her.

"I'm guessing it's your girlfriend right?", Edward said after studying Rex's expression.

Rex glance at him briefly, he then sighs, "Is it that obvious?"

"Yep, pretty obvious for me", Edward chuckles lightly, Rex's expression as soon as he tells that can 
be read easily by him.

Rex scratches his head, "Just change the topic, I don't want to talk about that"

Edward laughs lightly, "So you can be embarrassed like that? That's new. Fine, then what about 
your awakening? When did you Awakened?", he asks.

"Just a while ago, I'm still new to this Awakened power", Rex answers.

Edward studied him with a frown, "Why can't I forcefully sense your element? There's no way it's a 
higher rank element right?"

Hearing this, Rex wanted to show Edward his black lightning but suddenly he senses a figure 
approaching them.

"Take the girl, he's back already", Rex said.

Not long after, the door opened revealing Kiru with Chris in his hand.

Rex looks at Kiru before he looks at his phone, "That's quite ahead of schedule, I'm impressed", he 
said nonchalantly.

"Give my sister back! I brought you what you want", he said before throwing Chris in front of Rex.

Rex looks at Chris in delight, at least he doesn't need to find a way to kidnap Chris in this Sector 2E 
which he didn't know anything about.

Edward got out of the other room with Miru in hand, she has no energy left.

Kiru noticed that Miru still has her clothes on so he was relieved, he then glances at Rex, "Give her 
back! We have a deal"

"I know but you know that this thing CAN get leaked right?", Rex said as his body cracked with 
black lightning.

Looking at this, Edward was shocked while Kiru's face went pale.



Kiru steps back unconsciously as he felt his element got suppressed, the black lightning is emitting 
a terrifying amount of energy that he got rooted on the ground.

"But...but you said we have a deal!", Kiru said desperately.

He looks at Miru in worry, he can feel that he will not survive this next minute. As soon as Rex 
makes his move, he will probably lose his life.

Rex's eyes glint fiercely, 'I'm sorry but I can't let you guys live, Duncan will certainly find you guys 
and interrogate you', Rex thought, he felt wrong but he has to do it.

Just as Rex wanted to strike, his eyes then suddenly saw a glistering item.

He looks towards this item on Chris's necklace, his eyes glister as he checked the item.

<Necklace of the Sullivan>

The necklace is specifically made for Sullivan's family members by combining Mirage Steel and 
Sonar Crystal that will transmit energy to the Necklace watcher, the wearer of this necklace's 
location is tracked by the Sullivan Family.

Reading this, Rex widened his eyes in panic.

He already felt an immense aura approaching them fast, it is definitely the Sullivan's.

Rex ripped the metallic bookcase's handle and threw it at Chris immediately killing him, his 
decisive manner greatly shock everybody but he has to do it.

If he waited for a little while longer, he's afraid that Chris can't be killed anymore.

Chris died just like that without even being conscious, he didn't even know how and who killed 
him.

<Berserk Quest Completed!>

<Pride of a Friend>

<Obtained 500,000 Exp, 8,000 gold, Invincible x1, and High Ore of Vindication x10>

<Killed a peak rank three Awakened, Obtained 5,000 Exp>

Rex didn't have the time to check the system's notification as he shouted, "Edward! Run!!"

BOOM!!

Before they can even move from their spot, the ground trembles as something landed in front of the 
small warehouse they're in.

Rex felt the immense aura from the outside that is raging violently,

Kiru, Edward, and Miru got flung away because of the shockwave before they hit the wall, Rex was 
able to stand the shockwaves because he was ready for it.

Without any suspense, the figure that has just landed creates a fire claw and ripped through the 
warehouse.

GRAK!!



The warehouse front got ripped all the way through revealing the insides.

What greeted Rex is a bulky man as big as him, he wears a brown shirt with leather straps all over 
him and combat pants. A huge battleax hung behind his back emitting an intense heat, it certainly is 
high-rank battle equipment.

His hazel eyes glance at Rex and the others, he saw Chris' corpse with a darkened expression, "You 
brats dared to kill the successors of Sullivan's family?! I will kill you all!", he roared in anger.

The roar was mighty and loud, it frightens Kiru and Miru. They can feel the heavy suppressing aura 
from the man.

Rex's eyes glister,

<Mad Ronald>

Race: Human

Power: Rank Five(Early) - Eternal Fire Elementalist

Mental: 70

Strength: 150 (+20)

Agility: 60

Endurance: 95

Intelligence: 200

Rex gritted his teeth, 'System, what is the Eternal Fire rank?'

<Eternal Fire is a mid-second rank element>

Reading this, Rex thought, 'Although my black lightning is of a higher rank, it is still bad, their rank 
is too far apart and he can't overpower Ronald with his element.', he then glances to his side, 
'Edward is still here, and this can be really bad'

He can't run, if he runs then all of his plans will be exposed and two families will hunt him down.

The only thing he can do is to fight!

Crack!

Rex cracked his neck as he walks forward, "You should've let me kill him, now I will have to kill 
you too", he said while black lightning current started to blitz around his body.

The man raises his eyebrows, "High-rank element, you're a pretty good kid but I can tell that you're 
only rank two", he said with a mocking smile.

Edward from the side was also shocked, this is the first time he saw Rex's element and it is a peak 
rank two-element nonetheless!

The crescent moon shone Rex's back like an illuminous smile in the night sky.

Rex stretches out his hands, a brutal smile appeared on his face as he said menacingly, "Let's see 
who will survive this night!"

Chapter 92 Killing Chris Sullivan



Rex wears his battle gloves as he spreads his hands, "Let's see who will survive this night!"

BOOM!!

The ground cracked under Rex's might,

Rex flashes from his spot turning into a black current, he already envelopes his body with Force and 
also black lightning.

His movement is lightning fast, Ronal grabs his battleax and puts it in front of him in defense.

BAM!!

In a flash, Rex already sent a punch but got blocked by Ronald's battleax.

"Your talent is limitless, I don't know who you are or where you come from, but you will die 
today!", Ronald said as a red rune on his left arm glows fiery, fire mana started to havoc around his 
body, it then creates concentrated fire mana before suddenly, "Nova Burst!!"

BOOM!

The red barrier exploded right in front of Rex sending him flinging away, his skin is scorched by the 
fire.

Fire burns the surroundings making the night lit up in flame, the fire stubbornly envelops the 
surrounding inflame even though water came out of the white ground after detecting the fire.

Rex regains his standing but Ronald already dashes towards Kiru, he didn't even jump over Chris's 
corpse in respect.

Kiru was still shocked but he shakes his daze and turns into smoke, he turned into smoke right 
before a fiery battleax slashed past him.

Swoosh!!

It sent devastating shockwaves to the surrounding, it scorched everything that caught in its 
trajectory.

Although Kiru can evade the attack, the high-rank fire still scorched him because of the heat it 
emitted, and also the fire got enhanced by the battleax Ronald wield.

"Ahh!", Kiru's smoke form got swatted away as he turns back to normal.

Before he got back up, Ronald's hand already burns with fire as he spits out a bright orange flame 
from his hand burning Kiru's body.

Kiru's well-being is unknown, he is burning with flame.

Ronald's eyes glister, he then glances at Edward fiercely before dashing in like a raging fiery bull.

"Fire Titan Art! Unbreakable Body!", Edward chanted as his body cracked with fire, it sways 
around stiffly because of Ronald's fire suppression but the fiery figure still emerges from Edward's 
body and shields him.

CLANG!!!

The fiery figure got destroyed instantly,



Edward who is an early rank four Awakened doesn't stand a chance against Ronald, he got flung 
away crashing into the wall before breaking it.

Blood spurted all around his body endlessly, only one attack from Ronald almost killed him.

Ronald didn't stop, he intended to finish all the guys around before fighting Rex.

It is a good strategy because he can feel that killing Rex will be harder than the rest, although 
Ronald can only feel a rank two power from Rex, Rex's demeanor makes him on guard.

He raises his battleax and swung it down intending to finish Edward but got intercepted,

Rex gritted his teeth as he uses his flash skill to intercept the battleax, he can't watch his only friend 
died again.

BAM!!

Rex crossed his arm in front of his body, the battle gloves clash against the battleax violently.

Fire shockwave gushed out because of the impact, the ground beneath Rex cracked making him 
kneel on one leg!

The Force Barrier around him got destroyed, one can also see that Rex's battle gloves can hardly 
sustain one attack from Ronald, 'It's heavy! I don't have much choice'

On the other hand, Ronald was shocked!

'This kid, he can even block my attack?!', he thought, he can't believe that a teenager like Rex can 
be his match.

Out of nowhere, Rex's body glows as moonlight energy got sucked into him.

<The user's stats have been increased by 25%>

Rex felt his power brimming with energy, he turns his hand and gripped the battleax.

Ronald was surprised to see the sudden change,

Rex's hands got burned by the Eternal Fire but he held on with the help of his fire resistance that 
played their part, Rex can somehow felt that some of the fire heat got canceled.

He then stands back up while holding the battleax under Ronald's gaze,

Seeing this, Ronald's eyes widened even more!

Before Rex can do anything,

Edward didn't want to be a burden, he jumped from Rex's back and punches Ronald's face, 
"Colossal Punch!"

BAM!

The punch landed solidly but Edward's fire didn't scratch Ronald's,

"You pesky little brat! You can't hurt me!", the punch didn't even move Ronald even for a bit but 
that gives a solid two seconds window for Rex.

Rex parry the battleax, he goes under Ronald as his fists glow with a white hue,



"Force Beam!!"

BAM!!

"Huakh!!", Ronald was caught off guard because of Edward's distraction.

He was surprised by the strength from Rex's punches, he didn't expect Rex's punch to be this heavy 
as he spat a mouthful of blood.

Ronald gritted his teeth before he punches Rex making him flew to the side, Ronald is still a rank 
five Awakened and his hit are all very powerful.

He then looks at Edward fiercely as he reaches out his fiery hand to Edward,

Edward can only roll to the side dodging Ronald's hand, he knew that another hit from Ronald will 
certainly end him.

SWOOSH!!

Edward frown in pain, although he dodges it the heat Ronald emit is no joke.

The Eternal Fire corrodes his body even though he's also a Fire Elementalist.

From the corner of his eyes, he saw Rex is sneaking from the back so Edward decided to just hold 
on a bit longer.

Ronald is swinging his fiery battleax madly, he didn't care what got in his way.

Although Ronald's movement is fast, Edward manages to dodge with as little movement as possible 
thanks to his training in the military.

Just after Edward desperately dodges Ronald's attack,

Ronald suddenly stops in his track, the heat emitting from him started to grow hotter and hotter, 
"Do you think I will fall to the same thing again?!", he roared.

His eyes flash as if a flame burning inside it, he glanced at Rex who already leaped towards him.

Seeing this, Rex wanted to dodge but he can't change his momentum suddenly to dodge Ronald's 
attack.

He can see that Ronald's next spell is a very powerful one, the fire mana gather like crazy and it is 
also enhanced by the rune on his arm.

The fire around Ronald's body becomes thicker, it turns into two circles enveloping his arm and also 
his battleax.

The rune on his left arm glows responding to the two fire circles, fire mana got condensed into his 
battleax making the ground tremble, "Great Magic! Ring of Hellfire!"

In the nick of the intense moment, 'What do I do? I can't dodge this', Rex thought.

'This attack will surely cut me in half, I can't defend against this. Even if I use Alpha Intimidation, it 
will still cut me in half', his eyes are glued to Ronald.

He's trying to think of something then he realized, 'The system's reward!'



From killing Chris he just got an item that he didn't know, he got 10 High Ore of Versatility. 
Without thinking much, 'System! Use every item I have to enhance my body!'

10 Ores and a white fang suddenly appear out of nowhere and merge with Rex's body, then 
notifications appeared.

<Obtained 4000 Body Exp>

<The user's body leveled up to level 8!>

<Increase the user's Endurance stat by 15>

<Obtained 2000 Claw Exp>

<The user's claw leveled up to level 5>

<Increase the user's Strength stat by 6>

Rex puts everything on the line, he activates Alpha Intimidation to lowers Ronald's firepower.

<The target's stats has been decreased by 30%>

SWOOSH!!

Ronald got dazed for a little but he still swings his battleax in a circle, it sent a fire slash around his 
body threatening to burn the surrounding in flame.

The fire slash is akin to volcanoes erupting within Ronald's body, it turns the surrounding in red.

"What happen here?", a couple of FAA members hears the loud commotion.

They wanted to check where the commotion came from but were greeted by a devastating battle, 
their legs went weak in shock as they saw a fire slash aiming towards them.

Rex's eyes turn bloodshot, he gathers all the white force he can and split them into two. One for 
enveloping his body while one gathers on his hand.

He did this in less than a second, the fire slash is already in front of him.

It brought an unimaginable heat as if Rex is standing beside a volcano, it sizzles everything into 
black charcoal no matter what it is.

Edward already takes cover behind the small warehouse wall, he will not get hit directly by the fire 
slash.

Rex on the other hand already gritted his teeth as he punches the fire slash with all his might, he 
also added his black lightning, "Force Beam!"

BOOM!!

The force, the black lightning, and the fire mana clashes violently resisting each other, this creates 
powerful shockwaves of different colors.

Rex held out his punch not intending to back down, he can feel his bones cracking and his skin 
burning.

His battle gloves shattered because of the collision, it can't handle the amount of heat from the fire 
slash.



"RAARGHH!!", Rex roared as the fire slash destroyed his Force Beam and slash his gut.

BOOM!!

The fire slash exploded upon contacting Rex's body, It was so devastating that it destroyed all of the 
areas in hundreds of meters diameter.

A black cloud of smoke covers the whole place, it envelopes everyone's vision.

Ronald stands straight as he looks at the cloud of smoke, he squinted his eyes trying to locate Rex's 
whereabouts, 'He's dead, right? There's no way he can be alive after that'

His breath is heavy, it takes a huge chunk of his stamina by using that skill.

The place is in ruins, the warehouses got flattened, and even the ground is broken.

*Cough* *Cough*

Edward coughs as he struggles to stand up, he then realized that Rex just got hit by Ronald's 
ultimate attack, 'Rex?! Where is he?!'

The place is silent, there is no sound coming out of Rex's direction.

Ronald nodded his head as he glances at the remaining people,

Edward was stunned as he felt Ronald's glance, he's in a bad shape. His head is bleeding and his 
arms are burnt.

On the other hand, Kiru and Miru are not that much better either.

Kiru is coughing blood, he got hit by Ronald's Eternal Fire and it still feels like his body is burning 
and he's paralyzed while Miru is unmoving.

Thud!

Thud!

Ronald stomps the ground angrily towards Edward, he got a brutal smile on his face.

Although Ronald looks okay, Edward can see that Ronald is exhausted. He's probably will end up 
with Mana Exhaustion if he keeps on going, 'I must stall and make him more tired'

Edward gets into his battle position forcefully, he needs to at least buy 10 minutes.

But just before Ronald can get any closer,

BLITZ!!

"Huh?", Ronald glance to the side and saw a claw enveloped in black lightning right in front of his 
eyes, he widened his eyes in shock.

SLASH!!

"AAKHH!! YOU BASTARD!!", Ronald shouted in pain, he's holding his right eye that is already 
hollow with nothing in it.

He kneels while holding his head, the pain from having his right eye removed is not something he 
can endure.



Rex appeared out of nowhere with heavy breaths, Ronald's right eye is on his hand.

He's in very bad shape.

There is a brutal slash wound on his stomach that is bleeding profusely, his head is bleeding, his 
body is burnt in multiple places, and his clothes got burned leaving him shirtless.

His regenerative ability help him to sustain his injury, and also his sheer willpower.

"HOW?! YOU'RE JUST A DAMN RANK TWO!!", Ronald roared angrily, his strongest attack 
can't even kill a rank two Awakened.

It's not that he's weak, regular rank two Awakened or even peak rank four Awakened will definitely 
get obliterated by him but Rex is not just only a rank two Awakened, he's also a Werewolf and have 
the system.

Rex inhales a deep breath and closes his eyes, he then exhales while slowly opening his cold eyes 
before he suddenly disappears.

He uses flash to close the distance between him and Ronald with his arm glowing with a white hue, 
his nails turned into claws as he intended to finish Ronald off.

It is at lightning speed that even Edward got dazed by Rex's movement.

Ronald forcefully stands back up,

He tries to gather fire mana but to his surprise, he can't do it.

He widened his eyes, something is messing up with his mana channeling and he doesn't have 
enough mana to remove it forcefully.

Rex's attack before contains his black lightning, due to Ronald weakened state the black lightning 
manages to disturbed his insides.

Awakened can also get exhausted, if they got exhausted then they can't gather mana. Force, on the 
other hand, is limitless.

Rex can use it infinitely because his body naturally absorbs Force, unlike mana that needs to be 
replenished.

"NO!! I can't lose to a brat!", Ronald shouted but it was no use.

CRACK!!

Rex's claw pierced straight through Ronald's right chest, blood started to flow violently as Ronald's 
eyes turn red.

He can't even react before Rex's claw stabbed through him, Rex's claw penetrate his chest 
completely until it came out of his back.

'What? How did he?'

Spurt!!

Ronald coughs out blood as he holds Rex's hand, he raises his head up to meet Rex.

Rex's murderous eyes stare at Ronald coldly,



Ronald can see Rex's wounds emitting white steam as it started to close little by little, it was a 
bizarre scene making Ronald's eyes widened helplessly.

"What are you?", Ronald struggles to say the words.

Rex smiles deviously, he then pulls out his hands violently before he answers slowly, "I'm...not a 
human"

Ronald went on his knees with widened eyes, he struggles to look up and saw Rex's devious smile.

Fear started to envelop him but it didn't last long,

SLASH!!

He slashed Ronald's head off without even batting an eye,

Ronald can only widen his eyes as Rex's words permeate into his brain all the way until his soul got 
ripped by the grim reaper itself.

Chapter 93 Where Did She Go?

Because some of you guys said that it is plain to have the elements divided into first to the third 
rank, I decided to change it up from now.

The element rankings will be divided into Basic Element, Great Element, and Ultimate Element. 
Great and Ultimate element will be divided into low, mid, and peak.

I changed it up so it will be easier to understand and not as confusing.

I read all of the comments so keep sending me feedbacks and Happy Reading!

~~~~~~~~~~~~

<Killed an early rank five Awakened, Obtained 150,000 Exp>

The necklace on Rex's chest glows with a wicked aura before black energy came out of Ronald's 
corpse and got sucked into the necklace.

<Whiro Necklace of Fear activated, obtained +2 Mental stat>

Rex fell down to his knees after killing Ronald, he uses his all to fight Ronald, and thankfully the 
reward from the berserk quest saved his life.

If he didn't kill Chris and get those rewards, then he probably would've been cut into two by now.

'I got +2 Mental stat? Oh, the system didn't count the added stat only the raw stat. So instead of 72 
Mental stat, the system recognizes mine as only 40 which activated the Whiro of Necklace effect', 
Rex thought.

He somehow manages to kill a rank five Awakened with a little help from Edward, if one was to 
saw this then they might get shocked to death.

There's no record in history that a rank two Awakened manage to kill a rank four, nevertheless a 
powerful rank five Awakened.

Even for a rank four Awakened, there's only a handful that can challenge a rank five.



The reason behind this is because a rank five have at least a mid-Great Element and already created 
their element rune, upon creating an element rune the Awakened will have every spell they cast 
enhanced by a few times. Their control over their elements is also way better than a rank four, so It 
will be a foolish act to challenge a rank five that is better in every way.

Rex is exhausted, his heavy breaths indicate it clearly.

His eyes then landed on the big battleax that Ronald used before, without thinking much he grabs it 
and put it in his inventory.

Edward was dazed so he didn't saw Rex put the battleax inside his inventory,

He wakes up and stares at Rex blankly, he didn't have the time to think before because he needs to 
focus on surviving but now that it's over, he just realized Rex just killed a rank five!

He walks slowly towards Rex with a shocked look, "You...you kill a rank five?!", he said in 
disbelief.

Hearing this, Rex can only chuckle, "You're good yourself, you manage to survive against a rank 
five attack!"

Edward rolled his eyes, 'You take a serious attack from a rank five yourself!'

Rex is in a bad state, his body is trembling now that the adrenaline has gone. The exhaustion finally 
hits him as he lay on the ground.

"Edward, check them and kill them if they're alive. Make sure to use fire to kill them", Rex said 
while pointing at the small warehouse remains.

Edward nodded his head, he already got involved so he also needs to stop this event from getting 
leaked.

'I should've killed them myself but...', Rex thought, he wanted to get the free exp from a rank four 
Awakened but he can't level any trace and also his body is not listening to him.

After approaching the small warehouse remains, Edward notice Miru is already dead because of 
internal injury while Kiru is still breathing but heavily injured.

Kiru looks at Miru with immense guilt, he then looks at Edward and smiles, "Please, just kill me"

Without wasting any time, Edward nodded his head.

He put his fingers on Kiru's forehead, after confirming with Kiru one more time his hands blazed 
with fire as Kiru's forehead got pierced and instantly killing him.

It was a painless kill, Kiru's expression didn't even show any sign of pain before he died.

Edward went back towards Rex and saw Rex lying on the ground, "You're trying to make two 
families fight against each other, but that guy was killed by your black lightning"

Rex slowly wakes up from the ground, "Don't worry, I'm a rank two. The element will disappear in 
a bit"

They both then went back, leaving the scene as it is.



Not long after, a robot came to the scene as it rings a loud siren.

The robot is a product of sector 2E and in a flash, the local police and the FAA arrive at the scene.

They arrived at Faraday University after a couple of hours using Edward's car, it's a long journey 
because their body is hurting so much.

Rex already bought a healing elixir from the system and gave it to Edward,

His and Edward's injuries healed for a little bit but the burnt skin still there, the Eternal Flame is not 
letting the tissues heal.

"We can't get back like this, we need to go to the infirmary first", Rex said.

If he dare comes back late at night to his room, he will certainly get scolded by the girls heavily 
especially he didn't even reply to their texts.

For now, Rex wanted the girls especially Adhara to power themselves up.

Adhara will certainly accompany him in the future because of being in his pack, so she must be 
strong enough to help him in the future.

Edward nodded his head in agreement, they went to the infirmary not far from the entrance.

They avoid the crowd of students, they don't want any leaks in their plan. Rex even bought a normal 
shirt from the system so that he doesn't walk around shirtless.

Although going to the infirmary has risks, they have to go there.

Arriving at the infirmary,

Rex was greeted with advanced medical equipment that decorates the entire place, there were only 
four beds here and it is quite small.

'Well, I can't compare this to Ochyra University. Our students are easily ten times more than here', 
Rex thought as they approach the doctor there.

The doctor is a middle-aged man that looks ordinary, he wears a white coat just like any other 
doctor.

"What happened to you guys?", The doctor asks in worry.

He approached Edward who is supporting Rex to stand, they both looks like they just got out of hell 
with many burn marks.

Edward smiles awkwardly, "We're training, we got a little bit too excited"

The doctor shakes his head, he then signals both of them to lay on their respective beds, "You guys 
should be more careful, although it can easily be treated it is still dangerous"

Rex laid on the bed, he then said, "Doctor, I need to go back this night. Is that possible? I don't want 
to worry my lecturer"

Hearing this, the doctor looks at Rex and sighs, "I know you, you're all over the university web. I 
can't guarantee it but I'll try to heal you enough so you can head back"

The doctor then taps on a hologram beside Rex's bed before a medical machine came down from 
the roof towards Rex.



It then shoots a red laser into Rex's body scanning it,

Rex's condition got projected to the hologram in front of the doctor, the doctor analyzes the injuries 
and was quite surprised, "Why is the fire so powerful? Who did you fight against?"

"We're sparring against a lecturer, it seems he got carried a bit", Edward answered hurriedly.

The doctor frowns for a second before he started the treatment,

A needle came out of the machine as it went towards Rex's burned areas, Rex got the first treatment 
because Rex's burned areas are worst than Edward's.

The needle injected a translucent substance, "We need to prevent the infection first, it is a nasty 
wound so bare with me"

Rex can feel the needle went inside of it, it doesn't feel like anything but it started to hurt when the 
substance got inside.

Edward also got injected just after finishing Rex's.

Then, the doctor's hand glows with a green light as the dead tissue on Rex's burn injuries started to 
heal at a visible rate.

It got a few blowbacks from the Eternal Flame but is got controlled by the doctor,

'The doctor is at least rank five, that's quite amazing for a doctor', Rex thought.

Not long after, the treatment ended and Rex can feel he got better than before.

Just before they left the infirmary, "Rex Silverstar, you're quite blessed. To be gifted in 
Regenerative abilities is a blessing, after I got rid of the fire mana it started to heal at visible rat"

The doctor wrote in a report as he continues, "I have never seen something like that, your ability 
can even match a Vampire or even a Werewolf", he joked.

Rex can only smile wryly in reply, 'It's not that I can match them, but I am one'

 "You are gifted?! You're probably gifted in many aspects seeing how strong you 
are before", Edward said, he felt down after seeing Rex's power.

Rex slap his back encouragingly, "Don't feel down dude, just get stronger"

Edward can only sigh before they both separated and went to their own rooms.

Although Rex is healed, there are still burnt injuries around his body that are still healing. It is quite 
obvious so he needs to hide it from the other.

Thankfully, the injury mainly is around his stomach because of the fire slash.

Creak...

Rex opened the door but was soon shocked,

Adhara, Rosie, and Hera were standing beside one another in front of the door. They all have 
different expressions but Rosie is clearly mad.

"Where were you?", Rosie ask flatly.



Rex slowly closes the door behind him, "I...I catch up with Edward and forget the time", he laughs 
awkwardly.

Rosie studied Rex's expression, she then huffed annoyedly, "You owe me food tomorrow", she then 
left and slam her body on the right bed.

Hera and Adhara look at Rex with a meaningful look before they left Rex alone and went to bed.

Rex sighs a sigh of relief, he changes his clothes in the bathroom and wanted to go to bed because 
he felt extremely exhausted but, "Rosie why are you there?"

Rosie is on the right bed while Adhara and Hera are on the left bed.

Hearing Rex's remark, she wanted to rebut but Rex beat her to it, "Okay fine! I'm sleeping there", he 
said.

He's exhausted, and arguing with Rosie is not worth it.

Rex then slam his body to the bed and immediately closes his eyes,

He felt Rosie snuggles on his chest but he didn't give any reaction, all he wanted is to sleep and that 
is what he will get.

~

In the middle of the night,

Rex and the others are already asleep,

He's currently dreaming but then, a figure wakes up from the left side bed.

The figure gets out of bed slowly without alerting anyone, she then went out of the room and came 
back not long after.

Rex is already up sensing the figure, he felt nothing from the figure so he pretends to be asleep.

He even already knows that it is Adhara because of her scent, 'What is she doing?', Rex thought as 
he pretends to be asleep.

Adhara kneels beside the bed before her warm hand pulls up Rex's shirt.

Rex was shocked but then, Adhara's fingers started applying a lotion on Rex's burnt injuries on his 
stomach.

It brought a cool feeling as it touches his injuries.

After applying the lotion, Adhara closes Rex's shirt before she steps back.

Rex smiles gently, 'Of course she knows, I'm sorry for hurting you',

Adhara and Rex's feelings are linked with each other, just like during the Dark Moon when Rex can 
feel Adhara is hurting, she can feel Rex's too.

By the reaction from Rosie and Hera, Adhara probably held the pain in to not worry the others.

Because of that, he was quite touched.

'She adapted pretty fast, she didn't panic every time she felt I'm in danger and that's probably for the 
best',



But then, Rex sense Adhara standing still not far away from him.

Rex hears Adhara walks away and passes the bed.

He then heard Adhara went out of the door before the door closed again, Rex opened his eyes and 
looks at the door direction with a frown, 'Where did she go this late?'

Chapter 94 Decreased Sanity

The next day in Faraday University,

All of the students and even the entire sector 2E are shocked by the news they just received, Chris 
Sullivan has been killed yesterday night by an unknown person.

It is huge news that shocked the entire sector, they all know who Chris is and they can only be 
grateful for not born in an influential family that gets hunted by others.

They all thought that it is a conflict of huge families, they didn't think that an ordinary person can 
kill Chris like that.

All kinds of organizations went to Faraday University to consult about the event.

Many agents from the FAA, UWO and other organizations filled the place, the death of Chris is not 
a small matter.

The death of Lucas Platchi before is also a big deal but Ochyra University is the one that handled it, 
they shove the blame on Lucas' incompetence during the field test so the university is not affected.

Chris on the other hand is different, he's assassinated.

The last thing the UWO or all other organizations wanted is to have an inner conflict when they're 
still in war, so it is very big news that shook the entire sector and even neighboring sectors.

It is literally chaos inside the university, and the one who did it just got up from his sweet 
dreamland.

Rex sits on the bed while scratching his eyes, his body is sore because of last night.

The scene where Adhara, Rosie, and Hera gathering together while looking at a phone greets him, it 
broadcasting a news report about Chris Assassination.

Adhara sneak glances at Rex, she was suspicious about him.

Rex turns his head away avoiding Adhara's glance, he felt nervous because of Adhara's gaze.

Just as he wanted to do his morning routine, a notification appears from the system.

<-5% Sanity Stat, please check the user's stat tab for more information>

Rex frowns, 'My sanity stat increase and decrease without a notice, so why did the system gave me 
a notice now?'

He then checks his stat and was confused,

<Stats>

Name: Rex Silverstar

Pack: Silverstar (1/2)



Level: 21 (702,500/1,000,000)

Race: High Werewolf

Full-Moon: 22 Days - Yule Moon

Berserk: 75%

Sanity: 70%

Mental: 42 (+32)

Strength: 95 (+19)

Agility: 48 (+2)

Endurance: 38 (+25)

Intelligence: 38

Attributable Stats: 0

<Average Human Adults have 5-7 points for each stats except for Intelligence>

He noticed that the pack section is colored red instead of the usual black, he was confused, 'Does 
the system want me to add more members? I'm still not sure to turn someone into a Werewolf 
again', he thought.

Rex slammed his body to the bed again as his hand touches the burn scar from last night, it is 
already fading but it is still black and rough.

'My black lightning seems to have disturbance properties, I can clearly see Ronald's fire mana got 
canceled when I give him the final blow', Rex saw his black lightning intercepted the fire mana on 
Ronald's hand and battleax.

Even when he's still in rank two, he can disturb a rank five channeling.

It was quite shocking for Rex to see his element in action, 'It probably manages to do that because 
this black element is a higher rank than Eternal Fire, that's the obvious reason'

The girls are still busy with the news, it is in the headline so everyone is interested in it.

Rex wakes up and went to the bathroom, he's currently in thought and he didn't want to get 
disturbed by the girls.

The girls noticed Rex but Rex went straight into the bathroom without saying anything,

He immediately turns on the sink, the water flows making a calming sound as he looks at himself in 
the mirror.

'I almost died again, my level growth is too slow if I'm here. After the tournament, I will take as 
much mission from the university to meet more Supernatural I can kill', Rex thought, he decided to 
go out of the university more to earn more experience.

He then remembers that he already got enough gold thanks to the hectic event last night, he opens 
the system and bought Sakhmet Tattoo.



It costs a lot but he got the money to purchase it.

Rex equipped the tattoo then suddenly, a red woman figure appeared out of nowhere on his sides.

She's made by red energy, she appeared in front of Rex as she stretches out both of her hands to 
stroke Rex's chin.

Rex was confused but he knows that it is the Sakhmet Tattoo.

Her smooth hands stroke Rex's chin before her entire being got sucked into Rex's body, then a red 
tattoo appears on his right arm.

It is shaped like fiery eyes located just under Rex's wrist.

The woman figure disappeared after the tattoo appears, it left the bathroom warm.

Rex looks at the tattoo with delight, the tattoo seems to stare at Rex's eyes and it is emitting a slight 
fiery aura.

<The user's resistance to fire is increased by 15%>

He smiles before he then commands the tattoo to disappear, it then disappears from Rex's hand 
followed by the reduction of fire resistance.

After doing his morning routine, Rosie approaches him shyly.

She then said, "Rex, my parents are here for the opening. The opening is still unclear because of 
Chris's death so can you accompany me to meet them?"

Hearing this, Rex nodded his head.

He already promised to Rosie's parents and he's not the guy to break promises, 'After this, I'll focus 
on adding my pack member and Adhara'

Hera needs to go to a meeting with the university staff about the tournament, while Adhara said that 
she needs to go somewhere.

Rex was curious for a second but he didn't want to meddle in her things,

Rosie and Rex went side to side as they went out of the university to meet Rosie's parents that are 
waiting in a restaurant.

The surrounding is filled with agents, he acts as calm as he can without a hint of worry.

While they are walking, Rex suddenly bumped into someone.

Bump!

"Oh, sorry I didn't see you there", Rex said politely, the guy in front of him is quite short so he 
really didn't notice him.

The guy's face is not seen under his hood, he didn't even look up to Rex.

He went past Rex without even answering, Rex noticed a faint smile under the hood and suddenly, 
in a split second Rex felt something.

Rex Supernatural Sense is giving him signals for a slight moment, he looks back to find the guy but 
he's already gone, 'Did I sense it wrong?', Rex thought.



He then shakes his head, 'No, it can't be wrong. But how? A Supernatural? In the heart of Ratmawati 
City?'

"Rex? What's wrong? Don't be salty because of that, let's go!", Rosie said while pulling Rex.

Rex hesitated for a while before he finally follows Rosie.

They both went out of the University and met Rosie's parents in a restaurant nearby, it is not 
luxurious but Rosie said the students here said they make the best sushi.

He needs to pretend as a boyfriend in front of Rosie's parents, so this much is what he willing to do.

Rex went in with Rosie while wrapping his arm around her, they look good with each other but 
Rex's mind is not here.'

Muji and Cinta wave to them from afar, they look friendlier than when they met the first time, 
"Here!"

Rosie approach them excitedly, "Mom, Dad, How are you two?"

"We felt great! How about you honey?", Cinta replied softly, her face is brimming with excitement.

"I'm great! Rex here boasted he will beat Kevin", Rosie joked while tugging Rex with her elbow.

Rex snapped out of his daze and said with a smile, "Don't worry Mr. and Mrs. Rosiana, I will 
certainly keep my promise to both of you"

Hearing this, Muji and Cinta look at each other with confidence.

Rex's words give off a confident aura that makes the both of them assured of his statement, they 
didn't even worry at all.

They then started to eat while talking to each other about the tournament,

While they're chatting, Rex got a message from Hera saying that the opening will not be postponed 
and will be held today.

After getting the news, they all went to the opening.

The opening is held on Faraday University's auditorium called the Ring of Tenacity, it is a place 
located on the fourth floor of the building where there is only the auditorium there.

The place is crowded with people from all sorts of families,

Rex can see some parents that are standing pridefully beside their kid, some wear expensive-
looking clothes, some wear normal clothes, there's even a poor-looking family amongst them.

They're standing beside their son while getting glares from the surrounding.

'There are low-class people too? I thought Sector 2E is only for researchers', Rex thought, he was 
surprised to see these kinds of families here.

He didn't look down on them but it is just surprising to see their kinds of family in this high-class 
place.

His eyes then landed on the kid, he saw a gold pin on his chest with a number four on it



Just as he was wondering about that, Hera suddenly approach them and said, "Rex! Rosie! Come to 
the backstage, you guys will gather there"

'Where's Kevin? I really want to mess with him', Rex thought evilly, he didn't get the chance last 
night because of all the things that happened so he's itchy to mess with Kevin.

Adhara is also beside Hera, she signals Rex to come closer.

Rex was confused but he still approaches Adhara, "I saw Kevin, he's also looking for you", she 
whispers.

Hearing this, Rex smiles as Adhara tells him at the right time as if she knows what he's thinking.

The auditorium is different from the outsides, it is circle-shaped and it is metallic color dominant 
that looks majestic and aesthetic.

It can probably sustain thousands of people inside.

Rows of seats were lined up neatly, the seats are divided into three floors where the first floor for 
normal guests, the second for the Faraday University's students and parents, the third floor is for the 
higher-ups of the university.

In front of the seats is a glass that is covering the place in a circle.

It gives the view to the middle part of the auditorium that looks like a colosseum type and it is very 
big, many engineers are preparing the colosseum as the seats is still half empty.

Rex follows Hera as he looks around the place.

Hera guides them to a stair that goes under the place, two big terrifying robots are guarding the stair 
that Rex has never seen before.

It lets them through after Hera shows the robot her id.

Rex's eyes are still glued on the robot, 'They have to be at least rank five in power right? I can 
clearly feel the threatening aura they emitted', Rex thought.

He then arrives in the back room where there are the other representatives of Ochyra University, 
there are five others excluding Rex and the girls.

Gregg is also amongst them and he is giving Rex an unfriendly look that got ignored by Rex.

There's also one other lecturer aside from Hera, and Rex has never seen him before.

"Where're the Faraday University representatives? Will, they also gather here?", Rex asks Hera, he 
wanted to see this Kevin.

Before Hera can answer, the other lecturer said, "No they won't, it will be chaos if they're here"

Hearing this, Rex was annoyed but he can understand it, 'That's well thought by the committee, If 
he's here I probably can't hold myself back'

Chapter 95 Kevin Luc

In the Black Tiger's guild office,

Duncan is seating on his desks while attending to the piles of paper in front of him, he looks quite 
busy.



The sun is shining bright behind him and he felt refreshed when suddenly,

BAM!

"Dear!!", a woman shouted after slamming the door open.

The secretary follows after she tries to hold her back to no avail, the woman's face was in a panic as 
she strides towards Duncan.

Duncan raises his gaze, "What are you doing here, can't you see I'm busy?"

He looks calm and collected even though last night he already knows the killer of his son Lucas, it 
is highly commendable patience that is pretty terrifying, to say the least.

The woman then said, "The Sullivan just sent us a Red Wing! They attack our cash stack in 
Aglaenira Church and left a red wing letter"

"Red Wing? But we didn't even approach much less kill one of their family members", Duncan 
replied with a frown, he didn't know why they sent him a red wing.

The woman held her forehead, "They blame us for the death of Chris"

Hearing this, Duncan stands up abruptly with clear anger, "How dare they?! Do they really think I 
will be that petty? Killing their son because my youngest son is dead?!"

Just as they're talking, the phone on Duncan's desk rings.

"Sir, there's a guest in the meeting room. It's the Sullivan Family"

Duncan slammed the phone and stormed out of the room leaving the woman,

He arrives at the meeting room and saw five people wearing red formal clothes with a Hellcat crest 
on their chests, they are all sitting calmly on their respective seats but a terrifying chill can be felt 
from them.

The five of them send a cold glare at Duncan just after he arrives at the room.

"What is the meaning of this?! How can you think so lowly of me to do that", Duncan shouted in 
anger, he felt his pride got hurt because of their accusation.

A woman with blonde hair stares at Duncan's eyes coldly, she stands up slowly and said, "This is 
too far Duncan, our family has been a rival for years but I can't believe you stoop this low"

Duncan points at the woman angrily, "I didn't do such things! This is nonsense!"

Slap!

The woman threw a photo on the meeting table, "The evidence is pretty obvious, these are your 
doings"

Duncan grabbed the photo angrily, he looks at the photo and can't help to get shocked, 'What? Why 
are the assassins sent by Manuel are there?', he thought.

The photo shows Chris' corpses beside two white assassins.

"Stop your acting Duncan, although our family is weaker than yours, we will not stand by and let 
you trample on us. You did this, and we demand the red wing, " the woman said, her words raise the 
room temperature.



She then squinted her eyes and said meaningfully, "I could've just killed one of your family but I 
decided to send the red wing, Blood will demand to be paid by blood"

Duncan was at a loss for words, he's thinking about how can this happen.

Then suddenly a thought came to mind, 'These white assassins are sent to test Rex, is this his 
doing?! He knows I'm after him so he decided to strike first?'

He grinds his teeth in anger, "Diana, you must believe me! it's not me! It's that kid Rex doing!"

Hearing this, Diana glance at Duncan in confusion, "Rex?"

"It's the kid from Ochyra University! He also killed my son!", Duncan said desperately, he was still 
shocked to realizing Rex's scheme.

Diana chuckles, she then cast a mocking gaze, "That's your best excuse? Unlike your son, my son is 
guarded by a rank five. Your excuse is pretty pathetic I must say"

After saying that, Diana signals to the others and left the room.

Family war is coming and the Sullivan is not backing out of this, leaving the room means they're set 
in stone to have the Platchi family pay by blood.

Duncan was left speechless in the room, his hands burn with blue fire as he smashes the meeting 
room table to pieces.

BAM!!

"REX!!!", he shouted frantically.

~

Back to Ring of Tenacity,

Rex is sitting on a metallic chair in the backroom waiting for them to be called, the others also 
minding their own business.

The lecturer brought back a device that shoots a blue hologram.

"Gather around, I will introduce you guys and explain the tournament", the lecturer said as the 
students gather.

The opening is already started as they can hear the principal of Faraday University already started 
his speech.

Rex listen to the lecturer attentively,

"First let me introduce myself, I am Anthony that is in charge of managing students during outside 
tournaments like this. You can call me Tony, and I will be your instructor", Tony briefly introduces 
himself.

Rex studied Tony and see that he's quite good, he's a mid-rank five Metal Elementalist.

He looks well built wearing a training uniform, black hair, a kind aura, and there is a grey rune on 
his cheeks.



Tony then continues, "The tournament consists of three stages, Mana Control, Supernatural Hunt, 
and Duel. In the first stage, you will be tested on your control of mana by making any weapon using 
purely mana. In the second stage, you guys will hunt down a Supernatural. And lastly, you will fight 
against Faraday University students one on one"

"We are not expecting this, we thought that the tournament will only be a one on one duel but this is 
unexpected", he said while shaking his head.

They thought that it will only be a regular match but who knows it becomes like this.

Hera also added, "I tried to speak with them but they can't change the tournament, so we must make 
do. They wanted us to look bad, so we must prove them wrong"

Hearing this, Rex frowns as he was not expecting to be like this.

The other representatives also complain about it, it was understandable for them to be mad.

The mana control is a bit new for Rex, he only relies on the system on using spells and he never 
fought an opponent that can utilize mana like this.

"Adhara, do you know how to do the Mana Control?", Rex asks.

Adhara glance at Rex briefly and said calmly, "You need to be at least rank three, if you manage to 
enter rank three in one day which sounds impossible then I can help you not that I'm any good at it"

'Seems like I need to use the mana charm elixir today, it's embarrassing for me to be still in rank 
two', Rex thought.

After Tony explains the tournament, he also gives each of the representatives a badge and a 
uniform.

Rex got the number 1 badge, 'Are this based on the student's ranking?'

The badge is black in color with a white number carved on it from 1 to 8, the uniform is almost 
similar to the lecturer's uniform worn by Hera before.

Rex and the other representatives went to the changing room and change to their uniforms,

He looks at the mirror and was satisfied with the uniform's design, it is white in color with a golden 
outline, a white cape with red color underneath it that flows down covering their right shoulder.

Rex went out of the changing room and saw his uniform is the only one that is sleeveless, 'Huh, 
that's thoughtful'

The female outfit has the same design but the stomach part, the male one is covered completely 
whilst the female one's belly button area is exposed.

After they change their uniforms, they round up because they can hear the principal has already 
stopped his speech.

The representatives started to line up, they will be called out soon.

"Remember, the opening is only a stand out against Faraday University. You guys will not fight or 
even mock them, just wave to the crowd and come back", Tony reminded.

Hearing this, the corner of Rex's lips quirked up a little.



"Stop it, I know what you're going to do", Adhara whispers from the side, she can feel Rex's 
excitement just from his expression.

Rex chuckles a little, "What? I'm only going to say hi"

Just as they're waiting to be called, a guy on Rex's other side tugged Rex's elbow.

Rex glance at the guy who he has never seen before while raising his eyebrows in question.

"My name's Brock, I'm a huge fan of yours. You're my Role Model!", he whispers excitedly, his 
eyes are containing stars as he looks at Rex.

Rex got stunned for a second, his brain can't process the unexpectedness of Brock's words.

Brock then continues, "After seeing your fight against Gregg, I got so pumped and manage to get a 
spot in here. Thanks to you, I started to work hard even though I don't have much talent"

Rex felt bad to ignore him so he answers, "I'm glad I can be a good role model for you"

Hearing Rex's answer, Broc got excited even more but suddenly,

"Please Welcome, the challenger!, the newborn tyrant!, the representatives of OCHYRA 
UNIVERSITY!!"

The announcer announces excitedly, the crowd is going wild because of it.

The metallic gate in front of them opens revealing a crowd of people from all sides, flashlights can 
be seen from all around the corner and the spotlight shines on their entrance.

Hera approach Rex, "Wear this, you will be asked some questions to hype the match. Just don't say 
anything too stimulating", she said while she puts on a wireless mic on Rex.

Rex nodded his head before Tony signals them to go in.

Rex and the other representatives of Ochyra University walk inside the Arena under everyone's 
gaze, the crowd shouted as they burn with excitement.

They are lined up in three rows, and they started marching into the Arena.

Rex is located on the back of the line as they march inside, they march neatly with arched backs like 
elite students.

They stopped when they arrive in the middle of the big arena,

In front of them are rows of the first floor and the second-floor audience cheering for them, Rex 
can't even open his eyes properly because of the flashlights flashing in front of him.

Rosie's parents cheered loudly from the second floor, they're proud of seeing Rosie in the arena.

The cameraman from different channels can also be seen in front of the audience, it seems the 
tournament will be broadcasted.

"These students clad in bright golden are the challenger!, Open your eyes wide and meet the 
ELITES OF OCHYRA UNIVERSITY!!", the announcer said hyping the audience.



It becomes absolutely wild, even other universities are also watching this tournament of Ochyra 
University debut.

He then continues, "The Ochyra University representatives are lead by the rising star! The rightmost 
man that stood tall like a tyrant, let me introduce to you!!! REX SILVERSTAR!!"

"WOOOO!!!"

The crowd went crazy after they got introduced to Rex,

Although this is the first time Rex went to a tournament, normal people all over the Elpida Alliance 
always watch these kinds of tournaments. Some of them even came all the way from corners of 
Ratmawati City to Sector 2E just to watch the tournament.

Awakened is pretty rare amongst humans so it took a huge chunk of the entertainment market,  
newcomers like Rex are always welcomed by the citizens.

"The lecturer claims that he is unbeatable in Ochyra University, the pride of the newly made 
university that wanted to take the spotlight of all other universities!!"

Adhara on the side slaps Rex's arm,

Rex's arm got flung upwards making the crowd went crazier!

Rex glance at Adhara in annoyance but got a chuckle reply from her.

After the announcer finishes introducing each one of the representatives of Ochyra University, and 
the audience has quiet down, he then continues, "On my left, we will bring out the host of today's 
tournament!"

"ARE YOU READY!!", the announcer shouted.

The crowd cheers with excitement, it went even crazier than the excitement when Ochyra 
University went out before.

"PLEASE MAKE WAY! TO THE ELITE OF THE ELITE! the representatives of FARADAY 
UNIVERSITY!!"

Hearing this, Rex's head turns to his right.

He was also excited to meet the students that will be fighting against him, especially Kevin.

The metallic gate on his right opened abruptly, white gas comes out of the gate when suddenly,

BOOM!!

A huge dark red fiery lion came out of the gate making the temperature rise, it was blazingly bright 
and there are eight people on top of the lion.

Different fireworks shot around the arena making the scene look epic.

"KEVIN!!"

"KEVIN!!"

"KEVIN!!"



The crowd cheer one name that makes the Faraday University famous, and the person that Rex is 
itchy to fight against.

SWOOSH!!

The lion circle around the arena before it leaped and landed just beside the line of Ochyra 
University,

A man leads the group down from the dark fiery lion, he then snapped his finger before the dark 
fiery lion vanished instantly.

Adhara leans towards Rex and said, "That's Kevin, the Blazing Lion of Faraday University from the 
Luc Family. He's the second child of the Luc just after Evelyn his sister"

"That's Kevin?", Rex said while a smirk crept onto his face.

Chapter 96 I'll Screw Your Sister

SWOOSH!

The dark fiery lion vanishes as Kevin snapped his fingers.

He leads the other Faraday University representatives in an arrogant manner, the way he walks is 
brimming with confidence as if he's the king of the place.

The Faraday University waves to the crowd like they already won, they didn't put Ochyra 
University in their eyes.

They all wear normal clothes but then suddenly,

Woosh!!

Their clothes burn with fire as it turns into a bright red uniform, it is definitely an eye-catching 
transformation that makes the crowd goes wild.

Red uniform with leather red pants wrapped on their body, they wear black gloves and shoes that 
match their belt.

"LADIES AND GENTLEMAN, I PRESENT YOU OUR HOST!! FARADAY UNIVERSITY!!", 
the announcer shouted excitedly.

The audience gets up from their seats frantically as Kevin waves at them, all cameras got directed to 
Kevin.

'He is quite popular I must say', Rex thought.

Kevin Luc is a well-built guy with red blazing hair the exact same as Luke, his fiery red eyes match 
his uniform with two silver earrings on his right ear. He's not as tall as Rex in fact much shorter than 
Rex but his confidence is off the chart based on how he walks, and he also has human fangs peeking 
every time he opened his mouth.

He then glances at his shoulder arrogantly glancing at Rex, a mocking smile appear on his face after 
he looks at Rex.

"Faraday University is lead by the Blazing Lion, KEVIN LUC!!", he said while he points at Kevin.



After the crowd quiets down, Faraday University's representative lined up in front of Ochyra 
University.

The eight of the Faraday University look overly confident with their smiles, they are all looking at 
Ochyra's university students with a lowly gaze as if they're looking down on them.

Some of the people caught Rex's attention, he saw Edward and the guy with the number four pin on 
his chest.

Edward was all smiles as he looks at Rex, he was making dumb faces at him making Rex chuckles a 
bit.

Rosie and Adhara saw this and they already guessed that is Rex's friend that he said yesterday.

The announcer then continues, "Rex Silverstar and Kevin Luc please steps forward"

Hearing this, Rex and Kevin step forward facing each other.

The announcer went to the middle of them and asks Kevin, "Kevin, what do you think about the 
match against the newborn Ochyra University tomorrow?"

"Of course we will win like we always do, they're nothing but amateur in my eyes", Kevin said 
arrogantly, he even locks eye contact with Rex while saying this.

The announcer chuckles, "That's bold of you Kevin, what is your response about that statement 
Rex?"

Hearing this, Rex who towers over Kevin glance at him up and down.

Rex chuckles a little before he said mockingly, "Well I must say, It's quite hard to take someone 
LOWER than me seriously"

Hearing Rex mock Kevin viciously, the crowd burst into excitement.

Because of Rex's confidence in saying that, some people from the audience went to his side, while 
most of them booed Rex but Rex definitely takes the audience's attention.

Kevin's face darkened, he was shocked at how bold Rex in his home territory.

Dark Fire started to envelop Kevin's body threatening to burn his surrounding, his aura is leaking 
and everyone can tell that Rex's words hit him hard.

BOOM!!

His aura exploded as he raises his gaze crazily meeting Rex's eyes,

It makes the announcer stunned for a bit, he wasn't expecting Kevin who is always confident got 
angry all of a sudden.

Then suddenly,

BLITZ!!

Rex also replied by bursting the lightning mana around him, it is not as strong as Kevin because of 
the miles difference in rank but it is still a Peak Great Element just like Kevin's Dark Fire.



It makes the crowd shocked to see such bizarre elements from students like Rex.

In their eyes, Kevin's Dark Fire is considered amazing for a student to have because there's only a 
handful of students that has Peak Great Element in their fourth year lest a first-year like Kevin.

So seeing Rex have the same rank element as Kevin surprised them so much.

Kevin widened his eyes in surprise, he was surprised by Rex's element but he quickly returns to his 
normal expression.

"Bring it on little guy", Rex said making the arena even more intense.

Their elements are clashing against each other, it creates a subtle element spark that makes the wind 
flutter.

The audience held their breaths as they also felt the tension, it makes them suffocated.

Just as the tension begins to rise, the announcer intervenes, "Let's hold our excitement for tomorrow 
shall we?", he said while tapping bot Rex and Kevin's shoulder lightly.

Kevin was annoyed but then he felt someone watching him from the third floor so he decided to 
stop.

"Just wait for tomorrow, I will teach you our differences", Kevin said as he turns his head away 
unwillingly.

After Rex and Kevin separated, the announcer continues, "HOW EXCITING!! I can't wait for 
tomorrow, it will be epic!!", he said, luring the audience's attention back to him.

"Let me explain the tournament rundown. The first round is a test for your mana control, it is self-
explanatory so I don't have to explain much", the announcer joked.

"The second round however is a little bit interesting", he said before two huge holograms appeared 
above the arena.

"Each team will fight a Supernatural! The first Supernatural is a peak rank four Mummy!", the 
announcer pointed at the hologram on the left.

The hologram then shows the Mummy that is attacking a group of Awakened using sand and 
insects.

Its body is rotting with flies hovering around it, It is very agile with bandages wrapping all over its 
body from head to toe and a metallic scimitar that is glowing with a green hue on its hand.

Looking at this, Rex was in thought, 'Mummy? I only know they're able to manipulate sand'

<Mummy>

A high-ranking undead with human-like intelligence relies on magic with the purpose of guarding a 
place, is resistant to bladed, poison, and corrosive attacks. Mummy can manipulate sand, insects, 
and are practically an immortal Supernatural. They are very weak against fire and water elements 
but their ability to turn into sand makes them very agile.

Reading this, Rex was shocked.

'The system knows so much about these things? I should've known', Rex thought helplessly, it will 
be a big help if the system can tell every Supernatural in detail.



Then the right hologram flickers revealing the next Supernatural, it is a Manticore!

"The other Supernatural surprisingly is a deadly Manticore!! This Supernatural is a nightmare for us 
Awakened!", the announcer said.

Seeing this, the student's faces was surprised when they see the manticore appear.

It was a devastating Supernatural that killed many people during the emergence of Supernatural, it 
brings terror to look at. Even the audience gasp in surprise.

Rex also knows about this Manticore, it is truly a dominant Supernatural.

'System, tell me about Manticores', Rex thought.

<Manticore>

A high-ranking beast with low intelligence that relies on brute strength, fast attacks, fire breath, and 
wind pressure. They have pretty dense skin that renders bladed strikes useless, their body is 
resistant to fire, their tail is resistant to lightning, and their wings are resistant to wind elements, 
they also have regenerative abilities. They are mainly killed using brute strength, but their biggest 
weakness lies in an orb located on their tail, crush it the manticore will lose its tail and wings 
making them vulnerable to wind and earth elements.

After showing the Supernatural, the announcer then said, "Faraday University will get the privilege 
to choose the first pick for their home advantage, Kevin please pick your Supernatural"

Seeing this, Kevin smirk, "I choose the mummy", he declared loudly.

"Great choice from Kevin! Ochyra University will be having a hard time fighting a Manticore that 
has multiple resistance", the hologram then disappears.

The other Ochyra University frowns, one of them approaches Rex and said, "What will we do? 
Manticore is obviously a harder Supernatural for us"

"Yeah, we might not be able to beat the manticore"

"This tournament is rigid, how come they got the first choice instead of us"

Hearing the other rambling, Rex intervenes, "Manticore is better for us, just trust me on this one. 
They will be surprised"

The other hesitated for a while but eventually nodded their heads, Rex is an undisputable leader of 
them so they must at least work together against another university.

Although Gregg on the side is not having it, he's still salty about Rex.

Rex notices Gregg's aggression but he ignored it, Gregg is no longer an opponent he should be wary 
of.

Kevin glance at Rex and sent a mocking smile, he thinks he put Rex in a spot.

'The system explains both Supernatural in detail. Although Manticore has much resistance, its 
power will drop dramatically if its tail got cut off. Mummy, on the other hand, relies on magic', he 
smiles pitifully towards Kevin.



'The system didn't tell their magic so I assume it will be troublesome unlike Manticore who relies 
on brute strength', Rex thought.

Kevin thought that by giving them the Manticore they will struggle especially with so much 
elemental resistance, but he doesn't know Rex is a Werewolf with high physical abilities.

After choosing the Supernatural for round two, the announcer declared, "For the third round, it will 
be a duel against two universities. It will be random but because of the tension between Rex and 
Kevin, they will fight at the end of the tournament"

The audience cheered after getting the huge news, they really want to see Rex and Kevin battle 
head-on.

After explaining the tournament, the announcer tells each side to go back and gather here tomorrow 
before the opening ended.

It is quite thrilling for the audience to see Rex's bold move, Rex becomes famous because of it.

In the backroom, Tony and Hera gave the students another briefing.

"Okay, you guys heard them. The rest of the day, we will go to the training ground to at least let you 
guys know each other", Tony said while shaking his head.

Hera then steps forward, "We are not prepared for this so I hope you guys can prepare as best as you 
can during this last final day"

After they got their briefings, they went out and go to the training ground.

The crowd of the audience is still crowding the place so they need to go out from the other way, it 
will be a ruckus if they meet the audience.

While they're walking, they suddenly met Faraday's representatives.

Kevin approach Rex slowly, he seems to still want to mess with Rex even after the opening is 
finished.

He arrived in front of Rex, but his eyes landed on Rosie beside him.

"I can't believe you're this loser's girlfriend, why don't you be mine and leave this loser", he said to 
Rosie.

Rosie was quite annoyed, "Mind your own business, don't be sorry tomorrow when you lose"

Kevin chuckles a bit, "Quite feisty but cute, say...", he then glances at Rex smugly, "Why don't we 
bet on your girl right here, I'll bet my girl over here, I'll even use anything to bet against you in 
exchange for her", he said while bringing a girl beside him.

She was quite angry by Kevin's remarks but she held it in.

Kevin wanted to make Rex lose his cool, he lost the mental war in the arena so he needed to win 
this one.

Instead of answering Kevin, Rex walks past him and said, "I must say, the training ground here is 
quite good"

Hearing this, Kevin was aghast, "Aren't you going to answer my question?"



Rex stopped in his track, he then smirks, "I heard you're the second child of Luc Family", he keeps 
ignoring Kevin's remarks.

"So? What did that have to do with our bet?", Kevin said feeling annoyed.

"Okay, let's bet then. I'll give you Rosie if I lose to you", Rex said with a slight grin on his face.

Rosie was shocked, she was not expecting Rex to agree with the bet, "Rex! How could you think of 
me as an object!", she shouted in anger.

She felt disappointed and hurt by Rex's words.

Rex raises his hand signaling Rosie to stay out of this.

Looking at this, Kevin becomes even more daring, "So? What should I give if I lose? I can bet 
anything I have"

"That's an interesting question", Rex said while pretending to think.

He approaches Kevin, he stopped just beside Kevin's side and whispers slowly, "If you lose, I'll 
screw your sister. How about it?"

Chapter 97 Manticore Weakness

"If you lose, I'll screw your sister. How about it?"

Hearing this, Kevin was utterly shocked to the core.

He can't comprehend the bold words that came out of Rex's mouth, he turns his head in shock, 
"What...What did you say?"

"You heard me, you said you will bet anything? Then I'll say if I win I can screw your sister", Rex 
said loudly, he's raising his voice as if he wanted everyone to hear it.

The others were also shocked, hearing the words from Rex's mouth is like thunder ringing on their 
ears.

Edward who is leaning on the wall chuckles from it, 'You really have to do him like that?'

Kevin lowers his head with a darkened expression, his body is trembling in anger as if a volcano 
was about to erupt from within him.

Even the representatives of Ochyra University were all dumbfounded.

Although they know Rex is as daring as ever, they can't believe that even towards Kevin Luc who is 
the number one student of Faraday University and also the first son of the Luc family he didn't 
show any kind of restrain.

Rex walks away from Kevin with steady steps, "So? How about it Kevin Luc?"

Getting mocked around by Rex makes Kevin fuming in anger, he wanted to get Rex back for 
humiliating him in front of the audience but who would've thought that it turns like this.

Kevin gritted his teeth, "I'll see you in the arena", he said while leaving Rex.

After the other Faraday University representatives left the scene with obvious anger, Rosie smacks 
Rex's head.



Smack!

"How dare you use me to do that! Hmph!", she pouted, she's still salty to be used as a bet.

Rex glance at Rosie, "I didn't use you as a bet, he's the one who brought it up", he tries to defend 
himself.

Rosie didn't buy it as she turns her head away in anger.

Then suddenly, Adhara tugs the tip of Rex's uniform and said, "Do you really want to screw Kevin's 
sister?", an ominous aura brushes past his neck.

"I...I didn't, I don't even know his sister. You told me before he has a sister", Rex replied nervously, 
he didn't know why but Adhara makes him felt nervous lately.

Hera then said, "Rex, we will be waiting in the training ground to know each other better. You're the 
leader so at least showup, don't wander around making a scene"

After telling Rex that, Hera guides the others to the training ground leaving Rex and the girls.

Rex nodded his head, "I'll be there in a min, don't worry"

Just as Rex wanted to defend himself again, Edward approaches them, "Yo Rex! So, which one is 
your girl?"

Rex punches Edward's gut jokingly, he then introduced, "Rosie, Adhara, this is my friend from the 
military. You can call him Edward, a good friend of mine"

"Hello, I always wonder who can make Rex this soft. Now I can see why", Edward joked.

Adhara and Rosie chuckle because of Edward's funny remarks, they then also introduce themselves 
before they leave the place.

They talk to each other especially Rosie and Adhara who are curious about how Rex was like 
during the military, their eyes flash with curiosity.

"You won't believe how much of a lunatic Rex is", Edward said.

The girls' interest was piqued hearing this, he then continues, "One time, I heard him mumbling in 
his sleep 'greyish black fur, deformed ears, I will kill you' and all other stuff before he suddenly 
cries. It was weird, I even heard that he punches a guy during his sleep"

Adhara and Rosie chuckle but then they realized,  "Why would Rex said that in his sleep?", Hera 
asks.

"You didn't know? When Rex is little he-", before Edward can finish, Rex already cover Edward's 
mouth with his hand, "Okay, that's enough of talking about me"

Rex pushes Edward to the side, "Okay off you go, we have to train to beat you guys"

"No fair dude, although you're stronger than me don't think I will stand still and let you win", 
Edward taunted, he then waves his hand and left.

Adhara and Rosie were sad, they wanted to know more.



'Amidst that strong front, turns out Rex has a weak side too', Adhara and Rosie thought after they 
heard Edward's story.

They both then promise to themselves to be the one Rex head to when he's feeling weak.

Arriving at the training ground,

They went straight to the quiet room where the others gathered, it was in the corner-most room 
where the sound of fighting can't even reach there.

Rex and the girls enter the door and saw Tony and Hera are currently forming a plan.

The quiet room is quite spacious that can probably fit thirty people, there is a table in the middle 
with cushions surrounding it to sit.

"You're here, take a seat", Tony said.

Rex went and take a seat near Hera and Tony, "So, how is it going for the tournament plan?"

Hearing this, Hera taps a hologram beside her and pushes the hologram to the middle of the table, 
the hologram shows the manticore footage and its description.

"We are still talking about the Manticore that we will fight, the composition of our team is not a 
good one against a Manticore", Hera explains.

The footage is showing a Manticore fighting a group of Awakened, it is gruesome.

Tony then added, "Our team consist of two Fire Elementalist, two Earth Elementalist, one Water 
Elementalist, two Wind Elementalist, and lastly you, Lightning Elementalist"

He then enlarges the hologram footage and continues, "As you can see, the Manticore has multiple 
elemental resistance because of their nature. They have fire, wind, and earthPla resistance and are 
very agile for their size. It is a bad match for us, so our plan is to make Rex our main damage 
dealer  because of his Lightning Element, it is the only shot we have"

Ochyra University team has only 1 Water Elementalist, the Manticore is a bad matchup for them.

Hearing this, Rex frowns.

He recalled the system's description, "Manticore doesn't have resistance to the earth element"

Tony was confused, he then replayed the footage, "As we can see here, the rock broke instantly 
upon hitting the manticore"

The footage shows a peak rank four Awakened using a spell to summon a boulder crashing towards 
the Manticore but it broke easily as butter after getting hit by its tail.

From a glance, it looks like the boulder is ineffective but Rex trusted the system.

Rex squinted his eyes before he drags the hologram towards him, "If you look closely, the tail of the 
Manticore attacks the boulder as soon as it got close to its body"

The others squinted their eyes and saw the Manticore flinch to the side as it attacks the boulder with 
its tail.

"But based on the record, the Manticore's tail gives them earth resistance", Tony said while scrolling 
through the description, he was still doubting.



Rex stands up as he enlarges the footage even more, he then zooms in to the Manticore's tail, "Pay 
close attention to this scene"

The footage shows the Manticore's tail movement, it was fast so it is blurry.

But when Rex slowed the footage and zoomed in to the tail, the other saw something astonishing.

"That's...That's Lightning Element!"

"What? How could this be? The UWO manual will never make this kind of mistake"

Rex then continues, "There is only a few Manticore so the UWO probably didn't pay close attention 
to this one. The Manticore's tail is imbued with Lightning Element. Their skin is not very tough and 
Earth Element is weak against Lightning, that's why it evaded the boulder from hitting its body"

After realizing this, they all were utterly amazed by Rex's perception.

The tail moves lightning-fast and it didn't even emit any kinds of Lightning Mana, but when one 
pays attention closely they can see a faint spark of lightning coming from the Manticore's tail.

"The Manticore doesn't have multiple resistance, it's just specific parts of their body that have 
different resistance. Using its fast movement, it can adjust the elemental attack to its respective 
body parts to avoid injury", Rex explained.

The others nodded their heads in realization, even Brock's eyes started to glow in admiration.

But then, Rosie follows, "If that's the case, it becomes harder to fight it knowing that your attack 
can be negated by its tail"

"That's true"

"Now who can damage it? Ivy is the only Water Elementalist, and there is only two Earth 
Elementalist on our team"

Rex raises his hand to stop the others ranting and said, "Don't worry, the Manticore we will face 
tomorrow is only a peak rank four. It can't block my attack"

'I can even kill it using my brute strength', Rex thought silently.

Supernatural resistance becomes stronger the stronger they get, it is a commonly known fact.

For example, rank four Manticore can resist a fire attack from a rank four Awakened but if the 
Awakened have Mid Great Element, then they can't resist it. But as soon as the Manticore reach 
rank five, then they can resist the Mid Great Element but cannot resist Peak Great Element.

Using this logic, Rex's Black Lightning is a Peak Great Element which means it can only be resisted 
by a rank six Manticore.

"So what's the plan for tomorrow? Should we divide each student by their element and give them 
the Manticore's body part they have to target?", Tony asks Rex.

Rex leans both of his hands on the table, "Yes but with a little bit of twist"

The others listened attentively, they subconsciously already accepted Rex as their leader because of 
this.



"The Manticore has a weakness, we will aim for its tail first. There is an orb on its tail, crush it then 
the Manticore will be greatly weakened", Rex explains briefly.

Hera and Tony look at each other, 'Are the military more adept than the UWO?"

They started to doubt the UWO competence compared to the military, they thought Rex knows all 
of this from the military archives but little do they know Rex have the system with him.

"So here's our plan-"

~

"Sir, please I'm sorry. I don't know that it will end like this, I swear!"

In a room inside of the Faraday University, Manuel is shivering after getting cornered by a group of 
people.

If Rex was here, he will certainly know these people are from the Platchi Family.

Duncan was among them, "You said that you tested Rex, how can the White Assassins you sent 
killed Chris!", he said while showing Manuel the photo that was given by the Sullivan.

"Truthfully, the White Assassins never came back. We suspected Rex massacre them all", Manuel 
said with a shivering tone.

He looks left and right that is filled with Awakened from the Black Tiger Guild but they all are not 
wearing the Black Tiger uniform, they seem to come here in secret.

But one thing they have in common, they all emit a horrifying aura.

BAM!!

Duncan punches the wall beside Manuel creating a hole in it, "DAMN!!"

He scrunched his face in frustration before he approaches Manuel again, "Because of you, the UWO 
and the FAA will find out about this"

Manuel was so scared about the situation,

Although he is a Vice-Principal of the university, if known that he helped Duncan, he will be 
blacklisted from the university and will be exiled.

Duncan paces around the room with clear anger, "I WILL KILL THAT BRAT!!"

"Sir, calm yourself. The scandal makes the FAA monitor us, and now that it escalated like this, we 
can't afford to be reckless", a guy said from the side.

"I KNOW GOD DAMN IT!", Duncan shouted in frustration.

He then inhales a deep breath trying to calm himself down, after reducing his anger for a bit he said, 
"We can't be here for long,  and we can't have any witnesses. Kill him"

Hearing this, Manuel's face drains from all colors.

"SIR PLEASE SPARE ME! I'LL FIX THIS!", he said desperately, he can feel his time is about to 
come.

Manuel grabbed Duncan's leg, he's pleading for his life.



Duncan glances at him coldly, "The FAA will question you, it will damage our reputation if this got 
leaked out. So, you will die either way. Just blame yourself for creating this shit", he kicks Manuel 
making him stumbles to the ground.

He then gets a white crystal from his pocket before he teleported away.

The people around the room glance at Manuel murderously, his back is drenched with sweats as his 
spine grew cold.

One guy walks up to him while cracking his knuckle.

He squatted down in front of Manuel as his body started to emit a powerful aura, "Goodbye!"

CRACK!!

He punched Manuel in the face bursting his head into meat paste, he then licked the blood on his 
hand before he signals the other to leave.

Chapter 98 Too Curious

After the meeting for the tournament tomorrow,

All of the other Ochyra University representatives went to prepare themselves for tomorrow, they 
already discuss what each of them can do and already made a plan for tomorrow.

Rex and the girls are currently in the other quiet room, they just started to meditate.

The place is different from the place where they did their meetings before, this place is smaller and 
can only accommodate five people.

It has five big boxes made of glass with a cushion in the middle to sit.

These glass boxes are called by the Faraday University students as the Priming Box, it is a place 
where all Awakened meditate to increase their power.

The Priming Box accommodates all types of Elemental Crystal just like Ochyra University's VIP 
train but it is two ranks lower.

Although the Elemental Crystal in here is of lower rank, it is still good enough.

Rex takes the Mid Mana Charm Elixir from his inventory and drinks it in one go, it tastes sweet and 
he can definitely felt the changes immediately.

He adjusted the Elemental Crystal to lightning crystal before he sat back down.

The box turns bluish and it can be seen from the outside, lightning mana filled the room that makes 
Rex's body tingles.

'It's enough, although it's not as abundant as the VIP train it is still great', Rex thought as he started 
to meditate.

Adhara and Rosie are also meditating in their respective box, they started way earlier than Rex 
because Rex needs to do something before.

~

10 minutes ago,



Rex separated from the girls for a brief moment with the excuse to go to the toilet, he wanted to do 
something.

From last night he was curious about something.

He thought that he could shrug it off but he eventually got too curious about it,

"Edward!"

"P"

"P"

"P"

Rex texted Edward, he's spamming Edward like crazy.

"Bro, why the hell are you spamming?", he said annoyedly, he's currently in his room playing 
games when suddenly these rows of notifications from Rex came.

"Can I ask you for a favor?"

"Just say it, if you ask me something unreasonable I will definitely beat you up!"

"It's not don't worry, It's about Adhara"

"What about her?"

~

Thirty minutes into the meditation,

Rex's body is undergoing some changes, the lightning mana around his body becomes dense and it 
still becomes denser.

It envelopes his body completely in black, the black lightning current is sizzling inside the Prime 
Box.

Because of Rex's Black Lightning nature, the lightning mana turns black upon being released from 
Rex's body and it was a sight to behold.

Crack!

His body makes a cracking sound as a subtle lightning breeze blew.

Rex just enters the third rank and he can feel his body becoming closer to the lightning mana, it 
feels like he can control the lightning mana in the surroundings and bend them to his will.

It is a new feeling to Rex but he didn't stop meditating, he didn't want to waste the precious elixir he 
used.

After about four or five hours, Rex hears the Prime Box's door next to him open.

It's already afternoon turning night, he can tell from the lingering moonlight energy.

The effect from the Elixir he got from the system is astonishing, he can absorb literally tens of 
lightning mana in minutes! It was simply astonishing!



If anyone knows about this, they will definitely puke blood from shock.

Rex opens his eyes slowly, he then sees his stat,

<Stats>

Name: Rex Silverstar

Pack: Silverstar (1/2)

Level: 21 (712,500/1,000,000)

Race: High Werewolf

Full-Moon: 22 Days - Yule Moon

Berserk: 60%

Sanity: 75%

Mental: 42 (+32)

Strength: 95 (+19)

Agility: 48 (+2)

Endurance: 38 (+25)

Intelligence: 52

Attributable Stats: 0

<Average Human Adults have 5-7 points for each stat except for Intelligence>

Looking at his intelligence stat, he was quite proud of it.

In just hours of time, he manages to raise his intelligence stat by 14.

'I can raise roughly the same with the same amount of time before, is it because it will get harder the 
more I rank up?', Rex thought.

Although 14 raise is admirable, this speed is expected just when he drinks the same elixir before.

The difference is that today he drinks a higher grade of Mana Charm Elixir but can only manage to 
raise his intelligence by 14, even though he can absorb more lightning mana than before.

This can only mean one thing, it will get harder to increase the more he raises his intelligence.

Rex looks to the side and saw Adhara and Rosie just finished their training, they turn their heads 
and signal Rex that they wanted to eat.

He signals that he will eat later before the both of them left.

Just as he wanted to meditate some more, he remembers that he got into rank three so he can finally 
learn other spells.

'Let's learn some spells, I will also need to learn for the Mana Control round', Rex thought before he 
also left the room.

The quiet room is divided into many rooms, it is an all-function place.



The meeting room is just like before, the meditation room that he just used, and lastly is the training 
room where students can practice their spells.

It is really convenient and it shows the stand of Faraday University based on the facilities they 
provide.

Rex didn't get disturbed today, it is weirdly calm without any interruptions.

'I wish every day are just like today, it's refreshing to be alone', Rex thought, he then went to an 
empty training room.

Entering the room, it was different from any training room Rex has ever seen.

The room has natural light from the window above it, the ground is made of sand to accommodate 
the students, there are rows of different kinds of weapons on the side arranged neatly, a training 
dummy, and even a training robot.

It has everything Rex has ever hoped in a training room.

'I'm quite tempted to move here now, it's really an elite school', Rex thought.

He then walks to the control pad on the side, he clicks on it before a hologram popped out showing 
many functions.

In the control pad, Rex can adjust many things.

The training robot difficulty, the training dummy durability, videos of different arts of weapon, but 
his eyes landed on a function.

It is the training dummy function that can measure an attack power, he wanted to give it a try.

He clicked on the dummy function and set it to rank five, he then ticks the measuring function 
before he pressed okay.

ZONG!

The training dummy on the right got sucked into the ground before a new dummy appears, it makes 
a mechanical sound before it stopped.

Right in front of Rex's eyes, a white human-shaped training dummy appears.

Rex approach the training dummy, he notices the room is getting dark, 'I need to be quick if I want 
to test out my raw power'

If the night came and his passive skills activated, then his stat would've raised by 50% then he can't 
measure his raw power anymore.

He positioned himself before he punches the dummy with only his raw strength,

BAM!

The dummy's gut area turns red because of Rex's punch, "Power 956, Mid Rank Four", a 
mechanical voice said stating Rex's punch power.

Rex was confused about the power the voice said but he thought that it was only a scaling made by 
Faraday University.



After testing his raw strength, Rex activates his force and punches it again.

BAM!!

"Power 1045, Mid Rank Four"

Rex nodded his head, 'My raw punch during daytime is a solid Mid Rank Four thanks to the Force 
Manipulation skill'

He then added his black lightning to the mix and got a new high score, "Power 1090, Mid Rank 
Four"

Although it didn't rise by much, the speed his punch travel becomes faster than his usual.

Just after he punched the dummy, a notification from the system appears.

<Night Time! Increased the user's stats by 50%>

After his passive skill is activated, Rex then puts all of his power into one punch.

His fist emits a white hue from the Force and the Moonlight Energy, black lightning is sizzling on 
his arm like a black snake wrapping around his arm before he punches the dummy once again.

BOOM!

The punch creates an exploding shockwave that charred the dummy, Rex puts his all into it.

<Power 1857, Early Rank Five>

It was evident from the impact Rex make that it will be at least early rank five, but seeing it in 
person still greatly shocked him.

'No wonder I can punch the living hell out of Ronald', Rex thought.

After testing out his power limit,

Rex opened the system to see the spellbooks he had from before, he got quite a few of them lying 
around.

He got a couple of spellbooks that he got from the system, there's Mystic Shock, Lightning Salvo, 
and Black Field Orko.

Rex takes the books out of the inventory, two blue books and one dark blue spellbook appear in 
front of him.

He knows that the dark blue one is the Black Field Orko, he got it from when he became a Black 
Lightning Elementalist before so he decided to save it for the last.

It is definitely the hardest to learn.

This time, Rex wanted to save his gold and decided to learn the spellbook by himself.

He realized the scarcity of gold and he decided to save it, he got a couple of thousands left in his 
pocket and he's planning to keep it that way.

'Just think of this as Mana Control training, yes that's it', Rex thought trying to assure himself.

Rex takes the Lightning Salvo spellbook and opens it, he read the introduction of the skill, 'So this 
spell is related to the Mystic Shock spell, I should learn this one before Mystic Shock'



The spellbook stated that Lightning Salvo is a spell that summons lightning to strike a target, it is 
done first by channeling the lightning mana to the fingers.

Rex stands up and closes his eyes, he concentrates on the lightning mana on his body.

He can vaguely feel the lightning mana coursing through his body and also the surrounding, he then 
commands the lightning mana to his fingers.

The lightning mana stopped flowing as it went to Rex's arm.

Rex frown, he can felt the heavy burden to guide the lightning mana to its new path.

Not long after, just as the lightning mana enter his arm he lost his concentration before the lightning 
mana went back to its original path.

When he learns a spell through the system, his body instantly remembers the path of doing that 
certain move.

Take Flash skill, for example, his body instantly remembers the path to use Flash skill.

Doing it the normal way, however, is rather hard because it needs a lot of concentration and 
training.

The system is connected to Rex's body somehow, it can help his body to instantly remember the 
path of a certain skill.

"This is gonna be harder than I thought"

Chapter 99 Learning A Spell

Rex tries to channel the lightning mana to his fingers repeatedly,

Blitz!

"Come on work! I need to at least learn this one skill", Rex shouted desperately, he's training is not 
going well.

Every time he channels the lightning mana to his fingers, it failed because it is really as heavy.

It is akin to his body pulling an anchor from the bottom of the sea, it is really heavy that a new 
Awakened like him can't handle.

The lightning mana inside his body always went back to their original path after they got into Rex's 
arm, while the surrounding lightning mana is even harder.

During hours of training non-stop, he tries hundreds of times but fails.

He slammed himself to the ground with heavy breaths, it is mentally tiring to channel mana to 
conjure spells.

If someone knew how many times Rex tried, they might've fainted from shock to just how much 
stamina Rex has that even a master of Mana Control can't do.

"No matter how much I try, it's just not working", he's looking at the night sky tiredly, but the drive 
within him is still burning.

He sits back down and closes his eyes, 'Okay let's calm down, let's try to feel the Flash spell first'



Rex stands up and activates the flash spell,

The lightning mana rush to his legs instantly as if there's no obstruction, it didn't stop and gather on 
his leg wrist.

It created a bubble before suddenly,

SWOOSH!!

His body flashes into a black current before appearing at the other end of the room, Rex was feeling 
the course of lightning mana.

He did that a couple of times before he finally gets a hint from it.

'Every time I activate the Flash spell, the lightning mana in the surrounding only got sucked into my 
legs', Rex thought.

He can clearly feel the surrounding mana only got sucked into his legs, unlike how he tries before.

During his tries, he absorbs the lightning mana to anywhere inside his body before he channels it to 
his arms, this causes the burden to become too heavy.

Snap!

"That's it! I should focus the absorption of the surrounding lightning mana to my arm that way it 
will lessen the burden to channel it", he then immediately tries it out.

He absorbs the surrounding mana straight to his arms, he also channels the lightning mana inside 
his body at the same time.

Rex frowns for a bit but it is not as hard as before, he can channel it to his arms.

Blitz!

His fingers are cracking with black lightning, he successfully gathers the mana to his fingers and he 
can see black lightning blitzing around his fingers.

"Shit!", he stumbles as he can't contain the mana in his fingers.

BLITZ!

The black lightning reaches a couple of meters in front of him before it disappears, it was also 
rather weak.

Rex is excited seeing this, he manages to conjure a spell without the system.

He tries this multiple times, the channeling inside his body started to smoothen up as his fingers 
cracked with black lightning.

"Hold it...Hold it....", Rex tries to hold the mana in his fingers.

The lightning mana started to gather like crazy making a literal bubble in his fingers, the black 
lightning is coursing like a snake crazily.

Rex then aims it towards the training dummy before he let it out, "Lightning Salvo!"

BLITZ!!

This time, the black lightning reaches more than ten meters away striking the training dummy.



The training dummy got zapped by the black lightning, it only charred some of it but it is evident 
that this time it is almost a perfect Lightning Salvo spell.

Rex nodded his head, he's feeling rather proud but he didn't get it to his head.

He knows that the spell he used is rather normal than the other one he has, and also Lightning Salvo 
is not an offensive spell rather it is a Utility Spell.

The training dummy didn't get much damage from it but Rex can see there's a feeble piece of black 
lightning that is stuck on the training dummy.

It is small and almost unseen by the eye but it is there.

Looking at this, Rex takes the spellbook again and reads it some more.

It is stated in the Lightning Salvo spellbook that the spell's purpose is to leave those marks on a 
target, it can be chained by the Mystic Shock spell.

The Lightning Salvo spell didn't stop there, the true Lightning Salvo attack is versatile.

It is a spell to leave marks by striking them with a lightning strike that can bend, it is supposed to be 
an attack that can change trajectory to intercept the dodging enemy.

Rex tries to bend the spell but it is way harder than it said, it is so hard for him to control the 
Lightning Salvo the further it gets.

He tries it multiple times before he finally calls it a day.

The quarter moon shone down from the sky like an angel amidst the darkness, it brings a 
comfortable feeling for a Werewolf like Rex.

Just as he wanted to go out, Rex remembered the reward from the system.

He opened the inventory tab and tap the Invincible item description,

<Invincible>

A rank ten one-time use defensive item that can block one attack from a rank ten or lower entity. 
You will be in a weakened state after using this item.

Reading this, Rex was surprised, 'Another rank ten-item, it can block any attack from rank 10 or 
below? Wait a minute, is there even a rank ten?'

The system describes a rank ten as if there's a rank higher than that, it makes Rex thinks the 
unthinkable, 'There's no way that there's an even higher rank than 9 right?'

Any Human, Supernatural, or even Mutated Beast only got classified to rank 9, there are no such 
records of a rank higher than nine.

This makes Rex quite shocked, if this news was spread then it will be chaos.

After that, Rex decided to not think about it as he got out of the training room to get some food 
outside, he's starving from all that training.

"I wonder if Edward already does my favor", Rex thought as he walks slowly to a nearby food 
store.



~

Meanwhile,

Adhara and Rosie after they left the quiet room they went out to get food, they ate in the university 
cafeteria before they went outside of the university to find ice cream for Rosie.

After buying ice cream, they wanted to go straight back.

They're currently on the back entrance of the university to avoid the crowd, Faraday University 
students like to mess with them and it is annoying.

"Are you nervous about tomorrow?", Rosie asks while she's licking the vanilla ice cream.

Adhara shrugs her shoulders and said, "It's a lie if I say I don't but I'm not that nervous for the fight 
tomorrow, maybe a little bit nervous during the third round"

"I know right, especially Rex will definitely mock us if we lose", Rosie said while picturing Rex's 
annoying face, she bites the ice cream cone angrily because of that.

While they're walking up the stairs, Adhara suddenly frowns.

She tries to relax her body and walks normally, she then said, "Rosie, didn't you say you wanted to 
go to the toilet? There's a toilet there, I'll wait here for you"

Rosie slapped her forehead, "Oh yeah, I forgot that I wanted to pee", she then ran towards the toilet.

After Rosie went out of her sight, she then said slowly, "I know you're there, there's no point in 
hiding"

Adhara felt that someone is tailing them, although she didn't look much she's also a half-Werewolf 
and her senses are sharper than a normal human.

The back entrance is just beside the back cafeteria of the university, the students of Faraday 
University didn't hang around here because the stores on this side closed earlier than the main 
cafeteria.

From the corner of the place, a white figure appeared.

The white figure is tall and robust, he's wearing a white mask that covered his face and also he's 
emitting a fiery aura that suppressed Adhara's fire.

The only thing noticeable from the white figure is the reddish daggers on his waist.

"Who are you?", Adhara asks calmly but her head is a mess.

The white figure walks around playfully and said, "Why don't you try and find out?"

He then dashes like a phantom, he appears in front of Adhara and sent a fiery punch to her from the 
sides like a coiling snake.

His move is smooth and calculated, his movement screams expert.

BAM!

Adhara held up her arms and blocks the white figure's punch, the collision spat fire to the 
surroundings and sent Adahra screeching on the ground.



She then rolled to the side and get back on her feet.

"Hmm, not bad but I expected more for someone around Rex Silverstar", the white figure said 
jokingly, his voice is muffled so it is hard to hear his voice.

Hearing this, Adhara frowns in confusion.

'He knows Rex? Is he from the white assassins from before? but that's impossible, Faraday 
University's students?', she thought but she can't pinpoint who exactly the white figure is.

"Stop thinking so hard, focus on me", the white figure said.

Adhara readies her stance, the exchange from before instantly tells her that the white figure is at 
least a rank four Awakened and an expert in close-quarter combat.

Although her heart is beating like a drum, she felt no hostility from the white figure.

But just as she was studying the white figure, the white figure suddenly vanished like a phantom 
and appear on her back.

It was so fast that she can't react fast enough,

BAM!

A punch landed solidly on Adhara's waist, it was a heavy right hook that makes her gritted her teeth 
in pain.

The white figure didn't stop, he rains blow after blow endlessly.

Adhara was overwhelmed, every time she counter-attacked somehow the white figure already 
predicts her movement and punch her blind spot.

She was utterly outclassed by the white figure in close-quarter combat.

BAM!

Adhara was pushed backward with bruises all over her body, she raises her gaze and said fearlessly, 
"You know that there's CCTV everywhere here right? you will not be able to walk from this"

Hearing this, the white figure chuckles, "Don't worry about that"

The white figure turns his body and waves to the CCTV on the corner, "Hello there, enjoying the 
show?", he said playfully.

Seeing this, Adhara was stunned, 'He's definitely a part of the university, did they come to take 
revenge this fast?', she thought.

She then gathers the fire mana around her body, she wanted to make a loud noise to attract people.

"Good decision", the white figure said.

Then suddenly, fire mana around the white figure get contracted as it burst into a scorching flame 
that wanted to engulf Adhara.

SWOOSH!

Looking at this, Adhara makes a fire barrier around her as she tries to dodge it.



Her movement is not fast so she got engulfed by the white figure's flame, her barrier didn't last long 
as it got destroyed.

The fire burns her body making some of her clothes burned, it exposes her arms.

The white figure was quite shocking at the scene, he was not shocked by how Adhara survived his 
attack but rather the scene in front of him.

'This girl, he will be quite surprised after I tell him this', the white figure thought.

Then suddenly,

Creak!

Rosie came out of the toilet while humming a song, she was not aware of the fight that happened to 
Adhara.

Adhara glance at Rosie with a panicked look, she looked back to the white figure but he's already 
gone.

"Adhara?! What happened to you?!"

~

Rex already ate kebabs to his stomach content, he was satisfied and his mood lightens up.

He ordered the kebab on a store outside of Faraday University, he's currently on his way towards 
the entrance of the university.

While walking, a few students that still up glance at him.

They're whispering to each other, Rex can hear that some of them are mocking him while some of 
them are curious about him.

His room can be accessed through the side entrance, he's bored so he decided to go back through a 
different path rather than the main entrance.

The path to the side entrance is quite desolated, maybe because it's already late that it is desolated.

On Rex's side, there's a big garden beside the Gem of Knowledge building. It is the place where the 
students study researches, hang out, and also the library.

Rex wanted to finish his usual daily quest so he decided to sit on the garden bench.

He glanced at the surroundings and saw that there's literally nobody here, there's even no CCTV.

His senses are so sharp that he's never unaware of the CCTVs around the university but this time, he 
didn't found any CCTVs so he felt relaxed.

The sound of insects singing together and also the shining moon makes him relaxed, "This is nice"

He closes his eyes trying to enjoy the night, the night breeze charges his mind from the event that 
happens in the last couple of days.

After 30 minutes, his eyes opened abruptly.

Rex stands up from the bench and looks around with an alert expression, his Supernatural Sense 
suddenly tingles just like before!



He looks around the place when suddenly a hand taps his shoulder.

Chapter 100 Shapeshifter

Tap!

A hand suddenly grabbed Rex's shoulder, he jumped in surprise.

Rex jumped away and landed a few meters away from the figure behind him, his heart is thumping 
as he laid his eyes on the figure.

The figure is a guy wearing a Faraday University uniform that is covered by a brown hood, he's 
small and scrawny but he emitted an aura that even Rex felt pressured.

Rex's senses are on full alert,

It's not just the figure's aura that makes him alert but the figure got behind Rex without him even 
noticing, this is the first time anyone manages to do this.

It is seen clearly judging from the long slender fingers of the figure, he's definitely a Supernatural.

Rex's eyes glister as the figure's stat appear,

<Syn>

Race: Pale Shapeshifter

Power: Rank Five(Peak) - ???

Mental: ???

Strength: ???

Agility: ???

Endurance: ???

Intelligence: ???

Seeing this, Rex becomes even more certain, 'This guy is strong! Peak Rank Five is not something I 
can defeat', he thought.

"Hello there, nice to meet you fellow friend", Syn said, all of Syn's body and even voice is that of a 
human except for his long slender fingers.

Rex is backing away slowly, he trusts his senses and all of his senses are telling him to run.

'Fellow friend? Did he come here because of the day when I turn Adhara into a half-Werewolf?', 
Rex thought.

He then opened his mouth and said, "Why are you here?"

"How can a Werewolf like you live amongst humans, how did you get that body?", Syn said, he 
completely ignore Rex as he studied Rex up and down.

'So the Supernatural finally found me, they came to me to determine my position between the 
human and the Supernatural', Rex knows this day will come but he didn't expect it to come this 
soon.

Meeting an intelligent Supernatural is not what he's looking for, especially a high-rank one.



"Why should I tell you? Why should I tell a shapeshifter like you?", Rex said, his eyes darted left 
and right trying to find something or an opening to escape.

He decided to try and act like a Werewolf, it is at least what he can do right now.

Rex cursed himself to be alone in this place,

There's no CCTV around this area, it is completely blind in this garden.

Syn tilted his head weirdly, his human eyes suddenly turn black hollow, "You caught on quick, my 
name is Syn from the Conversion. I'm here to judge whether you're a friend or foe"

From the way he talks, Rex can tell that Syn is a proud shapeshifter.

Hearing this, Rex answered, "Only one Supernatural that can turn into almost a perfect human, so it 
not that hard to guess. A bastard like you is what we Werewolf hate"

Syn walks circling Rex slowly, he chuckles lightly, "Hate? You said you hate Shapeshifters?"

Rex stepped back unconsciously, he can feel Syn's aura becomes violent all of a sudden.

He's ransacking his brain in panic, 'Did I say something wrong? Why did he suddenly become 
hostile as if he's seeing his natural enemy'

Syn's eyes glanced sharply, "So, you're from the human side? a spy created by the human?!"

"What do you mean? I'm not on the Human side!", Rex shouted, he can feel the tension filling the 
air.

The wind is fluttering roughly as if there's a storm about to burst.

Syn black hollow eyes become darker, he looks at Rex sharply, "Werewolf and Shapeshifters have 
no hostile history with each other, you not knowing that means you're a fraud!!"

BOOM!

Syn blasted like a bolt, his movement is almost faster than what Rex's eyes can see.

SLASH!

In the blink of an eye, Rex's stomach got slashed by Syn's claws.

He didn't even notice what happened before suddenly blood burst out of his gut, a nasty slash 
wound etch on his gut as he held it tightly.

Rex felt the painful sting from the wound but he held it in, there's only one way to escape from this.

'Adhara definitely felt my situation, I'm still in the university so she will bring help', Rex thought, 
he's standing straight unfazed trying so hard to hold back his pain.

Syn looks at Rex with hostility, "You seem weak, even weaker than a normal Werewolf", he said 
while he licked the blood on his claws.

He looks confident in beating Rex, it was evident from the smile on his face.

'I can't beat him, it's the only way', Rex thought, he then smiles creepily while looking at Syn.

Looking at this, Syn was confused.



"What are you smiling at? You want to die?", he was feeling unsettled by Rex's smile but he shakes 
the feeling off.

Rex spread his arm mockingly, "It's funny that they say Shapeshifters is the weakest amongst the 
high-rank Supernatural, and now I can see why"

Syn was stunned, he didn't expect to hear that from Rex.

"You can't even react to my attack, trying to act tough?", Syn said mockingly, he didn't believe 
Rex's strong front.

Rex's smiles got even wider, he laughs maniacally, "It's not that I can't react, it's just I don't have to 
react to such a weak attack from you"

The wound on Rex's stomach is starting to heal up, it makes Syn shocked.

He was starting to hesitate because of it, Rex's regenerative ability is akin to that of High Werewolf 
that even Syn can't look down on.

"What's the matter? Are you done trying?", Re said confidently.

Syn gritted his teeth and said, "Big talk for a weakling, I can feel you're not even close to my power. 
I'm going to attack your left leg now, try and keep your tough front"

Hearing this, Rex uses his all to strengthen his body.

'This is it, after this, he will surely take my bait', Rex thought, he needs to at least make Syn bleed.

Right in front of Rex's eyes, Syn's hands that look like a normal human's hands suddenly turn into a 
huge skin-colored blade that looks sharp.

It makes Rex regret taunting Syn but he has to survive this next attack.

BOOM!

Just like before, Syn disappears from his spot like a phantom in the night before he arrives in front 
of Rex and slashes his legs.

In Rex's eyes, Syn's movement is so fast that even his body can't match.

Suddenly, Syn's body split into two as they both attack each of Rex's legs respectively.

Rex was shocked but he instantly collected himself.

Without thinking any further, Rex imbued all of his mana into his legs that makes them cracking 
with black lightning.

He also lengthens his claws to at least touch Syn's body, he needs only a little scratch that he can 
use to keep taunting Syn.

Rex focuses the force around his body to reinforce his legs, he needs all the defense he can gather.

SLASH!

"Eukh!", Rex grunted as his legs got a brutal injury on them.

He wanted to kneel on the ground because of the nasty slash wound but he didn't do it, he's still 
standing with a stoic expression trying to hold the pain in.



Although he can see his bones through the wound on his legs, he still didn't budge.

The pain he felt is extremely painful but he needs to put up a strong front, it is his plan to make Syn 
go all out.

He can already smell Adhara's scent nearing him, it seems Adhara really brought him some help.

"Even when I didn't do anything, you can't slash my legs off. You even get a little blowback from 
me, as you can see if I want to you'll be dead already", Rex said mockingly.

Syn on the other hand was stunned, his hands got zapped by the black lightning and his face got 
touched by Rex's claws.

There is a small scratch on his face, it is slightly bleeding.

It was due to pure luck that Rex manages to scratch Syn.

If Syn didn't underestimate Rex, then Rex will certainly die in mere seconds against him.

Syn touches the scratch on his face slowly, he looks at the bloodstain on his hand in disbelief, 
"You....scratch me?"

"It's a little gift for my little Shapeshifter, piss off now", Rex said.

Hearing this, the black aura around Syn exploded.

BOOM!!

The aura emitted by Syn makes the air trembles as he glances at Rex slowly, it is extremely dark.

Rough dark shockwaves breezes Rex's body along with the wind, it was utterly powerful.

Rex felt the pressure got heavier, his injury becomes even worse just by trying to fight back the 
pressure and standstill.

If he let go of his strong front now then it will be over.

'This guy, he unleashed his Supernatural aura recklessly. The lecturers and other Awakened nearby 
will definitely sense this', Rex thought.

Rex knows that Syn is a prideful Shapeshifter, he sounded proud just by saying that he's from the 
Conversion.

Because of that, Rex knows the way to make a prideful Syn mad is by mocking the Shapeshifter.

"A measly fake Werewolf like you...dare to scratch me?", Syn said slowly, his tone is getting lower 
and lower along with the pressure getting heavier.

It suffocated Rex making him dizzy but he tries his best to fend it off.

Syn's body merge together again as his blade hands glow with a dark hue,

The dark hue is so dark that even the surrounding light got engulfed by it as if it's a hungry hell 
hound eating away the light, it was a horrifying sight that can make trained soldiers feel fear.

'Dark Element! This guy is no joke!', Rex thought.



Dark Element and Light Element is two of the rarest element there is, both of the element can bring 
an Awakened directly to rank five without even needing to raise them to a higher rank element.

It is an element that is owned by seven people in the whole Elpida Alliance.

And that rare element is used by the Shapeshifter in front of Rex!

"I have seen countries fall! I have seen brethren die in vain!", Syn shouted as the dark mana gather 
crazily on his blade hand.

Without even needing to check it, Rex knows that he will die if he got hit by that attack.

Syn looks at Rex crazily, "I killed thousands of normal Humans! I even killed hundreds of Ancient 
Humans!"

"I AM TWO THOUSAND YEARS OLD! YOU CAN'T KILL ME!"

BOOM!!

The ground cracked under Syn's might, it got destroyed easily like butter.

He dashes like a madman turning into a black shadow filled with dark elements.

Rex can feel the immense pressure that even he himself is on the verge of kneeling, it is akin to a 
colossal monster stepping on a normal human's back.

As Syn got closer to Rex, he can feel the area around him got locked.

He can't even move an inch, the darkness is like a sticky liquid that restrains his movement in place.

"Great Magic! Blade of Darkness!", Syn arrived in front of Rex and slashes aiming at Rex's head, 
he intends to slash Rex's head in one clean strike.

Syn's blade hand is wrapped by the dark element,

The dark element turns into abyss eyes that sentenced Rex to death, it freezes Rex's being in place.

Syn didn't let Rex do anything, it happens in a flash.

In the nick of time, Rex shouted inside his head, 'SYSTEM USE INVINCIBLE!!'

BOOM!!

The slash landed cleanly towards Rex's head, the collision creates a huge shockwave that turns the 
night darker.

"What the hell is that?!"

"An attack? Rebels?"

"Dark Element?! How can a Dark Element Elementalist appear here?"

The collision between Rex and Syn caught the attention of many, they're all coming towards the 
garden near the side entrance.

Meanwhile,

Syn was shocked, he can feel his hand got stuck on something and he can't slash through it.

He raises his gaze and saw his blade hand can't slash Rex's neck!



The scene in front of him greatly shocked him, even in his wildest dream he didn't expect there to 
be a really high-ranking Werewolf live amongst humans.

"Wh...What?"
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