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561 Hans Wilson Changed His Mind 

Members of the European Federation team had a change of mind after hearing Derek 
Dole’s words. 

Hans Wilson nodded slightly and said, “That’s true, but the key is that we don’t have the 
right to speak in the future. We have to listen to Liu Yan’s orders. With the constraints of 
the Will of the Tower, we cannot disobey their orders. Even if we delay orders, we will 
be severely punished by the Will of the Tower. We will be disadvantageous in the 
future.” 

Hearing this, Derek Dole smiled and said, “I know it seems unfair, but we are weaker 
than the Land of Origin team. What Xu Han said was right. Since many teams were 
going to the top of the Tower together, it was natural that there should be one person to 
command. If there were many commanders, each commander had their thoughts. It will 
be a mess when something unexpected happens. With a unified command, the many 
teams will become strong teams. Their strength will become a whole. It will undoubtedly 
be more powerful, and there will be a higher chance of passing the trial of the higher 
levels of the Tower.” 

Members of the European Federation team felt that it made sense. 

“That’s true. We do need a commander.” 

“Although it’s frustrating to listen to someone else’s command, it’s better to be in 
command alone.” 

“It would be great if our captain, Hans Wilson, could be the commander. It’s a pity that 
we lost the ultimate gambling duel and were incorporated. We lost this opportunity.” 

“If that’s the case, perhaps we can go even further after we’ve been recruited by the 
Land of Origin team. After all, we’ve become stronger.” 

“The Land of Origin team is indeed strong. It’s a good thing to work with them.” 

“That’s right. The team members of the Land of Origin team have improved too quickly. 
They’re even stronger than the Red Star Empire team.” 

… 



Members of the European team agreed with Derick Dole’s opinion. At the same time, 
they were also surprised that the Land of Origin team had improved so quickly. 

When they had just entered the fifth level of the Tower, the strength of the Land of 
Origin team was still relatively average. The strength of the Red Star Empire team was 
the strongest. 

The overall strength of the European Federation team was slightly weaker than the Red 
Star Empire team. 

However, the European Federation team had a fusion skill, which was why they were 
not afraid of the Red Star Empire team. 

In such a short time, the Land of Origin team had grown from being the weakest to the 
strongest among the five teams. They surpassed the Red Star Empire team in one fell 
swoop. 

This kind of improvement was a bit exaggerated. 

Even the captain of the European Federation team, Hans Wilson, was no longer 
stubborn. He nodded and admitted, “I admit it’s better to have one commander. The 
Land of Origin team is strong. It might be a good thing for us to join forces with them.” 

Derek Dole was relieved to see that Hans Wilson had finally put down his previous 
hatred, regained his rationality, and listened to his advice. 

Derek Dole smiled and continued, “We lost to Liu Yan. It’s an embarrassing failure. The 
New World team lost to the army of magic puppets, the Pan-ocean Community team 
surrendered, and the Red Star Empire team lost to the Land of Origin team. We all lost 
to Liu Yan. It sounds embarrassing, but I don’t think so.” 

The members of the European Federation team agreed that it was too embarrassing for 
an entire team to lose to Liu Yan alone. 

No matter how strong Liu Yan was, he shouldn’t be able to destroy their entire team 
himself. 

This matter might even become the laughingstock of the other teams. 

Hearing that Derick Dole had other opinions, the members of the European Federation 
team also listened curiously. 

At this moment, Derek Dole continued, “This matter is rather embarrassing, but in 
reality, we don’t need to care about it. The strength of the European Federation team is 
obvious to all. It’s not weak and is about the same level as the Red Star Empire team. 
It’s stronger than the new world team and the Pan-ocean Community team. In the 



future, we can also prove our strengths. Let our strength speak for itself. Naturally, we 
don’t need to care about other people’s comments.” 

“It’s a good thing that we lost so badly this time. We’ve tried our best, but we still can’t 
win. It means we’re not weak, but Liu Yan is too strong. Liu Yan might have been our 
competitor or enemy in the past, but he’ll be our captain in the future. Isn’t it a good 
thing that Captain Liu Yan is strong? In addition, Liu Yan led the Land of Origin team to 
the Tower’s fifth-level trial and went against all odds. He eliminated four of our teams, 
won the final battle, and recruited four of our teams. Doesn’t this prove that Liu Yan is a 
rare leader? Isn’t this a good thing for us? Isn’t it more beneficial for our subsequent 
trials on the Tower’s sixth level?” 

“It’s not just our team that has been incorporated. All four teams have been incorporated 
into the Land of Origin team too. In this way, the strength of the Land of Origin team will 
be even stronger. With the five teams working together to break through the sixth level 
of the Tower, our chances will be much higher. It’s much better than us breaking 
through the sixth level alone!” 

Members of the European Federation team listened to their vice-captain, Derick Dole’s 
analysis and thought about it carefully. They couldn’t help but feel that it made sense. 

“That makes sense. It does seem like a good thing.” 

“That’s right. It’s a good thing to have such a powerful supreme commander. 

“Although I’m not convinced that I lost to Liu Yan, I have to admit that not only is Liu Yan 
insanely strong, but his leadership skills are also impressive.” 

“That’s right. This Liu Yan is too powerful. He’s simply a monster. Even I’m starting to 
admire him.” 

“Five teams working together to challenge the sixth level of the Tower. There’s indeed a 
good chance.” 

“All these things seem to be good. The only bad thing is that our entire European team 
lost to Liu Yan alone. It’s embarrassing, but as long as we don’t care about that, it 
doesn’t matter.” 

“That’s right. We’ll prove it with our strength later on. Let’s see who still dares to look 
down on us.” 

… 

The captain of the European Federation team, Hans Wilson, thought about it carefully 
and gradually understood. 



Hans Wilson couldn’t help but look at the members of the European team 
apologetically. “I’m really sorry. I was blinded by hatred and wanted to defeat Liu Yan. I 
caused everyone to get injured.” 

“It’s alright. We were also the ones who advocated fighting back then. ” 

“That’s right, Captain. How can you be the only one responsible? It’s our responsibility.” 

“At that time, we all advocated fighting, so there was no problem with this choice.” 

“If we had just surrendered and joined the Land of Origin team, we might not have been 
convinced. Now, we have witnessed the terrifying combat strength of Liu Yan and the 
Land of Origin team. We also lost to them, so we’re willing to join them.” 

“That’s right. I would regret it if I were to join right away.” 

“It’s just a little injury. We’re all men, so it won’t take long for us to recover.” 

“Compared to this small injury, the most important thing is for us to work together and 
strive to reach the higher levels of the Tower.” 

… 

Members of the European Federation team gradually cheered up. 

After that, they began healing and recuperating, preparing to welcome the sixth level of 
the Tower! 

562 Exclaim 

Earth attribute territory. 

After the ultimate gambling duel ended, members of the Red Star Empire team were 
teleported back to the earth attribute territory. 

The Red Star Empire team did not suffer any severe injuries in this battle. They were 
only eliminated. 

However, the ordinary members and the experts of the Red Star Empire team suffered 
a harsh blow. 

In the past, they thought they were the strongest team among the five teams on the fifth 
level of the Tower. 

The people from the Red Star Empire team did not think much of the Land of Origin 
team. 



Even though they had lost to the Land of Origin team and were eliminated by the Land 
of Origin team, they were still in shock. 

The Red Star Empire team did not think they were weaker than the Land of Origin team. 
It was just that the Land of Origin team had a better strategy. They had just ended a 
long battle with monsters, and their combat strength had dropped a lot. It gave the Land 
of Origin team an opportunity. In addition, they had the help of the New Continent team 
and the Pan-ocean Community team. That was why the Red Star Empire team had lost 
to the Land of Origin team. 

If they were in good condition, members of the Red Star Empire team would never have 
thought they would lose to the Land of Origin team. 

After all, when they had just entered the fifth level of the Tower, the comprehensive 
strength of the Land of Origin team was basically at the bottom. They were existences 
that the Red Star Empire team did not take seriously at all. 

Before the ultimate gambling duel began, the Red Star Empire team did not expect the 
Land of Origin team would choose them. After all, the Land of Origin team would lose if 
they did that. It was equivalent to giving them additional rewards for free. 

However, the Red Star Empire team had not expected the Land of Origin team had 
chosen the other three teams too. It could be said that the Land of Origin team had 
overestimated themselves. 

The battle between the Red Star Empire team and the Land of Origin team was unfair. 

Members of the Red Star Empire team had all recovered and were in good condition. 
Moreover, the New Continent team and the European Federation team were against the 
Land of Origin team too. Liu Yan did not join the battle at all, so the members of the 
Land of Origin were harassed by the two other teams. 

Furthermore, the Land of Origin team did not have any help from other teams. 

Hence, the Red Star Empire team had the upper hand in this battle. 

The strongest expert in the Land of Origin team, Liu Yan, did not participate in the 
battle. Hence, the Red Star Empire team had a significant advantage. 

However, the ordinary members of the Red Star Empire team realized that their 
strength was not as good as the ordinary members of the Land of Origin team. 

Ye Yifan and Luo Wei, the two top-tier experts from the Red Star Empire team, had an 
advantage in the battle. However, the other experts did not. 



Under Liu Yan’s crucial command, the experts of the Land of Origin team changed their 
battle plan and changed their targets. 

Then, Ye Yifan was up against Murong Xue, and Luo Wei was up against Allen Smith. 
The situation instantly changed. 

Although Ye Yifan’s strength was stronger than Murong Xue’s, he couldn’t do anything 
to Murong Xue, who had a strong defense. At the same time, he couldn’t escape 
Murong Xue’s entanglement and couldn’t join in the battle elsewhere. 

Luo Wei’s situation was similar to Ye Yifan’s. Although Luo Wei’s direct combat ability 
was not as good as Allen Smith’s, Luo Wei’s concealment, movement techniques, and 
assassination abilities were stronger than Allen Smith’s. 

Unfortunately, Allen Smith was also fast. He kept pestering Luo Wei, so Luo Wei could 
not assassinate the other members of the Land of Origin team. Luo Wei could only keep 
attacking Allen Smith. 

Without the advantage of the two top-tier experts in the Red Star Empire team, the Red 
Star Empire team was at a disadvantage in all other aspects. 

The little setbacks caused the Red Star Empire team to lose dominance as the battle 
progressed. 

Even without the help of Liu Yan, the strongest fighter in the Land of Origin team still 
managed to defeat the Red Star Empire team. 

This time, everyone from the Red Star Empire team could be said to be convinced of 
their defeat. 

At this moment, members of the Red Star Empire team all had unwilling expressions. 

“I didn’t expect the team members of the Land of Origin team to be so strong.” 

“That’s right. They were so weak at the beginning. I didn’t expect them to catch up to us 
so quickly.” 

“It seems like we’ve been too self-opinionated and have been stuck in the same place.” 

“Yes, compared to the huge improvement of the Land of Origin team since they entered 
the fifth level of the Tower, our improvement is too little.” 

“We’ve lost this battle in such an embarrassing manner.” 

“Liu Yan, the strongest member of the Land of Origin team, hasn’t joined the battle yet. 
We had the advantage, but we still lost. We’ve lost too thoroughly.” 



“If Liu Yan were to join the battle, I’m afraid we would lose even faster.” 

… 

Members of the Red Star Empire team were all brooding over their defeat, especially 
when they saw that the Land of Origin team had improved so much and had already 
caught up to them. On the other hand, they were still stuck in the same place and had 
closed themselves up. It was embarrassing. 

On the contrary, members of the Red Star Empire team did not seem to care much 
about the outcome of their defeat. They were more concerned about losing the battle. 

Sun Wen’s expression was helpless as he said, “All of you were busy with the battle 
and didn’t pay attention to the other battles on the stage. Liu Yan defeated the New 
Continent team and the European Federation team by himself. If Liu Yan had joined the 
battle, I think we would have lost immediately.” 

Hearing Sun Wen’s words, everyone was shocked. 

“Vice-captain Sun, is this for real? Liu Yan took care of the New Continent team and the 
European Federation team himself?” 

“Although the New Continent team isn’t as strong as us, they’re not weak either. The 
European Federation team is even stronger. How could Liu Yan have wiped out both 
teams by himself?” 

“It was two teams of awakened ones. It’s impossible, right?” 

… 

The members of the Red Star Empire team were all in disbelief. 

It wasn’t that they didn’t trust Sun Wen, but it sounded too ridiculous. 

They had also heard of Liu Yan’s combat strength. 

Especially in this battle, they had witnessed Allen Smith’s terrifying combat power. 

Allen Smith was only the second-best in the Land of Origin team, while Liu Yan was the 
first-best. 

After witnessing Allen Smith’s terrifying combat power, they naturally knew that Liu 
Yan’s strength could only be stronger. 

563 Lacking Strength 



However, no matter how strong Liu Yan was, he was just an awakened one. It was 
impressive if he could defeat ten awakened ones. How could he defeat two teams at the 
same time? 

The captain of the Red Star Empire team, Ye Yifan, looked at Sun Wen suspiciously 
and said, “Sun Wen, are you sure you’re not mistaken? That’s two teams, especially the 
European Federation team. They know how to combine their skills and are extremely 
powerful. Did Liu Yan defeat the New Continent team and the European Federation 
team by himself without others’ help?” 

Sun Wen looked at his team members, who were all in doubt, and nodded. “Of course, I 
saw it with my own eyes. Why would I lie to you? Who else Can Liu Yan rely on? The 
rest of the team members from the Land of Origin team are fighting us. Liu Yan faced 
the New Continent team and the European Federation team alone. The Pan-ocean 
Community team has been teleported out and can’t interfere with the battle in the arena. 
I saw Liu Yan defeat the two teams by himself.” 

Ye Yifan thought about it carefully and realized it was indeed the case. At that time, it 
seemed that no awakened could help Liu Yan. 

The only person Liu Yan could rely on was himself. 

“Then how did he do it?” Ye Yifan asked again. 

The other members of the Red Star Empire team also looked over at Sun Wen, waiting 
for his reply. They were curious how Liu Yan had managed to do the impossible. 

Sun Wen shook his head helplessly, “At that time, I still had to command and cast 
support skills. I couldn’t keep observing Liu Yan and the other two teams. I didn’t know 
the details but only the general situation. Liu Yan did not fight the New Continent team 
alone. Instead, he used a large number of enchanted puppets, about eighty of them. 
These enchanted puppets were all very powerful and almost crushed the members of 
the New Continent team. As for the battle between Liu Yan and the European 
Federation team, Liu Yan was alone. He used various spells and caused many troubles 
for the European Federation team, but the European Federation team also used a 
fusion skill. I don’t know what happened after that. At that time, I was busy with the 
head-on battle and had no time to care about other things. However, the result was that 
all the members of the European Federation team were severely injured and then 
surrendered.” 

Ye Yifan was surprised when he heard about the enchanted puppets. 

He knew about the enchanted puppet. It was an ancient secret technique that could 
create powerful war machines. 



It was a secret technique that had always been passed down only to one person. As 
such, very few people knew how to make enchanted puppets. 

The combat power of the enchanted puppets produced was indeed powerful. 
Correspondingly, the process of producing the enchanted puppets was complicated. 
The materials required were hard to get. Hence, it took a lot of time and materials to 
create an enchanted puppet. 

In particular, the enchanted puppets, which were regarded as powerful in combat, 
consumed many resources. The production process was more troublesome. 

Yet, Liu Yan had more than eighty enchanted puppets. Where did he get so many? 

“Looks like Liu Yan has a lot of secrets on him, and he’s also much stronger than we 
expected.” Ye Yifan nodded. 

At this moment, Ye Yifan couldn’t help but feel a sense of defeat. 

Even without Liu Yan’s participation, the Land of Origin team could still defeat them. 

Furthermore, Liu Yan’s strength was so terrifying that he could defeat the New 
Continent team and the European Federation team by himself. It was shocking. 

With such a comparison, the Red Star Empire team had lost completely. They had lost 
to the Land of Origin team in all aspects. 

Ordinary members of the Red Star Empire team gradually came to a realization. 

“No wonder the New Continent team and the European Federation team surrendered 
not long after we were eliminated.” 

“I thought the two teams had given up on resisting and sold us out. It turns out that they 
had no choice but to give up after losing.” 

“No wonder we haven’t received any reinforcements from the New Continent team or 
the European Federation team after waiting so long. It turns out that they can’t even 
protect themselves.” 

“This Liu Yan is too terrifying.” 

“Yeah, I’ve never heard of any expert who could defeat two teams by himself.” 

“Liu Yan is practically invincible. If he were to make a move against us, all members of 
the Red Star Empire team would not be able to defeat him.” 

“I also think that it’s possible.” 



… 

The captain of the Red Star Empire team, Ye Yifan, was silent for a moment. Then, he 
suddenly said, “If that’s the case, it’s a good thing that we’ve been recruited by the Land 
of Origin team. We’ll learn from Liu Yan and the Land of Origin team. We’ll become 
stronger.” 

When Sun Wen heard this, he looked at Ye Yifan with a strange expression. 

At this moment, Sun Wen finally understood that Ye Yifan was a little self-righteous and 
arrogant. He did not think much of Liu Yan and the Land of Origin team. 

But in reality, Ye Yifan was also a pure martial arts fanatic. He focused on cultivating 
and becoming stronger, so he didn’t care much about his knowledge. 

When he realized this, Sun Wen felt a lot more at ease. It might be good for Ye Yifan to 
join the Land of Origin team. 

As for joining the Land of Origin team, it was an even better thing for the ordinary 
members of the Red Star Empire team. First, they could raise their strength under Liu 
Yan’s leadership. 

On the other hand, it would increase their chances of reaching the higher levels of the 
Tower. 

At this moment, Sun Wen also looked at members of the Red Star Empire team and 
reminded them, “Everyone, listen up. I know you’ve lost to the Land of Origin team and 
will be incorporated into the team. In the future, listen to Liu Yan’s orders. Some of you 
may be dissatisfied and resentful, but I don’t care what you think. Put away your 
dissatisfaction and resentment for the time being and join the Land of Origin team 
obediently. I believe that you’ll gain a lot from training and fighting together with them for 
some time. It’s better to lose face by losing to your competitors than to lose your life by 
losing to your enemies in the trial. I hope everyone can remember this. Also, you can 
put away your arrogance. We’ve already lost to the Land of Origin team, and we’ve lost 
completely. In the future, don’t think that the Red Star Empire team is the strongest. 
Keeping a low profile and improving your strength is the most important thing!” 

564 Failure Might be a Good Thing 

Members of the Red Star Empire team gradually understood Sun Wen’s intentions. 

Although some team members didn’t quite agree, they could only obey the order for the 
time being. 

Sun Wen glanced at the Red Star Empire team members and felt at ease. 



It didn’t matter what they really felt. As long as they did as they were told, it would be 
fine. 

Sun Wen believed that after joining the Land of Origin team for a while, these team 
members would understand his intentions. 

Although losing to the Land of Origin team and being recruited by the Land of Origin 
team was embarrassing, it was a good thing for members of the Red Star Empire team. 

Immediately after, members of the Red Star Empire team also started to rest. 

The defeat this time was also regarded as a humiliation by the experts and ordinary 
members of the Red Star Empire team. They all decided to become stronger and win 
back in the future to wash away their previous humiliation! 

At the same time, in the wood attribute territory. 

Compared to the worry of the New Continent team, the despair of the European 
Federation team, and the humiliation of the Red Star Empire team, the members of the 
Pan-ocean Community team were much happier. 

As soon as the ultimate gambling duel began, they followed the original plan and 
surrendered to join the Land of Origin team. 

They thought the Land of Origin team would lose the final battle. However, the result 
was completely beyond their expectations. 

The strength of the Land of Origin team improved greatly during this period. They 
defeated the Red Star Empire team, which had always been the strongest. 

Liu Yan’s strength shocked Pan-ocean Community. They did not expect Liu Yan to have 
created so many powerful orange enchanted puppets. Liu Yan’s combat strength was 
also shockingly strong. He defeated the entire European Federation team by himself. It 
was ridiculous. 

In the past, members of the Pan-ocean Community team would never have believed 
that one person could defeat an entire team. It sounded too fake. 

However, after witnessing it with their own eyes this time, the members of the Pan-
ocean Community team finally understood that there was always someone better than 
them. After all, they saw Liu Yan had done the impossible easily. 

Members of the Land of Origin team have improved a lot. 



After all, they have so much good equipment and high-level loot. They don’t have 
anything to worry about. They can focus on improving their strength. It’s normal for them 
to improve so much. 

“Yeah. If our team has a ridiculous genius like Liu Yan, things will become much easier.” 

“Liu Yan’s combat ability is outrageous. He defeated a team all by himself, and so did 
his enchanted puppets. It means that Liu Yan can defeat two teams by himself!” 

“Liu Yan’s enchanted puppets crushed the New Continent team. I think Liu Yan can 
take down another team with the combat power of the enchanted puppets.” 

“Indeed. Forty-one red enchanted puppets are powerful. Each of them is comparable to 
an expert. The rest of the team members don’t have such an exaggerated combat 
power.” 

“Normally, there are only six or seven experts in a team. Our team only had three 
experts, which is not ideal.” 

“Haha, we don’t have enough resources. It’s fine. Once we join the Land of Origin team, 
I believe Captain Liu Yan will give us some resources.” 

… 

The members of the Pan-ocean Community team were thrilled at this moment. 

They were the first to surrender and join the Land of Origin team, unlike the other teams 
who had joined forces to fight the Land of Origin team. 

As such, the Pan-ocean Community team believed they would receive preferential 
treatment after joining the Land of Origin team. 

Although they were not familiar with Liu Yan, the members of the Pan-ocean 
Community team got to know Liu Yan during this period. They had a rough 
understanding of Liu Yan’s personality. 

Based on Liu Yan’s clear judgment, he would not mistreat the Pan-ocean Community 
team. 

At this time, He Yang also looked relaxed. He had made the right choice, which would 
undoubtedly bring endless benefits to the Pan-ocean Community team. 

He Yang was optimistic for the days ahead. After joining the Land of Origin team, he 
would follow Liu Yan closely. He believed that his team’s strength would improve and 
they could completely change their fate. 



At this time, He Yang saw that the members Pan-ocean Community team seemed to be 
a little too smug, so he did not forget to remind them, “The current situation is indeed 
very beneficial to us, but don’t get carried away. After we join the Land of Origin team, 
you have to listen to Liu Yan’s orders. Besides, you have to improve your strength. 
Strength is the most important. Our decision to join the Land of Origin team has indeed 
earned us Liu Yan’s favor and some resources, but that doesn’t mean he’ll always give 
us resources. Only by improving our strength and working hard can we continue to gain 
resources and grow into true experts.” 

Members of the Pan-ocean Community team all agreed to it. 

“Sigh, Captain, don’t worry. We understand.” 

“That’s right. We’ll cultivate and improve our strength after we enter the Land of Origin 
team.” 

“I’ve been trying my best to improve my strength, but I’ve been struggling because I 
don’t have high-level cultivation resources. I believe that I’ll be able to improve after 
joining the Land of Origin team.” 

“We’ll be heading to the sixth level of the Tower soon. I wonder what it will be like.” 

“Haha, I’ll be able to fight alongside members of the Land of Origin team in the future.” 

… 

Members of the Pacific Community were all full of smiles. They were looking forward to 
the subsequent trial on the sixth level of the Tower after joining the team of the Land of 
Origin. 

In the fire attribute territory. 

Liu Yan noticed it was about time. He estimated that the other teams had rested 
enough. He then released the A-grade fierce beast, Purple Wind Falcon, and placed 
four envelopes to be sent to the other four territories. 

The contents of the four letters were the same. All four teams were to go to the central 
area of the five territories and prepare to head to the sixth level of the Tower. 

Liu Yan looked at Purple Wind Falcon, which had already flown far away. He also 
informed Luo Qingcheng and Xu Han to gather the team, pack up their things, and head 
to the central area to prepare to go to the sixth level of the Tower. 

Members of the Land of Origin team had long been looking forward to it and had 
already packed up. 



There was not much to pack. The most important things were nothing more than 
equipment and cultivation resources. These precious things were all worn by the 
members. Some of them were kept in storage rings. 

The rest of the preparations were just a little bit of food. 

565 A Gift from the Guardian Beast 

Soon, all members of the Land of Origin team had gathered. 

At this moment, members of the Land of Origin team were also discussing among 
themselves, looking forward to the trial on the sixth level of the Tower. 

“I wonder what the sixth level of the Tower looks like.” 

“I don’t know much either. I’ve only heard that it’ll be extremely dangerous.” 

“I’ve heard about it too. It’s said that the sixth level of the Tower is a large platform, and 
there will be many humans and alien races from other planets, so it’s dangerous.” 

“That’s right. The trials on the fifth level of the Tower are battles between the few 
continents of the Blue Planet. Generally, we won’t kill each other unless it’s necessary. 
In the end, it’s just a competitive relationship. As for the trials on the sixth level of the 
Tower, we might kill the opponents if we have to. After all, we must get rid of enemies to 
protect ourselves.” 

“We’ve taken in four teams, and Boss is so strong. There shouldn’t be any problems.” 

“What’s there to be afraid of? Even if we’re not strong enough, we’ll have to improve our 
strength. We were the weakest when we first arrived on the fifth level of the Tower. But 
now, we are already the strongest team!” 

… 

Members of the Land of Origin team were in the midst of a discussion. When they saw 
their captain, Liu Yan, arrive, they all quieted down. 

“Everyone’s here, and we’re all ready.” Xu Han walked over and reported. 

“Then let’s go.” Liu Yan nodded. 

“Let’s go!” 

Following Liu Yan’s order, members of the Land of Origin team set off and headed out 
of the fire attribute territory. 



As the group was advancing, the cry of a phoenix came from the sky. 

Everyone looked up and saw that it was the fire attribute territory’s guardian beast, 
Undying Fire Phoenix. It wanted to send off the Land of Origin team. 

“I didn’t expect Undying Fire Phoenix would send us off.” 

“Undying Fire Phoenix is quite something. It protected our territory, fought for us, and 
even protected our team members during the battle. It is indeed a guardian beast.” 

“That’s right. Undying Fire Phoenix helped us a lot on the fifth level of the Tower.” 

“It’s time to part. I don’t know when we’ll be able to see Undying Fire Phoenix.” 

“I guess we won’t meet again. Undying Fire Phoenix still has to stay in the fire attribute 
territory on the fifth level of the Tower to guard it.” 

… 

Team members of the Land of Origin team immediately sighed with emotion. 

When Liu Yan saw Undying Fire Phoenix sending them off, he unfurled his Wings of 
Wind God and flew up to the sky, flying side by side with Undying Fire Phoenix. 

Although he wasn’t too close with Undying Fire Phoenix, it undoubtedly helped Liu Yan 
and the others a lot during the time on the fifth level of the Tower. 

Especially in the battle where the monsters were in chaos, the Undying Fire Phoenix 
was of great help. 

Thank you for sending me off. I might not see you again in the future. Liu Yan sighed 
with emotion. 

Undying Fire Phoenix let out a cry as if it had a special meaning. 

Just as Liu Yan was wondering what Undying Fire Phoenix was saying, Treasure 
Pangolin transmitted the Undying Fire Phoenix’s message to Liu Yan through the 
spiritual connection. Liu Yan had a spiritual connection with Treasure Pangolin through 
the contract. 

In addition to being good at digging holes and searching for treasures, Treasure 
Pangolin could understand the languages of many fierce beasts because it had been in 
contact with many different species of fierce beasts all year round. 

For example, Shadow Wolf could only understand the voices of the more common 
fierce beasts. 



Liu Yan then realized that Undying Fire Phoenix was asking him to open his arms. It 
wanted to give him something. 

Liu Yan looked at Undying Fire Phoenix in confusion, not understanding what it was 
trying to give him. 

However, Liu Yan still extended his hand. 

Undying Fire Phoenix tilted its head and threw something into Liu Yan’s hands. 

Then, Undying Fire Phoenix turned around and left, no longer paying attention to Liu 
Yan and the other members of the Land of Origin team. 

Seeing this, Liu Yan was dumbfounded. 

It seemed that Undying Fire Phoenix had come to deliver this item and not to say 
goodbye. 

They all thought Undying Fire Phoenix was here to send them off. 

Liu Yan didn’t expect Undying Fire Phoenix would leave without looking back after 
giving him the item as if it did not know Liu Yan and the others. 

Liu Yan couldn’t figure it out. He looked at the thing in his hand, and his first impression 
was that it was black. Then, he looked at it and found it was a black wood-like object. 

This strange black wood was relatively light. It was not made of metal or ore but some 
kind of wood. 

However, what made Liu Yan feel strange was that this piece of black wood seemed 
ordinary. Liu Yan used his S-grade skill, Omniscient Insight, to sense it but found 
nothing. 

This piece of black wood seemed to be an ordinary piece of black wood. There was 
nothing special about it, whether it was its appearance or interior. 

Liu Yan was a little confused and asked Treasure Pangolin. 

With the same thought, Liu Yan immediately understood Treasure Pangolin’s reply. 

Treasure Pangolin couldn’t sense it either. This piece of black wood didn’t seem to be a 
treasure. 

Liu Yan could not figure it out. 



Undying Fire Phoenix came all the way to give Liu Yan this item, so it must be 
extraordinary. 

One could directly sense the terrifying energy within the ordinary treasure and know it 
was extraordinary. Sometimes, one couldn’t sense the energy within ordinary treasure 
clearly. 

However, Liu Yan could sense everything within the black wood. Still, he could not feel 
anything special about the black wood, as if it was just a piece of black wood. 

Liu Yan was puzzled and tried to check the information on the strange black wood with 
his smart bracelet. 

[ Blackfire Divine Wood ] 

Level: Unknown 

Description: Unknown 

Effect: Unknown 

The status panel showed no information, but one thing made Liu Yan’s eyes light up. 
That was the name of this piece of wood. It was called the Blackfire Divine Wood. 

Blackfire Divine Wood? It sounded pretty impressive. 

At the same time, based on the information on his status panel, Liu Yan could conclude 
that the Blackfire Divine Wood was indeed a treasure. 

After all, the smart wristband had been perfected by powerful ancestors and contained a 
vast amount of information. 

The smart wristband could even find information on ordinary soil. 

Liu Yan only knew this piece of wood was called the Blackfire Divine Wood, and 
everything else was unknown. 

Liu Yan could determine that this piece of Blackfire Divine Wood was a treasure the 
ancestors had never encountered. It was very likely to be extremely precious. 

However, this Blackfire Divine Wood was rather special, and Liu Yan could not sense its 
extraordinariness. 

Liu Yan did not know how to use the Blackfire Divine Wood. After all, Undying Fire 
Phoenix had disappeared without a trace. He had no idea where it went. 



Immediately after, Liu Yan put the Blackfire Divine Wood into his intermediate storage 
ring. He planned to wait until he reached the higher levels of the Tower and explore the 
uses of this treasure when he had the opportunity. 
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After putting away the Blackfire Divine Wood, Liu Yan flew back to the ground. 

When team members of the Land of Origin team saw Liu Yan return, they were all a 
little puzzled. 

“Captain, what did you do to Undying Fire Phoenix?” 

“Why did Undying Fire Phoenix run away as soon as it saw you?” 

“Captain, did you threaten Undying Fire Phoenix?” 

“That’s right. Undying Fire Phoenix was here to send us off, but you scared it away.” 

… 

When Liu Yan heard this, he was speechless. He thought to himself, “Undying Fire 
Phoenix didn’t come to see us off. It’s here to deliver something, and then it left. It 
doesn’t have any intention of seeing me off.” 

“Go, go, go. Undying Fire Phoenix has already sent us off. What are you guys thinking 
about?” Liu Yan casually made up an excuse. 

At this time, Liu Yan was also a little puzzled. Did Undying Fire Phoenix want to send 
the Blackfire Divine Wood over, or was there someone who ordered it? 

However, all of these were naturally unknown now. 

In the space in the center of the five territories. 

Liu Yan led the Land of Origin team and arrived first. 

Not long after, the New Continent team, the Pan-ocean Community, the European 
Federation, and the Red Star Empire arrived one after another. 

The attitudes and moods of the members of the four teams were also different. 

The members of the Pacific Community were undoubtedly the happiest. 

In this ultimate gambling duel, the Land of Origin team was the biggest winner, while the 
New Continent team was the second. 



After the members of the New Continent team arrived, they mingled with members of 
the Land of Origin team and started chatting. They were familiar with each other. 

After all, the Pan-Pacific Community team was the first to be eliminated by the Land of 
Origin team. Members of the Pan-Pacific Community team were naturally more familiar 
with members of the Land of Origin team. 

In addition, in this ultimate gambling duel, the Pan-ocean Community was the first to 
surrender and join the team of the Land of Origin. 

Members of the Land of Origin team naturally had a better attitude toward the members 
of the Pan-ocean Community team. 

At this moment, members of the Land of Origin team and the Pan-ocean Community 
team were mixed. They were familiar with each other as if they were one team. 

On the other side, the members of the New Continent team were the most regretful and 
sad when they saw this. 

After all, the New Continent team had also been eliminated by the Land of Origin team 
long ago. Therefore, the members of the New Continent team and the Land of Origin 
team were more familiar with each other. 

Initially, the New Continent team could have had a good relationship with the Land of 
Origin team, just like the Pan-ocean Community team. 

But during the ultimate gambling duel, the New Continent team observed the battle and 
decided to fight the Land of Origin team. 

As a result, the relationship between the members of the New Continent team and the 
Land of Origin team worsened. 

At this moment, the European Federation team and the Red Star Empire team had also 
arrived. 

Members of the Red Star Empire team had lost to the Land of Origin team in the 
ultimate gambling duel. Naturally, they felt embarrassed. 

The members of the European Federation team felt even more embarrassed. 

The Red Star Empire team had lost to the Land of Origin team, while the European 
Federation team had lost to Liu Yan. They were not on the same level at all. 

In addition, most members of the European Federation team were still injured, either 
with light injuries or serious injuries. 



Hans Wilson and Derek Dole had already asked the priests from the European 
Federation team to do the treatment, and they had also used a lot of healing herbs. 

However, it was only a small part of the initial treatment. The rest of the team members 
were still injured. 

The European Federation team was undoubtedly the most miserable of the four teams. 
When they were declared war by the Land of Origin team, they put up a desperate 
resistance. Many of their members had been injured. 

In the ultimate gambling duel, members of the European Federation team were also 
injured by Liu Yan. 

The European Federation team handed their loot to the Land of Origin team. 

The healing consumables brought by the European Federation team were naturally not 
enough. 

As a result, many members of the European Federation team were still injured. 

At this moment, Liu Yan saw that the other four teams had arrived. He gathered the 
core members of each team to discuss their next move. 

Not long after, the team captains, vice-captains, and other core members of the four 
teams all went to Liu Yan. 

At this moment, the core members of these four teams were in a somewhat complicated 
mood. 

They were also the representatives of their respective continents and were also 
geniuses. 

However, all of their brilliance had been overshadowed by Liu Yan. They had even been 
incorporated into the Land of Origin team. They and all their team members had to 
listen to Liu Yan’s orders. 

Of course, the Pan-ocean Community team was an exception. 

He yang and the other experts from the Pan-ocean Community team were all beaming 
with joy. 

Although they had the least number of experts in their team, only three people, it did not 
affect their position as the second winner. 

The other teams might be stronger than them, but they didn’t make the right choice! 



Jin Cheng and the other experts from the New Continent team were the most regretful. 

They originally had the opportunity to enjoy the same treatment as the Pan-ocean 
Community team, but they had missed such a good opportunity. 

Hans Wilson and Derek Dole from the European Federation team were somewhat 
helpless. At this point, they had undoubtedly failed. 

Although Ye Yifan, Sun Wen, and the others from the Red Star Empire team had lost, 
they had gradually accepted the current situation. They also understood that Liu Yan 
and the Land of Origin team were stronger than them. They had many things to learn 
from Liu Yan and the Land of Origin team. 

Liu Yan looked at the experts from the four continents and announced coldly, “Let’s 
arrange the deployment first so that it’ll be easier for us to move later. As for the team 
members, we’ll maintain the original arrangement. All the members will stay in the 
original team, and I’ll directly command each of your team captains. You just have to 
follow the orders. This way, the team members won’t have to split up. Besides, they will 
become more familiar with each other. They’ll have better cooperation in battle, and it’ll 
be easier for you to maintain your combat strength. Of course, I’ll pick out the members 
I like and direct them!” 
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When the four team captains and vice-captains heard this, they looked at each other 
and were satisfied. 

At first, they were worried that Liu Yan would try to recruit their team members and form 
a new team. 

It seemed like they were overthinking things. Liu Yan didn’t even have the idea. 

Liu Yan wasn’t surprised to see their expressions. 

Liu Yan didn’t need to rope in their team members. 

Liu Yan had always believed that the best way to win over them was to attract them. 
With Liu Yan’s strength and captainship, he could attract the trust of his team members 
and make them acknowledge him as their team captain. 

Liu Yan didn’t like the stingy methods of messing up the organization. 

Liu Yan also knew that the disruption would affect their combat effectiveness. 



After all, a team’s overall combat strength was not only determined by the strength of 
each member but also by the cooperation and tacit understanding between the 
members. 

When team members of the same strength formed a team, the difference in tacit 
understanding and cooperation would affect their combat strength. 

Members of these teams were already very familiar with each other, so Liu Yan 
naturally wouldn’t disturb them. 

After all, the trials on the sixth level of the Tower would be more dangerous. They 
needed to think of ways to improve their combat power, not reduce it. 

Liu Yan would also choose some of the team members he liked and give them direct 
orders. This way, they could display their combat abilities and have better training. 

“I don’t have any objections.” He Yang, the captain of the Pan-ocean Community team, 
was the first to smile and reply, “If there are any team members that you like, feel free to 
pick. If there aren’t enough, you can pick a few more.” 

Since He Yang had already said so, the other team captains also expressed their 
opinions. 

“I don’t have any objections either. You can choose whoever you want.” The captain of 
the New Continent team, Jin Cheng, said. 

Jin Cheng understood that his previous mistake had left a bad impression on Liu Yan. 
He needed to perform well in the future. He might not be able to leave a good 
impression on Liu Yan, but at the very least, he would not leave a bad impression on Liu 
Yan. It would greatly affect the overall development of the New Continent team. 

The captain of the European Federation team, Hans Wilson, hesitated for a moment 
before nodding in agreement. 

“I don’t have any problems with that either.” 

Hans Wilson was reluctant. But since Liu Yan was the captain, he could only obey. 

As long as it wasn’t a matter of principle, he couldn’t refuse. 

Finally, the Red Star Empire team’s captain, Ye Yifan, also nodded in agreement. He 
had no objections. 

Seeing this, Liu Yan nodded slightly. “Alright. I’ll first pick a few members that I think 
highly of. They’ll be under my direct command. Of course, I’ll also train them well. I’ll 
choose other members in the future.” 



As Liu Yan spoke, he pointed at Chu Cunrui from the New Continent team, Derek Doyle 
from the European Federation team, and Sun Wen and Luo Wei from the Red Star 
Empire team. “For the time being, it’s just the four of you. You can work for me first.” 

Chu Cunrui from the New Continent team had fought monsters with the Land of Origin 
team before, so Liu Yan had some impression of him. 

Although Chu Cunrui’s combat power was not particularly outstanding, it was still pretty 
good. 

What Liu Yan valued the most were Chu Cunrui’s character and captainship ability. 

From the previous fights, Liu Yan was quite impressed with Chu Cunrui’s character. He 
was worthy of training, and his captainship ability was also good. 

Although Chu Cunrui’s current combat strength was average, according to Liu Yan’s 
observation, Chu Cunrui’s talent was quite good. 

However, due to the lack of resources in the New Continent, Chu Cunrui’s current 
strength was relatively ordinary. 

It was not a problem for Liu Yan. 

Liu Yan had many high-level cultivation resources in his storage ring. He could provide 
Chu Cunrui with all kinds of cultivation resources! 

As for Derek Doyle from the European Federation team, Liu Yan liked Derek Dole 
because of his strength. Most importantly, according to Liu Yan’s observation, many of 
the fusion skills of the European Federation team seemed to have been taught by Derek 
Dole. He was the most familiar with those fusion skills. 

If Derek Dole could teach the Land of Origin team to learn fusion skills, it would help the 
combat power of the Land of Origin team increase a lot. 

Of course, Liu Yan wasn’t the kind of person who would force others. If Derek Dole 
were willing to teach, then he would be glad. If not, Liu Yan wouldn’t force him. 

Lastly, there were Sun Wen and Luo Wei from the Red Star Empire team. 

The reason why Liu Yan valued these two people was simple. He valued Sun Wen’s 
strategy and powerful commanding ability. Moreover, he also admired Luo Wei’s 
assassin ability. 

Previously, Liu Yan had witnessed Luo Wei’s assassin abilities, even though he was not 
as strong as Liu Yan in all aspects. 



However, Liu Yan had to admit that Luo Wei’s understanding of the assassin profession 
and the way assassins fought was far superior to Liu Yan’s. 

In the end, Liu Yan’s ability as an assassin was only in terms of strength, but Liu Yan 
had not trained much. 

After all, Liu Yan had a variety of attack methods, and the combat power of other attack 
methods was also strong. Naturally, Liu Yan did not spend too much time on the 
assassin side. 

Liu Yan chose Luo Wei because he wanted to train Luo Wei to become a powerful 
assassin by his side so that he could carry out many special missions. 

On the other hand, Liu Yan also wanted to learn from Luo Wei about the assassin 
profession and improve his assassin combat ability. 

Jin Cheng from the New Continent team was not surprised to hear that Liu Yan had his 
eyes on Chu Cunrui. 

After all, Chu Cunrui was an outstanding expert by his side. Moreover, Chu Cunrui had 
previously gone to the Land of Origin team to fight, so he was more familiar with Liu 
Yan. 

“No problem. Chu Cunrui, you will be following Captain Liu from now on.” Jin Cheng 
said directly. 

“Alright.” Chu Cunrui replied. 

Naturally, Chu Cunrui was extremely happy. He had always admired Liu Yan, and it was 
naturally his honor to be chosen by Liu Yan and trained by his side. 

However, even though Chu Cunrui was extremely happy in his heart, he was extremely 
calm on the surface, as he didn’t want to cause any dissatisfaction in Jin Cheng. 

Even though he admired Liu Yan more, he couldn’t be ungrateful because Jin Cheng 
had treated him well. 

When Hans Wilson heard that Liu Yan wanted his vice-captain, Derek Dole, he was a 
little reluctant. 

Although Derek Dole’s combat power was not the strongest among the European 
Federation team, he was important to the entire team. 

In some aspects, even Hans Wilson was not as influential as Derek Dole. 
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Hans Wilson was hesitating if he should refuse. It wasn’t a good time to refuse. But he 
didn’t want to lose his right-hand man, Derek Dole. 

At this moment, Derek Dole signaled to Hans Wilson with his eyes, asking Hans Wilson 
to agree. 

Seeing this, Hans Wilson could only nod helplessly. 

Derek Dole also walked out and smiled politely, “Thank you for choosing me, Captain 
Liu. I’ll be following you from now on.” 

The last person remaining was the Red Star Empire team captain, Ye Yifan. He was 
also slightly surprised that Liu Yan had taken a fancy to the two team members beside 
him. 

Sun Wen and Luo Wei were undoubtedly important to the Red Star Empire team. 

Sun Wen was often in charge of the strategy of the Red Star Empire team. Ye Yifan had 
consulted Sun Wen on many of his commands. 

However, Ye Yifan thought about it. Since he had already joined the Land of Origin 
team and was going to listen to Liu Yan’s orders in the future, he didn’t need to 
command anymore. If Sun Wen wanted to leave, he could leave. 

As for Luo Wei, he was the number one assassin on the Red Star Empire team. He was 
very skilled and was Ye Yifan’s right-hand man. 

Although Ye Yifan was reluctant to let Luo Wei leave, he knew Luo Wei would only be 
able to develop better if he followed Liu Yan. 

After all, Liu Yan’s strength was so powerful. With Liu Yan’s nurturing, Luo Wei’s 
strength could improve even more. 

Previously, Luo Wei had mentioned to Ye Yifan that Liu Yan’s assassin abilities were 
extremely strong, far above his own. Luo Wei even admired Liu Yan a lot. 

Although Ye Yifan’s strength was not bad, Luo Wei would not improve much by 
following him. 

After all, Ye Yifan didn’t know much about being an assassin, so he naturally couldn’t 
help Luo Wei improve his assassin abilities. 

Liu Yan, who was an assassin and was stronger, would undoubtedly help Luo Wei 
become stronger. 



Ye Yifan knew if Luo Wei followed Liu Yan, he would have a better future than if he 
followed Ye Yifan. 

At the thought of this, Ye Yifan also nodded and said, “Sure, no problem.” 

Seeing this, Sun Wen was a little happy. 

Sun Wen still had an attachment to the Red Star Empire team and was reluctant to 
leave. 

However, Sun Wen knew only by following someone like Liu Yan would he be able to 
further improve himself. At the same time, he would have a place to put his plans into 
action. 

After all, the Red Star Empire team had already joined the Land of Origin team, which 
meant they did not have any actual commanding rights. 

If Sun Wen continued to stay in the Red Star Empire team, he would not be able to 
command and carry out his strategy. 

Sun Wen could not help but look apologetically at Ye Yifan, the captain of the Red Star 
Empire team. He then looked at Liu Yan and said, “Thank you for choosing me, Captain 
Liu.” 

Luo Wei, who was standing in the corner, was surprised to hear that Liu Yan wanted 
him. 

Seeing that Ye Yifan had also agreed, Luo Wei didn’t say anything else. He walked 
behind Liu Yan, indicating that he was following Liu Yan. 

Luo Wei was a man of few words and not good with words. 

At this moment, Luo Wei was undoubtedly happy. 

Since Luo Wei had become an awakened one with his current profession, Luo Wei had 
met people stronger than him. 

However, he had never seen an awakened one who could defeat him in the field of 
assassination. Liu Yan was the first. 

Furthermore, Liu Yan’s stealth, speed, assassination, and other aspects were all 
outrageous to him. 

It was why Luo Wei admired Liu Yan. 

Now that he finally had the chance to follow Liu Yan, Luo Wei was naturally happy. 



Only by following a top assassin like Liu Yan would his assassin abilities be able to 
improve. 

“Alright, we’ll just have these four people for now.” Liu Yan said after making his 
selection. 

Liu Yan was undoubtedly quite satisfied with these four team members. He believed 
that with Liu Yan’s training, they would continue to grow and become top experts. At the 
same time, they would also become Liu Yan’s left and right arms! 

At this time, He Yang, the captain of the Pan-ocean Community team, could not help 
but interrupt, “Hey, Captain Liu, why don’t you pick talents from my team? Don’t worry 
about the conditions.” 

He Yang was polite. He seemed to think that Liu Yan did not choose his team members 
because he did not want to take them away. 

When Liu Yan heard this, he was stunned. 

He did not pick any of the experts from the Pan-ocean Community team because none 
of them caught Liu Yan’s eye. 

Members of the Pan-ocean Community team were more in number. Although their 
strength was okay, there were no experts. 

The entire Pan-ocean Community team only had three experts, including He Yang. 
There was not a single top expert. 

Among them, there was no one that caught Liu Yan’s eye. 

However, He Yang didn’t realize this and politely let Liu Yan choose. 

Liu Yan’s expression turned awkward, “Ahem, there aren’t many experts on your team. 
It’s better not to pick those who will affect the overall combat strength of your team. I 
can pick next time.” 

Liu Yan could only say that so as not to embarrass He Yang. 

He Yang wanted to be polite and let Liu Yan continue to choose, but after seeing the 
strange expressions on the other team captains’ faces, he finally reacted. 

It wasn’t that Liu Yan didn’t want to reduce the combat power of his team, but he didn’t 
have any experts he was interested in! 

He Yang immediately shut his mouth and stopped talking. At the same time, he felt 
helpless. 



It was the case for the Pan-ocean Community team. 

After all, the resources of the Pan-ocean Community team had always been relatively 
scarce, so even if they had some talented members, it was difficult to cultivate them. 

As a result, the current Pan-ocean Community team had many members and good 
combat strength but lacked expert members. 

Liu Yan looked at his team members and continued, “Now, let’s talk about the 
distribution of loot. We’re about to enter the sixth level of the Tower, so it’ll be more 
dangerous. Naturally, it’s better to improve the combat power of each team.” 

The eyes of the captains and vice-captains lit up when they heard this. 

They were undoubtedly paying close attention to this matter. 

After all, the previous four teams had been eliminated by Liu Yan’s Land of Origin team. 
Therefore, the loot that the four teams had obtained on the fifth level of the Tower would 
all go to Liu Yan’s team. 

As a result, the Land of Origin team occupied all the rich spoils of war from the five 
territories. 

As for the other four teams, they didn’t have any loot from the fifth level of the Tower at 
all. 

Among them, the Pan-ocean Community team and the New Continent team were in a 
better situation. They were the first to be eliminated, so they were the first to hand over 
the spoils they had obtained on the fifth level of the Tower. 

He just had to continue handing over the spoils of war he obtained later. 
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On the other hand, the Red Star Empire team and European Federation team were in a 
more tragic state. They had only been eliminated by the Land of Origin team later on. 

With that, they handed over all the loot they had accumulated to the Land of Origin 
team. 

The most painful thing was not giving up the spoils of war. After accumulating loot, they 
thought these items would be theirs. However, they had to give all of them to the Land 
of Origin team, which was the most painful thing. 

If they knew what was coming up, they would just hand the items to the Land of Origin 
team earlier. At least it wouldn’t be so suffering. 



The four team captains were concerned about the loot. They all wanted to get some 
items from the Land of Origin team. 

However, Liu Yan was the real team captain at this moment, so he had the final say. 
They could only wait for the result. 

Liu Yan looked at the four team captains, and said, “As for how to distribute the spoils of 
war, it will naturally be decided based on your performance in the ultimate gambling 
duel.” 

He Yang, the captain of the Pan-ocean Community team, was overjoyed when he heard 
this. This way, the Pan-ocean Community team would get a lot of spoils of war, and the 
team members could use these spoils of war to improve their strength. There would be 
a lot of high-level equipment, high-level treasures, and many high-level cultivation 
resources and materials among them. 

The captain of the New Continent team, Jin Cheng, heard this and immediately felt 
bitter in his heart. 

He was undoubtedly filled with regret. 

Initially, the New Continent team and the Pan-ocean Community team would have 
received the same treatment. 

But during the ultimate gambling duel, Jin Cheng hesitated for a while and made the 
wrong choice. He had chosen to fight the Land of Origin team. 

Now that the New Continent team and the Land of Origin had fought each other on the 
dueling platform, it was obvious that they would not be able to get much of the loot. 

The European Federation team’s captain, Hans Wilson, also frowned when he heard 
this. 

Although he had expected this to happen, Hans Wilson felt it was reasonable. 

However, the European Federation team members were still injured and needed 
healing consumables. 

If Liu Yan were to distribute the spoils in such a manner, the European Federation team 
would most likely not be able to get many spoils of war. Naturally, they would not be 
able to obtain enough healing-type consumables to heal their team members. 

It was undoubtedly bad news for the injured members of the European Federation team. 

However, Hans Wilson had no other choice at this time. Liu Yan was the captain, and 
everything was up to him. He could not change Liu Yan’s decision. 



The captain of the Red Star Empire team, Ye Yifan, did not seem to mind. 

Members of the Red Star Empire team were not injured. They had only suffered some 
light injuries and could heal themselves. They did not need any consumables that could 
heal them. 

As for the equipment and cultivation resources, Ye Yifan had already let them go and 
didn’t care too much about them. 

In any case, increasing the strength of the Red Star Empire team members was the 
most important thing. There would naturally be opportunities to obtain external items 
such as equipment, cultivation resources, and consumables when they reached the 
sixth level of the Tower. 

The sixth level of the Tower was dangerous, but it also meant that there were rich 
rewards after the high risks. 

As long as one was strong enough, one would naturally have the opportunity to reap a 
bountiful harvest. 

At this moment, Liu Yan also announced the loot distribution rules, “The Pan-ocean 
Community team will have the priority to choose their equipment. At the same time, they 
will provide each member with sufficient cultivation resources and various consumables. 
The New Continent team, European Federation team, and Red Star Empire team will 
choose their equipment after the Pan-ocean Community team has chosen their 
equipment. As for cultivation resources and consumables, you’ll have to trade for them 
with other materials.” 

Upon hearing Liu Yan’s distribution rules, He Yang, the captain of the Pan-ocean 
Community team, was thrilled. His correct choice could bring a lot of benefits to the 
future of their team. 

Members of the Pan-ocean Community team had the priority to choose equipment that 
was suitable for them with the highest level. 

The Red Star Empire team, the European Federation team, and the New Continent 
team could only choose the leftovers after members of the Pan-ocean Community team 
finished picking. 

They could still get good equipment. After all, some good equipment was not suitable 
for the members of the Pan-ocean Community team, but it might be useful for the 
members of the other three teams. However, it was not likely to happen. 

The equipment selected by the other three teams was naturally not as good as the 
equipment selected by the Pan-ocean Community team, who had the priority to choose 
first. 



Moreover, the Pan-ocean Community team would get most of the cultivation resources 
and various consumables, which was undoubtedly the best news to them. 

As far as He Yang knew, the cultivation resources and various consumables in the 
treasure chests on the fifth level of the Tower were not low in level. 

What members of the Pan-ocean Community team lacked the most were these 
cultivation resources. 

With such a large supply of cultivation resources, members of the Pan-ocean 
Community team would be able to improve their combat effectiveness very quickly. 

Although members of the Pan-ocean Community team were relatively average in 
strength, they had potential. It was just that the Pan-ocean Community team had always 
been short of resources and cultivation resources. 

Now that he had enough cultivation resources, He Yang did not have to worry about the 
slow improvement of the strength of the members of the Pan-ocean Community team. 

“Thank you, Captain Liu!” He Yang smiled happily. 

“He Yang, you can lead the members of the Pan-ocean Community team to pick 
equipment and obtain cultivation resources and various consumables.” Liu Yan nodded 
slightly. 

“Alright!” He Yang agreed and immediately returned to the Pan-ocean Community team. 

When members of the Pan-ocean Community team heard the news, they cheered. 

The Pan-ocean Community team had the priority in selecting equipment pieces, 
cultivation resources, and a large supply of various consumables. These resources 
would allow them to become stronger rapidly and catch up with the combat strength of 
the other teams! 

Not to mention, He Yang and the others believed that Liu Yan would give more 
resources to their team in the future. 

He Yang could not help but rejoice once again. He had made the right choice in the 
beginning. As a result, it brought many benefits to the Pan-ocean Community team. 

570 Winning Over the Hearts of People 

At this moment, the leader of the New Continent team, Jin Cheng, had an awkward 
expression. 



He had expected that Liu Yan would give him slightly worse treatment. After all, the 
New Continent team had gone back on their word during the ultimate gambling duel. In 
the end, they even attacked Liu Yan and the Land of Origin team. It was reasonable for 
Liu Yan to give them a slightly worse treatment. 

But to Jin Cheng’s surprise, Liu Yan let his team choose equipment. They only chose 
equipment after the members of the Pan-ocean Community team had finished 
choosing. 

Even though the equipment they would get would be relatively worse, it would still be 
better than the equipment that the members of the New Continent team were wearing. It 
would also improve their strength a lot. 

To Jin Cheng’s surprise, Liu Yan even allowed the New Continent team to choose their 
equipment. Liu Yan didn’t have to choose at all. They had to exchange their equipment 
or something. 

But then, Jin Cheng thought about it and understood. 

Although Liu Yan was dissatisfied with what had happened in the ultimate gambling 
duel, he could still give them slightly worse treatment. 

No matter what, the New Continent team had joined the Land of Origin team. All the 
members of the New Continent team became Liu Yan’s subordinates. 

While Liu Yan targeted the New Continent team, he would also help them improve their 
combat strength. 

After thinking this through, Jin Cheng couldn’t help but admire Liu Yan. Liu Yan put 
aside these personal grudges and focused on the big picture. His mind was indeed 
broad. 

At the same time, the captain of the Red Star Empire team, Hans Wilson, had also 
realized this. He could not help but admire Liu Yan a little. He was indeed more open-
minded. 

It was indeed admirable that Liu Yan could let go of the past and move forward. 

At the same time, Hans Wilson felt a little helpless. 

After all, his European Federation team could not obtain those cultivation resources and 
various consumables. They could only use other items to exchange for them. 

However, team members of the European Federation team were currently in need of 
healing consumables. 



If they were to exchange, Hans Wilson was afraid he would have to spend a lot of 
fortune. 

After hesitating for a while, Hans Wilson finally chose to exchange other items for 
healing consumables with money instead of lowering his head and asking Liu Yan for 
help. 

Hans Wilson still felt that his reputation was more important. 

As for Ye Yifan, the captain of the Red Star Empire team, he did not care much about 
these things. 

The Red Star Empire was relatively wealthy. His members’ equipment might not be 
comparable to the many high-grade equipment pieces among the spoils of war, but it 
was not much worse. At the very least, it was enough for their current use. 

At most, they would just have to wait until they reached the sixth level of the Tower and 
find a way to get some good equipment. 

After Liu Yan was done arranging the distribution of the spoils of war, he let the other 
team captains bring their team members to choose their equipment or to exchange for 
cultivation resources and various consumables. 

Jin Cheng, Hans Wilson, and Ye Yifan left after hearing this. 

After the other team captains left to get busy, Liu Yan looked at Derek Dole and said, 
“Go and find Chu Long. Tell her to help treat the members of your European Federation 
team.” 

Derek Dole was stunned when he heard this. It was the main problem for the European 
Federation team, but it had not been easy to solve. 

During the ultimate gambling duel, the Red Star Empire team also fought with Liu Yan. 
Hence, it had not been good for them to seek help from Liu Yan or the Land of Origin 
team. They could only brace themselves and think of a way to solve the problem. 

However, Derek Dole did not expect Liu Yan would take the initiative to mention this. 

Liu Yan saw the surprised look on Derek Dole’s face as he stood rooted to the ground. 
He couldn’t help but smile and say, “Why are you so surprised? Although I had some 
conflicts with the Red Star Empire team, it was a regular competition, and that’s all in 
the past. Now, members of the Red Star Empire team are also my subordinates. I will 
naturally help your Red Star team. I know many of your Red Star Empire team 
members are still injured and have yet to recover. Go and ask Chu Long for help.” 



When Derek Dole heard Liu Yan’s words, he couldn’t help but feel warm in his heart. He 
nodded gratefully and said, “Thank you, Captain Liu. I’ll contact Chu Long now! 

Derek Dole was touched. He then left 

After Derek Dole left, Sun Wen couldn’t help but come to Liu Yan’s side and praise him 
in a low voice, “Captain Liu’s strategy is great. First, give them a beating, then give them 
sweet candy. Not only can this stabilize the morale of the European Federation team 
members, but it can also win over the hearts of a talent like Derek Dole.” 

When Liu Yan heard this, he could not help but look at Sun Wen in surprise. As 
expected of someone good at strategizing, Sun Wen could see through his thoughts 
with a glance. 

Liu Yan did have such thoughts and intentions. He had successfully incorporated four 
teams. As a result, the captains and members of the four teams would listen to his 
orders due to the constraints of the Will of Tower. 

However, the effect of merely listening to his orders and winning over the hearts of the 
people was naturally different. 

Only when the members of these four teams had a sense of belonging would the entire 
team become one, like a tight and indestructible hemp rope. 

Only then would he have enough combat power to face the dangerous challenges on 
the sixth level of the Tower. 

Earlier, Liu Yan had tried to stabilize the morale of the Red Star Empire team members. 
He had also tried to rope in the talented Derek Dole so that he could make use of Derek 
Dole. 

“It seems that I’m a little too obvious.” Liu Yan smiled awkwardly. 

“It’s alright. It’s a little obvious, but it’s still effective.” Sun Wen said in a low voice, 
“Derek Dole is indeed a talent. He taught all the fusion skills to the European Federation 
team. If we can rope in Derek Dole, it will bring great benefits to all of our teams.” 

Liu Yan nodded his head. 

Sun Wen’s words had indeed verified Liu Yan’s earlier guess. 

The vice-captain of the European Federation team, Derek Dole, was indeed the core of 
the team. He was the one who taught the fusion skills to the European Federation team. 



Liu Yan also understood Sun Wen’s intentions. If they could successfully rope in Derek 
Dole and make him willing to teach the Land of Origin team fusion skills, it would greatly 
improve the overall combat strength of the Land of Origin team. 

After that, he could also teach the members of the New Continent team, the Pan-ocean 
Community team, and the Red Star Empire fusion skills, helping them to improve their 
combat abilities. 

Liu Yan did not have any intention of keeping it to himself. He did not just want to help 
members of the Land of Origin team increase their combat strength. 

Since Liu Yan could win over the hearts of the other teams, he naturally wanted to help 
them improve their combat strength. 

After all, only Land of Origin had improved their combat strength significantly. How 
could it be faster than five teams improving their combat strength at the same time? 

As long as all five teams were united and their combat strength increased, Liu Yan and 
the others would have a chance to make a name for themselves on the extremely 
dangerous sixth level of the Tower! 

The strength of a team would always be greater than that of an individual. 

Of course, Liu Yan’s attribute domain was an exception. It was rare for a single person 
to be able to deal with several teams. 

 


