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Chapter 1131

Jasper said angrily, "What are you looking at? Send us to the hospital!"

"Oh." The owner of the car was a young lady who looked pure and beautiful. The blood on Eden's 
face was washed clean by the heavy rain, but the wound bled again and the blood ran down her face 
together with the rain.

She was very scared. She had just got her driving license, and it was the first time she had driven on 
her own, but she hit someone with the car before she could enjoy the joy and excitement of driving. 
Can she still drive?

No! She was trembling all over. She couldn't even walk, let alone drive a car.

Seeing that she was standing motionless in the rain, Jasper turned around and shouted coldly, "Why 
are you doing there?"

The lady looked at Jasper while crying, "I... I'm afraid. I don't dare to drive anymore." She opened 
her big eyes wide and looked at Jasper helplessly and innocently.

"Let me drive you to the hospital." Victor glanced at the lady and asked her to get in the car first.

"Victor, you can't leave. You are my fiance. Today is my birthday. Do you want to leave me alone?"

Melissa dressed in a noble gown and wore delicate and elegant makeup on her face. The hotel 
waiter was holding an umbrella behind her. She walked over and looked at Victor angrily.

What had happened was out of her expectation. Originally, she wanted Eden to see Victor become 
her fiance on her birthday party.

With her understanding of Eden, Eden wouldn't be with Victor anymore.

Then she would become Mrs. Alwynn.



However, Eden had a car accident here, and Victor happened to have seen it.

Things were completely out of her expectation and control, and all her plans had been ruined.

"Ha-ha..." Jasper sneered and looked at Victor with mocking eyes, "Victor, it turns out that Melissa 
is going to announce to the world that you're her fiance. You are alive, but you didn't let Eden know 
it. Do you know how much she has suffered in order to look for you and wait for you? After you 
had an accident, she didn't cry or make a fuss, but pretended to be strong and faced everyone with a 
smile. Do you know how sad she has been? She said that you were not dead and she would wait for 
you all the time."

"Everyone thought that you were dead, but she believed her intuition and waited for you to come 
back. How can you treat her like this?"

"You suddenly went missing. Haven and Malcom were ambitious, and they wanted to take over 
Alwynn Group, but she went against them bravely. In the end, Haven and Malcom were sent to jail, 
but her heart had been broken."

"She believed that you were alive, and this was the reason she survived in this world. None of us 
dared to ruin her extravagant hope, because we were afraid that she would get a fatal blow and fall 
ill."

"Victor, since you don't need her anymore, just make it clear to her. She won't pester you like other 
women. Why do you treat her so cruelly?"

Hearing Jasper's words, Victor felt as if a sharp knife had stabbed into his heart.

"Victor..."

"Get out of my way!" Victor roared at Melissa with a frenzy of rage and pushed her away with great 
force.

His deep eyes were full of malice and fury.



"Ah..." Melissa staggered and took a few steps back. If the waiter didn't hold her in time, she would 
have fallen to the ground awkwardly.

Her heart trembled violently as she looked at Victor's horrible face. At this moment, she suddenly 
thought of the rumours about Victor.

"Victor, you can't do this to me. I'm your fiancee." Looking at Victor's ruthless and cold-blooded 
face, Melissa was a bit nervous, but she didn't want to give up and looked at him stubbornly.

How could he treat her like this? She had looked after him for several months. Wasn't he grateful to 
her at all?

Victor did not speak, nor did he explain. He quickly turned around and got in the car.

The trembling girl followed him into the car immediately.

Victor got in the driver's seat, started the car and drove to the hospital.

The car was driving very fast, and the rain went all over Melissa's dress, but she could only watch 
Victor drive away helplessly.

"Victor, come back! Don't go!" She shouted madly in the heavy rain.

No one answered her except for the sound of the heavy rain. 

"Where is the hospital?" Victor's voice was cold as he asked the girl sitting beside Jasper.

The girl reacted very fast, "Go... ahead all the way and turn left... at the intersection. Then you'll see 
a hospital."

Hearing this, Victor turned the steering wheel smoothly and drove to the hospital.

Cautiously, the girl looked at Eden who was unconscious. She was so scared that her whole body 
was trembling. Was she dead?



At that time, when she... saw someone rush out, she was so frightened, but she had a quick reaction. 
Although she braked hard, she hit Eden with the car.

"I'm... so sorry. I got my driving license today and it was my first time to drive. I didn't expect that 
she would suddenly rush out."

Jasper glanced at her indifferently.

She lowered her head in fear and blinked her eyes. With an innocent and nervous expression, she 
explained in a low voice, "I'm... not trying to shirk my responsibility. I'm just telling the truth. I... 
will be responsible for her."

Jasper did not speak. He lowered his head and looked at Eden with tender and loving eyes.

He pressured to her wound with his clothes to stop the bleeding, and his eyes were filled with 
affection and distress.

Victor glanced at Jasper from the rearview mirror, feeling jealous and angry.

Were Eden and Jasper on a business trip together?

But it was not the time to care about this. He drove very fast. A few minutes later, they arrived at the 
hospital.

Victor immediately got off the car, slammed shut the car door and walked to the back seat in a few 
steps. Then he opened the car door and reached out to hold Eden.

"Don't touch her!" Jasper said in a warning tone furiously and looked at Victor with angry eyes. He 
went off the deep end when Victor reached out his hand.

Victor looked at him calmly and coldly, and said word by word, "She is my wife."



"You have abandoned her, and you're going to marry another woman. What qualifications do you 
have to be her husband? In the past, Eden loved you and she lived a happy with you, so I let go of 
my love for her. In the future, I will never give her up."

Victor's eyes turned gloomier and colder when he heard the last few words, "I won't give you such a 
chance. Eden can only be my woman in this life."

His tone was full of earnestness, as if he was making a promise.

He used some strength and picked up Eden from Jasper's arms. Then he turned around and ran to 
the hospital.

Jasper's white shirt was dyed red by Eden's blood.

The strong smell of blood spread in the air. The girl sitting next to him looked at the bloodstains on 
his shirt and his gloomy face. Just now, the conversation between the Jasper and Victor was filled 
with hostility, and the atmosphere in the car was extremely weird.

What Victor had said was ringing in Jasper's ears. He was mad, but there was nothing he could do.

Chapter 1132

Why was Victor here? Since he was alive, why didn't he go back to find Eden?

He made Eden live such a painful life.

Jasper's mind was filled with puzzlement.

"Sir, are you okay?" The girl looked at Jasper cautiously.

The strange atmosphere in the car made her feel very uncomfortable. It was her own car, but she felt 
that she should be the one getting off.

She lowered her head slightly and lifted her eyelids, looking at Jasper warily and nervously with her 
clear eyes.



When Jasper looked at her, she lowered her head quickly and didn't know where to look.

Jasper was very charming. He was the most handsome man she had ever seen.

However, he looked so fierce and angry, and he was as irritated as the man who had left with the 
injured woman.

She was very nervous and high-strung. Had she offended someone who was not to be trifled with?

The two men had outstanding temperaments, and they were definitely not ordinary people.

Jasper slowly looked away and did not pay attention to her words. He opened the car door and 
followed Victor to the hospital.

When the car door was closed, the girl suddenly raised her head. She looked at Jasper's back with 
dissatisfaction and muttered, "You're too strange. I am very innocent."

She followed him out of the car helplessly and lowered her head with a guilty face, just like a 
sinner.

The rain hadn't stopped, and her clothes was wet through. She didn't care about it and entered the 
hospital.

Victor had sent Eden into the emergency room. He sat on the bench outside and waited nervously.

He took out his phone, wiped the water on it and dialed Lucian's number.

Eden had gone out for a long time, which made Lucian and Amelia a bit worried. They had come 
out of the hall to look for Eden.

"Hello?" Lucian answered the phone while looking for Eden.

"Lucian, this is me."



Hearing the familiar and somewhat apathetic voice, Lucian froze. He looked at his front in shock 
and did not move. The whole world stood still right at that moment.

The phone in his hand almost fell to the ground.

"What did you say?" After coming to sense, Lucian raised his voice and asked excitedly.

It was Victor. He didn't mishear! It was Victor's voice!

"Lucian, this is me. Eden had a car accident. We are in the hospital now." Victor knew that his 
appearance had shocked and excited Lucian, but he wallowed in his own sorrow at this time. He 
could not accept the fact that Eden had got hurt in front of him.

Lucian said, "Are you in C Country?" He was even more shocked. 

"Yes!" Victor glanced at the door of the emergency room.

"Which hospital is it? Amelia and I came here to meet Melissa with Eden. We're on a business trip. 
Now we are looking for Eden downstairs."

Hearing that they were here, Victor felt better for no reason.

Then, he told Lucian the address and hung up the phone.

Sensing that someone had walked to his front, he looked up and saw Jasper whose clothes was 
stained with blood. Then he looked away indifferently and lowered his head. His long lashes cast a 
shadow on his face. There was a bruise on his face, because Jasper had punched him.

His face was very pale. His skin didn't look as healthy as before, and he was much weaker.

When he carried Eden into the hospital, he walked with great difficulty. His legs seemed to be 
feeble.



Jasper saw all these.

He sat opposite Victor powerlessly.

Seeing that the atmosphere was still tense, the girl who had followed them in could only sit far 
away and wait for the result.

However, she listened to their conversation carefully.

"Since you're alive, why didn't you tell Eden?" Jasper only wanted to know the reason.

Victor looked at him silently and didn't say anything. He was alive, but it didn't make any sense.

He had been lying on the bed and knew nothing about the outside world.

"If I say that I've just woken up from a coma today, will you believe me?" His tone was filled with 
depression and melancholy.

Jasper was stunned. His body trembled, and he was a little confused, "You had a car accident in 
River City, but are you in C Country now? Lucian has been looking for you. They have searched 
every hospital in River City. Eden has never given up, and she has been waiting for you..." As 
Jasper said this, he was so grieved that he couldn't finish his words.

Eden loved Victor with her life.

But Victor made her live in pain and sorrow.

He had never seen Eden bear so much stress and grief before.

He had doted on and protected Eden for seven years, and Eden had never been so desperate before.

Seven years! How many seven years could he have in his life? Although he was very sad and 
unwilling, he let go of his love for her.



However, when he found that Eden became more and more mournful, he regretted his decision. She 
should have lived a better and happier life.

Jasper wiped the water stains on his face in pain and lowered his head.

He had a very bad temper, but he gradually became gentle because of Eden. He had finally became 
a respectable person in the eyes of outsiders.

He really learned a lot from Eden. When he became a better man, he suddenly realized that he had 
fallen in love with Eden, the girl he had always doted on.

Victor looked at the painful expression on Jasper's face and chose to remain silent. He was 
powerless and had no reason to defend himself. No matter what kind of reason he had, he had hurt 
Eden's heart.

"Victor!" Lucian stood a few meters away from them and called Victor's name loudly.

The moment he saw Victor, he couldn't be more ecstatic.

Victor raised his head and glanced at Lucian, but he did not say anything and just looked at him 
quietly.

Amelia widened her eyes in shock. Victor was really alive, and Eden was right.

Lucian walked over and ignored Jasper who was beside Victor.

"Victor, you are really alive! Eden's intuition is right!" He said in a very excited tone.

However, Victor looked at him with guilt, "I'm so sorry that I made you worry about me." He said 
this blandly and did not say anything else.

However, Lucian smiled, "As long as you're alive, it is the greatest comfort to Eden."



He turned around and glanced at the door of the emergency room. A mood of melancholy 
descended on him as he asked, "Is Eden badly hurt?" She said that she wanted to go out for some 
fresh air. Why did she have a car accident?

Amelia looked at the door of the operating room and felt distressed. Why did something bad happen 
to Eden all the time?

Victor shook his head slightly and said in a painful voice, "We don't know the result now."

Amelia looked at the door of the operating room nervously, "She was just able to walk normally. 
What should she do if her legs are injured again?"

Hearing her words, the others looked sadder.

Victor lowered his head in sorrow and wished that he could bear all the disasters alone. Eden could 
have lived a happy life, but the fates conspired against her.

She was always so lucky and miserable.

Chapter 1133

Victor felt pain and tightness in the chest, and it made him extremely uncomfortable.

When he thought of the fact that Melissa had hidden the news that he was alive and had caused 
great harm to his family, he became incomparably furious. There was no warmth on his face, and he 
looked terribly apathetic.

The others felt the sudden change of his emotions and looked at him with puzzlement.

The most frightened one was the girl sitting on the bench. She felt constrained and depressed deep 
in heart. She felt cold after getting wet in the rain, but a chill stole over her body at this time and she 
felt colder.

Her lips quivered uncontrollably and her breathing became tense, but she listened to their 
conversation carefully. She couldn't understand what they were talking about and could only wait.



The injured girl was called Eden.

She prayed in heart, "Eden, wake up. You have to be safe and sound. I am still young and I don't 
want to become a murderer. I haven't been in a relationship yet, and I don't want to ruin my life. 
Please be fine."

The girl kept praying in the bottom of her heart.

Her hair had been wet by the rain and clung to her cheeks. She felt very uncomfortable, but she 
couldn't leave, because it was her who had hit Eden with a car.

"Miss, wipe yourself with this." 

"Ah..." Suddenly, someone spoke to her and she looked up in surprise.

Amelia handed her some tissues.

The makeup on the girl's face was wet by rain and she looked a little awkward. Although the girl 
had hit Eden, Amelia sympathized with her as a woman.

No one wanted this kind of thing to happen. Everyone wanted to live in peace. How could the girl 
hurt Eden on purpose?

"Thank... you!" The girl took the tissues and wiped her face. She knew that the makeup on her face 
must have been ruined and she must look very awkward.

"You're welcome." Amelia said blandly.

They sat together and waited for Eden.

The hospital had always been quiet. At this time, none of them spoke and even the sound of 
breathing was very light, as if there was no one in the corridor.

"Bang..." The sound of opening the door of the emergency room broke the stillness.



Victor suddenly stood up, looked at the doctor who came out first and asked, "Doctor, my wife..." 
He did not finish his question and only looked at the doctor with expectation. He prayed that Eden 
would be safe and sound.

The doctor took a look at them with relief, "She's not seriously injured. Her head hit the stone and 
she had more than ten stitches in the head wound. The wound is deep, but she is not fatally 
wounded. However, she had been very uneasy and excited during the operation, which made it 
more difficult for us to stitch her wound."

Hearing this, they all breathed a sigh of relief.

The doctor suddenly said, "She is emotionally unstable, because she is too tired and she has great 
pressure in heart. Moreover, she suffers from light depression. I guess that she can't sleep well every 
night. You have to take care of her carefully. Otherwise, her depression will get worse."

Victor nodded heavily, "I see!"

After the doctor left, Eden was pushed out and transferred to a VIP ward.

She was lying on the hospital bed with gauze on her head. Her face was deathly pale, and she 
frowned from time to time.

She was even uneasy when she was asleep. She muttered in a low voice, but Victor could hear that 
she was calling his name.

"Eden, I'm here. Don't be afraid. I won't leave you again." His voice was very gentle. He wanted to 
give her the greatest comfort and held her cold hand tightly.

Although such a promise was so pale and useless, he wanted to comfort her. He promised to her all 
the time, but he always failed to protect her.

Eden seemed to have heard Victor's voice. Her uneasy expression gradually eased and she fell 
asleep.



Seeing her like this, Jasper felt more mournful for no reason.

At this time, he finally realized that Eden had never loved him.

He had protected her for seven years, but it was not as useful as Victor's comforting words.

During the time when Victor disappeared, he had been by her side, but she didn't feel at ease 
because of him. He didn't even know that she was suffering from light depression.

At this moment, he was jealous and envious of Victor.

No matter what he did, he could not replace Victor in Eden's heart.

In the end, he lost to Victor.

No matter how many years he had been protecting Eden, it could not compare with Victor's deep 
affection towards her.

Jasper walked out of the ward silently with a dispirited expression on his face.

Lucian glanced at his melancholy figure and followed him out.

In the past few months, he knew that Jasper was a very good man after getting along with him.

Out of the ward, the girl hadn't left, and Amelia kept accompanying her.

Lucian looked at her and nodded. Then, he looked at Jasper again.

"Are you all right?" There was a touch of concern in his bland voice.

Jasper lowered his head. Under the lights, his face looked more grieved as he said in a doleful and 
sombre tone, "The most difficult time has passed. For me, this kind of pain is just a piece of cake. I 
just feel distressed for Eden. She always gets hurt."



Lucian pursed his lips slightly and did not know how to reply to him, "Everything will get better." 
He was not good at comforting others and readily spoke his mind.

If he didn't treat Jasper as his friend, he wouldn't even say a word to him.

Jasper looked up at him and smiled faintly, "I'll go back to the hotel first."

"Okay!" Lucian nodded calmly. Jasper lowered his head and bowed his shoulders. He walked very 
slowly and his footsteps were very light. It seemed like he could not bear to leave, but he had no 
choice but to do so.

Lucian sighed and took a deep breath. Jasper fell in love with Eden first, but Eden didn't love him. 
He was destined to be the heartbroken one.

Amelia stood up and looked at Lucian, "How is Eden now?"

Lucian turned to look at her worried face and shook his head slightly, "She hasn't woken up yet. 
Let's go back to the hotel to rest first. We will come here tomorrow morning to take care of Eden so 
that Victor can have a rest."

After finishing his words, Lucian called Adonis.

It was late at night, and Adonis was sleeping soundly. When he heard the ringtone, he fumbled for 
the phone and answered it.

"Hello?" His voice was hoarse and sleepy.

Lucian said, "Book the earliest flight and come to C Country immediately. We've found Victor."

Hearing this, Adonis was not sleepy at all. He jumped up from the bed, turned on the bedside lamp 
and looked at the time. It was two o'clock in the morning.

He pursed his lips unhappily, "Lucian, shouldn't you be with your girlfriend in the middle of the 
night? What nonsense are you talking about?"



Lucian knew that Adonis might not believe him, but he did not expect that he would say so.

"Adonis, I'm serious. Victor is not dead, but Eden had an accident. Come here and deal with the 
things here first." After finishing his words, Lucian hung up the phone without waiting for Adonis's 
reply.

According to Adonis's character, he would definitely keep talking with him.

"Amelia, let's go." He took Amelia's hand and was about to leave.

Amelia glanced at the girl next to her and comforted her, "Go home and have a rest. Eden is fine."

Chapter 1134

The girl stood up. There was finally a smile on her somewhat awkward face, "That's great! My 
name is Candace Aiken. Thank you so much today."

Amelia smiled, "Goodbye, Miss Aiken!"

"Goodbye!" Candace smiled.

After Amelia finished speaking, Lucian left with her.

Candace glanced at the ward and couldn't bear to disturb Victor. She planned to come here the next 
morning.

She turned around and left in a sullen mood.

Victor sat quietly in the ward and accompanied Eden. The doctor's words were still ringing in his 
ears.

His heart was filled with grief and pain. He had been holding Eden's hand and staring at her pale 
face.



"Eden, thank you so much for what you have done these days, and thank you for trusting me all the 
time."

His hoarse voice echoed in the ward.

Early the next morning, Adonis and Brian took the earliest flight and arrived in C Country.

Brian didn't have time to see Victor. He met Lucian immediately and then went to investigate 
Melissa.

Adonis went to the hospital alone. He wore a white shirt and rolled up his sleeves casually, looking 
leisurely and handsome. The black trousers were clean and simple, setting off his charm. Girls 
loved this kind of man, and he gave others a very comfortable feeling.

He ran to the hospital with an excited face.

However, he bumped into a girl coming in the opposite direction at the corner carelessly.

"Ah..." The lunch boxes in Candace's hands all fell to the ground.

Adonis was in a hurry to see Victor, and he did not expect that something like this would happen.

"Miss, are you okay? I'm sorry. I was in a hurry." Adonis lowered his head and looked at her. When 
he saw the lunch boxes on the ground, he quickly squatted down and picked them up for her.

"What bad luck!" Candace sat on the ground angrily and looked at her broken knee. She was in so 
much pain that she burst into tears.

Adonis's hand suddenly paused when he heard Candace's words.

He looked at her. Her head was lowered, and the soft hair covered half of her face. However, he 
could see that she was beautiful and adorable. The makeup on her face was simple and refreshing, 
and her pouted pink lips looked so attractive and lovely.



Adonis smiled, "What do you mean by that? Do you think you're unlucky to bump into me?"

His tone was a little unfriendly. After bumping into her, he had apologized to her.

Candace raised her head and glanced at him. He looked charismatic as well. But why was she so 
unlucky when she met handsome guys last night and that day?

She shook her head slightly and said somewhat powerlessly, "Sir, it has nothing to do with you. I 
just feel that I have back luck."

Hearing this, Adonis was stunned for a moment. He had encountered such a situation before. Those 
girls would only roar at him madly, "It's because I meet you that I become unluckier!"

He was furious, but he had no way to defend himself because he had bumped into others indeed, 
and he could only endure his annoyance.

However, this girl said that it had nothing to do with him. It was the first time he had met such a 
lovely girl.

"Ha-ha..." Adonis smiled happily "I'm a very unlucky person, too, so you don't have to feel 
discouraged. Get up first. It's cold on the ground."

Adonis reached out to help her up, picked up the lunch boxes and put them in her hands. The lunch 
boxes looked very delicate and expensive, and the food inside was not spilled at all.

Candace took a cold look at Adonis, and she seemed to be in a bad mood.

"Thank you!" she said blandly. Then, she turned around and walked forward.

Adonis was taken aback. Without saying a word, he followed her.

Candace took a few steps and found that Adonis was still following behind her.

She suddenly stopped and turned to look at him with vigilance.



"Why are you... following me?"

Adonis was speechless. He had to go to Eden's ward!

"I'm going in this direction as well. Who says I'm not allowed to go there?" Adonis frowned 
slightly. 

He no longer had a good impression of her.

He was so perfect and handsome. Did he look like a bad guy?

What was wrong wit her judgement?

Looking back at the corridor, Candace nodded, "That's true. This is not my home."

Adonis smiled mischievously. Was she innocent? Or was she silly?

He didn't say anything and walked straight forward.

Candace puckered her mouth and followed behind him. Seeing that he walked in the same direction 
as her, she muttered in heart, "It seems that I'm not only unlucky, but also have become stupid."

It was a hospital. He could go wherever he wanted, but she actually thought of him as a stalker.

As Candace thought so, she saw that Adonis was about to push open the door of Eden's ward and 
walk in.

"Hey... You stalker! You said you didn't follow me, but why do you come to this ward?"

Hearing this, Adonis stopped opening the door stiffly in an instant.



He looked back at Candace. At this time, Candace was looking at him defensively, and she was 
afraid and unconvinced. At the moment he turned around, she was so scared that she took a few 
steps back.

Adonis curled his lips. Even though he was not attracted to women, she didn't have to be so 
frightened, did she?

Adonis was a little depressed. Looking at Candace who was afraid of him, he sneered in an evil and 
casual way.

When Candace saw Adonis like this, she had to admit that Adonis was extremely handsome. 
Compared to the three sullen men last night, he looked more easy-going and many women would 
fall in love with him at first sight.

With his left hand on his waist, Adonis frowned and said with a smile, "Miss, my friend's wife lives 
in this ward. I'm here to visit my friend, but why did I become a stalker? I won't take the blame."

Candace was stunned. Looking at Adonis's wicked face, she took more stepped back.

What the hell?

She must have not slept well last night. Otherwise, she would not have been so embarrassed.

Eden was hit by her, and she not her friend. She just came to apologize to Eden, while Adonis came 
to visit Eden. What did it have to do with her?

"I'm... sorry. I was frightened yesterday, so I'm a little abnormal today. I came to see the injured lady 
as well. I... hit her with my car accidentally. I don't know if she has woken up. I brought porridge 
with me. If she has woken up, I want to apologize to her sincerely." While saying this, Candace kept 
her head down. Who was Eden? Why did she have so many handsome friends?

Adonis's face darkened when he heard that, and he said angrily, "Did you hit her? How did you 
drive your car? Eden's legs were injured in a car accident, and she has suffered a lot of blows. It was 
not until a few days ago that she could stand up and walk. How could you be so careless?" Adonis's 
tone was very unfriendly.



Candace knew that it was her fault. She shouldn't have pressed down hard on the gas pedal.

"I'm sorry. I really didn't mean it." She lowered her head, and the innocent look on her face was 
pitiful. She didn't dare to drive anymore because of the car accident.

Chapter 1135

Adonis looked at her and frowned, but he didn't say anything else. He turned around and glanced at 
the ward. As he pushed the door open, he said, "Come in."

Although Adonis said with his back to Candace, she nodded and followed him in.

"Victor." When Adonis saw Victor who was sitting beside the hospital bed, he cried out excitedly.

He didn't believe that Victor was really alive until he saw him.

Victor had been sitting there for an entire night, and his neck was a bit sore. He had just woken up 
from a coma, and he was very weak. At this time, his face was pale and he looked ailing.

He looked at Adonis, nodded and said in a hoarse voice, "Adonis, you're here."

Adonis walked to him in a few steps and patted him heavily on the shoulder, saying in a choked 
voice, "Victor, you b*stard, you're finally back! We all thought that you were..." Adonis did not 
finish his words. As long as Victor was alive, it was better than anything else.

His heart ached as he looked at Victor's pale face, and he couldn't imagine what he had experienced.

However, as long as Victor still lived in this world, they wouldn't feel regretful in hearts.

They had been in a lot of pain during this period of time. Victor grew up with them and had helped 
them a lot in their careers.

They all lived a rich life because of Victor, and they would always gain profits by cooperating with 
him.



In addition, they had been friends since they were children, so they were very important to each 
other.

A smile appeared on Victor's handsome face. Looking at Adonis's excited expression and hearing 
his choked voice, he knew that he had been living in sorrow during this period of time, "I'm sorry 
that I have made you worried."

Adonis smiled, "Don't say such words. Eden is the most worried and doleful one. The summer 
collection is very popular, and Alwynn Group has created an unprecedented achievement."

Victor looked at Eden's pale face, and his heart ached even more.

Seeing that Eden hadn't woken up, Adonis became a little nervous and uneasy, "Is Eden badly 
injured?"

Victor shook his head slightly, "No. The doctor left just now, and he said that she is not seriously 
injured. She has been too tired recently, and we don't know when she will wake up." Victor was 
afraid that Eden would think that it was her illusion to see him, and he didn't want her to sleep for 
several months again. 

Adonis heaved a sigh of relief, "It's good that she is all right. She has suffered a lot, and she can't 
get hurt anymore."

Victor pursed his lips slightly and looked at Eden with grief in eyes. It was all his fault.

His eyes suddenly turned sharp, and he said in a low and bland voice, "Has Brian come here?"

Adonis replied, "Yeah, he has met Lucian, and he is investigating Melissa now."

"Mm!" Victor nodded.

Adonis glanced at Candace who did not speak aside and said, "Go back first. You can come here 
after Eden wakes up."

Only then did Victor find that there was another person in the ward.



"Who is she?" His tone was indifferent, and he looked a bit unhappy.

Candace immediately introduced herself, "I was the one who hit Eden last night. My family cooked 
some porridge for you. You have stayed here for a whole night. Please have some porridge."

Victor looked at Candace. He was too anxious last night, so he did not pay attention to the girl who 
had hit Eden with the car.

"You can go back now." Victor said coldly.

Candace said, "I'll put the porridge on the table. There are several lunch boxes and you can eat 
some. I... will wait for Eden to wake up outside the door."

After saying that, Candace put the lunch boxes on the table and immediately turned to leave.

She felt that the ward was like hell.

Victor was simply too scary and horrible!

She ran away from the ward in panic.

Adonis was speechless. Why did he feel that she was a bit silly but cute?

Seeing that Victor's face was really pale, he took out the porridge brought by Candace and opened 
the lunch boxes. In an instant, the aroma of the porridge filled the ward.

Adonis smiled, "The porridge is not bad. Victor, you don't look well. Eat something first. What 
should Eden do if you get sick? These lunch boxes are new, and that girl is very sincere."

Victor nodded. He couldn't hold on any longer. If he fell ill, what should Eden do?

He got up, but he couldn't keep his balance and almost fell down.



Adonis immediately held him and looked at him with a worried face. Lucian said that Victor was 
seriously injured at that time. He had been in a coma for a long time, and he had just woken up.

"Victor, eat something and take a break. I'll look after Eden." Adonis looked at him with distress.

Victor said, "I'll eat something first."

Looking at the delicious porridge, he had no appetite, but he had to eat for the sake of his health.

He couldn't get sick. Otherwise, Eden would be sadder, wouldn't she?

Victor was not in the mood to eat, but he finished a bowl of porridge very quickly. Immediately 
afterwards, he sat down and accompanied Eden.

Adonis found that there was a lot of porridge left. He was hungry, so he ate some to allay his 
hunger.

To his surprise, the porridge tasted good. He couldn't help but eat two bowls of it.

"Ahem..." Eden suddenly coughed twice on bed.

Victor's pupils trembled as he looked at Eden with excitement.

"Eden." He called her in a very gentle tone.

Eden slowly opened her eyes. Her head was very painful, and she felt suffocated and very 
uncomfortable.

However, she was so happy when she heard Victor's voice.

"Victor!"



"Victor."

Two voices sounded at the same time. One was angry, and the other was weak.

Melissa rushed in angrily. Looking at Victor who was sitting next to the hospital bed, she was 
furious beyond belief.

Seeing that Eden had woken up, she glanced at Eden coldly.

"Eden, it's good that you're awake. I'll make it clear to you now. Victor is my..."

"Shut up! Get the hell out of here!" Victor roared at Melissa ferociously and horribly in a harsh and 
brutal tone.

Melissa was startled and took a few steps back in fear.

However, she vented all her anger on Eden.

"Eden, after Victor had an accident, you occupied Alwynn Group. How dare you appear in front of 
Victor again? Let me tell you. Victor is my fiance now, and we are about to get married soon. You'd 
better be sensible and divorce him as soon as possible."

Melissa said these words in a fit of anger.

Adonis was stunned. Was she out of her head?

Why didn't he know that Eden had occupied Alwynn Group?

In order to run Alwynn Group, Eden had suffered a lot.

When Eden heard these words, she thought of what she had heard on Melissa's birthday party, and 
she suddenly felt heartbroken.



Victor was alive, but he had become someone else's fiance.

She waited for him every day. No matter what she saw, she would thought of him and miss him.

When she looked at the blue sky, she thought of him. When she met a stranger who looked like him, 
she would quietly look at him for a long time and couldn't move her eyes. At that time, her heart 
was filled with bitterness. Victor just didn't come back to her.

Victor was really alive, but he didn't come back to her.

At this moment, Eden felt that all her dreams and hope had been destroyed.
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She couldn't help but burst into tears. Then she closed her eyes and didn't want to look at Victor.

Looking at Eden's painful expression, Melissa felt that she had finally vented her anger.

She was so awkward last night, and she could only bear it alone. However, Victor stayed here to 
accompany Eden, which made her so jealous that she almost went crazy.

Victor was hers, and no one could take him away from her.

Victor looked at Eden tenderly. She knew that Melissa's words had hurt her heart.

But was she in such distrust of him?

He knew that she always trusted him very much.

"Fool, don't you believe me that much?" Victor said gently.

Eden's eyelashes trembled, and she suddenly thought of something.



When people were in sorrow and pain, they were the stupidest. They cared about something too 
much, so they would ignore the traps right in front of them.

She had been waiting for Victor such a long time, and this was not the result she wanted.

She wanted Victor to come back to her and spend the rest of his life with her happily.

Only when she knew how to love and understand could she live a happy life. She did not want to 
misunderstand him and live in regret.

Her long eyelashes which were stained with tears trembled, and she slowly opened her eyes. Victor, 
whom she had missed for a long time, finally appeared in front of her safe and sound.

However, he had become thinner. His face was pale, but he looked more handsome and sharp- 
featured.

He was the most important person to her. In the bottom of her heart, he was always so charming and 
wonderful.

Seeing the change of her expressions, Victor became gentler and smiled tenderly. He knew that she 
always trusted him.

"I'm not dreaming, am I?" Her hoarse voice was very excited.

Victor held her hand tightly and still looked at her with affectionate eyes. His eyes were brimming 
with tears. In his dreams, she had been crying. But at this time, he made her cry again. He was 
really not a qualified husband.

"Fool, you're not dreaming. I'm back, and I'll never leave you again."

"Woo-woo..." Eden couldn't help crying. At this moment, she vented all her worries and 
expectations together.

Seven months was as long as a century to her.



At this time, she didn't have to wait for him anymore. 

"Don't cry, fool." He reached out and wiped the tears from her face.

Eden sobbed a few times before she stopped crying.

She held his hand which was wiping her tears, looked at him with misty eyes and smiled, "I won't 
cry. I'm so glad that you're back.''

Victor stroked her cheeks which was covered with tears and said, "Why didn't you take good care of 
yourself when I was not with you? Before I had an accident, you had gained some weight, but now 
you're thinner."

His concerned tone was the same as before, and his eyes were gentler. He was still her beloved man.

"I think it's okay. Whatever I wear, I look beautiful." Eden cried and laughed proudly. She held his 
hand tightly and refused to let go of him.

She was very dizzy, and she was afraid that he would disappear as soon as she let go of him.

She looked around and asked with confusion, "This is the hospital. What happened to me? Have I 
forgotten something? I seem to be ill, and I always feel that I have forgotten to do something."

Victor was stunned and suddenly remembered what the doctor had said. She suffered from light 
depression.

She had a car accident last night. Didn't she remember it anymore?

Victor said, "Eden, you had a car accident last night. Do you remember it?"

"A car accident..." Eden thought for a moment. What had happened last night flashed through her 
mind intermittently.



"Yeah, a car accident. It was raining heavily, and I was chasing after you. I called you by your name 
and asked you not to run so fast. I couldn't catch up with you. On a very beautiful grassland, you 
broke my lollipop and then bought ten lollipops for me. It was a kind of pink and big lollipop. I was 
so delighted at that time."

"You knocked over my strawberries, and I splashed you with the juice. You always got angry, and I 
always felt distressed for you. Every day, I stood on the balcony and waited for you to come back 
from school, and I wanted to play with you. You disliked me because I followed you all day long 
and I often cried. You thought that I was troublesome..."

Eden said a lot in detail. Those were what she had remembered vaguely.

When Victor was a child, he was so good-looking that people couldn't take their eyes off him, but 
he had a terrible temper, and people didn't dare to approach him. Only she dared to follow him and 
pester him to play.

The more Victor listened, the happier he became. She had finally remembered their past. Although 
it was not much, he was very satisfied.

"Yes, I broke your lollipop. You cried for a whole morning and complained to Delmont. I had no 
choice but to buy you ten lollipops which were several times bigger."

"I knocked over your strawberry, so you poured a glass of juice all over my body. That was my 
school uniform. I didn't wear my uniform in school, so I was punished and stood at the gate of the 
school."

"You waited for me to come back from school everyday. You know what? I went home as soon as 
the school was over, because I was afraid that Vincent and Adalynn would bully you. I said you 
were a persistent follower, because you even followed me when I went to the toilet. I thought you 
were troublesome because you often fell down and get hurt. That made my heart ache."

"Dummy, why do you only remember the bad things? Don't you remember how good I was to 
you?"

He remembered every scene and every warm moment. In his life, she was the last person he wanted 
to forget.



Eden smiled. She thought for a while and couldn't remember many things.

"I don't know. I only remember these." She puckered her mouth and looked at him with a smile. At 
this moment, she realized that she was the girl that he had been waiting for.

She was the girl that everyone liked in the Clement family.

They chatted happily and warmly, as if other people didn't exist.

"Ah... Victor!" Melissa let out a cry of pain.

Victor sat there, unmoved.

Adonis covered his ears impatiently.

He said angrily, "Are you out of your mind? Why do you yell so loudly?"

Melissa stared straight at Victor, "You promised me that you would marry me. What do you mean 
by doing this now?"

She looked a little ferocious and crazy, and she clenched her fists and gritted her teeth. She really 
looked like an insane woman.

Hearing her words, Eden had to face this matter again.

She looked at Victor and asked, "Victor, what's going on?"

Victor kept the same posture and gently rubbed her face with his fingers. Her face was a little cold, 
so he tucked her in so that she wouldn't catch a cold.

He explained with a smile, "Eden, when I woke up yesterday, the first person I saw was her. She 
saved me, but withheld the news that I was alive. That was why you couldn't find me. I wanted to



figure out everything last night and go back to see you this morning, but I didn't expect you to be 
here, and you had a car accident."
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Hearing this, Eden suddenly understood why Melissa called her in person and invited her to C 
Country.

She glanced at Melissa's proud and arrogant face, and Melissa was looking at her with hatred and 
anger.

Her purpose was to let Eden see Victor become her fiancee with her own eyes.

In that case, Eden would leave sadly.

But was that her only purpose? She withheld the news that Victor was alive from others and made it 
impossible for them to find Victor. Did she do this just because she liked Victor?

Melissa looked into Eden's eyes without fear.

She smiled confidently and said, "Eden, I had been taking care of Victor in the past few months. I 
have seen him naked, and I have kissed him. He has belonged to me. Moreover, I saved him. Before 
he fainted, he promised me that he would marry me when he woke up..."

"Bah!" Adonis couldn't help but spit on the ground.

He looked at Melissa with extremely sarcastic eyes.

"Melissa, aren't you ashamed to say so? Who do you think you are? As the daughter of the Craig 
family, you are arrogant, wilful and unreasonable. How could you wipe Victor's body in person? 
Even you yourself don't believe such words, let alone me. Listen, you saved Victor's life, and we are 
very grateful to you. But you withheld the news that he was alive, and it was against the law. 
Although we should thank you for saving Victor's life, you force him in this way and you're too 
mean. Therefore, we won't show you any mercy."



He felt that what Melissa had done was too shameless. Besides, they hadn't figure it out, and they 
couldn't make a conclusion until they got to know the whole story.

Brian would investigate it in secret. Melissa would definitely not be very vigilant.

Only then did Melissa notice Adonis in the room.

She said coldly and mockingly, "This is something between me and Victor. It's none of your 
business!"

Adonis smiled triumphantly, "He's my best friend. Of course his affairs have something to do with 
me! Listen carefully. You'd better not be so arrogant before we know the truth. Before I came here, 
I've had a thorough outstanding of you."

Melissa was stunned for a moment. A trace of nervousness flashed across her eyes, and her slender 
body tensed up slightly. They were investigating her, but why did they do so?

Eden looked at her face and thought for a moment. Melissa's expression was a little different from 
normal people's. There was intense viciousness in her eyes.

Darlene said that she had agreed to be with Melissa's father, but Melissa had an objection all the 
time.

Melissa had a bad temper, and it was indeed difficult for her to agree to something like that. After 
all, she was selfish, and she wouldn't fulfill other people's wishes.

Her mother passed away early. Her father spoiled her and brought her up. Money was her only 
reliance.

Darlene suddenly appeared in her life, so she thought that Darlene would take everything away 
from her. Eden could understand Melissa, but Melissa had to trust others, and she couldn't be so

mean.



Melissa didn't want to argue with Adonis. She looked at Victor and said, "Victor, I only want you. 
You know this."

Victor didn't look at her but said in a deep voice, "The moment you withheld the news that I was 
alive, it had been impossible for us to be together. We're not fated. You saved my life, so you can 
ask me to do anything except for being with you."

"But I only want you." Melissa was determined. Other than Victor, she didn't want anyone else.

Before Victor had an accident, she had been observing his every move.

That was why she took the initiative to go to the north district on a tour of investigation. She went 
to all the clothing stores owned by Victor and got a lot of inspiration. She was confident that she 
could surpass Eden.

So, when she met him by accident, she felt that density had brought them together.

Victor was silent. He looked at Eden and asked, "Eden, are you hungry?" 

Eden was speechless. She was hungry, but how could she eat at this time? She cared about this 
matter quite much.

She glared at him, "I'm hungry, but I have no appetite."

Victor smiled, "Then let's eat somewhere else."

Eden was surprised to see him smile.

She was so sad. Although she was glad because she had found Victor, Melissa's existence made her 
very unhappy.

There was no coincidence in this world.



She couldn't let nature take it course. Moreover, Melissa had saved Victor, and it was hard for them 
to repay her.

Victor turned around and glanced at Adonis, "Let's go back to the hotel."

"Okay." Adonis nodded.

Saying this, Victor helped Eden sit up, "Eden, since you don't feel comfortable here, let's go back to 
the hotel first. Now you only have to get an antiphlogistic injection every day."

Eden nodded. She didn't want to stay in the ward, either.

Victor picked up her shoes and put them on for her.

Seeing this, Melissa was envious and jealous. Victor should have treated her like this, but he only 
cared about Eden.

"Victor, do you really want to treat me like this?" Melissa walked to him and stared at him. Her 
sharp eyes glistened with tears.

Victor protected Eden behind him carefully.

With a cold expression, he said without looking at her, "I said that I thanked you for saving my life, 
but it was impossible for us to be together."

"Why? Victor, I have taken care of you for seven months, and we stayed together every day and 
every night. Do you think you can ignore the fact just by saying that?" Melissa got closer and closer 
to him.

Victor became more and more impatient.

"Melissa, don't say such shameful words, okay? If you told the police that Victor was alive, would 
he need you to take care of him? Eden would take care of him better than you did! We haven't let 
you take the blame, but you become more and more domineering. This is too much!"



"I've seen so many home-wreckers, but you're the most shameless one. You want to be a mistress, 
but you look so unreasonable!" Adonis said with disdain.

Victor was too embarrassed to say these words, so he said on his behalf.

He had a hard time as well when Victor was missing.

Who could be responsible for what he had suffered?

"Miss Craig, aren't you my cousin's fiancee? How come I don't know that you've broken up with 
him?"

When they were not paying attention, Candace came to the door of the ward, and she asked all of a 
sudden.

Adonis was stunned. He laughed in heart, thinking that Candace really came at the right time.

There was going to be a good show.

Melissa looked back at Candace, "What are you talking about?"

Candace looked at her with confusion, "Am I talking nonsense? Three days ago, didn't your family 
have a meal with his family to discuss your marriage?"
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"I... don't want to care about your business, but you are my cousin's girlfriend. Although he doesn't 
love you so much, you're about to get married. How can you be a home-wrecker? My cousin was in 
love with his ex-girlfriend. It was you who ruined their relationship. He gave up his ex-girlfriend 
and became your boyfriend. You can't do anything to betray him." Candace's mind was relatively 
simple, and she readily spoke her mind.

Everyone was stunned.

"Ha-ha..." Adonis couldn't help but laugh. Candace was simply too naive. She said these words like 
this, which had helped them a lot.



"Miss Craig, do you want to betray my cousin?"

Melissa's face darkened to the extreme when she heard that.

"You shut up!" She looked at Victor, "Don't believe what she said. That is not true. You are the only 
one in my heart."

After saying that, she glared at Candace fiercely.

Candace didn't say anything else.

She walked to Eden and bowed to her, "Miss Bleu, hello. I'm Candace Aiken. I'm sorry. I hit you 
with my car last night. I have just got my driving license. In the future, I... won't drive anymore." 
Her eyes were brimming with tears.

Eden looked at her sincerely face and smiled, "Miss Aiken, I should be responsible for the car 
accident as well. I suddenly rushed out and scared you."

At that time, she only wanted to chase after Victor and forgot to pay attention to the cars around her.

Candace heaved a sigh of relief when she heard that, "Miss Bleu, thank you. It's great that you're 
safe and sound. I had been praying last night. It seems that God has heard what I said."

Eden could not help but smile again when she saw how sincere and adorable Candace was, "Miss 
Aiken, thank you for praying for me. I'll leave first." 

Candace nodded with a grin, "Miss Bleu, I like your design very much. Look at the clothes I'm 
wearing. They're all produced by Alwynn Group. Your design is simple and generous, and it's very 
suitable for me. Whenever I go to the clothing shop owned by your company, I really want to spend 
all my money."

"Ha-ha..." Eden laughed when she heard that, "Thank you for your appreciation. Please support our 
new collection. The autumn collection will go on the market soon. I hope you will like it."



"Wow!" Candace laughed pleasantly.

Eden had met many women, but she suddenly felt that Candace was very pure. Her heart was as 
clean as a piece of blank paper.

"I have been paying attention to the new clothes of your company every season. I buy a lot every 
season. Look at this dress. This is your new design." Saying this, Candace looked down at the new 
clothes she had just worn this morning.

The dress was in orange and white, looking stylish and fashionable.

Eden recognized this dress as soon as she saw Candace.

"Thank you." She sincerely thanked her. It was because of their support that her summer collection 
had become so popular.

"No, I have to thank you, Miss Bleu, because you have forgiven me. If you do not forgive me, I will 
be guilty and uneasy after I return home." Candace's face was no longer dejected and she looked 
extremely happy. Her bright smile was just like the sunshine in the snowy day, clean and pure.

Looking at her, Adonis couldn't help smiling. He seldom met such a lovely girl.

"Victor, Eden, let's go." He said with a smile.

Candace looked back at him, "Big guy, you look very handsome."

Adonis was speechless. He was handsome indeed, but why did she call him a big guy? Why didn't 
she describe him as a charming man?

Big guy?

That was too silly!

Ahem!



Did he look silly?

What was she thinking about?

However, she said that he looked very handsome, which pleased him a lot.

He frowned and looked at Candace, "Big... guy? I am indeed very tall, but I am not a big guy. Am I 
not sexy? Don't I look like an appealing man?"

"Yeah, you're sexy and appealing!" Candace admitted it with a shy smile.

Adonis was speechless. Well, it seemed to be a bit difficult for them to communicate with each 
other.

"Goodbye, Miss Aiken." Adonis said with a smile. Then he turned around to look at Melissa who 
stood still.

He raised his eyebrows and looked at her sarcastically, "Miss Craig, please step aside."

Melissa glanced at him before looking at Victor, "Go back with me."

Victor said, "My wife is here. Where do you think I will go?"

He helped Eden out of the ward.

Melissa didn't want to give up and wanted to follow him.

However, Adonis quickly stopped her. He looked at her with harsh and fierce eyes and said in a 
warning tone, "Melissa, enough is enough."

"Get out of my way! You b*stard! Don't stop me!"



"Ha-ha..." Adonis laughed, "Melissa, what's the point of behaving like a crazy woman? Do you 
know what you're like now? You're not quite right in the head. You're a woman, not a beast. 
Therefore, you should know when enough is enough. If anything happens to Victor again, I don't 
mind doing something illegal."

Adonis didn't turn to leave the ward until Victor and Eden walked away.

"Ah..." Melissa screamed madly. Staring at the direction in which Victor had left, she was so furious 
that she wanted to kill someone.

Candace was startled by her. Seeing that there was no one else in the ward, she said angrily, 
"Melissa, who was the fiance you wanted to introduce to others last night?"

Last night, she was going to attend Melissa's birthday party.

However, when she arrived, she found that it was boring. After putting down the gift, she went 
downstairs and was about to drive home to have a rest. It happened to rain heavily and Eden 
happened to run out. That was why the car accident happened.

However, she did not have the time to think about Melissa last night. She only wanted Eden to be 
fine.

She didn't notice Melissa's affairs until she knew Eden was safe and sound.

Melissa ruined the relationship between her cousin and his ex-girlfriend, and her cousin had to 
break up under the pressure of his parents. He treated Melissa very well, but Melissa had fallen in 
love with a married woman.

She had betrayed Candace's cousin.

Melissa shot Candace a cold glance and said with an arrogant face, "That's none of your business."

Candace's face darkened, "I don't care about your business, but my cousin is very kind to me. You're 
wilful and bad-tempered, but he tolerates you. He became your boyfriend because of the business 
cooperation between your families, but you have to cherish him."
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Candace said in a serious tone. Such a thing could never happen to her cousin.

For the sake of his family's interests, his cousin had sacrificed his love and paid a high price.

There was a complicated expression in Melissa's eyes.

Caleb Arogon was very kind to her indeed. She was had-tempered, arrogant and unreasonable. But 
in Caleb's eyes, these were all her merits. He tolerated her and treated her nicely.

But after she lost her interest in Caleb after getting him. Caleb's affection towards her was not as 
good as Victor's love for Eden. She wanted to have the love that only existed in fairy tales.

Moreover, she had loved Victor from afar for a long time.

She had planned to go to River City, but she had been hesitating in the past one year because of 
Caleb.

However, God let her meet Victor by accident, so she had to take a gamble.

Melissa narrowed her eyes and turned to leave.

Seeing this, Candace shook her head helplessly. Last night, Caleb must be very disappointed.

She went out of the ward in silence.

The sky was clear and the sunshine was bright, making people be in a good mood.

Victor hailed a taxi and went straight to the hotel.

Along the way, Eden leaned against Victor's arms and did not say anything. Feeling his strong 
heartbeats, she finally felt at ease.



When they arrived at the hotel, both Lucian and Amelia had gone out.

Adonis went back to his room to rest.

Rushing to this country overnight, he was sleepy and tired.

Victor and Eden returned to their room.

Eden sat on the big bed wearily. She looked at Victor and found that he had been looking at her.

His eyes were gentle and distressed. She smiled and said, "Am I very pitiful in your eyes?"

"Yeah!" Victor nodded blandly and blinked his eyes tiredly.

"Eden, are you sleepy?" He asked. He was extremely sleepy, but he couldn't bear to sleep.

Eden looked at his pale face. She knew that he didn't sleep last night because he had been worried 
about her. 

She nodded. She felt dizzy, and it would be more comfortable for her to lie down.

Victor smiled tenderly, squatted down and helped her take off her shoes. Then he took off his shoes 
and coat, and they lay in bed and hugged each other.

Victor was very weak. He gently kissed Eden's forehead and immediately fell asleep.

However, Eden could not fall asleep.

She looked at Victor's sleeping face quietly. His face was much thinner. In the past few months, he 
had been lying on the hospital bed alone. How lonely he would be.



When she was in a coma, he accompanied her all the time. Occasionally, she could hear his painful 
voice and tried her best to wake up, but she couldn't do that.

Eden could not help but reach out and gently stroke his well-defined handsome face. He slept 
soundly, and there was even a faint smile on his pale face.

After looking at him for about half an hour, she was so drowsy that she gradually fell asleep.

In her dream, she dreamed of Victor holding her hand and walking with her by the beach. There was 
a string of footprints behind them. Under the beautiful setting sun, they seemed to be the only two 
people in the world. The romantic scene made her very happy.

Eden didn't want to wake up from this beautiful dream. However, she felt a pair of boiling hot 
handfs touching her body.

She opened her eyes, and her head was not as dizzy as before.

She raised her head and saw Victor's randy and affectionate eyes, as well as his handsome face. He 
was looking at her with a faint smile.

She was a little taken aback, and a trace of surprise flashed across in her eyes.

"Anson..." Eden couldn't speak fluently and felt that she was in a dream. Feeling his hot breathing, 
she knew that he was by her side.

Seeing that she had woken up, Victor smiled more brightly and rubbed his forehead against hers, 
"Honey, I miss you." His magnetic and deep voice was full of love and affection.

Eden was a bit uneasy. Well... they hadn't been together for a long time, and she was... nervous.

"I..."

"Call me honey." Victor's voice was pleasant and seductive.



Eden glared at him, "Stop it."

Victor smiled charmingly, "I like to hear that."

He kissed her forehead. A trace of distress flashed through his eyes when he saw the gauze on her 
forehead.

"Eden, is it still painful?" Last night, she bled a lot, which scared him terribly.

Eden shook her head slightly, "I feel much better after having a sleep, and I don't feel dizzy 
anymore."

Eden reached out to hold his waist with a bright smile, "You know what? When I heard Melissa's 
words, I was heartbroken, as if you killed me with your own hands."

Victor held his breath and lowered his head to kiss her on the lips, "Fool, I only love you in my life, 
and I will never fall in love with another woman."

In his heart, she was always perfect.

Her pure and simple smile was very sweet. Every time he saw her smile, his heart was full of 
happiness.

"So, I believed you." Eden smiled warmly. The process of waiting was very painful, but the ending 
was very sweet.

She had remembered her childhood. At this moment, she really felt that he was Victor, whom she 
always chased after and played with when she was a child.

Everything was not a dream. A wave of joy flooded her when she heard him call her by the name.

Hearing what she said, Victor became even more pleasant.

"Eden." He whispered, and his eyes were darker than ever before.



Eden smiled gently, "Yeah! I'm here." She said like a spoiled child. At this moment, she felt that she 
was really alive.

"I am not dreaming, right?" Victor asked in a low voice.

Eden was speechless and she suddenly smiled. She also felt that she was dreaming, but he was more 
confused than her.

"Even if it is a dream, I am very happy because we're together." Eden said with a chuckle.

Hearing this, Victor smiled. Whether it was a dream or reality, he was satisfied as long as they were 
together.

Closing his eyes, he felt the familiar and pleasant smell on her and kissed her soft lips.

He had always been infatuated with her beauty.

After a long time, the sky got dark.

They finished the sex, and Victor's heart was full of sweetness and happiness.

Eden leaned against Victor's arms. She was so tired that she wanted to sleep. Seeing her like this, 
Victor was satisfied.

At the same time, his heart was no longer empty.

Eden opened her eyes with difficulty and glanced at him, "I'm exhausted."

Victor's heart ached when he heard that.

"Eden, just sleep. I am by your side. You can sleep peacefully." When Eden heard his gentle 
promise, she smiled faintly, closed her eyes and fell asleep.



Victor heard her even breathing, and his dark eyes were filled with tenderness. He quietly got up 
and took a bath.

At this time, he didn't feel uncomfortable at all. On the contrary, his whole body was relaxed.

The top floor of the hotel was always Victor's private place.

He changed into a comfortable casual suit, walked out of the room lightly and went to the lobby.

Chapter 1140

Lucian, Amelia, Brian, and Adonis were all waiting for Victor in the hall.

Hearing the footsteps, they looked up and saw Victor walking towards them. After he took a 
shower, his bangs were flowing on his forehead, and his skin looked flawless. He looked refreshing 
and handsome, but his eyes were as apathetic as usual.

"Victor." Brian looked at Victor in surprise.

Usually, when he was at work, he would call him "Mr. Alwynn" respectfully.

Moreover, they had been good friends since college.

Victor looked at them and nodded.

Then he sat on the single sofa aside.

Lucian had prepared some flower tea for Victor. He picked up the teapot and poured him a cup of 
tea.

Victor was in no hurry to speak. He picked up the tea cup and took a sip elegantly.



Without putting down the cup, he played with the edge of the cup, rubbed it lightly with his fingers 
and leaned back slightly, looking leisurely.

"Have you found out something?" He said in a low and angry voice.

He didn't believe that he would say such words to Melissa.

Even if he was in a coma, he would not make a promise to her.

Brian said, "I checked the surveillance videos in the hospital. Four days after you had an accident, 
you were transferred to the VIP ward in C Country. The person who brought you here was Melissa."

"At that time, we were busy looking for you, so we didn't think of the possibility that you would be 
taken aboard."

As Brian said this, he clicked on the video and showed it to Victor.

In the video, Victor was pushed into the ward and didn't come out anymore.

It wasn't Melissa who had been taking care of him. Instead, it was an old male nurse.

Melissa came to see him every few days, but she wouldn't stay for a long time. She left in about 
twenty minutes every time.

Only the man nurse was busy taking care of him.

Brian added, "I've investigated Melissa thoroughly. She has a fiance, but it is not you. The man is 
named Caleb. He comes from a well-off family and ruins several foreign companies. Carney intends 
to let Melissa marry Caleb."

"Caleb had a girlfriend before. They broke up because of Melissa. Moreover, Melissa used to suffer 
from schizophrenia. She was diagnosed with schizophrenia after her mother passed away. But it was 
something that happened ten years ago. Now she has recovered."



Victor said in a deep voice, "So she was completely sober when she did those things."

"Yes! I found a secret room in her office. She plastered the room wall with photos of you, including 
some of your old photos and the photos of you and her. Of course, she edited those photos by 
computer. This means that she has been interested in you a long time ago. You happened to have an 
accident and she met you, so she took you here and hid you."

Brian felt that Melissa's way of doing things was crazy. How could a woman have such thoughts?

Regardless of the other people's concerns, she hid Victor.

They spent a lot of time looking for Victor, but they neglected such a woman.

Victor didn't say anything as if he didn't hear Brian's words. He kept his head down and stared at the 
tea in his hand. It seemed that he was lost in thought.

Lucian, Adonis and Brain had been used to Victor's character, but Amelia felt very uncomfortable. 
She didn't know if it was her illusion, but she felt Victor was more terrible than he was before he 
had a car accident.

She got up and glanced at everyone, "I'll... go back to my room to rest."

Although they trusted her, she couldn't stand such pressure and atmosphere.

Lucian stood up, looked at her flustered face and curled up his lips helplessly, "Let me send you 
back to your room. I'll call you at dinner time."

Adonis and Brian were speechless. Amelia's room was less than twenty steps away from here.

Did they have to witness public display affection like this?

"There's... no need. I... can go back by myself. The room is right behind you." Amelia said and 
immediately ran away.



Lucian was stunned. Why did she refuse him again?

Adonis raised his eyes and glanced at him. Seeing his depressed expression, he smiled gloatingly.

"Sit down. It's not far away and she won't get lost. Look at how nervous you are! It seems that she is 
more precious than a rare treasure."

Adonis's voice was a bit jealous. Why was he single all the time? 

With cold eyes, Lucian turned his head slowly looked down at Adonis's handsome face.

Adonis knew what he was going to say.

"Lucian, don't talk. I'm just telling you what I'm thinking. I know what you're going to say. Don't 
make fun of me. Sit down and let's discuss what we should do. We can go home after solving this 
matter."

Hearing this, Lucian bit back the words he would like to have said.

Lucian sat down expressionlessly and crossed his legs elegantly, waiting for Victor to speak.

Only then did Victor raise his head and look at Lucian, "Make an appointment with Mr. Craig. I 
want to meet him at noon tomorrow."

Lucian said, "I see. I'll go to his company to meet him tomorrow morning."

Victor got up and looked at them, "Let's eat first. I'll decide what to do after meeting Mr. Craig."

After that, he looked at Brian, "Have an investigation and find out if it was really Melissa who had 
saved me. I need to know all the details."

Brian nodded, "We can start from Melissa and get to the bottom of this matter. I need three days. 
I'm leaving right now. I have something to discuss with my friend here. He knows Melissa, so he 
might provide me some good news."



Saying this, Brian put away his computer and was about to leave.

Victor looked at him, "It's hard for us to meet again. Leave after having dinner with us."

"Ha-ha..." Brian smiled and looked at him, "Victor, you're right. We haven't had dinner together for 
a long time. Okay, I'll leave after dinner."

Lucian said, "I'll get them to deliver the meal here"

He stood up and made a phone call aside.

With an arrogant and casual look, Adonis put his legs on the tea table, took out his phone and 
started to play mobile games.

Anyway, he had nothing to do. He felt much better after having a sleep.

Brian sat down and played together with Adonis.

Victor returned to his room to see Eden. She was still sleeping soundly.

Eden's phone suddenly vibrated, and Victor took a look at it. It was a phone call from Gia.

Thinking of the three children, he felt as if his heart was being cut by a knife.

He picked up Eden's phone with his hands trembling.

Gia was making a video call, and he answered it.

Gia had grown up a lot, and she was so pretty. Her clear and beautiful big eyes were the same as 
Eden's.

"Oh..." Giada was dumbfounded when she saw Victor. Immediately afterwards, she burst into tears.
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