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Victor's black hair was a little messy after he had taken a shower, causing him to look more 
handsome and wild.

He had a stiff expression on his well-defined face at the moment. There was coldness, indifference 
and mixed emotions in his eyes.

He made up his mind suddenly and quickly tapped on the keyboard on his phone with his slender 
fingers.

"Eden, are you asleep?"

Victor waited anxiously for Eden's reply after he sent the message.

At the same time, Eden turned on her phone after she had sent a text message to Bethany.

She looked down and saw that her phone screen had lit up.

She was startled when she saw that Victor had sent her a WhatsApp message. She clicked open the 
message.

Eden felt very conflicted as she looked at the message that Victor had sent her.

She had no idea what Victor was thinking until now.

She bit her lower lip slightly and picked up her mobile phone. She quickly typed a line of words 
and replied Victor.

"Mr. Alwynn, I'm going to sleep. Good night."



Victor was closing his eyes when he heard the WhatsApp notification. He quickly opened his sharp 
and cold eyes and looked at the few words that Eden had sent him. Victor who had been depressed

the whole day, leapt up in joy instantly.

He lowered his head and his scattered hair fell on his forehead, making him look even charming.

A gentle smile slowly formed on his lips.

He moved his fingers quickly across the keypad of his phone. "Eden, rest early. Good night!"

Victor suddenly felt a sense of accomplishment after sending the message to Eden.

He sent Kenny a WhatsApp message after that.

"Kenny, are you asleep?"

However, there was no response from Kenny after Victor sent the message to him.

Victor glanced at the time. Kenny should be asleep at this time.

Gia was probably asleep too.

He wanted to hug Gia very badly. His heart softened when he thought of her sweet smile.

Victor smiled, took a deep breath and laid down. It seemed like he could sleep well tonight.

Eden was not asleep and she was looking at the messages that Bethany had sent her. 

"Cyan, is it you?"

"You're back, aren't you?"



"Cyan, what do you want? Don't keep hiding. Just tell me what you want."

"Cyan, you are vicious under the guise of kindliness. You're just a fake b*tch. I have raised you. Is 
this how you repay me?"

Eden smiled when she saw the last message.

She murmured, "Bethany, If I don’t do that, how could I be a match with a cruel and vain person 
like you?"

Eden had been kind to Bethany but she had been hurt by her eventually.

She would never take the initiative to provoke others but that didn't mean that she would let herself 
be at the mercy of others. She was kind and ruthless at the same time!

Eden put down the phone and looked at herself in the mirror. A hint of sadness and anger lingered in 
her eyes.

She had actually thought of putting behind all the pain she had suffered previously. After all, so 
many

years had passed.

If she was bitten by a rabid dog, would she get down to the floor and bit it back?

However, she had a knot in her heart. Where did Bethany get her?

Who were her birth parents?

She couldn't let go of these.

She had dreamt of the past frequently and she still couldn't let it go.



That was because there was still hatred in her heart!

Her wound had not healed even though seven years had passed.

She turned off her phone and hid it in a secluded place.

She smiled and went to sleep after she saw Zofia’s message telling her that she had reached her 
home.

Eden, who was used to getting up early, did not wake up late the next morning. Instead, she got up 
and went for a morning run.

She was used to running in the morning, especially on weekends.

She would buy some vegetables on the way back after she finished her morning run.

Before she went out, she had left a note for Jaida, telling her not to go out and buy vegetables 
because she would do that.

Her house was not far from Zofia's place. There was also a food market there.

She headed in that direction.

Her body was full of sweat when she reached Zofia's place.

She stopped, glanced at Zofia's house and looked at the time. It was just eight o'clock. Zofia's 
family should not be up yet at this time.

She smiled faintly. Her beautiful face was blushing after the morning run and she looked radiant 
and striking.

She turned around to head to the food market.



"Zofia, where are you going?"

Eden stopped in her tracks when she heard Zofia's name.

"Buddy, where I am going is none of your business. Go away."

Eden realized that the sound came from Zofia’s back door.

Why was Buddy so early?

Eden trotted over to the back door.

"Zofia, it's all my fault. I'm sorry, Zofia! I failed to protect you and our child." "Buddy, our child is 
gone and we have already cut ties with each other. Don't find me again in the future."

The sentence "Our child is gone and we don’t have a tie anymore" pierced through Buddy's heart.

Eden heard Zofia's determined words when she arrived. Her heart ached for Zofia when she saw her 
pained expression.

She walked over quickly and held Zofia who had a pained expression on her face. She asked, 
"Zofia, are you okay?"

Zofia seemed to have found someone to rely on when she saw Eden. She calmed down instantly.

"Eden, I'm fine." She shook her head gently but her eyes were welled up with tears.

Buddy's nerves tightened instantly when he heard Eden’s name.

"Buddy, what are you doing here early in the morning?" Eden glared at him angrily.



She saw clearly what had happened that night. Buddy was the one who had proposed to break up 
with Zofia.

He should face the facts since Aisling was clear about her thoughts.

If he continued to pester Zofia, both of them would only suffer.

Eden’s roar had interrupted Buddy's curiosity. He hurriedly explained, "I was just passing by and I 
wanted to see Zofia."

"See Zofia?" Eden smiled sarcastically, "Buddy, you are still young. Don't treat life casually. 
Everyone's life is filled with many unexpected challenges. You should not pester Zofia since you do 
not have the ability to take care of her."

It was great to be devoted. However, Buddy was devoted and merciless at the same time.

Sometimes, hope was more terrifying than despair!

Buddy should not give Zofia hope again since he was firm with his decision that night because it 
would only cause her more pain!

Buddy’s painful gaze fell on Zofia's pale face. He had been thinking about her crazily the past few 
days.
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Buddy thought he could let go but he was wrong. He would want to find Zofia whenever he thought 
of the teary look on her face.

However, he didn't dare to find her because he was afraid that he would make her sadder.

He had something to do in the vicinity early in the morning and he happened to pass by Zofia's 
house. He couldn't resist it anymore and came to see her.

At the same time, the traffic lights on the road was red.



Haven was driving Aisling to meet her friends.

Haven's car stopped at the intersection of the red light. Haven glanced around and found that she 
was near Zofia's house.

She saw a familiar car suddenly and looked at the license plate number.

Haven frowned and said a startled voice, "Mom, that's Buddy's car. Did he come to find Zofia?"

Aisling, who was looking down at her phone, raised her head immediately when she heard Haven's 
words. She looked outside and saw that it was indeed Buddy's car.

Her face that was filled with delicate makeup, turned grim instantly.

She shouted angrily, "Haven, stop the car at the side. It seems that Buddy didn't take my warning 
seriously."

Haven smiled coldly. She had warned Zofia not to mess with Buddy previously but she didn't listen.

A poor woman like Zofia would only pester Buddy constantly because she wanted to marry into a 
rich family.

When the lights turned green, Haven turned on her signal and pulled over to the side of the road.

Aisling didn't say anything. She looked tensed as she got off the car quickly.

Haven also got out of the car.

She held Aisling's arm intimately. Aisling looked at her tenderly and smiled lovingly.

She would have nothing to worry about as long as Haven behaved herself.



Aisling and Haven heard voices from the other side when they entered the alley. She stopped 
quickly and stood on the spot.

"I didn't pester Zofia. I came here to see her because I miss her too much. I would feel relieved if 
she is fine." Buddy said in a wounded tone.

"Buddy, I would have a better life only if you don't come to find me. You can go now!" Zofia drove 
Buddy away with a cold expression on her face. Her tone was stern and cold.

He was the one who wanted to break up with her but he was also the one who said he had missed 
her and came to find her. She wouldn't have suffered so much if relationships could be trampled 
easily.

Buddy didn't give up and said, "Zofia, I will buy you a house and put it under your name..."

"No need!" Zofia interrupted him without hesitation.

"Zofia..."

"Leave now! I have nothing to say to you. Please stay away from me from now onwards and never 
appear in my life again." Zofia had a cold expression on her face as she spoke.

Every single word that Zofia said pierced through Buddy's heart.

He wanted to make up for Zofia because he felt extremely guilty.

He even thought about leaving River City with Zofia.

He knew Zofia and Aisling very well but he was still reluctant to give her up.

He had helped Aisling with her work and he hoped that one day she would let him marry Zofia.

He looked at Zofia's cold face. He had not seen her for only a few days but she had lost a lot of 
weight. He felt distressed when he looked at her thin figure.



He gritted his teeth and felt a searing pain in his heart.

"Zofia, whether you believe me or not, I love you from the bottom of my heart." When he finished 
speaking, he glanced at her deeply and then left reluctantly.

After that, he turned around stiffly and walked out of the alley.

Eden looked at Buddy’s sad and lonely back and a complicated light flashed across her eyes.

What else could he do even if Buddy loved Zofia?

He couldn't defeat reality and his own mother.

Therefore, he still looked weak at the moment no matter how much he loved Zofia.

Aisling and Haven saw Buddy coming over with his head down.

They glanced behind them and saw that there was a flight of stairs behind them. They quickly went 
and stood on the stairs.

They only came out from the dark after Buddy had left.

Aisling looked at Buddy's back grimly. The b*stard still wanted to buy Zofia a house?

Did he plan to hide with Zofia and have their own time together?

What a nice thought.

Aisling was firm when she did not approve of Buddy' s marriage. She would not change her mind 
even if Buddy jumped off a building to commit suicide.



"Mom, it seems that Buddy hasn't given up on Zofia. You also know that a woman with a 
background like Zofia would feel amazed if she has a house. She will definitely agree to have a 
house if Buddy persuades her a few more times.

They will spend time together behind your back and you could do nothing to her when the time 
comes." Haven added fuel to the fire. She had a strange look on her face and she was extremely 
jealous.

Buddy was really generous. Houses nowadays were really expensive.

However, he still wanted to buy a house for Zofia.

Humph!!

She would never agree to that.

Aisling turned around and looked at Eden and Zofia, who were not far away. Eden was comforting 
Zofia at the moment.

Aisling twitched the corner of her lips angrily. She walked towards Eden and Zofia with an 
unprecedentedly cold expression on her face.

Haven followed behind Aisling with a sneer.

She would bump into Eden everywhere!

Zofia, who had just calmed down slightly, suddenly saw Aisling and Haven.

She became agitated instantly.

Eden could sense that Zofia was shaking as she watched Aisling and Haven walking towards them.

Her heart ached for Zofia and she said, "Zofia, don't be afraid!"



"Okay!" Zofia gathered her courage and pretended to be calm as she looked at Aisling, who was 
walking towards her.

Aisling walked over, raised her hand to slap Zofia in the face without saying anything.

Zofia widened her eyes and looked at the hand that was about to hit her without moving.

Eden's gaze turned cold when she saw that and she moved a step forward slightly. 

Slap!

Aisling’s hard slap landed on Eden's face.

A trace of blood appeared on Eden's fair skin near her ear because it was scratched by Aisling’s 
pinky nail that was studded with crystal sequins when Aisling slapped her face hard.

"Ah..." Zofia was dumbfounded when she saw Eden take the slap for her. No one had ever protected 
her like this.

A hint of pleasure flashed across Haven's eyes. Women like Eden was the most stupid. Did she 
really think that she was noble to take a slap for others?

Aisling looked at Eden's swollen face and frowned slightly. She looked at Eden and said unhappily, 
"You were the one who came forward to be slapped by me.

Eden asked with a sneer, "Mrs. Clement, do you think you can trample on other people's self- 
esteem just because you are rich? Do you know how disappointed the person would be after being 
slapped by you?"
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Eden saw that Zofia was scared and she felt as if she was looking at herself seven years ago.

She was very careful in front of the people in the Gienger family. She was cautious with her every 
movement, expression, gaze and even her breathing!



She knew that deep down, Zofia was terrified. However, she would not let Zofia get hurt because 
she was still pregnant.

"Hmph!" Aisling snorted coldly and looked at Eden with contempt. "Money can indeed trample on 
the dignity of people like you. Only by teaching you a hard lesson will you know what you deserve 
and what you can't afford.

Even if Victor didn't marry Haven, he wouldn't marry a shameless woman like you who has 
children before marriage."

A woman who had children before marriage?

Eden still felt very uncomfortable even though she was used to hearing this phrase. However, she 
still looked at Aisling with a smile and did not change her expression.

"What do you mean by people like us?" Eden asked word by word. Her eyes were clear.

Her voice changed slightly. It was dry and filled with forbearance. The smile on her face was still 
bright and charming.

Aisling frowned and anger surged through her when she looked at Eden who was stubborn and 
arrogant in front of her.

She actually didn't want to embarrass Eden too much but Eden was asking fortrouble.

"Fine! I will tell you since you want to hear it." Aisling spoke in a harsh and sarcastic tone.

She glanced at Eden and Zofia and said, "People like you are poor, shameless and are willing to do 
anything for money. Women like you think that you can capture a man's heart by giving birth to his 
child. However, you will just end up being abandoned by the man. Don't think that I don't know 
what people like you are thinking"

Eden was overwhelmed by a huge wave of shame when she heard that. Aisling’s every word was 
heartbreaking.



However, she still looked at Aisling and maintained the same smile on her face. "Mrs. Clement, 
well said. A rich and powerful person like you has received a good education and a luxurious 
lifestyle but the things you do are immoral.

You may be really remarkable but I may not think highly of you!"

"Eden, how dare you insult my mother?" Haven berated Eden angrily and looked at her coldly.

Eden glanced at Haven disdainfully. She had never seen someone as shameless as her.

Eden's anger was completely triggered at that moment. She rebuked Haven back in a similar tone 
angrily, "Haven, are you blind or deaf? Couldn’t you tell who insulted who? Are you still in 
kindergarten? Or are you retarded? You can't even tell right from wrong. Who are you to yell at 
me?"

Although Eden was very poor, she would not allow others to simply trample on her dignity.

"Eden, you..."

"Shut up! Open your eyes. Please take a good look at yourself and understand to be a human.

Also, don’t shout at me. I'm afraid of dogs!" Eden interrupted her coldly and angrily.

Eden was amiable when she was not angry.

However, she would not be merciful when she got angry.

She would retaliate without reservation by using the same way other people treated her.

Aisling trembled with anger. She raised her hand quickly and was about to slap Eden again.

Eden also raised her hand the moment Aisling struck. She held onto Aisling's palm that was about to 
land on her face.



Zofia who felt a little relieved a while ago, looked at Eden nervously at the moment.

She was afraid that Eden would get hurt again!

Aisling frowned and looked at her hand that was caught by Eden. She shouted angrily, "Let go of 
your dirty hand."

Eden said with a sneer, "Mrs. Clement, I advise you not to go overboard. Rabbits will bite when 
they are anxious and they won’t let go easily."

Eden's cold eyes caused Aisling's heart to tremble a little.

The people who did not put up with other people were the bravest people.

Eden looked fearless at the moment.

At the same time, Eden’s phone rang suddenly.

Eden ignored it and continued to hold Aisling's hand tightly as she stared at her.

She only shoved Aisling’s hand away and answered the call when her phone rang for the second 
time.

When she saw that the call was from Zaiden, she calmed down quickly and answered the phone 
with a smile. "Hello! Uncle Calder." "Eden, where are you?"

"Uncle Calder, I am having a morning run and I happened to meet Zofia. I am with Zofia now. I will 
go back after buying some vegetables. I want to let my mother rest for a while because she just 
came to River City."

"You're a very filial girl. I've sent you some furniture. I will come over to have breakfast with you 
later."



"Furniture?" Eden was surprised that Zaiden had sent her furniture.

"Uncle Calder, my previous furniture can still be used..."

"No. This is a gift from me. I have so much money but I have no one to spend it on. You don't have 
to save money for me.

"I'll reach your place at around twelve o'clock. Remember to buy fish. I love the fish that your 
mother makes the most. I’ll hang up first."

"Uncle..." Eden still wanted to say something but she heard a beeping sound from the other side of 
the call.

Eden frowned slightly. There was no need for Zaiden to send stuff to her house even though he 
fancied Jaida!

Aisling knew the person whom Eden had referred to as Uncle Calder.

It was Zaiden. He was very wealthy but he rarely appeared in public.

However, why did Eden know him?

"What's your relationship with Zaiden?" Aisling couldn't help but asked Eden. 

Aisling’s family had bought a piece of land recently and they planned to do real estate business. 
Zaiden was the most ideal person in terms of investment.

She had tried to made appointments with Zaiden several times but was rejected by him.

Eden looked at Aisling. She didn't want to say anything to Aisling who liked to look down on poor 
people.

She sneered and said, "This has nothing to do with you."



"Eden, you..."

Eden did not look at Aisling. Instead, she looked at Zofia behind her and said, "Zofia, you also want 
to buy vegetables. Why don't we go together? My mother wants to eat rice noodles but I don't know 
which restaurant is authentic."

Zofia smiled and said, "Eden, I know. I'll take you there."

Zofia glanced at Aisling and said, "Mrs. Clement, I didn't pester Buddy. Don't worry, I will move 
out of here and would never see Buddy again."

Zofia took Eden’s hand and left after she finished her words calmly.

Aisling was unable to contain the anger in her heart as she watched Eden and Zofia's departing 
backs.

"Mom, do we just let them leave like that?" Haven was very angry. No one had ever spoken such 
insulting words to her ever since she was a child.

Aisling looked at her with a frown and said angrily, "They've already left. What else do you want? 
You didn't say a word when they were still here. What's the point of saying this now?"

Aisling spoke as she walked out of the alley.
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"Mom..." Haven looked at Aisling's back sullenly. She did not have the chance to speak just now.

How dare Eden called her a dog?

Great!

Even though Haven's words were not as vicious as Eden, she would be more ruthless than Eden and 
would use shady means towards her. 



She stomped her feet angrily and followed Aisling out of the alley.

Eden and Zofia went out of the alley.

Zofia took Eden to the vegetable market.

Eden didn't know the address. However, she was not worried because she had Zofia to lead the way.

Zofia looked at Eden apologetically. "Eden, I'm sorry for letting you suffer today."

She still felt bad that Eden had received the slap on her behalf.

Eden glanced at her with a smile and said, "Zofia, I’m fine. A person would become more tolerant 
after encountering countless grievances. It was nothing and you don't have to feel guilty! Aren't we 
friends?

Friends should share happiness and hardship

together." Eden smiled in a relaxed manner. She could let go of a lot of things now.

As a matter of fact, if she was angry with Aisling, that meant she still hadn't conquered herself yet.

She smiled and her mood eased up a lot. She would only tire herself if she cared too much about 
other people's opinions.

"You are really silly!" Zofia still looked at Eden guiltily.

Eden changed the topic and asked, "Zofia, do you really plan to leave here?"

A touch of sadness instantly rose on Zofia's face when she heard that.



She glanced at Eden, lowered her head slowly and said in a sad tone, "Eden, you also know that the 
food stall is my mom's only income. The tuition fees for my brother would be gone if the food stall 
is destroyed by the Clement family.

I can't ruin my mother's only livelihood for my own sake. We are not wealthy and powerful. We 
can't beat them. It's better for me to suffer a little. The matter would also be solved."

Eden suddenly understood Zofia's thoughts when she heard that.

She suddenly gave a self-deprecating smile.

Sometimes people could not beat reality no matter how courageous they were.

Zofia was trying to protect her family by doing so.

Eden took a deep breath and asked, "Zofia, have you decided where to go?"

Zofia looked at her and shook her head with a bitter smile. "Eden, I don't have anywhere to go. The 
child is almost three months old and my belly will get bigger in a few months. If I continue to stay 
here, the neighbors will ridicule my mother.

My mother does not have an easy life. The business has finally stabilized and my family situation 
has improved a little. I can't let my mother be sad again because of my affairs."

Zofia did not have many friends. The few friends she had were married and had children. They were 
all busy with their own matters and did not have time to pay attention to her.

Anyway, she could live well on her own as long as the child in her womb was healthy, no matter 
where she went.

Eden smiled and said, "Zofia, why don't you come to my house?"

Zofia shook her head quickly. "Eden, I don’t want to cause trouble for you again."



Eden looked at her with a smile. "Zofia, you are pregnant now. If you live with me, it will be even 
more convenient after you give birth to the baby. I rarely work overtime so I can take care of you.

Besides, I have a lot of empty rooms. If you stay with me, you can talk to my mom when I go to 
work. She won't be lonely then."

Zofia also looked at her with gratitude and said, "Eden, thank you so much! You have helped me in 
my most difficult time. After I give birth to my baby, I will find a stall to sell my family's traditional 
delicacies to support myself and the child."

She had been searching for suitable stalls on the Internet the past few days. If she could find a stall 
within these few months, she could do business for another few months.

She was particularly confident in her family's traditional delicacies.

She could not bear to abort the child because she had a deep affection for Buddy.

She would contribute quietly and care for Buddy secretly!

Some relationships could not be restored once they were broken.

A relationship that was easily lost often did not belong to the person. Zofia would keep this 
relationship in her heart and make it a memory.

Eden smiled and said, "Zofia, take it easy. You

should take care of yourself and the child in your womb at the moment."

"Okay!" Zofia smiled and nodded.

Eden asked again, "When are you going to move in? I'll clean up a room for you when I go back."



"Eden, let's do it today! I have mentioned the matter to my mother before. She does not feel at ease 
if I live alone outside. However, I have made up my mind and she could not doing anything about 
it.

As for the child, she did not stop me from having it.

She said that women could raise their children even if they don't rely on men. As long as we are 
willing, we can face everything bravely."

"Zofia, you are right to think like this. You can go home to pack your things after we buy the 
vegetables. I will tidy up the room when I go back so you can stay there." Eden liked a lively 
atmosphere anyway. She had many rooms in her house and it could fit Zofia.

"Alright!" Zofia said with a smile. She was very grateful to Eden.

She would always remember Eden's help.

They bought some vegetables and went back home after that.

Zofia went back to pack her things while Eden brought the vegetables home.

It was exactly ten o'clock and was just the right time to make breakfast when Eden got home.

"Mom, I'm back." Eden shouted happily when she saw Jaida.

Jaida was going to cook when she saw that Eden had returned. She was instantly worried when she 
saw that Eden’s face was red and swollen. There were even traces of blood at Eden's ear.

She quickly walked over, took the vegetables from Eden and put them on the table beside her.

She asked, "Eden, tell me who hit you."

Eden quickly touched her face which had been slapped when she heard that.



She felt a numbing pain on her face and she was upset. Aisling's slap was really hard, causing her 
face to be still red and swollen.

She smiled and said, "Mom, I'm fine."

"Quickly tell me who hit you." Jaida didn't want Eden to get away with it like that.

She had sincerely regarded Eden as her daughter in the past seven years.

No one could bully her daughter.

Eden smiled and said, "Mom, I am really fine. I was just slapped by someone!" "Eden, who hit 
you?" Jaida asked persistently.

Kenny and Gia came out of their rooms when they heard Jaida’s harsh voice.

When Jaida saw that, she said, "Gia, Kenny, go to the second floor."

"Okay!" Giada glanced at Eden's face and turned to leave in distress.

Kenny also looked at Eden in distress and bit his lower lip hard.

Seeing that she couldn't escape, Eden could only tell Jaida what had happened today.

Jaida was shocked after Eden told her everything. "Eden, you said that Zofia's child belongs to 
Buddy?"

"That’s right!" Eden nodded. When she saw that Jaida was in deep thoughts, she said in confusion, 
"Mom, you seem to know Buddyjudging from your tone."
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Jaida looked at Eden dotingly. "Silly girl. The Clement family is a well-known family in River City. 
Everyone knows that they have two sons and a daughter. The news article would occasionally 
mention it too.



I have heard of Buddy Clement even though I do not know him. That's why I felt surprised."

Eden's previous doubts were all dispelled when she heard that.

She had never asked about Jaida's background. Jaida treated her as if she were her own child. Eden 
knew that Jaida would personally tell her everything one day.

Jaida's heart ached for Eden when she looked at her cheek that had been slapped.

She thought for a moment and asked, "Eden, Mrs. Clement hit you. You..."

Jaida wanted to say something but stopped. Judging by Eden's temper, she would retaliate if she 
was messed with.

Jaida could still recall the time when she accompanied Eden to bring the children for vaccination 
after Eden had given birth.

A couple did not line up and jump the queue in front of them. Eden fought with them at that time 
even though the couple was fierce.

Jaida still vividly remembered Eden's sassy behavior to this day.

Eden said with a smile, "Mom, do you want to ask me if I hit Mrs. Clement?"

"Yes!" Jaida nodded.

Eden shook her head and said, "Mom, I didn't. I'm your daughter and I'm not that sassy. I just 
mocked her and didn't say anything else for Zofia’s sake."

"That's great! Go and rest. I am going to cook. Didn't you say that you're going to design a piece for 
Darlene? Do you have inspiration now?"

Eden frowned. She would have forgotten about this matter if Jaida hadn’t mentioned it.



"Mom, the matter is not urgent. I've got a general inspiration but I'm not in the mood to design 
today. My design will be the best when I'm in a good mood."

"Okay!" Jaida rubbed Eden's hair dotingly.

"Eden, you are the best. I am going to cook." Jaida spoke as she picked up the vegetables on the 
table and went to the kitchen.

Eden looked at Jaida's back suddenly and said, "Mom, Uncle Calder is coming over for dinner. He 
wants to eat the fish cooked by you."

Jaida stopped when she heard that. She turned around and saw that Eden was smiling brightly. She 
smiled and nodded.

"Okay!" 

She went into the kitchen after that. However, her eyes darkened the moment she turned around.

How dare Aisling hit Eden? Jaida swore to settle the scores with Aisling in the future.

Zofia was a good girl. Aisling must be blind. She couldn’t read people clearly as she got older.

Generally, people experienced a lot as they grew older. Buddy and Zofia were in love with each 
other but Aisling interfered with their relationship and even abandoned her own grandson.

What had she gone through all these years to become such an unreasonable person?

Jaida frowned and shook her head.

Her heart ached for Eden because Aisling’s slap was really hard!

Eden watched Jaida enter the kitchen before she turned around and went to tidy up the room 
opposite her.



Jaida didn't stop Zaiden from visiting. Could it be that Zaiden was trying to pursue her when Eden 
was not at home?

The two children who were standing at the stairway had a sullen expression on their faces.

Giada turned and glanced at Kenneth who was standing behind her. She asked, "Kenny, who is Mrs. 
Clement?"

Kenny realized that Giada was willing to talk to him. He smiled and said, "Are you not angry with 
me anymore?"

"Humph! I won't be angry with you anymore for the sake of the QQ candy you had given me. You 
have to tell me who Mrs. Clement is?" How dare she bully Eden...

Giada swore that she would teach those who had bullied Eden a lesson one day and return all the 
humiliation that Eden had suffered to them!

"I don't know!" Kenny answered shortly.

After that, he returned to his room with a grim expression on his face.

Giada frowned when she saw that.

"Kenneth, you..." Giada was so angry that she couldn't speak.

"Humph!" She wrinkled her nose and stared at Kenneth’s room.

"Humph! I'll investigate myself." Giada spoke as she blinked her clear big eyes. She looked in the 
direction of the kitchen and wanted to ask Jaida.

However, Jaida knew what she wanted by just looking at her behavior. Jaida would definitely not 
tell her about it.



"Hehe..." Giada suddenly had an idea.

Jasper was the one who doted on her the most.

Giada smiled happily and headed for her room.

Eden tidied up the room quickly. There was a very big French window in the room. The room was 
spacious, bright and was very comfortable to live in.

Eden walked to the French window and pulled the curtains open. The sunlight shone in the room 
through the window, making the whole room brighter.

There were also similar small villas behind her house. She purposely counted the houses on her way 
back. There were ten houses in total.

Her house was the first house on the left.

In short, she was very satisfied with her house.

Eden's phone rang suddenly when she left the room. She took out her phone and saw that it was 
from Anson.

She hesitated for a while before she answered the phone.

"Hello! Manager Skye."

"Eden, I'm sending you gifts. Send me your address."

"Okay!" Eden hung up the phone and sent her location to Anson through WhatsApp.

She exhaled deeply and headed back to the kitchen.

Jaida was preparing the fish in the kitchen.



Eden shouted, "Mom, Manager Skye from my company will s to our house later."

Jaida who was preparing the fish, paused when she heard that. Was Anson the Manager Skye that 
Eden mentioned?

She smiled and said, "Eden, I'll prepare more dishes then. Ask him to stay and have a meal with us!"

"Okay! Mom, let me help you!" Eden spoke as she walked in the kitchen.

Jaida quickly said, "Eden, no need. I can do it alone. You can go and clean up the living room. We 
have guests to greet later."

"Okay!" Eden went out obediently.

Jaida glanced at Eden's back and thought for a moment. She picked up the phone next to her and 
sent a message to Zaiden.

"Zaiden, Anson is coming over later."

Zaiden was in a luxurious Audi and was heading to Eden’s house. He was still dressed in a dark 
black

suit and he exuded a gentle and elegant temperament.

He had set a special notification tone for Jaida's message. He glanced at the WhatsApp message 
gently.

He quickly sent a message back to Jaida, "Jaida, don't be afraid. I'm here!"

Jaida smiled when she saw the message.

"Don't be afraid, I'm here!"



These few words caused Jaida to feel guilty and heartbroken.

She was always sorry towards Zaiden.

However, in the future...

She smiled and there was a touch of affection in her smile.

Perhaps she had enough confidence to accept Zaiden.

She lowered her head and continued cooking.

She remembered that Zaiden didn't eat Sichuan pepper and parsley. She didn't put any of those in 
the food last night because she knew he was coming.
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Jaida saw that Zaiden ate happily last night, so she would cook for him again today.

Zaiden, who was always punctual, arrived at Eden's house at twelve o’clock on time.

A furniture truck also stopped at Eden's house.

Eden opened the door and welcomed Zaiden.

"Uncle Calder, you're here."

"Eden, I am here. Ask Kenny and Gia to come out first. I will ask the staff to bring out the old 
furniture and bring new ones in. The furniture can be used once they are moved in." Zaiden said 
with a smile.

Eden said gratefully, "Okay! Thank you, Uncle Calder!" Eden waved her hand and signalled 
Kenneth and Giada to go and play in the yard.



Kenny and Gia ran out obediently and played aside.

Eden made a path for the workers to move the furniture.

Her family had just moved in. They had not used much furniture and there were not many things in 
the house. Replacing the furniture at the moment saved them a lot of trouble indeed.

"Uncle Calder, I was just joking last night. I didn’t expect you to be serious." "Hehe..." Zaiden 
smiled happily. "Eden, I want to give this furniture to you whether you are joking or serious. I told 
you before that I am rich. You don't have to help me save money."

Eden was also amused by his words. She smiled and asked, "Uncle Calder, is it really good for you 
to show off your wealth like this?"

"What's wrong with that? I'm telling the truth!"

Eden said with a smile, "That's true. Uncle Calder, you are a real estate tycoon."

How could Jaida bear to let a rich and kind man like Zaiden wait for so many years?

Eden suddenly asked mysteriously, "Uncle Calder, have you met my mother again previously? My 
mom didn't put Sichuan pepper when she cooked the fish last night because she specially prepared 
it for you. Are you two..." Eden smiled as she spoke. She wanted to say something but stopped on 
second thought. She gestured her two fingers in front of Zaiden.

Zaiden smiled happily when he heard that. He glanced at Eden mysteriously and said, "Eden, my 
life is not easy. I am getting older by just waiting for your mother to marry me.

Your mom is now giving me a little chance so I'm grasping the opportunity to please and impress 
her with my sincerity."

Eden nodded continuously. "Uncle Calder, I'm on your side. I have no objection if my mother 
agrees to marry you."



"Really?" Zaiden narrowed his eyes at her.

"Yes! Uncle Calder, I mean it." Eden nodded seriously.

"I will be very happy if my mother leads a happy life."

"I like your kindness and filial piety." Zaiden was very happy.

He suddenly saw a black car driving towards them. He narrowed his eyes and said, "Eden, someone 
is coming!"

Eden looked up and smiled when she saw Anson's car.

"Uncle Calder, it's Manager Skye from my company.

I'll go take a look."

"Alright. Eden, I'll go with you. I happen to know him. Let's go and greet him."

"Okay!" Eden nodded and the two of them walked towards Anson's car.

Anson personally drove over to deliver the gifts.

Victor would never be at ease if Anson didn't come here in person.

Anson had no choice but to accept his fate and come over even though it was the weekend.

He could only stop the car behind the truck because it was blocking the road.

He saw Eden coming towards him from a distance.

He frowned when he saw Zaiden. Why was Zaiden here?



Very few people could see Zaiden in the business world all year round. It seemed that he was quite 
close with Eden.

He opened the door, got out and smiled at Eden and Zaiden who was approaching him.

"Eden, Mr. Calder." He took the lead in greeting them.

"Vo! Manager Skye, I haven't seen you for a long time!" Zaiden smiled as he spoke. 

Anson said, "Mr. Calder, it's really been a long time since we last met!"

Anson did not greet him when they were at the banquet previously.

"Mr. Calder, you seem to be quite close with Eden." Anson glanced at Eden as he spoke.

Zaiden looked at Eden gently and said with a smile, "I have known her for seven years. She is like a 
daughter to me. I will visit her house to have free meals when I have nothing to do."

Daughter?

Anson found the news a little hard to digest!

He was slightly stunned and he stood at the same spot.

Eden looked at him in shock as well!

On second thought, it was reasonable. Zaiden was very rich but he did not get married and had 
children. He was a mysterious legend in high society.

No one knew why he didn't get married.

Everyone just knew that he was very rich!



He never talked about this matter in front of the media. Some bold reporters had asked this question 
when they interviewed him.

However, he was able to avoid answering the question.

The stock price of the Alwynn Group would definitely soar if the people in the business world knew 
that Eden was his daughter.

Anson suddenly felt that Eden was Victor's lucky star.

The Alwynn Group would have a bright future with a powerful man like Zaiden!

Anson thought happily in his heart.

He looked at Eden with a smile as if he was looking at a cash cow.

He looked forward to the arrival of the Alwynn Group's heyday.

"Eden, Mr. Alwynn and I have prepared some gifts for you. I will take them inside for you."

When Zaiden heard that, he said with a polite smile, "Manager Skye, no need to bother you. Get the 
things out of your car first. I will ask the workers to move them in once they finish moving the 
furniture."

Anson glanced at the entrance of Eden's house. There really was no way for him to walk in if he 
brought the gifts into the house now.

"Alright!" Anson opened the trunk and moved the things down as he spoke.

Eden looked at the things and saw that there were two fortune trees, carnivorous plants, mural 
paintings, lucky bamboo and all kinds of things.



There were even children's toys and a rag doll. Eden could not believe her eyes. Anson behaved 
more like a father than the children's real father.

How did he manage to fit so many things in his car?

Eden was really touched even though the things did not worth much!

She needed the plants to decorate the yard and the balcony on the half floor.

"Manager Skye, thank you. Help me thank Mr. Alwynn too!" Eden said with a smile.

Anson glanced at the various things on the ground and looked at the things that Zaiden had sent 
over. He felt ashamed!

However, these things were carefully and sincerely selected by Victor.

Fortunately, Eden looked very happy, so Anson was relieved.

"Eden, I'll go back first then."

Eden said, "Manager Skye, stay for lunch!"

"No, I still have something else to do. I'll come again in the future."

He wanted to stay for a meal and inquire about Abigail. He had texted Abigail last night but did not 
receive any reply from her. She also did not reply to the messages he sent today.

Chapter 307

Anson looked at Zaiden and said, "Mr. Calder, see you next time!"

"Okay! Take care!" Zaiden smiled politely. He knew that Anson wanted to stay for dinner but he 
didn't want to have dinner with him.



Zaiden could have arrived earlier. However, he purposely asked someone to check Anson’s 
whereabouts and came here almost the same time as Anson.

Jaida rarely asked him for help. He would do his best to help her if she asked.

He would not let go of such a good opportunity to help her!

Jaida had begun to accept his affection for her, which meant that she had let go of the past.

Anson glanced at Eden's red and swollen cheeks before he drove off without even asking Eden 
because Zaiden was present.

Zofia came over at the same time.

Jaida stood by the window and watched Anson's car leave. Only then did she enter the kitchen to 
continue preparing lunch with a complicated expression on her face.

Zaiden brought enough people to carry the old furniture out and brought the new ones in.

There were a lot of people coming in and out of Eden's house at the moment.

The workers got everything done in less than an hour. The whole house looked brand new with all 
the high-grade furniture.

The random things that Anson had brought over were moved into the living room.

Only then did Eden and her family sat down happily and ate together!

Anson drove back to the villa.

Victor was waiting for him to come back to have lunch together.

Victor ordered takeout!



Anson was instantly in a bad mood when he saw the takeout.

"Have you delivered everything?" Victor asked in a deep voice.

"Yes!" Anson nodded helplessly.

A trace of displeasure flashed across Victor's handsome face!

"Let's eat!" He pointed to the takeout on the table.

Anson glanced at the takeout in disgust.

"Victor, I might as well eat at Eden's place if I knew that you ordered takeout." 

Victor sat down and said casually, "Sarah went back to take care of her daughter-in-law. She won't 
come back for a while. We'll eat takeout first."

Anson sat lazily opposite him.

"Victor, look at you. What should you do if I'm not around?

Don't order takeout at night, I'll cook for you!" Anson spoke helplessly. He felt sorry for Victor.

"You?" Victor glanced at him with doubt.

"Why? Haven't you eaten the food I cooked before?" Anson glared at Victor.

"You mean your scrambled eggs with cucumber without peeling the cucumber skin or your burnt 
fried egg? Your Mapo tofu has also more chilies than tofu. Or do you mean your fried beef with 
shredded melon? Even pigs don't dare to eat the dishes you cooked. I'd better continue to order 
takeout in case I have to go to the hospital." Victor spoke as he picked up the chopsticks and ate his 
food casually!



At that moment, Victor missed the dumplings made by Eden very much.

What could he do with Eden?

"Pfft! That's because that was my first time and I didn't know how to cook." Anson looked up at 
him. "Victor, do you only give people one chance? Wait and see. I'll cook black pepper beef for you 
tonight. It will definitely taste great."

Victor looked at him with an evil smile and did not refute his words.

"Did you meet Eden?" He asked in a deep voice.

"Yes! I met her but half of her face is swollen. It seems like she was hit by someone."

"Who is it?" Victor put down his chopsticks suddenly and roared.

Anson was startled by Victor. He looked up at him sharply and said, "Victor, will you only be happy 
after you choke me to death?"

Anson spoke indistinctly because he had a lot of food in his mouth.

"Why do you have such a big reaction? I saw that her side face was swollen so I thought she was 
hit. How would I know who hit her if that is really the case?"

He really regretted telling Victor about the matter.

Victor was someone who could lose his temper easily. His sanity would be gone when it came to 
matters that were related to Eden!

Victor had a grim expression on his face and he did not speak. He should have gone to Eden's house 
himself.

However, there were many spies sent by Rebecca outside the villa.



He would be followed as soon as he went out!

Rebecca had been investigating his relationship with Ricky. Judging from her character, she would 
soon discover that Ricky and Kenny were his children.

"By the way, Zaiden also went there. He said that Eden was like a daughter to him. He sent a lot of 
furniture to her house and even had breakfast there."

"Daughter?" Victor was quite surprised.

"That's right! Zaiden said so. Besides, I could tell that he is extremely good to Eden judging from 
his gaze!" Anson was also very shocked when he first heard the news!

Victor ate his food carelessly. He chewed the food in his mouth tastelessly.

After a while, he said, "Zaiden has a great reputation in the business world! He hasn't found a 
suitable heir to inherit his property that costs hundreds of millions of dollars. He started his business 
from scratch and he doesn't seem to have other family members."

Anson rolled his eyes at him and said sulkily, "This is not a secret in the business world.

Everyone is aware of his status. However, the most confusing part is that a rich man like him didn't 
get

married and have children."

Victor raised his eyebrows and said coldly, "He sent Eden a lot of expensive furniture. Aren't the 
gifts we sent too shabby in comparison?"

Victor only realized this problem after a while.

"Hehe..." Anson let out a weird laugh.



"You don't know how bad I look when I brought those gifts out from the car. Couldn't you pick 
something more expensive when you were choosing the gifts?"

Anson felt embarrassed when he recalled the way Zaiden tried to hold back his smile.

Victor looked at Anson sharply. "Didn't you say that Eden would not accept expensive gifts?"

Besides, the gifts that he had chosen were what women liked.

Didn't the videos online mention that many women like carnivorous plants?

Anson thought for a moment and realized that he had actually said that to Victor.

"By the way, the international clothing exhibition will be held on this coming Tuesday. Didn't you 
say that you want to bring Eden with you? I'll make arrangements for you on Monday."

He has always been responsible and serious about

his work!

It was good to mention this now that he thought about it!

"Okay!" Victor nodded his head indifferently. He had been looking forward to that day.

He felt very happy when he thought about bringing Eden with him to the exhibition!

He could not recall the number of times he had secretly felt happy in his heart.

Victor asked, "Are Lucian and Adonis coming over?"

Anson shook his head and said, "Lucian is not coming. He said that he had encountered a computer 
expert recently but he couldn't trace the person's IP address.



He is completely frustrated by that. He would be tracing the person's IP address with his laptop 
whenever he is free. He has been tracing the address for several days but he still couldn't find 
anything."

Victor frowned slightly. They knew that Rebecca had stolen Eden's design drawing previously.

That was because someone used a special way to inform them.
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The website of the newspaper company was also infected by a virus. The person seemed to be 
helping him secretly but he also seemed to be secretly helping Eden to take revenge.

Victor said casually, "The person is very mysterious. He has already helped us twice. It would be 
great if we could track the person!

His computer skill is very good. It would be great if he could come and work in our company!

You should also take some time to investigate this matter."

Anson almost spat out the food in his mouth when he heard that. He chewed quickly and swallowed 
the food.

Only then did he look at Victor angrily. "Victor, don't go overboard. I am still single even though 
you are not. Give me some time so that I can have the opportunity to pass on my family line.

My mother would nag me to do so every time I go back during the weekend.

I'm not much younger than you! I'm twenty-seven this year and I'm a bachelor. I can find a beauty 
to spend the rest of our lives together.

Therefore, you should let Lucian investigate this matter. He will be ten times faster than me."

Victor's children were almost seven years old and Eden was taken care of by his future mother-in- 
law.



However, he didn't know which family she was with.

Victor became grim when he heard Anson's chants.

Did he give Anson a lot of work to do?

He frowned at Anson and said in a low voice, "Abigail is the beauty you said that you want to spend 
the rest of your life with, right?"

"Why not?" Anson glared at him.

He was really thinking of Abigail.

It was a pity that she had a boyfriend.

Victor sneered and said in a sarcastic tone, "She already has a boyfriend. It is shameful to snatch 
someone away from the people they love. Can you really let go of your pride and do that?"

Anson pursed his lips, raised his head and looked at Victor seriously. He said, "Do you want to hear 
the truth?"

"You can lie. Anyway, you are lying to yourself, not to me." Victor didn't save face for Anson at all.

He was willing to speak more when he was together with Anson.

If he was with Lucian, it was possible that they would not speak to each other for the whole day.

"Tsk, it is meaningless to chat with you." Anson glared at Victor.

He thought for a moment before he finally spoke the truth. "Victor, I feel that the four of us were 
lost all this while.



It is not easy for me to meet a woman that I like after so many years. However, the woman whom I 
like has a boyfriend.

Even if I am bold enough and have the courage to take the first step, she still has to be willing to 
give me a chance!"

He was afraid that his passion would cause him to be heartbroken in the end. Just like what Victor 
had said, he would not be able to take it if he let go of his pride.

"Hehe..." Victor rarely saw Anson that serious. He couldn't help but laughed.

Anson's mood worsened when he heard Victor's laughter!

He roared, "Victor, it's not easy for me to meet a woman that makes my heart flutter and whom I 
take seriously. How can you make fun of me?"

Victor stopped smiling when he heard that. "Anson, I laughed because you are serious.

You said that you fell in love with Abigail at first sight. You still have a chance. However, you 
douse your own enthusiasm before you even try.

How can you strive for happiness like this?"

He always knew what he wanted.

He never let himself get lost. Since he had made up his mind, he would have enough courage to 
persist.

He was now very close to the outcome.

"Hehe..." Anson was the one laughing this time.

He suddenly said confidently, "Victor, you finally speak human language. That's what I call a chat. I 
have become confident again after hearing what you said.



I've checked out Joziah. He's not any better than me."

At that moment, his eyes were clear and his lips were slightly curled into a smile. He was confident 
and determined.

Victor had been waiting for Eden for ten years. Anson should also persist and never give up.

"I wish you to get Abigail in advance!" Victor got up when he finished speaking. His black shadow 
enveloped Anson.

Anson looked at him. Victor's elegant and full lips curled into a faint smile and he looked extremely 
charming.

Unbelievable!

Anson nearly turned gay when he looked at Victor's handsome face.

Yuck!

How could he betray his feelings for Abby?

Victor said, "Throw the rubbish away. I'm going to the old mansion."

Anson stood up quickly when he heard that. "I'll go with you. I'm afraid that you will be eaten by 
that old witch!"

Victor frowned and was speechless.

Would she dare to do that?

Victor wanted to go back and get the video card.



"Victor, wait for me." Anson spoke as he quickly tidied up the table.

He would feel bored if he stayed alone at home.

He wanted to make his boring weekend a little more interesting by looking at Rebecca’s disgusting 
face.

Victor didn't say anything but just stood there and waited for him.

Anson was very fast. He followed Victor out after he finished tidying up everything.

In the meantime, Eden and her family had already finished lunch.

Eden did not go out. Instead, she tidied her things at home.

Zofia, Kenny and Gia also helped her out.

Jaida sent Zaiden out.

The two of them walked side by side. 

The surrounding grass gave off a unique fragrance that lingered around them.

Zaiden looked at Jaida with a gentle smile.

He asked, "Jaida, are you well prepared when you come back this time?"

Jaida stopped and looked at her house which was far away. She nodded with a smile and said, 
"Zaiden, I have enough courage to face the past. It's just that you have suffered a lot..."

"Jaida, I'm willing to do that. There's no suffering." Zaiden interrupted her.



If he had succeeded earlier and achieved what he had today, Jaida would not have suffered so much 
if she were married to him.

Her appearance is enough to make him rejoice for the rest of his life.

Jaida looked at him and smiled gratefully. "Zaiden, I am not thinking about other things at the 
moment. I am only worried about Eden and the children's safety.

I felt sad to see Eden living a hard life. I would not have been able to get out of the past so quickly 
if it weren't for Eden and her children the past seven years."

Zaiden understood her worries.

He turned back and glanced at the house across him and saw a silhouette that was busy on the 
balcony of the second floor.

"I also like Eden very much. It is rare to see hardworking and kind-hearted girls like Eden 
nowadays."

In fact, he already had a thought previously.

He would talk to Jaida about it today since he had the chance.

He deliberated for a while before he said, "Jaida, I have an idea. How about I recognize Eden as my 
daughter and let the media report it? No one would dare to bully my daughter."
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Jaida was quite surprised when she heard that. She said solemnly, "Zaiden, you can't joke about this 
matter. Eden was hurt by the Gienger family in the past."

Zaiden gave her a reassuring smile. "Jaida, do I look like I'm joking?"

Jaida couldn't help but smiled when she saw his expression. "Anyway, I will rely on Eden for the 
rest of my life."



"What about me?" Zaiden looked at her jealously.

Jaida's face turned red instantly. She looked at Zaiden and said, "There will be a share for you too."

No words could describe how excited Zaiden was when he heard Jaida’s words.

He took Jaida's hand excitedly and said, "Jaida, do you really mean it?"

He finally got what he wanted after waiting and protecting her for so many years.

He always believed that life was right as long as he made the choice of his own accord. Generally, 
some degree of sacrifice would usually be involved when one wanted to obtain something.

Everything that we had done would be repaid in another way.

Jaida nodded. Her heart ached for him when she saw that he was very excited.

He had suffered together with her all these years. 

"Zaiden, I'm sorry to keep you waiting all these years." She looked at him guiltily, tears welling up 
in her eyes.

Zaiden smiled gently and looked at her calmly. He said in a playful tone, "Jaida, you are only 
willing to marry me when I am old." However, he felt that his guardianship was worth it.

Jaida smiled bitterly but happily. "I also didn't expect that I would get into a second relationship."

Over the years, one of them was in pain while the other was standing guard.

Her life was a failure. She couldn't let Zaiden suffer with her for life.

Zaiden took out his phone quickly and flipped through the calendar.



Jaida looked at him and asked, "Why are you so excited?"

Zaiden looked at her mysteriously and did not speak. He continued to look at the calendar.

Suddenly, he said excitedly, "Jaida, today is a good day. Let's go and register for marriage. I'll give 
you an awesome wedding later."

Jaida said, "What?"

She was dumbfounded as she stared at the excited Zaiden.

She had only promised him to consider a while ago.

Zaiden didn't care about Jaida's expression. That was the first time she had expressed her feelings 
towards their relationship. If he didn't strike while the iron was hot, he would be devastated if Jaida 
regretted her decision a few days later.

He was an orphan since he was a child and he didn't have a family.

He turned to glance at Eden and smiled. Eden would always cause him to be in luck!

Today was the day!

He looked at Jaida and said excitedly, "Jaida, it's better to choose today than any other day. Anyway, 
today is a good day. I will recognize Eden as my daughter today. I will put the names of our whole 
family in the household register."

Jaida saw the sincere expression on his face. She knew what he had been anticipating all these 
years.

She said, "We still need Eden's consent." "Hehe..." Zaiden smiled wickedly. "Jaida, I bet you still 
don't know this! Eden has already sold you out long ago. She said that she will not oppose our 
relationship as long as you are happy!"



"That little girl..." Jaida's tone was doting but also delighted.

Zaiden pulled Jaida and headed back to the house.

He and Jaida seemed like they were in a relationship for the past few years. He did not regret 
spending time with her in his youth.

His life would be complete if he married her.

Eden was placing the plants that Anson had sent her on the flower stand on the balcony.

She was shocked when she looked down from the balcony.

She quickly put down the flowerpot in her hand and went to the side and looked down!

"Wow!" Zaiden was really fast. Did he finally win Jaida’s heart after pursuing her for so many 
years?

"Eden, come down!" Zaiden waved to Eden.

Eden pointed at herself and asked with a mysterious smile, "Uncle Calder, are you sure you want 
me to come down at this time?"

"What's there to be unsure about? Come down quickly. I have something to tell you." Zaiden 
shouted with a smile.

He looked like a young man who was in love. His smile was bright and tender, and he looked 
several years younger.

Eden smiled and went to wash her hands before she headed downstairs.

Kenny, Gia and Zofia were organizing things in the hall on the first floor.



Zaiden saw that Eden was coming down.

He asked with a smile, "Eden, are you willing to be my daughter?"

Eden was speechless.

She was surprised and looked at Zaiden in disbelief. She didn't expect he would say that to her.

He actually asked if she wanted to be his daughter.

"Wow!" Giada who was at the side was overjoyed. She really liked Zaida very much.

Kenneth stood at the side with no expression on his face. People would find that Eden was kind and 
considerate when they spend a lot of time with her!

Eden was stunned. She looked at Zaiden for a while before she looked at Jaida who was smiling at 
the side.

She said with a smile, "Uncle Calder, are you joking?" "Eden, do I seem like I'm joking?" Zaiden 
asked as he looked at Eden sincerely!

He had no children in his life and no one to inherit his hundreds million dollars of assets. He would 
have no regret If he could have Jaida and also a daughter like Eden by his side!

Zaiden continued when he saw that Eden still did not believe him, "Eden, we have known each 
other for seven years. You know my character. I don't have children. I would not have any regret in 
my life if I have a clever and kind daughter like you."

It was true that Eden knew Zaiden’s character very well.

He had been waiting for Jaida all his life.

It just so happened that Eden had a mother and was still short of a father!



She smiled and said, "Uncle Calder, I am willing to be your daughter. It happens that I am short of a 
father."

"Haha..." Zaiden laughed out loud happily.

Jaida also looked at Eden and smiled.

"Eden, well done! You have made your uncle's dream cometrue!"

Eden smiled and said, "Mom, you are the one who made Uncle Calder's dream come true. Uncle 
Calder has been guarding you all these years. You have made the best decision by figuring 
everything out and be with Uncle Calder!"

Jaida nodded. It was actually not that difficult to truly let go of everything and accept a new life!

She was too adamant previously!

"Eden, why are you still calling me uncle? You should call me dad from now onwards." Zaiden 
corrected Eden.

"Yes, Dad!" Eden compiled to his wishes and called out to him happily.

"Eden, Dad is here!" An indescribable excitement welled up in his heart when he heard Eden calling 
him Dad.

Eden's heart ached inexplicably for Zaiden after she called out to him!

Zaiden was an orphan. Eden had never called anyone father in her life nor had anyone ever called 
Zaiden father!

Chapter 310

Sometimes a person would wonder what fate had in store for him!



In the midst of a crowd of people, those who had no interaction with each other could actually 
become a happy family!

Giada ran over and said with a smile, "Grandpa, this is great. I will have Grandpa and Grandma 
when both of you are married. Grandpa, will you come to pick me up from school with Grandma?"

"Haha..." Zaiden laughed and rubbed Gia's head.

"Gia, yes! I will pick you up with your grandmother in the future." Zaiden's voice was loud and 
clear. He was extremely happy at the moment!

Zofia who was standing by the side, was envious of Eden when she looked at her warm family.

People who were kind were rewarded with sincerity!

Eden had obtained happiness due to her kindness!

Zaiden said, "Eden, go and find your household registration book."

Eden looked at him doubtfully. "Dad, are you going to register for marriage with Mom?" "Yes! And 
you and your three children too. From now onwards, we will have our family in one household 
registration book."

"Uh..." Eden was stunned. How much did he yearn for a home?

"Dad, will the Civil Affairs Bureau allow this?"

Zaiden glanced at her with a smile. "Eden, I'm Zaiden Calder. There's nothing that I can't do. You 
just need to take the household register and follow me!"

"But..." Eden glanced at Jaida with a hesitant look on her face.

"What is it? Do you want to go back on your words?" Zaiden was a little anxious.



He had known Eden for a few years and understood her character. She would not acknowledge him 
as her father because of money but because of his character!

Eden quickly smiled and shook her head. When she saw Zaiden’s anxious expression, she suddenly 
realized that he wanted a warm home just like she did many years ago!

"Dad, you haven't proposed to Mom. You don't even have a ring. That’s not okay. You can't just 
abduct my mom like that!"

Zaiden heaved a sigh of relief when he heard that.

"I thought there was something wrong. It is easy to solve the problem. I had bought a diamond ring

many years ago.

Let's register for marriage today. I'll give your mom a grand wedding after some time. Everything 
will be fine." 

She would not wrong Jaida because she was the woman he loved dearly.

He had a conscience and a kind and sincere heart!

He wasn't afraid that Jaida wouldn't love him!

He had been open and honest in front of her all these years!

Jaida looked at the affection in his eyes and smiled gently, "Zaiden, we don't need a wedding..."

"No way. Jaida, I'll give you a wedding of our own." Zaiden interrupted her, knowing what was on 
her mind.

"Okay! As you wish but the wedding has to wait a little longer!" Jaida looked at him sadly.



Zaiden understood what she meant. "Jaida, I understand!"

He would help her!

"Okay!" Jaida smiled faintly, She was relieved at the moment.

Zaiden looked at Eden and urged, "Eden, what are you doing here? Quickly go and get the 
household register. If we go there now, it's just in time for their noon shift." "Okay!" Eden smiled 
and turned to go upstairs!

Jaida looked at Zofia and said, "Zofia, stay at home with Gia and Kenny. Don't tidy up these things. 
You should rest more! I will pack them up when I get back later!"

"Okay!" Zofia smiled and nodded.

Kenny walked up to Jaida and said with a smile, "Grandma, Grandpa, congratulations!"

"Thank you, Kenny! You're the most obedient!" Zaiden smiled happily. He had two grandsons and 
one granddaughter. His life was complete!

Eden suddenly realized a problem when she came down with the household registration book.

"Dad, today is Saturday. No one seems to be working today!"

Zaiden shook his head with a smile and said, "Eden, I know that there are people working on 
Saturday but not on Sunday. For me, I could make it possible for them to work even though it is not 
a working day!"

Eden smiled and nodded. It was true indeed. A person with a status like Zaiden had all kinds of 
connections.

Zaiden couldn't wait any longer after that. He drove Eden and Jaida to the Civil Affairs Bureau!

Meanwhile, Victor and Anson arrived at the old mansion of the Alwynn family.



The whole family was in the old mansion.

Haven was there too.

The family was chatting and laughing but when they saw that Victor had come back, everyone 
except Phillip had a terrible expression on their faces.

"Victor, Anson, you're here," Phillip looked at both of them as he spoke.

He had never seen Victor ever since the previous incident.

"Hello, Uncle Alwynn!" Anson greeted him with a smile.

There was no expression on Victor's delicate face. He looked cold and arrogant. He went directly 
upstairs to his room without looking at anyone.

Anson did not follow him upstairs!

Rebecca looked at Victor's arrogant and cold back angrily. She couldn't wait to put him to death!

She had lost her post because of Victor. She was idle at home and had nothing to do at the moment.

Phillip who was stubborn, was determined to go against her this time!

Rebecca had coaxed him for several days but he never agreed to let her go back to work.

Imogen looked at Anson and smiled gently. 'Anson, come and have a seat!"

Anson nodded his head and raised the corner of his lips into a smile indifferently.

He walked to the sofa at the side and sat down!



Imogen carried the cut fruit and put it in front of Anson. She smiled and said, "Anson, eat some 
fruit!"

"Thank you!" Anson said politely and said anything else after that.

Vincent had been paying attention to Haven's expression. Haven who was initially happy, changed 
her expression when she saw Victor.

Vincent knew that Haven still had Victor in her heart.

Anyway, he and Victor were at loggerheads!

"Dad, Mom, I'm going out for a while. I have an appointment with a friend!" He stood up and was 
about to leave as he spoke.

Phillip's eyebrows furrowed slightly as he looked at him coldly. He reprimanded, "Where are you 
going? Didn't you promise Haven to have dinner with her tonight?"

Vincent glanced sideways at Haven who seemed to be distracted. He sneered and said, "I'm afraid 
she does not have the mood to eat with me even though

I want to treat her to a meal!"

His words were a little sarcastic!

After all, he was going to be engaged to her soon!

There wasn't much affection between husbands and wives in aristocratic families like them.

However, Vincent felt that his dignity was trampled when the woman who belonged to her was 
thinking of another man.



When Haven heard that, she quickly came to his senses and looked at Vincent with a frown. She 
smiled and said, "Vincent, you were still fine just now. What happened to you suddenly?"

Rebecca glanced at Haven sharply when she heard that. How did Haven have the nerve to ask that?
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