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Victor still cared about the things that were related to Eden.

Victor's heart was heavy as he walked back home. Jasper's words echoed in his mind throughout the 
journey.

He saw a black Audi parked at his gate when he reached the villa.

A lonely figure was leaning against the car and he was covered in smoke under the dim streetlights.

Victor looked at the figure and realized that it was Buddy.

Victor composed himself and walked towards Buddy with the usual expression on his face. The 
closer he got to Buddy, the more he sensed the sadness emanating from him.

"Buddy, what's the matter?" His tone was indifferent as usual.

Buddy lifted his head and glanced at him. He put out the cigarette in his hand before he looked at 
Victor and said, "Victor, I saw Zofia having dinner with you tonight. Do you know Zofia?"

Victor glanced at Buddy. He slowly withdrew his gaze from him and said faintly, "She is Eden's 
friend.

We met and had a meal together."

Buddy nodded his head with no expression on his face. His eyes were hollow and there was a hint 
of pain in them.

"Is she doing fine?"

"She is doing fine!" Victor replied indifferently.



Victor felt uncomfortable when he saw Buddy's painful expression.

Buddy was infatuated with Zofia but he was powerless to do anything.

He did not have the courage to fight Aisling no matter how infatuated he was.

Victor raised his eyes and said, "Buddy, we grew up together. Do you really want to let go of your 
own happiness like this?"

Buddy who had a noble and cold expression on his face, suddenly fell into a trance. "No, but my 
mother' s attitude is firm. Besides, she bought a piece of land near Upper East Sleglund recently. We 
are very busy every day. I will bring up the matter about splitting up the family assets and living 
separately after this..."

"Splitting up the family assets?" Victor suddenly interrupted him with a sneer.

"Yes!" Buddy nodded heavily and his gaze was filled with determination. That was the plan he had 
come up with. He could only be with Zofia this way.

Victor's handsome face turned cold suddenly. "Buddy, it's impossible for you to split up with your 
family. Besides, Zofia may not even agree to get back with you."

"Why?" Buddy looked at him doubtfully.

Victor said ironically, "Buddy, since you can't protect her, don't cause trouble for her. Don’t you 
know your mother and sister’s characters?"

Victor glanced at him deeply and didn't say anything more. After that, he turned around and left.

People who had emotions would never forget about Haven's insult and Aisling’s hurtful words for 
the rest of their lives!

Buddy looked at Victor's arrogant back and frowned. "My mother and sister?"



He quickly caught up with Victor, stopped him, and asked hurriedly, "Victor, what did you mean 
just now? Did you see or hear something?"

"Get out of the way!" Victor looked at him coldly.

He had no right to talk about Buddy's affairs. He was in a mess himself!

"Victor, we grew up together and would probably become a family if Eden is alive. Don't you want 
to see me happy?" Buddy looked at Victor agitatedly. 

Victor pursed his lips slightly and said, "Buddy, Eden is still alive. Why do all of you think that she 
is dead? Do you know how hurtful she will be if she hears these words?"

"I..." Buddy choked for a moment. "But Victor, it's been so many years..."

"You should not give up no matter how many years have passed, should you?" Victor interrupted 
him angrily again.

"Also, Buddy, you need to fight for your own happiness. Remember the people who make you gasp 
in pain. They would either teach you how to endure or become cruel."

After that, Victor walked past Buddy and strode away.

Buddy was not like him. It would be hard for him to start over again if he left the Clement family!

Aisling would never compromise because she wanted Buddy to be married to a woman from a great 
aristocratic family!

Victor had witnessed Aisling’s stubbornness.

Buddy watched Victor's departing back with a painful and agitated expression on his face.



After some time, he dragged his stiff feet and got in the car. He smoked another cigarette in 
irritation and drove away!

D*mned it. Why did things turn out like this?

Buddy pressed his lips together painfully and drove at a very fast speed.

A long sound of the car horn could be heard at the wide street...

It cut through the lonely night sky!

A faint starlight could be seen in the lonely starry sky!

Eden arrived at the office on time the next morning!

Amelia had already prepared the materials for the meeting!

Amelia looked at the soft and beautiful Eden, and walked over with a smile. She said, "Director 
Bleu, good morning. These are the materials for today's meeting!"

Eden looked at her and smiled. "Thank you, Amelia. Let's attend the meeting."

"Okay! Director Bleu, Secretary Ronen said that Mr. Alwynn has a routine meeting today. We have 
to go to the general meeting room after the department meeting." Amelia smiled as she spoke. She 
didn't feel too much pressure working with Eden.

"Okay!" Both of them took the elevator and went down to attend the meeting.

Victor and Anson came to the company very early today. They were even earlier than Eden.

They sat down and chatted in the office.



Victor glanced at Anson, who was browsing his WhatsApp and said unhappily, Anson, how many 
times do you look at Abigail's page every day? You do that from night to midnight. You are still 
doing that in the office."

Anson who was busy, raised his head and glanced at Victor. He did not get angry. He pointed at 
Abigail's page and said with a smile, "Victor, don't you want to see Ricky's photos? Look at your 
son. He's so handsome."

Victor glanced at Anson's phone when he heard that.

The corners of his lips curled into a faint smile when he saw Ricky's handsome face.

"Of course. He is my son." Victor's face was filled with pride.

Anson glared at him and mocked, "Victor, are you sure you want to be arrogant in front of a single 
person like me?"

Victor smiled proudly, raised his eyebrows and said, "Anson, this is the capital for my pride!"

"Fine. You have the capital and you can be arrogant!" Anson could not refute him. Victor indeed 
had the right to be arrogant at the moment.

Victor thought for a moment and said, "Anson, the Clement family is focusing on real estate at the 
moment. Go and investigate the land they are selling in Upper East Sleglund.

Upper East Sleglund is Zaiden's territory. He would not wait for others to buy the lands that are 
profitable."
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Anson frowned suddenly and asked seriously, "Upper East Sleglund?"

"Yes!" Victor nodded.



Anson took a deep breath, thought for a moment, and said, "Didn't we bid for the place before? We 
felt like we could make money so we gave up in the end. What is the Clement family thinking of 
buying land over there?"

Victor shook his head slightly and his eyes were cold. "I don't know. I heard it from Buddy last 
night."

"Err..." Anson's brows furrowed.

"Could it be that Mrs. Clement insisted on buying it?" Anson knew that Aisling had been working 
very hard the past few years.

"I don't know. That's why I asked you to check." Victor spoke as he returned to his office chair. He 
turned on the computer and prepared for today's regular meeting.

"Alas!" Anson threw the phone on the sofa before he leaned on the sofa lazily. He looked at Victor's 
charming face.

"The Clement family runs quite a lot of industries. They probably have to use up at least half of 
their assets to buy a piece of land in the Upper East Sleglund."

Victor shook his head slightly and said in an indifferent tone, "They have to use up all of their 
assets."

"Ah..." Anson's eyes widened slightly.

"What if their assessment is wrong? Wouldn't they go bankrupt then?" Anson's voice grew louder 
and louder.

"Don't jinx it!" Victor glared at him.

Anson quickly smacked his mouth several times.

"That's right, I take back my words! My bad for saying such ominous things. However, the price of 
the land in Upper East Sleglund is really expensive."



Victor did not speak and his eyes were focused on the computer.

When Anson saw that, he knew that the boring Victor didn't want to talk to him anymore. He simply 
shut up and went back to his office to prepare for the morning meeting!

Eden felt very busy because she had been attending meetings the whole morning.

She went to the company canteen with Amelia during lunchtime. 

As they were going downstairs, Victor, Anson and

Lucian also headed downstairs to eat.

Anson glanced at Eden's back and then at Victor. Victor had really distanced himself from Eden for 
the sake of her safety.

He smiled suddenly and asked, "Victor, shall we go to the company canteen for lunch or..."

"Canteen!" Victor interrupted him with a poker face.

His long legs had already stepped into the elevator. The elevator reflected his noble figure and he 
had a thoughtful expression on his handsome face.

Anson and Lucian quickly glanced at each other.

"Hehe..." Anson let out a few hollow laughs.

"Victor, I remember the last time that you went to the cafeteria to eat was half a year ago." Eden 
was indeed charming!

The whole canteen was going to burst into an uproar when they saw Victor!



That was great. Anson would have to mingle in the canteen too.

He had been living a luxurious life with Victor.

He hadn't been to the canteen for a long time!

On the contrary, the gentle and cold Lucian, who was standing beside him, would eat at the canteen 
almost every day!

If Anson had a girlfriend like Abigail, he would definitely work hard to earn money and let her live 
a luxurious life.

Unfortunately, Abigail did not reply to his message.

Abigail had not responded to his messages the past few days.

On second thoughts, Abigail shouldn't have rejected him judging from her character.

Was he too sensitive? He somehow felt that Abigail was unhappy the past few days!

"Anson, we're here. Are you having fantasies about love? Or are you missing the big stupid bear on 
your sofa?" Lucian spoke in a calm voice.

"Uh...?"

Anson frowned and said, "Lucian, do you know the meaning behind that big bear? That's my 
partner. It's a special gift from Victor. I feel like I have a companion when he sleeps beside me at 
night." It would be great if the person lying next to him was Abigail.

As he spoke, he stepped out of the elevator and headed to the entrance of the cafeteria.

Victor, Anson and Lucian walked very fast and they were soon behind Eden and Amelia.



Eden felt a gust of wind coming from the side the moment she crossed the doorway.

She looked sideways and saw that Haven was standing not far away.

Amber from the planning department was walking towards her.

Amber had a big glass of mango juice in her hand.

Eden's heart trembled when the familiar scent enveloped her nostrils.

Amber was getting closer and closer to her. She leaned forward suddenly after taking a few steps 
and the big cup of mango juice flew towards Eden.

Eden's throat tightened and her heart was about to jump out of her throat.

She was terrified when she watched the yellow juice splashed towards her. She was most terrified to 
go through the allergy process!

"Ah..." Amber shouted suddenly and fell to the ground.

Eden's red lips parted slightly and her face had already turned pale due to fear.

Haven was standing not far away and a trace of viciousness flashed across her eyes when she saw 
that!

Eden wanted to dodge the mango juice. She was about to move her feet when someone embraced 
her.

"Splash..."

All the mango juice was splashed on Victor's head and back. The strong mango scent lingered 
between him and Eden.



The noisy canteen became quiet instantly when the people saw what had happened. The spacious 
hall was so quiet that even a pin drop could be heard.

Everyone held their breath and looked at Victor and Eden. Some people watched with their mouths 
agape.

Amber who was lying on the ground, was one of them

Haven, who was not far away, also had the same expression!

Eden turned around slowly and her frightened gaze suddenly plunged into Victor's worried eyes.

Eden looked up subconsciously. She saw the yellow juice dripping down from Victor’s head to his 
toes. Some of the juice was dripping in front of her.

Eden's heart was quivering. She was afraid of allergy her whole life. Her body trembled 
involuntarily at the moment.

Victor reacted quickly. He let go of her and stepped aside!

Anson's mouth was wide open at the moment!

What kind of dramatic plot was this? It would definitely cause a stir.

It seemed that he was really a jinx.

That was the first time Victor was so wretched.

In front of so many people still!

"Eden, are you okay?" Victor felt distressed when he looked at Eden's pale face.

Eden shook her head quickly. She took a few steps back involuntarily.



Her body was still trembling slightly at a closer look.

"Thank you!" Her voice trembled a little.

She hated mango juice very much. She still had lingering fears when she smelled the scent of 
mangoes.

Her life was fine before Myra knew that she was allergic to mangoes.

However, ever since Myra found out about this, she would think of ways to splash mango juice on 
her whenever she was unhappy.

Moreover, Eden was always caught off guard and could do nothing about it!

Haven squinted her eyes and looked at Victor who was drenched. He could actually do that for 
Eden!
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Victor was really a great person.

Victor turned and glanced at Amber who had already got up from the ground. He had a grim 
expression on his face!

Amber did not expect that Victor would suddenly show up.

Her face was pale and she could even feel that the flesh on her cheeks were trembling.

"Mr... Mr. Alwynn, I'm sorry. I, I didn't mean it. I slipped accidentally." She mumbled and her voice 
was trembling uncontrollably.

The light of the incandescent lamp fell on Victor's delicate side face, showing a dark storm on his 
handsome face.



He said word by word with a sneer, "You didn't mean it but you did it on purpose."

"No, that’s not true." Amber shook her head quickly.

"Humph!" Victor snorted and glanced at Haven, who was standing not far away.

Haven was stunned when she met Victor’s gaze suddenly. Why did Victor look at her in such a 
way?

Eden who had calmed down, came back to her

senses suddenly. She also looked at Haven coldly.

She instantly recalled the conversation between Myra and Haven at the fire exit previously.

Myra had been dismissed but it seemed like Haven still remembered it.

Amber had always had issues with Eden.

Victor roared furiously, "Anson, bring Amber to the personnel department and settle her salary."

He was very furious and was on the verge of breaking down!

"Okay!" Anson came back to his senses instantly and kept nodding his head.

He looked at Amber coldly. "Miss Rivera, let's go!" His voice was so cold as though he was 
announcing a death sentence!

Amber almost fell to her knees at that moment.

"No, Mr. Alwynn, I really didn't mean it. I accidentally slipped. I didn't know that Mr. Alwynn 
would show up here.



Mr. Alwynn, please don't kick me out. I really didn't mean it." Amber put down her pride and 
begged Victor in public.

The salary of the Alwynn Group was the highest in River City. Those who went to work in other 
company after they were fired by the Alwynn Group would be criticized by others. Amber would 
receive even more criticisms if other people knew that she was dismissed because of this kind of 
trivial matter!

Victor sneered wickedly, "I'm afraid you would not have the mango juice in your hand if you knew I 
would show up here. There are so many people in the hall but you tried to splash it on Director 
Bleu."

"I..."

Amber quickly glanced at Haven, who was not far away.

Haven was the one who told her that Eden was allergic to mango juice. Amber couldn't help but 
thought of the rumors recently and the relationship between Eden and Victor.

She was more beautiful and more capable than Eden. However, she never had a chance to get 
promoted and couldn't get Victor's attention too.

She wanted to teach Eden a lesson after Haven told her that Eden was allergic to mango juice.

She did not expect that Victor who rarely ate at the canteen, would miraculously show up here 
today.

Victor followed her gaze and glanced at Haven.

It was obvious that Victor would not let go of the matter easily, judging from his angry eyes!

"Get lost!" He roared angrily and did not give Amber the chance to speak at all.

Anson shrank his shoulders when he heard Victor's angry roar.



"Miss Rivera, you'd better leave quickly. I'll call the security guard if you don't leave." He warned 
coldly.

These people were bold. They would not get into trouble if they didn't look for trouble!

Anson wondered who came up with this phrase. It just made so much sense!

Lucian who was standing at the side, fixed his gaze on the slender Eden.

Eden looked calm and acted as if nothing had happened.

Amber glanced at Haven in resentment. Why did Haven tell her that on purpose?

Amber suddenly felt as if she had been used by Haven.

Tears rolled down her cheeks silently. She lowered her head and followed Anson out under 
everyone else's gaze.

Eden closed her eyes slightly. What the hell was going on?

She walked towards Victor. Victor suddenly roared angrily in the canteen, "Mango juice is not 
allowed here from now onwards!"

The chef who was standing not far away, came out. 

He nodded and bowed as he spoke, "Yes, Mr. Alwynn. I'll ask someone to put the mango jucie away 
immediately!"

After that, he turned around and asked someone to deal with the matter!

Victor looked at the crowd coldly.



The crowd came back to their senses instantly when they met Victor’s gaze. They headed for their 
tables with their food and dared not continue to watch the drama!

Lucian said, "I'll go to eat first. You can go back to the office and wash up. There are spare clothes 
in the room!"

Lucian left without looking back after he had finished speaking.

Eden looked at Victor gratefully.

"Mr. Alwynn, thank you so much just now!"

Her heart was in chaos and she was completely dumbfounded when she saw the mango juice that 
was directed towards her.

Victor shook his head slightly and said softly, "Eden, I'm fine. You can go and eat first."

Victor turned around and left after that.

"Victor." Haven chased after him.

Victor ignored her and strode forward.

Haven chased after them for a few steps and stopped. Victor was angry at the moment and he was 
capable of doing anything.

Haven turned around and glanced at Eden, who was still in shock. The corners of her mouth curled 
into a mocking smile.

"Director Bleu, I didn't expect Victor to do such a thing for you! Victor has never let any woman get 
close to him." Her voice was so loud that it gave a faint echo in the canteen.

"Everyone looked curiously at Haven again. Some girls who were in love with Victor were looking 
at Eden with hostility.



Eden looked at her coldly. "Miss Clement, today's show is great. I'm looking forward to your next 
show." She spoke with a hidden meaning and glanced at Amelia.

Eden and Amelia went to the area that sold vegetables.

Haven stood at the same spot and her face turned pale suddenly.

What did Eden mean by that?

Lucian who happened to return with a plate of food, heard Eden's words.

He glanced indifferently at Haven and sat down to eat his food.

People could tell that he had chosen a unique and irreplaceable life for himself from his every 
move!

Haven had embarrassed herself. She walked towards the area that sold vegetables silently.

However, deep down, she was furious. She could not understand why Eden was so lucky that she 
could escape every time!

As for Eden, she simply ate something. She took two lunch boxes and packed Victor's favorite 
dishes. She left the canteen after bidding goodbye to Amelia.

Lucian's warm and beautiful eyes became deep as he looked at the food in Eden's hands when she 
walked past him. He only withdrew his gaze when Eden was out of his sight.

He looked down at his plate and saw himself through the reflection. He had a dark expression on his 
face.
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Eden carried the lunch boxes and headed to Victor's office.



She was very grateful to him for what had happened today. If he had not protected her, she would be 
lying in the hospital in pain at the moment.

However, she hesitated when she reached the door of Victor's office.

She stood still for three full minutes before she helplessly shook off all the bad thoughts.

She raised her hand and knocked on the office door.

"Come in!" The voice was hoarse and alluring.

For some reasons, Eden became anxious when she heard the voice.

She pushed the door open and went in, only to see Victor coming out of the shower.

He hadn't buttoned up the expensive tailored shirt he was wearing.

His sturdy chest was revealed and his slightly dripping hair caused him to exude an attractive and 
charming aura.

Eden's beautiful eyes widened and she quickly turned around.

Victor looked at her nervous back and smiled evilly.

He buttoned his shirt as he walked towards her. However, he did not button the first two buttons on 
purpose.

A refreshing breath enveloped Eden instantly.

Eden became nervous instantly. She took a few steps forward and Victor followed her with a wicked 
smile on his face.

It seemed that he didn't want her to escape and wanted to let her feel his breath.



Eden blinked. She was here to deliver food to him. What was she nervous about?

She turned around quickly. A dark shadow enveloped her and she was greeted by an imposing aura.

The next thing she knew, her forehead bumped on Victor's slightly cold chest.

"Ah..." She was stunned for a moment and she took a few steps back.

When Victor saw that, he quickly stretched out his long arms, held her slender waist and pulled her 
back into an embrace.

The gentle bump of her forehead made Victor's heart skip a beat and passion surged through his 
heart. He was deeply attached to the gentle and tender Eden in his arms.

"Hehe..." Victor's pleasant laugh echoed in Eden's ears.

"Silly, what are you nervous about? I don't bite!"

Eden looked up suddenly and glared at him angrily. "Victor, who is nervous?"

Victor looked at her feisty behavior and the smile on his face broadened.

He rubbed his chin gently with his long and slender hand and his gently gaze was fixed on her 
angry face. Her pink lips were shiny and her fair and small white face was blushing. There were 
mixed emotions on her face and she looked stunning.

He lowered his head slightly and his lips were very close to her earlobes. He said in a wicked but 
charming voice, "Eden, could it be that I saw it wrongly? You are not nervous but you want to 
throw yourself at me?"

Eden looked at him angrily. She was slightly stunned when she saw the burning passion in his eyes. 
She pushed him away quickly and instantly took three steps away from him.



A sense of disappointment surged through Victor's heart.

"Victor, what are you thinking? Do all men only have dirty thoughts when they meet women?" She 
wanted to place her hands on her hips to appear more

imposing.

However, she realized that she still had the lunch boxes in her hands when she moved her hands.

Victor was about to speak when he saw Eden walk past him.

She placed the lunch boxes heavily on the table.

She looked back at him and said, "Victor, I am really grateful that you helped me just now. I have 
brought you lunch. You can eat your food! We no longer owe each other anything after this."

"Don't owe each other anything?" Victor looked at her deeply with a mysterious smile on his face.

He and Eden were destined to be involved with each other since birth.

"Courtesy!" Eden suddenly looked at him warily.

She knew his temper. He would not be Victor if he did not take the opportunity to come up with 
more terms.

Victor squinted at her and said, "Eden, this is not good enough. Accompany me to dinner tonight."

Eden was amused that she actually predicted that Victor would not let go of the opportunity so 
easily.

She raised her eyebrows and looked at him apologetically. "Mr. Alwynn, I have an appointment 
tonight!"



"With whom?" Victor asked almost instantly.

"My son and daughter."

Victor was speechless!

Victor took advantage of the situation and said, "I'm going too!"

Eden took a step back when she heard that.

She looked at Victor's deep and cold eyes and couldn't figure out what he really wanted. She felt as 
if she was looking at the stars that couldn't be reached by her.

Victor met her gaze and his eyes were burning with passion.

Eden immediately came to her senses the moment Victor changed his expression. "Why do you 
want to go?"

"To accompany you guys." Victor spoke with a matter-of-fact expression on his face.

"No. Who wants your company?"

In fact, Eden didn't have an appointment.

She had to go to Upper East Sleglund to help Zofia clean up the store after work.

They had roughly sorted the things in the store yesterday but they still needed to go there again to 
sort things out.

"I'm going!" Victor looked at Eden stubbornly, as though he had to go there.

"Alright, you can follow me after work!" A hint of cunning flashed across Eden's eyes.



Eden would let him go since he wanted that. She was initially worried about the lack of labor.

"Okay!" Victor glanced at her quietly before he turned around and went to eat.

He smiled faintly when he opened the lunch boxes and saw that it was his favorite dishes. There 
was an obsession at the bottom of his eyes.

"Eden, have you eaten yet?" He asked.

"I've eaten. I'll return to the office first. You can eat slowly!" Eden glanced at him before she turned 
around and left!

She had wanted to ask Victor about the incident a while ago!

She thought about it for a moment but the words still couldn't come out of her mouth.

Victor was also a discerning person. He could tell right from wrong!

His fast and vigorous tactics were similar to what was rumored.

"Victor, I asked Amber the reason she tried to splash the mango juice on Eden. She said Haven told 
her that Eden is allergic to mango juice!

She was indeed vicious. She brought trouble to herself but she did not forget to drag Haven down 
with her."

Anson mumbled to himself as he walked in with his head lowered. He saw that Eden was also here 
when he looked up.

His face turned pale instantly as though he had seen a ghost.

"Eden... Director, you... Why are you here?" Anson had difficulty in speaking.



He looked at Victor quickly and realized that Victor was staring at him coldly and sharply. Victor’s 
gaze was terrifying.

Anson shrank his shoulders instantly.

Why couldn't he keep his mouth shut?

Victor cursed in his heart, "Shut up!"

"Hehe..." Eden could not help but laugh when she saw Anson's behavior. That was the first time she 
had seen Anson embarrassed.

"Hehe..." Anson also laughed along with her.
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"Director Bleu, you didn't hear anything just now, did you?" Anson prayed that Eden did not hear 
what he said a while ago.

"Hehe..." Eden smiled mischievously and played along with him.

"Sorry, Manager Skye. I heard it very clearly!"

"Uh..." Anson crouched down and squatted slightly, causing him to look shorter. The fearful 
expression on his face was a little comical!

Why did he feel like there was a storm above his head?

He swallowed a mouthful of saliva and took a deep breath. After that, he smiled at Eden and said, 
"Director Bleu, you should forget what I said just now. Just assume that the spring breeze blew 
everything away!"

Why was Eden here?

Shouldn't she be eating in the canteen at the moment?



Anson was secretly crying in his heart.

Why was he always so unlucky?

Eden smiled at him and teased, "Manager Skye, a wildfire cannot burn the grass completely. When 
the spring breeze blows, everything, including the grass will grow again. How can the breeze blow 
away what someone has heard?"

Eden had known for long that Haven was up to no good.

Amber could only blame herself for being used by Haven.

Frankly speaking, Eden had not wronged Haven in any way.

However, Haven had used such despicable means on her.

Moreover, she did it at the canteen of the Alwynn Group!

It was not Eden’s fault that she was close to Victor.

She and Victor worked in the same company. It was impossible for them not to have any interaction.

"Hehe..." Anson smiled bitterly. "Director Bleu, you are really good at joking."

Eden smiled and said, "Manager Skye, don't worry. I won't take it to heart."

"That's great!" Anson really hoped that she would not take it to heart.

Haven was very vicious but Eden was innocent. He was worried that Eden would be bullied.

Eden would have thought that Anson's thoughts were ridiculous if she knew what he was thinking at 
the moment.



She was not innocent even though she looked innocent.

She smiled and said, "You guys can continue to chat with each other. I'm going back to my office to 
work."

Eden was about to leave when Anson suddenly called out to her.

"Director Bleu, the international clothing exhibition will be held tomorrow. As the design director 
of our company, it would be great for you to go there and learn something. It will last a total of 
three days. I have already prepared your hotel and flight tickets. Lucian will send them over to you 
later."

Eden suddenly turned around excitedly and looked at Anson.

"Wow! Manager Skye, you're very efficient. I almost forgot about that. I really wouldn't have 
remembered that if you hadn't mentioned it today."

Anson tugged the corner of his lips with difficulty. Even though he was very efficient and had 
served many people, he was still an incompetent person to Victor!

However, Anson had thought it through and planned everything this time!

He had specially made arrangements for Eden and Victor!

"Thank you for your compliment, Director Bleu. You are the first person to praise me." His smile 
was unnatural but confident.

Eden smiled gratefully and said, "Thank you, Manager Skye. I'll leave first." Eden had always 
wanted to attend the exhibition. Since she had the opportunity to attend it now, she would not refuse 
it.

"Okay!" Anson nodded his head. 

Anson suddenly realized that the atmosphere in the office had become depressing after Eden left.



He looked at Victor and saw that he was holding the chopsticks in his hand. His face was cold and 
his eyes were dark. There was a hint of anger in his eyes, causing him to look terrifying!

Anson glared at him and chided loudly, "Victor, what are you looking at? My face is well defined 
and I'm indeed a handsome man. However, I can't stand your burning gaze. I'm not gay."

Victor drew in a deep breath instantly!

He was shocked and the chopsticks in his hand almost fell to the ground!

Anson's shocking words made him feel as if there was a muffled thunder floating above his head.

Victor looked at Anson and said word by word, "Anson, you are really disgusting!"

Anson chuckled. "Victor, I never thought I could disgust you once in my life. If you think it’s 
disgusting, so be it! Anyway, I don't think that it's disgusting,

Besides, am I to blame for what happened just now? How would I know Eden would show up here 
at this time?"

"Can't you control your mouth?" Victor looked at him with a sneer.

A hint of guilt flashed across Anson's eyes but he still looked arrogant. "Victor, you can't say that. 
Didn’ 11 keep all your secrets? Anyway, Eden will see through it sooner or later.

It's good she heard that. At least she would be wary of Haven from now onwards."

Victor frowned slightly. He felt that he had not protected Eden well.

He felt that he was to blame when Eden was always bullied by other people!

"What do you plan to do with Haven? Judging from your relationship with the Clement family, it 
would be a big slap in the face to the Clement family if you fire Haven suddenly."



He was very clear about Victor's relationship with the Clement family.

Victor said, "She has bad thoughts but she doesn't have the guts to do bad things. You should pay 
more attention to her these days. You are better than anyone else to catch people's weakness. Don't 
let me down.

You have to specially pay attention to the places Eden visits. You must ensure that Eden can return 
in one piece in whatever the situation!"

"Alas! Of course I will do that. You are the typical culprit. These women fight for you and turn 
against each other because of you. However, you will always be the one to escape unscathed.

The person you pay attention to is innocent but he is sinful to others! There's no way he can fight 
the public opinion!"

Anson looked at him meaningfully after he had finished speaking.

Victor tugged the corner of his lips. He lowered his head slightly and his long eyelashes fluttered 
slightly. He did not deny what Anson had said.

He felt that his whole body was in pain when he thought of the damage that Eden had suffered.

Victor suddenly said angrily, "Buy a large number of the Gienger family's stocks. Eden's sudden 
disappearance at that time has something to do

with the Gienger family."

Anson leaned on the sofa lazily and rested his head on his hands. He said in discomfort, "There's no 
problem purchasing their shares but it is not easy to find out what happened back then. A heavy rain 
would have washed away all the evidence at the scene.

Moreover, it is a fact that Cyan does not have an adoption record in the orphanage. We would not 
know the whole story unless the people in the Gienger family take the initiative to reveal what 
happened back then."



Victor glanced at Anson in admiration and said, "Anson, not bad. You're getting smarter."

Anson said mockingly, "Thank you for your compliments, Mr. Alwynn!" He didn't want to waste 
his effort to investigate this matter.

Besides, he could not find out what had happened! It would be extremely difficult to investigate the 
matter. He didn't want to find trouble for himself.

The only way was to let the people of the Gienger family speak on their own. It would be easier this 
way.
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"But..." Anson sat up straight and said, "Victor, Eden is also buying the Gienger family’s shares. It 
seems that she also wants to figure out her background and find her biological parents.

Jasper is also secretly helping her to look for her parents!"

"Yes!" Victor nodded. "I have met up with Jasper and we have talked about this matter. He also 
knows that I am investigating Eden. However, before that, we need to find out what happened to 
Eden that year.

We had spent a lot of money and manpower back then but we still couldn't find Eden.

The only possibility for the failure to find Eden is that she was taken to a very far place by the 
Gienger family. Go and investigate this matter. You can put other things aside first!" 

Anson had a bitter expression on his face when he heard that.

He said seriously, "Victor, how about I open an investigation agency and you invest in it?"

There was a pin-drop silence in the office suddenly.

Victor looked at Anson coldly. His thin lips curved



into a beautiful but cold arc.

"Are you unwilling to do that?" Anson was creeped out by Victor's words.

Anson sat up quickly and looked at Victor who had a cold expression on his face. He really wanted 
to slap Victor!

"Victor, are you threatening me?" Anson was angry. He had the ability to investigate various 
matters. What's wrong with opening an investigation agency?

"Get out! Go and investigate immediately! Don't piss me off here and don't come back to me." 
Victor glared at him.

Anson had a pained expression on his face. "Victor, I'm nearly tortured to death by you when I'm 
with you. Feed me first before you ask me to do something for you.

I don't have the strength to investigate when I’m hungry."

As Anson spoke, he snatched the chopsticks from Victor’s hand and opened the lunch box that Eden 
had brought over. He started to gorge the food without even paying attention to Victor's expression.

When Victor saw that, he became so angry that he wanted to take the food from the lunch box and 
hit Anson's head. Eden had prepared the food for him!

Furthermore, he had already taken a few bites of the food. Anson really didn't mind that. He picked 
up the food and started eating it!

Victor was still hungry.

"Anson, aren't you embarrassed?" He shouted angrily with a sullen expression on his face. His 
imposing aura penetrated Anson's heart.

Anson was startled. He swallowed the food in his mouth and suddenly regretted acting impulsively.



He might be dead because of his impulse.

How could he forget that he was dealing with Victor?

He looked at him with anger. A hint of wickedness flashed across his eyes as he tried to divert 
Victor's thoughts.

"By the way, I have arranged the hotel for you tomorrow. Your room is next to Eden's. It's by the 
beach of Fralstin and it's very close to the exhibition. A cold person like you should grasp the 
opportunity and be more romantic.

Don't scare the girl away!"

Victor still looked at Anson with a grim expression on his face. His sharp gaze could pierce through 
Anson.

Anson could feel a stabbing pain all over his body!

"Alas! You're really stingy. What's wrong with me taking two bites of your food?" Anson was so 
angry that he almost threw his chopsticks and left.

However, he knew very well that he would not be able to enter the office tomorrow if he did that.

He could only bear with it when he thought about his shares.

He had done so many things for Victor after all. Didn' t Victor feel guilty at all?

On second thought, Victor nearly slapped him in the face.

He was Victor after all. How could Anson expect Victor to be grateful to him?

Mixed emotions surged through Anson's heart instantly.



Victor got up and walked to his desk. He spoke in a low voice, "Go back and eat at your desk! Don't 
get in my way here!"

Anson didn't hold back at all when he heard that. He picked up the lunch box and headed for the 
other desk not far away.

"Humph! How could I eat in front of you when you have such a dark face!" Anson spoke angrily as 
he walked.

Victor frowned slightly and pressed the intercom.

"Lucian, I need a cup of coffee without sugar!"

"I'll send it over right away!"

Victor frowned. Among the four of them, it was enough for them to have someone as boring as him. 
However, it just so happened that Lucian was also such a person.

"Alas!" Victor sighed before he turned on his computer and started working.

He had accumulated a lot of work because he was not here for two whole days.

He felt tired when he thought about it.

It seemed that he could start training his successors after bringing Eden and Kenny home.

He could spend time and accompany Eden then.

Victor thought about it happily.

After a while, Lucian came in with a cup of coffee. He did not have any expression on his 
handsome face.



He placed the coffee in front of Victor elegantly.

Victor looked up and glanced at him. He asked, "Anson told me that you have been investigating 
the person who had secretly helped us. Have you found him?"

"No." Lucian replied indifferently.

"You can't even find his address?" Victor was confused. Lucian had been specially trained.

However, he could not even find the person's address. It was obvious that the person's skill had 
surpassed Lucian's.

Lucian spoke casually when Victor picked up his coffee, "I've found an address. It's abroad but it 
may be fake. However, the address for the virus attack on the newspaper company is the same 
address as Eden's house."

Victor spat out the coffee that he just drunk because he was startled by Lucian's last sentence.

"Cough..." Victor who had never lost his composure, had an awful expression on his face at the 
moment.

He put the porcelain cup on the desk heavily.

He looked up at Lucian and asked word by word, "Lucian, tell me again, what is the address?"

Lucian remained expressionless as he said, "It’s Eden's house."

"Are you sure?" Victor suddenly became slightly unsettled.

Eden had already arrived at the company at that time. Besides, her computer skills were not superior 
to Lucian!



Lucian narrowed his eyes slightly and said, "I also find it strange! I met someone when I was 
reading at the bookstore yesterday." "Who?" Victor was very curious at the moment.

Lucian had the same way of speaking as him. Both them liked to leave a cliff-hanger.

Victor wanted to punch Lucian for giving him a cliffhanger at the moment. Couldn't Lucian finish 
his sentence once and for all?

"Eden's son."

"Uh..." Victor was confused.

Why was his son involved?

"Which one?" Victor couldn't help but ask.

"I couldn't tell." Lucian replied honestly.

Victor resisted the urge to get angry. He remembered that Gia and Kenny went to the bookstore 
yesterday. Hence, Kenny was the one whom Lucian met at the bookstore.
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How could it be Kenny?

Victor looked at Lucian in confusion. "Lucian, what does your meeting with Director Bleu's son got 
to do with this?"

He was sure that Kenny was the one who went to the bookstore yesterday.

Ricky was still in Gate City!

Lucian said indifferently, "The book he was reading!"



Victor almost slammed the table and stood up. He tried his best to suppress the anger in his heart. At 
that moment, he could understand how Anson felt when his speech ended with a cliff-hanger.

Anson could not refrain himself from getting angry every time, let alone Victor.

Victor said in a good-natured manner, "Lucian, let's change the way we speak. Tell me everything in 
one go! I'm all ears."

Lucian looked at Victor calmly and said in an unhurried tone, "He was reading Hacking Master."

"So?" Victor felt ashamed of himself when he saw how patient Lucian was.

"That means that he is responsible for the virus infection of that newspaper company." Lucian was 
almost certain of that.

When Lucian saw that Victor still didn't believe it, he continued, "Besides, the online criticisms 
towards Eden had also disappeared."

Victor found it hard to accept the news. How was it possible that Kenny was behind this?

Kenny seemed calm, obedient and sensible!

"Lucian, have you seen wrongly?" He still couldn't believe that his son...

Wait. That was his son.

An outstanding father would have an exceptional son!

"I did not see wrongly!" Lucian turned to leave after he finished speaking.

It was unusual for a six year-old to be a hacker.

He wanted to get to know him if he had the chance.



Victor still could not believe what he had heard even after Lucian had left.

He glanced at the computer quickly and searched for his news with Eden the other day. He browsed 
the Internet and found that all the nasty comments were gone.

"Hehe..." Victor giggled.

Anson, who had come out to throw the trash, was

dumbfounded when he saw Victor behaving like that.

He couldn't help but say, "Victor, why are you laughing like a fool?"

He would be spending time with Eden alone tomorrow. He couldn't be so excited that he became a 
fool today, could he?

Men who were in love were indeed fools.

Anson was one of the fools. He stalked Abigail's page last night until three o'clock in the morning.

"Hehe..." Anson laughed at himself and threw the lunch box into the trash can.

Victor called out to him, "Anson."

"What's the matter?" Anson said in a grumpy tone.

Victor was not angry at all. His eyes looked as though they were smiling and he looked radiant.

"Go and order five cups of strawberry juice. Send two cups to Director Bleu's office."

"Ah..." Anson frowned at him.



Anson suddenly understood Victor’s intention when he thought of the five cups of juice.

"Victor, don't you feel ashamed? You and Eden like to drink strawberry juice but not me and 
Lucian. You like strawberry juice because of Eden but I'm not like that."

Victor glared at him. "Why do you talk so much?" "Transfer the money to me." Anson spoke 
bluntly. "You are petty. I'll order myself. Go away and don't get in my way." Victor waved at him 
before he picked up his mobile phone and ordered the juice.

"Alas!" Anson shook his head. Who was actually petty?

Victor had asked him to do the things that he could actually do on his own.

Anson felt like he was serving a master.

Victor was too lazy to choose other flavors. He directly ordered five cups of strawberry juice.

He put down his phone after that and went into deep thoughts.

Was it really Kenny? He had to figure if it was Kenny or not.

He would send Kenny to train professionally if Kenny was really talented in that field. 

The strawberry juice was delivered very quickly. Eden and Amelia drank the juices happily!

Eden had always liked strawberry-flavored things. She could not refuse when it came to that!

Victor also drank happily.

Lucian and Anson looked at the bright red juice silently. They did not have the slightest desire to

drink it.



Anson shook his head helplessly and mumbled, "Victor, it's fine that you harm yourself but why did 
you involve Lucian and me?"

Victor left his office on time when it was time to get off work. His well-tailored shirt caused him to 
look steady and restrained.

Anson also walked out from his office.

Anson asked him, "Are you going back or going somewhere else?"

Anson felt that it was very boring to go back home. It was even more boring to face Victor who 
didn't like to talk!

Victor glanced at him and said, "You go back first. I have something to do!"

"What is it?" Anson was a little surprised. Victor would bring him along when he had matters to 
attend to.

Victor looked at him gloomily and two words came out of his thin lips, "A date!"

The corners of Anson's mouth twitched. He didn't know Victor was going on a date. He waved at 
Victor and said, "Bye. I will leave together with Lucian." "Okay!" Victor headed to Eden's office as 
he replied.

Lucian glanced at Victor's back silently and pursed his thin lips.

His cold facial features were reflected on his laptop screen. He had an obscure expression on his 
face.

Anson felt that the atmosphere was slightly different when he walked up to Lucian. He frowned and 
had an indescribable feeling.

He froze slightly. He wanted to speak but he didn't know what to say!



He glanced at Lucian in confusion.

He realized that Lucian's gentle and handsome face was much colder than before. He asked 
doubtfully, "Lucian, do you have something on your mind?"

Lucian looked up suddenly and met Anson's curious gaze. He composed himself slightly and replied 
coldly, "Do I look like someone who has something on his mind?"

Anson nodded in agreement. "You are right. You don't have a heart at all."

Lucian frowned and did not speak when he heard that!

However, his every move and his aura emitted a strong sense of calmness and power.

He put away his laptop and glanced at the spacious and tidy desk. He only turned off the light and 
was ready to get off work after making sure that

everything was done.

Anson said weakly, "Lucian, where are we going?" "A bar." Lucian replied indifferently.

"Er..." Anson was startled and he took a step back quickly.

He looked at Lucian in disbelief and said in shock, "Lucian, you're the model of a good man among 
the three of us!

All of us have rich and colorful private lives. We would be really high when we play games every 
day. You are the only one who is well-behaved. You would stay at home when you get off work 
every day. You never go to bars and KI Vs. Why do you suddenly want to go to a bar today?

You really scared me when you suddenly said that. I was really taken aback by it."
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"You are childish!" Lucian spat out the two words indifferently.

"Er... You said I am childish. Lucian, how am I childish?" Anson felt that he was talking to Lucian 
the same way he talked to Victor. He would be really pissed off by these two people!

He preferred to hang out with Adonis, the big gossiper. At least he could hear things that he usually 
couldn't hear when he was with him.

It was a little dull but he could still hear Adonis' chats at least. 

When he was with Victor and Lucian, they would only speak when he asked a question.

There were times when he wanted to grab the two of them and have a good fight with them. He 
would feel much better that way.

Anson started to howl in his heart when he thought about that.

He actually didn't dare to fight with them.

"You are childish in every way!" Lucian walked out as he spoke. His gaze was serious.

Anson glared at him. Was Lucian in a bad mood

today?

He stopped arguing with Lucian about the matter. He asked, "By the way, did you give Eden her 
flight ticket and access card?"

"I have already given her those!" Lucian's tone was still indifferent.

Anson frowned. He realized that Lucian was really slightly different from before.

He shut his mouth instantly and stopped talking.



He followed silently behind Lucian.

On the other hand, Victor was waiting for Eden outside her office.

Eden would not be in the company for the next three days. She explained some things to Amelia 
when she got off work.

She checked her work again after Amelia left. After making sure that everything was fine, she 
turned off her laptop and got ready to get off work!

A black shadow suddenly appeared in front of her when she walked out from her office.

She took a step back intuitively. Her face was filled with anger when she saw that it was Victor. 
"Victor, what are you doing? Why are you scaring people in broad daylight?"

Victor looked at her with a smile. "Eden, did I scare

you?"

Eden glared at him. "Do I look like I couldn't handle a scare? Why didn't you get off work? What 
are you doing here?"

Victor's face darkened slightly when he heard that. Had she forgotten about it so soon?

He said in a slightly deep voice, "I said I'd accompany you guys tonight."

Eden suddenly remembered what happened at noon.

"Hehe..." She laughed a little unnaturally. She had long forgotten about that.

"Let's go then." Eden headed to the elevator as she spoke.



Victor who was depressed a while ago, was in a much better mood.

When they reached the first floor, they met Vincent who came to pick Haven up.

They were about to leave the company.

When Vincent saw Victor and Eden, he stopped suddenly and smiled wryly. He said in a deep and 
cold voice, "Vo! It seems like both of you are inseparable! Are you getting off work together?"

Vincent put one hand in his trousers pocket and smiled wickedly at Victor.

Victor looked at him coldly. Their gazes met. One was cold while the other was playful!

"Victor!" Haven's voice was a little cold when she greeted him.

She looked at Eden in a weird way.

Haven would have the paternity results tomorrow. She would take actions towards Eden if she was 
Eden Clement!

Victor had a sullen expression on his face. He raised his eyebrows and said arrogantly, "Get lost! 
Move your dirty feet away. You can’t afford to dirty this noble place of mine!"

"Victor, don't go too far. Do you really think you are great?" Vincent was furious. His cold eyes 
were burning with anger. Victor had been humiliating him all the time.

He knew that he was inferior to Victor but he wouldn't allow Victor to humiliate him like that!

"I’ve asked you to get lost! Take the woman with you and get out of here right now!" Victor's angry 
voice echoed in the spacious hall.

Eden was so frightened by Victor’s thunderous rage that she swallowed a mouthful of saliva.



"Victor..."

"Shut up. Don't call my name in such a disgusting way." Victor interrupted Haven rudely. He hated 
her hypocritical face very much.

Haven's pupils shrunk dramatically when she was yelled at by Victor. His heartless words made her 
whole body ache in pain.

She was drowned by the innate sense of inferiority and humiliation instantly.

"Victor, you're looking for death!" Vincent was furious. He directed a punch towards Victor’s 
handsome face.

Ah...

Eden was so frightened that she parted her red lips slightly. Why did Victor have such a big temper 
today?

She was worried and nervous about Victor when she saw that Vincent's fist that was directed at 
Victor.

However, Victor quickly grabbed Vincent's whizzing fist in the next moment. He pursed his thin 
lips tightly and said coldly, "You want to hit me? Vincent, you should think about the consequences 
before you land a punch."

Before the voice had died away, a terrifying cracking sound was heard.

Vincent screamed like a pig that was being slaughtered.

"Ah...

"Vincent, how are you?" Haven looked at him worriedly.



"Victor, my arm is dislocated. Let me go! It hurts!" Vincent did not have the time to answer Haven 
at the moment.

He just wanted to free himself from the present pain!

He was not like Victor, who would go to the gym whenever he was free. Instead, he had spent all 
his time on alcohol and women!

He enjoyed the feeling of having beautiful women in his arms!

He would not end well every time he fought with Victor.

He was unable to defeat Victor whenever they fought when they were children.

Fortunately, all the adults would defend him and it would always be Victor's fault.

He would be in a very good mood every time he saw Victor scolded by Phillip!

Victor had taken a lot of blame for him when they were young.

Victor didn't have any evidence. Thus, he could not do anything even though he was wronged!

Victor used his strength to push Vincent out of the

door.

He turned around, glanced at the security guard on duty and said coldly and angrily, "If you let this 
guy in next time, don't blame me for being rude!"

"Yes, Mr. Alwynn." The security guard who was a middle-aged man, nodded quickly.

Haven glanced at Victor angrily before she went to support Vincent who was in pain and walked out 
of the company.



After walking for some distance, Vincent suddenly looked back at Victor coldly and said, "Victor, 
just you wait!"

Victor sneered fearlessly and said, "I've been waiting to send you and your mother to prison. You 
meddle with my car like what you did previously. I'll settle everything with you once and for all."

Vincent's face turned pale when he heard that.

Victor actually knew about those things.

Vincent didn't dare to say anything more. He shoved away Haven's hand forcefully and walked to 
his car quickly.

Haven glared at him angrily. She felt that Vincent was useless when he was easily scared.

She also hurried to the car. Since she had already chosen Vincent, she would stick to the path she 
had chosen.

Chapter 329

Victor's words reminded Eden of what Jasper had told her.

Victor was involved in several car accidents because there was a problem with his car.

Was it like what Jasper told her, that Rebecca really wanted to end Victor's life and took all his 
property?

She suddenly realized that Victor also did not lead an easy life.

Sometimes, she could see his vulnerable side from his sharp and dark eyes.

Victor only withdrew his gaze from Vincent after Vincent drove off.



He looked sideways at Eden. He suddenly saw that there was a touch of worry and pity in her eyes 
and his mood became much better.

"Eden, let's go to the garage directly." His tone was deep and was less cold.

"Okay!" Eden came to her senses and nodded frantically.

Victor smiled slightly and headed to the garage.

Victor and Eden did not speak along the way.

Eden's heart couldn't help but ached for Victor as

she watched his cold and noble back.

Victor regretted letting Eden witness what had happened just now.

Vincent and Rebecca were the two people he hated the most in his life.

He would remember his past whenever he saw Rebecca and Vincent. In the past, he was not as 
capable as he was at the moment and he was controlled by them.

He endured the humiliation. Even though he was wronged and reprimanded by Phillip, he still 
endured it all.

He had been suppressing the anger in his heart until now. He could probably heave a sigh of relief 
soon.

Victor only got to the driver’s seat after opening the door for Eden. He started the car and left the 
garage.

After that, Victor said, "Eden, do we go to your house directly or..."



"Go to Upper Street." Eden interrupted him and told him the address.

Victor was slightly confused because he thought she would be heading home directly.

He asked, "Eden, why are we going there?"

Eden smiled mysteriously at him and said, "You will know when you get there." "Okay!" Victor 
nodded with a gentle expression on his face.

He drove the car in the direction of Upper East Sleglund.

Victor suddenly thought of what Lucian had told him. He asked, "Eden, does Kenny like to use the 
computer?"

Eden nodded slightly and said, "Yes. I specially bought one for him and put it in his room so that he 
can watch movies or do other things. He likes to be alone and stay in his room to read books all the 
time. He would occasionally watch movies."

"Does he only use the computer to watch movies?" Victor asked with some doubts.

Eden glanced at him in confusion. "He's a young kid. Are you worried that he would watch 
something else?"

Victor smiled slightly and said, "Eden, you think too much. I didn't mean that. I just feel that Kenny 
is very obedient! He does nothing but reads books all day long. I am very curious about how a kid 
of such a young age has such great self-discipline!"

"Of course. Take a look at whose son he is." Eden did not conceal the arrogance in her tone. She 
had an arrogant smile on her beautiful face.

Victor also replied in his heart that Ricky was also his son.

"Eden, can you tell me what happened to you when you were a child?" Victor didn't know what had 
hit him. He just wanted to hear it from Eden at the moment! 



Eden looked at him strangely and asked, "Why do you want to know what happened to me when I 
was a child?"

"We are now friends. Can't you tell me?" Seeing that there were not many cars in front, Victor 
quickly glanced at her.

There was sorrow and joy in everybody's life. He had heard too much of her sorrow and wanted to 
know if there was anything else that he had not heard from her!

"Hehe..." Eden smiled. "You are really weird. Why do you ask about other people's childhood?

Don't you also know that I am Cyan? Do you think that I had a good time in the Gienger family?"

Eden was uncovering her scars when she talked about the past!

Victor suddenly said, "Eden, if you don't feel like talking about it, then don't talk about it."

He was a little annoyed. He would only make her suffer more if he let her uncover her own scars!

However, he couldn't help but want to know more about her.

Eden glanced deeply at him. She lowered her head and said, "Victor, I didn't have a good time when 
I was a child! There is nothing much to talk about."

Victor's heart ached for her instantly!

He knew that she did not have a good time when she was a child!

She wouldn't be lost if it wasn’t for him.

Victor tried to ask more in-depth questions slowly. He thought about it for a moment before he 
asked, "Eden, I have promised you that I would help you find your parents. Do you know how you 
got into the Gienger family when you were a child?"



"I don't know." Eden shook her head. She would not have sent those text messages to Bethany if she 
knew the whole story.

Victor apologized in his heart when he heard that. He couldn't reveal his identity at the moment 
because Haven wouldn't behave herself if he did that.

At least not until Haven left the Clement family and married Vincent!

"Take your time! There is no hurry!" Eden's tone was a little disappointed. It was a lie to say that 
she was not anxious. Her only wish was to know if her parents were doing well. She would feel 
relieved if they were doing well.

"Okay! Eden, don't worry. I'll find them." Victor's voice was gentle and warm.

Eden smiled and nodded. "Victor, thank you!"

"No problem!" Victor casted a gentle sideway glance at her.

Eden looked around and reminded him, "Victor, drive the car to the parking lot. We get off in front 
and walk over!"

Victor asked doubtfully, "Eden, is Kenny and Gia here?" Victor couldn't help but feel excited when 
he thought of meeting his children.

Eden looked at Victor in embarrassment. "Victor, I'm sorry. I asked you to come here today to do 
hard work."

Victor said, "Er..."

"To do hard work?" He was instantly confused.

"Eden, what kind of hard work?"

"You will know when you get there." Eden kept him guessing.



Victor smiled gently. Eden was slightly stunned when she glanced sideways and saw how gentle 
Victor was.

Victor was devilishly charming. Eden had to admit that she would be dazzled by his gentle smile 
sometimes.

After Victor had parked his car, he and Eden got off. After that, Eden took him to Zofia's store.

The sunset was like fire, weaving in and out of the tall buildings and reflecting a blurred evening 
vision.

There were a lot of people on the street, causing it to be lively and busy!

Victor knew that he was at the night market of Upper East Sleglund when he saw the busy street.

He glanced sideways at Eden and asked, "Eden, what are we doing here?"

Eden pointed at a store not far away and said, "Let's go to that store."
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Victor followed her gaze and suddenly saw Zofia who was busy in the store. He instantly 
understood what was going on.

"Ah!" Victor looked at Eden quickly, "Eden, when you say you want me to come here and do some 
hard work, do you mean to ask me to clean up this place?"

He was not good at this kind of things!

Eden nodded with a cunning smile. "Victor, didn't you say that we are friends?"

"Hehe..." Victor grinned. "Eden, but this..."



Eden interrupted him and said seriously, "Victor, you were the one who insisted on following me 
today. I am here to help Zofia to clean up her store today. You know that Zofia is pregnant and she 
has no friends by her side. She will have a hard time if we don’t help her." 

Zofia had bought some stainless steel cabinets today. She still had to clean everything even though 
they were brand new.

Victor was speechless when he heard Eden say that they were friends!

A trace of excitement blossomed at the bottom of his heart. He was still willing to do anything no 
matter how tiring the work was!

It would not be a bad idea to progress from friends to lovers and then to husband and wife!

At least Eden did not refuse him from getting close to her!

"Let's go!" Victor headed towards Zofia's store as he spoke.

Eden looked at his back and smiled.

Victor also had an adorable side to him.

She followed behind him and walked over slowly.

Eden did not know that Victor would only show his gentle side in front of her.

Their relationship which was distant for a few days seemed to have returned to its original state.

Victor suddenly thought of Buddy coming to him last night when he saw Zofia.

He sighed in his heart. Buddy couldn't get out of Aisling's control and he couldn't protect Zofia.

Hence, he did not tell Zofia about Buddy's matters.



Eden shouted, "Zofia."

Zofia who was busy cleaning her store, raised her head quickly and glanced at Eden when she heard 
her voice.

She was slightly stunned when she saw Victor who was walking in front of Eden.

"Eden, Mr. Alwynn, why are you here?" She was very surprised to see Victor.

She was a little worried and was afraid that Victor would tell Buddy that she was here.

Eden walked in with a smile and said, "Zofia, I brought someone to help us work together!"

"Ah..." Zofia suddenly looked at Victor in shock.

No one in River City would dare to ask Victor, the famous nobleman, to do hard work.

Victor looked at the surprised Zofia lightly. "Miss Rivera, can't I do that?"

"Hehe..." Zofia laughed and put on a forced smile on her face.

She wanted to say that it was fine but she was afraid that the unstable CEO would get angry.

She found it even more difficult to say no!

She had been with Buddy for quite some time and she had heard that Victor was fast and steady 
when he dealt with matters.

She also heard that he was unstable. However, after meeting him a few times, she felt that he was 
not as terrifying as he was rumored!



"Zofia, you don't have to feel embarrassed. We have to drag people like him to experience life." 
Eden spoke as she wore an apron.

Victor glanced at Eden and smiled faintly. "Eden is right."

Eden took a red apron and handed it to him. "Victor, fasten this apron so that you won't dirty your 
expensive clothes."

Victor was reluctant to wear the apron when he saw that the apron was red and flowery.

However, he smiled faintly and fastened the apron on his body when he saw that the apron that 
Eden was wearing was the same as his.

Zofia couldn't help but laugh when she saw that. Victor who was one meter eight, looked really 
comical when he wore the small apron.

Victor looked at the various things in the store and asked, "Miss Rivera, where do you want to place 
these cabinets?"

Zofia glanced at him and said with a smile, "Mr. Alwynn, just place all of them together against the 
wall!"

She had been tidying up the place alone the whole day today but she was still not done. She might 
have to take up another three or four days to finish cleaning up the place.

However, she wouldn't take up that long to clean up the place since Eden and Victor were here to 
help her!

Eden walked to Victor's side and glanced at the cleaning cabinet at the side. She said, "Victor, I'll 
help you to lift it!"

Victor frowned when he heard that. He looked at Eden's delicate hands, shook his head and said, 
"Eden, go to do something light. I can handle this alone."



Victor started to work as he spoke. He couldn't bear to let Eden's hands that were used for designing 
stuff, to get scratched.

He placed all the cabinets according to the location that Zofia had told him.

Eden stood by the side and watched. Victor was very strong. It was right to call him here to help.

Besides, he had anger in his heart. He would feel better when he was distracted.

Eden went over to help Victor when she saw him moving a large stainless steel cabinet.

Victor looked at Eden with his dark obsidian eyes and smiled at Eden gently.

Eden also returned a faint smile to him.

Zofia, who was standing at the side, was slightly stunned when she saw Victor's gentle expression. 
She had experienced in relationships and she could tell that Victor liked Eden.

Eden was the kind of person who would never think about love. Even though Jasper's eyes were 
filled with affection, she could only see friendship and family in his eyes.

She probably didn't have experience in love.

It was not until seven o'clock that they finished tidying all the things.

Victor did not suppress his emotions while he was doing all the work. He hadn't been as relaxed as 
he was now for many days.

"Alright, we are done." Eden clapped her hands as she spoke.

Victor raised the corners of his mouth slightly, and his thin lips curled into a perfect arc. His smile 
was intoxicating.



He asked, "Eden, are you tired?"

"I'm not tired. It's good to sweat and I would sleep more soundly at night." She could tell that Victor 
was very happy the last few hours.

Doing hard work was also a way to ease the mood. When Eden was in a bad mood, she would do a 
lot of things to alleviate her mood.

"Victor, how is it? Are you in a better mood?"

Victor was slightly stunned when he heard that.

Eden could actually tell how he was feeling.

A hint of tenderness quickly flashed across his dark and deep eyes.

"Eden, I am hungry!" There an unconcealable gentleness in his deep and alluring voice.

Eden took off her apron and said, "Let's go and eat if you are hungry!"

Zofia looked at Eden and asked, "Eden, what about Kenny and Gia?"

Eden smiled proudly when she heard that. "Zofia, don't worry. There are wrapped dumplings in the 
refrigerator. Kenny will cook them for Gia. We can bring them some late-night snacks forthem 
when we get back later.
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