
Remarriage Never And Go Away  

 

Chapter 1104 What Can I Do for You?  

“She thought that you and Jonathan are the same kind of people and that you both 
wanted to use her. She knows what’s what. If you don’t really like her, you don’t have to 
do this for her. She doesn’t need it.” 

Jordy’s eyes were darker and he rested his fierce eyes on George’s face, but George 
didn’t seem to notice it. He just patted him on the shoulder and said with a smile, “You 
should just mind your own business and take good care of yourself. Well…” 

Then George yawned and said, “Oh, I’m really sleepy. I’m going back to sleep. Take an 
early rest.” 

Then he left. 

He didn’t plan to stay. He had said everything he should say and had done everything 
he could do to encourage Jordy. He should leave now, and he felt great! 

Damn Jordy! He loved Gloria but refused to admit it. Even if he had kissed her and held 
her in his arms, he was still rejected by her. He deserved it! 

George left in a good mood and closed the door for Jordy, isolating the cold air in the 
room. 

Jordy was alone in the room. He sat on the sofa slowly with his arms on his thighs and 
his hands 

clasping. 

He looked down at the glass on the tea table. It was empty. He stared at it silently, and 
suddenly took the kettle beside him to fill the glass. He didn’t stop until the water almost 
overflowed. 

He didn’t drink it at all but just looked at the slightly shaking water in the crystal glass. 
The water didn’t seem to stop slopping, just like his heart. 

Jordy suddenly leaned on the sofa, closed his eyes, raised one hand, and stroked his 
temples that 

kept twitching. 

Gloria. 



Gloria. 

He was repeating Gloria’s name in his mind, and thinking about her angry face. 

There were all kinds of emotions on that beautiful face except… happiness. 

Her cold eyes would be filled with irritation only when she looked at him. 

At this moment, Gloria returned to her room. She leaned against the door, and the blush 
on her face hadn’t faded. She didn’t even realize that her heart was pounding at a 
speed that it never had before. 

Her mind was in turmoil at the thought of Jordy’s kiss. She turned her head and closed 
her eyes, as if she could stop herself from thinking about it only in this way. 

Her mobile phone suddenly vibrated, which drew her attention back. 

It was a message from Jonathan. Gloria suddenly remembered that Jonathan had just 
called her. 

She took a deep breath and calmed herself down. 

She clicked into WhatsApp and saw Jonathan’s message. 

-Jonathan, [Call me back when you are free.] 

Gloria closed her eyes again. She felt better, so she called Jonathan back. 

Jonathan answered the phone very quickly. 

“Were you very busy today?” 

Gloria’s eyes froze slightly. She took a deep breath and said in a calm voice, “I put my 
phone on silent and I didn’t check it. What’s the matter?” 

“Well, I need to see you for something.” Jonathan’s voice was as pleasant as ever, and 
he responded 

calmly. 

Gloria was puzzled, “What is it?” 

Chapter 1105 Her Heart Beats Faster and Faster  

“Are you free tonight?” Jonathan did not answer her question, but asked in reply. 



Gloria frowned, “No, not tonight.” 

“Tomorrow?” 

Gloria thought of Karen and said, “I don’t know. Can’t we just talk about it on the phone? 
I have important things to do and I might not have time for you.” 

After all… Grandma’s illness was really important. She had left all the cooperation to 
Ted’s charge. 

“What are the important things?” Jonathan still didn’t tell Gloria why he wanted to see 
her. 

Gloria paused, did not respond, but asked, “Why do you want to see me? Is it about the 
jewelry cooperation?” 

“Not really, and it’s hard to explain over the phone. We’ll talk when you have time. It’s 
not very urgent. Call me when you are free in a week.” 

Gloria thought for a moment and responded, “OK.” 

“Well, take care of yourself and don’t wear yourself out. Let me know if you need me.” 
Jonathan’s voice was always so gentle, and he always sounded relaxed and calm. 

Gloria said with a smile, “Thanks, but don’t worry. I can handle it.” 

Gloria’s heart suddenly missed another beat at the thought of what Jordy did to her just 
now. She was even no longer in the mood to talk to Jonathan. 

After a pause, she said directly, “I’ve gotta deal with something. Is there anything else?” 

“Alas…” Jonathan sighed helplessly, “I just want to hear your voice more. Fine, I’ll leave 
you to 

your work.” 

Gloria’s eyes froze for a moment, and she just said with a smile, “OK.” 

Then she hung up the phone directly. 

She put down her mobile phone, went to the sofa and sat down. Her expression 
became more and more complicated. What happened just now was like a vague dream. 
Her mind was so confused and 

she could not recall it at all. 



But… 

She could remember those intimate moments clearly, and her heart beat faster and 
faster. 

Gloria immediately put down her mobile phone, closed her eyes, and tried to clear her 
mind. 

She didn’t know what to think, but seemed more and more anxious. 

She really didn’t want to stay here anymore. She didn’t know why she felt more and 
more terrible after doing those things with Jordy. 

She could live a carefree life, but Jordy haunted her like a ghost. He didn’t like her and 
just wanted to use her, but he made such a humble choice. Wouldn’t he feel upset and 
restrained being with 

her? 

He thought she was a very scheming woman and even hated her guts before, but now 
he was willing to make such a big concession for interests. 

Heh… 

Should she feel glad that she was a very powerful person in his eyes, or should she feel 
sad that she could only be used? 

Gloria curled her lip and the ironic smile on her lips widened. 

She leaned against the sofa, closed her eyes, and tried to empty her mind. She was 
really tired of her life. It made her very uncomfortable. 

She took a deep breath. 

Then another deep one. 

But before she took the third breath, the door of her room was suddenly knocked. 

Chapter 1106 Jordy, Good for You!  

Gloria opened her eyes instantly, and she was a little startled, “Who is it?” 

The hairs all over her seemed to stand up, but she was stiff all over and didn’t notice 
that. 



A moment later, a light-hearted voice came from the door, “Hah… It’s me. Are you free 
now? I need your advice.” 

Advice. 

George said this word humbly, which made Gloria feel like he wanted to ask her 
something about 

the law. 

After thinking about it, Gloria got up and opened the door for him. 

George smiled and raised his hand to greet her, “Hello, we see each other again.” 

Gloria suddenly frowned, and the displeasure in her eyes was telling George that he 
shouldn’t be 

here. 

But… Gloria didn’t know that he came here with a purpose. 

She stepped aside and let George in. George walked in and sat on the sofa casually. 

Gloria closed the door, came over, sat opposite him, looked at him with an indifferent 
look, and said, “What do you want to know?” 

“Well…” At this point, George gave a light cough. 

Gloria raised an eyebrow, as if she didn’t understand what he was talking about. 

George laughed and said, “I just want to know what you thought just now.” 

Gloria was confused. 

She frowned. Obviously, she was displeased. 

George knew what she was thinking and continued, “Jordy is competitive by nature and 
always says things he doesn’t mean. I guess you know his character.” 

Gloria frowned, “What are you trying to say?” 

In fact, her impression of George was not very good. 

Because George and Jordy were friends, and Nydia hated George. 



Gloria only appreciated some of George’s talents. She didn’t like the things he once did. 
But what 

George had done had nothing to do with her. She just didn’t like him very much. 

“I have so many things to say.” George sighed helplessly. After a pause, he continued, 
“Well, what happened just now, you know, I… cough. I worried about you two. I heard 
what you talked about.” 

Gloria laughed angrily, “You are worried about me?” 

“Don’t get me wrong!” George immediately raised his hands as if to clarify, “I was just 
worried that Jordy might do something stupid!” 

Gloria was speechless. 

He was worried about Jordy? Was he afraid that she would eat Jordy? 

Gloria’s ironic smile widened. 

George hurriedly said, “Don’t over-think! I was just worried that he would make you 
angry. He likes you but he refuses to admit it!” 

Gloria felt like she had heard the biggest joke, “Jordy likes me? Do you know what you 
are talking 

about?” 

Gloria didn’t believe what George said, and her words were full of irony. 

George was speechless. 

He had expected this! 

He knew that Jordy was unreliable and didn’t know the right words to say and the right 
things to do. As a result, misunderstandings kept piling up between them, and now 
Gloria even felt that he was unreliable. 

Jordy, good for you! 

George hurriedly shook his head again, “Come on!” 

 


