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Boom~Long~Long!

As soon as that thought came up, the heaven and earth suddenly roared, and the entire holy land 
began to undergo changes.………

"This is?"

"what happened?!"

Everyone was shocked. They all looked at the sky in horror, feeling vaguely that something was not 
good.…..

At this moment, it wasn't just the people present who felt something was wrong.

The entire holy land, the first, second and third floors.

All examiners felt that the heaven and earth were roaring continuously, and thousands of laws were 
changing, as if mutations were taking place...

At this moment, tens of thousands of examiners raised their heads one by one in shock, and looked 
around the world...

Ka~ka~ka~!

At this moment, a crisp clicking sound came from the depths of the holy realm, as if some barrier 
had broken, and the spiritual energy between heaven and earth began to flow, gradually forming a 
spiritual energy storm.…..

"What the hell is going on here?"



The old man under the moon was frightened and looked around.

His soul was extremely strong and his sixth sense was always very accurate.

At this moment, he vaguely felt that this sudden side of the world seemed to be detrimental to him.
…..

But before he could think about it, the shouts of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor rang out again.……

"Fellow Taoists! help me! help me!"

This reminder made everyone wake up.

Ancestor Hunji hurriedly said:"Everyone, I don't care about those trivial matters! Let’s save fellow 
Taoist Di Mang first!"

"Exactly!"

At this moment, the group of people rushed towards Qin Feng again.

"Qin Feng, little thief! Stop it quickly!"

Ancestor Hunji and others were attacking and shouting fiercely.

Not far away, Ancestor Randeng saw this scene and was immediately overjoyed:"Haha!! Everyone! 
This little thief is extremely hateful! Ran Deng will lend a helping hand to kill this beast together!"

"Ha ha!! Fellow Taoist, be wise!"

"This is a great kindness!"

Hunji and others expressed their welcome one after another.



Old Man Yuexia and Ancestor Liugen looked excited.

With the help of a large number of helpers, let alone saving the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor, 
there is a high chance of even killing Qin Feng......

Seeing this scene, in the blood mist that filled the sky, Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor was 
extremely happy.….

"Qin Feng, kid! You are dead! You are dead! Ha ha!!"

The laughter was extremely arrogant and harsh.…..

At this moment, Huanji and others also arrived, only a few hundred meters away from Qin Feng.….

"Qin Feng, kid! Die!"

The Ancestor of Hunji took action first.

Boom~Long~Long!

Suddenly, the sky and the earth were shaking, the sun and the moon were dim, and the fighting 
power of more than 100 million Ji was crushed...

Sure enough, there was no peak giant. They are weak, and their strength is hidden

"Little thief! Leave your life behind!"

Boom~Long~Long!

Amitabha also rushed to take action, his giant palm crushed down, and the sky collapsed and the 
earth shattered.…..



Ancestor Liugen and Old Man Yuexia also arrived at the same time. They knew that Qin Feng was 
extremely powerful and did not dare to overpower him. They sacrificed six pure bamboos and the 
Moon of Creation, and struck Qin Feng with all their strength...

A moment later. , the four peak giants joined forces and launched a monstrous attack that covered 
the sky and the earth, causing the heaven and earth to collapse and the void to shatter.

The power of that combined attack was comparable to that of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor...

But it was not over yet. More than thirty quasi-Saint Ancestors also arrived, one after another, and 
their palms lit up with dazzling light, preparing to Attack Qin Feng together…….

"Ha ha!! Dead! You are dead!"

Di Mang Witch Ancestor was extremely excited when he saw it.

Old Man Yuexia and Ancestor Liu Gen were also flushed with excitement.

They seemed to see that Qin Feng was going to be beaten to a pulp by them...

They didn't believe that someone could be here. With this joint effort, we can still remain intact..…..

At this extremely critical moment, three earth-shaking explosions came from the depths of the Holy 
Land!

Bang~! Bang~! Bang~!

With this explosion, the holy realm shook violently, and the void for hundreds of millions of miles 
was distorted!

Ha ha!!

Done!



Qin Feng and Xuan Mi's faces showed expressions of ecstasy.

Ancestor Hunji and others were shocked.

But before they could react, Qin Feng shouted urgently at someone not far away.

"Hong'er! quick!"

Hongjun, who had been hiding aside for a long time, immediately thought about it and controlled 
the Chaos Bead...

Buzz~!

The Chaos Bead's spiritual light shined brightly, releasing endless suction...

Buzz~!

In the blink of an eye, the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor transformed into The blood mist, 
including its soul, was all sucked into the Chaos Bead...

At the same time, the attack of Ancestor Huanji and others was about to fall.

But at this moment, the space in the field was violently distorted, Ancestor Huanji The others turned 
into streaks of white light and disappeared out of thin air, along with half of their attacks.…….

The sky echoed with the frightened and angry roars of these people.

"what happened? How is this going?!"

"No~！"

Huh~! Huh~! Huh~!



White lights lit up one after another, and in the blink of an eye, Ancestor Huanji and others all 
disappeared out of thin air.…….

At the same time, Qin Feng and Xuan Mi's clones also got into the Chaos Bead.

As soon as he entered the Chaos Orb, Qin Feng saw the blood mist all over the sky, and sensed the 
fluctuation of the soul of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor, and he suddenly showed a look of joy.

"father! Your guess is indeed correct!"

Hongjun also ran over with a look of surprise on his face.

"How could...how could this happen?!"

At the same time, Di Mang's confused voice came out from the blood mist.

He saw with his own eyes that Ancestor Hunji and others disappeared out of thin air, but Qin Feng 
and Qin Mu did not disappear.…..

"Di Mang old thief! You're dead this time!"

At this time, Hongjun looked at the blood mist in front of him and sneered again and again.

He had been watching everything before silently.

This emperor's light mocking Qin Feng's arrogance had long made him hate it. Now he can finally 
Feeling bad-tempered……

"You...what do you mean?! Do you think you can kill me? Fellow Daoist Hunji and others will 
come to rescue me soon!"

"Ha ha!! At this point, you still count on them. To tell you the truth, Ancestor Hunji and others have 
been forcibly transported out of the Xuanwu Holy Realm by the will of the secret earth. They will 
never be able to come in, and no one will be able to save you!"



"What?!"Dimang Witch Ancestor was frightened and inexplicable.

"Hong'er! No need to talk nonsense with him! Do it!"

As soon as he finished speaking, Qin Feng activated his sword skills, and hundreds of millions of 
sword lights strangled the blood mist.…..

Xuan Mi's clone and Hongjun also took action together….

"ah~！….No~！….."

The screams of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor rang out in the blood mist.

"Hun... extremely... fellow Taoist! help me! help me~！"

Boom~! Boom~! boom~！、、

For a moment, the sword light in the Chaos Orb filled the sky, and the roar continued, and the 
screams and calls for help from the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor continued to be heard...

His spiritual energy plummeted again!、

"I have already told you that the old thief Hunji and others have been sent out of the Holy Realm, 
and no one can come to save you anymore! You are dead! Ha ha!!"

Hongjun sneered loudly, and the attacks in his hands continued

"No~！"

Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor roared in despair.



He did feel that outside the Chaos Bead, there was no breath of Ancestor Hunji and others for 
hundreds of millions of miles. Thinking that what Hongjun said was true, he suddenly felt 
extremely desperate.…….

"Qin...Lord Qin Feng! Spare your life! Spare me! I...I was wrong...ah!.."

"Lord Qin Feng! No…..Uncle Qin Feng...spare...life….."

At this moment, Emperor Mang Wu Zu begged bitterly.

Qin Feng was too lazy to pay attention and strangled him crazily.……….

In fact, Hongjun told the truth. Ancestor Hunji and others were forcibly teleported out by the will of 
the secret place.

Before, the three explosions in the depths of the Holy Realm meant that the barriers between the 
first, second, and third levels of the Holy Realm were broken.

The three levels of the Holy Realm began to easily merge into one, and the Xuanwu Holy Realm 
began to transform into the prototype of the Xuanwu Heavenly Realm.…..

All of this was caused by the virtual shadow clone completely refining the Xuanwu Heavenly Seal.
……..

In other words, from this moment on, Qin Feng completely mastered the third level of the Xuanwu 
Holy Realm and became the master of the Holy Realm.

According to the rules set by the will of the secret land, in order to protect the examiners from other 
forces so that they can continue with the next examination, it teleported them out of the Xuanwu 
Holy Realm in advance.

This is the reason why Ancestor Huanji and others disappeared out of thin air.

Before that, the will of the secret land had revealed this information to the phantom clone in 
advance.…..



It stands to reason that the Dimang Witch Ancestor would also be forcibly teleported out.

And Qin Feng speculated that as long as the space is changed so that the Emperor Mang Witch 
Ancestor does not stay in the holy space, the Emperor Mang will not be teleported out.

Therefore, before he took action, he asked Hongjun to ambush and wait for the shadow clone to 
refine the sky seal, and finally wait for the opportunity to take action.

Sure enough, everything was as he expected.

Now, Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor has become a turtle in the urn and can only wait to be killed 
by him.…….

Of course, the phantom clone has refined the Heavenly Seal, and the changes in the holy realm are 
not just what you see in front of you.

At this moment, major changes are also taking place in every corner of the Holy Land…
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Of course, the phantom clone has refined the Heavenly Seal, and the changes in the holy realm are 
not just what you see in front of you.

At this moment, major changes are also taking place in every corner of the Holy Land.………

In a dilapidated temple.

Saint Taiqing was looking at the restriction in front of him with excitement.

Behind him, several Dao Sect disciples also showed joy.

After their efforts, they have broken more than 90% of the restrictions here.



As long as they are given a moment more time, they will be able to completely break the ban and 
obtain the great opportunity in the temple.…..

At this thought, the joy on Taiqing's face became even stronger.

But at this moment, outside the temple, the heaven and earth suddenly roared, followed by three 
shocking explosions.

Taiqing and others were shocked and turned their heads to look.

But before they could think about it, the space around them suddenly distorted, turning them into 
streaks of white light and forcibly teleporting them out.…..

Their roars echoed in the void.

"No~！"

"what happened? How is this going?! What an opportunity for me! What an opportunity for me!"

Swish~! Swish~! Swish~!

White light flashed!

In just a moment, Taiqing and others were all forcibly teleported out, and no one was left.

Their extremely annoyed roars remained in the void.

In just a moment, the field recovered. Tranquility, only the opportunity of the temple remains, 
staying in place alone…….

At the same time, somewhere deep in the cave.

Mohu is leading a group of disciples to break the restrictions on the entrance of the cave.



They have also broken 90% of the restriction, and they can now enter the cave and gain 
opportunities.

A rare smile appeared on Mohu's cold face.

But at this moment, the heaven and earth suddenly roared outside the cave.

What followed was a series of explosions, and the space in the cave was rapidly distorted... shua~! 
Huh~! Huh~!

Immediately, the disciples behind Mohu turned into streaks of white light and disappeared out of 
thin air.

"Huh! This is?"

Mohu was so horrified that he tried to fight against the will of the secret land even though he was 
sealing seals.

But he only paused for a few seconds before turning into a white light and being forcibly teleported 
out.…..

This opportunity in the cave has been left behind again.

At the same time, there was an altar in a hidden valley.

There is a futon and a five-piece Taoist robe sealed in the center of the altar.

I saw that the futon generated wind and fire by itself, the rays of sunlight were emitted, and the 
Taoist rhyme was formed by itself.

In fact, the futon is called the Wind and Fire Futon, and it is a cauldron-level sacred weapon.

The five-dimensional Taoist robe is the inheritance token of the ancient god.



With this object and meeting some other conditions, you can obtain the inheritance of a direct 
descendant of a divine master.

These two things come together, which is quite a chance.

At this moment, the four great monkeys from the Changtian Domain are surrounding the altar, 
breaking the restrictions.

"Ha ha!! Chief, we have broken this restriction to some extent. It won't be long before we get this 
sacred futon."

The six-eared macaque laughed proudly.

The leader Lingming Stone Monkey also smiled and said:"Yes! I wonder what the usefulness of this 
futon is?"

"Big boss, don’t worry about it! I'm just afraid that if I break the restriction and get it, I'll find out 
once I try it. By the way, what’s the use of the Taoist robe next to me?"

The six-eared macaque looked curiously at the Wupi Taoist robe on the other side.

But at this moment, the world suddenly changed and the roar continued.

The four great monkeys were shocked and looked up at the sky.…..

Bang~! Bang~! Bang~!

At this moment, three shocking explosions were heard from deep within the holy realm.

Immediately afterwards, the void between heaven and earth twisted, and the subordinates guarding 
outside the valley mouth turned into white light and disappeared out of thin air.…..

The four great monkeys suddenly felt that something was not good.



But before they could think about it, the power of the surrounding space forcibly imprisoned them 
and then teleported them out one after another.…..

"This... what's going on?"

"Fuck...fuck!"

"Holy... holy weapon!"

The four great monkeys roared anxiously, but there was nothing they could do.

They could only watch as they turned into white light and were teleported out.…..

A moment later, in the valley, the altar remained the same, and only the unwilling roars of the four 
great monkeys echoed in the sky above.………

At this moment, white lights lit up one after another in every corner of the third floor of the holy 
realm.…..

Anyone who was not a member of the Divine Alliance was forcibly teleported out by the will of the 
secret place.

Not only on the third floor, but also on the second and first floors, the same thing happened.

Anyone who is not a member of the Divine Alliance will be forcibly spread...

The reluctant voices of the examiners are constantly echoing in the sky above the holy realm.…..

Many people just had the chance and almost got it, but were teleported away.

Only the people from the Divine Alliance were left behind.



In short, due to the sudden changes in the world, the vast majority of examinees were left empty-
handed and were kicked out of the Holy Realm without getting any benefits.

After all, it has only been two days since the Holy Land was opened, and there are still five days left 
before it is closed. Many places have not yet been detected.

In other words, more than 90% of the opportunities in this holy territory are still there, which is 
thousands of opportunities!

What’s even better is that because the restrictions on those superior opportunities are difficult to 
break, many people are teleported away before they have time to crack it...

In other words, most of the opportunities that people get are poor opportunities, and the basic ones 
left behind All are good opportunities.

In this way, all these good opportunities will benefit everyone in the Divine Alliance.

This is the huge change that occurred in the holy realm after the phantom clone refined the heavenly 
seal.…….

The will of the secret place is very clear. The shadow clone can refine the sky seal and control the 
entire Xuanwu Holy Realm. It will be much easier to deal with other examiners.…..

In order to maintain the progress of subsequent assessments, it had to meet other assessors and 
spread the news to the third level of the Holy Realm.……..

Boom~Long~Long~!

The heaven and earth are still roaring, and the three levels of holy realm are slowly merging...

At the same time, above the forbidden valley, inside the Chaos Pearl.

Qin Feng, Xuan Mi's clone, and Hongjun frantically strangled the blood mist…..



The screams and begging for mercy of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor are getting weaker and 
weaker.…..

Suddenly, there was a soft pop, and Di Mang's soul finally collapsed, and the pinnacle giant of the 
generation died.

And Qin Feng's mind also received system prompts.

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, you have successfully killed the Emperor Mang Witch 
Ancestor (the pinnacle of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor)... You have gained a large amount of karma 
points, and your redemption points have increased by 1,300 trillion points.….."

Ha ha!!

Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor was finally killed by him!

Qin Feng was overjoyed

"father! This guy is finally dead!"

Hongjun breathed a sigh of relief and was very excited.

This is the pinnacle giant!

I didn't expect that they could also kill it.

If this matter was told, I'm afraid no one would dare to imagine it.

Generally speaking, the pinnacle giant can be killed. The giants must have at least half the strength 
of the Saint Ancestor. The fact that

Qin Feng and others were able to kill the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor had a lot to do with their 
previous self-destruction and severe damage.



Otherwise, it would be really difficult for Qin Feng to kill him.

In short, They won a great victory this time

"Dad, the energy this guy turned into after death was really huge!"

Hongjun looked at the endless energy in front of him and was filled with emotion.

Qin Feng smiled slightly:"The energy possessed by a peak giant will naturally not be less.…."

Hongjun smiled and said:"If you refine all these energies, will you be able to break through to the 
realm of heavenly saints?"

Hearing this, Qin Feng smiled and said nothing.

He had just broken through to the Supreme Saint, but there was a lot of energy in his hand that had 
not been refined.

If all that energy is refined, there might be hope of breaking through to the Heavenly Saint…..

Thinking of this, Qin Feng's heart was full of expectations……..

Then he began to clean up the battlefield and collect loot..
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After a while, Qin Feng finished cleaning the battlefield and got a total of a ball of peak energy of 
the Quasi-Saint Ancestor, a storage ring, and a ball of top-level witch ancestor blood.

In addition, he also found more than 30,000 drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew in Dimang's storage 
ring.

Previously, Xuan Mi's clone spent a lot of Nine Heavens Jade Dew after condensing the Vermillion 
Bird Divine Pattern.



Now, he has received more than 30,000 drops, which has not decreased but increased. This brings 
his total Jiutian Jade Dew to about 100,000 drops.

With so much Nine Heavens Jade Dew, he can try to condense the next Four Elephant Divine 
Patterns, which gives him another way to improve his strength.…..

In short, Qin Feng is very satisfied with these gains, especially the energy at the peak giant level, 
which is more than the sum of all the energy he got before, which is enough to make his strength 
improve by leaps and bounds.…..

At this moment, the roar of the heaven and earth outside stopped.

Hongjun couldn't help but look outside the Chaos Pearl.…..

And the system prompts came from Qin Feng’s mind……

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, your phantom clone has integrated the three levels of Xuanwu 
Holy Realm into one…..The prototype of Xuanwu Heavenly Realm is re-formed….."

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host for getting another prototype of heaven…..The completion 
degree of the Great Flood God Realm has been increased to 92.3%.....The host receives a large 
amount of power from heaven and earth to feed back…..Your combat power increases to 1.6 trillion 
poles……"

Boom~Long~Long!

At this moment, Qin Feng couldn't help but close his eyes, and the momentum in his body surged 
crazily...

Hongjun looked back in shock.

After a long time, Qin Feng's breath slowly calmed down.

Only then did he open his eyes, with a look of ecstasy on his face.



This time I really made a lot of money!

Just getting a prototype of a new heaven made his strength skyrocket.

Moreover, this is just the beginning...

There are thousands of opportunities hidden in this prototype of heaven, which can completely 
increase the strength of the entire divine alliance.

By then, his strength will be greatly improved again

"Dad, has your strength improved again?"

Hongjun sensed that Qin Feng's momentum was different.

Qin Feng nodded slightly and smiled without saying a word.

"Let's go! Let's go meet the phantom clone. There are a lot of chores to do this time."

"Dad, what's the matter?"

"There are thousands of opportunities within this secret realm, waiting for us to take them…."

Hongjun suddenly realized.

Immediately, his face showed ecstasy:"Yes! Dad has refined the Xuanwu Heavenly Seal. This place 
is our territory. We can take advantage of the opportunities here."….."

Qin Feng smiled slightly and waved, and the three of them disappeared into thin air.

Today, the Xuanwu Holy Realm has become the prototype of the Xuanwu Heavenly Realm.



Qin Feng has become the master of this place. He can teleport anywhere and come and go freely.
……..

But on the other side, Ancestor Hunji and others turned into streaks of white light and disappeared 
out of thin air.

With a sudden spin, everyone's feet suddenly landed on the ground.

Ancestor Hunji quickly raised his head and looked around, and was surprised to find that he was 
back in the previous temple hall.….

"This...this is the previous assembly hall!"

"what happened?! How did we get back here?!"

At this time, the exclamations of Liugen Patriarch and others rang out in the main hall.

"not good! We were forcibly transported out of the Xuanwu Holy Realm! quick! Go back quickly!"

Old man Yuexia reacted the fastest and reminded loudly.

The giants woke up suddenly and looked towards the center of the hall. There were three light 
doors, leading to the first, second and third floors of the holy realm respectively.

"Go quickly! Go and save fellow Taoist Di Mang!"

Ancestor Hunji dodged and rushed towards the entrance to the third floor.

In order to obtain the gift from Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor, he also fought hard.

The giants also followed closely...



But as soon as they took a step, something strange happened in front of them. Suddenly... 
boom~boom~boom!

I saw the three light gates in front of me making an inexplicable roar.

Then there was a continuous flash of light. The three light gates shrank instantly, turned into the size 
of a sesame seed, and disappeared out of thin air.…..

Ancestor Hunji and others were immediately thrown into the air, standing in the middle of the hall 
in bewilderment...

The entrance to the Xuanwu Holy Realm was completely closed, so how could they save Di Mang?
…….

It’s over! It’s over!

It's completely over now!

Ancestor Hunji’s heart sank!

Old Man Yuexia, Ancestor Liugen and others were all dumbfounded and stood there blankly.
………..

Huh~! Huh~! Huh~!

At this moment, thousands of white lights lit up in the field, and more and more examiners were 
teleported out.…………

But on the other side, in the Xuanwu Holy Realm, in that mysterious space.

Star Master Ziwei, Panzu and other senior leaders of the Divine Alliance were excitedly 
surrounding Xuanxu's clone.

Around the crowd, there were more than a thousand disciples of the Divine Alliance standing.



It turns out that after refining the heavenly seal, the phantom clone has complete control over the 
entire holy realm and can summon subordinates at will.

Simply, he summoned all the disciples over…..

When the disciples arrived, they were stunned for a while.

Later, under the explanation of Ziwei and others, they understood what was going on, and they all 
showed expressions of ecstasy.……

"His Majesty! You said that all the assessors were forcibly teleported? This is real?"

Ziwei Star Master asked with concern.

Pan Zu, Fuzhi and others also looked at the shadow clone with concern.

Even though the shadow clone had said it once, they still couldn't believe it.

The shadow clone smiled slightly:"Of course it is true. of! Now, in this Xuanwu Heavenly Realm, 
there are only our people and no outsiders!"

As soon as these words fell, the whole place was in an uproar, and all the disciples were excited.

At this time, the shadow clone said again:"By the way, let me remind you one more thing. This 
special space is temporary. Five days after the outside world has passed, we will be forcibly 
transported back to the temple hall."

"At that time, the third assessment will continue to begin. The space here will be forcibly taken 
back by the will of the secret earth, so we must seize this opportunity and digest this opportunity 
before the will of the secret earth takes back this place. Fu Zhi nodded repeatedly:"

Yes!" The speed of time here is a hundred times that of the outside world. Outside in the lobby for 
the past five daysFive hundred days have passed here. These five hundred days are enough for us to 
digest any harvest."



Hearing this, all the disciples suddenly realized and showed joy again.

It seems that this is the will of the secret place taking care of them. It gave the outside examiners 
five days to prepare, but gave them five hundred days.…..

These five hundred days may bring about earth-shaking changes for them...

Just when everyone was excited, white lights flashed in the field, and three more figures appeared 
out of thin air.

"His Majesty!"

"Little Lord!"

When they saw the visitor, all the disciples came forward to greet him happily.

The visitor was none other than Qin Feng, Xuan Mi's clone and Hongjun

"Your Majesty, have you killed the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor?", Ziwei Star Lord asked.

Qin Feng smiled and said nothing.

Hongjun said excitedly:"Mother, you guessed it right. Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor has been 
killed by Father!"

As soon as these words came out, the whole place was in a state of shock.

"Oh My God! Your Majesty actually killed the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor!"

"yes! Your Majesty is too strong now!"



"Ha ha!! Very good! Your Majesty can even kill the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor. Our Divine 
Alliance is getting stronger and stronger!"

At this moment, all the disciples were excited and excited.

Qin Feng smiled and shook his head:"You don't have to be so excited! I was able to kill the 
Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor with some tricks. Under normal circumstances, it is not so easy to 
succeed!"

"Your Majesty, regardless of whether you are using tricks or not, the fact that you can kill Di Mang 
is enough to prove that you are the top among the giants in terms of strength."

All the disciples had full confidence in Qin Feng and did not care about his modesty.

At this time, Fu Zhi seemed to have thought of something and stepped forward and 
whispered:"Father, you killed Di Mang this time, and successively fought with Old Man Yuexia and 
Liu Gen. Ancestor, Ancestor Ran Deng, Ancestor Amitabha, Ancestor Hunji have a feud"

"In the end, the secret place forcibly teleported all the people from all forces out of the holy realm, 
leaving them no chance to find another chance. This means that you have offended all the forces at 
once!"

As soon as these words were said, everyone was shocked.

Yes!

Why didn't they think of this?

Forget about the small and medium-sized forces.

The top beings among the three extraterrestrial sects and the four super forces of Hunji Heaven 
were all offended by them!

If you include those large forces in the Nine Heavens and Ten Domains, the situation is a bit 
unfavorable to the Divine Alliance!



At that moment, Lord Ziwei said:"Yes! Your Majesty, this time all the assessors have been forcibly 
teleported out, and only those of us from the Divine Alliance remain here. It won't be long before 
those examiners know the truth."

"This means that our League of Gods has offended all the forces at once. I am afraid that in the 
subsequent assessments, they will join forces to target us.

"If there are only one or two superpowers that are our enemies, that's fine. It would be a bit of a 
headache if all the forces jointly targeted us."

After listening to the analysis of Star Master Ziwei, all the disciples felt that it was reasonable and 
began to feel a little worried and anxious.

But Qin Feng smiled calmly:"I have thought of this a long time ago. In fact, even if they are not 
offended this time, they will still be offended in subsequent assessments. That being the case, IWhy 
look forward and backward"

"What's more, even if they join forces, they may not be able to do anything to us. This time, the 
benefits our Divine Alliance has received are incalculable. As long as you wait for the next five 
hundred days and digest it and we get the chance, there will be hope to fight against their alliance!"

After hearing this, the eyes of all the disciples lit up.

Immediately, some people continued to express their opinions.

"His Majesty! I'll understand later!"

"His Majesty! We will definitely make good use of these five hundred days. After they get out, let 
them open their eyes! Let’s see who dares to be the enemy of our Divine Alliance!"

"that is! Our Divine Alliance is not easy to deal with!

Qin Feng nodded happily:"Very good!" Next, I will distribute the harvest in the Holy Land to 
everyone. After you get it, speed up your digestion!"



"By the way, I forgot to tell you that there are still thousands of opportunities yet to be taken in this 
holy territory. If we collect them all, each of you will get an average of two or three opportunities.
….."

As soon as he said this, all the disciples cheered

"Oh My God! So many opportunities!"

"Ha ha!! This is great! If you can get two or three opportunities, you will definitely be able to break 
through to a big realm."

"Your Majesty, where are those opportunities?"

At this time, many disciples couldn't wait.

Qin Feng smiled slightly and waved his hand. A blueprint and a pass flew towards the shadow 
clone.

The blueprint was a map marking thousands of places of opportunity.

And that passage order can break all the restrictions on the land of opportunities.

The phantom clone took those two things and disappeared out of thin air.

He went to collect those opportunities.

"The clone of this deity has gone to collect opportunities. When he comes back, he can give you 
suitable opportunities."

After hearing this, all the disciples were very excited.



Qin Feng then said:"Of course, the benefits are not limited to those opportunities. This time, I got a 
large amount of spiritual flowers, spiritual tea, spiritual fruits, and a large number of magical elixirs. 
Distributed to you now!"

Oh my God!

There are benefits!

All the disciples are overjoyed!

Even Ziwei, Fuzhi and other senior officials are excited.

With such resources to cultivate, why should the Divine Alliance not be happy?

Why should they be afraid of other forces joining forces?

This After thinking about it, all the senior executives were very excited and confident..

I! God level elementalist

Chapter 1224

At this moment, Qin Feng stopped talking nonsense and distributed the many spiritual fruits 
obtained this time.

Of course, there are more spiritual flowers, spiritual grasses, spiritual plants, etc. that can be 
reserved for future elixir making.

In short, the spiritual fruits distributed were of little use to Qin Feng, but they were of great use to 
these disciples.

After receiving them, the disciples were very happy.

Afterwards, Qin Feng took out tens of thousands of lower and middle level magic pills and 
distributed them.



The value of these magical elixirs is much higher than those of spiritual fruits.

All the disciples were even more ecstatic.

Qin Feng was also pleased to see it.

Neither those spiritual fruits nor those magical pills are of any use to him, but they are extremely 
precious treasures to these disciples, which can greatly enhance their strength.

As long as these disciples improve greatly, Qin Feng will be able to receive a large amount of 
combat power in return, and his strength will also increase greatly.

It can be said that it kills two birds with one stone!

After the spiritual fruit pills were distributed, the disciples scattered in various corners of the 
platform and began to practice individually to consume the rich harvest.

In the field, only Hongjun, Panzu, and Shangguan Yunxi were left.

"Hong'er, your cultivation has reached the limit of the peak of Heavenly Saint, right?"

"Yes, Dad! At present, there are still some Nine-turn Golden Body Pills and Nine-turn Yuan Shen 
Pills that have not been refined. After refining these magical elixirs, the child will try to break 
through to the quasi-saint ancestor realm............"

Qin Feng nodded happily:"Very good! Take this spiritual root seed!"

As soon as he finished speaking, he waved his hand, and an emerald green seed blooming with 
spiritual light flew over.

Hongjun happily took the spiritual seed:"Thank you, Dad! By the way, Dad, what kind of spiritual 
root seed is this?"

"It is the seed of the World Tree, the spiritual root of the space system, and it fits you very well."



Hongjun's companion sacred weapon is the Chaos Bead, which is a space system sacred weapon, 
and the power of chaos in his body also contains the laws of space.

In short, Hongjun has extremely high talent in the space system.

At this time, Qin Feng Then he said:"Hong'er, as long as you cultivate this spiritual root seed to 
maturity, with your talent, it will be easy to break through to the quasi-saint ancestor.

Hongjun smiled and said,"Dad, you don't know something." Your child is different from ordinary 
monks. Even without the help of spiritual roots, I can still break through to the quasi-saint ancestor.

Qin Feng's eyes lit up:"What can we do?""

"Very simple! As long as I upgrade my accompanying sacred weapon, the Chaos Bead, from the 
Kaiding level to the Heaven-casting level, my child will have great hope of breaking through to the 
quasi-Saint Ancestor level in one fell swoop."

Qin Feng suddenly understood.

Then he said with some regret:"Before, my father received the six-path Holy Spirit. It's a pity that 
they were all used to sacrifice the Heaven-Slaying Sword and the Book of Earth. If not, I will send 
you a piece of Holy Spirit Qi, and your Chaos Orb will be promoted to the Heaven-casting level in 
one fell swoop."

"Dad, you don’t know something. Even without the Holy Spirit, with the seed of this World Tree, I 
can promote the Chaos Orb to the Heaven-casting level."

"how do I say this?

Hongjun explained:"Dad, this World Tree is very consistent with my Chaos Bead." As long as I 
cultivate and germinate it in the Chaos Bead, the space law system born from its seedlings will be 
superimposed on the space law of my Chaos Bead, thus strengthening the law system of my Chaos 
Bead."



"At that time, I will be able to promote the Chaos Orb to the Heaven-casting level. I can also use the 
power of the Chaos Orb to break through to the Quasi-Saint Ancestor Realm in one fell swoop.

Qin Feng was delighted:"This method is very good!" Hong'er, use these 30,000 drops of Nine 
Heavens Jade Dew to cultivate spiritual root seeds. It should be enough for those seeds to sprout 
and sprout."

As soon as he finished speaking, he waved his hand, and a rune jade bottle flew towards Hongjun.

Hongjun was stunned:"Dad, if you want to condense the white tiger divine pattern and the green 
dragon divine pattern, you still need a lot of Nine Heavens Jade Dew. Keep these for yourself!"

Qin Feng smiled:"If you can successfully break through to the Quasi-Saint Ancestor, the combat 
power you will bring back to your father will probably be more than the spirit of the Four Symbols. 
In this case, as a father, I might as well help you break through to the Quasi-Saint Ancestor first."

"What's more, my father only has a total of 100,000 drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew in his hands, 
which may not be able to condense a complete divine pattern. It is better to distribute 30,000 drops 
for you to use urgently.….."

After hearing this, Hongjun thought for a while and felt that it made sense, so he put away the jade 
bottle."Dad, the child will be cultivated in seclusion right now, and strive to break through to the 
quasi-saint ancestor as soon as possible."

Qin Feng nodded happily:"Go!"

"The kid resigned!"

At that moment, Hongjun left happily.

Panzu on the side looked envious.

At this time, Qin Feng looked at Panzu again

"Panzu, have you refined the blood of the great witch that I gave you before?



Panzu replied respectfully:"Back to Your Majesty! I have refined a small part of it, and the effect is 
very good. It has improved my subordinates' strength a lot."…."

Qin Feng nodded happily:"Very good! By the way, after you refined the blood of the great witch, 
did you generate your own great witch's blood in your body?"

"Return to Your Majesty! The subordinates generated some blood of the great witch. Moreover, my 
subordinates also discovered that the more blood of the great witch I absorb, the higher the quality 
of the blood of the great witch in my body will be. Hearing this, Qin Feng was overjoyed:"

Haha!"! great! Panzu, most people can’t refine the blood of the great witch. Even if they can, they 
can’t generate the blood of the great witch in their own bodies."

"Only after the people of the witch clan have refined the blood of the great witch can they produce 
their own blood of the great witch in their own bodies. You are not a member of the witch clan, but 
you can also generate the blood of a great witch. It seems that you are born to practice the way of 
ancient witches!"

"Not only that, you absorbed the blood of those great witches and were able to produce your own 
great witch blood so quickly, faster than those of the witch clan. It can be seen from this that you are 
more suitable for cultivating the witch body than the people of the witch clan. Perhaps, all this is 
God's will!"

Being so praised by Qin Feng, Panzu was excited and happy.

At that moment, he said humbly:"Your Majesty, thank you! Panzu's achievements are all due to 
your hard work!"

"Panzu, you don’t have to be humble. You do have superhuman talents in the way of ancient 
witchcraft. Please accept this ancient jade talisman!"

Qin Feng waved his hand, and a golden jade talisman flew over.

Panzu quickly took the jade talisman, and after looking at it for a while, he felt that the jade 
talisman exuded the aura of eternity. At first glance, it was not an ordinary thing.



"Your Majesty, this ancient jade talisman is......？"

Qin Feng explained:"This is obtained from the storage ring of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor. It 
contains the secret technique of body refining of the Witch Clan - the way of ancient witches. It is 
just right for you to practice.""

"To tell you the truth, the way of ancient witches is divided into three levels. The first level is the 
realm of great witches, the second level is the realm of ancestral witches, and the third level is the 
realm of ancient witches."

"Even though the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor is extremely talented in body refining and his 
cultivation has reached the peak giant level, his physical body is still in the realm of the Ancestral 
Witch."

"From my perspective, your body refining talent is probably even stronger than Di Mang's. If you 
come to practice, it is very possible to break through your physical body to the realm of ancient 
witches."

"If your physical body reaches the realm of ancient witches, even if your cultivation is only close to 
the early stage of the Saint Ancestor, your physical strength will be comparable to that of the early 
Saint Ancestor. From now on, it will not be difficult to be proud of the same level."

"Thank you, Your Majesty, for the reward!"

After hearing those words, Panzu was overjoyed and put away the golden jade talisman with 
excitement on his face.

"Also, you should also accept these five masses of ancestral witch blood! These are left by Emperor 
Mang Wu, the famous witch ancestor. As long as you suck the blood of these ancestral witches, it is 
not difficult for your body to evolve into the body of the ancestral witch!"

"Many... many thanks to your majesty for the reward!"

Pan Zu was so excited that he couldn't speak clearly.



"Let me remind you one more thing. As long as you practice the way of ancient witches, you can 
temper your physical body to the level of ancestral witches. Even without the help of the spiritual 
roots of heaven and earth, you can still use the magical power of your physical body to break 
through to the realm of quasi-saint ancestors............"

Panzu was ecstatic:"My subordinates understand! I will go to refine it now and strive to break 
through to the quasi-saint ancestor realm as soon as possible!""

"Go for it!"

"The subordinate resigned!"

At that moment, Pan Zu left happily.

Looking at Pan Zu's leaving figure, Qin Feng also looked pleased.

If Pan Zu can also break through to the Quasi-Saint Ancestor, then his strength will also skyrocket..

Speaking of which, the blood of the great witch and the blood of the ancestral witches are not 
suitable for Qin Feng to refine.

But Qin Feng has a stronger drop of the holy blood of creation, and the energy contained in it is 
much higher than that of the blood of the great witch and the blood of the ancestral witches. Blood.

Even the Dimang Witch Ancestor only temporarily fused, and its combat power increased by tens of 
millions.

Temporarily fused, it can only obtain one-third of the energy of the holy blood.

If it is completely fused and refined, how much will it be obtained? The combat power is simply 
unimaginable……………

Thinking of this, he looked at Shangguan Yunxi again



"Xi'er, the Suzaku spirit has been successfully condensed. After a while, Xuan Ni's clone will 
perform the spirit filling method on you!

Yun Xi was overjoyed:"Xi'er thanked Master!""

"Come with me!"

Xuan Mi's clone dropped these words and turned around to leave.

Yun Xi followed closely.

At this point, many trivial matters were arranged.

Qin Feng breathed a sigh of relief and began to sit cross-legged, preparing to retreat.

Next , all the forces will definitely unite to deal with him.

If he wants to have the ability to protect himself, he must increase his combat power to the level of 
the Half-Step Saint Ancestor.

The combat power threshold of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor is 500 million poles.

However, With his super increase of three hundred times, as long as his combat power reaches 400 
million poles, he will be comparable to the half-step Saint Ancestor.

But his current combat power is only 160 million poles, which is far from 400 million, so he is now 
the most powerful The urgent thing to do is to improve his combat power...

Thinking of this, Qin Feng took out a ball of energy from the early stage of the Quasi-Saint 
Ancestor, opened his mouth and sucked it in, and began to devour and refine it..

Chapter 1225

At this moment, on the entire platform, all the disciples of the Alliance of Gods entered into 
seclusion to practice.



At the same time, inside the secret place and the temple hall, there was chaos.

At this moment, all examiners were teleported out.

In the hall, more than 18,000 people gathered in a dense crowd, with faces full of astonishment and 
exclaims.

"what happened? What exactly is going on? Why were we teleported out!"

"Oh my God! My spiritual fruit! A spiritual fruit I just discovered! Why did it come out before I had 
time to pick it...how...why did it come out?"

"me too! I found a place of opportunity. I finally defeated the puppet guarding the entrance. Before I 
could enter, I just...came out!"

"Woo~! Woo~! Woo~! I also discovered a spiritual pond, but I didn’t have time….."

"What about the entrance? Where is the entrance to the Holy Land? Why is it missing?"

"Huh! It’s really missing!"

"It’s over! It’s over! It's completely over now! We want to go back and find another chance, but we 
have no chance.….."

At this moment, the whole audience was crying and howling, and many people were sighing and 
lamenting endlessly.

Among the crowd, Saint Taiqing also looked confused.

At this moment, Yuqing and Shangqing ran over in a hurry

"Senior brother, how are you?"



"Senior brother, have you got that opportunity?"

The two looked at Saint Taiqing with concern.

Taiqing glanced at the two with a complicated expression before sighing:"Hey! Two junior brothers, 
as brothers, they are a step too slow after all.….."

"ah~！"

The faces of Yuqing and Qing changed drastically and became extremely ugly.

That place was a great opportunity. The disciples of the last foreign Taoist sect discovered it and had 
no time to break the ban, so they had to leave the map for them to collect this time.

Unexpectedly, the three of them were lost, and completely lost.

You know, now that the entrance to the Holy Land has disappeared, it is impossible for them to go 
in again.…….

The same scene also happened in another corner.

Luojia asked Mohu anxiously

"Mohu, did you get the opportunity in that cave??"

"Why! Not even close!", Mohu smiled bitterly.

Luojia's face also became ugly.

He was extremely looking forward to the opportunity in that cave...



After a long time, he stamped his feet fiercely:"Damn it! There are obviously still five days left, so 
why would the will of the secret place forcibly transport us out and close the entrance to the holy 
realm?"

As soon as these words fell, everyone woke up.

Many people in the crowd also started talking.

"yes! It is clearly stipulated that the time for seeking opportunities is seven days! It's only been two 
days now, why did it end early?"

"yes! This is really weird!"

Everyone was very confused.

At this moment, a loud voice sounded in the field

"Everyone, I know the reason for this!"

Everyone was startled and followed the sound one after another. They saw that the speaker was Old 
Man Yuexia.

"Fellow Taoist Yuexia, do you know the reason?", Taiqing asked quickly

"Fellow Taoist, please tell me something!", Luo Hu also spoke.

All the examiners also looked at the old man Yuexia curiously, and they also wanted to know the 
reason.

The old man Yuexia looked around at everyone, then smiled coldly and said:"Everyone, haven't you 
noticed that the assessors present There are forces from all sides, but there are no people from the 
God Realm.…."

"No one from the divine realm?"



Everyone was surprised and quickly raised their heads and looked around.

"Huh! It’s true!"

"Really! Brothers Qin Feng, Qin Lei, and Qin Mu are not here!"

"Not just the three of them, not a single person from the God Realm….."

Upon seeing this, everyone found that there was not a single disciple of the Divine Alliance present, 
and there was an uproar.

In the crowd, Taiqing hurriedly said:"Fellow Taoist Yuexia, do you mean that this time the will of 
the secret earth teleported us out in advance, was it the people of the Divine Alliance who caused 
it?"

"That's right! It was the people from the Divine Alliance who were responsible! Specifically, Qin 
Feng is up to something!"

Old man Yuexia said with gritted teeth.

He hated Qin Feng extremely.

"Fellow Taoist Yuexia, do you have any evidence?"Mohu didn't believe it.

He didn't believe that the three juniors in the second realm of eternity could make any big waves?

Not only Mohu didn't believe it, but many examiners were also doubtful.

Although Qin Feng and others were in the first two assessments , His performance is excellent, but 
the cultivation level of everyone in the Divine Alliance is not high, and there is not even a quasi-
Saint Ancestor.

With such power, what ability can nearly 20,000 assessors pass out of the Holy Realm?



"yes! Fellow Taoist Yuexia, why do you think it is related to the divine world?" Taiqing also asked.

Old Man Yuexia said coldly:"I'll be honest with you fellow Taoists! I had a conflict with Qin Feng 
in the holy territory. I saw it with my own eyes. They discovered a mysterious place of opportunity."

"Although I don’t know what opportunity they got, just when we were about to successfully 
encircle and suppress him, we were forcibly teleported out, but Qin Feng and others were not 
teleported out."

"It can be seen that this forced teleportation incident was clearly to protect Qin Feng. In other 
words, this incident was most likely secretly controlled by him!"

Most of these analyzes were conjectured by Old Man Yuexia.

However, he did get the rough guess right.

After listening to the evaluators, all the examiners had different expressions.

Taiqing frowned and said:"Fellow Taoist Yuexia, according to your description, Qin The wind is 
indeed suspicious. only……"

Old Man Yuexia said with some annoyance:"Fellow Taoist, I know there is no definite evidence, but 
you don't quite believe it."

"But have you thought about it carefully? There are more than a thousand disciples of the God 
Realm, but none of them came out this time. It is absolutely impossible for them all to fall into the 
Holy Land. Just based on this, don’t you find it strange?"

"Well…..", Taiqing was stunned and felt that it made sense.

All the examiners also looked at each other and started talking in low voices.



"right! This time, 20,000 assessors entered the Holy Realm, and the vast majority of them came out. 
There were people from almost all factions, except for those who did not come out from the God 
Realm."

"yes! There are more than 1,300 people in the God Realm. It is absolutely impossible to say that it 
is because they all died in it.….."

With this discussion, everyone's suspicion of Qin Feng began to increase.

At this time, the old man under the moon said again:"I personally saw Qin Feng entering a 
mysterious place of opportunity and having a conflict with it. I am not just talking nonsense. There 
are many people who can testify!"

"That's right! This ancestor can vouch for it!", Liugen Patriarch was the first to come forward.

"I can also testify!" Amitabha also came forward.

Ancestor Ran Deng even said angrily:"I can also testify!"

"And I can also testify! At that time, Qin Feng and I were in the same place and were about to be 
surrounded and suppressed by us. As a result, we were informed, but Qin Feng was not. If you say 
that he didn't do this, I don't believe it!"

Ancestor Huanji also came forward to explain.

At this time, the whole place was in an uproar.

Once, five peak giants actually identified Qin Feng. I am afraid that this is really Qin Feng's doing.

You know, peak giants always have a lot of weight in their words. , will not talk nonsense easily.

What’s more, the five giants all said so.



If no one from the Divine Alliance appeared in the contact room, it would be difficult for them to 
believe it or not.

This time, all the assessors believed it.

In the crowd, there was too much clarity. He frowned deeply, with anger looming in his brows.

Yuqing even complained:"Elder brother, I really didn't expect that! The opportunity we were about 
to get was actually spoiled by that Qin Feng kid!"

In another corner, Mohu and Luojia looked at each other.

"Mohu, what do you think?"

"Nine times out of ten, Qin Feng is the one doing bad things!"Mohu looked a little annoyed.

Luo Jia also said coldly:"It should be him! snort! If he dares to ruin the good deeds of our 
extraterrestrial Demonic Abyss, he will never be spared!"

At this moment, all the evaluators complained constantly.

"The five giants all said so. It seems that Qin Feng did this."

"Do you still need to ask? People from all forces came out, but Qin Feng and his people from the 
God Realm did not come out. I really didn’t expect that my chance was ruined by that guy.!"

"Hey~! I wandered around the first level of the Holy Realm for two days without finding any 
opportunities. I thought I would have some good luck in the next five days, but I didn't expect that I 
would be transferred out of the Holy Realm so quickly."

"me too! It’s over! It’s over! In five days, it will be the third assessment! Only 10,000 people can 
pass this test. I'm only in my first level. I don't think I have a chance to pass."



"I also hoped that I could find some opportunities in the holy territory this time to pass the next 
level, but I didn't expect such a thing to happen!"

In the crowd, there were constant sounds of annoyance, complaints, and sighs of despair.

At this time, the old man under the moon said loudly again:"Everyone! This time, Qin Feng forcibly 
ruined our opportunity for his own selfish reasons. How can we let this matter go?"

After this reminder, everyone immediately started complaining.

"Senior Yuexia is right! The reason why we lost the opportunity is because Qin Feng caused……"

"That damn Qin Feng is causing us to be eliminated, we can't just let it go!"

"That's right! We must make him pay!"

At this moment, the crowd was filled with indignation and cursed Qin Feng one by one. When

Old Man Yuexia saw this scene, he was overjoyed.

This was the result he wanted.

Then, he said:"Everyone, it is shameful to cut off people's opportunities. Worse than life and death. 
Since Qin Feng is unjust, how about we unite and deal with him together?"

"Fellow Taoist Yuexia’s suggestion is a good one! I am willing to join!"

"I am also willing to join!"

"And I!"

At this moment, the Six Root Ancestors, the Ran Deng Ancestors, Amitabha Venerable and others 
expressed their opinions one after another.



"I am also willing to join!

Seeing this, the leaders of all the forces expressed their opinions one after another. Even Sanqing, 
Mohu, and Luojia expressed their intention to join after some discussion. Old Man Yuexia was 
overjoyed:" If you leaders are willing to deal with Qin Feng together, come over and have a 
meeting." Yes, how about we discuss it later?"

"Senior, can leaders of small and medium-sized forces like us participate?"

"hehe!! Come if you want!"

"That's great!"

At this moment, the leaders of the middle and lower forces participated enthusiastically, and the 
atmosphere in the venue was heated.

For them, it is also an honor to discuss with these top giants.

Among the crowd, only Daxian Tianyu The leader of the group, Xian Ling, looked ugly.

She witnessed with her own eyes that so many forces were uniting to deal with Qin Feng. She 
secretly thought that Lord Qin Feng would be doomed this time, and she was extremely worried.
…..

Unknown to these, Qin Feng had a great opportunity this time.

After he digests all the opportunities, it’s hard to say who will deal with whom..

Chapter 1226

In this way, under the guidance of Old Man Yuexia, the leaders of the forces held a conference to 
jointly deal with Qin Feng.



Almost all the force leaders participated in the conference, and only a handful of force leaders 
remained neutral and did not participate.

Xian Ling and Cang Sheng did not participate.……..

While the leaders of the forces were discussing how to deal with Qin Feng, something was also 
happening in the territory of Xuanwu Saint.…..

At this time, within the territory of Xuanwu Saint.

A majestic figure was suspended above a dilapidated temple.

That figure was the shadow clone.

At this moment, his face was filled with joy.

He just got a very big opportunity in the temple below.

The temple below is where Taiqing and others broke the ban before.

Unfortunately, the opportunity here has been taken by the shadow clone.

After counting the harvest, the phantom clone dodged and disappeared out of thin air.

The next second, he appeared at the entrance of a cave.

That cave was the place where Mo Hu broke the ban before.

The phantom clone took out the pass order and pinched the seal in his hand!

Buzz~!



The pass order is activated and the inspiration shines!

Click~! Click~! Click~!

The restriction at the entrance of the cave in front was automatically broken under the light of the 
pass order...

In just a few seconds, the restriction was completely broken.

The phantom clone waved, put away the pass, and strode into the cave...

A quarter of an hour later, the phantom clone walked out of the cave with a happy face.

He got another great opportunity and even got 100,000 drops of Jiutian Jade Dew.

In this way, after deducting the 30,000 drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew given to Hongjun, he still 
has 170,000 drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew, which is enough to condense the third type of Four 
Elephant Divine Patterns...

At that moment, the phantom clone left with satisfaction and continued to collect opportunities.
…….

In this way, the phantom clone continued to teleport within the holy territory with the Xuanwu 
Heavenly Seal, receiving one opportunity after another, and his harvest continued to increase.…..

Time flies!

In the blink of an eye, four days have passed in the outside world…….

Secret place, inside the temple hall.

The meeting of leaders of all forces has ended.



In the end, everyone agreed that they should try their best to get rid of Qin Feng in the subsequent 
assessment.

As for the children of the Divine Alliance, they must kill those who can.

At this moment, the eight giants, Old Man Yuexia, Ancestor Liugen, Ancestor Randeng, Ancestor 
Hunji, Amitabha, Taiqing Shengzun, Mohou, and Luojia gathered together and were discussing 
something.…..

"Everyone, four days have passed and Qin Feng, Qin Mu, and Qin Lei have not come out.….."

The old man under the moon looks at the giants

"Not only did the three of them not come out, but fellow Taoist Di Mang didn't come out either! 
Ancestor Liugen sighed.

Ancestor Hunji smiled bitterly:"Looking at this situation, fellow Taoist Dimang is in danger. I'm 
afraid he has been killed by Qin Feng and Qin Mu.""

The Great Witch Heaven Realm was completely wiped out this time. Only some disciples below the 
Heavenly Saint were left, who were sent out from the first and second levels of the Saint Realm.

And those low-level disciples did not have Emperor Mang's soul card in their hands, so Hunji Lao 
Zu and others were not sure about the life and death of Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor at first.

But these four days have passed and Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor has not come out yet. They 
also realized that Emperor Mang was in danger.

With this thought, all the giants It is inevitable that some rabbits and foxes will be sad.

Taiqing, Mohu, and Luo Jia frowned when they heard this.

Since the existence of this secret place, many peak giants have entered every time it is opened, and I 
have never heard of a peak giant falling.



This time, only two assessments were conducted after the secret land was opened, and a peak giant 
fell. It may not be too exaggerated!

To put it bluntly, these three people couldn't believe it.

At that moment, Taiqing said:"Everyone, Qin Fenghe Is Qin Mu that strong? Can the two of them 
join forces to destroy the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor?"

Mohu also echoed:"Yes! Fellow Daoist Di Mang is also a peak giant. If you want to kill him, you 
will need at least half the strength of the Holy Ancestor. Do you believe that Qin Feng and Qin Mu 
can be compared to the Half-Step Saint Ancestor together? Old Man Yuexia smiled bitterly:"The 
two fellow Taoists don't know something. Fellow Taoist Di Mang will suffer this fate because of his 
wrong decision-making." At that time, he forcibly fused a drop of the holy blood of 
creation………"

At that moment, Old Man Yuexia simply explained the situation at that time.

For the sake of his own face and that of Liugen Ancestor, he vilified Qin Feng.

He did not say that he, Liugen Ancestor and Dimang Ancestor were no match for Qin Feng if they 
joined forces. That would be too shameless.

He only said that Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor was eager for quick success and chose to self-
destruct physically, hoping to harm both Qin Feng and Qin Feng.

Unexpectedly, Qin Feng avoided the self-destruction blow, and Dimang Wuzu was seriously injured 
after stealing the chicken and losing the rice.

Qin Feng and Qin Mu took the opportunity to join forces and blasted and strangled the seriously 
injured Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor. In the end, they met Amitabha, Ancestor Hunji, Ancestor 
Randeng and others... After hearing this, all the giants were dumbfounded.

Even though Old Man Yuexia and Ancestor Liugen deliberately belittled Qin Feng's strength, the 
giants were still shocked.



"I really didn’t expect that! That Qin Feng's combat power actually exceeded the limit of a peak 
giant, and he also had a creation-level sword array. With such strength, no wonder it can force 
fellow Taoist Di Mang to self-destruct!"

Saint Ancestor Taiqing was filled with emotion.

Mohou and Luojia also nodded slightly.

Even Ancestor Hunji, Amitabha and others were silent.

These people have not fought against Qin Feng, and they still look down on Qin Feng deep in their 
hearts.. Those who had fought against Qin Feng were Old Man Yuexia, Ancestor Liugen, and 
Ancient Ancestor Randeng.

However, when Ancient Ancestor Randeneng fought against Qin Feng, Qin Feng’s combat power 
was only 120 million poles.

Wait for Qin Feng When they fought against Old Man Yuexia and Ancestor Liugen, their combat 
power had already increased to 150 million poles.

Ancestor Kelan Deng’s impression of Qin Feng’s strength was still at 120 million poles.

He didn’t believe that Qin Feng could do it in just a short period of time. Within a few hours, his 
strength can skyrocket by 30 million poles.

As a result, his evaluation of Qin Feng's strength is still greatly underestimated.

In short, except for Old Man Yuexia and the Six Root Ancestors, the other giants present have 
greatly underestimated As for Qin Feng's strength, he thought that Qin Feng's combat power was 
just above the limit of the peak giant, which was only 100 million poles.

At this time, Mohu said with a cold face:"Fellow Taoist Yuexia, Qin Feng is like that That's all, how 
powerful is Qin Mu? Old Man Yuexia thought for a while and said:"I have not directly fought with 
Qin Mu, but overall, he should have the combat power of a peak giant, almost just passing the 
threshold."…."



As soon as these words were said, all the giants were filled with emotion again.

At that moment, Taiqing said:"I didn't expect that both Qin Feng and Qin Mu were so strong. 
Presumably Qin Lei's strength is not inferior to Qin Mu's. In this way, the three Qin Feng brothers 
will be difficult to deal with!

The corner of Mohu's mouth curled up slightly:"Brother Taiqing, you are so humble! Outsiders 
don't know the details of your Taoist sect, but I know it very well. If your two junior brothers show 
their true strength, I'm afraid the three brothers Qin Feng are not the three of you." man's 
opponent….."

As soon as these words came out, the giants were shocked and looked at Taiqing with strange 
expressions on their faces.

Taiqing was slightly startled. He knew that Mohu was talking about Yuqing and Shangqing.

How did this guy know the details of his family?

This made Taiqing a little frightened.

Then, he sneered and said:"Haha!! You Moyuan are quite well-informed. By the way, I have also 
heard one thing, that among you Moyuan, you and Luo Jia are the best at joining forces."

"With the combined power of the two of you, I am afraid that none of the three extreme giants will 
be your opponent!"

As soon as these words came out, the giants were shocked again.

Oh my god!

Three extreme-level peak giants, that is, three peak giants with a combat power of 100 million 
extremes! The combined power of Mahuluojia is so great Is it that strong?

At this thought, the giants couldn't help but look at the two Mohou Luojia.



They saw Luojia's mouth curled up slightly, as if he didn't bother to refute.

Mohu's expression was even more calm.

Obviously, the two acquiesced. This fact.

Seeing this, the giants were silent.

But Old Man Yuexia was ecstatic.

At that moment, he said:"Haha! This time, with Daozong and Moyuan joining you, it will be 
difficult for Qin Feng to die!"

Randeng Ancestor also smiled proudly and said:"Hehe! Not to mention that Qin Feng's child is only 
at the peak of his strength. Even if he has a strength of 200 million, he may not be able to survive!"

As soon as these words were said, all the giants looked at each other and showed knowing smiles.

In their opinion, with their joint strength, they can definitely kill Qin Feng.

Even if Qin Feng has a combat power of 200 million, That's not enough………..

But on the other side, deep in the Xuanwu Holy Realm, in that mysterious space.

In addition to the four days that have passed, four hundred days have passed in that space, which is 
more than a year.

At this moment, on the platform, somewhere in a corner.

Qin Feng slowly opened his eyes while meditating, with a look of ecstasy on his face.



After more than four hundred days of seclusion and practice, he finally digested all the energy, 
allowing his combat power to reach 300 million in one fell swoop.…….

At this point, the outside giants may not have expected this.

Obviously, Qin Feng's improvement in strength is not over yet.

At this moment, he waved his hand, and there was a drop of purple-gold blood in his palm. It was 
the holy blood of creation…
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That drop of the Holy Blood of Creation exuded the power of Peng Bai's bloodline, and Qin Feng 
was delighted to see it...

Now, his combat power has reached 300 million, and his cultivation has reached 98.2% of the 
Extreme Saint Realm, which is only one step away from the Heavenly Saint Realm. One step away.

If he can break through the realm, his strength will definitely skyrocket.

By that time, his strength will definitely be comparable to that of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor.

Even if he has not yet broken through to the Heavenly Saint Realm, as long as he refines the Holy 
Blood of Creation in front of him, he may be able to reach the threshold of the Half-Step Saint 
Ancestor.

"I wonder if after refining this drop of holy blood, my combat power will reach 400 million?"

Qin Feng muttered in his heart.

The combat power threshold of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor is 500 million poles.

With his super increase, as long as the combat power reaches 400 million poles, it will be 
comparable to the threshold of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor.



Thinking of this , Qin Feng's mind moved, and he was ready to swallow the holy blood and start 
refining it.…..

Boom~Long~Long!

But at this moment, his body suddenly shook, and there was a roar inside his body.

"Hey~! This is….."

Qin Feng immediately stopped swallowing the holy blood in his hand and turned to look at the 
Xuan female clone on the other side.......

At this moment, Xuan Min's clone just opened her eyes, with a look of ecstasy on her face.

At this moment, the roar in Qin Feng's body became louder and louder, and the momentum in his 
body also skyrocketed crazily, spreading to all directions, instantly alarming the entire audience.…..

"It's Your Majesty!"

"Your Majesty's momentum is rising sharply again….."

All the disciples looked at Qin Feng with joy.…..

Ha ha!! Done!!

Qin Feng was also pleasantly surprised. He closed his eyes directly and sensed the Great Flood God 
Realm in his body...

At this time, in a certain valley in the eastern region of the Great Flood God Realm.

Liu Yan was suspended in the air, looking up at the Fengling Xingxing in front of her.



At the end of the spiritual root tree hundreds of millions of feet high, the energy of countless 
spiritual roots escaped and turned into a monstrous blue spiritual energy, covering hundreds of 
millions of miles... At the same moment, endless power of heaven and earth descended from the 
sky...

Boom~Long~ Long!

The power of heaven and earth and the energy of spiritual roots automatically blended, causing 
resonance between heaven and earth, and the entire divine world trembled...

Gradually, an extremely huge cyan divine pattern formed in the sky, and then transformed from 
virtual to solid, and from solid to form. , transformed into a ten-thousand-foot-long divine dragon 
with green scales all over its body, wrapped in the light of wind and thunder, looking up to the sky 
and roaring, with an extremely earth-shattering momentum...

This is the spirit of the blue dragon, the head of the four divine patterns!

It turned out that when the shadow clone collected a lot of opportunities before, it also obtained a 
lot of Nine Heavens Jade Dew, which was handed over to the Xuan female clone.

Later, Xuan Mi's clone used those Nine Heavens Jade Dew, and with the help of Liu Yan, finally 
condensed the Azure Dragon Divine Pattern and completed it.…….

At this point, among the four major divine patterns, the blue dragon, vermilion bird, and basalt 
patterns have all been completed, but the white tiger divine pattern has not yet condensed...

Roar~!

At this moment, the spirit of the green dragon looked up to the sky and roared, causing the heaven 
and earth to shake, and the avenue to shine brightly, alarming countless creatures in the divine 
world... At the same time, Qin Feng's mind also heard a system prompt.…….

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, your Azure Dragon Divine Pattern has been successfully 
condensed.…….The eastern part of the Great Flood God Realm is guarded by the Green Dragon 
Spirit, and the perfection of the Great Flood God Realm has been increased to 93.3%....."



"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, your Great Flood God Realm has grown significantly, and the 
host has received a lot of feedback from the power of heaven and earth.…….Your combat power 
increases to 320 million poles…….."

Boom~Long~Long!

At this moment, Qin Feng's whole body momentum surged…..

After a long time, the increase in momentum slowly stopped.

His eyes opened and closed, his divine light was exposed, and his face was full of ecstasy.

This time, his combat power has soared to 320 million poles, and his overall strength is getting 
closer to that of the Half-Step Saint Ancestor.………..

"Your Majesty's strength has improved a lot!"

"yes! With His Majesty in charge, our Divine League is getting stronger and stronger!"

"Ha ha!! Not only has His Majesty's strength increased, but the strength of His Majesty's two clones 
has exceeded the limit of the peak giant!"

"Now even if all the forces outside join forces, they may not be able to suppress our League of 
Gods.……"

At this moment, the Divine League was filled with excitement. that's the truth!

Today, Qin Feng's combat power is 320 million poles, and the combat power of the two major 
clones exceeds 100 million poles.

In other words, the comprehensive strength of the two clones is not inferior to Old Man Yuexia, and 
is even stronger.

Old Man Yuexia relied on the Moon of Creation to allow his combat power to reach 120 million.



Although the two clones do not have such powerful innate holy objects, their combat power 
increase is much greater than that of Old Man Yuexia, and they also have holy weapons with them.

As a result, the combined strength of the two clones surpassed Old Man Yuexia by a head, and was 
not much worse than the Six Root Ancestors.…….

The Six Root Ancestor's own combat power is not stronger than the two clones. He relies on the 
sacred artifact of creation - the six pure bamboos to be stronger than the two clones, but the strength 
is extremely limited... In short,

Qin Feng's retreat, the original body Both his and his clones are greatly improved in strength.

At this moment, all the disciples looked over excitedly...

In a corner of the crowd, Chu Chu and Shangguan Yunxi were together, with excitement on their 
faces.

They are all happy for Qin Feng.

After so many days of practice, Chu Chu refined a large number of Xuanwu divine patterns, as well 
as various divine pills and opportunities. His cultivation level has successfully reached the limit of 
the peak of Heavenly Saint, and he is just a hair away from the quasi-Saint Ancestor.

Shangguan Yunxi's gains were also huge.

She had received the spiritual imbuing from Xuan Mi's clone before, merged with the spirit of 
Suzaku, and became the Suzaku Emperor guarding the south of the Great Flood God Realm. Her 
cultivation level had successfully broken through to the late stage of Tiansheng.

At the same time, she obtained two more sacred artifacts, one was the red Suzaku Divine Armor, 
and the other was the Flame of Nirvana.

The flame of Nirvana can destroy life and death, and has endless destructive power. It can also be 
used to make alchemy, and it is very clever to cooperate with the Qiankun Ding.



Nowadays, Yun Xi's cultivation has greatly improved, and with the help of the Qiankun Cauldron 
and the Flame of Nirvana, her alchemy skills have improved by leaps and bounds.

Because of this, Qin Feng gave her a large amount of medicinal materials obtained in the valley this 
time and asked her to try to refine some upper realm medicines.The magic elixir.

After Yun Xi integrated the Suzaku Spirit, she also digested many other resources and opportunities. 
After raising her cultivation level to the limit of the late Heavenly Sage, she began to try to make 
alchemy.

During this period of time, she has indeed refined a lot of high-level divine elixirs, so that the future 
development of the Shenmeng can continue continuously.……..

However, Qin Feng opened his eyes and looked around, with a look of relief on his face.

After these four hundred days of practice, the strength of the entire Shenmeng disciples has 
improved tremendously. Even the weakest ones have broken through to the second realm of 
eternity, and several more have been promoted to the Heavenly Saint realm...

This Everything made Qin Feng very satisfied.

Apart from that, there was another thing that made him quite satisfied.

Thinking of this, he turned to look at the phantom clone beside him.

At this moment, the phantom clone was constantly making seals with both hands, refining the 
purple gold alms bowl in front of him.

The purple gold alms bowl was snatched by Qin Feng from the ancient Ancestor Ran Deng. It was 
the sustenance of the Ancient Ancestor Ran Deng in cultivating his evil body.

At this moment, with the sacrifice of the shadow clone and the repair of various resources, the 
originally broken purple gold alms bowl will be repaired.



Once the purple gold alms bowl is repaired, it can be used to condense Qin Feng's ego clone.

People have three attachments: good attachment, evil attachment, and self-attachment.

The method of breaking the attachment of the clone will be to separate one's three major obsessions, 
turn one into three, and practice each one.

Qin Feng has already cultivated the clone of good attachment and the clone of evil attachment. As 
long as he refines the clone of ego, he will be close to success.…..

At that time, he would have another trump card against the combined forces.

Thinking of this, Qin Feng looked around, and finally his eyes fell on a beautiful and graceful 
figure.

That is Qinglin!

Today, Qinglin, with the help of a large amount of resources and opportunities, has successfully 
broken through to the early stage of Tiansheng.

"Qinglin! come on!"

"yes! His Majesty!"

After being summoned by Qin Feng, Qinglin walked over happily, and all the disciples also showed 
curiosity.

"Your Majesty, why are you calling me??"

"I have observed all the disciples and found that you are the most suitable to merge with the Green 
Dragon Spirit. Wait a moment, and I'll ask Xuan Ni's clone to imbue you with spirit and make you 
the Azure Dragon Emperor!"



As soon as these words were said, all the disciples were in an uproar. They all looked at Qinglin 
with envious expressions. They were all extremely envious.........

Qinglin was even more ecstatic:"Thank you, Your Majesty!"

Then, Xuan Min's clone greeted Qinglin:"Come here!"

"yes! His Majesty!"

At that moment, Qing Lin walked over with a look of joy.

Qin Feng looked at her graceful back, showing a look of expectation.

Among the four spirits, the spirit of the green dragon was the strongest.

This time, Xuan Min's clone was enough It took 160,000 drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew to 
condense the Azure Dragon Spirit, which was about 50% more than the Vermilion Bird Spirit and 
the Xuanwu Spirit.

It can be seen that the Azure Dragon Spirit is extremely powerful.

Besides, Qinglin is already in the early stage of Tiansheng. No one knows how far the cultivation 
level will be if it is integrated with the spirit of the Azure Dragon.…..

Qin Feng also wanted to know, and was naturally looking forward to it...

Soon, Qinglin came to Xuan Mi's clone in the envious eyes of all the disciples.Before...

Just when everyone wanted to see what kind of breakthrough Qinglin would achieve after merging, 
a sudden change occurred in the field..........

Boom~Long~Long!



Suddenly, there was an earth-shattering roar in a corner of the platform, and a terrifying aura rose 
into the sky and surged in all directions.…..

Everyone was shocked and looked at the sound..
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Boom~Long~Long!

Suddenly, there was an earth-shattering roar in a corner of the platform, and a terrifying aura rose 
into the sky and surged in all directions.…..

Everyone was shocked and looked at the sound……..

In that corner, I saw a spiritual bead blooming with dazzling light, instantly brightening the entire 
platform...

Wave after wave of monstrous spiritual energy storms emanated from the spiritual bead.…..

"It's the young master!"

"Could it be that the young master has made a breakthrough?!"

All the disciples exclaimed.

Qin Feng's eyes also shone and he looked over with joy.…..

That spiritual bead is the Chaos Bead!

Over the past few days, Hongjun has been cultivating the seeds of the World Tree in the Chaos Orb, 
and today there is finally movement...

Boom~Long~Long!



Just as everyone was nervously watching, another overwhelming aura of combat power emitted 
from the Chaos Orb, instantly covering the entire audience, and suddenly reached the early stage of 
the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.……

"This...this momentum has reached the early stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor~! Oh my God! The 
young master has broken through to the early stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor!"

"Ha ha!! The young master has made a breakthrough! The young master really made a 
breakthrough!"

The crowd suddenly burst into cheers...

Boom~Rong~Rong!

But before the crowd's shouts fell, the momentum emitted from the Chaos Bead continued to surge, 
and in the blink of an eye it reached the limit of the early stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.…..

"Huh! It has reached the limit of the early stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor……"

All the disciples exclaimed again…..

Boom~Long~Long!

The momentum emanating from the Chaos Bead continued to increase, and in the blink of an eye it 
reached the mid-stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.…..

But this is not over yet, the momentum exuded by the Chaos Bead continues to increase crazily.…..

The limit of the mid-term quasi-saint ancestor…….The late stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor... The 
limit of the late stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor……..

Boom~Long~Long!



The monstrous momentum emitted by the Chaos Bead continued one after another for a full quarter 
of an hour before gradually calming down and finally staying at the limit of the late Quasi-Saint 
Ancestor, just one step away from the pinnacle of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.…..

Seeing this astonishing scene, all the disciples were stunned and their mouths opened wide.…….

No way?

Isn't the young master at the pinnacle of Heavenly Saint?

Could it be that he suddenly reached the limit of the late stage quasi-saint ancestor?

If so, this is too exaggerated!

Just when the children of the Alliance of Gods were shocked, Qin Feng also heard a system prompt 
in his mind.…….

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, your child Hongjun successfully cultivated the World Tree and 
generated the core of heaven.……….The core of heaven and the world of Chaos Pearl are 
beginning to merge………."

"Ding~! Fusion successful…..The quality of the Chaos Bead has been upgraded to the Heaven-
casting level.…..Hongjun broke through the bottleneck and advanced to the early stage of Quasi-
Saint Ancestor.……"

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host for receiving a large amount of combat power in return. Your 
combat power has been increased to 340 million poles.……."

Boom~Long~Long!

At this moment, Qin Feng's tiger body shook, and his whole body's momentum exploded instantly, 
and it also increased crazily.…..

Everyone was shocked and looked at Qin Feng again.…..



After a long time, the violent momentum gradually subsided.

Qin Feng also slowly opened his eyes, with a look of joy on his face.

His son Hongjun finally broke through to the early stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor.

At this point, the Divine Alliance also has a quasi-saint ancestor level powerhouse.

What's even better is that Hongjun's breakthrough actually allowed him to receive a large amount of 
combat power in return, which increased his combat power from 320 million poles to 340 million in 
one fell swoop, an increase of 20 million poles.…..

Qin Feng was very happy at this thought.

At this moment, Hongjun walked out of the Chaos Bead.

As soon as he appeared, the disciples were surprised to find that his cultivation level was only at the 
early stage of the Saint Ancestor.

In other words, Hongjun's cultivation level is only at the early stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor, but 
his comprehensive strength has reached the limit of the late-stage Quasi-Saint Ancestor. He is only 
one step away from the threshold of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor's peak.…..

This made all the disciples marvel, secretly thinking that the young master is indeed extraordinary 
and has the legacy of His Majesty.

Just the cultivation level of the quasi-saint ancestor in the early stage, the comprehensive strength 
can be comparable to the limit of the quasi-saint ancestor in the later stage, easily crushing the same 
level!

The disciples were overjoyed at this thought.

But as soon as Hongjun came out of the Chaos Pearl, he ran towards Qin Feng with a face filled 
with joy.…..



"father! The kid has a breakthrough!"

"My father saw it!"

Qin Feng also looked at Hongjun with a look of relief.

With this breakthrough in cultivation, Hongjun's appearance has also changed. He is one or two 
years more mature than before, and he already looks like a teenager.

"Hong'er, you just cultivated the world tree into the core of the heaven, and allowed yourself to 
break through to the early stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor. If I give you some Nine Heavens Jade 
Dew to cultivate the world tree to maturity, and let the core of the heaven grow into the prototype of 
the heaven, you There should be a big breakthrough, right?"

"whee! The father really understands the child! If the core of the Heaven Realm is promoted to the 
prototype of the Heaven Realm, not only will the child's cultivation level improve, but his overall 
strength will also reach the threshold of the pinnacle of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.….."

Qin Feng nodded happily:"Very good! Very good! In this way, it is actually very easy for your 
strength to reach the threshold of the peak giant. As long as you cultivate the World Tree to 
maturity, its core of heaven will naturally be promoted to the prototype of heaven.…."

Hongjun smiled bitterly:"Dad, to cultivate the World Tree to maturity, at least 100,000 drops of 
Nine Heavens Jade Dew are needed, and there is not a drop in the child's hand. Presumably, you 
don't have much in your hand, right?"

Qin Feng nodded slightly:"That's right! There are only a few thousand drops left in my father's 
hand, so I really can't help you. However, we don't have to rush. After the next assessment, the 
secret land will definitely reward Nine Heavens Jade Dew. By then, my father will give priority to 
helping you cultivate it. Out of the prototype of heaven…."

Hongjun was overjoyed:"Thank you, dad!"

Qin Feng smiled slightly:"Hong'er, you have just made a breakthrough in cultivation, and you still 
need to consolidate your realm.…."



"Dad, let’s go and strengthen my son right now!"

At that moment, Hongjun resigned to Qin Feng and walked aside to consolidate his cultivation...

On the other side, Qinglin was filled with envy after watching this scene.

At this time, the voice of Xuan Mi's clone rang in her ears

"Let’s get started, close your eyes and let go of your soul protection….."

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

Qinglin closed his eyes obediently, his long eyelashes trembling slightly.

The disciples around him also looked over curiously.…..

Even Qin Feng and Hongjun looked over with concern.…..

At this time, Xuan Ming concentrated on her luck, put her two fingers together and pressed them 
between Qinglin's eyebrows.…..

Bah~la~la~!

The next second, blue and blue electric lights erupted from the fingertips of Xuan Mi's clone, and 
the sounds of wind and thunder continued to erupt...

Among those electric lights, there was also a blue divine pattern, exuding an incomparable sacred 
aura...

That It's the Green Dragon Divine Mark!



Xuan Mi's clone pressed a finger on Qinglin's smooth forehead, and the Azure Dragon Divine Mark 
emitting spiritual light penetrated directly into the center of the eyebrows and rushed towards 
Qinglin's sea of consciousness.…..

Suddenly, lightning flashed and thundered in Qinglin's sea of consciousness, and the power of her 
divine consciousness was surging. Her whole body also exuded the aura of heaven-reaching 
Taoism...

Immediately afterwards, Qinglin's delicate body shook, and her whole body's aura was like a 
volcano erupting, going straight up crazily. Chong, the level of cultivation also soared... the limit of 
the early stage of Tiansheng…….The middle stage of Tiansheng...the limit of the middle stage of 
Tiansheng... boom~boom~boom!

Qinglin's momentum continued to surge, and overwhelming numbers of people surged in all 
directions, shocking the world.…..

Late Tiansheng period…….The limit of the late stage of Tiansheng...the peak of Tiansheng…….

Click~!

At this moment, a soft sound came from Qinglin's body, like a bottleneck being broken through in 
one fell swoop...

Boom~Long~Long!

Immediately afterwards, Qinglin's momentum skyrocketed crazily, more than doubling, and in the 
blink of an eye he reached the early stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor.…..

The overwhelming momentum instantly filled the entire platform, leaving all the disciples stunned.
…..

OMG!

After Qinglin merged with the spirit of Qinglong, he broke through to the early stage of Quasi-Saint 
Ancestor in one fell swoop.



This Azure Dragon Spirit is worthy of being the first of the four divine patterns.

Of course, Qinglin's own cultivation level is very high, which also has a lot to do with it.

In short, the second quasi-saint ancestor of the Divine Alliance appeared just like this!

At this moment, Qinglin's momentum increased and slowly slowed down...

But before the disciples could breathe a sigh of relief, there was another clear sound from heaven 
and earth.…..

Buzz~!

A huge projection of the blue dragon appeared behind Qinglin, and the divine power enveloped the 
whole place, and the endless spiritual pressure overwhelmed all directions...

After a moment, the projection of the blue dragon spirit fell, and Qinglin's body was attached, 
automatically forming a piece full of dragons. The cyan armor with scales, and there is a cyan 
whirlwind between the armor plates...

In addition, there is a golden dragon ball, suspended above Qinglin's head, which bursts out from 
time to time with lightning all over the sky, exuding the power of destroying the world.........

Those two objects both have a halo of Dao charm and are full of spirituality. They are the sacred 
Qinglong Divine Armor and the Dragon Pearl, which are the standard equipment of the Qinglong 
Emperor.…..

At this time, Qinglin slowly opened his beautiful eyes, his face full of ecstasy.

At the same time, the system prompts also sounded in Qin Feng’s mind…….

"Ding~! Congratulations to the host, your subordinate Qinglin has broken through to the early stage 
of Quasi-Saint Ancestor.…..The host receives a large amount of combat power in return, and your 
combat power is increased to 345 million poles.….."



Boom~Long~Long!

Qin Feng's tiger body trembled, and his momentum surged again…
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Boom~Long~Long!

Qin Feng's tiger body trembled, and his momentum surged again………

After a moment, he slowly opened his eyes and his face showed joy again.

Qinglin did not disappoint him!

This time, Qinglin merged with the spirit of Qinglong and broke through to the early stage of Quasi-
Saint Ancestor in one fell swoop.

If we include the two sacred artifacts of the Azure Dragon Divine Armor and the Dragon Ball, 
Qinglin's comprehensive strength should be able to surpass most of the same level, comparable to 
the limit of the early stage of the Quasi-Saint Ancestor.

After all, not every quasi-saint ancestor owns a sacred weapon. It would be nice to have one.

And Qinglin not only owns the holy weapon, but also owns two.

Having said that, compared to the number of holy weapons, among the three great emperors, Yun 
Xi, who had the lowest cultivation level, had the most.

Yun Xi possesses three sacred artifacts: the Suzaku Divine Armor, the Flame of Nirvana, and the 
Qiankun Cauldron. Among them, the Qiankun Cauldron is a heaven-level sacred weapon.

This makes Yun Xi's overall strength comparable to the peak of Tiansheng.



In short, Qinglin's breakthrough in cultivation this time allowed the Divine Alliance to add another 
strong quasi-saint ancestor, and also increased Qin Feng's combat power to 345 million.

This is very close to his first combat power target of 400 million poles.

As long as his combat power reaches 400 million poles, his overall strength will be comparable to 
the threshold of the Semi-Saint Ancestor.

At that time, even if all the forces join forces to deal with him, he will not be afraid anymore!

Thinking of this, Qin Feng looked at the holy blood of creation in front of him again, opened his 
mouth, sucked it in, and swallowed it.…..

As soon as the holy blood entered the throat, a monstrous heavenly charm of creation instantly burst 
out, rushing directly towards Qin Feng's limbs and bones...

Boom~!

The next second, Qin Feng's whole body shook violently, and his body continued to swell like a 
balloon. The overwhelming power of blood and energy emitted from his body and spread to all 
directions.…..

Suddenly, the power of the blood stirred the heaven and the earth, and the wind and thunder moved 
together.…..

At the same time, Qin Feng frowned slightly, with a look of pain on his fair and handsome face.…..

Obviously, the holy blood of creation is extremely fused. Even with Qin Feng's physical strength, 
he still has to endure great pain.…..

Bang~! Bang~! Bang~!

Another burst of explosions!



Qin Feng's exposed skin outside his robe swelled, forming knotted muscles, making his whole 
person look more majestic.

Immediately afterwards, the energy and blood all over his body burst out crazily, emitting a 
torrential bloody light.…..

Boom~Long~Long~!

The next second, Qin Feng's fighting strength surged...

350 million…..360 million…….370 million...

380 million…..390 million…….400 million...

In the blink of an eye, Qin Feng's fighting strength surged to 400 million, and then the surging 
bloodline power gradually calmed down...

The disciples around him were stunned, and their eyes widened.…..

Oh My God!

Your Majesty's strength has improved a lot!

Is this strength improving too fast?

At this moment, Qin Feng slowly opened his eyes, his eyes like torches, with a hint of blood...

Then he waved again, and the void shook, boom~long~long!

The next second, a thousand-foot-long divine flag, Just burst out of the air... click~! Click~! Click~!



As soon as the divine flag came out, it exuded a monstrous heavenly charm of creation, crushing 
every inch of the surrounding space into fragments, stirring up the laws of heaven and earth and 
instantly causing chaos...

That was the broken sacred artifact of creation - the Witch God Flag!

"really! After integrating the Holy Blood of Creation, I used this shaman flag, which is a good 
thing.….."

The corners of Qin Feng's mouth curled up slightly, revealing a faint smile.

The two clones are extensions of his body.

If he can use the Witch God Banner, then the two clones can use the Witch God Banner.

At that time, he can use the Heaven-Slaying Sword Formation, and one of the clones can use the 
Witch God Banner.

In this way, the combat power of the clone will skyrocket. Even if the six ancestors have a complete 
sacred weapon of creation, they may not be the opponent of the clone... At this thought, Qin Feng 
smiled at the corner of his mouth and looked at what was coming next. The assessment is more 
confident.

But then, he seemed to think of something, shook his head, and sighed again

"Dad, what's wrong with you? Why sigh!"

Hongjun, who had been paying attention, ran over with concern on his face.

When the disciples saw this scene, they were also puzzled.

Yes!



Your Majesty has merged with the Holy Blood of Creation and his strength has greatly improved 
again. He should be happy.

Why did he sigh?

Qin Feng glanced at Hongjun, didn't say much, and just opened his mouth and squirted…..

Boom~Long~Long!

The next second, Qin Feng's whole body shook violently, his body trembled slightly, and his blood 
energy dropped sharply.

In just a moment, his combat power dropped back to 345 million, and the drop of the holy blood of 
creation flew out from his mouth, suspended in the air, faintly exuding the heavenly charm of 
creation that shocked the heavens and the earth.…..

Hongjun was stunned:"Dad, you failed to refine this drop of the holy blood of creation?"

Qin Feng nodded slightly.

Hongjun was surprised:"No way? Dad, your physical strength is comparable to the middle stage of 
the Saint Ancestor, and even stronger than the Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor. Could it be that even 
you can't completely refine it?"

Qin Feng nodded slightly:"As a father It really cannot be completely refined! Now it seems that if 
you want to completely refine it, your physical strength must reach the late stage of the Saint 
Ancestor.…."

"That's it…..", Hongjun was slightly disappointed.

All the disciples also showed some disappointment.

Qin Feng smiled and said:"However, not only is this not a bad thing, it is also a good thing!"



Hongjun was puzzled:"Dad, how do you say this?"

Qin Feng explained:"The reason why my father cannot be completely refined, I underestimated this 
drop of the Holy Blood of Creation before. It contains much more energy than I imagined. If I 
expected it right, when the emperor's light was fused before, not even 20% of the power of the 
blood was used."

"And when I forcibly fused it just now, I only exerted 30% of the power of my bloodline. But just 
30% of the power of my bloodline increased my combat power from 345 million to 400 million."

"In other words, if I can completely refine it, my combat power will increase even more, and I'm 
afraid I can directly reach 500 million poles.….."

After hearing these words, Hongjun was shocked.

The disciples around him were also dumbfounded.

According to His Majesty's wishes, this drop of the Holy Spirit of Creation can provide him with a 
combat power of about 150 million poles!

This is too exaggerated!

Before this, Qin Feng's evaluation was that this drop of holy blood could provide him with a combat 
power of 70 to 80 million, but now it has doubled.

From this point of view, they really underestimated this drop of holy blood!

At this time, Hongjun suddenly said:"Dad, I understand! In other words, the value of this drop of 
holy blood is stronger than we previously estimated. If you can truly refine it, you will get more 
benefits.…."

Qin Feng smiled again and said:"Actually, I can also forcibly fuse it now, so that I can greatly 
improve my strength in a short period of time, and I can also control the Witch God Banner. In other 
words, this is also a trump card.…."



Hongjun's eyes lit up:"Yes! Dad, when Di Mang forcibly fused this drop of holy blood, he could 
only last for a quarter of an hour. How long can you last?"

"My father's body is much stronger than his, so he can hold on for an hour without any problem!"

As soon as these words were said, Hongjun was overjoyed.

The disciples around him also showed happy expressions.

One hour is long enough!

If Qin Feng uses the holy blood as his trump card, the effect will be much stronger than that of Di 
Mang.

In other words, With this drop of holy blood in hand, Qin Feng can reach the strength of the half-
step Saint Ancestor within an hour..…..

Half-step Saint Ancestor!

Within this secret place, there is an almost invincible existence.

Just thinking about it makes all the disciples feel excited!

Qin Feng added:"Not only that, I am now only one step away from the Heavenly Saint Realm. As 
long as I can break through to the Heavenly Saint Realm, I can immediately refine this drop of holy 
blood.…."

Hongjun said happily:"Dad, then you should practice quickly. There are still a hundred days left. 
Maybe you can break through before the next assessment."…."

Qin Feng smiled:"From the current point of view, it is time to continue practicing.….."

At that moment, the father and son chatted for a while, and the matter came to an end.



Hongjun went to consolidate his realm.

All the disciples also went into seclusion to practice.

Affected by the continuous improvement in strength of Qin Feng, Hongjun, and Qinglin, everyone 
became more active in cultivation and worked harder...

Qinglin also began to consolidate his realm.

The Xuan female clone and the virtual shadow clone began to work together to condense Qin 
Feng's third clone - the ego clone.…..

Qin Feng selected some useful ones from the many upper-level divine elixirs he had obtained 
before, and began to retreat.…….

Just like that, everyone in the Divine Alliance was once again practicing as a whole... time flew by 
so fast!

In the blink of an eye, a hundred days passed.

This day finally arrived when Qin Feng and others were leaving.…

Chapter 1230

Qin Feng smiled coldly, didn't care, and continued walking outside the fetal membrane.…

"Dad, where are you going?"

"Go trade some Nine Heavens Jade Dew!"

"I'm with you!"

Hongjun followed in a hurry.



At that moment, the father and son came out of the fetal membrane of heaven and earth together. As 
soon as Qin Feng stepped out of the fetal membrane of heaven and earth, more than a dozen 
spiritual consciousness scanned over. It was those pinnacle saint ancestors The powerful people, as 
well as Prince Xi Shen and others...

Hey~!

Only the second realm of eternity?!

But the next second, all the powerful people exclaimed in their hearts, and looked at Qin Feng in 
shock.

Before, they were in Dengtianye.

The consciousness and spiritual power of all the great powers were sealed, and they could not detect 
the cultivation of others.

Now that their cultivation was restored, they could see through Qin Feng's cultivation at a glance, 
and were naturally very surprised.

It was really unexpected that this person was running around before The boy who went there turned 
out to be just a junior in the second realm.

How strong does this physical body have to be to be able to have such speed!

In the corner, Emperor Mang Witch Ancestor was even more dumbfounded.

He has always claimed to be the first person to cultivate the physical body. , now it seems that he 
was completely crushed by Qin Feng.

You must know that the higher the cultivation level, the stronger the physical body will be.

If Qin Feng's cultivation level is at the same level as him, the strength of the physical body will be 
even more unimaginable.



This When he thought about it, his face became even more gloomy.

In any case, it was this boy who stole his first place. His cultivation was not high and he did not 
give himself face, which always made him unhappy.

He has always been narrow-minded, how could he Let Qin Feng go.

On the other side, Liugen Ancestor also sighed after seeing Qin Feng’s cultivation.

"Tsk tsk!! Fellow Taoist Yuexia, what you said is indeed true. This kid really only has the second 
level of cultivation! It's really amazing that such a low level of cultivation can have such physical 
strength!"

Hearing the Six Roots Ancestor praising Qin Feng, Prince Xishen and Saint Ancestor Guixu were 
both a little unhappy.

"Ah! Senior Liu Gen, I don’t think it’s that big of a deal. No matter how powerful his physical body 
is, his strength will not reach the mid-stage of Quasi-Saint Ancestor. If I have a fair fight with him 
again, I will definitely defeat him!"

Prince Xishen said angrily.

The last time, Qin Feng defeated him in public, which always made him resentful.

At this time, Old Man Yuexia also said:"Even if this kid is very good, he still has to survive. OK, 
otherwise all the talents and gifts will be in vain.…."

"Ha ha! Fellow Taoist Yuexia is right! No matter how good a genius is, if he dies young, he will be 
nothing. Fellow Taoist, do you want my help?"

Ancestor Liugen took the opportunity to mention the old saying again.

"Let’s talk about it later!"



Old man Yuexia excused himself.

At the same time, Qin Feng and Hongjun had unknowingly arrived at the area where Daxian Tianyu 
was stationed...

Although Qin Feng caused a sensation in the hearts of all the powerful people, ordinary assessors 
They didn't know his details.

He didn't attract anyone's attention along the way. Only those quasi-saint ancestors who were at the 
peak of their abilities were secretly watching his every move.

However, as soon as Qin Feng entered the area of Daxian Heavenly Domain, , I saw dozens of 
leaders of small and medium-sized forces, communicating enthusiastically with Xian Ling.

Everyone was discussing how to exchange resources.

There is a specialty spiritual fruit in Daxian Tianyu, called Jiuzui Lingguo, which is the most 
important to eternity. It is of great help to improve the level of cultivation.

However, this kind of spiritual fruit only matures once every 90 million years, which is very rare.

Daxian Tianyu has collected it for so many years, but the quantity is still extremely limited. It can 
be said that the supply exceeds demand, and it is naturally favored by many small forces. sought 
after

"Fairy Xianling, I am willing to exchange five Seven-leaf Spirit Flowers for one Nine-Drunken 
Spirit Fruit. What do you think??"

"Fairy Xianling, I am willing to use 10,000 drops of weak water roots in exchange for a Nine 
Drunken Spirit Fruit.….."

"Fairy Xianling, the treasure below is better, you can take a look……"…….

At this moment, dozens of leaders of small and medium-sized forces are rushing to exchange the 
Nine Drunken Spirit Fruits with Xian Ling.…..



Most of these people are in the realm of extreme saints, and some are in the early stage of heavenly 
saints.

As soon as Qin Feng arrived, he lined up the crowd and walked straight towards Xian Ling...

This immediately annoyed a few people

"Boy, what are you doing? Don't know how to queue? Get to the back of the line! It's not your turn 
yet!"

"that is! You dare to jump in line even though you are in a small second realm. I wonder if you are 
arrogant or have no discernment!"

The two supreme saints actually expressed their dissatisfaction with Qin Feng in public.

Especially when these two saw Qin Feng's second-level cultivation, they immediately showed a 
superior attitude and used their power to overwhelm others...

This scene made Hongjun frown. It was about to break out on the spot.

These two blind guys dared to scold their father in public and wanted to die!

At this moment, the quarrel here attracted everyone's attention.

The leaders of the small and medium-sized forces started to shout. looked over

"Um? Someone wants to jump in line?!"

"Ah! It turns out to be a guy from the second realm of eternity! With such a level of cultivation, 
how dare you jump in line? What a big face!"

"Is this guy just here? He didn't know that Fairy Xianling had previously set a rule that traders must 
come first, first served, and no one is allowed to jump in line!"



"If he acts like this, he is afraid that he will be driven away by Fairy Xianling……"

After all the leaders saw Qin Feng's cultivation level, they all showed disdain and started sarcastic.
…..

The world of cultivation is a world where the strong are respected!

What's more, these people thought Qin Feng was here to jump in line.

Just when these people were mocking Qin Feng, even thinking that Qin Feng would be driven away 
by Xian Ling, and gloating about his misfortune, a puzzling scene happened.….

"Huh! Lord Qin Feng!"

With a cry of surprise, Xian Ling's beautiful eyes shone, and she walked towards Qin Feng with a 
look of surprise.…..

This scene made everyone dumbfounded!

No way?

As a powerful person at the peak of the Heavenly Saint and the master of one of the Nine Heavens 
and Ten Domains, Fairy Xianling actually calls a second-level person an adult?

Did they hear it right?

"Master Qin Feng, the little girl was just wondering why she didn’t see you, but she didn’t expect 
that the master would come to visit in person today..."

Xian Ling smiled cleverly, and her original beautiful appearance became even more radiant...

That scene looked very much like a woman's sight. When it comes to the one you love... this makes 
everyone surprised, puzzled, and even a little jealous…..



"Fairy Xianling, does this guy seem to have jumped in line?"

The leader of a medium-sized force suddenly reminded him.

He was a man in the early stage of Tiansheng. He looked middle-aged and had two black beards on 
his lips.

He was very unhappy when he saw Fairy Xianling being so enthusiastic about Qin Feng. 
Comfortable.

Even though he was a master in the early stage of Tiansheng, he did not receive such treatment. 
Why would this mediocre second-level monk be so favored by Fairy Xianling?

Unexpectedly, as soon as the man finished speaking, Xianling frowned. He frowned and said with a 
displeased look on his face:"I am willing, what does it have to do with you?!"

After this retort, the bearded man was stunned for a moment, his face full of embarrassment.

Everyone was even more surprised!

Xian Ling didn't care what everyone thought, and looked at Qin Feng enthusiastically:"Master Qin 
Feng, you came to see the little girl today, so Why? Qin

Feng smiled slightly:"Fellow Taoist Xianling, I wonder how many drops of Nine Heavens Spiritual 
Dew you have in your hand?""

"There are currently one hundred and twenty-nine drops. However, there are still nearly a hundred 
people from our Daxian Tianyu who are undergoing the assessment, and there should be dozens 
more in the future."

Qin Feng's eyes lit up, one hundred and twenty-nine drops was a lot.

"Sir, do you need Nine Heavens Jade Dew?"



"That's right! I would like to exchange some elixirs for all your Jiutian Jade Dew. Are you willing? 
Xian

Ling pursed her lips and smiled:"As long as the adults need it, the little girl will naturally be willing 
to change it as you say."

Qin Feng was overjoyed:"Qin accepted the favor from my Taoist friend." Of course, Qin will not let 
fellow Taoists suffer. I want to exchange this Hunyuan Shendan for your Nine Heavens Jade Dew, 
one elixir for five drops, how about it?"

As soon as he finished speaking, Qin Feng turned over his hand, and there was a Hunyuan Divine 
Pill in the palm of his hand. The fragrance was overflowing.

Xian Ling only glanced at the magic pill, and without identifying the quality of the magic pill, he 
smiled and nodded:"no problem! However, I only have one hundred and twenty-nine drops, so I 
can’t seem to make up the round number.

Qin Feng smiled and said:"Fairy helps me so much, I can't be so stingy." Then I will give you 
twenty-six Hunyuan Divine Pills in exchange for one hundred and twenty-nine drops of Nine 
Heavens Jade Dew.…."

"good!"

Xian Ling readily agreed and was about to take out the Jiutian Jade for trade.

But at this moment, the bearded man suddenly came out to stop:"Fairy Xian Ling! Never!

Xian Ling frowned:"Why?""

The bearded man looked at the magic elixir in Qin Feng's hand with disdain, and sneered:"Fairy, 
think about it, how precious the Nine Heavens Jade Dew is! I want to exchange one elixir for five 
drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew. That is at least a divine elixir of lower eternity quality that has 
such value."



"But I am not a talented person. I have been immersed in the art of alchemy for many years and 
have a good understanding of elixirs. The elixir this boy took out was of inferior quality at the next 
glance. It was not even worth a drop of Nine Heavens Jade Dew, let alone five drops in exchange 
for it."

"Fairy Xianling, this guy is here to trick you into using Jiutian Jade Dew. You must not be fooled 
and you cannot exchange it with him!"

As soon as these words came out, the whole audience was shocked.

Qin Feng also frowned slightly.

Before he could get angry, Hongjun was furious:"What are you talking about?! You know nothing 
about alchemy! My father's Hunyuan Divine Pill is of eternal lower realm quality. You can't see it 
clearly, so you just spread rumors!"

Being scolded by this, the bearded man was also angry.

He really didn't see the quality of Hunyuan Shendan, and he was talking nonsense, just to stop Qin 
Feng's transaction.

But he didn't expect to be pointed at the nose by a child of several years old in public. Swearing 
loudly made him lose face.

Besides, Hongjun's cultivation was not obvious, and he didn't think there was anything special 
about this kid.

If the fighting in the secret place was not forbidden, he really wanted to slap him away

"hehe! You, a child, know nothing about refining alchemy, so what right do you have to question 
me? You father and son are really weird. You used low-quality elixirs to defraud Jiutian Yulu. If you 
were exposed by Hu, you would be very angry."

The bearded man quipped quickly.



But as soon as he finished speaking, Xian Ling said:"Fellow Taoist Hu Lin, please stop talking! 
This fairy believes in Master Qin Feng. Lord Qin Feng, let’s exchange!"

While speaking, Xian Ling took out a jade bottle, which contained one hundred and twenty-nine 
drops of Nine Heavens Jade Dew.

The bearded man quickly dissuaded him:"Fairy Xian Ling, you must not do this... He is lying to 
you!"

Xian Ling frowned:"I want you to teach me how to do things?! Either you shut up! Either get out!"

Being so angry in public, the bearded man was stunned, and his face suddenly turned red, feeling 
extremely embarrassed.…..

Everyone was also extremely surprised.

They didn't know why Fairy Xianling trusted Qin Feng so much.

You know, the bearded man is indeed very accomplished in alchemy.

Seeing the bearded man deflated, Hongjun felt happy.

Qin Feng didn't bother to pay attention to the weird looks around him, and casually took out twenty-
six Hunyuan Divine Pills and prepared to trade them.…..

But at this moment, an old and cold voice sounded from behind the crowd.

"Wait!"

As soon as these words were said, everyone turned around.

Qin Feng also followed the sound and saw Old Man Yuexia, Ancestor Liugen, Prince Xi Shen, and 
Saint Ancestor Guixu walking over with a sneer...



Seeing this scene, Hong Hong Jun Dun felt bad.

These guys were probably here to disrupt the situation…
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