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Wang Meng looked at Qin Chuan with a smile. In his opinion, Qin Chuan would definitely agree. 
Being able to join a stronger team is what many warriors without a team dream of.

However, what surprised him was that Qin Chuan shook his head and said,"Thank you, Brother 
Wang, for your kindness. I just want to go alone."

After hearing this, Wang Meng had a look of surprise on his face, and then he kindly advised

"Little brother, is this your first time going to Ten Thousand Beasts Forest? You still don’t know 
what’s dangerous, right? Even second-level warriors would not dare to go there alone unless you 
have third-level strength.

Qin Chuan still said:"Thank you, Brother Wang, for your kindness. I have made up my mind.""

Seeing Qin Chuan like this, Wang Meng couldn't help but shake his head and sigh.

"Why! Young people today! I really don’t know the heights of the world. I have such a little talent. I 
really think that I am the best in the world. I really think that those ferocious beasts are made of 
paper."

Forget it, since this kid doesn't know how to live or die, why bother talking about it? It's okay to let 
this kid suffer. If he dies, he deserves it. If he doesn't die, it's his fate. It can be regarded as helping 
him grow his memory."

Thinking of this, Wang Meng couldn't help but despise Qin Chuan. In his eyes, Qin Chuan was the 
kind of young man who had some talent but was too high-minded and didn't know the importance 
or the good.

At that moment, Wang Meng stopped persuading him and turned around to leave, but was stopped 
by Qin Chuan.



"Brother Wang Meng, I would like to ask, do you know where there is a map of the Ten Thousand 
Beasts Forest for sale in this club?"

Hearing this, Wang Meng became more and more disdainful.

This kid really planned to go alone, and now he is looking for a map.

"If you want to buy maps, just go to the second floor, they sell them there."

Wang Meng's tone was a little impatient. He didn't want to deal with such ignorant people.

"Thank you very much! Qin

Chuan smiled slightly and went directly to the second floor without caring about Wang Meng's tone.

Not long after Qin Chuan turned around, several people's voices came from behind him.

"Captain, this young man really doesn’t know what to do, so why are you nagging him?"

"that is! If he wants to die, just let him die. With his little cultivation, he dares to go alone into the 
forest of beasts."

It was the members of the Tiger and Wolf Team who spoke. It turned out that they had heard the 
conversation between the two of them just now.

Obviously, these team members did not have a good impression of Qin Chuan.

Listening to the disdain behind him, Qin Chuan didn't care and came to I was just about to go up the 
stairs.

At this moment, two teenagers came down from upstairs.

"Huh! why you?"



When the two teenagers saw Qin Chuan, they both looked surprised.

Qin Chuan also looked at the two people in front of him in astonishment.

How could these two people appear in Tianshui City?

It turned out that the two people in front of him were not others. It was Lu Bao and Huang Yue 
whom they had met at the Tianhe Martial Arts School.

Now that they have not seen each other for a year, the cultivation of these two people has also 
improved greatly, and they are already first-level advanced martial artists.

The three of them were stunned for a moment, and then woke up

"Ha ha!! There are really no places in life where we don’t meet each other! Unexpectedly, Junior 
Brother Qin Chuan came to Tianshui City. I wonder what Junior Brother Qin Chuan came to 
Tianshui City for?"

Lu Bao's round face showed a half-smiling expression.

"yes! It’s such a rare visitor to see Junior Brother Qin Chuan this time!"Huang Yue's tone was also 
strange.

"hehe!! The two senior brothers were polite. My little brother only came to Tianshui City for a 
casual stroll."

At this moment, Qin Chuan had countless thoughts in his mind.

He didn't expect that these two people would appear here, and he didn't know if Mr. Bai would be 
nearby. It seems that it is not safe here. He must find a way to escape quickly.

Thinking of this, Qin Chuan smiled and said:"Two senior brothers, I have something urgent to do to 
go down to the second floor. Could you please excuse me?"



"oh? I wonder what Junior Brother Qin Chuan wants to do on the second floor? If you need 
anything, tell your senior brother, maybe I can help you!"

Although Lu Bao's words were polite, his expression was not polite at all. He stood at the top of the 
stairs and did not even move his body..
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"Senior brother, you're welcome. It's just a small matter, so there's no need to bother senior brother. 
Please give way to Senior Brother Lu! Lu

Bao still didn't give in, but said:"Since they are all small things, let's do these small things later." I 
see that my junior brother came from Shenyan City and it must have been a hard journey! The so-
called visitor is a guest, why not go out for a drink?"

Hearing this, Qin Chuan sneered in his heart, secretly thinking that Lu Bao really doesn't want to let 
him go.

"Senior Brother Lu Bao, I don’t think it’s necessary!"

"Junior brother, don't you want to give me face?"

Lu Bao's face gradually became colder, and then he gave Huang Yue a look.

Huang Yue immediately understood and nodded slightly. Suddenly

, the two people moved and shot at Qin Chuan at the same time.

It turned out that these two people saw that Qin Chuan was a first-level With advanced cultivation, 
he thought that as long as the two of them took action at the same time, they would be able to 
capture Qin Chuan.

Seeing the two of them suddenly taking action against him, Qin Chuan sneered in his heart and his 
figure moved.



"boom! boom!"

There were two loud noises, and as soon as the three people came into contact, the figures of Lu 
Bao and Huang Yue immediately flew out at a faster speed, flying directly into the center of the 
hall, smashing more than a dozen wooden tables, and then fell to the ground. He was vomiting 
blood and groaning.

This huge change immediately alarmed all the warriors in the hall, and their horrified eyes quickly 
focused on Qin Chuan.

"It seems we made a mistake!"

Wang Meng and other members of the Tiger and Wolf Team were dumbfounded. They looked at 
everything in front of them in disbelief, and their hearts were horrified.

They had witnessed the whole conflict between Qin Chuan and Lu Bao. They originally thought 
that... Lu Bao and the two would teach the ungrateful boy in front of them some lessons, but the 
reality is completely the opposite.

"Captain, judging from this boy's skill just now, he should have reached the level of a second-level 
warrior, right?"

"Um! He should have second-level strength. No wonder he dared to go into the ferocious beast 
forest alone. This kid really has a lot of tricks up his sleeve!"

Wang Meng and others looked at Qin Chuan no longer with the disdain they had before.

"Captain, although he has second-level strength, it is still very dangerous to enter the ferocious 
beast forest alone."

"yes! At best, they can barely protect themselves!"

At this time, the fight downstairs also attracted the attention of some people on the second floor.

"snort! Who is he? How dare you insult our"Four Killing Alliance" people?"



A woman's voice came from the second floor angrily.

Hearing this voice, Qin Chuan secretly thought something was wrong. He did not expect that Lu 
Bao and the two had accomplices above.

At this time, a beautiful young woman came from the second floor. Lou walked down slowly.

When he saw this extremely beautiful woman, Qin Chuan's eyes flashed with a hint of 
astonishment, because the woman in front of him looked very much like a person, and she was a 
familiar person to him.

This woman Who is she?

Why does she look so similar to Sister Yuyao? She's just a little older and has a slightly different 
temperament." It turns out that the woman in front of him is very similar to Yuyao. Qin Chuan 
almost fell in love with her when he first saw it. I mistakenly thought it was Yuyao.

At this time, many people on the first floor had recognized the woman’s identity, and their eyes 
showed surprise.

"Isn't this woman Feng Qingyan, the eldest lady of the Four Kills Alliance?"

"yes! I heard that she is one of the top ten masters among the younger generation in Tianshui City."

"So awesome!"

"Of course, she is a third-level Dzogchen master!"

Most of the warriors in this hall are young people.

As young people, they are naturally extremely excited to see the top ten masters of the younger 
generation, with fanatical admiration in their eyes.



There are even some The young men who were previously greedy for the beauty, when they learned 
that the woman in front of them was actually one of the top ten masters, the frivolity in their eyes 
was replaced by awe, and they regarded the woman in front of them as a goddess in their hearts.

Among the crowd, Wang Meng The others are no exception..

Chapter 1763

Qin Chuan couldn't help but be a little surprised when he heard the words around him.

The beautiful woman in front of him was only about twenty years old, but she was already a third-
level Dzogchen warrior. Her talent was so high that he had never seen her before.

At this time, Lu Bao climbed up from the ground with difficulty, staggered to the woman's side, and 
whispered a few words in Feng Qingyan's ear.

Feng Qingyan's beautiful face gradually showed a look of surprise, and her eyes towards Qin Chuan 
also became a little weird.

After a while, a beautiful smile bloomed on Feng Qingyan’s pink face

"It turns out you are Qin Chuan! I have admired this lady for a long time! Qin

Chuan also smiled and said,"I'm sorry to bother you, sister. I, Qin Chuan, am just an ordinary 
person. What can I admire for so long?""

At this moment, Qin Chuan's mind also turned over and over again.

Since Lu Bao has a relationship with the woman in front of him, then Mr. Bai is naturally a member 
of the Four Kills Alliance. He just doesn't know what kind of organization this Four Kills Alliance 
is.

"Brother Qin Chuan, you are very humble. Your background is not simple!"

Feng Qingyan's tone was profound.



The young warriors around him couldn't help but look at Qin Chuan curiously after hearing the 
conversation between the two.

This young man who looked like he was only fourteen or fifteen years old, why did Miss Qingxuan 
treat him so much? So polite?

Isn't this young man an ordinary person?

When Qin Chuan heard Feng Qingyan's words, a hint of surprise flashed through his heart.

In fact, he himself also wanted to find out what kind of background he had.

"Brother Qin Chuan, you must have had a hard time coming all the way from Shenyan City. It must 
have been a dusty journey. Why don't you come and sit with our Four Kills Alliance?"

"Sister, you are too polite, but I am afraid that I don’t have time!"

"whee!!"Feng Qingyan covered her mouth and smiled sweetly.

"My brother is really interesting. It seems that if my sister doesn't invite you personally, I'm afraid 
my brother won't be willing to go there."

After hearing this, Qin Chuan's face changed slightly.

Sure enough, Feng Qingyan chuckled, and suddenly approached Qin Chuan.

With the fragrant wind, a majestic fire energy enveloped Qin Chuan. , making him feel a strong 
sense of oppression.

When the young warriors around him saw Feng Qingyan’s sudden attack, their eyes showed 
excitement.



They all wanted to see who the younger generation of Tianshui City’s Ten-Day Masters were. Such 
strength, and this Qin Chuan was naturally the victim to let them see the strength.

Seeing Feng Qingyan's showy hands coming towards him, Qin Chuan no longer concealed his 
strength, and his whole body aura exuded, and he retreated, easily avoiding The capture of Feng 
Qingyan

"Huh! You are actually a third-level wood element warrior!

Feng Qingyan had a look of surprise on her face, and then she chuckled softly:"Interesting!" Then 
give your sister a slap and try it!"

After saying that, Feng Qingyan's originally gentle offensive suddenly became extremely fierce, and 
a palm struck Qin Chuan's chest like lightning.

Its momentum was so fierce that it fully displayed the strength of the third-level Dzogchen warrior. 
Even The warriors who were watching thirty meters away could feel the huge spiritual pressure, and 
they couldn't help but feel a sense of fear in their hearts.

Qin Chuan snorted coldly, without any fear, and greeted him with a palm.

The two palms met. , with a loud bang, the whole hall shook, and the huge energy collided, forming 
a strong wind, which flew away the tables and chairs several meters away, and some of them were 
closer. The warrior was even pushed back by the air wave.

After the loud noise, the two of them each took three steps back, and it turned out to be a tie.

"This...how is this possible? They ended up in a tie!"

The young men around him all had expressions of disbelief, and their surprised eyes fell on Qin 
Chuan.

They didn't expect that the young man in front of them would have such strength and could even tie 
with the top ten masters..
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"Is this young man also one of the top ten masters? do you know who he is?"

"do not know! It seems that none of the top ten masters are so young, right?"

"yes! The youngest among the top ten masters is already eighteen or nineteen years old. This young 
man is only fifteen years old at most."

If they knew that Qin Chuan was only thirteen years old, they would probably scream in shock.

"Do I know who this person is?"

"who?"

"Miss Feng Qingyan mentioned before that this young man came from Shenyan City. He should be 
one of the top ten masters among the younger generation in Shenyan City."

"yes! I think it must be! I didn’t expect that Shenyan City would produce such a genius! No worse 
than our top ten masters in Tianshui City!"

At this moment, the young warriors looked at Qin Chuan with awe in their eyes.

In the crowd, Wang Meng and others showed a hint of embarrassment. They remembered that they 
had made sarcastic remarks behind their backs before, and now they couldn't help but feel a little 
embarrassed.

But they said, The huge noise of the two people fighting just now has alarmed everyone on the 
second floor, and many people came down to watch. At this moment, there was a person on the 
second floor who saw Qin Chuan, and his eyes showed surprise. This person was no one else , 
turned out to be the third child who was stolen by Qin Chuan.

After seeing Qin Chuan, the excitement in his eyes was unspeakable, and he whispered a few words 
to the middle-aged man beside him.



The middle-aged man He was originally watching the fight leisurely, but when he heard Lao San's 
words, his face immediately showed a look of rage, but he was quickly suppressed by him, his face 
became extremely gloomy, and he looked at Qin Chuan coldly. She began to think deeply.

However, in the field, Feng Qingyan was also surprised to see that Qin Chuan could tie with her. 
Her beautiful eyebrows wrinkled slightly, a trace of anger flashed across her pink face, and the 
depths of her two beautiful eyes were even more intense. Two purple flames appeared strangely.

Qin Chuan was very close to Feng Qingyan, and he could see the strange two purple flames in Feng 
Qingyan's eyes at a glance.

As soon as these purple flames appeared, Feng Qingyan's entire momentum It has improved a lot 
invisibly, giving Qin Chuan an unprecedented sense of oppression, and even an inexplicable fear.

It seems that this Feng Qingyan is not simple. What is the purple flame in her eyes? As soon as that 
thing appears , her strength seems to have suddenly increased a lot, far more powerful than the 
average third-level Dzogchen warrior! I'm afraid

, even if I fight with all my strength, I can only be tied with her at best."

Thinking of this, Qin Chuan looked across the way Feng Qingyan became fully alert.

But at this moment, what surprised Qin Chuan was that the purple flame in Feng Qingyan's eyes 
quietly receded, and her beautiful face gradually showed a smile.

"Brother Qin Chuan is indeed extraordinary! My sister admires me! Since the younger brother 
doesn't want to be a guest, the older sister won't force him. Lu Bao, Huang Yue, let's go! Brother 
Qin Chuan, see you soon!"

Seeing Feng Qingyan suddenly calling her subordinates to leave, Qin Chuan's eyes showed surprise. 
He did not expect that things would change like this.

"See you later!"

"Brother, take care of yourself!"



Feng Qingyan smiled charmingly and led Lu Bao and the others away.

After the three of them left, Qin Chuan anxiously went up to the second floor to buy a map.

Now he just wanted to buy the map and leave as soon as possible. This place is not suitable. After 
staying for a long time, he said that after Feng Qingyan and the others left the warrior club.

On the way, Lu Bao asked in confusion:"Miss, why should we let Qin Chuan go? If the lady uses 
talent inheritance, then the boy will definitely not be your opponent."

"There is no need, let’s just let him go and follow him as if we have never seen him before!"

Speaking of this, Feng Qingyan bit her red lips with her teeth, and a meaningful smile appeared at 
the corner of her mouth..
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But Qin Chuan went directly to the second floor.

The second floor is like a small market, where many warriors buy and sell some items.

Most of what is sold is what warriors gain from the beasts in the forest.

There are many people selling maps here.

When these warriors saw Qin Chuan coming up, there was a hint of awe in their eyes. They had all 
seen Qin Chuan's previous performance.

Third-level warriors are already top masters to low-level warriors like them.

Qin Chuan ignored everyone's looks. After scanning around, he asked a warrior where he could buy 
a map. It happened that the warrior had a map in his hand.



Qin Chuan spent ten gold coins to buy the map. After looking at it carefully, he understood what the 
map of the Ten Thousand Beasts Forest was about.

It turns out that in addition to the detailed terrain on those maps, several places where ferocious 
beasts of level four or above may appear were also marked in detail, marking them as dangerous 
areas.

Seeing this, Qin Chuan was very satisfied and felt that the ten gold coins were well spent.

Qin Chuan thought back to the valley marked on the treasure map. Compared with the map, he 
found that there were no fourth-level ferocious beasts nearby, and he felt relieved.

After putting away the map, Qin Chuan was about to leave, but a young warrior stopped him.

"My friend, can you stop for a moment?"

Qin Chuan frowned slightly. He didn't want to waste time here. He just wanted to get to this place 
of right and wrong as soon as possible.

Although Feng Qingyan left inexplicably, Qin Chuan didn't know what would happen next?

So now he just wants to He took out the treasure and quickly left Tianshui City.

Seemingly seeing that Qin Chuan was unwilling to stay, the young warrior said again

"Don't worry, my friend, I won't delay you for too long. My family just wants to meet you and 
negotiate a deal with you, which guarantees your satisfaction!"

"trade?"

A trace of surprise flashed in Qin Chuan's eyes.

"Who is your adult?"



"If my friends are interested, just come with me. My family is in a private room next door."

Qin Chuan hesitated for a while, but still followed. He was also curious about who wanted to 
negotiate a deal with him?

Qin Chuan followed the young warrior to a box next door.

After entering the box, Qin Chuan He saw two middle-aged men sitting in the box.

When Qin Chuan saw one of them, he immediately exclaimed something bad.

Because one of them was the third child.

As for the other one, he was handsome, fair-skinned, and had something on his body. He has a 
scholar-like temperament, but Qin Chuan has never seen this person before.

However, this person is a third-level Dzogchen warrior.

Seeing this person and the third child together, Qin Chuan couldn't help but be on guard..At this 
time, the young warrior who led the way quietly retreated.

There were only three people left in the room. There was a faint sandalwood incense floating in the 
air, but there was a sandalwood incense burning in the incense burner beside it. Seeing this 
sandalwood incense, Qin Chuan felt a little weird, who would light sandalwood in this trading 
place.

Just when Qin Chuan was doubtful, the fair-faced middle-aged man stood up with a warm smile on 
his face

"Little brother, please don’t go outside. You must have a lot of doubts in your mind, right?"

As soon as he heard the middle-aged man speak, Qin Chuan showed a strange look on his face.



Because he heard the man's middle-aged voice, Qin Chuan knew that this middle-aged man was 
none other than the one who was at the Shenyan City auction. , the incense owner who was with the 
third child.

Although he already knew the identity of the other party, Qin Chuan pretended to be puzzled and 
asked

"good! I don’t know why you two want to see me?"

"Ha ha!! Little brother, I just saw you fighting against Feng Qingyan. Your strength is not weak. 
You are really a young hero. Chen has a desire and wants to make friends with the little brother. I 
wonder if the little brother can give Chen this face? Qin

Chuan smiled slightly:"Thank you, Mr. Chen. I think Mr. Chen asked the boy here not just for this 
simple matter, right?"".
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Hearing what Qin Chuan said, the middle-aged man was slightly startled, then smiled heartily and 
said

"good! The little brother talks quickly, so Chen will stop beating around the bush."

"Let’s open the windows and speak frankly!"

"You must have met the guy next to me. You were in the same caravan, but when we were 
approaching Tianshui City, the little brother suddenly disappeared."

It happened that on the night when my little brother disappeared, one of my brother's valuables was 
also lost."

Qin Chuan pretended to be angry:"Mr. Chen, what do you mean by this?"

The middle-aged man smiled slightly. :"Don't be anxious, little brother. I didn't come to you to ask 
you to hand over something like that. I just want to negotiate a deal with you!"



Hearing this, Qin Chuan's face showed surprise and he couldn't help asking:" How do you say this?"

The middle-aged man said:"To be honest, Chen is the incense master of the Tianpi Gang. The 
people in this gang are also good at stealing and do not resist theft."

"Since the little brother can steal things from our gang, it means that the little brother is superior in 
skills. We will not pursue the lost things if we are willing to be inferior. This little brother can rest 
assured."

Hearing this, Qin Chuan sneered in his heart. I only believe what you say.

Sure enough, when he said this, Chen Xiangzhu's tone changed again.

"It’s just that the things that the little brother took away that night were of great use to Chen, so here 
Chen wanted to beg from the little brother for a drop or two of the Ten Thousand Years Ice Heart 
Liquid, and hoped that the little brother would grant it."

"hehe!! I'm afraid Master Chen Xiang is disappointed. I don't know what Master Chen Xiang is 
talking about. How can I talk about this theory of perfection?"

"Ha ha!! Little brother, if Chen asked you for two drops of Wannian Bingxin Liquid, he didn’t ask 
for it in vain. He would certainly offer the corresponding things in exchange. Do you think this is 
okay?"

Hearing this, Qin Chuan's heart moved slightly. He did not reply immediately, but just looked at 
Chen Xiangzhu in silence.

Chen Xiangzhu seemed to understand what Qin Chuan meant, took out a small porcelain bottle and 
said

"This bottle contains Tianmui Liquid, which Chen got by chance when he went to Shenyan City. I 
wonder if my little brother can appreciate it?"

When he heard that it was Heavenly Essence Liquid, Qin Chuan's eyes flashed with a hint of 
ecstasy, and he couldn't help but feel excited in his heart. He was really worried about where to go 



to get Heavenly Essence Liquid to improve his qualifications in the two elements of metal and 
earth. , but didn’t expect someone to come to the door.

Although he was ecstatic, Qin Chuan still pretended to be calm

"I wonder if Lord Chen Xiang can let me take a look at this heavenly marrow liquid first?"

"No problem at all!"

Master Chen Xiang pretended to be generous and handed the small porcelain bottle containing 
Tianmui Liquid to Qin Chuan.

Qin Chuan took the small porcelain bottle and suddenly felt a little familiar, as if he had seen this 
small bottle before. After thinking about it briefly, Qin Chuan thought A flash of inspiration 
occurred, and he remembered it.

It turned out that this bottle was the one he had seen at the Shenyan City auction, and it was the 
bottle of Heavenly Marrow Liquid that was auctioned.

This made Qin Chuan curious, what exactly is this Heavenly Marrow Liquid? It was stolen by 
Master Chen Xiang.

This man is indeed a thief. He seems to not want to let go of any treasure he sees.

Qin Chuan sighed in his heart and opened the small porcelain bottle to confirm. It was indeed 
Tianmui Liquid. In order to successfully obtain the Heavenly Essence Liquid, Qin Chuan also asked 
Yuyao about the characteristics of the Heavenly Essence Liquid, because he was worried about 
being deceived in the future.

"Little brother, is this Tianmui liquid true?"Chen Xiangzhu narrowed his eyes and said with a smile.

"It is indeed Tianmui Liquid. I wonder how you want to change it?"

At this moment, Qin Chuan stopped talking nonsense and went straight to the topic..
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As soon as Qin Chuan said this, he admitted that he had stolen the Ten Thousand Years Bingxin 
Liquid.

"Little brother, Chen wants to exchange this bottle of Heavenly Essence Liquid for two drops of Ten 
Thousand Years Ice Heart Liquid. Do you think it’s appropriate? Qin Chuan sneered and said:"

Master Chen Xiang, your bottle of Heavenly Essence Liquid is only worth 150,000 gold coins, and 
two drops of Ten Thousand Years Ice Heart Liquid are worth 200,000 gold coins. Just exchange it 
like this. Isn't this kid going to suffer too much?""

Hearing this, Master Chen Xiang said with a bitter face.

"Little brother Qinchuan, Chen knows that this transaction is a bit of a loss for you, but do you think 
we got the ten thousand years of ice heart liquid first, and now that it has been obtained by the little 
brother, we don’t want to get it back, so we hope that the little brother can make the deal cheaper. 
Give us"

"How about this! What do you think of Chen adding 10,000 gold coins?

Qin Chuan pondered for a while and then said:"Okay!" make a deal!"

Actually, Qin Chuan felt in his heart that his Ten Thousand Years Bingxin Liquid was originally 
stolen from others, and he took advantage of him. Now that he is suffering a small loss, he can 
exchange it with two drops of Bingxin Liquid.

Besides, The marrow fluid that day was exactly what he wanted most at the moment, and he also 
got ten thousand gold coins.

Qin Chuan had already run out of gold coins, and he was worried about not having to worry about 
money. Now that he got these ten thousand gold coins, he could solve all his needs. Money was the 
problem.

At that moment, Qin Chuan made a deal with Master Chen Xiang.



After trading two drops of Ten Thousand Years Bingxin Liquid to Master Chen Xiang, Qin Chuan 
still had five drops left.

But these five drops were enough for Qin Chuan to break through the water energy to the third 
level.

"Ha ha!! Brother Qinchuan, thank you very much this time!"

Master Chen Xiang got the two drops of Wannian Bingxin Liquid, with an extremely excited look 
on his face.

"Master Chen Xiang, let’s say goodbye then!"

After leaving the box, Qin Chuan hurriedly left the club and headed directly to the Ten Thousand 
Beasts Mountain Forest.

He was worried that Feng Qingyan would leave and come back, and something would happen 
again.

But he said that after Qin Chuan left, the third child also came out. After seeing Qin Chuan really 
leaving,

Lao San hurried back to the box.

In the box, Master Chen Xiang swept away his previous gentle look and sat on the chair with a 
gloomy face.

"Is that little bastard gone?"

"gone! Incense Master, I don’t understand. This little bastard Qin Chuan clearly stole our stuff, but 
instead of taking it back, you even negotiated with him nicely and even offered him Heavenly 
Essence Liquid in exchange. Incense Master, why are you doing this?"

"snort! Pig brain!"



Chen Xiangzhu looked angry and cursed angrily.

"Didn't you see that little beast's previous fight with Feng Qingyan?"

Feng Qingyan's strength ranks third among the top ten masters of the younger generation. Even I 
am not her opponent."

"But Feng Qingyan chose to leave after a fight with that little bastard. Don't you think there's 
something weird in this?"

"I don’t think Feng Qingyan is sure she can win him. If Feng Qingyan can't deal with that little thief 
Qin Chuan, wouldn't I be even less sure?"

"If I do it directly, it will be difficult to get back the Wannian Bingxin Liquid"

"So why did the incense owner choose to trade with him?"

"good! The owner of this incense chose to trade with him, which was just a delaying tactic. Now 
this Xiang Master is about to break through. With these two drops of Ten Thousand Years Ice Heart 
Liquid, he will definitely be able to break through to the fourth level within three days. When the 
time comes, this incense master will definitely cut this nasty little thief into pieces!"

Speaking of this, Chen Xiangzhu could no longer suppress the anger hidden in his heart, and 
suddenly slapped the table in front of him, which actually broke the table into pieces.

"However, after the incense master breaks through, the little thief Qin Chuan has long disappeared. 
How can we find him to settle the score?"

Chen Xiangzhu sneered at the corner of his mouth. He seemed to have already made up his mind. 
He pointed at the sandalwood stick and said:

"Third child, do you think I ordered just ordinary sandalwood? This sandalwood stick was specially 
made by the incense owner. It is mixed with Shilixiang powder. At this moment, he must have the 
smell of Shilixiang."



"As long as it is within ten miles, my scent bugs can know his location. It's not that easy for him to 
escape my tracking."

Hearing this, Lao San's rat eyes suddenly lit up:"Xiang Master really has a better move!"…
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"snort! Does that little bastard think the things from our Sky Thieves Gang are so easy to steal? This 
time I not only want him to vomit out all the things that should belong to me, but I also want him to 
regret coming into this world!"

Seeing the ghastly and terrifying expression on Master Chen Xiang's face, Lao San beside him 
couldn't help but shudder.

"Third child, I need your help in this matter!"

"Incense Master, please tell me!"

"You take my scent bug to track the boy's location, and remember not to get too close to him to 
avoid being discovered by him. After I break through, I will go find you. Then I, the incense master, 
will settle the score with that boy!"

Speaking of this, Chen Xiangzhu showed a proud sneer on his face. It is not easy for a fourth-level 
warrior to kill a third-level Dzogchen warrior.

A fierce battle is taking place in the forest to the north of Ten Thousand Beasts Mountain Forest.

Only At the scene, seven young warriors were surrounding and killing a second-level ferocious 
beast, the Python Tiger.

The leader of these young warriors was a young man holding a spear. He was about twenty years 
old and was the only second-level warrior in the team. The warriors were also the main force 
surrounding and killing the Mangshan Tiger.

The other six warriors, four men and two women, ranged in strength from first-level advanced to 
first-level intermediate.



"Be careful everyone! You just need to keep a check on me! I'll deal with this beast!"

The young man roared, and danced with a spear like a tiger. He had the courage to be unstoppable 
by ten thousand men. He took most of the attacks of the python tiger by himself, and he was very 
powerful for a while.

And the remaining six warriors The Mangshan Tiger was restrained from the side, making it 
difficult for the Mangshan Tiger to focus on one thing and the other for a while.

Obviously, these seven people were used to long-term cooperation, and they cooperated with each 
other very well. It didn't take long for the Mangshan Tiger to be completely suppressed by 
everyone.

Seeing that they were at a disadvantage. Victory was in sight, and everyone's faces showed joy.

The young man at the head was even more energetic, roared, and danced with his spear, forcing the 
Mangshan Tiger to retreat.

The team members were suddenly excited and cheered.

"The captain is so majestic!"

The younger of the two young warriors spoke.

She looked at the young man with a light of admiration in her eyes.

"Of course, the captain is not only handsome, but also very talented. I heard that he broke through 
to the second level when he was eighteen years old. It would be great if he could marry someone 
like the captain!"

The other girl did not hide her admiration for the young man at all.

"snort! Are you worthy of marrying the captain? Stop dreaming!"



"What do you mean? You need to clean up, right?"

While the two women were quarreling in private, a sudden change occurred.

The young man was accidentally slapped away by a python tiger's claw, and his body was whipped 
out by a tiger whip.

At the same time, The Mangshan Tiger broke out of the surrounding team members and pounced 
ferociously at the young man.

"Captain, be careful!"

All the team members exclaimed.

The two girls were so frightened that their faces turned pale.

Seeing that the young man was about to be injured by the python tiger's claws, at this critical 
moment, a figure suddenly rushed out of the woods beside him. The sword struck at the Mangshan 
Tiger.

There was a flash of sword light in the field, and blood immediately splattered. The Mangshan Tiger 
was actually split in half by the sword.

"Bravo!"

Everyone looked at the young man in white who suddenly appeared in the field in surprise.

This young man looked about fourteen or fifteen years old. His waist-length hair was scattered 
casually, and he was exuding evil aura. Coupled with the bright and big pair, The eyes full of 
spirituality formed a unique temperament.

The young man quietly wiped the blood on the sword and smiled slightly at the young men who 
were still in shock.



This young man was naturally Qin Chuan who was passing by.

Qin Chuan's smile made everyone sober. Coming over, the leading young man secretly called out 
his luck with lingering fear. At the same time, he cursed himself for being too careless before and 
was almost injured by the claws of the Python Mountain Tiger..
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"Thank you for your help, otherwise He would have been seriously injured today."

The young man came forward sincerely and thanked Qin Chuan.

"It's just a little effort, Brother He is so polite. I would like to ask Brother He, which direction is the 
Yunwu Valley?"

"Keep walking eastward to Yunwu Valley, and you'll reach it after walking about ten miles."

"Thank you very much! Hey brother, see you soon!"

Qin Chuan thanked the young man, then left and disappeared into the vast jungle.

All the team members looked at the direction of Qin Chuan's disappearance quietly. After a while, 
someone asked:"Captain, that man just now was so powerful. Who is he? Who is he?"

"I don't know either."

The young man shook his head slightly.

"However, he can kill a second-level ferocious beast with just a raise of his hands. Even a second-
level Dzogchen warrior would never be able to do so easily. Could it be that he is a third-level 
warrior?"

After saying this, even the young man himself found it unbelievable.



The rest of the team members even looked horrified.

"Oh my God! That little boy is so strong! I didn’t expect that there are people in this world who are 
more talented than the captain!"

The younger girl looked silently at the direction where Qin Chuan disappeared, with a hint of 
confusion in her eyes.

However, Qin Chuan asked for the direction and hurried all the way.

After half an hour, Qin Chuan finally arrived at the Cloud Valley.

This Yunwu Valley is covered by thick fog all year round. There is a miasma of poisonous insects 
everywhere in the valley, and few ferocious beasts appear.

This is mainly because the miasma in the valley is highly toxic, and even those ferocious beasts are 
unwilling to enter.

Not only is there no ferocious beasts in this valley, There are no beasts, and there are no other 
cherished things. Moreover, there is thick fog inside, and the visibility is very poor. It may be 
dangerous to step into the poisonous insect nest accidentally, so few people set foot in this cloud 
valley.

But all this is not good for It was not a problem for Qin Chuan.

Ordinary warriors who want to enter this valley must first take detoxification pills, but Qin Chuan 
does not need it. Qin Chuan closed his breath and entered the valley, following the route described 
in the treasure map Heading to the treasure place.

The fog along the way is very thick, which has a great impact on people's vision.

However, Qin Chuan's vision has greatly improved since the mutation, and he can barely discern the 
direction in the thick fog, coupled with his abnormal hearing aid , allowing him to walk in it with 
ease.



Not long after, when Qin Chuan passed a bush, he suddenly found that the ivy on the side was full 
of yellow fruits that were only the size of walnuts but shaped like gourds.

Looking at these small gourds Looking at the yellow fruit, Qin Chuan's face showed a look of 
surprise.

Hey! Isn't this the 'Spirit Gourd Fruit'?

This is a very rare earth spiritual fruit!

I heard that this thing can improve the cultivation of earth warriors, and the effect is It's better than 
the Earth Spirit Pill. This fruit can be sold for five hundred gold coins at least."

Seeing the tree covered with hundreds of ripe spirit gourd fruits, Qin Chuan was filled with joy. He 
didn't I thought that I had an unexpected harvest before I even entered the treasure place.

This tree full of spiritual gourd fruits is worth at least one hundred thousand gold coins. This is 
definitely a big income.

Qin Chuan was able to discover this unexpected gain because few people entered the Cloud Valley.

Although Master Liu Qian and his disciples had come in before, it was difficult for the two of them 
to discover the location of the spiritual fruit due to the obstruction of their sight in the valley, so 
they could only miss the opportunity.

The effect of this Spirit Gourd Fruit is dozens of times better than that of the Little Juyuan Pill. 
What kind of Little Juyuan Pill will he take in the future?

Just eat this spiritual gourd fruit and the progress will be much faster than before.

This spirit gourd fruit is effective on earth warriors below the fourth level, and even quasi-warriors 
can take it.

Unlike the Juyuan Pill and the Earth Spirit Pill, they can only be taken by warriors of level one or 
above.



At the moment, Qin Chuan happily picked the spiritual fruits.

Unexpectedly, before Qin Chuan picked two spiritual gourd fruits, a"buzzing" sound of wings 
suddenly sounded in the bushes.

Immediately afterwards, hundreds of fist-sized khaki venomous bees flew out of the bushes and 
flew toward Qinchuan in a dense crowd..
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Seeing so many poisonous bees suddenly appearing in front of him, Qin Chuan's expression 
changed drastically and he hurriedly backed away.

He recognized that these poisonous bees were mutated earth spirit bees. These were not ordinary 
poisonous bees.

Each of these mutated earth spirit bees has the strength of a peak quasi-warrior. What's even more 
frightening is that their tail stings are highly poisonous. Even a third-level warrior who is stung will 
be paralyzed and unable to move for a while.

In the blink of an eye, the hundreds of poisonous bees showed off their stingers one by one and 
stung Qin Chuan's head and face.

"court death! Qin

Chuan snorted coldly in his heart, and swept away dozens of poisonous bees with one move of the 
Fire Rain Plum Blossom Sword.

This Fire Rain Plum Blossom Sword is a group offensive martial art, which can deal with these 
weak but numerous bees. The poisonous bees were the most suitable.

At that moment, Qin Chuan avoided the siege of the poisonous bees while using the Fire Plum 
Blossom Sword to fight against the enemy. It didn’t take long to kill all the poisonous bees.



Without the obstruction of these poisonous bees, Qin Chuan He easily picked all the spirit gourd 
fruits and counted nearly three hundred, which is nearly 150,000 gold coins.

Qin Chuan happily put all these spirit gourd fruits into the God of War Order space and continued. 
Heading into the valley.

After traveling for about half an hour, Qin Chuan reached the bottom of the valley.

There were steep cliffs on three sides of the valley bottom. Qin Chuan came to the foot of one cliff 
and groped around for a long time before he found a finger-sized stone on a stone wall. hole.

Qin Chuan put a finger into the small hole and pressed it, and there was a roaring sound on the cliff 
next to it, and then a stone gate appeared strangely on the cliff.

Sure enough, it is here, this treasure place is indeed Secret enough!

Qin Chuan smiled slightly and ducked into the cave.

Just when Qin Chuan entered the treasure cave, a middle-aged man also appeared outside the 
Yunwu Valley.

This middle-aged man was the third son who was following him from a distance..At this moment, 
the scent bug in the third child's hand made a low chirping sound, looking at the cloud valley filled 
with miasma and poisonous mist, daring not to go in.

It turned out that the scent bug was afraid of the poisonous gas in the cloud valley.

The third child saw the scent bug. I didn't dare to go in, so I put it away, looked at the Cloud Valley 
and whispered to myself

"strangeness! What does this little bastard want to do in this Cloud Valley? In this Yunwu Valley, 
apart from poisonous insects, there is poisonous mist. Is there any treasure in it?"

Although he thought so in his heart, he didn't dare to go in. He didn't bring any antidote pills. There 
was no difference between going in and seeking death.



Huh! There is only one exit in the Cloud Valley. Unless the kid dies inside, he will have to exit from 
the valley sooner or later. Come out.

Then I will wait for him at the entrance of the valley. As long as the incense owner arrives, I won't 
have to worry about anything.

Thinking of this, the third child decided to wait at the entrance of the valley.

On the other side, after Qin Chuan entered the cave, He slowly groped inside.

This cave was very long, but the ventilation in the cave was very good, and the air was a bit cold 
and dry.

After walking forward for nearly a hundred meters, Qin Chuan discovered two stone houses.

In addition to some alchemy furnaces and There is nothing else on the bookshelf, except for some 
empty porcelain bottles. Everything inside has been cleared away by Master Liu Qian and his 
disciples.

Not even a single book is left on the bookshelf.

Judging from the layout of these two stone houses, This is probably the hermitage of an alchemist.

I just don’t know if there is anything else in this cave.

Thinking of this, Qin Chuan continued to move into the cave.

Soon, Qin Chuan reached the bottom of the cave.

Bottom of the cave There was a heavy iron gate everywhere.

The iron gate was tightly closed, and it was unknown what was going on behind the gate.



Qin Chuan groped around the gate several times, but did not find any button that could open the 
gate.

Finally, he saw a line of small words on the gate, which read: Those who enter this door must use 
their own strength to open it.

The meaning of this is obvious, that is, if you want to enter, you must rely on your own ability to 
open it.

See here , Qin Chuan smiled..
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