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After being scolded by Yu Yao, Mr. Zhou came to his senses completely, and at the same time felt 
despair in his heart.

After what happened today, he will never have any idea of Yu Yao again in the future.

If you talk about using force, it is absolutely impossible. Yuyao's cultivation level is at the third 
level, which is much stronger than him. Using force is just seeking death

"how come? How could it be like this? Could it be that the medicine has failed? impossible! I only 
used one drop last night to make Lin Yue look like that. Could it be that Yuyao's cultivation level is 
too high and the weight is not enough? Why! It's over, there will be no chance again."

Thinking of this, Zhou Shaolian was ready to die.

Not only did he not take advantage of Yuyao this time, he also offended Yuyao, and he also gave the 
other party an excuse.

He felt the burning pain on his cheek , Young Master Zhou's heart hurt even more.

Yuyao had just made an angry move, and the slap was not light. At this moment, five clear 
fingerprints were left on his face.

However, Qian Xing, who was guarding the door, heard a commotion in the house. , knowing 
something had happened, he just wanted to go in, but met Yuyao with an angry face walking out of 
it.

"Get out of here!"

Yu Yao cursed angrily. Now she has a very bad impression of Mr. Zhou Zhou, and she also hates 
Qian Xing.



Qian Xing unconsciously got out of the way.

Watching Yu Yao leave safely, Qian Xing Immediately he felt something bad and hurriedly walked 
in.

When Qian Xing went in, he happened to see Mr. Zhou holding his swollen cheek from being 
slapped and getting up from the ground in embarrassment.

"Fourth Young Master, what’s wrong with you?"

"You still have the nerve to ask, what kind of medicine did you give me? Why did it have no effect 
at all? Not only did I not take advantage of him, but I was also beaten up by the woman and half of 
my face was swollen. It's just that I didn't expect that this Yuyao was actually a third-level warrior."

Hearing this, Qian Xing frowned immediately.

"No way! Tianxian/Desire is the best medicine, how could it not be effective?"

"snort! I also felt strange. I tried the medicine on Lin Yue last night and the effect was indeed not 
good. Why doesn't it work today?"

After that, Mr. Zhou took out the bottle of medicine and looked at the liquid inside. It was colorless 
and odorless. He couldn't tell whether it was real or fake.

The medicine was a colorless and odorless liquid. On the surface, it was no different from water. , 
naturally he can’t distinguish between true and false.

"Why! It's really strange. Why does this medicine become ineffective after one night? By the way, 
is that little bitch Qin Chuan dead?"

Seeing Young Master Zhou asking such a question, Qian Xing suddenly looked ugly, and then told 
Qin Chuan's condition after being poisoned.

After listening, Young Master Zhou's face changed greatly and he couldn't believe it.



"what is going on? Why can't this little bastard always be killed?"

Having said this, Young Master Zhou looked at Qian Xing angrily:"Is the poison you bought a fake, 
so that little bastard didn't die? Qian

Xing hurriedly said in a panic:"Fourth Young Master, everything I buy is definitely genuine and 
there will be no fakes.""

"fart! If the medicine you bought wasn't fake, how come that little bitch Qin Chuan wasn't poisoned 
to death?"

"this……"

Qian Xing had cold sweat on his forehead.

"Fourth Young Master, didn’t your aphrodisiac suddenly lose its effectiveness? Will there be any 
changes in the middle?"

"misfortune?"

Hearing this, Mr. Thursday was stunned for a moment, and he became a little suspicious.

After a while, Mr. Thursday looked at the medicine in his hand and whispered to himself.

"It seems that I want to go to Lin Yue to try again tonight to see if there is anything weird about the 
medicine in this bottle? If it still works, that's right. If it doesn't work, the reason is not simple."..
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Thinking of this, Young Master Zhou ordered

"Qian Xing, I'm going to spend the night with the Fourth Young Mistress tonight, so you can help 
me keep watch in the courtyard to see if there's anything unusual or weird?"



"yes! The subordinates know!"

"Then you clean up this place first, and when the redness and swelling on my face subsides, we will 
go there!"

But outside the hospital, Qin Chuan heard everything clearly.

Seeing that Yu Yao left safely, Qin Chuan breathed a sigh of relief. At the same time, he was also 
secretly surprised that Yu Yao turned out to be a third-level warrior.

But as long as he thought of Yu Yao , There is a master behind Yao who is both a seventh-level 
warrior and an alchemist, so he doesn't think this is strange.

Unexpectedly, Zhou Shao began to doubt the medicine.

He couldn't let Zhou Shao doubt it, otherwise it would be easy for Zhou Shao Then they would be 
suspicious of him.

By the way, I wonder if the pot of tea in Lin Yue's room is still there? He had poured the rest of the 
medicine into it, and it seemed that he had to find a way to get some out.

Thinking of this, Qin Chuan advanced Set off and sneaked into Lin Yue's small yard first.

This time, Qin Chuan entered the yard with ease.

However, he did not hide under the window, but lay in the shadow of the roof.

In this dim night, it was It was difficult to find him.

As soon as Qin Chuan got on the roof, he quietly opened a tile and looked inside the house.

Inside, he saw candlelight dancing, and Lin Yue was sitting at the table, dazed.



In fact, she She had just woken up not long ago.

Last night, she was given aphrodisiac by Zhou Shao. After a night of indulgence, she was so tired 
that she couldn't get out of bed. She didn't wake up until the evening.

This was mainly because Zhou Shao wanted revenge and had no intention of showing mercy to 
her. , only venting harshly on her

"What happened last night?"

Lin Yue touched her cheek and recalled what happened last night, but her memory was very vague. 
She vaguely saw her cousin Nan Mingyu.……

Thinking of what happened last night, Lin Yue felt angry, ashamed, and a little excited. It was very 
complicated.

"Who is it? It couldn't be Nan Mingyu's cousin. Could it be Young Master Zhou Zhou? By the way, 
he came to my place last night and poured me a cup of tea with his own hands. He looked very 
unnatural at that time. Did he put medicine in my tea cup?"

Thinking of this, Lin Yue was a little angry, and at the same time she had some weird feelings in her 
heart.

"Is this the cup of tea? snort! This Young Master is indeed not a good person, he actually used this 
thing on me! When I look back, I will definitely ask him why he did this!"

Lin Yue looked at the half cup of tea on the table and felt very unhappy. She poured out the half cup 
of tea. Whoever knew that she had been drugged would probably not be happy. Maybe it was 
because of seeing the tea that Lin Yue I felt a little thirsty.

After all, I did a strenuous exercise last night and slept all day during the day. I didn't eat or drink. It 
was natural to feel thirsty at this time. At the moment, Lin Yue took out a tea cup again, not caring 
about the cup in the pot. The tea was overnight cold tea. He poured a large cup and was about to 
drink it.



On the roof, Qin Chuan's face suddenly became strange when he saw Lin Yue wanting to drink the 
cup of tea.

He poured all the medicine into the tea...

But just when Lin Yue was about to drink the cup of tea, Qin Chuan's face suddenly changed 
slightly on the roof and he looked in a certain direction outside the courtyard.

Because he heard a rapid sound breaking through the air from that direction. The speed was very 
fast. frightening

"There are experts! He is a fifth-level master. Who is the visitor?"

Just when he had this thought in his mind, a golden light appeared in the courtyard, and then he 
flashed into the house.

As soon as he saw the golden light, Qin Chuan was shocked, and he instantly recognized that the 
golden light was the Monkey King.

"It turned out to be the Monkey King. Unexpectedly, the Monkey King came back again."..
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But Lin Yue in the room was about to drink the cup of tea. Suddenly she heard the movement 
outside the room and put down the tea in her hand. Before she could stand up, a golden light rushed 
into the room, revealing the figure of the Monkey King.

"Monkey King, why are you back? Don’t you know that Thursday is less likely to look for you 
everywhere? How dare you come back."

When Lin Yue saw the Monkey King, her expression suddenly changed.

The Monkey King was very embarrassed at the moment, with a lot of blood stains and injuries on 
his body.



Seeing the Monkey King's appearance, Lin Yue couldn't bear it. After all, she was getting along 
with the Monkey King. After a long time, she gradually discovered that the Monkey King had a 
very straightforward character, especially that he had no malicious thoughts towards her, which 
made her impression of the Monkey King not so bad.

At that moment, Lin Yue asked with concern:"Monkey King, what are you doing? What's wrong? 
Why are there so many injuries on your body?"

The Monkey King said angrily:"It's not the Vice President leader of the Zhou family named Li Mu. 
In the past few days, he has led many masters to eliminate the Monkey King outside the city. This 
Monkey King almost suffered their murderous attacks several times."

"If this Monkey King hadn’t been thinking about you, I would have returned to my home long 
ago.We went to the Monkey King's Cave, so why spend the night and dine outside the city while 
worrying about the danger of being killed.

Lin Yue sneered:"Are you thinking about me?" I see you are thinking about how to get to the 
Temple of War, right? You'd have a hard time finding it without my help."

The Monkey King glanced at Lin Yue with a complicated expression, and then sighed.

"Whatever you think, going to the Temple of War is not just for me. If you don’t go, you won’t live 
long. I don’t believe you don’t want to go."

Hearing this, Lin Yue seemed a little angry and said impatiently

"Okay, I don’t want to get entangled with you on this issue. Tell me, what do you want to do when 
you come to see me this time?"

The Monkey King said:"Now Li Mu is on the outside of the city to destroy this Monkey King. 
Outside the city, the Monkey King cannot stay any longer. I can only hide here with you."

"If you find it inconvenient, I, the Monkey King, will go back to my Monkey King Cave. I just want 
to say hello to you before going. In the future, after you have obtained those ancient documents, you 
can go directly to the Monkey King Cave to find the Monkey King.



Lin Yue pondered for a while and said,"I think it's better that you hide here with me first." However, 
you can no longer show your face in front of others. Can you do this?"

Hearing what Lin Yue said, the monkey king's eyes actually showed joy.

"If you don’t show up, you won’t show up. This monkey king will only act at night from now on."

"As long as you know!"Lin Yue said lightly and didn't want to pay attention to it anymore.

Suddenly, Lin Yue thought of another question and asked why the Monkey King wanted to steal 
Young Master Zhou's gold box that night.

The Monkey King was stunned and asked Qin Chuan Yu told him about cheating him.

Lin Yue suddenly realized:"It turns out that Qin Chuan stole the fire liquid that day. This kid is 
really powerful! However, you monkey is really a hericium and a pig brain, and you were actually 
fooled by a teenage child."

"Why!"

The Monkey King sighed. As long as he thought about that incident, his heart was bleeding. He 
knew that no matter how much he tried to defend himself at this moment, it would be useless. He 
could only bear the scapegoat Qin Chuan gave him.

And the one on the roof Qin Chuan listened quietly to the conversation between one person and one 
monkey, with a strange expression on his face.

"By the way, Monkey King, why were you killed outside the city for no reason?"

"It’s not because of that little bastard Qin Chuan!"

Speaking of this, the Monkey King's eyes were spitting fire, and he immediately told everything 
about his encounter with Qin Chuan outside the city that day.



"So it turns out that you were discovered by Li Mu because of this?"

"yes! Unfortunately, that little beast of Qinchuan is too cunning. It is a pity that the Monkey King 
could not get the God of War Order from him."

"Why! Forget about him, as soon as he mentioned Qin Chuan, who had been killed thousands of 
times, this monkey king wanted to kill him. By the way, after running for a long time, my mouth is 
dry now. Do you have any water here?"

Monkey King looked at the table, picked up the purple sand teapot, and poured a few sips of tea 
into his mouth..
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When Lin Yue saw it like this, her eyes were slightly unhappy, and she murmured in a low 
voice:"Sure enough, it is still uncivilized. Can you drink tea like you? Don't you know how to pour 
it into a cup and drink it?"

But the Monkey King didn't think so. Meaning:"I'm so thirsty, who cares so much, I just want to 
drink to my heart's content!"

It actually drank up the pot of tea in one breath.

When Lin Yue heard what it said, she didn't want to pay attention to it.

However, when she saw the Monkey King drinking happily, she also felt a little thirsty, so she drank 
the cup of tea in her hand.

On the roof, Qin Chuan suddenly looked strange when he saw the man and the monkey finishing 
their tea.

"Oh my God! There are a lot of medicines added to the tea! Nothing will happen if this continues, 
right?"

Just as Qin Chuan was thinking this, everyone in the room began to feel a little uncomfortable.



"Huh! This tea is so weird. It's cold when you drink it. Why does it start to make you feel hot after 
drinking it?"

The monkey king scratched the monkey hair on his body and walked around the room very irritably.

Gradually, the monkey king felt that an evil fire was burning under his dantian for no reason, 
making him extremely anxious, but he didn't know it. what's going on

"Lin Yue, your tea..."

Just when there was chaos inside, Qin Chuan's expression suddenly changed again. He held his 
breath and lay motionless on the roof, but looked outside the courtyard.

He saw two footsteps coming from outside the courtyard. Soon, Zhou Shao and Qian Xing were 
seen entering the courtyard.

"Qian Xing, just watch in the courtyard! I went in to see that woman Lin Yue."

"yes! Subordinates obey!"

At that moment, Young Master Zhou entered the house alone. He was still thinking about the scene 
last night.

Soon, Young Master Thursday walked in.

As soon as he entered the house, Young Master Thursday's expression changed slightly.

He vaguely heard Lin Lin There was a strange sound coming from Yue's boudoir.

He was so familiar with this sound that Shao Zhou suddenly felt something was wrong.

"what happened? What on earth is that woman Lin Yue doing? Could it be that she did something to 
make me feel sorry for me behind my back?"



Thinking of this, Young Master Zhou couldn't help but feel something in his heart. His hands 
trembled involuntarily, and he quietly walked towards Lin Yue's boudoir.

He was worried that Lin Yue had really done something sorry for him, even if Lin Yue doesn't love 
him, and he doesn't love Lin Yue much.

But Lin Yue is his woman after all, and few men in this world can bear the betrayal of their own 
women, no matter whether he loves that woman or not.

Thursday Although the young master is not a good man, he is still a man, so he cannot bear it and 
cannot tolerate it.

Lin Yue had already betrayed him before marrying him and gave him an incomplete body. This has 
left him breathless. Come.

If Lin Yue betrays him after getting married, it will only make him collapse on the spot.

Slowly, Master Zhou got closer and closer to the door, and the voices inside became clearer and 
clearer.……

"boom!"

Young Master Zhou felt his brain roaring and his mind went blank. His whole body seemed to be 
paralyzed. He took a step back unconsciously and his eyes became empty. The movement in this 
room had fully proved that Lin Yue had betrayed him. Him!

Immediately, a surge of overwhelming anger surged from the heart of Young Master Zhou Zhou.

"Bitch! Lin Yue, you bitch! How dare you betray me, I will kill you! Kill you! I'm going to cut you 
two bitches into pieces."

Young Master Zhou's eyes suddenly turned red. He held the long sword tightly in one hand. At this 
moment, his anger could burn everything. At this moment, he could no longer control himself. He 
held the long sword and was about to rush in, trying to Kill this bitch on the spot..
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Young Master Zhou roared crazily in his heart. He was getting closer and closer to the door. At this 
moment, he did not rush in directly, but walked gently over.

Now he just wants to see what the adulterer who cuckolded him looks like.

‘The door of the room was opened quietly. When Young Master Zhou saw the situation in the room 
clearly, his eyes widened immediately, and then his eyes went black. Blood surged in his breath, and 
he almost spurted blood out of anger.

A sadness suddenly rose in Young Master Zhou's heart, and he roared crazily in his heart.

"ah!!! I'm going crazy! I'm going to kill you!!"

Young Master Zhou had a ferocious face and roared crazily. He raised the sword in his hand and 
struck at the Monkey King on the bed.

The Monkey King suddenly heard the sound of breaking through the air behind his head. When he 
looked back, he saw the ferocious Young Master Zhou. With a grimace on his face, he raised his 
sword to chop at himself.

At this time, the Monkey King had already recovered some of his sanity. After all, it was a fifth-
level ferocious beast and was much more resistant to the power of medicine.

When it saw Shao Zhou coming at him with his sword, he also Furious, he roared and grabbed the 
long sword with one claw. With just a little force, he snapped the long sword into two pieces with a 
'click'. The monkey king was angry not only because Zhou Shao interrupted his good deeds. , and 
because Zhou Shao shouldn’t be Lin Yue’s husband.

At this moment, it has regarded Lin Yue as its own woman. On

Thursday, it was rare for the monkey king to crush his sword with just one claw, and he suddenly 
woke up, knowing that he would definitely He was no match for the monster monkey in front of 
him.



But before he could act according to the opportunity, the Monkey King struck with another claw, 
grabbing directly at Young Master Zhou's Tianling Gai.

"ah!"

With a shrill scream, Young Master Zhou was so caught that his brains exploded and he died 
tragically on the spot.

All this was seen by Qin Chuan on the roof, and he was shocked and surprised. He didn't Thinking 
that Master Zhou died like this in the end.

He did not regret the death of Master Thursday.

Even if Master Thursday did not die in the hands of the Monkey King, he would eventually die in 
his hands.

Master Thursday died in the Monkey King's Paw Next, Qin Chuan was still a little lucky, as this 
would save him a lot of trouble.

But Qian Xing, who was guarding the yard, heard Young Master Zhou's scream and immediately 
rushed into the house. As soon as the Monkey King heard that there was something going on 
outside. Someone came in, and a strange color flashed in his eyes. In a hurry, he wrapped Lin Yue in 
a quilt and was about to jump out of the window to escape.

The moment the Monkey King jumped out of the window and left, Qian Xing happened to be 
rushed in and saw it.

Qian Xing saw all this , was stunned for a moment. He couldn't believe the scene in front of him.

However, the reality of the situation did not allow him to think too much. The monkey king had 
already escaped from the window with Lin Yue in his arms. Qian Xing was so anxious that he 
chased him out, saying Shouted:"No! Thursday Shao was killed by a monkey! Thursday Shao was 
killed by a monkey!"

His shouting was particularly harsh in the quiet night sky!



After Qian Xing chased him away, Qin Chuan immediately jumped down from the roof and 
hurriedly found the small porcelain bottle containing the Seven Spirits Purple Fire Pill from Young 
Master Zhou. Throw it into the space of the God of War Order.

This time Zhou Shao dies, and there will be a big storm soon. He has to leave here quickly, but he 
can’t be involved in this storm.

As soon as he has collected the newly harvested Seven Spirits Purple Fire Dan, Qin Chuan left the 
scene in a hurry before he had time to see what else was on Young Master Zhou.

Every extra minute he stayed at this scene would put Qin Chuan in more danger, so he had to leave 
as soon as possible.

As soon as Qin Chuan left the scene, he quietly hurried back to his residence.

At this time, Mr. Zhou's mansion was in a mess. There were noisy and shouting sounds everywhere.

Qin Chuan tidied up his house a little and checked that there were no flaws. Then he left the room 
and participated in the search with other guards.

Obviously, with Qian Xing's strength, it was impossible to catch up with the Monkey King.

After the Monkey King escaped with Lin Yue,

Qian Xing arranged for several people to protect the scene and quickly reported to the superiors..
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This night was spent in a chaotic scene.

Early the next morning, Qin Chuan and other personal guards were summoned to the lobby of 
Master Zhou's residence.

Sitting in the middle of the hall was an old man with gray hair.



At this moment, the old man had a trace of sadness on his face.

He is Young Master Zhou's father Zhou Changkun, a fifth-level fire warrior.

Zhou Changkun looked at the row of personal guards in front of him, with a trace of hatred in his 
eyes. If these people were not so useless, how could his son die?

Although Mr. Zhou is the least successful of his three children, he is his biological son after all!

Faced with the tragic news of his son's tragic death, as a father, how could he not feel sad? How can 
you not be sad? How can you not be angry?

"You are all a bunch of trash, you can't even protect your own master, what else do you have left?"

Zhou Changkun stood up from his seat angrily, pointed at the guards and shouted curses.

Seeing Zhou Changkun's anger, the guards' expressions changed greatly, and they lowered their 
heads, not daring to look up.

And Qin Chuan, as Young Master Zhou's personal guard, naturally also Among this group of guards

"snort!"

Seeing the anxious and fearful look of these personal guards, Zhou Changkun rolled his sleeves 
angrily and stood with his hands behind his back.

After a while, Zhou Changkun's anger calmed down a little, and the anger on his face gradually 
disappeared, and he changed to a cold look.

Although Young Master Zhou These personal guards all have some responsibility for Zhou's death, 
but after all, Young Master Zhou was killed by a ferocious beast that inexplicably broke into Zhou's 
house at night. This is something beyond ordinary people's expectations.



Therefore, even if these personal guards are responsible , but the responsibility will not be too great.

If Zhou Changkun wants to punish these personal guards, he cannot do too much. At most, he can 
only use some corporal punishment.

Doing this will not vent the anger in his heart. It is better to calm down and investigate carefully. 
Things in between.

Thinking of this, Zhou Changkun's tone softened.

"Say it! What is going on? Why would a vicious beast break in?"

All the guards shook their heads. Only Qian Xing remained silent.

Seeing all the guards shaking their heads, Zhou Changkun felt resentful in his heart and snorted 
coldly.

"As expected, they are all a bunch of trash! So, who among you was on night duty last night?"

All the guards immediately turned to look at Qian Xing and Qin Chuan.

"you! And you! You two stand out!"

Qin Chuan and Qian Xing immediately walked out of the queue.

"Were you two doing night duty last night? Qin

Chuan replied:"Sir, my subordinate was supposed to be on night duty last night, but he felt unwell 
last night and asked for leave from Brother Qian to go back to rest. Therefore, only Brother Qian 
Xing was on night duty last night.""

Hearing this, Qian Xing glanced at Qin Chuan and said with slight hesitation.



"Report to the master, it is just as Qin Chuan said, one of my subordinates was on night duty last 
night."

With Zhou Shaoyi's death, Qian Xing has no backer, but now he does not dare to offend Qin Chuan.

After listening to the two of them, Zhou Changkun pondered for a while, then turned to Qian Xing 
and asked:"So, Are you the clearest about what happened last night?"

"Yes! Last night, my subordinates had been guarding near the Fourth Young Master. When 
something happened to the Fourth Young Master, my subordinates were the first to rush to the 
scene, just in time to see the ferocious beast leave, and the ferocious beast even kidnapped the 
Fourth Young Master!"

"And kidnapped my daughter-in-law?"

Zhou Changkun had a strange look on his face.

"Yes! Sir, actually…..."

At this point, Qian Xing stopped talking and glanced at the guards behind him.

Zhou Changkun understood and said:"Qian Xing stays, you all can go down!"

When Qin Chuan and others left the hall.

However, Qin Chuan did not leave just yet. When no one was around, he quietly sneaked back to 
eavesdrop.

Zhou Changkun left Qian Xing alone, and he was worried.

After all, Qian Xing had a lot of conflicts with him because of Mr. Zhou Zhou. Who knows whether 
Qian Xing would take advantage of the opportunity of having a private conversation with Zhou 
Changkun to harm himself secretly?..
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But he said that in the hall, after all the guards left, Zhou Changkun asked.

"Qian Xing, if you have anything to say, just say it!"

"yes! master! Qian

Xing stepped forward and pretended to be mysterious:"Master, although there were several people 
who saw the ferocious beast last night, only one of my subordinates could really see what it looked 
like.""

"At that time, the subordinates heard the screams of the fourth young master. When they rushed in, 
they saw the demon monkey wrapping the fourth young master in a quilt and preparing to jump out 
of the window to escape. However, the subordinates also saw its appearance clearly. It was a 
monkey. The golden-haired monkey, judging from the speed it ran away last night, was probably a 
fifth-level ferocious beast."

"What? You said that demon monkey wrapped my daughter-in-law in a quilt and escaped?"

"Yes, sir!"

"So was my daughter-in-law wearing clothes at that time?"

"This...this... subordinates dare not say it!"

"snort! You don't need to tell me, I already know it, but I can't figure it out, how could this monster 
monkey find Lin Yue? Let's sneak into the inner courtyard of our Zhou family. I'm afraid it won't be 
easy."

"What the master said is right. In fact, my subordinates also saw a suspicious point at that time."

"What's the doubt? Say it!"

"Yes! My subordinates saw that the demon monkey last night was very similar to the pet monkey 
that the Fourth Young Mistress used to keep around, except for the size."



Hearing this, Zhou Changkun's face changed slightly.

"You mean, the monster monkey that killed my son last night was the pet monkey next to Lin Yue."

"Probably!"

At that moment, Qian Xing also told the little monkey to steal Master Zhou's gold box, and then 
told him that Master Thursday had driven him out of the mansion. After these two connections, 
Zhou Changkun had an idea in his mind.

"Unexpected! Unexpected! Then Lin Yue actually had an affair with the demon monkey and did 
such a thing. How could I have such a daughter-in-law?"

"It seems that the little monkey is not only her pet, but also her adulterer. My son drove that monster 
monkey out of the Zhou Mansion, and it must have a grudge."

"This time it sneaked back to the mansion and had an affair with Lin Yue, but was caught by my son 
and killed him! Why!! My poor child! snort! Lin Yue, and that monster monkey, I won't let you go!"

Thinking of this, Zhou Changkun finally sorted out the whole incident.

At this time, Zhou Changkun suddenly asked Qian Xing:"Besides what you told me about these 
things. Who else have you spoken to?

Qian Xing said hurriedly:"My subordinates only told the master, and no one else disclosed it.""

"good! very good! You did very well! Remember, never mention this to anyone in the future!"

"Yes, I understand!"

This matter involves Mr. Zhou's reputation and the Zhou family's face, so Qian Xing naturally 
doesn't dare to talk nonsense.



"By the way, I heard that you were my son’s most trusted bodyguard during his lifetime. You should 
know a lot about him."

"Yes! My subordinates have always been loyal to the Fourth Young Master!!"

"good! Then let me ask you, what is my son’s last wish? Qian Xing pondered for a while and said:"

I'm telling you, Master, the fourth young master had two main wishes during his lifetime: one is to 
advance to the third level warrior before the age of thirty, and the other is to kill his personal guard 
Qin Chuan."."

At this moment, Qin Chuan was listening outside the house. When he heard Qian Xing's words, his 
heart suddenly shivered and he secretly thought

"What a money punishment. I guessed it right. You really want to use this conversation to harm 
me."

Actually, Qian Xing also has his own little calculation.

Given the conflict between him and Qin Chuan, it is impossible for him to become friends in the 
future. If Qian Xing wants to continue working in the Zhou family, he will inevitably have to work 
with Qin Chuan in the future.

With Qin Chuan's cultivation and potential, he would definitely do better than him in the future. He 
knew that he could not defeat Qin Chuan, and was afraid that Qin Chuan would let him down in the 
future, so he told this matter, hoping to use Zhou Changkun's help to get rid of Qin Chuan. In order 
to avoid future troubles for himself.

Moreover, he did not tell lies. Killing Qin Chuan was indeed one of Young Master Zhou’s wishes…
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After saying that, Qian Xing continued:"Master, the thing is like this, when Qin Chuan and the 
Fourth Young Master….."



Qian Xing also wanted to tell the origin of the conflict between Qin Chuan and Zhou Shao, but was 
interrupted by Zhou Changkun

"Okay, you don’t have to say it. I know that you are the most trusted personal guard around my son, 
and what you say will not be false. Master, I don’t want to know what conflicts there are between 
them."

"However, since killing Qin Chuan is one of my son's last wishes during his lifetime, it is also the 
only last wish that can be fulfilled for him. As a father, I will help him complete it! After all he is 
my son."

Hearing this, Qian Xing was secretly happy. He knew that Zhou Changkun was going to kill Qin 
Chuan.

With Zhou Changkun's identity and strength, it was very simple for him to kill Qin Chuan.

But Qin Chuan outside the house heard this , but his face changed slightly, and he thought

"Young Master Zhou died just now, and he drove away the Monkey King. Why did such a guy 
come again? Why can't I always be at peace?

At this time, Zhou Changkun, who was in the room, said to Qian Xing:"I already know everything. 
Just go and ask Qin Chuan to come over!""

"Yes, I’ll go right away!"

Qian Xing's eyes were filled with joy. He didn't expect Zhou Changkun to attack Qin Chuan so 
soon.

At that moment, Qian Xing was about to turn around and leave.

But at this moment, Zhou Changkun suddenly took action. A big withered hand struck like 
lightning. He grabbed Qian Xing's throat, and his eyes showed cold murderous intent.

"Well!!...Well!!"



Qian Xing's eyes widened in horror. He tried desperately to break open the big hands holding his 
throat and shout loudly, but no matter how hard he tried, he couldn't.

"Qian Xing, I know you are very loyal, so just take your loyalty and go down there to accompany 
my useless son. Don't blame me for killing you. If you do, blame me for knowing too much."

Speaking of this, Zhou Changkun exerted a little force with his right hand, and Qian Xing's throat 
bones cracked softly, and his head tilted weakly, and he died. The reason why Zhou Changkun 
wanted to kill Qian Xing was because Qian Xing knew about the Monkey King and Lin Yue. The 
affair had hurt his son's identity, and even more so the Zhou family's face, so he naturally allowed 
outsiders to know about it.

Even though Qian Xing had already said it and would not talk about it to outsiders, he still felt 
unhappy in his heart. He trusted Qian Xing and simply killed Qian Xing to silence him.

But Qin Chuan outside the house could not see the scene of Zhou Changkun killing Qian Xing, but 
he could clearly hear it, and he thought to himself:"It seems that Zhou Changkun is a ruthless 
person. I'll have to be more careful in the future."

Inside the room, Zhou Changkun glanced at Qian Xing's body indifferently, his expression very 
calm.

With his identity and status, it is not a big deal to kill a guard casually. As long as he makes an 
excuse casually, no one will pursue him.

Slightly After thinking for a while, Zhou Changkun walked out of the hall. There were two of his 
bodyguards outside the door.

"Wang Jia, go in and dispose of the corpse inside!"

"yes!"

Wang Jia looked very calm. Obviously, he had encountered this kind of thing more than once.



Zhou Changkun turned to another guard and said:"Zhao Bing, go and call Qin Chuan over and ask 
him to come see me!"

"yes! This subordinate is going now!"

After Zhao Bing left, Zhou Changkun looked at the distant sky, with a touch of sadness on his face, 
and whispered to himself.

"Xiaosi! Little four! You loser, are you going to die like this? You really make dad sad! But don’t 
worry, dad will help you kill Qin Chuan in a while, fulfill your last wish, and let you go with peace 
of mind!"..

Chapter 1999

Outside the house, in a dark corner, after hearing these words, Qin Chuan's thoughts began to 
change rapidly.

It seems that he must leave here now. If he is really summoned by Zhou Chang Kun, he will 
definitely die.

Although Qin Chuan's current comprehensive strength is infinitely close to the fourth-level 
Dzogchen, if he wants to face a fifth-level warrior, he can only be killed instantly.

He is not a fool, and he will not just wait to die.

After Zhou Changkun re-entered the house, Qin Chuan left quietly and directly left the Zhou 
family's inner courtyard.

After leaving the Zhou family's inner courtyard, Qin Chuan rushed directly to the reserve guard 
camp to find his father.

In the preparatory guard camp, the residence of the deputy chief instructor.

Qin Chuan told Qingyun Feng everything about last night

"Um! You said that Zhou Changkun wants to kill you?"



"Yes, father! How to deal with this matter?"

Qing Yunfeng chuckled nonchalantly.

"If he wants to kill you, how can it be so easy? Now that Master Zhou is dead, it’s time to recall you 
personal guards to the guard camp. As long as you enter the guard camp, he won’t dare to take 
action lightly. Besides, there is still your Uncle Yun Sheng in the guard camp, and he will protect 
you. Of course you're fine"

"However, if you stay at my place today and don't go there, then Zhou Changkun won't be able to 
find you, and there will be nothing he can do to you. I'm going to inform your Uncle Yun Sheng 
right now and ask him to quickly issue a transfer order to transfer you back."

"As soon as the transfer order comes tomorrow, you can go directly to the guard camp to report to 
your Uncle Yun Sheng."

Qin Chuan came from the Ninth Leader of the Dizi Camp. His files are all registered in the Ninth 
Leader, and he is also under the Ninth Leader's guard.

Now the commander of the Ninth Leader is Qing Yunsheng. As long as he gives an order, he can 
take over at any time. Qin Chuan was transferred back.

At that moment, Qin Chuan followed his father's arrangement and stayed at the deputy chief 
instructor's residence.

Qing Yunfeng also immediately went to the guard camp to inform Qing Yunsheng of the transfer 
order.

After Qing Yunfeng left, Qin Chuan The ball in the God of War Order was released.

In order not to attract other people's attention in the past two days, Qin Chuan has been hiding the 
ball in the space of the God of War Order.



Maybe he stayed in the space of the God of War Order for too long. As soon as this guy came out, 
he With tears in his eyes and a look of grievance on his face

"OK! OK! Qiuqiu, stop crying."

Qin Chuan picked up Qiuqiu with a smile and held it in his arms.

"Gujiguji!!"

The little guy pouted his little mouth, his fat little face was full of resentment, and a fat little paw 
even grabbed a gold coin and stuffed it into his mouth.

"OK! Little guy, this is the Zhou family. I don’t let you out because I’m worried about your safety. 
In a few days, I will probably go to Tianshui City. As soon as I leave Shenyan City, I will release 
you and no longer lock you in the God of War Order space, okay?"

When he heard this, Qiuqiu's little eyes flickered.

"If you feel good, then listen to the words, you know?"

"Gujiguji!!"

The little guy immediately nodded obediently.

"brat!"

Qin Chuan petted Qiuqiu's little head.

"You go and play, I'm going to practice, remember to keep watch for me! If any stranger comes, call 
the police in advance"

"Gujiguji!!"



Qiuqiu nodded obediently, and then ran to play happily.

It has been locked up in the War God's Order space for two days, and it has long been exhausted.

Looking at Qiuqiu's naughty look, Qin Chuan smiled slightly

"This little guy is really naughty. It seems that its cultivation level has not increased much recently. 
It seems that these gold coins can only keep it from starving, but they do not help its growth!"

"I'd better think of more ways to get some gold spiritual objects for it to eat so that it can grow 
faster. The stronger it is, the greater its help to me will be!"…

Chapter 2000

Qiuqiu is Qin Chuan's pet, and is naturally a big help to Qin Chuan.

Qiuqiu's current cultivation level is at the peak of the third level, but it has no bottleneck. It is easy 
to enter the third level of Dzogchen because it is an eighth level beast.

The faster the ball grows, the faster its strength increases.

However, the speed of this growth has a lot to do with the food that the ball eats.

Just like Qiuqiu's growth rate after eating sky-tempered gold, it can reach a hundred times the speed 
of eating gold coins.

Therefore, what food the ball eats has a lot to do with its growth.

But while Qin Chuan was hiding in the deputy chief instructor's residence, there was a quarrel in 
Master Zhou's residence.

In the hall, Zhou Changkun looked at the guards in front of him impatiently.

"how? Haven't found it yet?"



"Report to the master, not yet! All the other personal guards under the Fourth Young Master were 
there, but Qin Chuan was missing."

"Huh! This is strange! How come this kid disappeared in the blink of an eye? You continue to 
search for me and mobilize more manpower. If you can’t find the Fourth Master’s residence this 
week, we will expand the scope to look for it. snort! This kid neglected his duties and dared to leave 
his post without authorization. He was so casual. It seemed that he really didn't take my son 
seriously. Maybe he was secretly enjoying himself because my son was dead!

Thinking of this, Zhou Changkun's eyes filled with anger.

"yes! Subordinates, go find it now!"

That day, all Zhou Changkun's men searched for the entire day, searching almost the entire inner 
courtyard of the Zhou family, but could not find any trace of Qin Chuan. Naturally, they could not 
find Qin Chuan, because Qin Chuan was no longer in the inner courtyard of the Zhou family.

It was not until evening that the guards who had found nothing reported the results to Zhou 
Changkun again.

"how? Haven't found it yet? snort! This little bastard Qin Chuan can really jump!"

Zhou Changkun waited for a whole day, but still couldn't find Qin Chuan, which was a waste of 
time.

However, Qin Chuan's behavior also completely angered him.

"snort! If you can't find him today, you will continue to look for him tomorrow. If you can’t find it 
tomorrow, you’ll have to look for it the day after tomorrow. Until I find that little bastard"

"I don't believe it, this little bastard really left the Zhou family. As long as he is still in the Zhou 
family, he will definitely appear again. When the time comes, I must kill him with my own hands to 
comfort my son’s soul."



Speaking of this, Zhou Changkun's eyes showed a cold murderous intention, and he had already 
begun to kill Qin Chuan.

Time passed quickly, and it was the next day in a blink of an eye.

The next day, Qin Chuan took the day's hair After receiving the transfer order, he went directly to 
the guard camp and found Qing Yunsheng.

In the commander's barracks,

Qing Yunsheng looked at Qin Chuan with a smile.

"Qin Chuan, from now on in this guard camp, you can call me Commander Qin or Uncle Qin. Don't 
call me Uncle Yunsheng, lest the walls have ears."

"Um! Qin Chuan knows!"

There are many people in the guard camp, so they naturally have to be more careful.

"Your current superficial cultivation level is still disguised as the second level of Fire Element 
Dzogchen. That’s fine. I can arrange for you to be my personal guard. Normally I won’t assign you 
tasks. Your only task is to practice."

"If you really show off your third level, according to regulations, you will be assigned a captain 
position. As a captain, you will have many tasks on your shoulders. These tasks will take up a lot of 
your time, and you will have no time to practice."

"After all, this is a guard camp, not a preparatory guard camp. What you have to do now is to 
improve your strength as soon as possible, so that you can have more ability to protect yourself 
when snatching the Blue Dragon Pearl."

"Uncle Qin!! I see!"...
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