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"Ling'er, there is enough water energy in this place. It is indeed a good place to practice water 
energy!"

Now, Qing Tianqi's Fire Yuan Qi has reached the peak of the fourth level, Wood Yuan Qi is the 
fourth level, and the equally talented Water Yuan Qi is only at the level of the Great Perfection of 
the Third Level, so he has always wanted to take advantage of the opportunity to cultivate the Water 
Yuan Qi to the fourth level.

Because of the Water Yuan Qi At the fourth level of cultivation, he can transform the energy of the 
three elements of water, fire, and wood into the power of wind, and his strength will be greatly 
increased by then.

In fact, according to Qingtian Qi's estimation, his water element talent is no worse than the wood 
element talent. At least at present It is a genius qualification.

If he can find the inherited artifact of the Wu family and activate the Xuanwu true blood in his body, 
his water talent will be at least the qualification of a hidden spirit body, or even a pseudo-spiritual 
body.

As for the earth and gold systems , In the cultivation of vitality, he did not dare to have high 
expectations for it.

"This is indeed a good place to practice water energy!"Ming Ling'er also nodded slightly.

She knew very well that Qingtian Qi worked hard in cultivation, which was almost crazy.

She had hardly seen Qingtian Qi sleeping for more than an hour.

As long as he had time, Qingtian Qi would He spent all his thoughts on cultivation.



This made Ming Ling'er deeply feel that Qingtian Qi's achievements today are not only due to 
chance, but also inseparable from his diligence and hard work.

For Qingtian Qi, this is Obsessed with cultivation, Ming Ling'er not only did not feel disgusted at 
all, but was happy in her heart.

Because she knew that there was another inheritor of the God of War in this world, and it must be 
very powerful.

According to her understanding of her uncle, it was impossible for his uncle to choose one A weak 
person becomes the master. Even if he is a ninth-level warrior, his uncle may not like him.

Therefore, if Qingtian Qi wants to survive, he must become stronger as soon as possible, and he 
must race against time.

"Why!"

Thinking of this, Ming Ling'er felt inexplicably sad, and couldn't help but worry about Qing Tian 
Qi's future.

Seeing Ming Ling'er sighing suddenly, Qing Tian Qi asked with concern:"Ling'er, what's wrong 
with you? Ming

Ling'er looked at him tenderly and sighed:"My dear husband, tonight is Ling'er's last night with 
you. Tomorrow Ling'er must return to the Sun, Moon and Heavenly Wheel to practice." Ling'er felt 
a little reluctant to give up!"

Hearing this, Qing Tianqi felt a burst of warmth in his heart and smiled.

"Ling'er, don't worry, as long as I find another Blood Soul Pearl in the future, you will be able to 
come out and accompany me again, right?"

Ming Ling'er sighed:"Hey! It also takes time to find the Blood Soul Pearl. During this time, Ling'er 
will not be by your side to protect you, so you must take good care of yourself!"



"Um! Ling'er, don't worry! I will definitely help you find the remaining four blood soul beads as 
soon as possible to make the Sun and Moon Heavenly Wheel complete. At that time, your strength 
will also increase, and you will be able to refine the power of Lei Ya's weapon soul faster."

"Even so, how could the Blood Soul Pearl be so easy to find?"

"Didn't the Monkey King say that there was a blood soul bead in the attached hall? After a year, I 
went to find him. When the time comes, I get that blood soul bead, and you can come out and 
accompany me again."

"Hope so! By the way, I wonder how long it will take Old Man Teng to refine the Xuanwu Token?"

"I don’t know this either! Ask him again in a few days!"

It turned out that that day, Ming Ling'er and Teng Xiaoshan worked together and spent a whole day 
to rescue Qingtian Qi's mother.

Later, Qing Tianqi and his mother recognized each other, which was a touching scene.

Qingtian Qi also I was grateful to Ming Ling'er for this.

Next, Teng Xiaoshan took some blood essence from Qingtianqi's mother and went back to refine the 
Xuanwu Token.

In the past three days, the three tribes also held a conference.

That conference Teng Xiaoshan gave another task to the children of the three clans.

This task was to find the whereabouts of the children of the Bai family and the Wu family, while 
also asking for news about the 'Blood Soul Pearl'.

Qingtian Qi knew that this must be what Ming Ling'er ordered Teng Xiaoshan helped. There is 
strength in numbers, and he was happy to do so..

Chapter 2542



"Ling'er, I won't practice tonight. I'll chat with you!"

It turns out that Qingtian Qi knew that Ming Ling'er was leaving after tonight, and he suddenly felt 
a little reluctant to leave. The relationship between people is always so strange.

When they are together, there is no feeling. Only when they are separated, will the deepest feelings 
in their hearts be touched. That string makes you feel reluctant to part with it.

No matter how ordinary the previous relationship was, you will still feel nostalgic when you recall 
it!

"OK! Unexpectedly, my husband was finally willing to take the initiative to accompany Linger."

Ming Ling'er's cheeks turned red with joy, and she leaned on Qing Tian Qi's shoulder actively, 
looking charming and charming under the moonlight.

Qing Tian Qi's eyes lit up when she saw it, and she said to herself:"Ling'er is really pretty when 
she's not fierce!"

Next, the two of them just looked at the night sky and chatted.

After chatting until dawn, Ming Ling'er reluctantly turned into a ray of light and entered the sun and 
moon wheel.

Looking at the sun and moon mark on the palm of his hand, Qingtian Qi suddenly felt a sense of 
loneliness and sadness in his heart.

In fact, he had always been lonely. Although Qiuqiu came later, Qiuqiu would not talk to him. Until 
he met Ling'er later, he no longer seemed like before. so lonely

"Why! From now on, I am alone again!"

Qingtian Qi sighed in his heart, put away all his thoughts, and walked towards the Qing family's 
residence.



When Qingtian Qi returned to his residence alone, a white shadow happily ran out of the house and 
threw himself into his arms

"Ball ball!"

Qing Tianqi held the white shadow in his arms

"Gujiguji!!"

Qiuqiu licked Qing Tianqi's face with his warm little tongue, giving him a little warmth in his 
lonely heart.

Without Ming Ling'er by his side, there will still be Qiuqiu in the future.

"brat! Miss me?"

"Gujiguji!"

Qiuqiu nodded obediently.

Qingtianqi smiled slightly and took out a piece of magnetic blue gold from the War God's Order 
space to feed it.

Qiuqiu happily hugged the piece of magnetic blue gold and started chewing it.

Seeing Qiuqiu's cute and well-behaved appearance With such a look, Qingtian Qi suddenly felt sour 
in his heart. He gently stroked Qiuqiu's soft fur and whispered:

"Whatever the future holds, little one? No matter what the relationship is between you and the 
devil? You are my best mate. Always will be! I will definitely protect you!"

At this moment, Qing Tianqi felt endless sadness in his heart.



Both Qiuqiu and Ming Ling'er may leave him one day.

Qiuqiu is likely to be taken away by the devil.

Ming Ling'er is likely to fall into another In the hands of the inheritor of the God of War.

And he will die alone.

As if feeling Qing Tianqi's sadness, Qiuqiu raised his fat little head and made a low sound of"woo 
woo". With a pitiful look, it actually He also became sad.

Qingtian Qi smiled slightly:"Little guy, don't worry, I'm fine! Let's go inside!"

At that moment, Qingtian Qi took Qiuqiu into the house.

Looking at Qiuqiu in his arms, Qingtian Qi seemed to suddenly cheer up a little.

"What's wrong with me? Why did you suddenly become sentimental? Could it be because of the 
sadness of parting with Ling'er? no! He is burdened with the expectations of the three clans and 
must not remain depressed. Even for the sake of Ling'er and Qiuqiu, we must cheer up and work 
harder to improve our strength."

Thinking of this, Qingtian Qi suddenly woke up and said to himself

"yes! I don't have much time to begin with. I think so much here, why waste my time? For the sake 
of my family, for Qiuqiu, and for Ling'er, I must improve my cultivation as soon as possible!"

Thinking of this, Qingtian Qi got rid of all his thoughts and took the time to practice again.

Just like that, seventeen days passed in the blink of an eye.

During these seventeen days, Qingtian Qi's five elements of vitality have improved.



Especially Water Yuan Qi has made the greatest progress.

During this period, Qing Tianqi took a large number of water elixirs, went to waterfalls and pools 
every day, and practiced the Qingxin Mantra day and night. Water Yuan Qi improved very rapidly.

According to his estimation, as long as In a few months, I will definitely be able to cultivate the 
water energy to the peak of the third level of Dzogchen, which will not be far from the fourth level 
at that time.

As for the other four vitality, there has been more or less progress, but not as much progress as the 
water energy..
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At the same time, Teng Xiaoshan also refined nineteen pieces of Xuanwu Tokens in these seventeen 
days and distributed them to the three tribes.

The three clans also successively sent nineteen groups of disciples out to look for the children of the 
Bai family and the Wu family.

Of course, the first thing to look for is the children of the Wu family.

Because of the Xuanwu Order, it is naturally much easier to find the children of the Wu family than 
the Bai family.

Each of these nineteen batches of disciples has nine to ten people.

There were nearly two hundred people together, all warriors of the fourth level or above.

It can be said that most of the fourth-level and above warriors among the three tribes have been sent 
to all corners of the Dakun Kingdom, leaving only a small number to guard the base.

But Qingtian Qi has never been sent out.



But on this day, Qing Tianqi was suddenly summoned by Qing Xuanlin.

Arriving at the clan meeting hall, Qing Xuanlin was already waiting there.

As soon as he saw Qing Tianqi, Qing Xuanlin said politely:"Tian Qi! You are here!"

Even he must be polite to his grandson now.

"Yes, Tianqi has met Grandpa! I wonder why grandpa summoned Tianqi to come over? Qing

Xuanlin nodded and said,"Grandpa does have something to ask you, but he still has to wait for the 
other two to come over." By the way, Miss Linger has gone into seclusion?"

"Yes, Linger is in seclusion"

"Why! It seems that it will have to wait for several more decades for you to become a true ninth-
level warrior. In fact, it doesn’t matter. Our three tribes have waited for thousands of years. What 
does a mere few decades mean?"

While the two were talking, two more people walked in outside the hall, but they were Qingtian 
Ling and Qingtian Jun.

Qingtian Ling was very happy to see Qingtian Qi. He immediately stepped forward to say hello.

Qingtian Jun was stunned when he saw Qingtian Qi. , then stepped forward with a sad expression 
and said

"Tianjun has met the clan leader and the young clan leader."

Qingtian Qi was a little surprised to see Qingtianjun. He saw Qingtianjun's expression was gloomy 
and did not dare to look at him. He thought to himself:"It seems that what happened last time had a 
big impact on him!"

At this time, Qing Xuanlin spoke and said



"good! Now that the three of you are here, let me tell you what happened. Finding the descendants 
of the Wu family and the Bai family this time is the most important matter for our three clans."

"Now, except for some guard personnel, I have basically sent out the rest of the fourth-level and 
above warriors, but I have not sent out the three of you. Do you three know why?"

"have no idea!"

The three of them shook their heads slightly.

Qing Xuanlin said:"Because you three are the most outstanding third-generation descendants of our 
Qing family, and it can be said that you are also the most outstanding third-generation descendants 
of the three clans at present. Among the three generations of descendants of the Feng family and 
Teng family, there are no children with the qualifications above the hidden spirit body, and only our 
Qing family has them."

Speaking of this, Qing Xuanlin couldn't help but show a look of pride on his face.

At that moment, Qing Tianqi asked curiously:"Grandpa, is it possible that what you are going to say 
next is related to our qualifications?

Qing Xuanlin smiled and said:"Not bad!" It is not only related to your qualifications, but also has a 
lot to do with your strength. Actually, what I want to tell you is about the 'Rookie Conference' that 
will be held in Kyoto in six months' time. I just want the three of you to participate!"

"Attending a rookie convention?"

Qingtian Qi and the other three people suddenly looked at each other, and they all saw a hint of 
surprise in each other's eyes.

All three of them had heard about the Rookie Conference, which was a 'Rookie Ranking' ranking 
competition held only once every ten years in the Great Kun Kingdom.



All people from the Great Kun Kingdom and warriors under the age of thirty are eligible to 
participate in the competition. Only the top

100 people in the competition can enter the list, and those who make the list will be re-ranked.

The Rookie Conference is one of the biggest events in the Great Kun Country. First, both warriors 
and the people attach great importance to it.

For all the young warriors in Dakun Country, it is the event they most long to participate in, even 
Qingtian Qi and the others.

After all, young people have a desire in their hearts. A strong heart, a heart that wants to compete 
with the world's heroes..
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After the three of them were surprised, Qingtian Qi was the first to react and asked

"Grandpa, why did you let the three of us attend the rookie meeting?"

Seeing Qing Tianqi ask this question, Qing Xuanlin smiled and nodded.

"good! There is indeed another reason why I asked the three of you to participate. My goal is the 
prize in the competition, 'Apocalypse Pill'’"

Hearing Tianqi Dan, Qingtian Qi and the other two people opened their eyes wide. Apparently all 
three of them had heard of it.

Qing Tianling was even more excited and said:"Clan leader, Tian Ling has heard about Tian Qidan a 
long time ago. I heard that Tian Qidan is a top-quality elixir worth about two million gold coins, but 
in fact it has a price but no market. There is no market for it outside. Can't buy it"

"And its effect is also extremely terrifying. I heard that taking the Apocalypse Pill has a 20% chance 
of helping a fourth-level Dzogchen peak warrior to break through to the fifth level."



"Tian Ling said it right! Apocalypse Pill is indeed so magical. It’s a pity that our Qing Feng Teng 
family cannot refine such a top-quality elixir, so I asked you to attend the Rookie Conference to get 
the reward of the Apocalypse Pill."

"With the Apocalypse Pill, it will be much easier for you to break through to the fifth level in the 
future. This is a rare opportunity!"

"yes! Grandpa, you are right, this is indeed a rare opportunity! However, it is not easy to get the 
reward of Apocalypse Pill! I heard that only those who enter the top ten rookies will be rewarded 
with the Apocalypse Pill! Qing

Xuanlin said:"That's why I asked you three to go. I hope one of you three can make it into the top 
ten." As long as one person can enter the top ten, it will be a great blessing."

"In fact, as far as the young disciples of the three tribes are concerned, you three are the most 
qualified and have the highest cultivation level. If you are not sent, who will be sent? Although 
the"Zi" from the Feng family is very good, he is already over the age of competition."

"In fact, judging from the previous conferences, the tenth rookie is not necessarily a fifth-level 
warrior, but also a fourth-level Dzogchen warrior in some conferences, so all three of you have a 
chance."

"Even if there is no chance, the three of you must unite and find a way for one of you to enter the 
top ten. After all, you are all descendants of the Qing family, and sometimes you have to know how 
to sacrifice your small self to preserve your greater self."

After listening to Qingxuanlin, the three of them agreed.

At this time, Qingxuanlin turned to Lord Qingtian again and said

"Tianjun, I am most worried about you. As an elder, I want to tell you. No matter what kind of 
unhappiness you had with Tianqi, it was all a quarrel between brothers in the clan. After leaving the 
Qing family, you are all descendants of the Qing family, and you must unite and help each other, do 
you understand?"

"Patriarch! I see!"



Qingtianjun nodded silently

"alright! I’ve basically finished what I want to say. The task for you three now is to intensify your 
practice. The Rookie Conference will be held in six months. You still have five months to practice, 
and then you will rush to Kyoto one month in advance. Therefore, the three of you must seize these 
five months of practice and improve your strength as soon as possible."

"During these five months, the Qing family's Cangwu Hall will always be open to the three of you. 
The three of you can go in at any time to learn martial arts that suit you. This is the general order of 
the Cangwu Hall."

At that moment, Qing Xuanlin distributed a green jade order to the three of them.

All three of them accepted the jade order with joy.

Qing Tianqi even thought to himself:"I heard that all the Qing family's martial arts palace has wood 
martial arts. There are so many types, so I want to take a closer look when I go in this time.

At this time, Qing Xuanlin said again:"Okay!" Everything is given to you, so you three should seize 
the time to practice!"

At that moment, Qingtian Qi and the others resigned to Qingxuanlin and left.

However, Qingtian Qi walked out of the hall and saw the melancholy Qingtian Jun in front of him. 
His heart moved and he shouted:"Brother Tianjun! Qingtianjun

's tiger body trembled slightly, and he said hoarsely:"Young clan leader, you don't dare to be!" You 
should call me Qingtianjun!"

After saying this, Lord Qingtian left directly..
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Qingtian Ling on the side said angrily:"Tianqi, why do you care about him? You kindly call him big 
brother, but he still doesn't appreciate it. For this kind of person, just don't pay attention to him in 
the future. With your current strength and identity, why should you care? Him?"

Qingtianqi shook his head and said:"Brother Tianling, you can't say that. Even if he has any 
misunderstandings about me before, he is still my clan brother, and I should respect him as brother. 
Okay, I won't say more. Brother Tianling, let’s go to the Cangwu Hall to see if we can find some 
martial arts suitable for us."

After hearing this, Qingtianling said excitedly

"OK! I heard that there are many wood-based martial arts in our Qing family’s martial arts palace! 
Now that you and I have cultivated the wood energy to the fourth level, we may be able to find a 
superior wood martial skill there that can be practiced without having to understand the secret.

Qingtian Qi also said happily:"Yes!" As long as we can learn a superior martial art, our strength will 
greatly increase"

"Of course! After all, not every fourth-level warrior can learn superior martial arts. Because most of 
the best martial arts require understanding of the secrets before they can be learned."

"As long as there are a very few superior martial arts that do not require comprehension of the 
secrets, they only require fourth-level cultivation to learn them. It's just that this kind of superior 
martial arts that doesn't require understanding the secret is extremely rare! I don’t know if our Qing 
family has it!"

"yes!"

Qingtian Qi also nodded in approval.

In fact, he also has three superior martial arts.

An superior fire-based defensive martial skill, 'Fire Feather Aegis,' which was obtained from Xie 
Dingkun, the father of Fourth Young Master Xie.



A superior gold-based martial skill.'"Moon God Slash" was obtained from the corpse of Ke Yuan in 
the Fire Lotus Cave.

An excellent water martial skill,"Ice Dragon Roar", was obtained from the king of Tianshui City, 
Xiangzhu.

Among these three superior martial arts, Fire Feather God Shield and Moon God Slash can only be 
learned after the fifth level, while Ice Dragon Roar can be learned after the fourth level.

Unfortunately, Qingtian Qi's water energy has not been cultivated to the fourth level.

Therefore, he cannot learn these three superior martial arts. Study.

His current most powerful offensive martial skill is only the fusion martial skill 'Three Color Sky 
Slash', which is slightly higher than the intermediate martial skill. It can increase the amplitude of 
the attack power by 30%, but it is not enough compared to the superior martial skill. The superior 
martial skill can reduce the attack power. The force amplitude is 40%.

Therefore, Qingtian Qi is in urgent need of mastering a superior martial skill to increase his attack 
power.

However, Qingtian Qi's"Three Color Sky Slash" is just a fusion of three similar inferior offensive 
martial arts. If Combining the five inferior martial arts to achieve the perfection of the five 
elements, its power is likely to surpass the superior martial arts in one fell swoop, just like the 'Five 
Elements Shield', reaching the level of pseudo-top martial arts

"By the way, my 'Three Colors Sky Slash' is the fusion of three inferior martial arts: Light Slash, 
Rock Slash, and Flame Slash."

"I wonder if I can find a similar wood-type martial skill from the Hidden Martial Hall and fuse it 
together. As long as the fusion of the four elements is achieved, the power of my fused martial arts 
will definitely reach the level of superior martial arts."

Thinking of this, Qing Tianqi was even more eager to go to the Cangwu Hall.

He immediately said:"Brother Tianling, let's not think too much, let's go to the Cangwu Hall now!"



Then the two of them went straight to the Cangwu Hall.

The person guarding the Cangwu Hall was a seventh-level elder.

When the elder saw Qingtian Qi, he immediately saluted respectfully.

After all, Qingtian Qi was the young clan leader, and his status was higher than him. He 
immediately , the two of them showed their pass orders and entered the Zangwu Hall…
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Zangwu Hall is divided into four floors.

The first level is inferior martial arts.

The second level is intermediate martial arts.

The third level is superior martial arts.

The fourth level is the ultimate martial arts.

After Qingtian and Qi entered the Cangwu Hall, they entered the third floor directly and began to 
eagerly search for the superior martial arts that could be learned on the third floor.

The two rows of bookshelves on the third floor contain more than a hundred superior martial arts.

Its content covers all aspects: attack, assistance, defense, etc.

But what disappoints Qingtian and Qi are that the two of them have browsed through nearly a 
hundred superior martial arts, and they all need to understand some kind of wood secret to learn, 
and none of them can be learned by fourth-level warriors.

At that moment, both of them began to feel agitated.



"Why!! Our Qing family is an ancient family that has been passed down for thousands of years! 
Isn't it possible to find a superior martial skill that a fourth-level warrior can learn?"

Qing Tian Ling irritably threw a volume of superior martial arts secrets back into the bookshelf.

But at this moment, Qing Tian Qi's surprised voice came from the other side.

"Huh! Brother Tianling, come and see! Here is an excellent martial art that fourth-level warriors can 
learn"

"What type of martial arts is it? Let me see!!"

Qing Tianling immediately ran over in surprise

"It's an offensive martial skill called Green Dragon Roar!"

Qingtian Qi excitedly handed the secret book to Qingtian Ling.

Qingtian Ling couldn't wait to look at it.

At this moment, Qingtian Qi thought of another thing in his excitement, and he thought to himself

"This green dragon's roar is very similar to the water martial art ice dragon's roar. According to the 
rules of fusion martial arts, those who are similar can be fused. These two superior martial arts 
should be able to be fused. If the fusion is really successful, its power will be amazing. It's a pity 
that I can't learn the roar of the ice dragon yet"

"By the way, since there are Green Dragon Roar and Ice Dragon Roar. I wonder if there are similar 
superior martial arts in other series? If there is, I successfully integrated all the five martial arts, and 
that would be the five dragons' roar. Its power must be unimaginable, and it can definitely exceed 
the ability of the best martial arts."

Qingtian Qi couldn't help but be horrified when he thought of this.



It is absolutely unimaginable that the power of fusion martial arts can exceed the top martial arts.

The Qing family's children are already proud of possessing the top martial arts 'Psychic Technique' 
At the same level.

And what kind of strength will it be if you have a fusion martial skill that is more powerful than the 
best martial arts?

Qingtian Qi couldn't imagine it, but he was still looking forward to it.

Just thinking about these things in Qingtian Qi's mind, he stood aside Qing Tianling's laughter came

"Ha ha!! Sure enough, it was an excellent martial skill that a fourth-level warrior could learn, and he 
finally found one. Tianqi, let's continue searching to see if there are any other superior martial arts 
skills that can be learned."

Then the two of them continued to search.

However, the two of them rummaged through the remaining best secret books, but they could not 
find the second best martial skill that could be learned.

At that moment, Qingtian sighed in unison:"They all say that you can do it at the fourth level. It is 
extremely rare to learn superior martial arts, and it seems to be true now!

Qingtian Ling also nodded and said,"Yes!" Among the more than a hundred superior martial arts, 
only the Roar of the Green Dragon can be learned. The others require understanding of the secrets!"

"Brother Tianling, it seems we can't find anything else, let's go down!"

Then the two of them went downstairs.

Qingtian Qi went to the first floor again.



Qingtian Ling was surprised.

The first floor was full of inferior martial arts, and he had long been disinterested.

However, Qingtian Ling didn't say much. , and accompanied Qingtian Qi to the first floor.

Soon, Qingtian Qi was surprised to take out a secret book, but it was an inferior offensive martial 
skill 'Life-breaking Slash'.

Seeing this, Qingtian Ling asked why.

Qingtian Qi Then he told me about the fusion of martial arts.

Qingtian Ling smiled and said:"So you also know about the fusion of martial arts. Now that you 
have found the Breaking Light Slash, Breaking Rock Slash, Breaking Flame Slash, and Breaking 
Life Slash. I happen to have a water-type"Wave Breaking" here for you. This way you can find all 
five series."..
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After Qingtian Ling mentioned this, Qingtian Qi immediately remembered that Qingtian Ling had 
used 'Wave Breaking' that day at the Fengwei River.

At that moment, Qingtian Qi happily thanked Qingtian Ling.

He also didn't expect that this time he would be lucky enough to have all five low-level martial arts 
skills.

Afterwards, Qingtian Ling gave Qingtian Qi a jade tablet recording the skill of Breaking the Waves.

After that, the two of them took the secret skills from the"Blue Dragon's Roar" and exchanged them 
for the Jade Skill Transfer Jade Tablet from the guard elder.

Happily holding the Qinglong Roaring Martial Arts Jade Tablet, Qingtian Qi and Qingtian Ling left 
the Cangwu Hall, and the two parted ways.



However, Qing Tianqi did not go back to his residence, but walked towards the Feng family's 
residence.

He was going to find the Phoenix Master.

About an hour later, when Qing Tianqi walked out of the Feng family residence, his face was filled 
with joy.

It turned out that he went to find Master Feng because he wanted to find a superior martial art that 
he could learn from the Feng family.

But he didn't want to really get a superior fire martial skill, and it was the one he wanted most.

This superior fire martial skill is the 'Fire Dragon Roar'.

After getting the roar of the fire dragon from the Feng family, Qingtian Qi was in a good mood and 
went straight back to his residence.

Along the way, Qing Tianqi began to plan his future training plan. After he fully mastered these 
martial arts, he began to retreat with all his strength to prepare for the rookie conference half a year 
later.

In this way, after Qingtian Qi returned to his residence, he began to devote himself to learning 
martial arts.

In the blink of an eye, half a month has passed.

The season has entered autumn inadvertently.

But in the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers, it feels like spring all year round, so you don’t even feel 
that time is passing by.

At this moment, deep in the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers, there is that waterfall.



From the pool below the waterfall, a shocking roar of a beast suddenly came.

Immediately, a ferocious beast wearing silver-white battle armor, several feet long, with a dragon's 
head and a lion's body, and two wings on its back, with an extremely powerful and ferocious 
appearance emerged from the water.

This mighty ferocious beast is naturally Qiuqiu wearing Ruyi armor.

As soon as the ball broke out of the water, a young boy's laughter came from above.

"Ha ha!! Qiuqiu, take another move from me - Five Elements Heavenly Slash! '"

As the sound fell, a white-haired young man holding two swords jumped down from the cliff of the 
waterfall and slashed at Qiuqiu with one sword.

When the sword was slashed, a nearly 100-meter-long path was immediately formed. The five-color 
light knife was burning with raging purple-black flames around the outside of the light knife, and 
there was still black smoke surrounding the flame. The momentum of this knife was extremely 
shocking, as if it was going to cut the entire pool in two, and even Qiuqiu widened his eyes in fear. 
Eye.

Just when the terrifying light knife was about to hit Qiuqiu, Qiuqiu suddenly swayed and split into 
two.

The light knife suddenly cut through the air and struck directly on the water pool below.

Suddenly, dozens of people were stirred up. Meter-high water waves and purple-black flames 
instantly boiled the entire pool of water, stirring up countless hot water vapors.

"What a powerful force! It's stronger than I thought!"

Qing Tianqi opened his eyes wide in surprise, and then said to himself



"Ha ha!! This Five Elements Heavenly Slash combines the five elements of inferior martial arts to 
achieve the perfection of the five elements, and its power has exceeded that of superior martial arts. 
My overall strength has greatly improved again."

Speaking of this, Qing Tianqi became even more excited.

Now, after his transformation, his combat power has exceeded that of ten thousand people.

Such attack power is extremely terrifying. This is definitely not a level that a fourth-level warrior 
can achieve.

Even if the ball body has Ruyi Battle Armor did not dare to receive this blow.

Now, Qingtian Qi's speed has already reached the level of a fifth-level warrior, and the combat 
power of the strongest blow has also reached the level of a fifth-level warrior.

And with the fusion martial arts 'Five Elements The shield' and the protection of the 'Five-Escape 
Soft Armor' make his defense extremely powerful. Even if he encounters an attack with the strength 
of ten thousand people, he can withstand it.

However, even so.

Qingtian Qi's comprehensive There is still some gap between the strength and the fifth-level 
warrior.

Because the strength of ten thousand people is only the basic combat power of the fifth-level 
warrior, it is still the lowest threshold.

Therefore, Qingtian Qi is still not the opponent of the fifth-level warrior, but the fifth-level warrior 
wants to kill him But it was not that easy, let alone killing him instantly.

But when Qingtian Qi was feeling proud, Qiuqiu and its clone not far away roared and challenged 
him..
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Qing Tianqi laughed loudly:"Haha!! Little guy, you are still not convinced, are you? Then let's fight 
again!"

At that moment, Qing Tianqi laughed, his figure flickered, and both swords came out.

A huge fire dragon was swung out with the sword in his left hand, and a ferocious green dragon was 
swung out with the sword in his right hand.

It was the superior martial arts Fire Dragon Roar and Green Dragon Roar, but Qingtian Qi used 
them at the same time.

The two giant dragons were dozens of feet long, roaring in the air, and pounced on Qiuqiu's body 
and its clone respectively.

At this moment, Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu started fighting again.

After dozens of rounds of fighting between one man and one beast, Qiuqiu began to fall behind and 
was beaten back by Qingtian Qi.

Qing Tianqi's arrogant laughter kept echoing in the air.

Suddenly, there was another muffled groan.

Qiuqiu's body was once again slashed into the pool by Qingtian Qi's sword.

Qing Tianqi immediately laughed:"Haha! Qiuqiu, are you still convinced? You are no longer my 
opponent."

"Wow!"

With a sound of water, the ball rushed out of the pool again and merged with the clone in the air.

This time, it did not continue to fight with Qingtian, but shook off the water on its body and walked 
to Qingtian with a look of reluctance. Qi Qi's side.



Qing Tian Qi knew that Qiu Qiu was afraid of being beaten by him, so he had to admit defeat.

At that moment, he felt very happy.

It was not easy to be able to suppress Qiu Qiu.

However, Qing Tian Qi also knew that he was only temporary. Squeeze Qiuqiu's head.

It won't be long before Qiuqiu's strength will definitely surpass him again.

Because Qiuqiu's strength has reached the peak of the fourth level of perfection, and is only one 
step away from the fifth level. It won't be long before Qiuqiu. He can break through.

As long as Qiuqiu breaks through to the fifth level, his strength will increase significantly. Even 
ordinary fifth-level warriors are no match for Qiuqiu, let alone himself. After thinking about this, 
Qingtian squatted down Down the fairway smiling and comforting

"Little guy, your strength will surpass mine before long, so don’t be so discouraged now!"

Hearing Qingtian Qi's words, Qiuqiu growled, and his face showed its original expression.

Seeing it like this, Qingtian Qi couldn't help but smile, and said

"Little guy, now that you and I join forces, can we deal with a fifth-level warrior? If it is possible, 
we will have great hope of entering the top ten at the Rookie Conference in more than five months. 
I'm afraid that the combined strength of you and me still can't deal with the fifth-level warrior!"

As far as Qingtian Qi knows, the rookie conference allows pets and spiritual weapons to participate 
in the battle. This rule is of great benefit to him.

Just as Qingtian Qi whispered to Qiuqiu, a gentle voice suddenly came from behind him

"Ha ha!! Tianqi, the battle just now was very exciting!"



Hearing this, Qingtian Qi quickly looked back and saw an old man with gray hair looking at him 
with a smile.

Seeing the old man, Qingtian Qi was greatly surprised and respectfully stepped forward to greet 
him.

"It turned out to be Senior Teng. Could it be that Senior Teng was always nearby?"

Teng Xiaoshan nodded and said with a smile:"Yes! If I wasn't nearby, how could I have seen such a 
wonderful battle? Tianqi, it seems that your own strength is much stronger than I imagined. You 
always bring me unexpected surprises!"

"Senior, thank you!"

Qing Tianqi smiled modestly.

"I wonder why Senior Teng is here? Are you here specifically to find the juniors?"

"You little guy is very smart. I came here this time just to find you!"

"So what exactly is the matter with the senior looking for the junior? Teng

Xiaoshan smiled slightly:"It has been more than a month since we came to the valley together. Do 
you remember that I said at the beginning that I would give you a reward." Little one, you won’t 
forget, right?"..
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Hearing this, Qing Tianqi immediately asked:"So this is what happened? Could it be that the senior 
came to Tianqi this time to give Tianqi a reward?"

"good! I have already finished handling the trivial matters during this period, so I came to see you 
today just to give you a reward. Hearing this



, Qing Tianqi was overjoyed:"Then, the junior will thank the senior here first!""

"Ha ha!! It makes you happy, then come with me now!"

"good!"

At that moment, Qingtian Qi let Qiuqiu go back first and left with Teng Xiaoshan.

Not long after, under the leadership of Teng Xiaoshan, Qingtian Qi came to Teng Xiaoshan's retreat.

This retreat was a quiet small valley.

There are children of the three tribes guarding the outside of the valley. No one can break in without 
Teng Xiaoshan's order.

Entering the small valley, Qingtian Qi saw a huge rune array in the valley at a glance.

In the center of the rune array, there was a A huge spirit bead with a diameter of nearly a hundred 
meters is suspended in mid-air, struggling desperately.

However, the huge spirit bead is tightly bound by several arm-thick iron chains, making it 
impossible to escape.

Each iron chain The chains were flashing with golden runes, and the other end of the chain was on 
the altar.

Seeing this, Qingtian Qi already knew.

The huge spiritual beads in the sky were the golden spiritual beads.

"Tianqi, I told you last time. The reward I want to give you is to forcefully extract part of the golden 
energy from this golden spirit bead and pour it into your body to help you improve your cultivation. 
As for how much you can absorb and refine, it all depends on your destiny!"



"Tianqi understands!"

At that moment, the two of them walked towards the altar.

The closer they got to the altar, the richer the golden energy around them became.

When Qingtian walked to the center of the altar, directly below the golden spirit bead, the intensity 
of the surrounding golden energy had reached fifty or sixty times that of the outside world. Times.

This is just the aura emitted by the golden spirit bead unintentionally. It can be seen from this that 
the golden energy contained in this spirit bead is extremely vast and majestic.

Thinking of this, Qingtian couldn't help but stop and look at the huge one in the sky. Lingzhu sighed

"Tsk tsk!! This golden spirit bead is truly worthy of being a golden holy bead that took more than a 
thousand years to cultivate! I don’t know what the Holy Priest wanted to do by raising such a spirit 
bead?

But at this moment, Teng Xiaoshan said:"Tianqi, you will meditate with your eyes closed in the 
center of the altar soon." I will find a way to extract the golden energy from the spirit beads and 
force it into your body"

"All you need to remember is to seize the time and refining the golden energy with all your heart. 
You can persist in refining it for as long as you can, and you don't need to worry about the rest. Do 
you understand?"

"Tianqi understands!"

"good! Then let’s get started!"

At that moment, Qingtian Qi walked to sit directly under the spirit bead and assumed a posture of 
meditating with his eyes closed.



Seeing this, Teng Xiaoshan jumped up and flew to the top of the spirit bead. Then his body swayed, 
rose up in the wind, and turned into a ten-foot-long figure. Tall, his hands began to pinch 
continuously, and he kept punching seals into the golden spirit bead.

The golden spirit bead immediately made a violent vibration, and the struggle became more intense.

Suddenly, Teng Xiaoshan shouted loudly, and slapped the golden spirit bead with a giant hand..

The golden spirit bead seemed to have spirituality. It let out a mournful cry, and then shot out a 
bowl-sized white light from it, directly hitting Qingtian Qi's head. The white light was not an attack 
method, but extremely pure and rich golden energy.

But that said Pure golden energy poured directly from the top of Qingtian Qi's head. Qingtian Qi 
was immediately shocked, as if he was enlightened.

Immediately, he felt an extremely majestic and pure golden energy pouring into his body crazily, 
rushing directly to his Dantian.

"What pure golden energy!"

Qingtian Qi was horrified, and at the same time he was even more surprised.

But before Qingtian Qi woke up from the surprise, he felt as if he was about to burst, and his whole 
body swelled up unconsciously.

But it was because it was poured into his body at that moment The golden energy was too majestic.

Just when Qing Tianqi was shocked, Teng Xiaoshan's anxious voice came from above

"Tian Qi, if you don't hurry up and refine these pure golden energy, I won't be able to hold on for 
long."

Hearing this, Qing Tianqi immediately woke up, hurriedly closed his eyes and meditated, and began 
to frantically refine the pure golden energy.



In this way, Teng Xiaoshan kept forcing out the purest golden energy from the golden beads in the 
sky. Enter Qingtian Qi's body..
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Qing Tianqi is constantly refining and absorbing below.

In this way, the two of them maintained this posture for two days and two nights without realizing 
it.

In the past two days and two nights, as Qingtian Qi crazily absorbed the gold energy, his gold 
practice improved rapidly.

Teng Xiaoshan was not surprised by this.

What surprised him was that after practicing for two consecutive days and nights, Qingtian Qi didn't 
feel sleepy at all. This made him surprised and thought to himself.

"This guy's willpower is really extraordinary! Two days and two nights have passed, and he doesn't 
feel sleepy at all. This is much better than I imagined, and I don't know how long he can last."

At this moment, Qingtian Qi is immersed in the joy of continuous improvement in the cultivation of 
Jin Yuan Qi. He is frantically absorbing and refining the pure Jin Yuan Qi. He doesn't think too 
much at all.

Because he knows that there is only this chance, and he must seize every opportunity. Time, absorb 
as much as you can. If you miss this village, it will be difficult to encounter this store again.

In this way, the third day passed, and the fourth day passed

It was the ninth day in a flash.

As time passed day by day, Teng Xiaoshan became more and more frightened. He re-evaluated 
Qing Tianqi's willpower again and again, and each time he was greatly surprised.

According to his original estimate, Qingtian Qi could last at most three days and three nights.



Because normal people can endure their thoughts and practice without eating, drinking or sleeping 
for three days and three nights, which is extremely good.

But what surprised him was that nine days passed in the blink of an eye, and Qingtian Qi hadn't 
finished practicing yet. Even he, a ninth-level warrior, felt very tired.

"How can this be? Is this kid a freak? He is just a fourth-level warrior, how could he persist for so 
long? He doesn't want to persist until the tenth day, right?"

While Teng Xiaoshan was thinking in his mind, Qingtian Qi, who had been sitting quietly below, 
finally moved slightly, and then he heard Du Qingtianqi let out a long and cheerful roar.

"Ha ha!! Senior Teng, that’s it! The junior has reached his limit!"

After hearing this, Teng Xiaoshan seemed to be relieved, and quickly stopped his hand, and the 
beam of light disappeared immediately. At this time, Teng Xiaoshan fell from the sky with a tired 
face, and hurriedly looked at the blue sky.

He saw that the blue sky was also there. His face looked tired, but there was joy in his fatigue.

Obviously, Qing Tianqi was very happy with the substantial improvement in Jin Yuanqi cultivation.

"Tsk tsk!! Tianqi, your gains this time are really not small! Your gold energy actually broke through 
from the peak of the first-level intermediate level to the peak of the second-level Great Perfection in 
one fell swoop. Even you are only one step away from the third level. It is really rare to make such 
progress in these short nine days!

Qing Tianqi said gratefully:"This is an opportunity given to this junior by senior Teng." Tian Qi 
thanked Senior Teng here!"

"Ha ha!! You don’t need to thank me. If it weren’t for your own extraordinary willpower that 
allowed you to persist for so long, you wouldn’t have made such great progress. However, you are 
indeed a freak. You can last for nine days at a stretch. This really surprises me."



"No matter what, the juniors are grateful to the seniors from the bottom of their hearts."

"Okay, Tianqi, go back and have a good rest! This time, in order to force out the vitality from the 
golden spirit bead, I also consumed too much vitality! Now I urgently need to adjust my breathing. 
Why! This time I almost exhausted myself! If I do this kind of thing two or three more times, I will 
definitely lose dozens of years of life!"

Hearing this, Qingtian Qi said:"In that case, then I will resign! Senior, please adjust your breath 
well!"

At this moment, Qing Tianqi turned to Teng Xiaoshan to say goodbye, dragging his legs that were 
weak from hunger, and walked to his residence.

Although he was a warrior and his ability to withstand hunger was much better than that of ordinary 
people, but he did not eat or drink for nine consecutive days. I can't bear it anymore

"Why! very hungry! You must have a big meal when you go back this time! However, this time the 
Jin Yuanqi cultivation level has greatly increased, which is worth the hunger."

Now, Qing Tianqi's Jin Yuan Qi has broken through to the peak of the second level of Great 
Perfection, and his strength has increased a lot.

"There are still four months of training left. By the way, I haven't had time to refine the Fire God 
Pill, so I might as well take advantage of this time to go into seclusion and refine it. I have the Pure 
Heart Charm, and I can refine it with all my strength day and night. I should be able to refine the 
Fire God Pill within these four months."

"As long as I refine the Fire God Pill, my fire qualifications will reach the pseudo-spirit 
qualifications. In the future, it will be easier to cultivate fire energy, and it will be easier to break 
through to the fifth level."

When he thought of this, Qing Tianqi became even more confident. He dragged his tired legs and 
happily walked towards his residence..
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