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Hearing this, Qingtian Qi suddenly understood the truth and asked coldly

"What do you mean, your ancestors of the Luo family started secretly killing the children of the Wu 
family before the Five Saint Kingdom was destroyed?"

"Ha ha!! Boy you are very smart! That's right! At that time, my ancestors only dared to assassinate 
secretly. It wasn't until Long Xing destroyed the Five Holy Kingdoms that our ancestors dared to 
massacre your Wu family disciples and captured many of them alive."

"do you know? You children of the Wu family are called 'blood slaves' in the eyes of our Luo 
family. We have dozens of blood slaves in the restricted area of the Wu family. We regularly extract 
the blood essence of your blood slaves to refine the true martial arts pills, and then distribute them 
to the children of the Luo family."

"In fact, our Black Turtle blood successors of the Luo family are considered weak among ordinary 
blood successor families. In the past, our Luo family was not strong among ordinary blood 
successor families, even not as strong as the Jin family of Scarlet Gold City."

"But since the children of the family took Zhenwu Dan, the overall talents of our Luo family 
children have improved. Now, after a thousand years, our Luo family has become the best among 
the big families. It is said that we still rely on the merits of your Wu family!"

Hearing this, Qingtian Qi discovered another problem.

"Since your Luo family has already arrested many children of our Wu family, and you go to collect 
blood regularly, why do you still go around arresting children of the Wu family?"

"Ha ha!! Although we have kept many blood slaves in captivity, people are always subject to birth, 
old age, illness and death. There are always many blood slaves who die of old age or die from too 
much blood drawn, so the blood source must be constantly replenished."



"In fact, we have also thought about finding some men for your Wu family women to breed 
offspring, so that you don't have to go around looking for Wu family children to replenish the blood 
supply. It’s just that the women of your Wu family are too uncooperative. Anyone who gets their 
hands on it from our Luo family commits suicide, so we have no choice but to give up this 
approach."

Hearing this, Qingtian Qi was extremely angry. What did the Luo family think of the children of the 
Wu family?

As captive animals?

Not only did they kill many children of the Wu family, but they even didn't spare the women of the 
Wu family.

All this made Qingtian Qi couldn't stop being angry. When he saw Hai Qi's proud face, he wanted to 
kill him immediately to avenge the children of the Wu family.

It seemed that seeing Qing Tian Qi's anger reaching the extreme, Hai Qi became even more proud.

"Let me tell you another secret. This time, the purpose of our search for the disciples of the Wu 
family is not to replenish the blood source. Qingtian

Qi suppressed the anger in his heart and asked in a deep voice.

"What is it for this time?"

"For my ancestor’s breakthrough. My ancestor has been taking Zhenwu Dan for more than a 
thousand years. The Black Turtle True Blood in his body has evolved several times due to the 
improvement of Zhenwu Dan. Now it is more and more similar to the Xuanwu True Blood."

"The Black Turtle was originally a descendant of Xuanwu. It is natural for the Black Turtle True 
Blood to evolve into Xuanwu True Blood."

"Now my ancestor's cultivation has long reached the eighth level of Great Perfection, and the 
quality of the Black Turtle True Blood in his body has been improved to 90% similar to the Black 
Tortoise True Blood."



"His old man once studied that when the true blood in his body is 90% similar to the Xuanwu true 
blood, he can use the Wu family's inherited artifact to awaken the true blood in his body, which can 
once again greatly improve his cultivation. and qualifications, there is an 80% chance that it can 
help him break through the current bottleneck in one fell swoop and advance to a ninth-level 
warrior."

"Just to activate the inherited artifact of your Wu family, you must use the soul consciousness of the 
children of the Wu family as a guide."

"Because you, the children of the Wu family, have the mark of the sacred beast Xuanwu in their 
souls, but our Luo family does not. No matter how much the true blood of our children of the Luo 
family is improved, we, the children of the Luo family, will not have the mark of the Xuanwu in our 
souls, so we can only Kill those captive Wu family disciples and extract their souls."

"According to my ancestor's budget, we need to extract the soul consciousness of thirty-six martial 
arts disciples. As for the blood slaves kept in captivity by my Wu family, plus the children of the 
Wu family captured in the past ten years, there are only thirty-five, one less. However, if you are 
included, it will be enough. My ancestor can use the martial arts heritage artifact to activate the true 
blood."

"Ha ha!! Do you think it was a great achievement for me to capture you alive and give it to the 
ancestor? My ancestor will be very happy, and he will definitely reward me with many true martial 
arts pills. Boy, now you understand it!!"

"I told you everything in order to make you a wise man after your death."

"However, there is a price to pay for hearing these truths. The price is that when I catch you later, I 
will not only cut off your limbs, but also cut off your tongue to prevent you from talking nonsense 
on the road. Do you think my method is good?"..
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"Yeah?"

Qing Tianqi sneered



"It turns out that this is the truth! It turns out that your Luo family killed the children of our Wu 
family because of your own ambitions."

"You use the blood of our descendants from the Wu family to feed your family. Use your dirty and 
despicable blood to pollute the blood of our children of the Wu family. I will cleanse all these blood 
debts with the blood of your descendants from the Luo family."

"Ha ha!! How dare you say such a thing! Do not overestimate your own capabilities."

Hai Qi's eyes showed extreme disdain.

"Little beast, let me tell you, in my eyes you are just a blood slave on the same level as a beast, you 
are not even qualified to be a human! You Wu family are destined to be stepped on by our Luo 
family forever!"

"After my ancestor becomes a ninth-level warrior, he will go to Baixi Country to find out where the 
rest of you are, capture all of you, keep them all in captivity, and make your Wu family become the 
humble blood slaves of our Luo family forever!"

"Ha ha!!"

Qing Tianqi was so angry that he laughed crazily.

"Ridiculous! Ridiculous! Your Luo family only has the humble XuanXue Ji, you have despicable 
blood flowing in your body, and you dare to call our Wu family despicable. You are really an evil 
slave bullying your master!"

"Shut up! Do you still want to be the master of our Luo family? Do you still think you are a 
descendant of the Wu family from a thousand years ago? snort! Little blood slave, I think you 
should stop talking nonsense and cut off your own hands and legs! Do you really want me to do it 
myself?"

"snort!"

Qing Tianqi sneered



"By the way, what's your name?"

"It doesn't hurt to tell you that my pseudonym when I am outside is Hai Qi, and my real name is 
Luo Bei Qi. Do you remember it? Remember to cut off your tongue so I don’t have to do it?"

"Ha ha!! Arrogant guy, let me tell you a secret too!"

Luo Beiqi was stunned when he heard this.

"What secret? you say!"

"In fact, the secret is that Hai Long didn't tell me everything. I lied to you about everything just 
now. Instead, you revealed all the secrets of your Luo family."

Hearing this, Luo Beiqi's expression changed and he became furious.

"Little beast, how dare you lie to me! You're looking for fucking death! However, even if you knew 
it! I'll cut off your tongue right now!"

After saying that, Luo Beiqi was about to take action.

But he didn't expect that Qing Tianqi was faster than him. He wanted to step back and shouted to 
Qiuqiu at the same time.

"Ball, get ready to fight!"

Qiuqiu understood, jumped down from Qingtian Qi's shoulder, and transformed into a fighting 
form.

Then he opened his mouth and sprayed out the Ruyi armor, put it on his body, and in a blink of an 
eye, he turned into a armored beast, extremely powerful.

His wings suddenly flapped. Vibration, a terrifying momentum spreads out



"Huh! This is…."

Feeling the astonishing aura emanating from Qiuqiu, Luo Beiqi opened his eyes wide in horror. 
Only then did he realize that Qiuqiu was no ordinary ferocious beast, its strength was astonishing.

Just when Luo Beiqi was extremely surprised, Qing Tianqi on the other side also yelled

"Crazy god transforms!"

In just an instant, Qingtian Qi transformed into a battle-mad form with white hair flying, and began 
to emit an aura that was more powerful than the ball. And this fierce aura was also mixed with a 
heart-stopping evil spirit. This suddenly made people feel sad.

Luo Beiqi felt extremely horrified again. It was not until this moment that he realized that he had 
underestimated the young man in front of him.

The strength of the young man in front of him was far more perverted than he imagined.

At that moment, Luo Beiqi retracted his previous contempt. , said in a deep voice

"Good boy, I didn’t expect you to be so strong! However, do you want to escape from us based on 
this? What you think is too simple!

Qingtian laughed together:"Haha!"! Luo Beiqi, you are too arrogant. Did I say you wanted to run 
away? Let's have a battle today! go to hell!"

With a sharp shout, Qingtian Qi waved his hands, pulled out the two swords of ice and fire from the 
God of War Order space, and went towards Luobei Qi.

Qiuqiu also went towards Luobei Qi at the same time..
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Seeing this, Luo Beiqi chuckled.



"Don’t underestimate yourself!"

Immediately he also rushed forward.

In the blink of an eye, Qingtian Qi's attack arrived.

He jumped up, shouted, and thrust out both swords.

The swords immediately ignited blazing fire, but they were accompanied by 'The Earth's Heart' 
Yan', slashed towards Luobei Qi's head. As soon as Luobei Qi saw the purple-black 'Earth's Core 
Flame', he immediately said 'Eh'

"Huh! This is a middle-grade spiritual fire!"

At this moment, Luo Beiqi's face changed slightly, and he was horrified in his heart. He did not 
expect that the young man in front of him could comprehend the middle-grade spiritual fire with his 
fourth-level cultivation. And as a fifth-level warrior, his natal water spiritual energy was only Low-
grade spiritual energy.

Thinking of this, Luo Beiqi felt inexplicable jealousy in his heart, and immediately faced it with a 
sword. With this sword swing, the temperature of the surrounding air dropped sharply, as if it had 
entered cold winter in an instant.

And above the sword blade, there was even more It was accompanied by a layer of ice crystals and 
a white mist.

It turned out that Luo Beiqi also carried his own spiritual energy with this sword.

At this moment, he just wanted to chop the hands of the young man in front of him with one sword., 
let this ungrateful guy know how powerful he is, and that the majesty of a fifth-level warrior cannot 
be offended, so he didn't hold back at all.

"Ha ha!! You little bastard, go to hell!"



In a blink of an eye, the two of them were about to collide with each other for the first time.

Luo Beiqi's eyes were extremely excited, and he secretly thought that Qingtian Qi was 
overestimating his own capabilities, and was simply seeking death!

He thought he was about to see it The tragic ending of Qingtian Qi's sword being destroyed and 
useless.

Boom!

A loud bang!

The two attacks collided, resulting in a huge explosion. Countless gravel flew everywhere. The 
scene was extremely shocking!

Qingtian Qi then groaned and was beaten by Luo Bei Qi flew away with his sword, tumbling 
backwards, and finally fell to the ground. He took a few steps back before regaining his balance.

"What a powerful force! A fifth-level warrior is truly extraordinary!"

Qing Tianqi marveled in his heart, holding the sword tightly with both hands, shaking constantly.

The hard blow just now made his hands so sore that he could hardly lift them, as if the bones of his 
arms were broken.

In fact, he knew in his heart that if It's not because he is a physical warrior. His body bones are 
stronger than those of fifth-level warriors. His hand bones should have been broken by that blow 
just now.

After all, his basic attack power is only the power of 6,000 people. Even if he has spirit, With the 
addition of weapons and earth core flames, its attack power reaches the power of eight thousand 
people.

But the basic combat power of a fifth-level warrior is at least the power of ten thousand people.



And the Luobei Qi in front of him has a basic attack power that obviously exceeds ten thousand 
people. The power of people reached the strength of eleven thousand people.

Therefore, even if Qingtian Qi used both swords, he could not stop his sword. Compared to 
Qingtian Qi, Luo Beiqi was even more shocked.

"How can this be? How could you not be injured!"

Luo Beiqi looked at Qingtian Qi in front of him with a look of disbelief.

But just when he was still uneasy, Qiuqiu also attacked.

"Evil beast! court death!"

Luo Beiqi snorted coldly, hurriedly avoided it, and struck Qiuqiu in the middle with a sword.

The sword he used against Qingtian Qi before did not achieve the effect he wanted, which made 
him both shocked and angry. Seeing Qiuqiu at this moment Qiuqiu attacked, and he vented all his 
anger on Qiuqiu, so he used a lot of skill with this sword. He just wanted to cut Qiuqiu into two 
pieces to relieve his anger. At that moment, the sword was extremely fast. , slashed down with a 
sharp cold air.

Its speed was so fast that Qiuqiu could not avoid it.

With a roar of pain, Qiuqiu was chopped away with a sword.

At the same time, Qiuqiu also shot a blast of destruction towards Luobei Qi. Light.

Seeing the divine light of destruction coming towards him, Luo Beiqi felt a sense of crisis in his 
heart and quickly blocked it with his sword.

"Click!"

There was a crisp sound.



The divine light of destruction actually broke the long sword in Luo Beiqi's hand. Luo Beiqi was 
even hit by the huge impact and took half a step back.

"What a powerful attack! Oh my God! What kind of beast is this? He has such attack power at less 
than level five!"

Luo Beiqi was shocked again and looked at Qiuqiu with horrified eyes..
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Immediately, Luo Beiqi saw the Ruyi armor on Qiuqiu, and once again showed surprise.

"It turned out to be a top-quality battle armor. No wonder that sword failed to cut you in two. snort! 
I'll kill you beast in a moment, and your top-notch battle armor will be mine!"

"Roar!"

Hearing this, Qiuqiu roared angrily, and his whole body once again exuded a strong aura. Although 
the sword just now did not hurt it, it still suffered a lot of pain, which had reached the limit of his 
defense.

"Ha ha!! Luo Beiqi, don't talk so loudly. I originally thought that fifth-level warriors were so 
powerful, but now it seems like they are nothing more than that!"

Qing Tianqi's hands have recovered. After the test just now, his confidence has greatly increased.

Hearing Qing Tianqi's words, Luo Beiqi's face changed slightly.

"hehe!! Boy, you really surprised Luo. Not only are you so powerful, but even your pets are not 
simple."

"I admit that you and your pets can indeed fight me together, but these alone are not enough. 
Besides, you are doing this with the help of spiritual weapons. Do you really think that I don’t have 
a spiritual weapon?"



After saying this, Luo Beiqi threw away the broken sword in his hand and pulled out a sharp sword 
emitting white light from his spare sword. It turned out to be a spiritual weapon.

This move did not surprise Qingtian Qi. Five It is not unusual for a martial artist to possess a 
spiritual weapon.

Qingtian Qi fought with Luo Bei Qi today just to take this opportunity to hone himself. With the 
spiritual sword in hand, Luo Bei Qi's confidence suddenly increased.

"With the help of this draining sword, it will be much easier to deal with you, what a pity! A genius 
like you will be destroyed in my hands today! Ha ha!!"

"Yeah?"

Qing Tianqi sneered and stopped talking nonsense with him.

There was a flash of blood on his body, and he activated the Blood Shadow Escape Technique and 
Phantom Fire Shadowless Step at the same time. His speed suddenly increased, and with a flash of 
his figure, he went towards Luobei Qi again.

"What a speed! How can this be?"

The Seven Great Horrors of Luobei, he didn't expect Qingtian Qi to be so fast, surpassing the level 
of a fifth-level warrior, and already infinitely close to the level of a peak fifth-level warrior.

"Ha ha!! go to hell!"

Qingtian Qi used his speed to instantly approach the defensive corner behind Luo Beiqi. At the 
same time, he struck down the head with the 'Five Elements Sky Slash'.

Luo Beiqi felt the threat to his life, his face changed slightly, and he immediately roared.

"Xuan Jingshi!"



Immediately, a giant ice crystal shield several feet in size blocked in front of him.

There were countless sharp ice spikes on the front of the giant ice crystal shield!

"boom!"

There was a loud noise!

The ground shook, and gravel flew everywhere.

The Xuan Jing immediately completely blocked the attack of Five Elements Sky Slash, and there 
was not even the slightest crack on it.

Seeing this, Qing Tianqi was slightly frightened, secretly saying that he had such a strong defense , 
and at the same time, he used his speed to prepare to attack again.

Unexpectedly, Luo Beiqi suddenly laughed ferociously, pinched his handprints, and the black 
crystal shield exploded. Dozens of huge ice spikes on the shield surface, with the help of the power 
of the explosion, shot towards the blue sky. Qingtian Qi's face was stern, and he swung both swords 
to avoid the flying ice spikes.

Luo Beiqi took the opportunity to attack.

But at this moment, Qiuqiu had already circled behind him and opened his mouth. Spouting out his 
own spiritual sword, it instantly turned into thirteen huge lightsabers and shot towards his back in 
succession.

Hearing the sound of 'Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh!' behind him, Luo Beiqi had no choice but to 
Turn around to resist Qiuqiu's attack.

In this delay, Qingtian Qi has swept away those ice spike attacks and once again used his speed to 
attack Luobei Qi.

At the moment, Qingtian Qi is the main force, Qiuqiu is holding back from the side, and one person 
and one beast join forces. , and a battle broke out with Luobei Qi.



For a while, the two sides fought in darkness, and it was difficult to tell the winner.

In the entire valley, energy exploded continuously, gravel flew everywhere, and countless huge pits 
were left on the ground..
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The entire valley was destroyed beyond recognition in just a moment, and it was no longer what it 
was before.

The destructive power of a fifth-level warrior is astonishing...

Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu have joined forces, and their strength has fully reached the fifth level.

The battle between the two sides was truly amazing.

But it was said that the two sides fought hard and evenly. Qing Tianqi became more and more 
happy as he fought, secretly saying that he had underestimated his and Qiuqiu's strength before.

You must know that Luo Beiqi is not a fifth-level warrior who has just been promoted. He is a 
veteran fifth-level warrior.

Since Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu can team up to tie with Luobei Qi, judging from their strength, they 
have every chance of entering the top ten rookies.

It's a pity that Qing Tianqi can't bring the ball into the battle, which greatly reduces his overall 
strength.

However, if Qingtian Qi can rely on his own strength to win the No. 10 ranking among rookies, it 
will prove that Qing Tian Qi's true overall strength is stronger than the No. 1 ranking among 
rookies.

In fact, Luo Beiqi was getting more and more frightened at this moment. He really couldn't believe 
that Qingtian Qi could actually tie with him.



Although Qingtian Qi is a five-series warrior, only two of Qingtian Qi's five series have reached the 
fourth level, and the other series have not reached the fourth level.

Logically speaking, such strength could never be as strong as what he saw now. How could this not 
shock him.

At this moment, Luo Beiqi's heart sank, and he seemed to realize that he had made a huge mistake.

At this moment, Qingtian Qi stabbed Luo Beiqi behind with his sword again, and laughed at the 
same time.

"Luo Beiqi, now you see your arrogance! You should know by now that I just want to fight with 
you. If I want to leave, can you keep me?"

Luo Beiqi didn't answer and hurriedly blocked Qingtian Qi's sneak attack.

At this time, Qingtian Qi said again

"such a pity! Luo Beiqi, because of your arrogance, you told me all the secrets hidden by your 
family. If your family knew about this, you would die without a burial place without me taking 
action!!"

Hearing this, Luo Beiqi's face changed drastically, and he felt extremely regretful. Then he roared 
with a ferocious expression.

"Little bastard, do you really think you can take this secret away? Today, even if I risk my life, I 
will keep your life alive!"

"Ha ha!! If I want to leave, can you keep me?"

Qingtian Qi's figure flickered, leaving several afterimages in the field.

Luo Beiqi snorted angrily.



"Arrogant! How dare you threaten me! Then I will give up capturing you alive and just kill you!"

As soon as these words were said, Luo Beiqi made a seal in his hand, and pressed it in the air with 
his palm.

"Great ice sealing technique!!"

With the pressing of Luo Beiqi's palm, a force of extreme cold suddenly fell from the sky and the 
earth, freezing the entire valley instantly.

Every corner of the valley made a"click-click" sound of freezing.

In just an instant, the entire valley was frozen. The valley turned into an ice valley, as if even the air 
was frozen.

Even Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu were unable to escape. They were all frozen into thick ice sculptures, 
standing still and unable to move.

Time seemed to have stopped for a moment. , everything became very quiet.

Looking at Qingtian Qi who was frozen into an ice sculpture, Luobei Qida felt proud and laughed 
suddenly

"Ha ha!! Little bastard, my great ice sealing technique is a pseudo-top-notch martial art, it can 
instantly freeze everything around you. No matter how fast your kid is, so what? I've told you a 
long time ago that you can't take the secret away, so go die!! Bingyuehua slash!"

I saw Luo Bei Qi's sword swung, and the white sword energy turned into a moon-shaped ice blade 
several feet long, shooting towards Qingtian Qi's ice sculpture, actually trying to split Qingtian Qi 
in half.

With that Wherever the giant ice blade went, it brought a violent energy storm, stirring up the ice on 
the ground, carrying countless broken ice, roaring, and shooting towards the blue sky frozen into ice 
sculptures.



At this critical moment, that The ice sculpture suddenly exploded, revealing Qingtian Qi, whose 
face was turned blue by the cold.

As soon as Qingtian Qi saw the moon-shaped ice blade shooting towards him, his expression 
changed drastically. His body at this moment was invaded by the extremely cold air, and he had 
long since His body was stiff from the cold, and his heart suddenly became anxious.

But he had no time to escape. In a hurry, he only had time to activate the 'Five Elements Shield'.

Boom!

There was a loud noise.

‘The Five Elements Shield was directly chopped into pieces by the moon-shaped ice blade, and 
finally struck Qingtian Qi's chest, exploding with a bang. Qingtian Qi groaned, was blown away 
more than ten meters, and fell to the ground motionless..
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Seeing this, Luobei was very happy.

"Ha ha!! Little beast, you are finally dead this time! My Ice Moon Flower Slash is an excellent 
martial skill, and with the help of spiritual weapons, even a fifth-level warrior cannot bear it. What 
about you? snort! Little bastard, if you weren't too fast, I wouldn't be able to attack you head-on, 
and I would have killed you long ago! However, it is not too late for you to die now!"

Just when Luo Beiqi was very proud, Qingtian Qi's body moved.

Luo Beiqi suddenly felt as if he had seen a ghost, and his eyes widened in surprise.

"How can this be? Is this kid not dead? He survived my Ice Moon Flower Slash move?"

As if responding to Luo Beiqi.



At this time, Qingtian Qi stood up unsteadily on the ice in front. The clothes on his chest had been 
blown to pieces, revealing the five-escape soft armor underneath, and there was blood hanging from 
the corners of his mouth.

After Qingtian Qi stood up, he looked at Luo Beiqi and smiled sadly, then coughed violently and 
spit out two large mouthfuls of blood. The blow just now broke several ribs in Qingtian Qi's chest.

Thinking of the blow just now. , Qing Tianqi felt his scalp numb.

If it weren't for the fact that his Five Elements Shield was a fusion martial skill equivalent to a 
pseudo-top-level martial skill, its defensive power was extremely strong, helping him eliminate 
most of the attack power.

In the end, it was the armor he wore next to him. The Five-Escape Soft Armor saved his life.

If not for the help of the Five Elements Shield and the Five-Escape Soft Armor, Qingtian Qi would 
have been split in half.

However, even so, Qingtian Qi still suffered serious injuries.

"It seems that I still underestimated this Luo Beiqi. I didn't expect that he could fake the best martial 
arts. There are very few fifth-level warriors who know one of the best martial arts, and there are 
also very few who can fake the best martial arts! It seems that his strength is not weak among fifth-
level warriors."

There are few fifth-level warriors who know the best martial arts, mainly because it is too difficult 
to master the best martial arts.

There are fewer fake top-level martial arts, because the number of fake top-level martial arts is 
smaller, and they are even rarer than the best martial arts."

"Now I'm seriously injured and can't fight with him anymore. Besides, I also figured out the 
strength of Qiuqiu and I after joining forces. It’s time to lure him to Ten Thousand Flowers Valley."



Thinking of this, Qingtian Qi's mind moved, and the natal spiritual fire in his body began to 
circulate. Purple-black 'earth core flames' suddenly rose up all over his body, sweeping away the 
extremely cold air that invaded his body.

Qingtian Qi's body suddenly He recovered again, and his blood boiled again.

Seeing this, Luo Beiqi's face changed slightly

"Unexpected! Not only are you not dead, you still have the strength to fight! As the saying goes, 
take advantage of your injury and kill you! You must die here today! go to hell!"

Luo Beiqi suddenly showed his ferocious expression and charged at Qingtian Qi again.

Qingtian Qi's expression changed slightly, and there was a flash of blood on his body. He endured 
the severe pain in his chest and dodged Luo Beiqi's attack.

But at this moment, the ball's The ice sculpture also burst into pieces, revealing Qiuqiu, who was 
wearing armor.

Obviously, Qiuqiu had just escaped.

On the other side, Qingtian Qi once again avoided Luo Bei Qi's attack.

His chest injury slowed him down greatly, but he was still faster than Luo Bei. Qi Qi was faster.

Seeing Qiu Qiu get out of trouble, Qing Tian Qi made a move and used the roar of the fire dragon to 
distract Luo Bei Qi. Then he used his speed to get behind Luo Bei Qi and rushed to Qiu Qiu.

"Ball ball! Let's go quickly! Come up!"

Qiuqiu immediately understood, instantly changed back to his original appearance, and jumped onto 
Qingtian Qi's shoulders.

At that moment, Qingtian Qi endured the pain and fled with Qiuqiu.



Seeing Qingtian Qi trying to escape, Luobei Qi became anxious and his expression changed. 
shouted ferociously

"Little beast, don't even think about escaping!"

Qingtian Qi knows the secrets of their Luo family. If Qingtian Qi escapes, the consequences will be 
disastrous.

He must kill Qingtian Qi!

Only in this way can he keep the secrets of the Luo family and let himself live.

At the moment, Luo Beiqi was about to chase him. He believed that Qing Tianqi was seriously 
injured and couldn't run very far. As long as he kept chasing him, he would be able to kill him.

However, just after Luo Beiqi chased him out of the valley, he suddenly thought of something. He 
immediately turned back to the valley and came to the place where Qing Tianqi was vomiting 
blood. He pressed seals against the large blood stain and then shot out a white light..
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The white light blended into the blood stains, and the blood stains automatically floated into the air 
and gathered into a ball of blood essence.

Seeing the mass of essence and blood, Luo Beiqi's face flashed with joy.........

Immediately, he took out a stick-shaped metal object about a foot long from his body.

There are actually two walnut-sized red skulls on both ends of the metal object. I saw Luobei 
pinching two seals at seven points and driving them into two red skulls.

The stick-shaped metal object automatically grew and deformed, turning into a long bow in the 
blink of an eye.



It turns out that the stick-shaped metal object is a top-quality spiritual weapon called the Mingye 
Bow, which is the trump card of Luobei Seven.

It's just that this Mingye Bow is only suitable for distant attacks and not suitable for close combat. 
Therefore, Luo Beiqi has never used it in previous battles.

At this time, when he saw Qingtian Qi running away, he knew that he could not keep up with 
Qingtian Qi and would probably lose him, so he remembered to use the Mingye Bow.

But it was said that Luo Beiqi opened the Mingye Bow, took the ball of essence and blood 
suspended in the air into his hand, divided it into two small groups, and shot them into the red skulls 
at both ends of the Mingye Bow.

The two red skulls let out a cheerful chirp one after another, and the entire bow began to buzz.

Seeing this, Luo Bei Qi was overjoyed. He quickly injected his spiritual energy into the bow, 
opened the string with his right hand and pulled the bow, and a line of red energy formed between 
Luo Bei Qi's fingers.

The smell of the red energy arrow was extremely terrifying, and it also contained the smell of 
blood.

The smell of blood was caused by Qing Tianqi's blood essence being integrated into the energy 
arrow.

In fact, by the time Luo Beiqi finished all this, it had already taken a lot of time, and Qingtian Qi 
had already escaped two or three miles away.

However, Luo Beiqi didn't care. He fully drew his long bow and said to the void.

"Using your essence and blood as a guide, as long as you are within ten miles, you will not be able 
to escape no matter how you try. This arrow is equivalent to the full blow of a fifth-level Dzogchen 
warrior. You will die! Hahaha!"

At that moment, Luo Beiqi laughed, and as soon as he loosened his fingers, the red energy arrow 
whizzed out.



The red energy arrow seemed to have spirituality. As soon as it flew out, it automatically changed 
its direction and chased Qi Qi into the sky. The speed was extremely fast, like a red lightning 
flashing through the air.

In just a moment, a shrill scream came from outside the valley.

That shrill scream came from the blue sky.

When I heard the clear sky , The screams made Luobei Qida happy

"Little bastard! I knew you couldn't run away. Without the means to deal with you, how could I 
easily say those things that I shouldn't say? Ha ha!"

Luo Beiqi laughed proudly and chased in the direction of Qingtian Qi's screams.

But on a trail in the jungle outside the valley.

Qingtian Qi fell in a pool of blood, Qiuqiu transformed into a fighting form, and used his head 
anxiously The ground rubs against the blue sky, and a mournful cry of"Woo! Woo!" comes from the 
mouth.

"Ball ball! I'm not dead yet!"

Qingtian Qi's lips turned white, he gritted his teeth, covered his chest, struggled to get up, and lay 
on Qiuqiu.

A hole was shot through his chest, which was the size of a walnut, and blood was gurgling from the 
hole. Go.

In addition, the Wudun soft armor worn by Qing Tianqi was also shot through, and even the 
spiritual weapon Ice Sword in his hand was broken into two pieces.

It was a weapon that had been with him for a long time.



It turned out that previously, When the red energy sword came, Qingtian Qi also noticed it and 
wanted to dodge.

But he didn't expect that the energy arrow seemed to be spiritual. No matter how he dodge, he 
couldn't avoid it.

In desperation, he had to cross the sword in front of him. , activated the Five Elements Shield, and 
blocked the arrow.

But the power of that arrow was too terrifying, not only breaking his Five Elements Shield, but also 
his Ice Sword was broken by one blow, and the Five Escape Soft Armor on his body was also 
broken. was penetrated.

Not only that, Qingtian Qi was penetrated by the arrow, and the icy power of the energy arrow also 
invaded his internal organs in an instant, seeming to freeze all the internal organs to pieces, causing 
wanton destruction. Fortunately

, Yes, he is a physical warrior, and his internal organs have been strengthened. Under the attack of 
the powerful ice force, his internal organs were not frozen to death, but his internal organs were still 
injured, causing him to lose the ability to move for a while..

Chapter 2638

But when Qiuqiu saw that Qingtian Qi was still alive, he was overjoyed and licked his face with his 
tongue.

Qing Tianqi, however, was extremely anxious. He climbed onto Qiuqiu's back with great difficulty 
and urged anxiously:

"Ball ball!! quick!! You quickly carry me and fly to the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers. I can't 
move anymore."

Qiuqiu immediately roared, and when Qingtian lay on his back and hugged him tightly, he quickly 
flew into the air.



As soon as Qiuqiu flew into the air, Luo Beiqi chased him out of the valley with the Mingye Bow in 
his hand. Just in time to see the ball in the distance, carrying the blue sky on its back, escaping into 
the air

"Could it be that that arrow still failed to kill that boy! ? How is this possible?"

Luo Beiqi was surprised, and then he raised his bow and pulled the string again, and an energy 
arrow was formed between his fingers.

This second energy arrow was still red all over, exuding an extremely terrifying aura.

"snort! I don’t believe this second arrow can’t kill you! Luo

Beiqi smiled coldly and loosened his fingers. The energy arrow immediately turned into a red 
lightning and flew towards Qingtian Qi in the air.

Hearing the sharp sound of breaking through the air suddenly behind him, Qingtian Qi quickly 
turned around and saw When a red light came, his face immediately changed with fear.

He recognized at a glance that the red light was the energy arrow that injured him before. It was an 
arrow that could not be avoided.

In fact, even if he could avoid it, Qingtian Qi could not There was no ability to dodge.

The previous arrow had already penetrated Qingtian Qi's body. Even his internal organs were 
frostbitten by the cold force, and his whole body almost lost the ability to move.

Of course, Qingtian Qi also knew in his heart that if he was attacked again If this arrow hits, you 
will definitely die.

At that moment, Qing Tianqi shouted anxiously

"Ball ball, fly left!"



Qiuqiu couldn't see the situation behind it, but it had great trust in Qingtian Qi and immediately 
flew to the left.

But the energy arrow seemed to have spirituality and changed its direction, still chasing Qingtian 
Qi.

Moreover, its speed Extremely fast, he was close to Qingtian Qi's face in just an instant

"It’s over!"

Qingtian Qi was horrified in his heart. He knew that it would be useless to stop him.

The attack power of the energy arrow was too strong. Even if he tried desperately to block it, it 
could still break through his defense and shoot through his head.

At this moment, Qingtian Qi felt in his heart Desperation began to set in.

He had never been so desperate.

"Am I going to die like this?"

At the same time, a proud smile appeared on Luo Beiqi's face below. He knew that Qingtian Qi was 
about to die under the arrow. The

'blood arrow' shot by his Mingye bow would shoot out with just one arrow without seeing the light 
of blood.!

That was the best weapon for sneak attack and assassination. He didn’t believe that Qingtian Qi 
could escape.

But just when Luo Beiqi thought that Qingtian Qi was about to die under the arrow, a sudden 
change occurred in the air.



In the air, Qingtian Qi was in despair. , suddenly an idea struck him. He did not choose to dodge 
sideways, nor did he activate the Five Elements Shield to block it. Instead, he suddenly stretched 
out his right hand and grabbed the tip of the incoming arrow.

‘There was a soft sound and blood flew everywhere.

The energy arrow shot through a big hole in Qing Tianqi's palm. As a result, the energy arrow was 
deflected by Qing Tianqi and flew out close to his hair, but never came back.

"so close! Unexpectedly, I made the right bet!"

Qing Tianqi broke out in a cold sweat. He didn't expect that he actually defused the arrow.

However, a big hole was shot through his palm, and even the bones in the palm were broken into 
pieces, and the entire arm was frozen. The force invaded and formed a layer of ice slag.

His right hand was considered useless and had lost its fighting ability.

However, Qingtian Qi felt a little lucky to have exchanged one hand for his own life!

At least he still had Alive.

Luo Beiqi below was also shocked.

"This damn little bastard, I didn’t expect him to break this arrow in such a way! snort! So what if 
you defuse that arrow! I want to see how many arrows you take today?"

At that moment, Luo Beiqi opened his bow and pulled the string again, and another energy arrow 
was formed at his fingertips.

However, the energy arrow formed this time was pure white, but not the previous blood red.

Seeing this, Luo Beiqi frowned. Wrinkle, secretly



"Unexpectedly, that kid's blood and essence can only form two blood arrows. This is going to be 
difficult!"..

Chapter 2639

It turns out that the blood-guided arrow previously shot by Luo Beiqi needs to be integrated into 
Qingtian Qi's essence and blood, and uses its blood as a guide, so that it will automatically track 
Qingtian Qi, making Qingtian Qi unable to avoid it, and must see blood.

Qing Tianqi seemed to have guessed that, so he sacrificed one of his hands to defuse the second 
blood arrow.

By the time Luo Beiqi condensed the third arrow, the blood essence he had previously absorbed had 
been used up and he could not form the 'blood arrow' again.

So the third arrow is just an ordinary energy arrow and has no guiding function.

But its power is as powerful as the blood arrow, which is equivalent to the full blow of a fifth-level 
Dzogchen warrior. It is simply not something that Qiuqiu and Qingtian can resist.

Without the automatic guidance function, Luo Beiqi had to aim by himself.

But at this time, Qing Tianqi was lying on Qiuqiu's back, and his whole body was almost blocked 
by Qiuqiu. He couldn't find the angle to aim at, so he had to change the target and shoot at Qiuqiu.

At that moment, Luo Beiqi snorted coldly, loosened his fingers, and the third energy arrow turned 
into a white light and shot towards the ball.

"No, here we go again!"

Seeing the third energy arrow coming, Qing Tianqi's expression changed drastically again.

However, he quickly discovered something was wrong. First, the energy arrow was white, and 
second, the target of the energy arrow was not him but Qiuqiu.



Before Qingtian Qi could figure out what was going on, the third energy arrow had been shot over 
quickly, only ten meters away from the ball.

Qingtian Qi was horrified and hurriedly screamed:

"Ball ball, fly to the right!!"

The ball immediately flew to the right. This time it only deviated a few feet to the right. The third 
energy arrow passed by and almost penetrated the ball.

Seeing this, Qing Tianqi felt happy and overjoyed at the same time. At this moment, he understood 
that Luo Beiqi could no longer shoot the automatically tracking red energy arrow, otherwise he 
would continue to attack himself instead of Qiuqiu.

And judging from the third arrow, there was indeed no automatic tracking. function.

However, the aura of the third arrow is still extremely terrifying. It is definitely not something that 
Qiuqiu can resist. You still have to be extremely careful.

If Qiuqiu is really hit, both Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu will be finished.

After thinking about the situation in front of him, , Qingtian Qi became energetic. He saw the hope 
of his escape and immediately shouted

"Ball, fly quickly!! Keep flying high into the sky, the higher you fly, the better!"

Luobei Qi below saw that one arrow missed, and he immediately became angry and raised his hand 
to shoot more than a dozen arrows.

However, whenever an energy arrow approached him, Qingtian Qi would give a warning to let 
Qiuqiu avoid it in advance..At this time, Qingtian Qi was equivalent to the eyes behind Qiuqiu.

One person and one beast cooperated very well, causing Luo Bei Qi's dozens of arrows to miss.



This immediately made Luo Bei Qi below furious.

"This nasty little bastard!"

When Luo Beiqi raised his bow and drew the arrow again, the ball had already flown to an altitude 
of more than 10,000 meters with the blue sky. From the ground, it was just a small black dot, which 
was beyond the range of the Mingye Bow. It was the limit.

This immediately made Luo Beiqi extremely depressed.

In fact, even if the ball was still within his shooting range, he might not be able to shoot it. After all, 
it was too far away and he did not have such a high accuracy.

"Little bastard, do you think you can escape my pursuit like this? Your pet is just a fourth-level 
ferocious beast. It can’t escape my tracking at its flying speed."

"I just kept chasing you to see how long you could hold on. I didn't believe it. You really stayed in 
the air and couldn't come down. Besides, you are seriously injured. If you don't get treatment early, 
you will die! snort! You will eventually fall from the sky, and that's when you die!"

Luo Beiqi put away the Mingye bow, smiled coldly, and immediately chased the ball in the 
direction where it flew.

At an altitude of 10,000 meters, the blue sky lay on the back of the ball, and he finally breathed a 
sigh of relief.

He knew that it was finally possible. We are out of danger, and we are safe now.

However, there are naturally formed strong winds above the 10,000-meter altitude.

The power of those strong winds is not small, and the higher the altitude, the stronger the power of 
the strong wind.

However, those 10,000 meters Qiuqiu and Qingtian Qi can still withstand the strong wind above. If 
they fly higher, they can't persist.



Due to the existence of the strong wind, it is quite difficult for Qiuqiu to fly and the speed is also 
weakened a lot.

And Qingtian Qi hugged Qiuqiu tightly.

Most of Gangfeng's threats to him were resisted by Qiuqiu, so although Qingtian Qi was seriously 
injured, he could barely resist.

In this way, Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu escaped high in the sky , Luobei Qi is chasing closely below..

Chapter 2640

"Qiuqiu, this place is quite far away from the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers. You have to fly for 
three days and three nights to reach it. Can you hold on?"

"Roar!"

Qiuqiu growled and nodded slightly.

However, Qingtian Qi was still a little worried. After all, flying at an altitude of more than 10,000 
meters is different from flying at an altitude of 1,000 meters.

Qiuqiu has to resist the strong wind, which consumes a lot of energy. He was worried that Qiuqiu 
wouldn't be able to hold on to the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers.

If Qiuqiu couldn't hold on, the two of them would have to fall from a high altitude, and what 
awaited them would naturally be the fate of being massacred.

"This time I miscalculated and underestimated Luo Beiqi. I didn't expect that he also had a top-
grade spiritual weapon bow. Qiuqiu, the rest is up to you. As long as we can hold on to the Valley of 
Ten Thousand Flowers, Luobei Qi will be dead! Originally, I was thinking about how to coax him to 
the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers, but now he revealed some secrets himself. In order to keep the 
secret, he had to hunt me down. Getting there... Humph!"

A cold light flashed across Qingtian Qi's eyes.



At that moment, he said no more and took out some healing and hemostatic medicine from the War 
God's Order. After treating the injury, he began to use the essence energy in his body to heal the 
injury.

If Ordinary warriors would be unable to survive such a serious injury and pass out long ago.

But Qingtian Qi is a physical warrior, and his physical fitness is much stronger than that of warriors 
of the same level. He has also encountered more serious injuries than this, so he can naturally hold 
on this time.

Afterwards, Qingtian Qi was distracted, healing the injury on Qiuqiu's back while observing the 
situation.

In this way, the two sides chased and escaped, quickly approaching the direction of Wanhua Valley.

"Huh! Where is this kid going to escape to? Why don't you go to Kyoto?"

Luo Beiqi below was also very surprised.

Immediately, he figured it out and sneered.

"hehe!! That direction is the direction to Baixi Kingdom. It turns out that this kid is going back to 
the Wu family's hometown in Baixi Kingdom! such a pity! This place is far away from Baixi 
Country, and your pet is flying at an altitude of 10,000 meters against the strong wind. Sooner or 
later, you will fall down. When you fall down, it’s time for me to take your head, haha!!!"

Thinking of this, Luo Beiqi felt happy and suddenly laughed proudly.

At that moment, he continued to chase Qiuqiu.

It turned out that the Ten Thousand Flowers Valley was located in the Black Territory Forest.

The Black Territory Forest was located on the border of Dakun Country , and connected to the 
Kingdom of Ten Thousand Beasts and the Kingdom of Baixi.



Qingtian Qi flew to the Black Domain Forest, and Luobei Qi had no doubt that it was there. He 
thought that Qingtian Qi was trying to escape to the Wu family's lair.

In this way, the two sides chased each other and escaped. The ball flew in the air for three days and 
three nights.

During these three days and three nights, Qingtian Qi relied on the super recovery power of the 
body training warrior and the rapid healing effect of the essence energy. After these three days and 
three nights of healing, Qingtian Qi, His injuries were mostly healed.

Even the right palm that was shot through was mostly recovered with the help of a large amount of 
essence energy, and he barely regained some mobility.

This was something Luo Beiqi below could not have imagined..

He thought that Qingtian Qi's injuries should be getting more and more serious, and he was 
approaching the edge of death.

Because he could not imagine that Qingtian Qi was not only a fifth-line warrior, but also a 
legendary physical warrior who had disappeared for a long time.

Then Super strong recovery power is the characteristic of physical warriors.

And the recovery power of physical warriors who have reached a high level is even more terrifying. 
Even"rebirth of a severed limb" is normal. The so-called rebirth of a severed limb is If you cut off 
one of his legs, he can grow it back.

In some ways, physical warriors are difficult to kill.

Unknowingly, Qingtian Qi and Qiuqiu had entered the sky above the black forest.

But at this time, Qiuqiu's physical strength seemed to be reaching its limit. Not only did his flying 
speed slow down, but his huge body began to tremble slightly in the strong wind.



Seeing this, Qingtian Qi was very worried.

"Qiuqiu, Ten Thousand Flowers Valley is coming, you have to hold on!"

"Roar!"

Qiuqiu responded with a low voice and flapped his wings hard twice.

Luo Beiqi below also looked tired.

He had been traveling without sleep for three days and three nights, and even a fifth-level warrior 
couldn't bear it.

However, he also felt The ball's speed slowed down a lot, as if it was reaching its limit.

This made him say proudly to himself

"hey-hey!! It seems that the boy's pet can't hold on any longer. Even a fifth-level flying ferocious 
beast can only fly in the strong wind for so long! It's just that the direction this kid is flying is a bit 
strange. Why doesn't he fly in the direction of Baixi Country? No matter so much, this kid's pet 
can't hold on any longer. I will understand everything after I catch him."

At this moment, Luo Beiqi continued to chase forward...
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