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After a moment, Qingtian Ling nodded with great satisfaction and said:"Haha! That's great! I didn't 
expect it to be a flaming lion that can grow to the seventh level of perfection. The two uncles, for 
this psychic beast, Mrs. Tianling Satisfied."

Qing Yunlie immediately laughed and said:"Haha!! As long as you are satisfied! Brother Ying and I 
saw that you have not been channeling since you entered the fifth level, so we knew that you were 
not satisfied with the spirit beasts raised in the family."

"This time, the two of us worked hard to catch this flaming lion in the Black Ridge area. Seeing that 
you are so satisfied, our hard work was not in vain. Hearing this

, Qing Tianling was immediately moved to express his condolences to Qing Yun Lie.

At this time, Qing Yunying, who had been silent, said in a deep voice:"Tian Ling, please channel 
now!" We are here to help you conquer the formation!

To cast a channeling technique, you must first defeat the channeled beast, so that it can voluntarily 
let go of the protection of its soul and channel. Therefore, if Qingtian Ling wants to channel the 
Flame Lion, he must first defeat it.

As soon as he heard this, Qingtian Ling couldn't wait and said immediately:"Okay! Yun Ying, let 
me defeat it!"

Qingtian Ling has entered the fifth level for more than a month.

For more than a month, he also wanted to find a suitable psychic beast, but no one caught his eye.

But now this flame lion made him very satisfied, so naturally he was eager to channel the spirit.

At that moment, Qing Yunying nodded slightly and said,"Tian Ling, it's up to you!"



After saying that, he shook the iron chain to release the shackles of the Flame Lion.

At the same time, Qing Yunlie shouted to the group of onlookers:"You bastards, get out of the way 
quickly. If you get too close, you will be hurt!"

Hearing this, the disciples stepped away one after another, leaving one Huge battle arena.

At this time, Qing Yunying also released the shackles of the Flame Lion.

As soon as the flame lion was freed from its restraints, it roared violently, turned around, and ran 
away.

"Evil beast! Don't even think about running!"

When Qingtian Ling saw this, he immediately used the Phantom Step, and with a flash of his body, 
he blocked the path of the flame lion.

The flame lion was furious, and opened its mouth to spit out a fire dragon at Qingtian Ling.

Qingtian Ling quickly stepped aside and pulled out the weapon at the same time. Taking out the 
Hundred Flowers Battle Sword from his waist, a blue dragon roared and attacked the Flame Lion. 
The two sides started fighting.

The Flame Lion was only a fifth-level ferocious beast. Although Qingtian Ling was also a fifth-
level beast, he had the Hundred Flowers Battle Sword and the Phantom Tracking Step. After 
helping each other for only dozens of rounds, they gradually gained the upper hand.

Seeing this, Qingyunying and Qingyunlie both showed relief.

And the children of the four tribes all showed excitement and admiration.

Obviously, they were disappointed with Qingtianling's solo battle for five years. He was very 
impressed that a ferocious beast of this level could still gain the upper hand.



Among the crowd, Qingtian Qi stood silently fighting aside. In fact, he wanted to see how much 
progress Qingtian Ling had made during this period of time.

But at the moment It seems, not bad! It seems that Brother Tianling has made a lot of progress.

Qingtian Qi nodded silently in his heart.

But at this moment, a sudden change occurred in the field.

I saw the flame lion suddenly roared violently, and forced it with one claw. It opened Qingtian Ling, 
then jumped up and fled.

However, the direction it fled was not in another direction, but rushed towards the group of children 
of the four tribes who were watching.

It turned out that the flame lion saw that he was no match for Qingtian Ling, He wanted to give up, 
and took advantage of Qingtian Ling's entanglement to turn around and escape.

However, it was also very smart.

It found that there were green cloud shadows, Qingyun Lie, and Qingtian Ling on all sides, and the 
remaining side was A group of children of the four tribes.

None of the children of the four tribes were at the fifth level, which was the best direction for it to 
escape.

At that moment, after it forced Qingtian Ling back, it roared and rushed towards the children of the 
four tribes. As soon as those children saw this A fifth-level ferocious beast rushed past, and 
everyone's expressions changed with fright, and they all backed away in horror..
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At the same time, Qing Yunying, who was not far away, saw such a change, his face suddenly 
changed slightly, and he snorted coldly:"Evil beast! Looking for death!"



At the same time, he was about to take action.

But at this moment, a figure suddenly rushed out from the crowd, blocking the way of the flame 
lion for an instant, and pressed the head of the flame lion with an extremely swift palm.

"It’s Tianqi!"

There was a burst of exclamation from the crowd.

The person who rushed out was Qingtian Qi.

At the same time, Qingtian Qi gently pressed his palm on the forehead of the Flame Lion.

With Qingtian Qi's gentle palm, The huge body of the flame lion that rushed over suddenly stopped, 
and time seemed to stand still at this moment.

This scene went from movement to stillness, completed in an instant, it was very strange, and 
everyone was stunned.

"Good boy!"

Qing Yunying's eyes lit up and he couldn't help but sigh in admiration. He asked himself that he 
could stop the Flame Lion, but he would never be able to do it so lightly as Qing Tian Qi.

But at this moment, Qing Tian Qi showed a smile on his lips and said even more casually. road"Get 
down!"

As soon as he said these words, Qing Tianqi's palm gently exerted force, and the huge body of the 
flame lion could no longer support it, and fell to the ground, unable to move.

This scene once again shocked the people around him Living

"This...is this?"



"Wow! Tianqi is so awesome!"

At the same time, Qingtian Qi had another thought. With a flash of red light in his hand, he cast a 
'soul-sealing technique' on the flame lion, causing the flame lion to fall into a deep sleep instantly.

At this time, Qingyun Ying walked away with a face full of horror. He came over and 
exclaimed:"Good boy, your strength has become so strong. It seems that even I am no longer your 
opponent."

As soon as he said these words, the disciples around him took a deep breath of cold air and looked 
at Qingtian Qi with great horror.

You must know that Qingyun Ying is a fifth-order Dzogchen Peak warrior, and there is also a fifth-
order Dzogchen Peak warrior. The psychic beast is said to be the first person below level six among 
the four tribes.

Now even Qing Yunying admits that he is no match for Qing Tian Qi, so what extent does Qing 
Tian Qi's strength reach? They can't even imagine.

No one dares to believe that Qingtian Qi will be a sixth-level warrior.

Because even if he has true spiritual qualifications, it is impossible to reach the sixth level at the age 
of fifteen or sixteen.

At the same time, Qingyunlie and Qingtian Ling Ye came over with a shocked look on his face.

"Tianqi, good guy, you really surprised my brother! The strength has reached this level.

Qingyun Lie on the side also laughed loudly:"Haha!"! Tianqi, it seems that you have reached the 
peak of the fifth level of Dzogchen, right? Coupled with your identity as a five-series warrior. The 
number one person below level six is none other than you. Boss Yunying, it seems that you have to 
give up your position as the number one person below the sixth level. Ha ha!!"

Hearing this, Qing Yunying ignored him, but turned to look at the unconscious Flame Lion, and said 
with some regret:"Tianqi, what did you do to this Flame Lion? It wasn't killed by your slap, was it?



Qingtianqi replied:"Uncle Yunying, I didn't kill it." It would be a pity to kill such a rare ferocious 
beast. I just used secret techniques to make it comatose."

"Oh I got it!"

Qing Yunying breathed a sigh of relief.

"Tianqi, then let it wake up now! Tian Ling's channeling ceremony hasn't been completed yet!

Qingtian Ling also said impatiently:"Yes!" Tianqi, let this guy wake up first, I will defeat him. It 
was just a small accident before, but I won't let it get away this time."

Obviously, Qingtian Ling is very satisfied with this flame lion.

But unexpectedly, Qingtian Qi did not wake up the flame lion, but smiled and said:"Brother 
Tianling, didn't you ask me to bring you an ancient beast at the ancient training ground last time? Is 
the beast back? Hearing this

, Qingtian Ling said in surprise:"Tianqi, don't you say you really brought one back?" Last time I just 
said it casually. It is not an easy task to bring a living creature back from there!"

"hey-hey!! Brother Tianling, you really got it right. I actually brought you an ancient ferocious 
beast."..
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Hearing this, Qingtian Ling said in surprise:"Really? Where is that ferocious beast?"

At that moment, Qingtian Qi smiled slightly, and with a casual move, white light flashed, and there 
was a strange little animal in the field.

I saw that the little animal looked a bit like a cat, with a long tail and a body length of only two feet. 
Its body was curled up and sleeping.......



Seeing this little animal, Qingtian Lingqi said:"Tianqi, is this the ancient ferocious beast you want 
to give me? Looking at its current appearance, is it not in a battle-transformed state?"

"good! This guy is not weak. If it transforms, Brother Tianling, you should not be its opponent. 
However, don't worry, I do have a spiritual skill called 'Mystery Technique'. I can use this technique 
to contain it and help you conquer it. Hearing this

, Qingtian Ling was overjoyed and hurriedly urged:"Tianqi, let this guy wake up." I just want to see 
how powerful it is"

"good! By the way, brothers and sisters, you should retreat five hundred meters away and don't get 
too close. This beast is too powerful. I will wake this guy up now. Brother Tianling, two uncles, you 
must also be prepared."

Hearing what Qing Tian Qi said seriously, the children of the four tribes did not dare to be careless 
and stepped back one after another. At the same time, they were also curious about how powerful 
the ancient ferocious beast that Qing Tian Qi brought back was?

And Qing Tian Ling and the others did not dare to be careless.......

After seeing all the disciples retreating, Qingtian Qi turned to look at the ancient ferocious beast, 
then pinched a Soul Art in his hand and shouted in a low voice.

"Soul Sealing Technique, solved!"

As soon as he said these words, Qingtian Qi flicked out a red light with one finger, which shot 
directly into the eyebrows of the ancient beast. As soon as the red light disappeared into the 
eyebrows, the ancient beast moved slightly.

After a while, it seemed to be gradually waking up. , its eyes slowly opened.

When this ancient ferocious beast slowly raised its head and vaguely saw the surrounding scene, it 
was at a loss for a while.

But when its eyes turned to Qingtian Qi, it seemed to have remembered something. , immediately 
jumped up from the ground with a swish, and then stepped back with frightened eyes.



When it retreated to five or six feet, it looked at the blue sky angrily with its eyes, then roared, and 
it started Transformation.

In the blink of an eye, the cat-like ancient beast transformed into a three-foot-long ferocious beast.

But when everyone saw its transformed appearance, they all involuntarily took a deep breath of cold 
air.

"Oh my God! What kind of ferocious beast is this? Why does it look so weird? I have never heard 
of such a ferocious beast before."

At this moment, the cat-like ancient ferocious beast has transformed into a leopard-headed ferocious 
beast, but its appearance is very strange, completely different from ordinary leopard-shaped 
ferocious beasts. Its head is a leopard head, but it has a It has a sharp horn, and its huge body is 
covered with a carapace like a turtle shell.

However, what is even more surprising is that the tail of this ancient beast actually grows three 
terrifying tails, like three long whips. , waving continuously in the air.

Seeing the strange appearance of this ancient beast, Qingtian Ling and Qingyun Lie were shocked.

And Qingyun Ying felt the terrifying momentum of this ancient beast, and he immediately 
roared :"not good! This ferocious beast at the peak of the fifth level of Dzogchen, Yun Lie and Tian 
Ling, please retreat quickly!"

At the same time as he spoke, Qing Yunying's figure flashed, pulling Qing Yun Lie and Qing Tian 
Ling back quickly.

With the strength of Qing Yun Lie and Qing Tian Ling, they are definitely no match for the fifth-
level Dzogchen Peak ferocious beast, let alone one from ancient times. The ferocious beast.

At this moment, only Qingtian Qi was left confronting the ferocious beast.



However, the ancient ferocious beast and Qingtian Qi confronted each other for a while, and fear 
gradually appeared in its eyes.

It remembered the scene when it first met Qingtian Qi. , it also confronted Qingtian Qi like this.

But in the end, before it could exert its full strength, Qingtian Qi effortlessly captured it alive.

Thinking of what happened that day, it became even more frightened.

At this moment, it simply It didn't have the fighting spirit to continue fighting Qing Tianqi.

Thinking of this, it roared, the afterimage of its body flashed, and it actually used the speed skill, 
turned around and fled..
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Thinking of this, it roared, the afterimage of its body flashed, and it actually used its speed skill, 
turned around and fled.

This time, the direction chosen by the ancient ferocious beast was exactly the direction Qing 
Yunying and others moved away from, which was also the direction directly leading to the exit of 
the school grounds.

After the ancient beast used its speed skill, it was extremely fast and ran dozens of feet away in the 
blink of an eye.

But just when it was about to pass by Qing Yunying.

Qing Yunying suddenly took action, slashed at its neck with a knife, and shouted:"Evil beast! Don't 
even think about running away!"

The ferocious beast felt the wind of the knife attacking from the side, and was furious. It turned 
around and waved out a claw to meet Qing Yunying's attack. attack.

The knife and claws intersected, and there was a loud bang!



One person and one beast suddenly separated.

The ancient ferocious beast only moved back a foot, while Qingyun Ying moved back a foot and a 
half.

Obviously, the ancient ferocious beast has the upper hand

"What a powerful beast! It is indeed an ancient ferocious beast, much stronger than ferocious beasts 
of the same level."

Qing Yunying was horrified in his heart, and the breath in his chest was still a little unstable.

At the same time, after the vicious beast blocked Qing Yunying's attack with one claw, it did not 
dare to fight, turned around and continued to escape towards the exit of the school ground.

Seeing this, Qing Yunying frowned He frowned and shouted:"Xiaoying merges into one!""

As soon as these words were said, a psychic beast whose appearance was completely dark and 
could not be seen slowly stood up from Qing Yunying's shadow. It was Qing Yunying's psychic 
beast 'Little Shadow'. In just an instant,

Qing Yunying and ' Xiao Ying completed the psychic fusion, and his aura surged.

His whole person was like a dark warrior blending into the darkness, so gloomy that people couldn't 
see his appearance clearly.

After the fusion, Qing Yunying snorted coldly:"You want to follow me?" How easy is it to escape 
from your hands?"

At the same time as he spoke, his figure flashed and he chased the ancient beast again.

When the ancient beast was only two or three hundred meters away from the exit of the school 
ground, Qingyun Ying finally caught up with it, and with a flash of figure, he blocked its path. , and 
chopped off the head with one strike.



The ancient beast waved its claws to resist again.

This time the two sides collided head-on, but the beast roared in pain and fell back continuously.

And while it was retreating, the beast looked back, Qingtian Qi happened to be walking over here 
leisurely. As soon as it saw Qingtian Qi coming, it was immediately frightened and filled with rage 
and anger. Then it roared and transformed a second time, slowly growing from its neck. A second 
head sprouted out.

As soon as the second head sprouted, the beast's momentum increased sharply, reaching a terrifying 
level in an instant.

Qingyun Ying's eyes widened in horror.

"Huh! It’s a late mutation! It turned out to be a ferocious beast that mutated in the later stage!"

At the same time as he spoke, Qing Yunying did not dare to be careless. He quickly thought about it 
and shouted in a low voice:"Shadow clone!"

At that moment, Qing Yunying used the psychic beast's skill 'Shadow Clone', split his body into 
two, and separated into a clone with exactly the same strength as the original body.

This 'Shadow Clone' was actually the same as Qing Tianqi's Yin-Yang Clone Technique. Generally 
powerful.

It's a pity that Qingtian Qi has not learned the Yin and Yang clone technique yet.

Because if you want to learn the Yin and Yang clone technique, you need to have a deep 
understanding of the 'Tao of Yin and Yang', and Qingtian Qi's understanding is not deep enough.

But it is said that Qing Yunying has just used this technique After releasing the 'Shadow Clone', the 
two-headed ferocious beast roared and rushed over. The two sides started fighting.



But before the two sides fought for a few rounds, the two-headed ferocious beast broke through 
Qingyun Ying's blockage and fled in the blink of an eye. In no time, they arrived at the exit of the 
school ground.

Seeing this, Qing Yunying's face changed drastically and he shouted anxiously:"Evil beast! Stop 
leaving!"

Outside the school grounds, there is the living area of the four tribes. There are many family 
members of the children of the four tribes there.

Many of these family members have very low cultivation.

If this two-headed beast rushes in, the consequences will be disastrous. That's why Qingyunying is 
so angry and heart-wrenching..
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At the same time, Qing Tianqi also frowned and secretly said something bad.

He also didn't expect Qingyun Ying to be unable to stop the two-headed ferocious beast, allowing 
the two-headed ferocious beast to escape so quickly.

At that moment, Qing Tianqi's heart tightened and he was about to rush over to catch the ferocious 
beast.

But at this moment, a purple-haired young man carrying a long sword walked in from the entrance 
of the school grounds.

As soon as he saw the purple-haired young man walking in, Qingyunying was overjoyed and 
shouted quickly:"Zi! Stop that beast, don't let him escape!"

It turned out that the handsome purple-haired young man was the number one among the seven 
people in blood clothes. The person 'Zi' is now a sixth-level warrior

‘When Zi' heard Qing Yunying's cry, he also saw the two-headed beast rushing towards the exit.



At that moment, 'Zi''s face showed a look of disdain, and he said in a cold voice:"Where are those 
beasts from? How dare you come to our four tribes to run wild!"

At the same time as he spoke, 'Zi' pulled out the long sword from behind and slashed at the 
oncoming attacker with one strike. The two-headed beast came.

It turns out that 'Zi' misunderstood what Qing Yunying meant.

Qingyun Ying wanted his help to capture the two-headed beast alive, but Zi thought that 
Qingyunying wanted to kill the two-headed beast by himself, so Zi did not hold back at all with his 
sword, slashing at the two-headed beast with great force, vowing to kill the beast in front of him. 
The beast was cut in half with one sword strike.

Seeing this, Qingyunying was very anxious and shouted quickly:"Zi! Don't kill it!"

Qingtian Qi not far away was even more anxious and shouted:"No! Uncle Zi, please show mercy!"

But it was already too late. Oh, 'Zi' took action too fast and didn't have time to stop.

Zi is a sixth-level warrior, and no matter how strong the ancient beast is, it is only a fifth-level 
beast. Facing a sixth-level warrior, it can only be killed instantly.

So there is no doubt that with one strike of Zi's sword, the beast will definitely die.

Seeing that the ancient ferocious beast that he had worked so hard to capture alive was about to die 
unjustly under Zi's sword, Qing Tianqi suddenly felt a chill in his heart.

At the same time, Qing Tianling behind him also showed a look of despair.

Previously, Qingtian Ling was still congratulating himself. He was about to get an extremely 
powerful psychic beast, but in the blink of an eye, all his good wishes came to nothing. The spiritual 
beast Qingtian Qi had finally captured for him was about to die accidentally. Zi's sword came down.

But at this moment, Zi's sword slashed down.



But just when everyone thought that the two-headed beast was about to die under Zi's sword, a 
sudden change occurred.

When the sword was about to approach, the body of the ferocious beast suddenly turned into a large 
ball of white mist with a bang.

Uh-huh!

Zi's sword struck the white mist. boom!

There was a loud bang.

The huge energy explosion blasted a large crater more than a foot deep into the ground.

The white mist was blown away by the bombardment and almost disappeared.

After a while, the white mist that was scattered in all directions gathered together again, and in the 
blink of an eye, the appearance of the ancient ferocious beast was condensed.

But at this moment, the ancient ferocious beast was lying on the ground with bleeding from the 
corner of its mouth, looking extremely depressed, unable to move.

Seeing this astonishing scene, the group of disciples not far away were amazed.

"Huh! Not dead! A fifth-level ferocious beast was not instantly killed by a sixth-level warrior."

"yes! This is incredible!"

But at this moment, the martial arts disciples in the crowd all showed incredible expressions.

"Oh my God! I am not wrong, right? Is the skill used by the ferocious beast just now the inherited 

talent of our martial arts family?’？"



"seems like it! But how is this possible? How could a ferocious beast know the inherited talent of 
our martial arts family? And it’s the most powerful talent skill among them."

"yes! This 'turning one's body into mist' is an inherited talent known as absolute defense. It can even 
cross levels to withstand one or two attacks from the enemy. Even among the martial arts disciples, 
very few of us can obtain this inherited talent. How did this ferocious beast obtain the inherited 
talent of our martial arts family?"

At the same time, both 'Zi' and Qingyunying who were near the exit were stunned.

Both of them looked at the ferocious beast in great horror.

After a while, the two of them looked at each other from a distance, and both saw shock in each 
other's eyes..
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After a while, the two of them looked at each other from afar, and both saw shock in each other's 
eyes.

"Brother Yunying, did I read it correctly just now? This ferocious beast seemed to have used the Wu 
family's inherited talent just now to turn its body into mist.’"

Qingyunying also took a deep breath and said in a deep voice:"You read that right! That should be 
'turning one's body into mist'. Otherwise, this beast would have died by your sword long ago. With 
the strength of the fifth level, If a sixth-level warrior can survive one move with his sword, only the 
skill 'turning one's body into mist' can do it."

Zi immediately said in surprise:"Isn't this impossible? How could this weird beast be able to 'turn 
one's body into mist' ? That is the skill of the legendary sacred beast Xuanwu, and only the disciples 
of the Wu family have the opportunity to inherit it."

When he said this, something suddenly occurred to him, and a look of horror appeared on his face.

At this time, Qing Yunying saw Zi's complex expression and also showed a strange look, saying:"It 
seems that you have also thought about it. The reason why this ferocious beast can 'turn into mist' is 



because it also has Xuanwu Zhen in its body." Blood, and it has been activated, so it can obtain the 
true inheritance of Xuanwu."

Hearing this, Zi nodded slightly and sighed:"Unbelievable! This is actually a ferocious beast with 
Xuanwu true blood. In this way This ferocious beast can reach at least the eighth level!"

Any ferocious beast with the true blood of a holy beast, and the true blood in its body is activated 
by chance, can basically grow to the eighth level. yes! It can grow to the eighth level, and it is still 
an ancient beast with the true blood of a holy beast. It is absolutely the best when used as a psychic 
beast."

Qingyun Ying couldn't help but show extreme envy in his eyes.

"good! I'll catch it alive now. It will definitely be of great use to your Qing family."

While speaking, Zi walked towards the ferocious beast with a smile.

When the ferocious beast saw Zi coming, a look of horror appeared in its eyes, and it struggled to 
get up and escape.

But at this moment, Zi's figure flashed and approached it, holding out a hand He grabbed it.

The ferocious beast sensed something was wrong and wanted to use his body to turn into mist to 
escape again.

However, Zi was prepared for it and used his own aura to lock the ferocious beast in advance, 
suppressing all the energy in its body. Hold it, making it unable to use skills for a while.

Then, Zi put a hand on the back of the beast, forced his own vitality into the beast's body, and sealed 
all the beast's vitality energy, making it unable to move. Not at all.

The ancient ferocious beast was captured alive by Zi.

Qingyun Ying also stepped forward and looked at the ancient ferocious beast carefully.



Not long after, Qing Yun Lie, Qing Tian Ling and the children of the four tribes came forward to 
watch, and everyone discovered There were some exclamations.

And the martial arts disciples showed inexplicably complicated expressions.

After a while, Zi suddenly asked:"Brother Yunying, where did this strange beast come from? Why 
have I never seen it? As far as I know, our ancestors once said that our five races are the only blood 
inheritors of the guardian beasts of the five ancient directions."

"Logically speaking, there shouldn't be any ferocious beast in this world that can have the 
inheritance of Xuanwu. Don't you think this incident is too strange? Qing

Yunying pondered for a while and said,"Yes!" This is indeed a very strange thing. However, the 
appearance of my five ancient races is a mystery. Tracing back to the earliest period when our five 
ancient tribes appeared, it was after ancient times and at the beginning of antiquity."

"The ferocious beast in front of me is not the ferocious beast of today, nor is it the ferocious beast of 
ancient times. It is the ferocious beast of ancient times. Maybe in ancient times, the situation was 
different from now. Hearing this

, Zi was surprised and said:"It turns out that this ferocious beast is actually an ancient ferocious 
beast." By the way, Brother Yunying, how do you know it is an ancient beast?"

"Because it was brought back by Tianqi from the ancient training ground. It is naturally an ancient 
ferocious beast. Huh! Where is Tianqi?"

When Qingtian Qi was mentioned, everyone realized that Qingtian Qi was not among the crowd of 
spectators.

At that moment, everyone looked around for Qingtian Qi.

Soon, everyone was surprised to find that Qingtian Qi was standing still dozens of meters away, 
slightly He raised his head and closed his eyes tightly, with a look of realization on his face..
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At the same time, Qing Tianqi's body was also in a strange state, and the surface of his skin began 
to atomize.

Seeing such a scene, everyone was immediately surprised

"Huh! Do you see that fog? And Tianqi’s status? That is how the matter?"

"This...can't be right? Could it be that Tianqi's Xuanwu talent was awakened? His Xuanwu talent 

turned out to be"turning one's body into mist"’？"

"It should be, his phenomenon should be awakening the inheritance of talent. It's just that it has just 
been awakened, not fully activated yet."

As soon as these words came out, the surrounding disciples were in an uproar.

And the disciples of the Wu family showed even more horror and envy.

‘Turning one's body into mist is one of the most powerful inherited talents of the Wu family, and 
they will naturally be envious of it.

It turns out that Xuanwu, also known as Xuanming, is a holy beast of the water system and knows 
the three paths of water, namely: liquid, mist, and ice.

However, among these three paths, Xuanwu Ice Path is the strongest, so after the martial arts 
disciples activate their true blood, they all have the innate ability to control ice.

But the talent inheritance left by Xuanwu to the disciples of the Wu family includes the Tao of 
Water, and this"turning one's body into mist" is one of the Tao of Mist.

As if sensing something, Qing Tianqi, who had closed his eyes and was immersed in perception, 
slowly opened his eyes.

As soon as Qing Tianqi opened his eyes, what greeted his eyes were surprised faces.



Only then did Qingtian Qi realize what had happened.

At that moment, with a thought, the floating mist around him disappeared.

However, he was still a little excited.

He has been unable to awaken the Xuanwu inheritance in his body, and he is also worried about this 
matter!

But he didn't expect that this accidental incident would accidentally awaken his Xuanwu 
inheritance.

What I didn't even expect was that my Xuanwu inheritance was actually 'turning my body into 
mist'!

In fact, it was also the first time for Qingtian Qi to see the ancient ferocious beast perform 
'Transform into Mist'.

The last time, Qing Tianqi was in a dangerous situation and after seeing the ancient beast, he didn't 
give the beast a chance to use his full strength and directly captured it alive.

This time, it was the first time he saw the ferocious beast perform 'Transform into Mist', and he 
realized that he had underestimated the ferocious beast and even underestimated its growth limit.

And at the same time that the ferocious beast used its body to transform into mist, there was also a 
strange mental fluctuation.

Qing Tianqi is a soul mutant and feels unusually inspired by mental fluctuations.

As soon as he felt the mental fluctuation, his whole body was shaken, and something deep in his 
blood seemed to be awakened.

In fact, it is a kind of inheritance resonance from the same Xuanwu true blood.



This resonance quickly awakened Qingtian Qi's dormant Xuanwu talent, allowing him to instantly 
enter a state of enlightenment.

At that moment, he felt like he was going to turn into a large floating cloud and fly away with the 
wind. It was a mysterious feeling.

But soon, everyone's gaze interrupted Qing Tianqi from his thoughts, and let his consciousness 
return to reality.

As a soul mutant, Qing Tianqi has an extremely keen eye on others.

What a pity! This time, the inherited talent was only awakened, not fully activated.

It seems that if you want to fully activate 'Transform into Mist', you can only rely on other 
opportunities.

This time, Qingtian Qi felt a little regretful that he could not fully activate the inheritance talent in 
one go.

At this time, Qing Yunying and others also came over.

As soon as everyone came over, they asked Qing Tianqi what happened just now.

Qingtian Qi did not deny it, and directly described the Xuanwu talent he had obtained as"turning his 
body into mist".

This naturally aroused everyone's amazement.

With such powerful defensive skills, it can be said that Qingtian Qi's overall strength has greatly 
increased..
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Then, with everyone's envious eyes, Qingtian Qi used the 'Magic of Confusion' to help Qingtian 
Ling communicate with the ancient ferocious beast.



The 'enchantment technique' is a soul skill recorded in the soul book. Its main function is to 
hypnotize, seduce, and cause people and ferocious beasts to hallucinate.

But Qing Tianling was originally only a fifth-level warrior, but after channeling the ancient beast, 
his strength greatly increased.

Now, even Qing Yunying thinks that he is no match for Qing Tian Ling.

What surprised Qing Tianling even more was that with the help of the psychic beast, his water talent 
was greatly improved, and was actually as good as his fire talent, reaching an advanced level.

Qingtian Ling is a warrior of the third element. In order to allow him to blend into the Zhou family's 
blood circle, Qing Yanhai worked hard to improve Qingtian Ling's fire element talent to a high 
level.

Now, with the help of psychic beasts, Qing Tianling has actually improved his water talent to an 
advanced level.

For all this, the person Qingtian Ling is most grateful for is naturally Qingtian Qi.

It was just the gratitude between the two brothers, all in silence.

Qingtian Ling also loved the psychic beast so much that he even gave it a name, 'Xuanwu'.

The meaning is that his psychic beast not only has the true blood of Xuanwu, but also can"turn into 
mist with its body".

After dealing with Qing Tianling's matter, Qing Tianqi found an excuse and hurriedly left the school 
grounds.

He doesn't have much time to stay in the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers. He must leave the Valley 
of Ten Thousand Flowers as soon as possible and go to Tianshui City to meet Lin Yue Monkey 
King. Because he has exceeded the agreed time limit, he does not have that much time to spend 
time with Qingtian Ling and the others. Got together.



However, there are some things Qingtian Qi has to do.

Now it's time to go to the Hidden Martial Pavilion. There is the ultimate martial art I want, 'All 
Souls Incarnation Technique'!

Qing Tianqi's heart felt hot when he thought of the 'All Souls Incarnation Technique', and he felt a 
little impatient.

This time he returns to the valley and obtains the secret technique of 'All Souls Incarnation 
Technique', which is also one of the things he must do.

In fact, this 'All Souls Incarnation Technique' is the best among the best martial arts. Even compared 
with the inherited talent 'Transforming the body into mist', it is even better.

‘Transforming the body into mist is a purely defensive martial skill. After transforming into the mist 
state, one can only move and cannot attack, but the defense against any attack is unparalleled.

The Transformation Technique of All Spirits is a superb martial art capable of both offense and 
defense.

Its defense ability against single attacks is super strong and it can be invincible. However, when 
faced with group attacks or large-scale attacks, its defense is not good. It is far worse than turning 
one's body into mist.

After all, the art of incarnation of all spirits is the incarnation of thousands of small life forms, but 
they are still alive.

As long as those small life forms are attacked by a wide range of skills, they will still fall.

And by turning his body into mist, he turns his whole body into a lifeless mist. As long as he is not 
wiped out instantly, he can survive and his defense is super strong.

However, the 'incarnation defense' of the All Souls Incarnation Technique is only one of its effects, 
and its other effect is the 'All Souls Clone'.



The so-called clone of all spirits means that you can create a clone with exactly the same strength as 
the main body.

In fact, that clone is controlled by the soul of a psychic beast.

‘According to the rule of"all souls' clones", after channeling, how many souls are in the body can 
create several clones.

According to Qing Tianqi's speculation, if he learns the 'All Souls Incarnation Technique', when he 
has two psychic beasts, he will have three souls in his body. At that time, he will be able to separate 
two clones that are as strong as the main body. This is equivalent to a threefold increase in strength.

If he learns the Yin-Yang Clone Technique, he will be able to split into six, and his strength will be 
six times greater.

Because of the yin and yang clone technique, what is separated is the two bodies of yin and yang. 
There is no distinction between primary and secondary. Both are the main body.

The two main bodies then used the"All Souls Incarnation Technique" to use the All Souls Clone, 
and each of them was divided into three, that is, six.

However, after more than ten years of pondering in the 'Void Evolution Realm', Qingtian Qi found 
that it is extremely difficult to learn the 'Yin and Yang Clone Technique', probably even more 
difficult than the 'All Souls Incarnation Technique'. Deep understanding.

Not to mention the Yin-Yang Clone Technique, let's talk about the 'Incarnation Technique of All 
Spirits', which is the ultimate martial art that Qingtian Qi believes in must be learned.

Because the 'All Souls Incarnation Technique' is suitable for combat, while 'Transforming the Body 
into Mist' is more suitable for life-saving.

When the two work together, it's perfect.

Thinking of this, Qing Tianqi felt secretly happy and strode towards the 'Cangwu Pavilion'..
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Seven days later, Qingtian Qi closed his eyes slightly and stood outside a field of flowers.

He was surrounded by thousands of petals swirling and dancing around him.

After a moment, a curtain of light suddenly lit up above his head.....

In the light curtain, a large tree emitting dazzling cyan brilliance gradually emerged.

As soon as the big tree appeared, it began to frantically absorb the wood energy around it, and even 
forcibly absorbed the life energy of those plants.

In the blink of an eye, within a radius of one mile, flowers withered and trees fell, creating a 
desolate scene of late autumn.

It turns out that the big tree in the light curtain is Qingtian Qi's native wood spirit - the tree of wood 
spirit.

Now this wood spirit tree has evolved into its second form. Its ability to absorb wood energy is 
more than ten times stronger than before, and it can even forcibly plunder the vitality of other 
plants.

What's even more frightening is that it also has a second function, which is to automatically help 
Qingtian Qi refine wood vitality, and its speed of refining wood vitality is no less than that of the 
pseudo-spirit body.

In other words, with the help of the Wood Spirit Tree, Qingtian Qi can refine Wood Yuan Qi at a 
speed equivalent to that of a pseudo-spirit body plus a hidden spirit body, much faster than a 
pseudo-spirit warrior.

Therefore, after Qingtian Qi's Wood Element Qi enters the sixth level, his Wood Element 
qualifications are much higher than those of the Pseudo Spirit Body. In other words, if he does not 
transform into the Wind and Thunder Body, he will be the easiest among the five elements to enter 
the ninth level. Of course it's wood type.



Generally speaking, a warrior with pseudo-spiritual qualifications has a 10% chance of becoming a 
ninth-level warrior.

With the help of the Wood Spirit Tree in Qingtian Qi, the chance of Mu Yuan Qi entering the ninth 
level is close to 20%.

After a while, Qing Tianqi slowly opened his eyes, looking at the withered scene in front of him, his 
eyes showing deep thought.

After a moment, he sighed deeply

"Why! don't know! don't know!"

It turns out that Qing Tianqi was comprehending the way of life in the wood system before.

Although the Qing family's children can be born with psychic powers, they are only born with the 
'esoteric meaning of psychic'. To understand the way of life, they still need to rely on themselves to 
comprehend.

The secret of channeling is just a certain aspect of the application of skills in the 'Tao of Life'.

Simply put, the Tao is the general outline, and the secret is the application of the Tao in a certain 
aspect.

The Tao is a state, and the secret is more focused on skills.

Understanding the Tao and the general outline is the ultimate goal that a warrior should achieve.

If you want to learn the 'Transformation Technique of All Spirits', you must first understand the 
'Profound Meaning of Spirit Transformation' and transform your body into a spirit. But how to do 
this?

Maybe first Once you understand the 'Way of Life', will it be easier to understand the 'Secret 
Meaning of Spirit Transformation'? Hey! Forget it, if you can't figure it out, don't think about it.



Thinking of this, Qingtian put away the wood spirit tree above his head.

Those surrounding The petals around him fell one after another and withered instantly.

At this moment, Qing Tianqi suddenly sensed something and turned his head to look in a certain 
direction outside the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers, with a happy smile on his lips.

"You are finally out of seclusion! In order to wait for you, I have been delayed here for nine days. 
However, you finally didn't disappoint me, now it's time to go find them. However, I have to go and 
say goodbye to my tribe first."

Speaking of this, Qingtian Qi's figure flashed and disappeared.

It turned out that three days ago, Bai Xiaotian used Ni Yuan to forcibly raise Qingtian Qi's golden 
energy from the fifth level of Dzogchen to the peak of the fifth level of Dzogchen. , which has once 
again enhanced Qingtian Qi's strength a lot.

Today, Qingtian Qi's comprehensive combat effectiveness has reached 580,000 people. After the 
mad god transformed, the comprehensive combat effectiveness can reach 78 people.

If he fights with the ball again When the balls are combined, Qingtian Qi's comprehensive combat 
power can reach 940,000 people.

Such a powerful basic combat power has far exceeded the basic combat power that a sixth-order 
Dzogchen peak warrior can achieve. The basic combat power of a sixth-order Dzogchen peak 
warrior, That is only the power of 700,000 people.

However, the power of 940,000 people is only Qingtian Qi's basic combat power. His speed and 
various other special methods make him stronger in overall strength, and warriors with the same 
combat power are absolutely Not his opponent.

Today's Qingtian Qi is worthy of being the first person under the seventh-level elders of the five 
ancient tribes..
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But regarding this issue, no one among the five tribes can realize it. Even Teng Xiaoshan and Bai 
Xiaotian would not think of it, and Qingtian Qi would naturally not talk about it.

Half a day later, a red-haired boy walked out of the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers.

This red-haired boy is naturally Qing Tianqi, who just said goodbye to his tribe.

Qing Tianqi looked back at the Valley of Ten Thousand Flowers behind him, feeling inexplicably 
emotional in his heart. Then he turned and walked towards a certain place in the Black Forest, 
because there was something he had to deal with there.

It was precisely because of that matter that he stayed in Wanhua Valley for so long.

At the same time, something was happening in the Demon Blood Ridge area in the Black Forest.

This Demonic Blood Ridge is located deep in the Black Forest and is a place where high-level 
ferocious beasts often appear.

Among the ferocious beasts that appear here, the weakest ones are of the fifth level. Sixth-level 
ferocious beasts are even more common. In some places, there are even seventh-level ferocious 
beasts.

However, many warriors still enter this place every year to hunt ferocious beasts.

Because the fur material on the sixth-level ferocious beast is an indispensable raw material for 
refining defensive spirit armor.

Whether it is to make money or to refine some spiritual armor for yourself or your family, for sixth-
level warriors, going to Demon Blood Ridge to hunt sixth-level ferocious beasts is the best choice.

At this moment, at the edge of Demon Blood Ridge.

Six warriors were discussing around the corpse of a ferocious beast.



The youngest of the six looked to be in his thirties, and two of them were elderly.

The old man at the head had even gray hair.

At this time, a dark-skinned middle-aged man in the crowd shouted excitedly

"Ha ha!! Dad, this time we tried our best to hunt down this sixth-level red raccoon beast. The fur on 
this red raccoon beast should be able to refine a fire-type spiritual armor, right?"

In the crowd, the old man at the head shook his head repeatedly and said:"Haha! San'er! Do you 
think defensive spirit armor is so easy to refine? It takes at least the furs of three sixth-level fire-
type spiritual beasts to gather some raw materials, and some other fire-type materials are also 
needed."

"After preparing these materials, we still need to spend a lot of money and ask a master to refine it 
for us, so that we can refine a piece of spiritual armor."

"Isn’t one head enough? It seems we have to hunt two more!

The old man at the head said again:"Okay, stop talking nonsense." Everyone quickly disposed of the 
corpse of this vicious beast. After a while, the leader of this clan will lure a fire beast over. You 
should still set up a trap here as before."

"yes! Patriarch!"

It turns out that these six warriors are from a relatively powerful small martial arts family in 
Crimson Gold City.

The old man who headed them is the patriarch of the family and the only sixth-level strongman in 
the family.

This time, in order to give the family's children After refining a few pieces of defensive spirit armor, 
he came up with the idea of creating a sixth-level ferocious beast from Demon Blood Ridge.



However, with his own strength, he was not sure that he could deal with a sixth-level ferocious 
beast, so he thought of letting the family members stand aside. Assistance to help him hunt down 
the sixth-level ferocious beast.

The other five people were naturally the fifth-level elites of their family.

However, with these five people using traps to contain them, the old man successfully hunted a red 
raccoon. Beast.

It didn't take long for everyone to finish processing the body of the red raccoon beast.

The old man said to one of the old men:"Second brother, you lead them to set up a trap here. I will 
go and lure a sixth-level ferocious beast over."

After saying this, the old man flashed and entered the depths of the jungle.

Everyone quickly set up a trap.

However, before everyone could arrange the trap to one third, there was a sound coming from the 
depths of the jungle not far away. There was an angry sound from the beast queen. Then, the old 
man's frightened and angry roar came again.

Then, there was the running sound of 'Whoosh! Whoosh!' and the roar of the beast.

In just a moment, the old man who went to lure the beast The old man rushed back.

With a look of panic on his face, he shouted loudly to the five people who were in a state of 
astonishment.

"Everyone quickly dispersed and ran away, but behind us came a sixth-level ferocious beast. We 
were no match."

Hearing this, everyone was scared to death..
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