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A quarter of an hour later, in the meeting hall.

Several kings sat in their seats and looked at Jade Qilin with puzzled faces.

"Yu Qilin, you called us over, what are you going to announce?", an old man asked impatiently.

This Yu Qilin suddenly called everyone together and said nothing, which made him a little 
dissatisfied.

Yu Qilin silently glanced at everyone in the field, a total of four people.

The four who were left behind by the faint organization All the kings are here

"Yu Qilin, you should say so! If you don't tell me, I won't have time to play with you anymore!"

The old man stood up directly and was about to leave.

He was very jealous of Yu Qilin, a rising star. He had broken through to the eighth star at such a 
young age and was on an equal footing with himself, which made him a little unhappy.

If he could come, it would be enough to give him face. I kept mumbling for a long time without 
saying anything.

"Mr. Hunter King, please be patient!", Yu Qilin smiled slightly,"Sit down!

The old man said impatiently:"Then announce quickly, we are all very busy!""

"yes! Yu Qilin, if you have anything to say, just say it quickly!"



"that is! I still want to practice in seclusion!"

Several other people agreed.

After all, Yu Qilin has just been promoted to eight stars, and her prestige is limited.

She took the initiative to summon the kings today, giving people the feeling of a leader summoning 
subordinates.

These old guys are naturally a little unhappy.

What are their identities? ?

When will it be the turn of a rising star to tell them what to do?

Yu Qilin knew it well.

She smiled and said:"Everyone, I summoned you here because I want to introduce someone to 
you!"

"who?!", the hunting king asked impatiently

"it's me!"Qin Feng's voice suddenly sounded behind the kings.

The kings were startled and turned around quickly to see an extremely handsome young man 
standing there coolly.

"It's you!"

"He is Qin Feng!"

The Hunting King and others were shocked, and they all jumped up in surprise.



Qin Feng smiled evilly, and a silver light flashed in his eyes.

The illusion was activated!

The Hunting King and others suddenly felt sleepy and unable to resist.

Plop~! Plop!~！….

The sound of four heavy objects falling to the ground was heard in succession.

In just a moment, the four hunting kings fell to the ground and fell asleep.

The next second, Qin Feng waved to the four of them.

Four white lights flew out from the heads of the four people.

Qin Feng flicked his index finger, and the white light shattered

"OK! Some of the memories of these four people have been deleted by me!", Qin Feng said calmly.

After his soul power strength broke through to the emperor level, memory scanning was upgraded 
to memory control.

Memory control: an emperor level soul skill, which can delete and disrupt the memory in the past 
five days.

Qin Feng Some recent memories of these four people have just been deleted.

"Master, is this really okay?", Yu Qilin swallowed her saliva.

Qin Feng's methods made her feel incredible.



"You’ll know after you try it!"

Qin Feng smiled slightly and waved his hand, and the four Hunter Kings automatically flew up and 
returned to their seats.

Then, he disappeared.

The next second, the illusion was lifted.

The four Hunter Kings suddenly woke up.

This As soon as they woke up, the four of them were stunned for a while.

The hunting king stood up directly and said:"Jade Qilin, if you don't tell me, I won't accompany 
you!"

The expression was very impatient.

Yu Qilin was stunned.

Immediately, her eyes flashed with joy, and she was even more amazed at Qin Feng's methods.

The old guy's memory was indeed deleted.

He didn't remember Qin Feng coming at all.

"Lord Hunting King, Lord Feng Yu King asked me to summon everyone here!", Jade Qilin said 
suddenly.

The Hunter King frowned and felt even more unhappy.



After all, he was also the third person among the kings, and his status was only under King Feng Yu 
and King Thunder.

How could King Feng Yu let this girl convey orders? Instead of yourself?

"What did Lord Feng Yu King say?", the Hunting King asked in a deep voice.

The other three kings also looked at Yu Qilin curiously.

Yu Qilin said:"Master Feng Yu King said that he may have to stay on the earth for a while. Exactly 
how long it will take is not yet certain."

"During his absence, everything here is managed by Lord Hunter. Everyone must obey the 
arrangements of Lord Hunter King!"

After hearing these words, the Hunter King's complexion gradually softened, and joy flashed across 
his eyes.

Sure enough, he still has prestige.

"So that’s what happened! Jade Qilin, just reply to Master Yuwang. When he is away, I will manage 
this place well..." The

Hunting King was in a good mood and his tone became kind.

He is a person who attaches great importance to fame and fortune.

"Lord Hunter, I will convey it in a moment!", Yu Qilin smiled.

"We will also obey the Lord Hunter King’s arrangements!"

The other three kings also agreed.



"Ha ha!! Everyone! If nothing happens, just leave!", the hunter king said with a smile

"By the way, what did Mr. Feng Yu King do on Earth?", a king patted his head in confusion.

He felt that his memory was not very good recently, and he could not remember some things 
clearly.

Yu Qilin smiled and said:"Sir King of Swords, Lord Wind and Rain King went to the earth to 
investigate. News about Qin Feng, have you forgotten this?"

"oh! Yes! Yes! I remembered!", the sword king suddenly realized

"Ha ha! Sword King, you have a bad memory recently! I even forgot about this!"

The other kings all laughed.

They didn't realize that part of their memory had been deleted.

A proud smile appeared on Yu Qilin's lips.

Then, the kings dispersed.

A quarter of an hour later, in Yu Qilin's boudoir.

The door Close it tightly and open the barrier.

In the room, Qin Feng sat leisurely on the sofa, enjoying Yu Qilin massaging his shoulders.

The delicate technique made him feel very comfortable

"Sect Master, those guys don’t even remember what the God Emperor told them, and they also 
forgot about the loss of contact with more than thirty informants. Now it’s interesting."



Yu Qilin walked around the sofa, sat down, and began to rub Qin Feng's legs.

Qin Feng enjoyed the beauty's service with a smile on his lips.

He deleted the memories of those people so that they would not remember the loss of contact 
between the eyeliners.The message from the God-Emperor was forgotten.

In this way, these people will not continue to explore the earth.

The destruction of the Heavenly Monument of Creation will not be exposed

"Sect Master, the hidden danger here has been eliminated. But what about the God Emperor? Do we 
still have to reply?"

Yu Qilin was a little worried again.

Qin Feng smiled:"I have a way to deal with this matter. Let’s not discuss this first, let’s solve the 
second question, where is the headquarters of the Star Alliance?"

Yu Qilin put Qin Feng's leg on her thigh.

She massaged it and said:"The headquarters address is far away! In fact, if you want to apply for the 
fifth-level star field, you don't need to go to the headquarters. Just go to the Eastern Branch and 
apply for promotion!"

"Eastern Division?"

Yu Qilin explained:"Yes! The Star Alliance is so big that it is divided into five major regions: East 
Region, West Region, South Region, North Region, and Central Region."

"Each region is managed by a star domain lord, who governs thousands of star domains. These star 
fields are divided into five levels. Among them, the fifth-level star field is the lowest and the first-
level star field is the highest."



"The Earth Star Domain and the dozens of star domains under the name of the Coma Lord are all 
under the management of the Alliance's Eastern Region. Therefore, you are going to advance to the 
Earth Star Domain. Just go directly to the Eastern Branch to report."

"The fifth-level star field ranking assessment you are going to take part in is also held in the Eastern 
District. Qin

Feng nodded slightly:"Then how do I get to the Eastern Branch?""

"This is about to take a ride on the interstellar spacecraft! We only have the manpower to fly, but we 
don’t know how long it will take to arrive!"

"We don’t have this thing on earth."Qin Feng was a little worried.

Yu Qilin smiled and said:"You don't have it on Earth, but I know who has it?"

"who? Are you organized?"

"Our flying boat is still in the hands of the God Emperor. He has already driven to the headquarters 
of the Hun Organization. You can't get it for the time being. What I want to say is, the one of the 
Star Orcs."

Qin Feng's eyes lit up.

That's right!

If there was no interstellar spaceship, how could the starry sky beasts come here?

The starry sky is so vast that it is far beyond human imagination.

"Where is the flying boat of the Star Orcs? I didn't find it at their location."



Yu Qilin smiled and said:"This starry sky beast clan is very cunning! They had gone to war with 
your Earth before, and they were worried that the spaceship would be damaged, so they did not stop 
the interstellar spacecraft on the moon."

"After our secret investigation, their spacecraft stopped at the Mars sub-station. Qin

Feng smiled:"It seems that it is necessary for me to go to Mars, and then kill the remnant of the 
Gale Emperor!""

He must get the interstellar spaceship.

He wants to advance to the fifth-level star field, so he needs this means of transportation.

Besides, by swallowing the origin of the Gale Emperor, he can overcome the tribulation, and he will 
also have the opportunity to advance to the fifth-level star field. Domain is qualified..
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"By the way, just having a flying boat is not enough, right? There should be a star map, otherwise 
how would I find the Eastern Branch?"

Qin Feng glanced at the jade unicorn.

This woman exudes a faint fragrance.

"Sect Master, generally star maps are hidden in interstellar ships, so there is no need to worry about 
this."

"In fact, as long as the sect leader has the strength to dominate and a star map, he can easily reach it 
even without a flying boat. The speed of the ruler is much faster than that of a flying boat…."

Yu Qilin looked at Qin Feng with some obsession.

In her eyes, Qin Feng is destined to become a dominant figure



"These are too far away! My current goal is to become the Great Emperor first…..".Qin Feng 
smiled and pinched Yu Qilin's pretty face.

"I have to go now!"

"Master, why don't you take a rest before leaving?"

Yu Qilin's tone was leisurely.

"I have to deal with the matter of King Feng Yu. This is business and cannot be delayed!"

"Okay!", Yu Qilin looked resentful.

Qin Feng then stood up, took one step in the air, and disappeared into the room.…….

At the same time, on Earth, Yunyang City.

Inside the city lord's palace.

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were sitting leisurely in the office.

Both of them looked happy.

Just now, they got good news.

Shangguan Yunxi and Liu Yan were both designated as core apprentices.

One is the core apprentice of alchemy, and the other is the core apprentice of weapon refining.

The two of them were happy about this for a while

"City Lord, what is the identity of this core apprentice?"



Wei Qing asked curiously

"Not sure!" Shangguan Yunyang took out a cigarette.

Wei Qing quickly lit it for him.

"However, this name is not simple when you hear it, and your future achievements and status will 
definitely be extraordinary..."

Shangguan Yunyang blew out a smoke ring beautifully.

"I think so! Speaking of which, these two girls are very competitive and have achieved good 
results!" Wei Qing also took a deep breath of cigarette.

Shangguan Yunyang tapped his fingers on the table and said meaningfully:"Brother Wei, don't you 
think this is a bit strange?"

"oh? What's weird?"Smoke came out of Wei Qing's nostrils.

Shangguan Yunyang whispered:"Although I don't know the identity of the core apprentice, the tone 
above seems to be very noble."

"Logically speaking, Liu Yan and Xi'er's results cannot lead to promotion to core apprentices.…."

Shangguan Yunyang paused when he said this.

If Liu Yan and Shangguan Yunxi hadn't gone to the Qinmen headquarters, he would have come to 
ask.

Wei Qing seemed to have thought of something and whispered:"City Lord, do you mean that 
Emperor Qin secretly helped?"

"That should be it... I never thought that that young boy could achieve what he has now.…."



The figure of Qin Feng appeared in Shangguan Yunyang's mind, and he couldn't help but sigh.

"yes! I haven't seen their brothers and sisters for a long time, and I don't know what they look like 
now..."

Wei Qing also fell into memories, with a smile on his face.

"Brother, we had a good vision back then!"

"Ha ha!! Of course! The thing I am most proud of in my life is this..." Wei Qing said proudly.

The two looked at each other and smiled.

When the Qin Feng brothers and sisters were in Yunyang City, they were very optimistic about this 
pair of brothers and sisters. They also took great care of them.

At this moment, footsteps sounded outside the office.

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were alarmed and turned to look.

Creak~!

The door was pushed open!

A beautiful girl walked in, followed by Followed by a four or five-year-old little girl.

This was Chu Chu and Qin Baobao.

Shangguan Yunyang was stunned for a moment.

Chu Chu was now much taller and more beautiful, and her appearance had changed a lot.



He didn't recognize it at first sight. come out

"Is it Miss Chu Chu?!", Wei Qing was a little surprised

"Deputy City Lord Wei, don’t you recognize me?", Chu Chu walked in with a smile

"It’s really Miss Chuchu!", Wei Qing was overjoyed and stood up quickly

"Miss Chuchu... No! No! Princess Chuchu, why are you here?!"

Shangguan Yunyang jumped up with a look of surprise.

When old friends meet, there is always an unexpected joy.

Both of them were sincerely happy and quickly entertained them warmly.

On the other side of the office, there were sofas and coffee tables.

Wei Qing entertained Chu Chu Sit down.

Shangguan Yunyang went to make tea himself.

Qin Baobao looked at the office curiously.

"Princess Chu Chu, who is this cute little sister?"

Shangguan Yunyang put the hot tea on the coffee table in front of Chu Chu and looked at Qin 
Baobao with a smile.

This little girl is so cute.



"The Lord of Yunyang City is an old friend. Just call me Miss Chu Chu as before.…"

"This is impossible!"

"Nothing can be done…."

"well….."

Shangguan Yunyang was a little at a loss, but he was still happy in his heart.

"Auntie, where are the bad guys?"

Qin Baobao's little hands pulled Chu Chu's clothes, and his big eyes turned darkly.

"Who is this beautiful little doll?", Wei Qing looked at Qin Baobao with a kind expression.

"This is my brother's child!"

Shangguan Yunyang and the two were shocked.

"It turns out to be the little princess!"

Qin Baobao is already famous, and the two of them have heard about it a little bit.

"I heard there are bad people here, and I'm here to fight them. Grandpa, where are the bad guys?"

Qin Baobao looked at Wei Qing with a childish look.

Wei Qing was stunned for a while.

Chu Chu smiled and said:"Don't listen to her, she doesn't understand yet..."



Wei Qing laughed.

The three of them chatted together..............

At the same time, on the streets of Yunyang City.

King Feng Yu looked at the scene on the street with a confused expression.

This place is completely different from his previous impressions!

I saw people coming and going everywhere on the street, speaking various dialects, and it seemed 
that there were people from the seven major alliances. The scene was very lively.

Among the crowd, he also saw many monsters with animal heads and human bodies.

Human beings, on the other hand, were not surprised at all when they saw the demon clan. 
Everyone was busy with their own business.

He even saw an elementalist and a demon clan bargainingWhat items are being traded.

And on the roadside not far away, a ferocious beast was lying lazily on the lawn, basking in the 
warm sun, feeling extremely comfortable.

Next to it, there were several human children playing, seemingly not afraid of the ferocious beast at 
all.

The atmosphere in the city is peaceful!

Damn it~!

Is this the earth?

King Feng Yu almost thought he was in the wrong place!



On Earth, aren’t the major human alliances mutually exclusive, and aren’t the human race and the 
monster race hostile to each other?

How come they are so harmonious now!

Weird! eccentric!

"Lord Yuwang, it’s so strange here!" King Lei was also confused.

King Feng Yu nodded slightly:"It seems that something happened on the earth. Walk! Let's go to the 
city lord's mansion and find the city lord of this base city. If you want to get the news, he is the best 
person to contact!

King Lei's eyes lit up:"Your Excellency, you are right!""

At that moment, the two of them rushed to the city lord's mansion..
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But he said this side, the City Lord’s Mansion.

In the office living room.

Shangguan Yunyang, Wei Qing and Chu Chu chatted happily.

Qin Baobao happily ate snacks on the side.

As for beating the bad guys!

She has long forgotten!

It's important for bad guys to eat snacks



"Miss Chuchu, I want to ask you something?", Shangguan Yunyang put out the cigarette butt in his 
hand.

"City Lord, just ask!"

"Well... I just want to ask, is the core apprenticeship of Yun Xi and Liu Yan arranged by His 
Majesty, right?"

Shangguan Yunyang asked with some embarrassment.

"this…..", Chu Chu hesitated whether to say it.

But at this moment, there were chaotic footsteps outside the door.

Bang~!

There was an explosion!

The office door was kicked open!

Sawdust is flying!

Everyone was startled and quickly turned their heads to look.

There were flashes of light and shadow outside the door.

Two arrogant figures walked in.

Walking in front was a middle-aged man with a lean face, it was King Feng Yu.

The sturdy Thunder King followed closely behind him



"Who are you? Why did you kick down the door of the city lord's office?!"

Wei Qing was furious, stood up and shouted:

"Ah! Something like an ant!"

King Feng Yu glanced at Wei Qing with disdain.

A five-star elemental master dared to yell in front of him.

He didn't even bother to look at it.

Then, he glanced at the others, and finally his eyes fell on Shangguan On Yunyang.

As for Chu Chu and Qin Baobao, he didn't see the depth of their cultivation, and he didn't care at 
all.

How powerful a thirteen or fourteen-year-old girl or a four or five-year-old baby could be, he didn't 
need to pay attention at all!

"Are you the lord of Yunyang City?!"

King Feng Yu looked at Shangguan Yunyang proudly.

This guy has the highest level of cultivation and should be the city lord.

"Who are you?" Shangguan Yunyang said with a gloomy face.

This guy has bad intentions!

"Don't care who I am? Just asking if you are the city lord?"



King Feng Yu is a little impatient.

He is now eager to know the reasons for the changes in the earth.

This journey has surprised him so much.

"good! I am the city lord!"

"Come and take a trip with me!" King Feng Yu's tone sounded like an order.

Shangguan Yunyang frowned:"Sorry! This city lord will not leave with you! Who are you?"

"Not leaving?!", King Feng Yu sneered.

Even a small six-star elemental master dared to refuse his order.

"Thunder King!"

"The subordinates are here!"

"Catch this guy! Kill everyone else!", King Fengyu ordered cruelly.

These words shocked Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing.

But at this moment, a milky voice sounded in the field.

"Do you even kill children?"

Fengyu King and Thunder King were stunned, and turned around to look.

They saw Qin Baobao looking at them curiously while eating Guoguo.



Those big black eyes were full of childlike innocence, as cute as they are..

King Feng Yu and King Thunder looked at each other with strange expressions.

This little kid really doesn’t understand anything!

Immediately, King Lei raised his mouth and said with a ferocious smile:"Hehe!! Baby, not only do 
we want to kill children, we also want to eat them. Children with tender skin and tender meat like 
you are our favorite!"

"Then you are the bad guys!"Qin Baobao asked seriously.

"Bad guy? That's right! We are the bad guys! Ha ha!!" King Lei couldn't help laughing.

King Fengyu couldn't help but smile.

This little baby is really childish!

"Hurrah! I'm here to fight bad guys! I'm going to crush you!"

Qin Baobao waved his pink little fists.

King Thunder and King Fengyu were both crazy with joy.

Whose silly child is this?

How dare you beat them.

They are aloof kings.

"Ha ha!! Little baby, you want to beat me! come!", King Lei said with a sinister smile.



"This is what you asked for!"

Qin Baobao secretly glanced at Chu Chu.

Chu Chu nodded slightly, indicating that he could take action.

Qin Baobao was happy.

Although she was naughty, she still knew how to behave.

The little girl jumped up all of a sudden,

"Bad guy! I'll beat you up now! Take my punch!"

Qin Baobao threw away the fruit in his hand and rushed over.

King Lei smiled sinisterly, stretched out his palm as big as a leaf fan, and slapped Qin Baobao 
fiercely.

At that moment, the power of the Eight-Star King filled the whole place.

Shangguan The expressions of Yunyang and Wei Qing changed greatly.

Oh my God!

This man is actually the Eight-Star King!

No!

Baby Qin is in danger!

Shangguan Yunyang and the other two were so frightened that their expressions changed.



But in an instant, Baobao Qin had already rushed there In front of Thunder King.

Thunder King's big palm has fallen, and the surrounding space is shaking.

His palm was shot with all his strength!

There is no mercy!

He wants to shoot this little baby into meat paste!

Thinking of the bloody and cruel scene, He couldn't help but be excited!

It's over!

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were so frightened that their faces changed, and they couldn't 
bear to watch any more.

At this moment, Qin Baobao's little fist collided with the Thunder King's big hand..Boom~!

There was a shocking loud noise.

All the tables and chairs within a hundred meters were instantly shattered into powder. King Lei 
screamed miserably, and was knocked out by Qin Baobao so much that he vomited blood and flew 
backwards. His body penetrated the office wall and fell into the yard..

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were stunned for a moment.

King Feng Yu was also dumbfounded!

What the hell is this?

"And you bad guy! I'm going to beat you up too!"



Qin Baobao rushed towards King Fengyu again.

King Fengyu was horrified, this kid is not simple.

He immediately became full of momentum and reached the level of transcending tribulation in an 
instant.

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were shocked again.

This was actually a crossing. The super master of the calamity period!

But the next second, there was another loud noise!

King Fengyu was also punched away by Qin Baobao, vomiting blood and flying directly into the 
yard.

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were dumbfounded again!

At this time, Qin Baobao rushed out of the office.

Soon the pitiful screams of King Fengyu and King Thunder could be heard in the yard, as well as 
the sound of fists hitting the flesh. They were beaten like this for a long time, and the throats of 
King Fengyu and King Thunder were almost hoarse.

Shangguan Yunyang was shocked to hear what he heard.

Wei Qing also felt his own body aching. After a long time , the sounds outside gradually stopped.

Chu Chu put down the tea cup leisurely and said:"Let's go! Let’s go outside and have a look!"

Then, she walked out calmly.



Shangguan Yunyang and the other two followed closely.

After a while, the three of them arrived in the courtyard.

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were completely dumbfounded when they saw the scene in the 
courtyard clearly!

Feng Yu Wang and Lei Wang were really beaten flat.

I saw that these two people were beaten into a flat layer, as thick as cardboard, completely inhuman 
shape, and just paralyzed there like a gossamer, motionless. Fortunately, both of them were The 
eight-star king, if replaced by a low-level elementalist, would have been dead long ago.

"Auntie, look! I've beaten the bad guy to pieces!"

Qin Baobao patted the dust on his body and proudly asked Chu Chu for credit.

"Well done!"

Chu Chu smiled and touched the baby's little head. After all, this child is still young and has some 
kindness in his heart.

Otherwise, King Feng Yu and King Thunder would have been killed long ago, and they would not 
be half dead like this.

You know, even if it is Even the Nine-Star Emperor is no match for Qin Baobao.

If she really has the intention to kill, she can kill the two Fengyu Kings with a snap of her fingers.

But Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing took a deep breath.

They looked at Qin Baobao, their eyes filled with excitement. Showing a weird look.



This little princess is so scary!

"You...you...who are you?"

King Feng Yu looked at Chu Chu and Qin Baobao angrily, with fear in his eyes.

At this moment, the space fluctuated.

An extremely handsome young man appeared above everyone.

Qin Feng is here!

"elder brother!", Chu Chu looked at Qin Feng excitedly

"dad! I beat the bad guy to pieces!"

Qin Baobao proudly reported his achievements to Qin Feng.

"Yes..it's you!"Feng Yu King recognized Qin Feng at a glance, with despair on his face...

Qin Feng flicked his index finger and fired two fires of chaos, instantly turning Feng Yu King and 
Thunder King into ashes, even their souls were burned. Not leaving a trace of breath.

After the death of King Feng Yu, a storage ring and a divine feather were left in the field. Qin Feng 
waved his hand and all the items were in hand.

He glanced at the divine feather and his eyes showed joy.

This is actually the nine-star wind divine feather, which is exactly what he needs.

He has already collected four of the divine feathers he wants to collect!..

Chapter 374



Qin Feng put away Shen Yu and checked the Feng Yu King's storage ring.

After a while, he found the messenger jade talisman of King Feng Yu from inside.

Then, after he found the jade talisman mark of the God Emperor from the jade talisman, he sent 
some false news to the God Emperor in the name of King Feng Yu.

King Thunder's storage ring was also dealt with by him.

After completing these trivial matters, Qin Feng fell from the sky

"I have met His Majesty!"

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing excitedly stepped forward to salute. They were extremely 
emotional when they met old friends. The boy who came out of the refugee area was now beyond 
their reach.

The huge identity difference made the two of them sigh at the same time. Also feel cautious

"Long time no see, two brothers!"

When old friends met, Qin Feng was inexplicably happy.

"It’s been a long time since we last seen each other, and His Majesty’s style is even better than 
before!" Shangguan Yunyang felt sincerely.

Wei Qing smiled at the side.

Qin Feng also smiled and said:"You two brothers should know that I have been in Nandu City, why 
don't you go and see me? Shangguan

Yunyang said hurriedly:"Your Majesty is busy with everything, so how dare we bother you?""



"yes! Your Majesty is satisfied if he can take the time to see us.", Wei Qing stroked his long beard

"The two brothers are both old friends, so there is no need to be formal. There is no need to call me 
Your Majesty today, just call me by my first name!"

"This is impossible!"

"yes! Your Majesty, you are the most powerful person in the world. We cannot wait, and we dare 
not!"

Shangguan Yunyang and the two became nervous.

"You two don’t have to be like this! Qin Feng came to Yunyang City today because he wanted to 
meet his old friends and talk about the past. Can't the two brothers satisfy Qin Feng's wish?"

"This... is fine! Yunyang dared to call His Majesty Qin Feng again today. After today, Your Majesty 
is still Your Majesty!"

"now it's right!", Qin Feng smiled boldly

"Your Majesty, please move to your residence and I will welcome you!"

"Brother, have you forgotten again? Just call me Qin Feng today!"

Hearing this, Shangguan Yunyang smiled awkwardly.

Wei Qing said hurriedly:"City Lord, it's better to prepare something for the house quickly and ask 

the servants to prepare a banquet and wait for us to return.….，"

Shangguan Yunyang nodded:"That's right!"

Soon, the group left.



Half an hour later, Shangguan Yunyang held a banquet at home and warmly entertained the Qin 
Feng brothers and sisters.

Of course, there is also Qin Baobao, a gluttonous foodie.

The group of people chatted happily.

After drinking and eating, Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing accompanied Qin Feng around the 
city.

Qin Feng and Chu Chu returned to their former residence.

Many buildings in the homeless area were empty, and there were not even one or two familiar faces.

Nowadays, humans and monsters coexist peacefully, and the threat from the starry sky beasts has 
been eliminated.

Ordinary people no longer need to crowd into small refugee areas.

Some went to build new residences outside the city.

Some people also go to towns that were abandoned by humans earlier and rebuild their homes.

Even many demon clans have joined in the construction and built their homes together.

Survival is no longer a theme for people.

Powerful has become a new theme.

Everything is changing quietly.

Perhaps, if they come back a few years later, everything will be different.



Qin Feng and Chu Chu suddenly felt like time flies by

"Brother, come with me to Nandu!"

Above the sky, Qin Feng looked down at the entire Yunyang City.

The city was expanding outside, and the city was bustling with people.

"Your Majesty, this is my hometown and my roots. I can't bear to leave..."

Shangguan Yunyang overlooked the entire city, his eyes full of warmth.

He devoted his youth, blood, and half his life to Yunyang City....How could he be willing to leave!

"Where is brother Wei Qing?"

"Ha ha! I have been in love with Yunyang for half my life, how can I bear to let him stay alone in 
Yunyang City and die alone?…."

Qin Feng nodded slightly and sighed in his heart.

Everyone has their own needs, don’t force them

"You two, it’s time for me to leave!"

"Your Majesty, if you have time in the future, come and visit your hometown.…."

Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing both looked reluctant to leave.

"Will do!



Shangguan Yunyang hesitated for a moment and said,"Your Majesty, I have one more thing to ask 
your Majesty for help."…."

Qin Feng smiled and said:"It's rare for me to ask for help! Say it!""

"I also hope that Your Majesty can take care of Xi'er and Liu Yan who are far away in Nandu.…"

"You don’t need to tell me this, I will do it too"

"Thank you, Your Majesty!"

"Take care, you two!"

"Your Majesty, please take care of yourself!"

Both parties bid farewell

"Take this!"

Qin Feng waved and sent out a storage ring.

The next second, he teleported away with Chu Chu and Qin Baobao.

Seeing Qin Feng and Chu Chu really leaving, Shangguan Yunyang and Wei Qing were a little 
confused. sentimental

"Why! I left. I don’t know when Your Majesty will return to his hometown.….", Wei Qing sighed

"yes! Before leaving, His Majesty also gave you this storage ring.…."

Shangguan Yunyang's mind went to the storage ring and he was shocked.



Wei Qing was surprised:"City Lord, what's wrong? What did your Majesty give you?"

"See for yourself!" Shangguan Yunyang handed over the ring.

Wei Qing took it and was shocked.

After a moment, he said with emotion:"Back then, we took special care of him and gave him more 
resources. Today, he has returned the favor a thousand times.….."

Shangguan Yunyang nodded:"His Majesty is a person who values love and justice! He is also the 
eternal pride of our Yunyang City!"

Under the setting sun, the figure's silhouette grew slantingly.

Both of them were deeply moved……..

At the same time, the distant dusk star field.

In a temple.

The God Emperor and the Hades Emperor were chatting.

At this moment, the God Emperor was in a very good mood.

Not long ago, he received a reply from King Feng Yu

"Lord God Emperor, has King Feng Yu responded to your message?", Hades Emperor asked 
curiously

"good!"

"How is the earth doing now?"



"Ah! It’s not the same as before! The nine emperors are all doing their own thing!", the corners of 
the God Emperor's mouth were slightly raised, and there was a hint of ridicule in his eyes.

The Hades Emperor also shook his head and said:"These stupid earthlings! I have never known how 
to unite! If nine of them gather together, it will be really difficult for us to deal with them. The God 
Emperor nodded:"

Of course!" The Nine-Star Emperor is not easy to kill! Nine stars versus nine stars, it is more 
difficult to kill the other party. If the nine of them get together again, even if there are many of us 
and there are puppets to help, there will still be some price to pay."

"Fortunately, those idiots on Earth are always fighting each other and are not united. We can defeat 
them one by one and catch them off guard!

The Hades Emperor said happily:"The God Emperor is right!" As long as we defeat them all, we 
should be able to achieve zero casualties... As long as the nine emperors are destroyed, the earth 
will be ours!"

"No!"The God Emperor shook his head and said,"We can't keep those eight stars either. By the way, 
those Earth geniuses should also be killed. For example, that Qin Feng! This kid has so much 
potential, there are hidden dangers if you keep it!"

Pluto Emperor nodded:"That boy's potential is indeed extraordinary. He at least has the potential of 
a great emperor. If he doesn't die, he will definitely lead the people on earth to rebel in the future!"

"rebel?!"The God Emperor sneered,"Those earth natives are only worthy of being slaves! By the 
way, when will the Plague Demon Emperor arrive at the headquarters?!"

"He can arrive tomorrow! The God Emperor was overjoyed:"

As soon as he arrives, everyone will be here." We can also start our journey!"

The Hades Emperor also showed joy..
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But on the other side, Qin Feng and the others quickly returned to Nandu City.

At this moment, in the palace

"Brother, have you finished dealing with the God Emperor?", Chu Chu asked with concern

"Finished for now"

"Brother, then we should do something about it. The God Emperor is coming to invade the earth 
this time.

Qin Feng nodded slightly:"I have a plan in mind!" In fact, the God Emperor is not difficult to deal 
with, but the faint master behind him is difficult to deal with! Hearing this

, Chu Chu suddenly felt worried:"Brother, what should I do?" Qin

Feng smiled slightly:"There's nothing to worry about!" As long as I destroy the God Emperor and 
promote the Earth's star field to the fifth-level star field as quickly as possible, I will be protected by 
the alliance."

"At that time, the master of darkness will not be able to do anything to us. He would not violate the 
rules of the alliance for the sake of a god-emperor. Besides, they were the ones who started this 
matter."

"right!", Chu Chu nodded repeatedly, feeling that it made sense.

But then, she said with a sad look on her face:"Brother, promotion to the fifth-level star field 
requires a strong man with emperor-level strength. Our earth does not have such a strong man yet! 
Qin

Feng smiled slightly:"Don't worry about this. As long as I complete the tribulation, I should be able 
to do it." Chu Chu was shocked:"

Brother, you are so strong!""



Qin Feng smiled and said nothing.

Then he said:"Our biggest problem now is that we need an interstellar spaceship. Without the 
interstellar spaceship, we would not be able to reach the Eastern District of the Star Alliance, and it 
would be difficult to advance to the Earth Star Territory level!!"

"Brother, where can I find this interstellar spaceship?"

"On Mars! Gale Emperor has one on hand, so I'm planning to go to Mars recently... Okay! You have 
been in retreat recently and worked hard to break through. When the God-Emperor arrives, a battle 
is inevitable!"

"oh! I see!"

"Go for it!"

After sending Chu Chu away, only Qin Feng and Qin Baobao were left in the room.

"Dad, where is Mars? I also need to go!" Qin Baobao asked in a sweet voice.

Qin Feng pinched her little face full of collagen, smiled and said:"Okay! Dad takes you there!"

"OK!", Qin Baobao jumped for joy,"Dad, shall we set off today?"

"Not urgent! Dad will take you to a place first. Let's get some good stuff first, then go to Mars…."

"Um!"

"Let's go!"

Qin Feng made a casual move, and the two of them disappeared into the room.

The next second, the two of them appeared over the ocean near Antarctica.



This sea area was deserted.

"Baby, there are some dangers in the place you are going to go soon, so you have to be obedient!"

"Know it! dad!", Qin Baobao nodded obediently

"bring it on! Psychic fusion!"

Qin Feng thought, and the Chaos Transformation was activated.

In an instant, the world changed color.

Qin Feng instantly turned into a thousand-foot giant, his momentum skyrocketed, and his combat 
power surged from 90 billion to 117 billion.

That powerful aura pulled the surrounding time and space. All twisted.

Qin Baobao also roared, turned into a golden dragon, hovered in the air, and then got into Qin 
Feng's body and disappeared.

The next second, Qin Feng's nails grew automatically, became sharper and longer, and appeared on 
his arms, legs, and Golden dragon scales appeared on the body...

After a moment, countless dragon scales came out of the body and automatically fused to form a 
golden dragon armor with extremely smooth assembly lines, which was put on Qin Feng.

The golden dragon armor had tall shoulders and a mask. A pair of eyes are left exposed, and there is 
a red cloak on the back, which is stretched out in the wind, very powerful and domineering!

This dragon armor is very special. Even if it is damaged in the battle, it will repair itself. It is 
formed by the dragon scales on Qin Baobao's body.

This is completed After the psychic fusion, Qin Feng's combat power skyrocketed to 147 billion!



Qin Feng was overjoyed.

With such combat power, he dared to fight against a strong man who had just broken through to the 
level of the Great Emperor.

This psychic technique is indeed extremely powerful!

"Dad, let's go!"

Qin Feng's lovely voice sounded in Qin Feng's mind.

After the psychic fusion, Qin Feng was absolutely dominant, but Qin Baobao could still 
communicate with him.

"Let's go!"

Qin Feng shrank to the size of an ordinary person, and with one step, he disappeared above the vast 
sea.

A quarter of an hour later, he appeared deep in the mysterious cave in the center of the earth.

At this moment, he stood at the last end point, where It's in the middle of the pool.

The spiritual liquid in the pool has long since disappeared. It's dark all around, and the air is 
actually a bit cold.

"Huh! Why is it missing?"

Qin Feng looked around suspiciously.

Last time, the base of the Creation Sky Monument that appeared at the bottom of the pool was also 
missing.



"Dad, it’s so dark in here!", Qin Baobao's voice sounded in his mind

"Is the baby afraid?"

"Dad is here! The baby is not afraid!"

Qin Feng smiled and walked deep into the cave.

The cave was dark and the surroundings were quiet.

I wonder if the monster in the cave has fallen asleep?

Qin Feng walked forward carefully.

The monster was extremely scary.

Even if he The combined strength was no match for him, so he naturally had to be careful.

Unknowingly, he walked nearly a hundred meters into the cave, and a spiritual flower appeared in 
front of him.

The flower had nine petals and nine colors, and the leaves were green and fragrant. Overflowing

"Ding! Congratulations to the host for discovering the emperor-level spiritual flower - Jiulin 
Flower….."

"Huh! It’s this treasure!"

Qin Feng was pleasantly surprised. He quickly stepped forward, picked the spiritual flowers and put 
them away carefully.

"Dad, what is this?", Qin Baobao is very curious.



"This is Jiulin Flower, which can be used to refine Jiulin Pill. Jiulin Pill is used to temper the origin 
of elements and improve cultivation. A Jiulin Pill is as effective as a Xingxi Stone"

"What's even more valuable is that Xingxi Stone also has various properties. There is no need to 
distinguish the attributes of this Jiulin Pill, it can be used in all nine systems."

"With just such a flower, if you are lucky, you can refine five Jiulin Pills, which is equivalent to five 
Xingxi Stones."

Qin Feng became more and more excited as he talked.

His alchemy skills will also be put to use.

"Dad, is Jiulin Pill sweet?"

"Forehead….", Qin Feng was speechless.

Children's concerns are different from those of adults.

Qin Feng continued to move forward.

Not long after, he discovered another Jiulin flower.

Qin Feng was delighted, put away the spirit flower, and moved on.

Not long after, he discovered the third Jiulin flower…..

In this way, Qin Feng walked all the way.

He walked nearly 10,000 meters in one breath and collected more than 200 Jiulin flowers.

This time I really made a lot of money.



However, Qin Feng was also surprised.

He walked for so long without noticing any movement deep inside the cave.

He couldn't figure out whether the monster from last time was asleep or missing?

Qin Feng was confused and continued to move forward.

Not long after, he saw another spiritual plant.

It was a green spiritual fruit that exuded strong fluctuations of wood energy and had a light fruity 
fragrance.

"Ding! Congratulations to the host for discovering the Yinmu Spirit Fruit (Emperor Level),…..After 
swallowing, you can get the true meaning of wood….."

"found it!"

Qin Feng was pleasantly surprised.

Everything was as he expected.

He came to the cave this time just for this spiritual fruit.

His true meaning of the Five Elements lacked the true meaning of the wood.

If he can get the true meaning of the wood again, the second kind will be useless. You can get it if 
you show your true intention.

Qin Feng walked towards the spirit fruit excitedly..

Chapter 376



Soon, Qin Feng walked to the spiritual fruit and picked it off

"Ding! It is detected that the host already possesses one supreme true meaning and four ordinary 
true meanings, and the success rate of swallowing the Yinmu Spirit Fruit is reduced to 8%..."

"Sure enough!"

Qin Feng had already expected it.

It is indeed the most difficult to obtain the last true meaning of the Five Elements.

It seems that he needs to refine a few more wood-type Enlightenment Pills.

"Dad, this fruit is so delicious. Can you give it to me?"

The sound of Qin Baobao swallowing saliva sounded in Qin Feng's mind.

The little guy was greedy.

"I can't give this to you. Dad still has something to use.…"

"oh…"

"Let's go further inside. There should be fruits you want to eat.…."

Qin Feng put away the Yinmu Spirit Fruit and continued walking inside.

The temperature inside the cave is getting higher and higher, exceeding 10,000 degrees, and the 
cave begins to become extremely dry.

After walking about a few hundred meters, a red light appeared in front of me.



Qin Feng took a closer look and saw that it was a crystal clear red crystal.

"Ding! Congratulations to the host for discovering the emperor-level spiritual material——
Huoyaojing….."

"Another treasure found!"

Qin FengHe happily put away the Fire Crystal.

This fire crystal is a good material for refining weapons.

The heaven-tempered gold he obtained before was also a weapon refining material.

Due to insufficient auxiliary materials, the two Heavenly Fire Halberds he refined with Heavenly 
Tempered Gold only reached the pseudo-emperor level.

Now that he has this fire crystal, he might be able to refine the real imperial weapon.

Today, tempered gold and fire crystal are the main materials, and what is refined should be a fire-
type imperial weapon.

The figurines of Yue'er, Qin Baobao, and the two fire demon generals can all be used, which will 
greatly help improve their combat power.

Thinking of this, Qin Feng was in a good mood and continued to search.

It didn't take long for him to find the second Fire Crystal…..

In this way, Qin Feng unknowingly went deep into the cave 20,000 meters deep.

He has found more than one hundred pieces of Huo Yaojing.

The repulsive force in the cave has reached more than 120 billion.



Qin Feng gradually felt more and more pressure.

The strange thing is that he still didn't sense the monster from last time.

Deep inside the cave, like an abyss, there is silence

"Has the monster left?"

Qin Feng was confused and continued to go deeper into the cave.

Not long after, he made another discovery.

Next to a large piece of fire crystal, he saw a fiery red spiritual fruit growing, exuding an extremely 
attractive fragrance.

"Ding! Congratulations to the host for discovering the Lihuo Spirit Fruit (Emperor Level),…..After 
swallowing, you can get the true meaning of fire…..

"Ha ha!! found it!"

Qin Feng walked over in surprise.

These Five Elements True Spirit Fruits are indeed arranged in the order of the five elements: earth 
produces gold, gold produces water, water produces wood, and wood produces fire.

The last one to appear is the fire element fruit.

Qin Feng Quickly walked to the spiritual fruit and carefully picked it off

"Dad, this red fruit smells so good! Can I eat this?"

"Can! This is for you!"



"Wow! Dad is so kind!"

Qin Feng's mind rang with Qin Baobao's cheers.

"However, this will have to wait until we go out before I can eat it for you."

"OK!"Baby Qin is extremely well-behaved.

Qin Feng smiled, carefully put away the spirit fruit, and let out a sigh of relief.

Basically everything he wanted was obtained.

This Lihuo spirit fruit is the most suitable for the baby to eat.

Because he You have understood the true meaning of fire and do not need the spirit fruit.

And the baby is of the fire system and has reached the stage of transcending tribulation. You can 
take the spirit fruit of Lihuo. If you want to obtain the true meaning, you need at least the 
cultivation level of the stage of transcending tribulation. Baby This condition has been met.

Besides, after the baby understands the true meaning of the fire system, his strength will definitely 
increase.

This will be of great help to his improvement of strength.

"Dad, when are we going out?"

The sound of the baby swallowing saliva sounded in Qin Feng's mind.

The little guy was already so greedy.



Qin Feng smiled:"Don't worry! Let’s go ahead and take a look inside! There should be treasures in 
this cave!"

"oh!"

At the moment, Qin Feng continued to walk inside, and the repulsive force in the cave continued to 
increase.

But this time, he advanced nearly 10,000 meters and found nothing. He did not find any treasures 
along the way.

Qin Feng was a little depressed.

Logically speaking, it should be The deeper you go into the cave, the more treasures there will be!

Qin Feng was confused and continued to go deeper.

After a hundred meters, he finally made a discovery.

The space in front seemed to have noticed changes.

As soon as he stepped over, the gravity around him suddenly increased. One hundred thousand 
times.

Boom~!

Qin Feng’s whole body sank.

All the bones in his body creaked.

"This is….", Qin Feng was shocked

"Dad, what's wrong?", Qin Baobao also felt it



"The surrounding gravity has increased by a hundred thousand times!", Qin Feng pondered,"It's 
possible that we are close to the center of the earth, hey! wrong….."

Qin Feng seemed to have discovered something, and suddenly raised his head and looked forward.

About a hundred meters ahead, there was something that looked like a stone, completely black, 
emitting a faint halo, and a strange force field.

It was also the force field emitted by the strange rocks that increased the surrounding gravity.

Qin Feng was curious and walked over quickly.

He lifted his foot and stepped forward.

Boom~!

Under the influence of 100,000 times gravity, he fell down and weighed as much as a million 
pounds.

The whole cave trembled.

Qin Feng continued to take the second step.

Boom~!

The earth trembles!

The cave shook!

Sand, dust and stone debris fell one after another on both sides of the cave wall.

Qin Feng continued to move forward.



He took two meters with each step.

Boom~! Boom~! Boom~！……

Continuously stride for fifty meters.

The gravity actually increased to half a million times.

The closer you get to the mysterious stone, the stronger the gravity becomes.

This thing is extraordinary!

"Ding! Congratulations to the host for discovering - Liangyi Yuan Magnet (Emperor Level, Super 
Quality)……….."

"It’s actually an emperor-level treasure! It’s still super high-quality!"

Qin Feng was excited.

This is definitely a treasure.

Although he doesn't know what it is used for, its value will definitely exceed the sum of the 
previous treasures.

No wonder he didn't see the treasure even if he went 10,000 meters deep. It turned out that it was 
within 10,000 meters. , this is the treasure.

The more Qin Feng thought about it, the more excited he became, and he continued to take a step 
forward.

Boom~!



The foot fell, weighing millions of kilograms.

The cave shook again.

Qin Feng lifted his foot and continued to move forward.

But at this moment, he Suddenly sensing something, he quickly raised his head and stared into the 
depths of the cave.

The depths of the cave were dark and silent, like an abyss.

But Qin Feng sensed that something seemed to be awakening in the abyss.

While he stared into the abyss.

The abyss stared back at him.

The atmosphere in the venue became tense..
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But Qin Feng sensed that something seemed to be awakening in the abyss.

While he stared into the abyss.

The abyss stared back at him.

The atmosphere in the field became tense and the two sides seemed to be confronting each other.

The next second, Qin Feng's eyes flashed and he kicked down.

Boom~!



The earth trembles!

Roar~!

There was a roar from the depths of the cave, like a demon.

Wherever the roar passed, the space was shattered.

This time, Qin Feng was closer to it.

The power of this sound wave was obviously more than twice as strong as the last time.

But Qin Feng only felt a surge of blood in his heart and did not suffer any harm.

The strength he came in this time was much stronger than last time, and he was already resistant to 
this sonic attack.

"Dad, what is that?"

"Ignore it! Get the treasure first!"

Qin Feng walked quickly towards Liangyi Yuan Magnet.

Boom.~！…Boom~！..Boom~！……

Qin Feng took more than ten steps in a row.

Roar~! Roar~! Roar!........

Deep in the cave, the demon kept roaring.

Sonic attack, one wave is as strong as the other!



Qin Feng was so shocked that his blood boiled.

But he still resisted.

Forty meters...thirty meters...seventeen meters....

In the blink of an eye, Qin Feng was only ten meters away from the Liangyi Yuan magnet, and its 
weight increased to 900,000 times.

At this time, the demon in the cave finally became anxious.

It roared, and its sonic attack power suddenly increased.

"kill!"

This time, the roar was no longer the roar of a beast, but the cry of a human being.

Qin Feng suddenly felt that the blood in his chest was frantic, and he almost wanted to vomit blood.

For a moment, he seemed to have fallen into a sea of blood.

There was a huge torrent in front of him. In the sea of blood, the roar of the God of Death could be 
heard in his ears.

Qin Feng was horrified:"What's going on? Could it be that there isn't a monster lurking deep in this 
cave? How does it look like a human being?"

"Dad, the monster is coming out!"

At this time, Qin Baobao exclaimed.

Qin Feng actually heard the sound of footsteps deep in the cave.



It was like the sound of human walking.

Qin Feng was startled and quickly stepped forward. In a moment, he walked to the Liangyi Yuan 
Magnet and grabbed the treasure with one hand. go

"kill!"

Another low roar came from the cave.

The overwhelming murderous intent came, and the sonic attack shook the earth.

The sky was filled with the illusion of a sea of blood!

Qin Feng's chest felt like a heavy hammer, and he couldn't help but groan.

But he still resisted, and at the same time he He picked up the Liangyiyuan magnet on the ground 
and put it into the storage ring.

The gravity field of nearly a million times disappeared all of a sudden.

Qin Feng's figure flashed and disappeared out of thin air.

Inside the cave, everything suddenly changed. It was empty.

The demon seemed stunned for a moment.

After a moment, an extremely angry roar sounded from deep in the cave, shaking the cave.

At this moment, the whole earth trembled inexplicably.

Hundreds of millions of people were horrified........



Nandu City.

The Phoenix Emperor, the White Tiger Emperor, the Xuanwu Emperor, the Whale Emperor and 
others flew out of the palace one by one and were suspended in the sky.

The emperors looked down at the earth, all panicked.

Their feelings are completely different from those of ordinary people.

Those people only saw the ground around them shaking.

Or maybe the river and the sea are roaring.

The emperors saw the whole earth trembling

"This...what the hell happened?"Emperor Xuanwu was a little panicked.

It can make the whole earth tremble, even if a few of them join forces, they can't do it.

Perhaps, only the emperor can do it!

My God!

Has the earth been attacked by the emperor?

This is impossible!

The emperors were horrified at this thought.

If the emperor really attacked, they would only be killed instantly.



The Nine-Star Emperor was like an ant in front of the emperor.

"Deputy Sect Leader, what's going on?"

The White Tiger Emperor looked at Emperor Feng with some uneasiness.

The emperors also looked over.

Emperor Feng also had uneasiness in his eyes.

The earth suddenly trembled, and it was obvious that it had been attacked by something........

Such a method is amazing

"Not sure! Let me ask the doorkeeper!", Emperor Feng immediately thought of Qin Feng

"Yes! Ask the doorkeeper!"

Fengdi quickly took out the communication jade talisman.

But at this moment, there was a fluctuation in the sky above everyone's heads.

"No need for subpoena! The sect leader is back!"

As soon as he finished speaking, Qin Feng and Qin Baobao appeared out of thin air.

"Door owner!"

"I’ve met the door owner!"

The emperors were pleasantly surprised and felt inexplicably relieved, as if they had suddenly 
found their backbone.



Unknowingly, the emperors became dependent on Qin Feng and became more in awe of Qin Feng.

"Your Majesty, why is this earth shaking suddenly?" Emperor Feng asked with concern.

Qin Feng said calmly:"Don't worry! It will calm down soon and that thing won't come out!"

As soon as he said these words, the tremors of the earth slowly subsided.

All the emperors were shocked.

The corners of Qin Feng's mouth curled up slightly, secretly thinking that this was indeed the case.

Although he did not confront the demon in the cave head-on, he got a glimpse of some details about 
the demon..

The demon's soul power is extremely weak, and it seems to have been severely injured, and it 
cannot fight for a long time at all.

Therefore, it will always fall asleep.

If it rushes out rashly, it is hard to say who will win and who will lose.

In fact, Qin Feng has already I saw through the demon's intention.

It was a bluff, scare yourself away and don't disturb it again.

"Is there any treasure deep in the cave that can restore soul power?"

Qin Feng suddenly came up with this weird idea.

The more he thought about it, the more he thought it was possible.



However, he is not the opponent of the monster yet.

After he has overcome the disaster, he will go to deal with the monster, and maybe there will be a 
big surprise.

Just here While Qin Feng was thinking wildly, the emperors looked down at the earth for a long 
time.

Sure enough, after the tremors of the earth stopped, it no longer trembled.

His Majesty, Emperor Qin, really hit the mark.

By the way, how did Emperor Qin know that the tremors of the earth would stop?

The emperors suddenly appeared This idea.

They thought of Qin Feng's previous words, saying that the thing would not come out. Could it be 
that…..

"Sect Master, this time the earth suddenly trembled, is it related to you?", Emperor Feng couldn't 
help but ask.

The emperors also looked at Qin Feng.

They were very concerned about this issue.

Making the earth tremble is the emperor's method.

"That’s right!", Qin Feng said calmly

"My dad almost got into a fight with that monster!", Qin Baobao suddenly interjected.



All the emperors were shocked and shocked.

Oh my god!

Did Emperor Qin fight with an emperor-level figure just now?

But Emperor Qin didn't seem to be injured!

The emperors looked at Qin Feng's His eyes became a little adoring

"It's okay, let's all disperse!"

Qin Feng still had something urgent to do, so he casually dropped these words and took Qin Baobao 
away.

Only the emperors were left standing there with sighs on their faces.………

A quarter of an hour later, Emperor Qin entered the palace and was in the hall.

Qin Feng and Qin Baobao got together and took stock of the harvest with satisfaction.

This time, Qin Feng gained a lot.

Especially the Liangyiyuan magnet, its value is inestimable!

However, he hasn't figured out how to use this treasure yet

"Baby, take this….."

Qin Feng casually handed over the Lihuo Lingguo

"What a delicious fruit! Dad is so kind!"



Baobao Qin took the red spirit fruit, opened his mouth and took a bite. Suddenly the juice 
overflowed from the corner of his mouth, and the fragrance overflowed.

"See how anxious you are! eat slowly! After eating the fruit, I went to find my aunt…."

"Why are you looking for aunt?"

Baobao Qin's little mouth was full.

Qin Feng said with a smile:"This is an emperor-level spiritual fruit. It will not be digested 
immediately after eating it. After you eat it, go to your aunt's time field to practice for a day. It will 
be of great benefit!"

"Wow! There are also great benefits! I'm going to find my aunt now!"

As soon as she heard that it was good, Qin Baobao ran away in a hurry.

Qin Feng looked at her lively back and smiled happily.

This little guy has not realized the true meaning yet.

Therefore, this spiritual fruit can make her realize it 100% The true meaning of fire.

By then, the little guy's strength will improve again.

Qin Feng couldn't help but look forward to it..
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"I guess this little guy can refine it in half a day.…."

Qin Feng muttered.



Chu Chu's time force field is ten times that of the outside world. Qin Baobao spent half a day 
refining in it, which is equal to five days in the outside world.

This was enough for her to digest the medicinal power of the spirit fruit.

Qin Feng made a casual move, and a green spiritual fruit floated in front of him. It was the Yinmu 
Spirit Fruit.

"The success rate is only 8%... I only have one wood-type Enlightenment Pill in my hand. With the 
bonus of the Enlightenment Pill, the success rate can be increased to about 20%.…."

"From this point of view, I need three or four wood-type Enlightenment Pills to possibly increase 
the success rate to over 50%.…."

"I wonder if there is a wood emperor among the people the God Emperor brought this time?"

Qin Feng silently put away the spirit fruit, and disappeared into the room in a flash.……

The next second, Qin Feng appeared in the former Qinglong League headquarters, now renamed 
Qinglong City.

It is one of the eight first-level cities under Qinmen.

At this moment, Qinglong City, the City Lord’s Mansion.

Xiao Qingfeng received Qin Feng respectfully.

In the city lord's office, Qin Feng was sitting on the office chair.

Xiao Qingfeng stood aside tremblingly.

After a female official brought a cup of hot tea, she was dismissed by Xiao Qingfeng.



Now, Xiao Qingfeng has broken through to eight stars.

He is also the first city lord of Qinglong City

"Your Majesty, why do you have time to see me today?"

Xiao Qingfeng asked respectfully.

He always felt very stressed when standing in front of Qin Feng.

He found that the current Emperor Qin had changed a lot.

Even sitting there quietly, he still had his own pressure and was awe-inspiring.

"This emperor is here today to arrange a secret mission for you!"

Qin Feng waved his hand, and a soundproof barrier was set up in the room.

Xiao Qingfeng looked solemn:"Your Majesty, tell me! The subordinates promise to complete the 
task!"

Qin Feng nodded slightly, very satisfied with Xiao Qingfeng's attitude.

"Take this!"

Qin Feng waved his hand, and a military talisman token flew into Xiao Qingfeng's hand.

"Your Majesty, what is this?"

"One of the talismans of the Emperor's puppet legion. With this talisman, you can control nine 
hundred fire demon terracotta warriors!"



"Ah..." Xiao Qingfeng was greatly shocked.

His Majesty's puppet army has long been famous all over the world.

The weakest of those fire demon terracotta warriors have the combat power of the Eight-Star Great 
Perfection Peak.

If he can control the nine hundred fire demon terracotta warriors, He dares to provoke the Nine-Star 
Emperor

"Your Majesty, my subordinates dare not accept such great military power!", Xiao Qingfeng 
panicked and refused.

"You don’t have to be afraid! Your mission is special and you must use them. how? Backed off?

Xiao Qingfeng was shocked:"I don't dare!" Since it is required for the mission, I will accept the 
soldier talisman for the time being! Xiao

Qingfeng carefully put away the military talisman, and then asked anxiously:"Your Majesty, what 
kind of secret mission is it?""

"look by youself!" Qin Feng threw a jade talisman casually.

Xiao Qingfeng caught it respectfully.

After he read it, a look of surprise appeared on his face.

After a moment, he hesitated and said:"Your Majesty, will the God Emperor be fooled?"

Qin Feng took a leisurely sip of tea and then said quietly:"You don't have to worry about these. You 
just need to execute the command!"

"Subordinates understand"



"Walk! Come with me to the Holy Land!", Qin Feng put down the teacup in his hand

"yes! His Majesty!"

At this moment, Xiao Qingfeng respectfully led the way and took Qin Feng to the Qinglong Holy 
Land.

A quarter of an hour later, the two entered the Holy Land.

Qin Feng made some secret arrangements inside, gave Xiao Qingfeng some instructions, and left.
………

After returning to Nandu City, he found Feng Emperor and Chu Chu again.

He handed over the control talismans of the headless golden man and the two fire demon figurines 
to Emperor Feng.

The talisman that controlled more than a hundred fire demon warriors in the Tribulation Period was 
handed over to Chu Chu.

He was like dividing the puppet army into three.

Then, he gave Yue'er and Chuchu some secret tasks.

After making these arrangements, Qin Feng stayed at Fengdi's palace that night.

This was a night of tenderness and sweetness.

The bright moon hangs high, the spring breeze stirs, everything is wonderful……

A night of silence.



Early the next morning, Qin Feng left the Feng Emperor's palace feeling refreshed and held a 
meeting of the emperors.

At this moment, the palace, the meeting hall.

The emperors were talking among themselves below, each with a worried look on their face.

Qin Feng sat on the dragon chair and watched the discussion calmly.

Qin Baobao was also present.

She actually took out a chair and sat in the corner of the hall, eating snacks by herself. Her mouth 
was as full as a hamster's, and she never stopped.

She didn't care at all about the issues discussed by the adults.

None of those problems were as important as her snacks.

Qin Feng also doted on her and let the little guy play aside.

It seems that Qin Baobao has refined the Lihuo Spirit Fruit and successfully obtained the true 
meaning of fire.

Her cultivation level has not changed much, but her combat power has increased to 33 billion.

This makes Qin Feng happy.

But at this time, the emperors discussed it for a long time.

The White Tiger Emperor said sadly:"Hey! I didn't expect that the Hun Organization is an 
organization from the outer star domain. The God Emperor and the Hades Emperor are even more 
ambitious and want to invade our earth!



". Your Majesty has just destroyed the Starry Sky Beast Clan, and the people from the Hun 
Organization are here again. What should we do?!"

It turns out that Qin Feng summoned the emperors early in the morning and made things simple for 
the God Emperor and the Hun Organization. I said it again to let everyone know the current 
situation of the earth.

After hearing this, the emperors were worried

"Your Majesty, as you said. The Hun Organization is much stronger than the Star Orcs. This time 
the God Emperor attacks, I'm afraid it will be difficult to deal with. Your Majesty, what should we 
do next?"

The Ice and Snow Emperor looked at Qin Feng with a worried look.

Qin Feng said proudly:"Don't worry, everyone! I don't know the other information, but one thing is 
for sure. Among the helpers brought by the God Emperor this time, there should be no Great 
Emperor. As long as there is no Great Emperor, there is nothing to be afraid of!"

After Qin Feng reminded him, the emperors' eyes lit up.

Yes!

His Majesty the Qin Emperor is unfathomable!

Perhaps, he already has the strength of the Great Emperor.

Even if not, it should be about the same.

The earth trembled yesterday was enough. This explains all this.

In other words, with Qin Feng here, what are they afraid of?



But at this moment, Qin Feng said again:"Although we are not afraid of the God Emperor's attack, 
there is still a problem. That is, if one of them sees that the situation is bad and escapes in an 
interstellar spacecraft, it will be bad."

"As far as I know, the interstellar spaceship is faster than the Emperor, and none of us can catch up. 
If one of them slips away and goes back to report the news, it will be a big trouble."

"Therefore, when they come this time, we must kill them all. In order to prevent some of them from 
escaping in a flying boat, we also need a flying boat here."

After hearing this, the emperors nodded slightly and felt that it made sense.

They must make careful preparations.

If someone really escapes in a flying boat, the one who will be brought here next time will be the 
emperor, and then the earth will be really dangerous.

"Your Majesty, are you planning to go to Mars?", Emperor Feng heard what Qin Feng meant.

"good!", Qin Feng nodded,"Wherever there is an interstellar spaceship from the Starry Sky Orcs, I 
must get it. What's more, if we want to advance to the fifth-level star field, we also need a"

"Your Majesty, at the speed of the Nine-Star Emperor, it would take more than a month to fly from 
the Earth to Mars, and the round trip would take two to three months. Will this be too long?"

The White Tiger Emperor was a little worried.

The emperors also nodded slightly.

If Qin Feng leaves the earth for too long and the God Emperor brings people to attack, they will be 
in trouble.

Now, Qin Feng is the backer of the earth and their support.



Without Qin Feng to guard it Earth, they are uneasy!

Qin Feng said lightly:"At my speed, it doesn't take that long, it can take up to ten days to return."

Hearing this, the emperors felt a little relieved.

Qin Feng said again:"The emperor is summoning you today because he has two things to arrange."

"The first thing is that when the Emperor is not on Earth, you must obey Feng Emperor’s orders. 
She will arrange everything!"

"I'll obey!"

The emperors agreed one after another

"The second thing is, during this period, everyone arranged for their subordinates to do their best to 
collect these medicinal materials!"

Qin Feng waved his hand, and a dozen jade talismans flew towards the emperors.

The emperors took a look and found that the materials inside were not particularly rare and were not 
difficult to collect.

It turned out that they were auxiliary materials for refining Jiulin Pill. A Jiulin Pill is comparable to 
a Xingxi Stone.

Qin Feng has more than 200 Jiulin Flowers on his body, so he naturally needs to refine them in 
large quantities.

Then these require a lot of auxiliary materials.

Of course, if Qin Feng refines them all, It will be of great benefit to his cultivation.



After reading the message, the emperors agreed one after another

"Don't worry, Your Majesty! We will do our best to search!"

Qin Feng nodded with satisfaction:"Okay! That concludes today's meeting! Without further ado, it’s 
time for me to set off! Baby, let's go!"

Qin Feng stood up and greeted Qin Baobao in the corner.

The little guy immediately followed behind.

A moment later, Nandu City was high up in the sky.

Qin Feng and Qin Baobao were sent off by the emperors. Flying out of the atmosphere..

Chapter 379

In the vast starry sky.

Qin Feng looked far away in the direction of Mars, thinking deeply in his heart.

I wonder when the God Emperor will return?

He once used King Fengyu's communication talisman to send a message to the God Emperor, but 
he failed to find out.

The God-Emperor was cautious and did not give any clear reply.

Qin Feng was afraid that the God Emperor would be suspicious, so he did not continue to inquire.

However, Qin Feng estimated that the God Emperor was about to set off.

Otherwise, he would not inquire about the current situation of the earth.



And it’s time for him to act quickly.

The starship must be obtained as soon as possible.

It is not only necessary to deal with people like the God Emperor, but also to deal with the Golden 
Crow Emperor.

He wants these people to never come back, otherwise there will be endless troubles.

"Dad, is there fire on Mars?" Qin Baobao asked in a milky voice.

"No fire! Just call that name!"

"oh~！"

"bring it on! Psychic fusion! It's time to go!"

"Um!"

Qin Feng's heart moved, chaos transformed, and his fighting power surged.

Qin Baobao turned into a golden dragon and penetrated into his body.

In a blink of an eye, the two completed the psychic fusion.

At this moment, Qin Feng was covered in golden armor, with bright light and high cloak. Zhan, 
flying in the wind, full of domineering.

His combat power and momentum also increased to 150 billion, which was stronger than last time. 
The next second, a pair of roc wings appeared behind him, which was thousands of feet long. Both 
pairs of wings appeared behind him.



Spread his wings!

The big roc spreads its wings—spread!

In an instant, he was ten thousand meters away.

The speed was so frightening that it was infinitely close to the emperor-level level.

At Qin Feng's current speed, it only takes five or six days to catch up. to Mars...............

Meanwhile, the solar system, Mars.

There is a large station next to a Martian mountain range.

Next to the station, there is also a mine.

From time to time, monsters with animal heads and human bodies come in and out of the mine, 
covered in mud.

This is where the Star Orcs are stationed on Mars.

Around the station, there are many beast monsters setting up formations, each one burying rune 
formation pillars and hiding them underground.

In the air, a handsome young man in white looked silently at the busy beast monsters below, with a 
hint of anxiety in his brows.

He is none other than the Gale Emperor.

At this moment, his face lost its previous calmness.

Behind him, a capable black-bearded old man followed respectfully.



This old man is the leader of this place - Leopard Wild King

"Your Majesty, we have accelerated the mining of all mines in accordance with your instructions"

"In addition, the three thousand rune pillars of the Thousand Fantasy Jueying Formation have all 
been engraved. Now only the process of setting up the formation is left. It is expected that the 
formation will be set up this afternoon!"

Baoye King reported the progress of the work seriously.

Gale King nodded slightly, and the anxiety between his brows faded a little.

In the past half month, he was terrified.

When he thought of Qin Feng, he couldn't concentrate on practicing, for fear of Qin Feng The chase 
is coming.

Now, this Thousand Phantom Shadow Formation is alwaysIt's almost done.

He also breathed a sigh of relief.

But then, a look of sadness appeared on his face again

"Your Majesty, are you worried?"Baoye King saw that something was wrong with his expression.

Gale King shook his head slightly:"The formation is about to be completed, I feel at ease, but I am 
not worried. I just suddenly felt a little sad.!"

"Why is Your Majesty so sad?"

"Why~！"



With a sigh, the Gale Emperor raised his head and looked across the endless starry sky towards the 
direction of the earth.

"I feel sad for the Star Emperors! We have been together for many years, and Mr. Star Emperor has 
taken great care of me. Unexpectedly,….."

Emperor Gale smiled bitterly, and the corners of his eyes were actually a little moist.

He really felt sad for Wuye Star Emperor and others.

Leopard Wild King's heart was touched.

These days, he often saw Gale Emperor secretly feeling sad.

Obviously, Emperor Gale was feeling sad for the death of Emperor Wuyue.

This is truly a compassionate and righteous emperor!

Leopard Wild King respected Gale Emperor even more.

He didn't know that the death of Emperor Wuye was largely caused by Emperor Gale.

If the Gale Emperor does not destroy the teleportation array here, the Nightless Star Emperor still 
has a chance to survive.

"Your Majesty, you don't have to be sad! We will definitely avenge Lord Star King. Didn’t the 
Emperor send us a message back?"

"He asked us to wait here. He can arrive in a month at most! By then, it will be Qin Feng’s death!"

Baoye King sincerely consoled him.



It turned out that as soon as the Gale Emperor escaped to Mars, he asked the Golden Crow Emperor 
for help.

As soon as the Golden Crow Emperor received the news, he was furious, dropped everything in his 
hands, and rushed over at full speed.

The original plan was to within three months When they arrived, the Golden Crow Emperor had 
already compressed it into one and a half months.

Calculating the time, there was still one month to go.

This time, the Golden Crow Emperor was very aggressive and had to kill Qin Feng.

"Having said that! But this emperor is still worried that Qin Feng will take the initiative to kill him. 
That guy is not easy to mess with!"

Thinking of Qin Feng, King Gale showed fear in his eyes.

King Leopard Ye said calmly:"Your Majesty, don't worry, there is no teleportation array from Earth 
to Mars. Qin Feng wanted to come, he could only rely on flying"

"Flying from the earth to Mars, even if Qin Feng is stronger than the Nine-Star Emperor, it will take 
about a month"

"Calculating the time, he will be here in half a month at the earliest. And our Thousand Illusions and 
Shadows Formation was prepared for him."

"That’s it if he doesn’t come! If he comes, he will throw himself into a trap. Our Qianhuan Jueying 
Formation trapped him for half a month, there is absolutely no problem"

"And half a month later, the emperor arrived. When the time comes, the emperor will directly enter 
the battle and kill him!"

Baoye King said easily.



This is the arrangement of the Gale Emperor, and everything has been considered perfectly.

The Gale Emperor sighed:"Yes! This formation of thousands of phantoms and shadows traps 
people, and it is a unique one. As long as Qin Feng's combat power does not exceed 100 billion, it 
will definitely trap him for a month or two, let alone half a month. King Leopard Ye said with a 
proud smile:"

Your Majesty also said that Qin Feng's combat power seems to be around 70 billion." As long as he 
enters the formation, he is dead."

Hearing this, the Gale Emperor smiled and said nothing.

He had been desperately carving the formation pillars during this period just to set up this trap.

He knew that Qin Feng would definitely come.

Now that the formation was about to be completed, he finally felt confident.

"By the way, during this period of time, you have been mining resources on Mars. How have you 
gained?"

"Your Majesty, Mars is very rich in cultivation resources. We currently have stockpiled 530 tons of 
fire spirit ore, more than 300 fire moss plants, and more than 6,000 drops of spirit fire liquid.……."

Leopard Wild King reported more than thirty kinds of resources in one go.

The more Emperor Gale listened, the happier he became.

The resources on Mars are really rich!

In the past, he didn't pay much attention to it.

In fact, this station is left to its own development, except for the production of star stones.



The Beast Kings did not care about other resources.

Now, Leopard Wild King reports these resources.

Emperor Gale silently calculated in his heart and was very shocked.

When those resources are added together, the total price is comparable to thousands of Xingtide 
stones!

Emperor Gale was moved.

At this time, Leopard King said again:"In addition, there are more than three hundred pieces of 
newly mined Xingxi stones!"

Gale Emperor's eyes flashed.

Immediately, he said quietly:"Pack up all these resources, put them in the storage ring, and give 
them to me for safekeeping. To prevent Qin Feng from attacking, in case of an accident, these 
resources will be lost!"

"yes! I'll do it when I get back!"

"By the way, take these pills and distribute them to all your subordinates. One per person!"

Emperor Gale threw out a few more bottles of elixirs.

King Baoye took it and saw that there were thousands of red elixirs inside.

He recognized the elixirs at a glance and said in surprise:"Your Majesty, These blood-burning pills 
are very precious things. Do we really want to give them away?"

The function of the Blood-Burning Pill is to burn blood essence and temporarily increase combat 
power without major side effects.



The Gale Emperor smiled slightly:"Go ahead! Remember, keep one for each person as a spare. With 
these elixirs, we can also improve our overall combat power and be able to deal with some 
emergencies."

"yes! This subordinate is going now!"

At that moment, the Leopard Wild King left in a hurry.

The Gale Emperor looked at the Leopard Wild King's back, and a flash of light flashed in his eyes.

Although his strength is not as good as that of the Nightless Star Emperor, he is proficient in 
formations and alchemy, and is also a wizard.

Those blood-burning Dan, he had done some tricks secretly a long time ago..

Chapter 380

time flies!

In the blink of an eye, four days passed.

On this day, near Mars, in the vast starry sky.

A golden light, as fast as lightning, flew close from a distance.

After a moment, the golden light flew over Mars, stopped suddenly, and turned into a god of war 
wearing golden armor and a cape.

The person coming was none other than Qin Feng.

He flew from Earth to Mars in just four days, faster than expected.

Qin Feng was suspended in the void, overlooking the Mars below



"Dad, is this red planet Mars?", Qin Baobao's lovely voice sounded in my mind

"Yes! Baby, let’s go down and find the location of the Star Orcs!"

"OK, Dad!"

At the moment, Qin Feng flew towards the thin atmosphere of Mars and hovered thousands of feet 
high in the sky.

The diameter of Mars is only 0.53 times that of the Earth, which is much smaller than the Earth.

Qin Feng flew in a certain direction according to the memory of the Immortal Wood Emperor.

One hour Finally, he saw a station thousands of miles away, surrounded by a large protective light 
shield. The

Mars station of the Starry Sky Orcs was found.

Qin Feng was happy and flew towards the station.…..

At the same time, within the station.

Meeting hall.

At this moment, Emperor Gale was sitting on a chair, listening to the reports of the kings.

In addition to the Leopard Wild King, there are two Eight-Star Kings at this station.

"Your Majesty, in accordance with your instructions, we have ended the mining in all mining areas, 
recalled all our personnel to the station, and entered a state of war preparation."

A Wangzhehui report.



Gale Emperor nodded slightly:"Very good! During this period, no one should leave the station and 
no one should relax. As long as we persist for another twenty days, the Emperor should arrive"

"Your Majesty, the harvest of the past two days has been harvested. Take a look!"

Baoye King handed over a storage ring.

Gale Emperor looked at it and put it away with satisfaction.

These days, he has plundered all the resources of the entire station.

"Has the interstellar spacecraft been inspected?", Emperor Gale asked quietly.

"Return to Your Majesty, check it out, everything is normal! The energy reserves are also 
sufficient!", Leopard Wild King replied.

Why did he feel that Gale Emperor had a feeling of running away at any time.

However, he did not dare to ask, but he always felt that Gale Emperor was too cautious.

"That's good!" Gale Emperor nodded with satisfaction,"By the way, have the blood-burning pills 
been distributed in place?"

"Your Majesty, it has been sent out!"

"good!"

Just after saying these words, a shocking loud noise sounded over the station.

Click~!

That was the sound of the station's protective shield being blasted!



There was a shocking earthquake, and the whole station shook violently.

"not good! It must be Qin Feng!"

Everyone's expressions changed drastically.

"Activate the Thousand Phantoms Array!"

The Gale Emperor roared, and the sound instantly spread throughout the station.

In the station, the frightened beast monsters immediately woke up, and all prepared for battle. The 
formation instantly opened.

For a moment, the sky and the earth changed color, and the entire station turned into a huge illusion 
array.

But on the other side, in the station.

Qin Feng blasted through the station's protective shield before falling to the ground. The 
surrounding scenery changed rapidly.

The next second, the station disappeared, and the surrounding area was no longer a barren rocky 
land, but turned into a sea..

Qin Feng waved his hand and took in the sea water. It was real sea water.

He looked around again, and all he could see was the turbulent sea surface, which was boundless.

"Huh! Dad, how did we get to the sea? Is there a sea on Mars? Qin Feng smiled slightly:"

Little guy, what kind of sea is this?" It's all an illusion. We're trapped in a phantom formation"



"If what I expected is correct, this is the Thousand Illusions and Shadows Formation. At least a 
thousand people are needed to activate this formation. It can be used to trap the Nine-Star Emperor! 
Qin Baobao said again:"

Dad, how can we get out?" Can I keep flying out? Let's fly to the sky!

Qin Feng said easily:"This is an illusion!" No matter how hard you fly, you can't get out. It's easy to 
get out of this big formation, you just need to blast through the illusory formation barrier.…."

At the same time, the Gale Emperor had quietly arrived outside the station through the formation 
gate left in advance.

He was suspended in the air, looking at the formation in front of him with a proud look on his face.

Looking from outside the formation, the scene is completely different from looking from inside the 
formation.

What he saw was thousands of subordinates, presiding over the formation pillars, constantly urging 
the formation.

An invisible huge light shield enveloped the station.

Qin Feng was trapped in it, looking around blankly.

This scene was not only seen by the Gale Emperor, but also by all the beast monsters in charge of 
the formation.

The faces of all the monsters showed joy.

His Majesty the Gale Emperor is indeed wise!

As soon as this human came, he was trapped.

At this moment, there was a flash of light and shadow.



A figure flew next to Gale King, it was Leopard King

"Your Majesty, is this Qin Feng?"

"That's right!", Emperor Gale nodded.

Qin Feng was his nightmare, how could he not recognize it.

King Leopard Ye smiled and said:"Your Majesty, look at the confused look on this guy's face, he 
must be completely trapped. As long as we trap him like this for more than twenty days, he will be 
dead when the emperor arrives!"

"Ha ha!!"

Emperor Gale laughed proudly.

He had not been so happy for a long time.

"I thought this guy would surrender later, but he didn't expect him to be in such a hurry to die that 
he arrived so quickly!"

At this moment, Emperor Dafeng was confident, and he felt heroic in his heart.

"Everyone, maintain your formation! As long as we persist for more than twenty days, victory will 
belong to us!"

"Don't worry, Your Majesty! I will definitely try my best!"

All the demons also shouted in unison, and their morale was high.

"Your Majesty, why hasn't Qin Feng taken action for so long?"The Leopard Wild King saw that 
something was wrong.



The Gale Emperor smiled and said:"This Thousand Phantom Shadow Formation can only be 
opened by a thousand people presiding over it. This emperor has strengthened it. With more than 
3,000 people presiding over it, the formation is even more powerful."

"If you want to break this great formation, you won't be able to break it without a combat power of 
more than 100 billion. This Qin Feng is also a master of formations. He should have seen the clues 
that he was troubled!"

"After all, he only has 70 billion combat power, how could he possibly break it? Taking action 
rashly is a waste of energy.

Leopard Wild King suddenly said:"That's it!" I just said why he was standing there in a daze! I 
didn’t expect that he was actually a master of formations!"

Baoye King was a little surprised.

A master of formations, he is still very popular in the Star Alliance.

The two of them didn't know that Qin Feng was not in a daze, but chatting with Qin Baobao.

At this moment, Qin Feng took action.

I saw him flicking his fingers and shooting out a golden light at will, blasting towards the large 
array of light shields.

The Gale Emperor sneered.

Didn't he try his best in this test?

This Qin Feng looked down on his array too much.

The demons also felt that Qin Feng Feng was arrogant and looked like he was watching a good 
show.



But the next second, there was a loud noise!

Click~! Click~! Click~!

The golden light bombarded the formation.

Countless cracks were everywhere!

Ah~! Ugh~! Ugh~!

Thousands of monsters were all shocked to the point of vomiting blood.

"not good! The formation is about to break!"

The demons were extremely frightened.

With just a snap of the fingers, is it close to a hundred billion combat power?

This is too terrifying!

"Is this...is this possible?", Leopard Ye King was so frightened that he was stunned

"quick! Take the blood-burning pill quickly!"

The Gale Emperor roared anxiously.

Qin Feng's strength was completely beyond his expectation!

The monsters woke up, swallowed the blood-burning pills, and mobilized the formation with all 
their strength.



"You also take the blood-burning pill! Go down and help!", the Gale Emperor urged anxiously

"yes!"

The Leopard Wild King was also anxious.

He swallowed the blood-burning pill and rushed into the formation. In just a few seconds, all the 
demons swallowed the blood-burning pill.

A light flashed in the eyes of the Gale Emperor.

The blood sacrifice formation! Explode!

He suddenly made a seal with his hand!

Those monsters who had just swallowed the blood-burning pill exploded one after another. The 
audience screamed and blood mist filled the sky.

"Your Majesty, what are you doing? ~~Ah!"

The Leopard Wild King was shocked.

But the next second, he also blew himself up and died miserably!

A moment later, countless blood mist and spirits were absorbed by those rune formation pillars.

Thousands of formation pillars chimed in unison, and spiritual light bloomed!

The blood sacrifice started, and the large formation The power is doubled!

Without 200 billion combat power, this formation cannot be broken.



200 billion combat power is the threshold of the great emperor's combat power.

This Gale Emperor is extremely vicious.

When he saw that something was wrong, he actually killed all his men A blood sacrifice.

At the same time, inside the formation,

Qin Feng saw a blue sky.

The sky was full of cracks.

But then, those cracks disappeared, and the sky turned into blood red, and there was also a Invisible 
pressure!

"Huh! Blood sacrifice array?!"

Qin Feng could tell at a glance that the situation had changed.

"Dad, what's wrong with this formation?"

"He should have been given a blood sacrifice by the Gale Emperor! I tested it before and found that 
the critical defense value of this array is about 100 billion. This blood sacrifice doubled the power 
of the formation and should reach 200 billion!"

As soon as he said these words, the proud voice of the Gale Emperor echoed in the sky.

"Ha ha!! Qin Feng, if you want to kill me, just go ahead and dream! Without the destructive power 
of the Great Emperor, you can never go out! The emperor is gone!"

Outside the formation, the Gale Emperor dropped these words, turned around and ran away, flying 
quickly in the direction of the interstellar spaceship.



This guy is not only insidious and vicious, but also cautious and timid.

He doesn't care whether Qin Feng can break the formation, it's more important to escape first to 
save his life..Besides

, all the resources here belong to him, there is nothing to miss.…….

At the same time, within the formation

"dad! The bad guy is running away!

Qin Feng sneered:"He can't escape!""

Before he finished speaking, he waved his hand and held the Dragon Spear in his hand.

Qin Feng raised his hand and shot, destroying the true fusion.

The power of that shot actually exceeded 300 billion...

Click~!

A crisp sound!

That big formation Like paper, it was broken by Qin Feng with one shot.

This is the magical effect of the Supreme True Intention!

At the level of the Great Emperor, the strength of the True Intention has a great impact on the battle.

After breaking the formation, Qin Feng saw the Gale Emperor not far away Fleeing 
everywhere……



"This...how is this possible!"

The Emperor of Gale heard the loud noise behind him, looked back, and was frightened.

He quickly turned around and ran away.

Qin Feng teleported and reached the sky above his head.

Qin Feng's eyes flashed, his memory was scanned instantly, and then he shot Blast King Gale to 
pieces.

The shrill screams echoed over Mars.

A mass of nine-series origin, a storage ring, and a divine feather remained in the air.

Seeing the mass of origin, Qin Feng smiled.

Swallow this , he can survive the tribulation..
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