
Godly Choice 1131

Chapter 1131: Xia Feiyao is visiting

I met Li Yun's Nine Heavens Thunder in Zhangjiacun, and He Canghu knew that Feihumen was 
over when he learned that he had appeared at the gate of Feihumen.

"asshole!!"

"Damn boy!!"

"Wait, I will be successful in cultivating immortals one day, and I will surely break your corpse into 
ten thousand pieces!!"

He Canghu gritted his teeth and cursed, one inadvertently, the car slammed into another oncoming 
car.

"You're **** looking for death!!!"

He Canghu's head got out of the car and shouted, "I can't even drive, I'm annoyed by Lao Tzu, I 
**** kicked your car!"

With the power of an innate master, it is not difficult to kick a car.

"Damn it's really a passing year, don't you move away?! I'm in a hurry, I don't have time to clean up 
you!"

He Canghu annoyed and cursed again, retracting his head and preparing to start the car again.

Surprisingly, the car that hit him remained motionless.

"What the fuck!"

He Canghu cursed again: "Is it dead? If you don't die, quickly move the position for Lao Tzu, Lao 
Tzu..."

"His head has a good temper."

"Who?!"

A ridiculous voice came from the opposite side, which made He Canghu suddenly startled. He 
stretched out his hand to pick up the sword in the passenger seat and watched vigilantly at every 
move in the opposite car.

"Hehe, don't be nervous, I am not here to trouble you, but to give you a way of revenge."

The other party said in a bewitching voice: "Don't you want that kid to be ruined and be accused by 
Wanfu? Simply killing it will make the kid cheaper."

He Canghu frowned deeply. This person knew very well about his feast with Li Yun. If he hadn't set 
up some conspiracy against him, he would definitely be Li Yun's enemy!

"Why should I believe you?"

"Hehe, because you and I are all followers of the magic door, do you believe me when I say this?"



He Canghu's face changed slightly. In fact, he said that he was a subordinate of the Demon Sect and 
he was elevated. The bone ghosts and Taoists of the Demon Sect didn't put him in the eyes at all. 
They just gave him some resources for cultivation and a subject called "Bone Refining". The other 
methods of "Gong" are gone.

"Well, let's find a place to talk. Don't worry, I'm just a small acquired state, and I can't threaten you."

After the two cars were in a car accident, they stopped on the spot, which has already attracted the 
attention of many people, and some of them were grumpy and began to scold their mothers.

He Canghu got out of the car with the sword and saw a middle-aged man also get out of the car. At 
the same time, He Canghu noticed a small logo embroidered on his clothes.

"So it's you!"

"Hey, the enemy's enemy is a friend, the master, please!"

...

"Does Miss Gong live here?"

Xia Feiyao followed Li Yun to the gate of No. 3 Mansion in French Rent Realm, and stared at the 
iron gate with complicated patterns and different from Chinese architecture.

The architectural styles here are all European style. The arches, foreign gardens, bell towers, 
pointed roofs, and even the pavilions in the garden are all European style, revealing the taste of the 
West.

Xia Feiyao had always lived in an ancient Chinese-style pavilion, but when she came to this 
western European aristocratic mansion with a completely different style, she was a little 
uncomfortable.

"It's okay, you can be generous later, and Qingyu promises that you won't be embarrassed!"

Li Yun smiled and said: "As for Lianyi, her personality is even more gentle, a proper lady, so you 
don't have to worry too much."

Chapter 1132: Uncle, you are back

Xia Feiyao felt a little relieved, and followed Li Yun into Mansion Three.

She noticed that the nursing home here—it should be called the bodyguard. They were very 
respectful to Li Yun. When the taxi first arrived, they looked at it vigilantly, but when they saw Li 
Yun inside, they immediately became respectful. stand up.

"Uncle, you are back."

A security guard said hello with a smile on his face. After taking a look at Xia Feiyao, he said, 
"Miss did not go to school today. She should be at home now. Uncle, you can find Miss and 
grandma when you go in."

"Okay, it's hard work."

Li Yun nodded and led Xia Feiyao into it.

The guard and his colleagues looked at each other. Their faces were very weird. The uncle is worthy 
of the uncle. Just over a week after leaving, he returned with a different beauty.



And although this little beauty is not as good as the young lady, she is worse than immature and 
cute, and her proud and hot body is comparable to any woman!

"Hey, I don't know how angry the lady will be."

"Don't think about it, what else can the lady do? My uncle is so powerful, and it's normal for many 
confidantes to like him. Uncle, he didn't tell the lady, he was willing to bring the woman outside to 
show her, and he has proved that the uncle is right. Miss's attention!"

"That said, our young lady is always an eldest woman, and other women can only be small!"

The guards held their heads high, as if the young lady was proud to be Li Yun's wife.

"Qingyu, Lianyi, I'm here!"

As soon as Li Yun and Xia Feiyao walked into the hall of the mansion, they saw two beautiful and 
slim girls in palace costumes hurriedly stepping down the spiral staircase, but the two girls in palace 
costumes had their original faces when they saw Xia Feiyao. The thick surprise expression turned 
into astonishment, which made Xia Feiyao more nervous.

"Li Yun."

The older, mature and dignified palace-dressed beauty was the first to react, with a gentle smile on 
her face, and asked: "This lady is...?"

"Huh~"

Slightly immature in age, yet another beauty who is more mature than Xia Feiyao snorted proudly, 
and said jealously: "Auntie Lian, don’t ask, it must be this guy’s new girlfriend, but we thought he 
was here. The county was suffering, but I did not expect to hook up with a little beauty."

Xia Feiyao was speechless.

"And she's still a little beauty with a childlike face!"

With that said, the younger, quiet and elegant classical beauty made a move that surprised all three 
of them.

She stretched out her evil hands and squeezed Xia Feiyao's face.

"Ah!"

Xia Feiyao's small face turned red all of a sudden, she quickly backed away and blocked herself 
with both hands. She was treated like this by the only outsider, that is, her husband.

But now, she is actually the same as a woman, still a quiet and elegant palace-dressed beauty...

"Qingyu!!" Li Yun gave a wry smile, "What are you doing?"

"Huh~"

Gong Qingyu gave Li Yun a roll of eyes, "I just want to see how old she is to make you look like 
you. Ghosts can't help but make a move... I thought this lady was a young girl who just graduated, 
just thinking Report the crime, fortunately, I feel that she is old enough!"



Gong Qingyu especially emphasized the big characters, making Xia Feiyao even more at a loss. Is 
she saying that she is a shameless and shameless woman?

Chapter 1133: Feiyao, say yes

Gong Lianyi didn't realize how to round the field for a while, Qingyu was really crazy!

On the contrary, Li Yun understands Gong Qingyu very well. She is not the kind of person who can 
make the relationship froze as soon as they meet, and even though Gong Qingyu dislikes human 
relationships, there is no doubt that her EQ and IQ are extremely high. .

"Xia He."

Gong Qingyu's expression was indifferent, and she told her maid: "Prepare the room for this big 
European beauty to live in tonight and in the future on the third floor. Everything else should be 
prepared. If she wants to live here, in the future That room is hers!"

"what?"

Xia Feiyao was surprised. The quiet and elegant woman just molested her. Why did she allocate a 
long-term living room all at once?

Li Yun smiled, Qingyu really can get closer, using a room to show that she is willing to accept Xia 
Feiyao.

She was jealous of her previous rude behavior, right?

"Let's go, let's go upstairs and sit down."

Li Yun took the lead and took three beauties to the small living room on the third floor.

Since he had a very close relationship with the two golden flowers of the palace family, the third 
floor has become an exclusive place for him and Qing Yulianyi. Usually, except for a few maids, no 
one else will go up, even those who come as guests. They only lived on the first or second floor, and 
the third floor became Li Yun's exclusive residence.

The allocation of rooms to Xia Feiyao on the third floor already showed Gong Qingyu's attitude.

"Yao'er, let me introduce you."

After going up to the living room on the third floor and sitting down, Li Yun gave an introduction to 
both parties.

"Hello, Miss Xia." Gong Lianyi's expression was soft and politely greeted Xia Feiyao.

But Gong Qingyu was much simpler and straightforward.

"Are you the daughter of Xia Zhenghe, the head of Qinglei Valley?" Gong Qingyu looked at her 
with a strange look, "As if I heard that your grandfather has broken through the realm of masters?"

"Well, yes, it broke through just a few days ago!"

Speaking of this, Xia Feiyao's confidence came back a bit, her voice became louder, and she began 
to talk about the events of the previous few days, specifically emphasizing that Li Yun had already 
been to Qinglei Valley and was recognized by her family elders.



Gong Lianyi listened beside her, her eyes widened.

Li Yun has already been approved by Qinglei Valley, doesn't it mean that if he visits the palace 
family, can he also impress the palace family?

Let the palace family agree to Li Yun marrying her and Qingyu at the same time, maybe it can 
really be achieved...

"It turned out to be so."

Gong Qingyu twisted Li Yun's waist and said with a smile: "It turns out that this guy has been so 
busy recently not to study, but to visit his little wife."

Little wife? !

Xia Feiyao, who is now in a very sensitive period, suddenly woke up and blurted out: "I am not a 
little wife, I, I, I am a big old man..."

"Big?"

Gong Qingyu aimed her eyes at her chest, nodded solemnly and said: "Fiyao, you are indeed not 
young, I just tried it... Um!"

Li Yun couldn't listen anymore, and directly covered the dead housemaid who seemed to be quiet 
and elegant, but in fact there were many kinds of knowledge in his mind, and there was no taboo in 
speaking and doing things!

"I hate it, let me go! I'm telling the truth, your little wife Feiyao is indeed amazing in figure, I am 
envious of it, and want to experience it."

"Have you experienced it like this?"

"Otherwise? Feiyao, don't you think?"

Gong Qingyu finally couldn't pretend, and smiled leaning over and hugged Xia Feiyao, rubbing her 
baby's fat face vigorously.

Chapter 1134: Sister Qingyu

"Hey hey, little Lolita of Tong Yan Ju 0, ooh, I really like it!"

"Li Yun, you are amazing, you have turned such a cute little loli into your hand!"

"Feiyao, you must wear a maid skirt. Hey, I have collected a lot of fun costumes. Then you will 
show me the cos, how about it? Anyway, you and I will be sisters in the future, so you don’t want to 
wear them to me. Suffer~"

Hugging her hard, Gong Qingyu rubbed against Xia Feiyao’s cute little face with happiness, and 
said something that Xia Feiyao and Gong Lianyi could not understand at all. What is Lori for a 
lifetime? It’s great. NS.

Li Yun was startled at first, and then reacted, and suddenly he couldn't laugh or cry.

Gong Qingyu likes to watch cartoons and animations. The cute little Lolita is very charming. It is 
very lethal to the otaku. According to incomplete statistics, women have a tendency to light lily. Li 



Yun has always suspected that Qingyu has the same. Tendency, now it seems that it is estimated to 
be.

Qingyu really likes a little loli like Xia Feiyao!

"Gong, Miss Gong?"

Xia Feiyao had an expression of wanting to cry. She originally came here with Li Yun to meet her 
future'sisters' and strive for peace.

Unexpectedly, Gong Qingyu, a genius and beautiful girl, first put on a cold expression and grabbed 
a hand of her in front of her, but now she hugged her hard?

For a time, Xia Feiyao fell into a deep bewilderment.

"Hehe, don't call me Miss Gong, it's too ugly!"

Gong Qingyu squeezed Xia Feiyao's small face, and said with a smile: "I will be called Sister 
Qingyu or Sister Yu from now on. I'll just call you Yaoer, Sister Yaoer, how about?"

"puff!"

Li Yun's tea spouted out, "Don't mess around, my little Yaoer is already 18 years old this year. It's 
not always certain who is older than whom!"

"...My birthday in July." Xia Feiyao whispered, she is a bit awkward now, and she is still being held 
closely by Gong Qingyu.

"Well, I got it in April!"

Gong Qingyu replied solemnly, but her Aunt Lian unceremoniously exposed her: "Qingyu is in 
November. Strictly speaking, she is not yet eighteen."

Li Yun smiled and said, "So Qingyu, you should call sister Yaoer."

Xia Feiyao blushed, sister Yao'er or something, is she the older wife?

"Hmph, I don't care, anyway, I want to be a sister!"

Gong Qingyu began to play tricks, and he insisted on calling Xia Feiyao to her sister, looking very 
satisfied.

"Come on, sister Yaoer!"

Gong Qingyu took Xia Feiyao's little hand and walked her to her room, and said excitedly: "I will 
show you my collection. All of them are COS clothes. Some of them are very suitable for you. We 
secretly Don’t show it to Li Yun that bad guy, huh~"

cos service?

Li Yun's lower abdomen became hot, and he had seen Xiao Chili wear those cos costumes with his 
own eyes, all of which were very beautiful and all kinds of clothes.



Miku clothes, princess clothes, Lolita skirts, Han clothes, sailor clothes, dead reservoir water and so 
on.

They were all wonderful costumes, styles that made men very excited.

Xia Feiyao was ignorantly dragged away by Gong Qingyu. She didn't understand all of these, but 
she was still willing to have a good relationship with Gong Qingyu.

The two became sisters because of Li Yun's relationship, and Xia Feiyao didn't mind getting closer 
to Gong Qingyu.

But she soon learned that she sacrificed too much for this kind of close relationship!

Those cosplay clothes are very shameful styles...

Chapter 1135: Meet the elders

After Qingyu and Xia Feiyao left, only Li Yun and Gong Lianyi were left in the living room, and 
the third floor is a place where no outsiders will come—the four maids are all reliable people, never 
Will talk more about anything about the host outside.

Therefore, Li Yun unceremoniously enjoyed the fox and charming beauty, hugged her and kissed 
her so that she faded her graceful and feminine temperament and completely revealed the charm in 
her bones.

"Li, Li Yun~"

Gong Lian Yijiao panted slightly and pushed him away. The long-term intimacy made her 
breathless, but she was extremely eager for a tryst with her lover who hadn't seen her for more than 
a week, and she pushed him away until she couldn't continue.

"My Lianyi has something to tell me?"

Li Yun smacked his lips with satisfaction. His confidante is really the best elder sister. There is a lot 
of beauty that belongs to mature women. However, because of the success of cultivation and the 
beauty and skin care pills, Gong Lianyi has a good reputation. The jade skin of the young girl of Yu 
Doukou, with no regrets that her youth is no longer in her life.

It's really great, and it's so admirable.

"Well, yes, something is happening."

Gong Lianyi bit her ruddy lips, and her eyes seemed to be covered with water mist, her eyes looking 
at Li Yun were very charming.

If you let outsiders see her like this, you will definitely be surprised.

A flawless, gentle and virtuous lady, but now she is charming and charming. Any man can't help but 
be bewildered when she sees it, and bow down under her pomegranate skirt willingly.

Gong Lianyi, a natural fox charming beauty, is only suppressed by her book fragrance, and only 
when she is alone with Li Yun will she show off her appearance of a fox spirit that overwhelms all 
living beings.

"What's up?"



Li Yun asked casually, moving non-stop, even though it was very light, but still talking with her 
close.

"Bad, bad guy."

Gong Lianyi's cheeks flushed, and she barely supported the last trace of strength to stop his 
movement, as if this movement was very tiring, and exhaled and said: "I, I want you to come back 
with me and Qingyu... "

She was speechless, and her shame was stronger than before.

"Back to what?"

Li Yun's ridiculous smile provoked Gong Lianyi's irritation, her eyes flowed mid-autumn, charming, 
charming.

"Bad guy, you must have guessed it?"

Gong Lianyi pursed her mouth, her mature Yu Jie still has a girlish and charming personality, "I 
want you to come back to the palace with us...to meet the elders..."

Gong Lianyi was embarrassed and embarrassed. These words were tantamount to handing over both 
herself and Qingyu to Li Yun, and bound to him for the rest of her life. No one can separate them 
ever since.

"My parents, and Qingyu's parents, they actually knew about this vaguely, but I haven't told them 
clearly yet..."

"Ding, trigger the option event, please choose from the host:

Option 1: Agree to Gong Lianyi’s request, find a time to visit the palace, reward experience value + 
500,000, free attribute points +1888, money + 1.88 million, four medium-sized medicinal pills*2, 
choose this option, in the future Make Gong Lianyi's favorability full.

Option 2: Reject, no reward.

Option three: go now, reward: double the reward for option one. "

Li Yun was not too surprised to see Option One. He had long guessed that the reason why Gong 
Lianyi's favorability was less than 100 points was because of concerns about the obstruction of his 
family.

Chapter 1136: Jun as a rock, concubine as a pampas grass

Gong Lianyi is not the kind of woman who can work hard for love. In her concept, family is very 
important, and the permission of her parents is also an important factor in giving her back to Li Yun.

"Li, Li Yun?"

Seeing that he hadn't agreed, Gong Lianyi couldn't help but feel anxious. She felt that she shouldn't 
force Li Yun to go to the palace so soon, maybe she should go later.

"Why don't we wait for Qingyu University to graduate before..."

"Waiting for college graduation? No need!"



Li Yun waved his hand and said confidently: "When I have time, I will go back with you two, 
Lianyi, trust me! The palace family and your parents will agree to our relationship, and I have the 
confidence to let them All agree!"

In an instant, Gong Lianyi's eyes were full of tears, she took the initiative to plunge into his arms 
and hugged him tightly, and said with a cry of joy: "Okay, I believe you, Li Yun... Even if my 
parents disagree , I will follow you too."

"The king is treated as a rock, the concubine is treated as a pampas grass, and the pampas are 
threaded like silk, and the rock is not transferred."

Gong Lianyi watched him affectionately, and used a poem to portray her heart.

The only way Li Yun could respond to her was the hot kiss that had not been separated for a long 
time.

"Ding, the host makes a choice, rewards experience value + 500,000, free attribute points +1888, 
money + 1.88 million, four medium-sized pill*2 (recovery pill, detoxification pill, peiyuan pill, and 
foundation building pill) ."

Li Yun, who was in her arms, was even more satisfied. The four medium-sized pills*2 corresponded 
to Lianyi and Qingyu, which were equivalent to 8 purple gift bags, which made Li Yun too cool.

Of course, it is even more refreshing to have a fox beauty like Gong Lianyi on the sidelines to enjoy 
it.

...

the next morning.

"Sister Qingyu, Sister Lianyi, don't you go with me and your husband?"

Xia Feiyao asked obediently, but her eyes were slightly dodging when she looked at Gong Qingyu. 
She didn't go to the guest room to sleep last night, but was put to sleep by Gong Qingyu as a pillow.

Moreover, sister Qingyu half-forced her to wear those shameful styles of clothes, and put various 
poses in front of the mirror to ask her to take pictures. Xia Feiyao felt ashamed in retrospect.

Fortunately, no outsiders saw her, including Li Yun, otherwise she would die in shame.

Therefore, Xia Feiyao, who has been tossed about clothes styles all night, now has a deep sense of 
fear for Gong Qingyu-those cosplay clothes are really...

"not going."

Gong Qingyu waved his hand, and said lacking interest: "I don't bother to care about Song and Yuan 
dynasties and other grievances. For me, whose ambition is to cultivate immortals, I don't bother to 
care about these things."

After that, she glanced at Li Yun with a strange look. She still didn't understand why Li Yun wanted 
to mix these things so actively. Is it for the beauty?

I heard that the spiritual medicine fairy does not look bad.



"Xiuxian..." Xia Feiyao stayed for a while. Her original goal was only innate. After meeting Li Yun, 
she was a little bit ambitious and wanted to become a master, but she felt that it was too early for 
Xiuxian to seek the truth.

"Yeah." Gong Qingyu rubbed her cheek again and said with a grin: "Qing Sheng is very strong, far 
better than the so-called grandmaster. My goal is to chase her, and I don't bother to pay attention to 
other things! "

Li Yun smiled and said, "I don't think you want to practice at home, but you just don't bother to 
walk around, right?"

Chapter 1137: Black cat suit

"Hee hee~"

Gong Qingyu did not refute. As a housemaid, she certainly prefers to stay at home.

"The two sisters, my husband and I are leaving first?"

"Sister Yaoer has a good journey."

Gong Lian Yiying smiled. Over the night, her name for Xia Feiyao changed from Miss Xia to Sister 
Yaoer. Being accepted so quickly made Xia Feiyao very happy, so she endured the strangeness of 
sister Qingyu last night. Move.

"Well, let's go." Gong Qingyu exhorted: "Sister Yaoer, you must be optimistic about your **** 
husband, don't let her get in trouble!"

"Uh?"

Li Yun lay innocently with the gun, Xia Feiyao covered her mouth and smirked, "Yes~~, two 
sisters, I must be optimistic about him!"

Gong Qingyu was very satisfied, but the next moment, he leaned in and gave a quick kiss on Li 
Yun's lips before turning and leaving, saying that he would not miss him.

Li Yun couldn't laugh or cry, but Qingyu's behavior reminded him that he hugged Gong Lianyi and 
kissed her red lips in her blushing face.

"Lian Yi, I'm leaving!"

"Yeah, yeah." Gong Lianyi blushed and replied with a kiss from Li Yun, and said affectionately: 
"Please don't remember that there is a concubine here, so don't read everything well."

Wen Jianjian's love words are tickling. Li Yun felt that she was not enough after having tasted her 
for several hours yesterday, but unfortunately, there is no chance now.

After bidding farewell to Lian Yi, Li Yun and Xia Feiyao went out and got in the Gong family 
driver's car, ready to go to the airport.

"Hoo~."

As the car drove out of Mansion No. 3, Xia Feiyao let out a soft breath, leaning against Li Yun's 
arm as if relaxed.



"What's wrong? Was Yao'er nervous just now?"

"No." Xia Feiyao shook her head, her eyes a little bit shy: "Sister Lianyi is very nice, but sister 
Qingyu...well, I can't tell you." It was too shame.

"Ha ha!"

Li Yun burst into laughter and took out his phone to show her some photos.

"what!"

Xia Feiyao widened her eyes and exclaimed fiercely.

In the photo of her husband’s mobile phone, she is wearing a cat ear suit, showing a white belly, and 
a black cat ear with fluffy ears on her head. There is also a special tail behind her, which can be 
turned up and down. Shaking, just like a real cat's tail!

In the photo, she is posing, with her hands clenching soft fists, and her upper body leaning forward, 
which is exactly the same as the ‘meow’ posture!

"This this this!"

Xia Feiyao's immature face was flushed with shame. How did her husband have these photos? 
Could it be...

"Qingyu sent me a few photos last night." Li Yun said with regret: "She said there are hundreds of 
all kinds of photos, but they will be sent to me only if I perform well. They are now her collection... 
"

"Ah, no!"

Xia Feiyao wanted to cry without tears, she knew she would not play these cosplays with sister 
Qingyu.

The driver of the Gong family who started the machine was the one who sent Li Yun before. He 
couldn't help but admire the way Li Yun and Xia Feiyao were playing with each other.

Not only did my uncle bring other beauties back to Mansion Three, but he was also recognized by 
the young lady and grandmother, which is really amazing.

...

As the car came all the way to the airport, Xia Feiyao finally recovered from her shyness. On the 
contrary, it was okay for her husband to see those shameful photos anyway.

"Husband, is the saintly lady better than my grandfather?" Xia Feiyao remembered another woman 
who had known from sister Qingyu last night, Fan Qingsheng.

Chapter 1138: Airport

"She is in the Void Return Realm, and her strength is strong--" Li Yun thought about it, "Impossible, 
because we have never seen her make a full shot, and we can only infer her strength from a scaly 
armour."



Xia Feiyao was amazed, saying that he wanted to know her and see what kind of person Gong 
Qingyu would admire.

——They don’t even know that Li Yun and Fan Qingsheng are already in a 
romantic relationship, and they still have a 100-point fulfilment degree.

"There will be a chance."

Li Yun smiled, "Qingsheng was in retreat yesterday, and I will take you to meet her when she is 
free."

"Okay~"

Xia Feiyao agreed easily and happily. Since following Li Yun, her knowledge suddenly broadened, 
and she could even recognize the magical existence of practitioners.

The two arrived at the airport. Gong Lianyi had already bought the ticket last night, and Li Yun 
directly took out the ticket and waited to board the plane.

But for some reason, the plane was delayed. Li Yun and Xia Feiyao spent the morning at the airport. 
After lunch at an expensive airport restaurant, they waited until more than two o'clock in the 
afternoon before they could finally set off.

"Aircraft is also very troublesome, I thought it would be very convenient."

When queuing to register, Xia Feiyao complained a bit, think about it, she was personally grieving 
after waiting so long at the airport.

"Fortunately, I didn't wait until the next day." Li Yun shrugged. He still has this level of 
concentration, but it's just a little uncomfortable.

At this moment, a sentence attracted the attention of many people.

"It's normal to be late. I heard that Dongshan Airlines was hijacked, so urgent inspections caused 
many planes to be delayed."

Hijacking!

At the airport, this word is like a stone thrown like a pond, instantly stirring up countless waves.

"real or fake?"

"I don't know, a friend of mine told me that it is still under investigation."

"The news doesn't seem to be reported."

"I'm a little panicked. There was an international plane that went missing last year and it hasn't been 
found yet. Will we still be on this plane?"

"Being afraid of a ghost, there is no way to hide from it. I just want to come!"

There was a lot of discussion, and many people chased the airport staff to inquire, but they didn't get 
the exact information.



Xia Feiyao was a little frightened. If the plane had an accident in the sky, it would be of no avail 
even if it was congenital consummation. Perhaps the Grandmaster would not be able to withstand 
the impact of the crash.

"Yao'er don't worry, it's okay if you have a husband!"

Li Yun frowned slightly, and comforted her by holding her little hand. He looked around and then 
scanned with his mind. No suspicious person boarded the plane.

It seems to be thinking too much.

After boarding the plane smoothly, Li Yun and Xia Feiyao came to the business class to sit down, 
turned off their mobile phones and waited for the plane to take off. The stewardess came to ask if 
they needed drinks and snacks.

Everything is normal.

It was not until everyone got off the plane smoothly and Qi Qi breathed a sigh of relief that Li Yun 
received a call.

"Brother Liao? What's wrong?"

Li Yun had a vaguely bad premonition. Liao Hua called him when he first turned on the phone. It is 
estimated that the matter is very urgent.

"There is something very urgent."

Liao Hua smiled bitterly on the phone, "An international flight has disappeared, and the relevant 
personnel are conducting an urgent search. According to the gathered information, it is possible that 
the people of the magic door did it!"

Li Yun paused, signaled Xia Feiyao to stop first, and asked, "How is the situation now? Do you 
need my help?"

"I'm still trying to search the black box signals of the plane, and I have a preliminary inference 
about where the plane went. My thought is, Li Yun, can you help us find the plane? For example, 
the lady of the saint..."

Chapter 1139: Consort Wanqing, are you a pig?

Li Yun couldn't laugh or cry, and said helplessly: "Brother Liao, do you think I have that kind of 
magical power? As for Qingsheng," Li Yun thought for a while, "I don't think she can do anything. 
Sometimes she even finds If you can’t find anything, it’s even harder to find a plane flying in the 
sky!"

It is said that the cultivator can perform divination and find out the whereabouts of certain things by 
asking ghosts and gods.

But Li Yun didn't think that this kind of magical powers could still exist in the world today when the 
aura is declining.

"Well, sorry, I just went to the doctor in a hurry."

Liao Hua smiled helplessly. The disappearance of a civil airliner still had a great impact, and there 
were practitioners like Li Yun around him, and it was normal to ask Li Yun for help.



"Well, I will ask the little maid Qingzhu later, if there is a way, I will call you again."

"Okay, trouble you, I'll tell you if I have follow-up news!"

After hanging up the phone, Liao Hua sighed, and he could also hear that it was out of the question, 
and he had to rely on manpower to locate the missing plane.

"Husband." Xia Feiyao took his arm and asked curiously: "The people of the Demon Sect hijacked 
the plane? Why? Are they not immortal cultivators?"

In Xia Feiyao's concept, immortal cultivators are all those who come and go, with swords for 
thousands of miles, coming and going without a trace, at all, they have no connection with the high-
tech aircraft.

Li Yun shrugged, "Who knows, maybe they want to do some sabotage."

This is the best result, at least there is no follow-up conspiracy.

"But it's still not sure if it's hijacked by the magic door. I'll make a call."

Li Yun first contacted the little maid Qingzhu.

"Looking for the spell of the plane? Idiot, are you stupid? How could there be that kind of spell, and 
the plane has no soul! You are stupid!"

"...I thought it could be."

"How is it possible? Forget it, you come to me when I have time, and I will tell you about the spells 
in this area, lest you be like a fool!"

After being laughed at by the arrogant little maid, Li Yun shrugged and hung up the phone.

There are spells that can be traced, but a certain medium is needed. The most convenient and simple 
way is to search through the soul, that is, if the human remains in the wreckage of the aircraft are 
found, then the spells can be used to search for relevant information.

After thinking about it, Li Yun called another saint.

"Huh? Which **** interrupts my nap and looks for death?"

A lazy voice came from the phone, with a lazy accent, like a Persian cat stretching, revealing a 
charm of charm.

"It's me, Li Yun."

Li Yun's eyelids twitched. He didn't believe that the demon girl didn't see the call reminder, she just 
wanted to make him sick.

"Concubine Wan Qing, you sleep until four o'clock in the afternoon. Are you pig?"

"You are a pig!"



Concubine Wan Qing scolded with a smile, "I am in a good mood recently, and I have nothing to 
do, what's wrong with being a little lazy? Unlike you, who run all day to hook up with little 
beauties, one day you will be exhausted on a woman's belly!"

Li Yun: "..."

How does he feel that Concubine Wan Qing knows his schedule very well? Does this demon keep 
watching him?

"Forget it, I'm too lazy to talk to you."

Concubine Wan Qing's face blushed inexplicably, and the topic changed: "You called me, do you 
want to beg me again? Haha."

Li Yun's tone was stagnant for a while before he pretended to be confused and asked: "I called you 
just to care about you... What are you doing recently?"

"What do you do? Why can't I understand what you are saying~"

Chapter 1140: Microwave barbecue

The flirty words of the saint of the Six Demon Sects made Li Yun not sure whether she was 
pretending to be stupid or she really didn’t know, so she could only mistake her for a while, and said 
solemnly, "Don’t pretend to be stupid, you should know what I said !"

"Whee."

Concubine Wan Qing let out a girlish smile like a silver bell, and said slowly: "I have recently fallen 
in love with barbecue. I have to eat it morning, afternoon and evening, but I am tired of slow-
roasting with charcoal fire. It makes me full of smoke. As a result, Xiaoqing recommended me a 
microwave oven for baking from the inside to the outside. Although most of the time it’s not good 
enough, it can barely be used."

After speaking, she hung up the phone.

Barbecue?

Li Yun always felt that there was something in the words of Concubine Wan Qing. Does it allude to 
the form of barbecue or the process of barbecue?

The only thing that is certain is that the undercurrents are also raging inside the Six Demon Gates, 
and as the saint concubine Wan Qing can't stop it, so she can only sleep in idle without anything.

"Husband?"

Seeing his frowning appearance, Xia Feiyao couldn't help but asked in a worried voice.

"It's okay, let's go, go to Tiandanmen!"

Li Yun smiled, took her out and hired a taxi.

"Where are the little brothers going?"

The taxi driver first greeted him enthusiastically, and then looked at Xia Feiyao. Suddenly, his 
expression was obviously sluggish, seeming to be startled by her baby face + hot body.



"Humph."

Because of her figure, Xia Feiyao had been extremely sensitive to this kind of gaze from a very 
young age. How could she not know the driver's thoughts and immediately snorted in annoyance.

"Ahem, brother, where are you going?"

The driver turned his gaze awkwardly and looked at Li Yun who was holding his arm by Xia 
Feiyao, his eyes flashed with envy.

He could see that this little beauty with a childlike appearance was Li Yun's girlfriend. It is 
estimated that something has happened between the two, and they appear extremely close.

"Go to Tiandan Sanatorium."

Li Yun said lightly, he was not angry. After all, a man could not help but look at Xia Feiyao's figure. 
This was an instinctive reaction, as long as it wasn't the kind of squinting eyes.

"Yes, there are a total of 185 for the two!" The driver proficiently quoted, "If you are still students, 
you can charge 180. How about?"

"Isn't it calculated by the distance?" Xia Feiyao looked at the driver suspiciously, she still had some 
common sense.

"Little beauty, you don't understand this!"

The driver smiled and said, his eyes wanted to look at her chest, but he was afraid of offending the 
customer’s embarrassed expression: "Tiandan Sanatorium is quite far from the airport. Basically, it 
has already left Wenshan City, and most taxi drivers are not happy to go. There must be an empty 
car to come back."

Xia Feiyao was speechless, Li Yun smiled, not entangled whether it was slaughtered, opened the 
door and said, "Okay, let's go."

After the two got into the car, the driver was in a good mood. After starting the car, he said: "Little 
brother, what are you going to do in Tiandan Sanatorium?"

"Ding, trigger the option event, please choose from the host:

Option 1: Answer the driver, reward the green gift bag*1, wisdom +100, and have the opportunity 
to find some useful clues.

Option 2: Ignore, no reward.

Option 3: U-turn and go back, no longer go to the Tiandan Sanatorium, reward: Wisdom +1000, 
white gift bag*5, skill risk perception experience value increased. "

Li Yun was a little surprised. He actually triggered a selection event on a very ordinary driver, 
which means that the driver may know some clues.


	Godly Choice 1131

