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Chapter 1751: Three flames

The flames of the world can be simply divided into three categories.

All fire, spiritual fire, sacred fire.

If it was in ancient times, then it can be said with certainty that the higher the level, the stronger the 
flame.

However, after the development of modern technology, mortals can also create terrifying flames 
with a temperature of hundreds of millions. This makes the people of Hidden Sacred Valley a 
headache, and they don't know how to classify flames.

The biggest difference between Spirit Fire and Fan Huo is that Spirit Fire can be easily manipulated 
by people. As pointed by the arm, it is the same as Li Yun's absorption of the Earth Fire into the 
Dantian, but it will not be burned to death.

As for the sacred fire, there is not much information. There is only a small group in the Hidden 
Sacred Valley, its power is unknown, and few people go to observe it. The Sage Fanqing and the 
elders are not very clear about this, maybe only the Valley Lord and a few have survived enough. 
The long-standing hidden world power only knows the details.

Gong Qingyu listened very carefully, and she even wanted to become a practitioner with the fire 
attribute.

Unfortunately, Fan Qingsheng told her that the magic attributes of practitioners are not fixed, and at 
best they are only proficient in certain types of spells.

For example, she is good at lightning spells, but she is also very proficient in swordsmanship. Of 
course, Vatican Sage can also use water spells, and she even knows **** with sound.

"Mana is the foundation of everything. After consolidating your martial arts practice, you can try to 
learn the most basic qi-satisfaction technique, and then consider learning spells after you have mana 
in your body."

Facing the admonition of the Vatican Sage, the two daughters of the palace naturally nodded their 
heads and promised. This is definitely a benefit that outsiders can't think of-a Void Returning Realm 
can give pointers to the maze. Is there any better treatment?

The atmosphere became active, and even the little maid Qingzhu had forgotten the difference 
between master and servant, and went to the table to taste the dishes without a taboo.

In this active atmosphere, Li Yun told them about his trip to Mount Adu, like telling a story, clean 
ups and downs, plus some photos taken, such as the volcanic labyrinth, the fire channel leading to 
the underground, As well as the lava lake at the bottom of the volcano, etc., they all have an 
immersive feeling!

"Ah, this volcanic labyrinth really was formed by the influence of the earth's evil fire, I said how 
strange it is!"

"The palace in the magma... I really want to see it with my own eyes!"



"Li, Li Yun, you are really too bold! You are grabbing something under the eyelids of Returning 
Void Realm!"

Qingzhu was taken aback, and Li Yun smiled and said, "This is nothing. After returning to the 
capital, I had a fight with another person, to be exact, the two return to Void Realm!"

"..."

The women didn't know what to say, only Fan Qingsheng was indifferent, and even put a piece of 
green vegetable into his mouth with chopsticks, nibble a few times with her white teeth, and said 
slowly: "You definitely didn't win. "

Li Yun: "..."

"Hahaha!"

Gong Qingyu and the little maid laughed loudly, and even Lian Yi, who was gentle and watery, 
couldn't help but snickered while covering his mouth.

Li Yun smiled bitterly. Qing Sheng was also in the Void Returning Realm. Knowing that he 
possessed the Earth Fiend and Nine Heavens Thunder Talisman, she could naturally infer that he 
could not truly defeat a Void Returning Realm.

Several people chatted while eating. After finishing, they watched TV in the living room on the first 
floor.

Li Yun thought of something and asked Fan Qingsheng about the ancient times. Unfortunately, she 
didn’t know much. The Hidden Sacred Valley had moved several times, and was beaten to the 
mountain gate several times by the people of the Six Demon Sects. Or if they hit the other side's 
gate, the battle between the two sides is evenly matched, the disputes continue, and the secrets 
about the ancient times have long been lost.

Li Yun showed the runes on the silkworm cocoons formed during the evolution of the Black Feather 
Butterfly to the Sanctuary of Vatican Qing, and found nothing. It seems that the runes involved have 
far exceeded the contemporary ones and belonged to the ancient times.

Chapter 1752: I am coming

In the evening, Li Yun played with Gong Qingyu and Gong Lianyi for half the night. It was just the 
same as the intimacy in the car during the day. Nothing happened further. After all, Lianyi's current 
favorability is only 99, and there are some concerns in his heart that have not been resolved.

Gong Qingyu had no objection, but Aunt Lian refused. She just gave Li Yun a roll of eyes and 
smiled and pushed him out of the room door, letting him sleep in the next room by himself!

The next day, the eyes of the two women stayed, and considering that until the end of the college 
entrance examination, Li Yun would not be able to come to Zhonghai City again, so he stayed for 
two more days, accompany the two women out shopping for a day + came back to play for half a 
night.

In the afternoon of the third day, Li Yun sneaked into Mansion No. 8 again, and only appeared in 
front of the garden so as not to disturb the fairy inside.



Fortunately, there is only Sage Fanqing in the wonderful garden like a fairyland. This seems to be 
her exclusive place, and she is usually the only one.

Li Yun walked all the way inside and saw the fairy sitting in front of the wooden house in a white 
dress.

The fairy is reading a book, the gentle sunlight is shining in the garden, the skin is white, the 
female's curves are graceful, and the profile is perfectly displayed in front of Li Yun.

The beauty is incredible.

"Li Yun, you are here."

Before Li Yun spoke, Sage Fan Qing lifted his head from the book and looked at him with a pair of 
nice eyes.

"Well, here I am."

When the two were alone, Li Yun's heart was itchy, and he stepped forward to embrace Qing 
Sheng's perfect body. The saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley also cleverly opened her arms around 
him, leaning her head against him, the picture is quite There is a feeling of... stealing love.

Isn't it stealing love to hide from Qingzhu's little maid?

Besides, this time Li Yun still came to abduct her.

"Qingyue~"

Li Yun put his arms around her slender waist, stroked the beautiful face of Saint Fan Qing, and said 
to her with a gentle and magnetic voice that belongs to a man: "Let's go on a date!"

"About, yes?" Fan Qingsheng seemed surprised. Although he still didn't show his expression, he 
could hear it from his tone of voice.

"Well, date!"

Li Yun also wanted to describe the so-called dating, which means that two men and women who 
like each other go to play together, deepen their feelings, and exchange their thoughts.

Unexpectedly, Fan Qingsheng nodded directly and said: "Okay~."

Li Yun couldn't laugh or cry, he probably knew what Van Qingsheng was thinking now.

Just like the day before yesterday, when Li Yun came here, Sage Fanqing also opened his arms to 
beg for a hug. Last time when the projection of Divine Mind was about to disappear, he also made a 
kiss to Li Yun.

The pure-minded Saintess probably thinks that she and Li Yun are in a romantic relationship, so she 
needs something that ordinary couples would do, hugs, kisses, squeezes and so on.

Li Yun couldn't laugh or cry about it, did Qing Sheng like him a little bit in his heart?

There should be!



Otherwise, it is impossible for him to hug, kiss, or even...

"I change clothes."

Sage Fanqing stood up and said, and at the same time put his right hand to his waist, and after 
holding the waist, with a graceful movement, he gently pulled Li Yun's shocked eyes.

"..."

"..."

With no words at all, Li Yun was already stupid.

The pure white dress was specially thrown to Li Yun by the Saint Fanqing. The beautiful and cold 
face was still very calm, and he said: "Want to smell it?"

Li Yun: "..."

He is not stupid anymore, but his sanity has fallen below -250!

Chapter 1753: Us, go on a date

Before he could ask, Fan Qingsheng, who stood tall in front of him, explained: "I have seen from 
the book that boys like to smell the smell of girls, and if the relationship between the two is very 
close, you can try to use it. The clothes I changed for him...smell...smell."

I don't know if it was an illusion, a small blush faintly appeared on the delicate face of this cold 
fairy, as if...the clothes she took off let Li Yun smell it, making her feel ashamed for the first time.

"Qing Sheng!!"

Li Yun grabbed the shoulders of Lord Saintess and said seriously: "Don't read those messy books. 
The relationship between you and me is very good now, very good!"

Looking at Li Yun with a pair of eyes as pure as a pool of clear water, Sage Fan Qing said seriously: 
"I don't believe it."

It means that if you lie, our relationship is not good at all.

Li Yun's mood is really... ups and downs, magnificent waves, and a mess!

Not only moved by Qingsheng's seriousness and dedication, but also pityed her awkward efforts, 
and at the same time, I felt sorry for her cold personality. If I met him earlier, perhaps Qingsheng 
would not become what it is now.

But Qingsheng is Qingsheng, her character has been developed, and what Li Yun likes and loves is 
also the cold and holy woman now.

Holding her in his arms, Li Yun didn't have a trace of desire|fire, only a deep warmth.

"I admit that I have a low self-esteem in front of Qingsheng, and I am not too relaxed."

"Yeah." Fan Qingsheng hugged him and whispered: "Is it my character that makes you feel afraid to 
approach? In fact, I don't hate the things you do to me. This is what I say in my heart."



Li Yun was ashamed, and said: "I haven't finished speaking yet, Qingsheng, please finish listening 
first."

"it is good."

"But, later I slowly discovered that Qingsheng, in your heart... is also longing for the feelings of 
ordinary people."

Sage Fan Qing did not speak, her beautiful eyes kept looking at Li Yun, and the two looked at each 
other for a long time. She suddenly put her arms around Li Yun's neck and gently kissed him.

"My mood now--"

Fan Qingsheng let Li Yun's hand feel her heartbeat, and his voice sounded like a natural sound: 
"There has been a change. It is because of you Li Yun that the change has occurred."

"Yeah! That's great!"

Li Yun was very excited and excited, not because of other things, but because of Qingsheng's 
words.

"Li Yun, when your mental power becomes stronger, I want to feel your heart and let you feel my 
heart." Fan Qingsheng said suddenly.

"what?"

"Don't worry, this is not to pry into the secrets of people's hearts, but to communicate with each 
other in the spiritual world."

Fanqing Sheng said softly: "A very pure soul communication without a trace of distractions. I am 
looking forward to it, and I think we can enter each other's hearts."

"...?"

Li Yun was stunned, this seems to be the so-called divine mind exchange?

Is this what Qingsheng likes?

"I'll talk about it later. Now, I'm going to change into a modern outfit, we--" Fan Qingsheng left his 
embrace, his mouth raised, and his tone became a little lighter: "Go on a date~!"

Dating!

Let's go on a date! !

Hearing the word date in the mouth of a cold saint, Li Yun felt that he was worth it in his life!

"Okay, let's go on a date!"

...

I don't know how long it took, Qing Zhu walked into the garden with a brisk pace. She was in a 
good mood these three days. Although the big bad guy always made her angry, he often made her 
feel very happy after being angry.

Saintess... also very happy.



Qingzhu even felt that he would rather live like this for the rest of the day.

Until... She saw a message paper on the stone table and a folded white dress.

"Ahhhh, Li Yun, you **** unexpectedly abducted Master Saint, I am going to kill you!!!"

Chapter 1754: My boyfriend is also handsome

Of course, Li Yun would not hear the yelling of the little maid. He was wearing a modern dress, tall 
and graceful, with a bag cross-body, holding a mobile phone and wearing sunglasses, and he was 
dressed in a modern Hidden Sacred Valley. Saint, the two walking on the street holding hands.

"Qingsheng, do you know? It is said that the monster race once ruled the earth and established the 
monster court, which is the heaven of the monster race..."

Li Yun talked to her casually. The topics ranged from ancient legends to modern urban layout, from 
Huang Xuan country's swordsmanship to the shrines of cherry blossom country, from the **** of 
the West to the underworld of the East. There was nothing he couldn't talk about.

"Li Yun."

Sage Fanqing looked at him, blinked and said: "You know a lot of things, and many of them are 
things I haven't touched before."

Li Yun laughed, and clicked a little on her pretty Qiong nose, and smiled: "Qingsheng, what else do 
you want to know? I can tell you, not me, I know some of the ancient myths and legends. What do 
you want to hear? What do you want to hear? What do you want to hear?

It's another girl, now she must be looking at Li Yun with admiration, and then put her arm around 
him and act like a baby.

However, it is Fan Qingsheng who is dating Li Yun now.

"Do not."

Fan Qingsheng shook his head, glanced at him and said, "I want to know what your company is 
like."

"company?"

Li Yun was taken aback for a moment, and he was right. There is nothing to understand about 
ancient legends. If you are not interested, there is no benefit if you know it. It is better to get to 
know his company.

Li Yun was a little moved and squeezed Qingsheng’s tender palms, and smiled at her: “Should we 
take a taxi to my company? While visiting, we will have dinner in the company cafeteria by the 
way. In the evening, we will go to the movies, or go to You can play anywhere."

He remembered that the company's QQ group was quite lively not long ago. Everyone was writing 
blessings to celebrate the establishment of the canteen. Li Yun also joined the fun and brushed a few 
red envelopes to show his face.

"Not going to the movie." Fan Qingsheng nodded.

Li Yun understands what she means, except not to go to the movies, everything else is fine!



"Ok, let's go!"

Li Yun acted decisively, and walked towards the road with the lady of saint, intending to stop a taxi.

When other girls heard that they even went to the company cafeteria to eat when they came out on a 
date, I am afraid they would immediately turn down their faces, or laugh and curse that they really 
don’t understand the customs!

But with the character of Fan Qingsheng, he didn't care about this at all, and Li Yun felt that it didn't 
matter.

What happened to the cafeteria? The cafeteria is just for people to eat. Others can eat it, and of 
course you and Qingsheng can eat it too!

He is worth tens of billions of dollars now, plus his strength, so he didn't care about these superficial 
skills a long time ago.

"O, k?"

Fan Qingsheng repeated this sentence, speaking very slowly: "Does this mean ‘good’?"

"Correct!"

"Um~, I'm studying English recently."

The two stood on the side of the road. The man was tall and handsome, and the woman was 
beautiful and cold. This combination attracted the attention of countless people, and quickly 
attracted the attention of his brother. A taxi drove in front of Li Yun.

"Brother, where are you going?"

"Mingyu Building."

"Okay!"

The driver's gaze never looked away from Fan Qingsheng’s face, until the two got into the car, his 
neck turned around and quietly gave Li Yun a thumbs up: "Brother is amazing, girlfriend is so 
beautiful!"

Li Yun smiled and was about to say something, but Fan Qingsheng glanced at him and said, "My 
boyfriend is also very handsome."

Li Yun & driver: "..."

Ah, thank you so much, Qingsheng!

Li Yun was so moved that he was about to cry! !

Chapter 1755: The Saintess has to take the college entrance examination

The driver really envied Li Yun’s girlfriend. Not only did she look good, she also had a nice voice. 
After taking off her sunglasses, she was even more beautiful. The driver swears that he has been 
driving a taxi in Zhonghai City for fifteen years, this brother. His girlfriend is definitely the most 
beautiful!



Of course, he can only envy him. Li Yun is tall and handsome, with a gentle temperament, and he 
does not look like a person who lacks money. His skin is white and tender, and he can only be 
possessed by a pampered son.

Such a handsome guy is worthy to stand beside a peerless beauty,

"Li Yun."

Sage Fanqing looked at him again, hesitated for a few seconds before asking, "Can I take the 
college entrance examination?"

"What?!"

Li Yun was shocked to suspect that he had ear problems, and the driver driving in front was also 
startled.

These two golden boys and girls have not yet taken the college entrance examination? And that tall 
beauty, looking at the age of seventeen or eighteen, how can she say that she can take the college 
entrance examination? Doesn't everyone take the college entrance examination?

Unless it is a student whose grades are extremely poor and can only find another way out.

A beauty of this level is actually that kind of student...

For a time, the mood of the driver was extremely complicated.

"The college entrance examination, can I take it?" Fan Qingsheng emphasized again, her eyes were 
serious, and Li Yun could not see any joking.

In fact, she never joked.

Li Yun shook her little hand, smiled and said, "Qingsheng, can I know why you want to take the 
college entrance examination? Besides, you have just learned some cultural courses, right?"

"Well, just learned."

Repeating his words like a child, Fan Qingsheng nodded: "I have no problems with Chinese, and 
mathematics is good-I am fast at calculations, just remember the formulas."

Of course, Li Yun knew that the realm of refining the gods could be called cultivators. They had 
initially separated from the category of mortals, and the computing power of their brains was 
comparable to that of a small calculator.

Note that computing power is not equal to intelligence. Some people can quickly calculate addition, 
subtraction, multiplication and division, but their IQ is quite low.

"The subjects of science and synthesis." Fanqing Sheng listed them one by one: "I have studied 
physics. I can test 110 points in the simulation paper, and 90 points in chemistry. However, I have 
learned some and can test. Close to full marks."

Li Yun was stunned.



Fan Qingsheng said again: "English is being studied, if I only test my memory and listening, I will 
be able to finish it in a week."

It means that there are still more than ten days before the college entrance examination, which is 
enough!

Li Yun stared at her with a weird face for a while, then suddenly smiled: "Does Qingsheng want to 
go to university? Well, it's not impossible. I will call Brother Xia and ask her to arrange for you to 
enter China Overseas University. A school!"

Driver: Excuseme?

Are you **** kidding me! ?

If you call Xia, you will be able to enter Zhonghai University, one of the top three in the country, 
and the top university in Zhonghai City?

Don't brag like that!

"No." Fan Qingsheng lightly shook his head, "I will not go to university because it is inconvenient 
to have classes every day."

Li Yun understood that as a saint, she certainly couldn't go to class every day.

Although it is said that there will be no expulsion, but not showing up several times in a semester is 
still not enough.

"I just want to take the college entrance examination."

Van Qingsheng pointed his finger at the driver and asked, "Have you ever participated?"

"Yes, I have participated! It's just... hey, I failed the exam! The college entrance examination was 
very cruel at that time, and it was completely different from now!

The driver was immediately excited. A beautiful girl like a fairy talked to himself. Today, I can eat 
two more bowls of rice when I go back!

Chapter 1756: She is a fairy

Li Yun understood what Qingsheng meant.

"Do you want to experience the college entrance examination for ordinary people?"

"Um."

The corner of the driver's mouth twitched.

What is the college entrance examination for ordinary people? When is the college entrance 
examination unusual? Isn't this an exam that everyone, including those top rich second generations, 
will take?

At most those rich second generations are taking TOEFL IELTS stuff from abroad, but they can be 
regarded as college entrance examinations!

Fan Qingsheng said in a pleasant voice: "I learned during this period that the college entrance 
examination, like the ancient imperial examination, is the most important watershed in modern 
society. I want to experience it.



This is true, and Li Yun agrees.

If he does not get the system, then taking the college entrance examination and becoming a student 
of a prestigious university is the best way out.

It’s not that every student at a prestigious university can succeed, but at least they can work easily 
and have no worries about food and clothing. The probability of success is much higher than that of 
ordinary people.

The driver really wants to vomit, you two dare not to eat the fireworks? Also "experience" it! The 
words are too high!

"Okay, I'll call you to ask, it should be ok." Li Yun took out his mobile phone and looked for the 
address book. "You need a high school or equivalent degree to take the college entrance 
examination. You don't have a Qingsheng, but the problem is not big. You can find Xia for 
accommodation. Just get a certificate of academic qualifications."

Li Yun didn't mind using privileges. After all, he was just taking the college entrance examination 
and would not harm others.

"brother!"

The driver couldn't help it: "I said there is a limit to bragging, right? What kind of brother Xia is so 
awesome, you can easily get a high school diploma? How is this possible! Every student has a 
student status, file They are all stored in the educational data, and you can't get through so many 
relationships to engage in this stuff even with the best of the means!"

Sage Fanqing looked at him, and Li Yun shrugged and said: "Special special office, my girlfriend is 
not simple, she is a fairy."

The driver was speechless, and wanted to scold him, I know your girlfriend is a fairy, but you are 
not deliberately showing off!

"You don't believe me?"

Li Yun smiled and changed the mobile phone call to external broadcast so that both of them could 
hear the conversation.

"Brother Xia, are you busy?"

"Li Yun? What's the matter? I am in a meeting now to discuss strengthening awareness of 
prevention and preventing personnel from being lured by the six magic doors. Do you have any 
suggestions?"

"Uh... just tell them who is in the Six Demon Gates. By the way, I have something to do with you."

"Oh?"

Xia Ming, who was in the meeting, sat down immediately, motioning other people to stop talking 
and let him finish the conversation with Li Yun.



It was not that he overreacted, but the last time Li Yun looked for him, he took a cart of explosives 
and overturned a volcano!

"In fact, it's nothing, it's my daughter... well, it's the holy woman of the Hidden Sacred Valley, the 
Sage Fanqing, do you remember?"

Li Yun almost blurted out my girlfriend!

"Van Qingsheng? Remember, she is what we are fighting for!" Xia Ming said yearningly: "If we can 
win her rights and support, and then win the full participation of the Hidden Sacred Valley, I think 
we are working with Liudao The battle of the magic door will become easier!"

Li Yun was ashamed. He didn't expect Xia Ming to be quite far-sighted, and his ideological 
consciousness was not generally high.

Unfortunately, this is almost impossible.

Li Yun glanced at the Sage Fanqing, the latter nodded slightly, and said to Xia Ming on the phone, 
"Hidden Sacred Valley will not form an alliance with the government. One is the character problem, 
the other is that I don’t want to interfere with the world, and the third is. , Look down on the 
government."

Chapter 1757: No problem with the college entrance examination

Xia Xia Ming was stunned, who is this nice voice? It seems that according to the news obtained in 
Zhonghai City, the saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley is a woman who speaks very nicely. Could it 
be said that Li Yun is with Fanqing Sheng now? !

"This is the opinion of the saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley."

Sure enough, Li Yun admitted it!

Xia Ming suddenly became excited. This is the first time a leader of his level has had a high-level 
dialogue with Hidden Sacred Valley. The significance is absolutely very important!

It is even possible to convince her!

"what happened?"

In the Beijing meeting room, everyone looked at Xia Ming. After learning that he was talking with 
the Saintess of the Hidden Sacred Valley, the meeting room suddenly exploded!

"Hidden Sacred Valley? It is said that it is a sect that can compete with the six magic gates. The 
enemy's enemy is a friend. We should strive to communicate with them!"

"Hidden the valley of the saints... this school is not easy to communicate."

"Not very optimistic, let's not have hope!"

"Why? Isn't the Hidden Sacred Valley fighting the Six Demon Gates just like us?"

"Hehe, you think, the six magic gates are now making big things over and over again, but the 
Hidden Sacred Valley hasn't moved yet. Who knows what they think?"



There was a lot of discussion in the conference room. Xia Ming stopped them with gestures and 
considered the words before saying: "I know that the hidden sacred valley is full of extraordinary 
people and immortals who practice magic, and their personalities are relatively arrogant. In the 
previous historical dynasties, because of various Factors do not trust the government, but none of 
these matters!

Today's Huang Xuan country is different from all previous dynasties, and we officially have the 
power no less than spells. Even if the Hidden Sacred Valley does not form an alliance now, there 
will definitely be this opportunity in the future! "

Fan Qingsheng’s words were cold, and the people in the Hidden Sacred Valley were very arrogant, 
but Xia Ming was still reluctant to give up the plan to form an alliance with them.

After all, there are many spells in the Hidden Sacred Valley. If Huang Xuanguo can master them all, 
would he still be afraid of the six magic gates?

"Reconsideration."

With two words, Fanqing Shenghui no longer speaks.

The driver was dumbfounded, what is the situation? There is also an organization in Huang Xuan 
that can form an alliance with the country? ! This is too exaggerated!

"Drive leisurely, brother driver." Li Yun smiled at him, and continued to say with Xia Ming: "Now 
the saints of the Hidden Sacred Valley come out to experience the worldly life. After knowing that I 
am about to take the college entrance examination, I also want to participate, so I feel it for myself. 
The atmosphere of the college entrance examination, I don't know Brother Xia...?"

"sure, no problem!"

Xia Ming immediately patted the table to decide, looked at a leader in charge of education, talked 
with the other party in a negotiating tone, and got a very affirmative answer.

"The saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley is going to take the college entrance examination? Of course 
there is no problem. I will ask the education department of Zhonghai City to apply for the admission 
ticket for her and arrange an opening separately!"

In order to strive for the help of the Hidden Sacred Valley, let alone a college entrance examination, 
just let Van Qingsheng directly get the first score!

Li Yun couldn’t laugh or cry. He was sure that if Hidden Sacred Valley promised that as long as the 
saint was awarded the top prize in the college entrance examination, he would form an alliance with 
Huang Xuanguo. Then Xia Ming and others would directly modify the results of Van Qingsheng. 
Even if Li Yun got full marks, he would also be a hidden saint. Gu Sheng women's volleyball team 
first!

"There is no need for a separate examination room. Follow the normal procedures, and the complete 
college entrance examination can have a good experience!"

"Let's do it." Li Yun glanced at Fan Qingsheng, "Brother Xia, you ask Qingsheng to arrange a high 
school exam. After confirming that she has high school skills, Qingsheng will apply for the 



admission examination room for Qingsheng. Then Qingsheng will go to ordinary To participate in 
the college entrance examination in the examination room."

Xia Ming naturally agreed.

He won't lose, Huang Xuanguo is a society of human affection, even the immortal door must pay 
attention to human affection.

This time Huang Xuanguo helped the saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley, and next time she will 
definitely pay back!

Chapter 1758: Welcome Chairman Li Yun

"Brother, nothing to say, awesome!"

As the car drove to the Mingyu Building, the driver extended two thumbs to Li Yun, indicating that 
not only he is awesome, but his girlfriend is even more awesome.

Although the driver did not quite understand the meaning of the conversation, he combined the 
rumors of the Haoting International Banquet Hall in Zhonghai City some time ago and the strange 
fog on Shiwangfu Street that came from the capital a few days ago. The driver vaguely guessed 
something. .

"It's okay, goodbye then."

Li Yun smiled, and took out a few hundred-yuan bills from his wallet, "I don't need to find the rest, 
as a tip."

"I'm Cao, the local tyrant is really good! Hahaha, I'm not welcome!"

The driver took the money and immediately changed his mind, from a brother to a local tyrant, with 
a happy smile on his face.

No matter how awesome Li Yun was in the front, the driver didn't think much. He was quite calm 
and leisurely like a world-famous person, but after Li Yun took out a few banknotes and gave him a 
benefit, the driver looked at Li Yun with admiration!

This is reality, no matter how awesome you are, I won't be too lazy to bird you if it doesn't benefit 
me!

"Big Brother Tyrant!"

The driver got his head out of the window, and was about to throw a business card to Li Yun, so that 
Li Yun would come to him next time. Suddenly, the driver was startled by the scene in front of him.

I saw two rows of people standing in front of Mingyu Building, men from left to women, each in 
suits and shoes, dressed as an elite.

Even more frightening is that the driver actually recognized the middle-aged man with the 
presidential temperament standing at the forefront.

Wu Ke!

He has been frantically swiping the screen in the news recently, claiming to raise 200 billion yuan to 
study autonomous driving. Of course, as a taxi driver, he has also paid attention to this matter.



"The Lord has appeared!" The driver saw that President Wu Ke raised his hands and patted with a 
smile, and shouted: "Come on, let us welcome the mysterious and unusual boss of Baiyun 
Technology Group who has not shown his face for three months. Chairman Li Yun!"

"Welcome Chairman Li Yun!!"

Nearly three hundred elites shouted with smiles and craned their necks to see how mysterious the 
legendary chairman of Baiyun Group was. From the establishment of the company to the current 
market value of 500 billion, it has been Did not show up!

The driver who stretched his neck to see was completely dumbfounded.

It turned out that the passenger he had just carried was actually Baiyun Technology-the chairman of 
the company that is known to be the world leader and will soon release epoch-making super-
intelligent fully automatic driving technology!

Listen, epoch-making, super-intelligent, fully automatic driving!

Such awesome technology will be born in the next two months!

Not to mention that drivers don't believe it, there are few people in the world who believe it!

However, Baiyun Technology Group abruptly attracted a 300 billion investment, and also bought a 
medium-sized automobile company in a large amount, and transformed all the production lines into 
its own intelligent driving workshops.

"I'm Cao, Baiyun Technology!"

"Huh? Baiyun Technology? This company is too high-profile now!"

"Tsk tsk, such a young chairman is a scam, hey, I don’t know how many people will be cheated out 
of their money!!"

"It's not that people are deceived, it's stupid than being deceived."

"Haha, that's right, idiot will be deceived!"

People passing by stopped and watched, took out a few pictures of Li Yun and Fan Qingsheng with 
their mobile phones.

Let alone cheating, people are now real and rich, with a net worth of at least tens of billions, and the 
Baiyun Technology in charge is properly the strongest unicorn in 2020!

Some people even speculate that if autopilot is really made by him, then it is not impossible to 
become a giant multinational group comparable to BAT.

Chapter 1759: Buy a building

Against the background of hundreds of business elites, Li Yun's light at the moment has 
overshadowed the beauty of the Sage Fanqing, making her look like a nine-day fairy eclipsed, and 
everyone else looked at Li Yun, and It's not her.

"Wu Ke, what are you doing?"



Li Yun and the saint of the Hidden Sacred Valley stood side by side, looking at Wu Ke amusedly, 
the president of Baiyun Technology, who is in charge of all the power of the company every day.

In exchange, the chairman of another company would definitely not dare to do this. After all, even if 
it is a brother, sister, or even father-son relationship, they will turn their faces and deny people in the 
face of large enough interests!

But Li Yun didn't think it mattered.

His power comes from the system, to be exact from himself!

Even if Wu Ke betrays him and Li Yun starts from scratch again, he can easily build a technology 
company with a market value of hundreds of billions by virtue of his god-level hacker knowledge. 
If the system distributes some rewards, the market value of trillions is a simple matter.

Therefore, Li Yun did not pay attention to the question of whether Wu Ke would betray or not. All 
the daily personnel and financial powers were left to Wu Ke and several shareholders, such as Fang 
Xue, Su Muxin and others.

Wu Ke estimated that she would never, and would not betray.

The reason is simple. Li Yun has a mysterious background, strong strength, and backing by the 
country. Even if Wu Ke kicks Li Yun out as chairman, Baiyun Technology will fall apart within 
three days.

This is the terror deterrence brought by power!

"I didn't do anything."

Wu Ke shrugged and said: "I just think that Baiyun Technology has not seen the chairman for many 
years, and some people are unstable, so I brought them to meet the world, so as not to be able to 
look up."

"Hahahaha!" A group of Baiyun Technology employees laughed.

Have they never seen the world?

It is not an exaggeration to say that everyone present can easily join any company when they go to 
any company, and some even can directly be middle-level leaders, starting with an annual salary of 
tens of millions.

Will they be people who have never seen the world?

But at Baiyun Technology, they are really "noobs" who have never seen the world!

After all, any company in the world with a market value of more than 100 million has never said 
that the chairman of the board will not show up or speak for two to three months.

This is ridiculous!

"I believe you, besides, I have to take the college entrance examination." Li Yun said innocently. 
"You don't know how nervous the college entrance examination review is."



"puff!"

A group of business elites almost vomited blood.

They come from top universities in the world, and many of them have overseas study experience. 
The standard is 985+ study abroad+ master’s degree, but now their boss is still a student without a 
college entrance examination?

This... is too outrageous!

"Are you nervous?" Wu Ke looked weird, "The genius who got the top score in the mock test, you 
haven't gone to school at all recently, have you? I don't know my wife all day... By the way, let us 
warmly welcome Chairman Li Yun again! "

He saw the Sage Fanqing and quickly changed his words.

"It's OK, it's almost done."

Li Yun stopped the shouting of the employees, scanned the crowd, and said a little surprised: "Why 
are there so many employees? How many people have you hired recently? Forget it, you should go 
back first, this drowsy standing Damiankou, it would be bad if it affects other companies!!!"

"Other company? Cough cough cough!" Wu Ke patted her chest sharply, looking distressed.

Li Yun looked at him in surprise, "What's the matter?"

"Chairman, this is the case!" The security guard who had seen Li Yun several times on the side 
quickly explained: "Now the Mingyue Building is all owned by our Baiyun Technology, uh, I have 
also become Baiyun Technology's security!"

Chapter 1760: Our goal is to global

Bought an entire building!

Li Yun subconsciously raised his head and glanced upwards, and a hundred-meter-high thirty-story 
building stood in front of him. Until this moment, Li Yun had a sense of success.

When he was in middle school and high school, when he saw the ten or twenty-story buildings in 
the county, he always imagined what it would be like to stand on it and look down. Sometimes he 
also imagined that if he could own a building, it should be. How energetic, lashing out at Fang Qiu, 
standing on the top floor of the president's office and looking down, how refreshing he should be!

Now Li Yun finally realized his dream.

"very good!"

Li Yun patted Wu Ke on the shoulder, the corner of his mouth showed a "evil and mad" president 
smile, and pointed to the Mingyu Building in front of him: "This is just the first step of Baiyun 
Technology. In the future, I will let us Baiyun Technology The headquarters of the company has 
become the tallest building in Zhonghai City. Buildings belonging to our Baiyun Technology will be 
built all over the country and even in the world! Hahaha!"

"Oh!! The chairman is mighty!"



Many employees cheered. They seemed to see Baiyun Technology's research on autonomous 
driving technology, occupying the global autonomous driving market, and becoming a super 
multinational company that can compete with dogs, giants, and fruits!

Only Wu Ke was full of doubts: Why must a building be built? Is there anything to say?

"This is the Vatican Sage, who came to visit our company today." Li Yun introduced the saint of the 
Hidden Sacred Valley to the employees. The Sage had already come to the press conference last 
time, but the new employee still didn't know her.

Everyone's eyes were attracted by her.

After regaining their senses, they discovered that the woman brought by the chairman was so 
beautiful, as beautiful as a fairy coming out of a classical painting, and her temperament floating 
like an immortal, which made people feel embarrassed.

Being watched by so many people, the cold fairy's beautiful face still has no expression, a pair of 
bright eyes are like the quiet pool of the deep mountain, the moon is shining in it, and the clean 
water surface has no trace of fluctuation.

Shocked by her beauty, the surrounding area was quiet.

"cough!"

Li Yun awakened this group of people with coughing sound. These business elites bowed their 
heads in shame. They also attended many banquets and met a tier of celebrities... But after bringing 
Baiyun Technology, they really have never seen the world. Same!

"Wu Ke." Li Yun smiled, "Is the cafeteria open? Last time you said that the company cafeteria has 
been built, so I specially brought Qing Sheng to the cafeteria for a meal today!"

As an adult saint, experience life.

"It's all right a long time ago." Wu Ke glanced at Fan Qingsheng, his face turned extremely weird.

It was also the first time he heard that "Dating" came to the company cafeteria for dinner.

"That's it!"

Li Yun waved his hand. "It's been a long time since the last celebration banquet. It's a coincidence. 
Let's have another dinner today. We will have a meal in the cafeteria together. The food will be paid 
according to the highest standards!"

This is also the message Li Yun sent to Wu Ke before, asking him to ask the canteen to prepare 
standard meals in advance, so that Qing Sheng is not used to it.

It is estimated that Li Yun can do it by letting the president of a large company prepare for these 
things.

But no way. He doesn't have a secretary in the company. Naturally, he has to trouble Wu Ke for 
everything.



Everyone cheered together. The highest standard of food is at least two hundred, and it is at least 
five hundred + standard for an outside restaurant. After all, the company canteen saves all kinds of 
expenses and is much cheaper than outside.
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