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Chapter 2011: Three-winged black feather butterfly

A saint abducted by a phone call?

Li Yun really didn't know whether he should be happy or worried. After all, if he chose the wrong 
direction and led the saint into a crooked road, it would be a heinous crime.

Among other things, the little maid Qingzhu must bite her with her fangs a few times.

"Wow~"

The little fox woke up, ran to Li Yun vigorously, and exchanged wailing. You don’t need to think 
about it. This little guy must be hungry and wants to eat delicious food, such as red fire fruit, red 
fire fruit, and Something like red fire fruit.

"Really gluttonous."

Li Yun cursed and knocked on the cute fox's head, then picked up its back neck and said, "Don't 
move, I'll take you to a place."

The little fox was so obedient that he stopped even his tail.

The next moment, a flower was in front of it, and it came to a beautiful place that made it extremely 
excited and full of power.

"Ooooooooooooo~~"

The little fox was so excited in the fairy mansion that after Xiaoqian teleported to the neighborhood, 
her eyes lit up, and she couldn't help but stretch out her hand to hug the little fox in her.

Sure enough, no girl could resist the temptation of the cute little fox.

Female ghosts won’t work either.

Li Yun smiled and said, "Xiao Qian, this is Mengmeng Fox, my newly adopted pet, you usually..."

Suddenly, a small black thing flew in the distance, and it rushed to Li Yun's face with a scream.

"Bab baba~~~! Hee hee hee, hug, hug~"

"Fluttershy?"

Li Yun was surprised to catch the little villain who was fluttering on his face, and placed it in his 
palm to look at it. As expected, the black feather butterfly, it turns out that she has already evolved!

The nine-winged black feather butterfly evolved from two wings to three wings. Three pairs of 
beautiful black star-like thin wings flashed lightly behind them, mysterious and beautiful.

Her body is not as long as it is but small, she still looks like a Barbie doll, even the figure is still like 
a 13 or 14-year-old girl, with slender waist and soft feet. If she becomes an ordinary person, she 
will definitely be a charming girl. Little beauty.

"Hehe, Baba~"



The black feather butterfly beat a few times in the palm of Li Yun's palm, then crawled along his 
arm to the shoulder of Baba, and kissed him on his face. The delicate and cute face was full of 
happy expressions, waving his hands. Said:

"Baba, it has become so comfortable here, with a lot of food, so Xiaodie has grown up all at once!"

The innocent words accompanied by the cute movements made Li Yun laugh dumbly.

She was talking about the fact that Lotus Immortal Mansion gained another 500,000 spiritual 
energy.

It seems that if the black feather butterfly wants to evolve, the surrounding environment must have 
ample aura, otherwise it can't support this mysterious evil insect to evolve again.

Li Yun estimated that for a long time, the black feather butterfly will maintain its three-winged 
state.

After all, her next evolution is conservatively estimated to require more than 10 million spiritual 
auras. This little guy is very powerful. He can imitate other people's magical powers at will, but he 
is too greedy. Li Yun has a system plug-in with rich wealth and he almost can't support him Up her.

"Fluttershy likes it."

Li Yun nodded her little face with a finger, causing Black Feather Die to giggle, shaking her two 
little feet without shoes.

Well, Xiaodie still has a change, and her speech has become clearer and clearer.

"Baba, what is this?"

Black Feather Butterfly saw the little fox in Nie Xiaoqian's arms. His eyes blinked and blinked, but 
his curious eyes made the little fox scream with fear, and desperately hid in Nie Xiaoqian's sorrow.

The difference between the ancient fierce insect and an ordinary little fox monster cannot be 
described by the sky and the earth.

Chapter 2012: Little buddies

"Your little friend who will play in the future."

Li Yun said with a smile, Fox Mengmeng is a pet, and Black Feather Butterfly is a pet and daughter. 
It's okay to be a partner together.

"Wow, Fluttershy likes this little friend~~!"

The black feather butterfly happily flew to the little fox's back and tossed it happily.

The corners of Li Yun's mouth twitched, and Xiaodie's speed increased again. If he was able to get 
through the opponent's head if he was able to match the general spirit refinement realm, the enemy 
could not understand what was going on.

"Hee hee, it's nice to have friends, thank you Ba Ba~" It can be seen that Hei Yudie quite likes cute 
foxes.

"Well, let's go play, Dad won't accompany you."

"Good~~!"



Black Feather Butterfly doesn't like to go out. For her, it is a terrible place that is impoverished in 
spirit, and weakens every second she stays.

If it weren't for going out occasionally, or helping Baba beat bad guys, she would never go out.

"Goodbye Baba~"

Black Feather Butterfly waved, and then happily rode the little fox to play.

The two little guys are similar in size, and the black feather butterfly with the palm of the hand rides 
on the little fox as if a person is riding on an elephant, which is just right.

"Xiao Qian, how are you doing recently?"

Li Yun turned to look at the red ghost in front of him. Xiao Qian's face was already flushed. After 
practicing the Yin Ghost Huayang Method, she was getting closer and closer to humans.

Of course, it takes a long distance to truly become a human being.

"Well, everything is fine for Xiaoqian, son, son."

Nie Xiaoqian seemed to have something to say, but in the end she didn't say it, she lowered her head 
to look like a good wife.

Li Yun stepped forward to hug her, chatted with the shy Nie Xiaoqian for a while before leaving the 
fairy house.

At noon, the two women woke up. After Li Yun and them had breakfast and lunch, they wanted to 
start a formal exercise, but Fang Xue became shy again and said that he would not do anything like 
this during the day, so Li Yun could only take They are playing in Taihuang Mountain.

As a result, Mr. Fang said that Taihuang Mountain was tired of playing and wanted to go to another 
place to see it.

"Xiaoxue, you want to go somewhere else, but you have to tell it, don't you? How else would I 
know where to go?"

Li Yun looked helpless. Sure enough, before the girl became a woman, she would become very 
upset, all kinds of coquettish anger, and it would take a while to coax well.

Fang Xue's face blushed, "Go...go...to see the valley last night?"

"Go there?" Li Feng asked her in surprise.

"I didn't see it clearly last night!" Fang Xue hugged Li Yun's arm and acted like a baby. "Go, go, I 
didn't see the whole picture of the pine tree demon last night. It was too dark at night."

"It's a monster, not a tree." Li Yun corrected her and turned to look at Li Feng: "Sister, do you want 
to go?"

"Little Fengfeng!"

As soon as Fang Xue stared, Li Feng raised her hand to surrender, her best friend was so 
troublesome that she could annoy you if she didn't agree.



So the three of them took the cable car down the mountain again, passed through Huangxi Village 
and then arrived in front of the valley.

"Stop ahead!"

Several mighty gunmen stood in front of the road. After seeing Li Yun's trio, one of them 
immediately stood up and stretched out a palm to him, making a gesture of forbidden to pass.

"You are stupid!" His other companion hurriedly pulled him back, "This is Mr. Li Yun from last 
night"

"what!"

With embarrassment on the soldier's face, Li Yun smiled and said, "It's okay, I just came here to take 
a look. There was nothing wrong with it last night?"

"No, no, nothing happened, and no one was hurt!"

Chapter 2013: Back to the valley

The soldier who recognized Li Yun quickly replied, and then said with a frightened expression: "It's 
just that there are some huge monsters peeping in the mountains and forests from time to time. I 
saw with my own eyes a seventeen-eight-meter-long python spawning a letter to this side, warning 
It took a few shots into the sky before it ran away."

"There was indeed a python in the monster group last night." Fang Xue whispered.

The soldiers looked at each other, secretly rejoicing that it was not them who faced dozens of 
monsters last night.

After all, they have all heard that those monsters are all rough and thick-skinned monsters. A 
cannon will not necessarily damage their fur in the past. Once dozens of monsters initiate a charge, 
the casualties will be extremely severe.

Only such a worldly expert like Mr. Li Yun can retreat with his whole body, right?

"Then we go in first, you can continue to stand guard."

"Yes!"

Li Yun took Fang Xue and Li Feng into the valley. There were already at least thousands of heavily 
armed soldiers on guard. Soldiers in camouflage uniforms and various powerful weapons could be 
seen everywhere along the way. Li Yun estimates that if time is not too late, it is estimated that tanks 
will be driven here.

Dozens of monsters are too scary.

"General Zhao, huh? Reporter Gao, you are still there."

Li Yun found General Zhao in the middle of the valley next to the fallen pine tree demon. He was 
discussing with several professors, and Gao Xiaoxiao and the cameraman were nearby.

"Li Yun!?"



General Zhao and others were very happy to see Li Yun. It was much safer to have such a master 
sitting in town.

After a brief conversation, I learned that Gao Xiaoxiao and the two are now assigned to the special 
temporary management department, and we will talk about it later.

"Mr. Li, hello." A professor named Zhu Zian greeted him. Li Yun was quite surprised. Professor Zhu 
Zian smiled and explained: "I am a researcher at the Cloud Gods Research Institute, and the director 
has already told us. , Mr. Li Yun, you are the special consultant of the institute!"

Cloud Gods Research Institute?

Li Yun remembered that Xia Ming had mentioned this to him, and the system also gave him a 
choice event and gave him a funny book called "Science Cultivation" for elementary school.

"Hello."

Li Yun shook his hand with an unnatural expression.

After all, he is a dignified consultant, but he doesn't even know where the research institute is, what 
research is being done, who is there, etc. This is really unreasonable.

"Mr. Li!" Professor Zhu Zian didn't talk too much nonsense, and the next sentence was to 
respectfully ask him: "We plan to transport this mutated monster pine tree back to the research 
institute, no matter how hard it is, it's just that this tree is really real. It’s too big and we are hesitant 
to cut it open."

"Slicing is also a problem."

General Zhao, who was in a uniform, now frowned and looked at the huge tree trunk tens of meters 
high with embarrassment: "Its texture is very hard, even if it shoots bullets, it only makes a small 
hole in it. So according to the project quantity, it will take at least three months to ship it out!"

Everyone was speechless.

The dead monster had to toss its corpse so hard, it was hard to imagine how the monster pine tree 
would deal with it when it was alive.

"Ding, trigger the option event, please choose from the host:

Option 1: Help Professor Zian Zhu transport the pine tree monster back, reward justice value 
+500,000, white gift bag*3, pine wood sword*1 (golden).

Option 2: Ignore, no reward. "

Chapter 2014: Just things

Li Yun's eyes lit up, his expression a little excited, he actually rewarded 500,000 justice points? The 
system is really generous!

He killed the pine tree demon last night, and it turned out that there was no justice at all. 
Unexpectedly, today he was given a reward of 500,000 justice!

"Institute... That's how it is."



Contacting the research institute established by the country, Li Yun probably wanted to understand 
why there are so many justice values.

The study of pine tree monsters can bring benefits to the country and strengthen the power of 
ordinary people to resist monsters in a disguised form, which is a great benefit to the entire society.

Therefore, compared to killing someone or destroying a conspiracy, enhancing the overall power of 
society is the correct way to obtain justice!

Li Yun couldn't help but think of a story.

Saying that a corrupt official went to **** after his death in ancient times, he thought that he had 
done a lot of evil in his life and would be sent to the eighteenth **** by Lord Yan.

As a result, the Lord Yan sent two envoys with bull head and horse face to respectfully lead him to 
the path of reincarnation to the wealthy family.

The corrupt official was very surprised and couldn't help asking why.

The Lord Yan replied: "You once wrote to the court once in your lifetime, opened warehouses for 
disaster relief, and saved thousands of people, so you have great merit."

The corrupt official was deeply surprised. That time he applied to the court only to gain a good 
reputation, but now he has benefited from it.

Going back to Li Yun, he killed dozens of people with the Six Demon Gates, maybe they were no 
better than helping to study and do things at once, which is the same as the story.

"it is good!"

Li Yun agreed with a smile, raised his hand and evoked the Leap Fire God Sword. The red sword 
suddenly appeared, shocking everyone around him.

Especially Professor Zhu Zian. He has always heard how Mr. Li is magical in the Cloud Gods 
Research Institute, but after all he hasn’t seen it with his own eyes. Now he suddenly saw Li Yun 
use a sword like a magic spell, his eyes were wide open. NS.

"This is...space compression?"

Just like a scene in science fiction, Professor Zhu Zian almost doubted his three views. Fortunately, 
seeing this strangely large pine tree demon with his own eyes, he was psychologically prepared.

"Almost, not very magical, so so."

Li Yun humbled, and jumped onto the huge charred tree trunk. This action once again frightened 
everyone and jumped too high!

"General Zhao, I'll cut this tree open. How about you transport it back later?"

"Oh, good! I'm bothering you, Li Yun!"

General Zhao was overjoyed and waved his hand to disperse the soldiers a bit, and don't hinder the 
performance of Mr. Li Yun's shocking sword spirit.



Fang Xue and Li Feng looked at each other, and both women were proud of Li Yun's arrogance.

After they were all dispersed, Li Yun smiled slightly, his body slowly deepened, his hand spewed 
out a dark blue flame, and the handsome figure standing in the sky made him more and more like a 
**** who descended from the sky!

"Huh!"

Li Yun swung his sword, and the sword gas silently sank into the giant tree trunk of the pine tree 
demon. The dark blue flame combined with the sword gas cut open the hard-textured tree trunk like 
tofu.

Flying forward along the tree trunk, Li Yun kept the sword in his hand, sprinkling the sword gas one 
after another, cutting the 300-meter-high tree trunk into sections into pie-shaped sections, which 
were neatly collapsed and stacked, just like a long section. Bread that has been cut open.

"Okay, awesome!"

General Zhao, Professor Zhu Zian, and the thousands of soldiers present were all stunned.

Chapter 2015: Ding, pine sword

It takes three months of engineering work for an ordinary cutting machine. Li Yun swung a fiery red 
sword back and forth and finished it in less than a minute.

"finished!"

Li Yun fell lightly and smiled at the people around him.

General Zhao took a deep breath. He felt that General Xia Ming was right. At this turbulent time, it 
is Huang Xuanguo's luck to have such a peerless master as Mr. Li help!

"Thank Mr. Li Yun!" General Zhao saluted Li Yun, but the soldiers in the valley did the same, 
saluting Li Yun together.

"Uh, guys, I can't afford this, just call me Li Yun!"

Li Yun smiled bitterly, but he was very moved in his heart. He only did a little thing, but he made 
these soldiers so respected and uneasy.

"Right!"

General Zhao put down his hand with a smile, came up to hold Li Yun's hand enthusiastically, and 
patted Li Yun's shoulder excitedly, without mentioning all kinds of praise.

"Ding, the host made a choice to help Professor Zian Zhu transport the pine tree demon back, 
reward justice value +500,000, white gift bag*3, pine sword*1 (golden), extra reward: pine spell set 
refining method (limited Gift to the Cloud Gods Research Institute, an additional reward of 100,000 
justice points

Li Yun was very pleasantly surprised, and there were additional rewards.

I took a look at the effect of this pine magic set. It should be refined with the three-hundred-meter-
long pine tree demon corpse. It does not need to cooperate with various spells, and it can be refined 
with ordinary methods.



In this way, the Cloud Gods Research Institute can have at least thousands of spell defense suits, 
and there is a guarantee in dealing with the emergence of monsters in the future.

"very good!"

Li Yun turned his head and smiled at Professor Zhu Zian: "These pine woods have special effects 
and can resist the weak demon infestation. I have a method on how to use these pine woods. You 
can take them back and study them."

"Really? Thank you very much, Mr. Li!" Professor Zhu Zian was very surprised. Their research 
institute is now in its infancy, and they don’t know much about monsters and practitioners. With the 
help of Li Yun, the research progress can be greatly accelerated. many!

After giving the things to him, Li Yun turned his head to look at Li Feng and said with a mysterious 
smile: "Sister, I have one more thing for you here."

"Oh?"

Li Feng looked forward to it. She was very interested in Xue's bracelet and wanted something 
similar.

Unfortunately, the things Li Yun wanted to give her were not of that kind.

"Pine Sword

Special effect: kill monsters.

Skill: Twig entanglement (passive, every time you swing the sword, there is a probability that a twig 
will entangle the enemy and slow down the opponent.)

Explanation: By coincidence, the pine tree that obtained the demon blood turned into a demon, and 
began the revenge journey of the plant. "

Seeing the attributes of this golden sword, Li Yun couldn't laugh or cry. Was the pine tree demon 
taking revenge on the animals? No wonder it worked so hard to come up with the decoy of demon 
blood.

If the pine tree demon swallows all the demon blood, its strength should be even more terrifying.

Holding the wooden dagger in his hand, Li Feng bulged his mouth. Although he was not satisfied 
(because he was not better than a good girlfriend), he was still happy. After all, it was something her 
brother gave her.

"Let's go, let's go back!" Li Yun actively proposed, and there is nothing to do if you stay here, so it's 
better to go back to the hotel quickly.

"What do you want to do when you go back?"

Fang Xue glanced at him with a look of "I know what you villain think", Li Yun smiled, lying next 
to her ear and said softly, "Of course..."

"What is it? Huh? Say it! Say it!" Fang Xue put her hand on Li Yun's waist, narrowing her face.

"Hurry up... you, ah~~~ my wife is forgiving!"



"Bad guy, don't run!"

Chapter 2016: Memorable day

The next day, ten o'clock in the morning.

In the Tianshen Pavilion, Li Yun still woke up from a soft fragrance, surrounded by two early Cheng 
En Ze Hou, delicate and delicate beauties were sleeping.

On the white bed sheet discarded on the ground, two bright red marks are clearly visible, and the 
beauty is intoxicating.

"Uh!"

Thinking of what had lasted for more than six hours last night, Li Yun couldn't help feeling satisfied 
again, and felt heavy responsibility.

The two girls around him gave themselves to him, and the future life will be firmly connected with 
him, rich and poor, life and death, and will never leave.

"Xiaoxue."

"sister."

Li Yun stroked Fang Xue and Li Feng's cheeks, the two women grunted dissatisfiedly, and hid their 
heads under the quilt to continue sleeping.

The fresh melon just broke, the delicate flowers just bloomed, and the two girls needed sleep now.

Li Yun chuckled, amused for his inexplicable emotion, shook his head and got out of bed.

This may be the entanglement that a big boy will have when he becomes a man.

Although Li Yun had tried a lot of messy gameplay before today, he had a little experience at home, 
in Adoshan Hot Spring, in Beijing, and even at Qingyu House in Zhonghai City.

But last night was the first time after all, it is worth remembering.

"Ah! I should also prepare for the future!"

Let the two women continue to sleep soundly. After Li Yun washed up, he lay on the balcony in 
pajamas as usual, preparing to open the bag with the fresh morning air of Mount Taihuang and the 
endless sea of clouds.

"How can I say that last night was also my first time, coupled with the domineering side leakage of 
Taihuang Mountain, a small mountain, this time I should be able to open the bag to open something 
good!"

Li Yun opened his inventory and saw the various bags full of Dangdang, feeling full of 
accomplishment in his heart.

He still remembers how some of these bags came from.

Teasing Linghuo Master received 4 golden gift bags, killing Thousand Soul Old Ancestor clones 
and getting two more, persuading Da Ri Venerable to get 1 colorful gift bag, and using Baiyun 
Technology's high-tech face to get another colorful gift bag from around the world. , No. 1 in the 



college entrance examination, and won two colorful colors-these two were used up yesterday, and 
500,000 auras were replaced.

and many more.

Li Yun now has 10 golden gift bags, 3 colorful, and the rest are white, green, blue, purple, etc.

Uh, it doesn't look like a lot.

The main reason is that a lot of direct transactions with the system were wasted yesterday, although 
there was no loss.

"No matter what, let's open five white ones first."

Li Yun rubbed his hands, and it was the exciting part of opening the bag again. It's not impossible 
for a bag to take off!

"Ding, the host gets a rich breakfast for three people*1 in the white gift bag."

I'm Cao.

The corners of Li Yun's mouth twitched, the system is really sensible, knowing that he and Fang 
Xue's two daughters were the first time last night, and this morning they gave him a breakfast, yes, 
yes... yes!

"What I want is good things, real good things, understand!?"

Li Yun gritted his teeth and said.

In the next moment, a colorful light burst out from the white bag, shining Li Yun's two dogs almost 
blindly.

"I...Cao!!!!?"

"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening a colorful item in the white gift bag: God-level skill 
pill*1."

Li Yun opened his mouth and finally said two words: The system is awesome!

Why are two words? Because the system = awesome. So it is two words.

Li Yun was so excited. Although he still had two colorful gift bags on his body, it felt completely 
different when he took out the colorful items from the white bag!

Chapter 2017: Ding, the god-level skill Dan

It's as if you made 10,000 yuan and bought lottery tickets happily, only to make another 10,000 
yuan!

This feeling is really refreshing!

"Huh, calm down, how can I say that I am also a ‘man’ now, bluffing is a problem that only virgins 
have!"

Li Yun grinned, lying on the chair with Erlang's legs upright, and decided to use this god-level skill 
pill directly!



At the very beginning, the first colorful item he opened in the white gift bag was also a god-level 
skill pill. At that time, Li Yun wanted to save it later to obtain good skills before eating, but it was 
saved as soon as he stayed. Now.

"Now that I have obtained two god-level skill pill, I should use one of them!"

Li Yun raised his eyebrows lightly, and decisively took out the skill pill he had just opened from his 
inventory.

The appearance of the god-level skill pill is not much different from the ordinary one, but it has a 
strange and strange fragrance that makes the index finger move, which is condensed but not 
scattered, which is very mysterious.

Li Yun admired the treasure he opened before putting it in his mouth.

"System, use the god-level skill pill to upgrade my earth evil sun fire power to god-level!"

The god-level skill pill can directly upgrade any skill to god-level, and has a chance to understand 
stronger advanced skills.

Although his earth evil sun fire skill is already at a master level, using the **** level skill pill is 
really a waste, but Li Yun used it directly in order to work hard to comprehend the advanced skills!

After all, Earth Shayang Fire Art is his basic technique, the stronger the better!

"Ding, the host uses the god-level skill pill, and the earth evil sun fire power has been upgraded to 
the god-level."

"Ding, because of the earth's evil sun, the fire power has been promoted to the **** level, and the 
host has a new passive: flame teleport."

"Ding, because of the earth's evil sun, the fire art has been upgraded to a **** level, and the host's 
misty fire body technique is automatically upgraded to a high level, allowing you to quickly move 
through the flames."

"Ding, the earth evil sun fire skill has failed to advance to a higher level."

……Grass.

Li Yun scolded his father secretly, comprehending failure, and used the god-level skill Danbai.

Fortunately, because of the promotion to the **** level, there is an extra passivity, and the body can 
be automatically promoted to a high level, otherwise it is really a loss.

"Flame teleportation: moving at super high speed in a place with strong flames within 30 meters."

Li Yun touched his chin. According to this passive description, flame teleportation is not true 
teleportation, but ultra-high-speed movement, almost teleportation.

And it can't be teleported casually, the target point must have flames, and the flames must burn 
vigorously to teleport over.

Restrictions are big or small, and small are not small.



If he was in the magma underground like Mount A'Duo last time, Li Yun was confident that he 
could play with the Taoist White Crane with this passive, unless he had a large-scale powerful 
attack skill, otherwise there would be no way to take Li Yun.

But if it is an unprepared battlefield, this passivity is almost useless.

Fortunately, Li Yun himself is playing with fire. As long as there is no place to burn, he can rely on 
the fierce fire to ignite the surrounding areas of the battlefield, so as to be able to teleport the flame.

Besides, there is still a lot of fuel in his space ring. It's a big deal to throw a few cans on the ground 
to ignite, and create an environment suitable for combat!

Except in one case: in the sea.

Then Li Yun really couldn't do it.

"A good start, continue smoking!"

Li Yun continued to open the bags happily, but ended up opening all the white, green and blue bags. 
Jin Guang didn't see any of them, cheating.

"System, open all the purple bags!" Li Yun gritted his teeth, he didn't believe that there was no good 
thing!

Luck can’t be used up so quickly, right?

"Ding~~!"

Chapter 2018: Ring ring, or ring

"The host obtains from the purple gift bag: fire avoidance charm (small), medium detoxification 
pill*1, medium recovery pill*2, water avoidance charm (small)*2..."

A long list of useless things came out one after another, and Li Yun's face turned green.

In the end, he was only given a golden one.

"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening a space ring*1 (10 cubic meters) from the purple gift 
bag."

Space ring!

Barely not bad, there are many confidantes around Li Yun who don’t have this stuff. For example, 
his sister Li Feng gave her a peach wood sword yesterday, and today just gave her a ring to store 
weapons, and then take it out when used. .

"System, open three golden gift bags!"

The highlight is coming. Li Yun is looking forward to bringing out some good equipment. He now 
has weapons and shoes, but he still lacks combat clothes. It is best to have a close-fitting garment 
that can block a fatal injury. That would be great!

"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening the golden equipment from the golden gift bag: space 
ring*1 (10 cubic meters

Here again?

"Ding, the host got it from the golden gift bag: Recovery Pill*1."



"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening the golden equipment from the golden gift bag: space 
ring*1 (10 cubic meters

I'm Cao!

Li Yun was shocked, and actually opened three spatial rings in a row!

Isn't this thing very rare?

Should today's luck be good or bad?

It can only be said that it is barely okay.

"System, open three more bags!"

"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening the golden equipment from the golden gift bag: space 
ring*1 (10 cubic meters

Me. Day!

Li Yun said that he had nothing to say. Today, he really stabbed the nest of the space ring, causing 
these things to pop out one by one.

"Ding, congratulations to the host for getting the golden equipment from the golden gift bag: Five 
Thunders Exorcism Jade Pendant."

"Ding, the host gets it from the golden gift bag: Detoxification Pill*1"

The remaining two bags are okay. The Five Thunder Exorcising Jade Pei is a good defensive 
jewelry. Li Yun had obtained one before and gave it to Liu Xianxian, and this time it happened to 
his sister Li Feng.

Li Yun is not short of pill now. In addition to the lack of skill pill, there are a lot of remaining four 
types of pill, especially small and medium-sized ones. There are nearly one thousand pills, enough 
for pets and daughters in the family to eat for a long time. NS.

"System, continue to open the remaining four golden bags."

"Ding, congratulations to the host for opening the golden equipment from the golden gift bag: space 
ring*1 (10 cubic meters

alright

Li Yun did find a nest of space rings today, four in a row are really enjoyable, really exciting, 
really...tm has nothing to say.

"Ding, the host gets it from the golden gift bag: Peiyuan Dan*1, Skill Dan*1."

"Ding, congratulations to the host from..."

Li Yun's spirits lifted. Every time the system congratulates him, there is a good thing. It seems that 
the last bag... is it still the space ring?

"Bring out the golden equipment: Thunder Bow."



bow?

He wants this thing...Oh yes, it can be used with the archery!

Thinking of shooting a sun arrow, Li Yun was a little surprised, so he checked the properties of this 
bow.

"Thunder Bow

Special effect: with the power of thunder

Skills: Thunder Arrow (5/5), Thunder Power (Passive, each time you shoot an arrow, you can carry 
part of the lightning power)

Description: Legend has it that the **** of the Titans, the good ambassador of Thunder, used the 
thunderbolt as a weapon to defeat his father Cronus and become the king of the gods. "

Chapter 2019: Ding, Suzaku Summoning Talisman

Zeus?

Li Yun doesn’t know much about Western mythology, but he has also heard of the name of the **** 
king. It is said that this servant has hundreds of illegitimate children in Olympus, with horses, cows, 
sheep, and him. Sister's, and the wives of human kings, and even... and men!

That's right, Zeus is cold and cold. Regardless of whether he is male or female, it is said that the 
person he loves most is a young man. He is so emotional that he makes his sister and wife Hera 
very jealous.

Li Yun has no spare time to despise, there is Zeus in the west, and dragons in the east.

The so-called dragon begets the nine sons, each has its own difference. This saying not only means 
that the offspring is different, but also implies that the dragon is licentious, and it means to mess 
with all kinds of animals.

"Western thunder bow with eastern sun-shooting arrow?"

The corners of Li Yun's mouth twitched, it was not a bit messy, and the style of painting was 
different.

Forget it, anyway, myth, too lazy to manage.

"System, open the first colorful gift bag!"

The real highlight begins now!

Li Yun is extremely expecting that the colorful gift bag can get a real good thing, preferably a 
peerless treasure that can continuously produce aura like that Hongmeng Purple Spirit Bracelet.

When the system was rewarded to Fanqing Sheng, Li Yun still didn’t think the fairy bracelet was so 
powerful, but then he began to gain aura value, and discovered that the aura can make the fairy 
house more suitable for cultivation, and can make the black feather Butterflies have a full stomach, 
and after supplementing the depletion of the terrible fire.



Li Yun suddenly discovered that the fairy bracelet is worthy of a peerless treasure named 
Hongmeng. Apart from anything else, the fact that it continuously produces aura is enough to make 
him extremely greedy!

If this piece of equipment is known to the practitioners of the Hidden Sacred Valley and the Six 
Doors, it is estimated that countless great abilities will come out to kill the Hidden Sacred Valley at 
all costs and seize this supreme treasure!

Because in this world where aura is declining, the Hongmeng Purple Qi Fairy Bracelet is self-
generating aura, the effect is too bad!

It's a pity that the fairy bracelet is a peerless treasure that the system designated to give her when the 
Fanqing Sage's favorability reached 100, and Li Yun couldn't use it even if she wanted to use it.

"The avenue is fifty, Tianyan is forty-nine, and people are one of them. Is there really a cosmic 
purple qi in the fairy bracelet? This thing is in the ancient mythology, but it is a necessary 
opportunity for sanctification!"

Every time Li Yun thinks of this, he is not regretting that he has sent a peerless treasure to 
Qingsheng, but fortunately that it is not a prehistoric era. Otherwise, the ancient power can count on 
it and know that there is a chance for Sanctification in the hands of the Fan Qingsheng. Come 
personally to **** the Hongmeng Ziqi.

For no reason, just grab it!

This is related to the chance of sanctification. Which **** can withstand the temptation?

"Ding, congratulations to the host for the colorful grade equipment from the colorful gift bag: 
Suzaku Talisman (disposable item

What the hell?

Seeing that it was a one-off item, it was even more than the sun-shooting arrow used once three 
months before, Li Yun couldn't help but look forward to its power and quickly check its properties.

"Suzaku Summoning Charm (one-time item)

Special effects: None.

Skill: Summon Suzaku projection.

Description: Suzaku, according to legend, is one of the four spirits of the sky, the southern dingding 
fire, cut into liquid to become a dragon, and form a gas into a bird. Its aura becomes the sky, and its 
quality declines to the earth. "

Suzaku projection...

Li Yun really didn't know whether to say good or bad.



Saying it is useful, it can't immediately change his strength; saying it is useless, but this thing 
belongs to nuclear weapons, and it can kill the Quartet when summoned, and it is not a problem to 
frighten the old monsters of the six gates.

Therefore, this thing is best to be the same as shooting a **** arrow, praying for a day that will 
never be activated.

Chapter 2020: God Ring

"Open again!"

Putting the Suzaku Summoning Talisman at the bottom of the pressing box, Li Yun chose to open 
the second colorful gift bag.

"Ding, congratulations to the host for the colorful level exercises from the colorful gift bag: "Sky 
Demon Xuan Huang""

Li Yun: "..."

He had nothing to say, the first exercise that came out of the colorful gift bag turned out to be 
exclusively for monsters, so does the system want him to change to the monster clan?

No, you won't become a demon if you die!

"Cheating system!"

Li Yun depressedly threw this golden shining technique back to his inventory. It cannot be said to be 
completely useless. Although the nine-winged black feather butterfly and the three-eyed toad are 
murderous insects, there are natural magical powers that do not need to be practiced, but the little 
fox can practice it from a distance. The level is also far away.

But in the future, it may be useful.

"The last colorful gift bag, open it!"

Li Yun gritted his teeth, should I give something good this time, right?

"Ding, congratulations to the host for the colorful level equipment from the colorful gift bag: God 
level space ring (1000 cubic meters

"..."

"..."

Babbled.

Li Yun has nothing to say at all. It is true today, and he ran into the nest of the Space Ring without 
any error. Before, he opened five small ones, but now I have a big one, which is very scientific, very 
reasonable, and very logical. !

Li Yun sighed, put the contents of the original space ring on the balcony, and then installed it with 
the god-level space ring.

After installation, I felt the inside. 1000 cubic meters is 10*10*10, which is about 100 square 
meters of room, and the height is twice that of ordinary rooms.



It’s not that big, but it’s much better than a 10 cubic meter golden ring. You can put more fuel in the 
future to release the flame teleportation.

"Brother, what are you doing?"

Li Feng didn't know when he woke up, and saw Li Yun taking things out of that space ring and 
taking them back, so he asked curiously.

Li Yun turned his head and looked at the room, and his eyes suddenly brightened. The gentle beauty 
in the room was wearing a pure white pajamas. Her snow-white skin was smooth and delicate. 
There was a trace of the mark left on her body last night, which made her index finger move.

"Sister, come here, I have something for you!"

"Huh?" Li Feng glanced under him, "Bad brother, are you sure you are not bullying me?"

"Of course not, am I that kind of person?"

"Usually you are not, but sometimes you are!"

Li Feng walked over and wanted to sit next to his younger brother, but was pulled over by Li Yun 
and hugged him directly.

"Also, say you are not!"

A touching blush appeared on Li Feng's charming face, and Li Yun gave Li Yun a white look with 
her charming eyes.

This bad guy, that's all in the early morning, is she too used to him?

"Hey-hey."

Li Yun smiled and kissed her, then took out a ring, raised Li Feng's hand, and said softly, "Sister, 
this is what I gave you."

"Ah!!"

Li Feng was very surprised. She looked at Li Yun with her beautiful eyes wide open, and the little 
hand held by him trembled slightly: "This, this is...? No, you want to marry Xiaoxue, I can't steal 
her... …"

Having said that, Li Feng's eyes were clearly filled with infinite surprises and happiness, allowing 
Li Yun to put the ring on her left middle finger.

"Like it?"

The beautiful ring is inlaid on Li Feng’s slender middle finger, revealing a noble and mysterious 
aura, making Li Feng’s temperament suddenly changed from the image of a gentle big sister to a 
powerful and noble imperial sister. There is some inexplicable charm with a smile.
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