
Godly Choice 591

Chapter 591: Another skill pill

There was no shouting, no screaming, no splattering of blood, no gun smoke.

But this battle is just as tragic!

The zombies did not feel that they were fighting as if they had broken their hands and feet. 
Therefore, there were more than a thousand people on the scene, but the ground was already 
covered with broken limbs. It seemed that they were telling Li Yun and the others that before they 
came, this battle was already Lasted for a long time.

"Ah! Li Yun, look there!" Jin Liuli pointed her finger in a certain direction, and said in surprise: 
"Isn't that zombie General Xu?!"

The zombie she pointed at was the weird zombie who had cut his own coffin to pieces when she 
met at the Keihai Leopard.

It has now changed to a spear weapon, and it is waving vigorously, thinking it will definitely be a 
rare fierce general in the future!

Li Yun smiled slightly, "No, he is not General Xu, he should be General Xu's subordinate, a general 
or a general or a school lieutenant."

It now appears that the zombie broke his coffin to pieces before, and it should be to participate in 
this battle.

It's just that Li Yun wondered whether it came to protect the palace or the party that wanted to break 
the Golden Temple?

Both sides of the battle are zombies, and there is almost no difference in equipment, but they can 
distinguish between enemy and us, and the battle is unambiguous.

"Ding, the host made a choice and merged with Alice to track the whereabouts of the zombies. The 
rewards (experience value + 1 million, all attributes + 1000, golden gift bag*1, purple gift bag*3) 
have been distributed!"

The reward was very generous, but Li Yun was a little unhappy. He had known that he would not 
add points first, and wasted the big reward of all attributes +1000!

Fortunately, the golden gift bag was still there, Li Yun opened it without saying a word.

"Ding, the host gets a medium recovery pill*2, a medium detoxification pill *1, and a medium 
peiyuan pill *1."

"Ding, the host opened a golden grade item in the golden gift bag: Enhanced Skill Dan*1."

The corner of Li Yun's mouth twitched. This Nima already had an enhanced skill pill, why did he 
get another one?

Could it be that the system hinted that he had eaten the skill pill?



But Li Yun didn't have time to eat skill pill before, and now he still doesn't have time.

"what!"

Suddenly, Yang Jie screamed and pointed to the roof of the Jinluang Temple and shouted: "Li Yun, 
there is a man in black there, he is looking at us!"

what! ?

Everyone was shocked, Li Yun had already reflected, and when he raised the Silvin pistol, it shot a 
bullet.

boom!

The bullet hit an invisible wall, a burst of smoke burst out, and then slowly appeared an old man in 
black clothes and black eyebrows, who was the Venerable Black Eyebrow that everyone had 
encountered before in Wei Yueyan's tomb!

"Boy!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow's appearance has undergone a great change, his whole body seems to be 
blurred, and black auras emerge from his body, which distorts the surrounding light, and the figure 
becomes very blurred.

"Unexpectedly, I didn't look for you, but you came to die!" Venerable Black Eyebrow was 
condescending and looked at Li Yun with a fierce look, looking like he would swallow him alive.

Li Yun smiled faintly, "You are the old ghost with black eyebrows? This is your law body, right? As 
long as I kill you again, you will really die."

"So!" Jin Liuli triumphantly raised the peach wood sword and pointed at him and shouted: "You 
ugly guy with black eyebrows must be careful not to be killed by our younger generations again, 
otherwise, say What a shame to go out!"

Chapter 592: Actually four magical instruments

Everyone wanted to laugh but didn't dare to laugh, Jin Liuli's words were too annoying!

Sure enough, Venerable Black Eyebrow was so angry that he was full of black arrogance, as if he 
was incarnation of an ancient beast, and the evil aura enveloped everyone present.

"Smelly girl, you are looking for death!"

As he said, he stretched out his hand angrily, and with a swish, a black gas burst from his fingertips, 
shooting towards Jin Liuli's chest at a speed comparable to a bullet.

Li Yun stood in front of Jin Liuli and didn't dare to use his fists to force it. First, he tried the moves 
of the black-browed venerable with an ordinary sword.

With a sneer, the black gas hit the long sword. Suddenly, this attached Li Yun Zhenqi long sword 
was corroded into a scar. If it weren't for Zhenqi's resistance, I'm afraid this sword would be 
scrapped on the spot!

"Huh! How can you take me?"



Venerable Black Eyebrow sneered, his fingers flicked, and one after another black gas shot out like 
bullets. Everyone evaded in a panic. After the black gas touched the blue brick floor, it corroded and 
melted instantly, corroding the blue bricks one by one. Potholes.

"Shoot, knock him down!"

Alice screamed and ordered, and at the same time, she waved the golden double-stranded fork in 
her hand to block a large number of black bullets.

After the attack stopped for a while, Alice glanced at the golden double-stranded fork and found 
that it was still golden, and the black gas could not corrode this legendary Pluto weapon!

Although it is an imitation.

"boom!"

Li Yun shot it over again. Venerable Black Eyebrows instigated the black evil spirits all over his 
body to resist, but he was still shocked by this bullet carrying destructive power. He had cultivated 
for a hundred years, and then invaded this tomb of the Emperor of Heaven and seized its magic 
circle The mighty power gained by the power actually couldn't stop Li Yun's bullet!

"you!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow finally woke up and glanced around Li Yun, Jin Liuli and the others, with 
a strange look on his face: "Three, no, four magical artifacts! You actually have four magical 
artifacts, why? possible?!"

His majestic black eyebrows, in the six demon gates comparable to the existence of the elders, he 
has cultivated for a hundred years, but he has only two magical weapons in his hands.

One of them was only snatched by him after killing a fellow, which shows the scarcity of magical 
artifacts.

However, Li Yun and his group actually have four magical artifacts. You must know that these 
people are no better than him in total age!

"You have good eyesight."

Li Yun smiled mockingly. In fact, there were more than four magical artifacts, two of Jin Liuli's 
body, and two of Yang Jie's body.

At the same time, Li Yun understood in his heart that, as Concubine Wan Qing said, even in the Six 
Demon Gates and the Hidden Sacred Valley, there are very few people who possess magical 
artifacts.

"Okay!" Venerable Black Eyebrow showed a weird smile. He wanted to laugh, but it seemed that 
his muscles were atrophy and he couldn't laugh at all, his expression was very strange.

"that is really good!"



Venerable Black Eyebrow was overjoyed: "I originally thought that spending 20 years to occupy 
this tomb was my biggest gain in 50 years. I never expected that when I was about to succeed, 
someone actually sent me four It’s a great artifact! Hahaha!"

Sudden.

"Boom!"

A shocking thunder came from the bottom up, from Li Yun's hand, and hit the Venerable Black 
Eyebrow fiercely.

Fast, too fast!

Everyone only saw a blue light flashing in front of them, and then they heard a burst of thunder 
from their ears.

Jin Liuli jumped three feet high like a frightened kitten, and Alice was stunned, her eardrums roared 
and she was at a loss with a double-stranded fork.

Chapter 593: Billowing Thunder

But the worst is not them, but the Venerable Black Eyebrow standing on top of the Golden Luang 
Temple.

He was hit by the sky thunder frontally, and he rolled down from the roof with a scream, his black 
aura was dissipated, and even his illusory body became much blurred.

"Great!"

Jin Liuli cheered: "Li Yun, give him another...gun, ah, what's wrong with you?"

She hurriedly stepped forward to support Li Yun. For the first time, she saw his pale face and 
trembling hands. Jin Liuli's heart was incomparable imitation and helplessness.

Before she knew it, she had become accustomed to seeing Li Yun's calm and indifferent appearance, 
and even felt that he was omnipotent and could deal with any powerful enemy!

So seeing what Li Yun looks like now, Jin Liuli burst into tears and cried: "You, you big bad guy, 
don't scare me, oh, I won't scold you again, okay, come here soon! "

"..."

"I'm fine."

After taking out a medium recovery pill with a trembling hand, Li Yun regained some strength.

He couldn't help smiling wryly in his heart. This Nine Heavens Thunder Talisman was stronger than 
he had imagined, but the power consumed was also greater than he had imagined.

Not only was the true energy consumed, and even the physical strength was sucked up by this spell, 
this thing is not acquired, or even the martial artist of the innate realm can control it!

If it weren't for Li Yun's incomparable innocence, I'm afraid he wouldn't even be able to send it out!



Fortunately, as he had previously expected, the recovery pill can relieve the weakness after using 
the sky thunder talisman, but it is also limited to this. It is impossible to use it a second time in a 
short time.

If I use it any more, Li Yun suspects that his blood will be drained, and the recovery pill will not be 
able to save it!

"Really okay?" Jin Liuli held Li Yun with tears in his eyes, and the girl's virgin fragrance rushed 
over his face. Li Yun felt that the fragrance was stronger than the medium recovery pill, and he 
actually felt a sense of heat in his body.

What Jin Liuli cultivates is soft and innocent, and the girl's figure is extremely soft, and it's 
fascinating.

"Ahem, I'm fine, I can move!"

Li Yun stood up straight and looked at the Venerable Black Eyebrow who was lying in the distance.

The Venerable Black Eyebrow is not dead yet, not even seriously injured, but almost all of his mana 
is scattered by the sky thunder, which is not as good as the normal training period.

Seeing Li Yun raising the pistol again, Venerable Black Eyebrow was startled and rolled around on 
the ground, hiding directly behind the stone railing in front of the Golden Luang Temple.

Jin Liuli chuckled and said, "The so-called venerable person will use this trick to roll around when 
he is in a hurry. I thought it was only used when the little thieves in the rivers and lakes fight!"

"Don't underestimate the lazy donkey rolling, the critical moment is the magical ability to escape!"

Li Yun jokingly said that the Silvin pistol is very useful against ghosts and zombies, but the real 
power is the same as the blocking gun, and it cannot hit the Venerable Black Eyebrow hiding behind 
the stone pillar.

"Let's go forward together and catch him alive!" Alice made a beautiful and wonderful pick, and she 
was about to step forward with a golden double-stranded fork.

But everyone still underestimated the Venerable of the Six Demon Gates.

"You guys are looking for death!!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow screamed, Li Yun vaguely felt a wave of fluctuations spreading, and then, 
half of the zombies who were fighting immediately turned around, and killed everyone in spite of it!

What's more troublesome is that other zombies that were not under his control also chased over, and 
everyone suddenly fell into chaos.

The zombies that originally guarded the tomb of the Emperor of Heaven, plus the zombies that 
rebelled under the control of the Venerable Black Eyebrow, plus Li Yun and others.

The three parties fought together to make the situation out of control.

Chapter 594: Innate, divine mind

People and zombies were mixed together. Li Yun saw Jin Liuli's soft figure tossing around, 
showcasing her "soft magic" and "soft water step" among the zombie group. The combination of 



these two techniques makes her The body is incredibly soft, and various extreme movements can 
make yoga masters ashamed.

On the other side, Princess Alice Windsor, the Valkyrie holding a gold double-stranded fork, is 
indeed the other extreme of Jin Liuli.

The moves are wide-ranging and overbearing, and there is a kind of vertical and horizontal 
battlefield, the style of a female general who is all-powerful!

The golden-red double-stranded cross in his hand will either die or be injured when it encounters a 
zombie. It actually performs better than Guo Xun and Yang Jie!

"No, the guy with black eyebrows will recover if this continues!"

Guo Xun shouted anxiously.

He wanted to rush over with Yang Jie several times to kill Venerable Black Eyebrow, but this guy 
also recovered a bit of mana, hiding from the east, and controlling more than half of the zombies 
here. Everyone actually took him. no way!

"Jie Jie Jie, kid, it's not that easy to kill a Venerable!"

Venerable Blackbrowed sneered triumphantly. Standing beside dozens of zombies, he said, "You are 
probably a grandson of an elder in the Hidden Sacred Valley, right? Humph, those hypocrites in the 
Hidden Sacred Valley, sooner or later I will Kill them all and grab all the training resources! 
Hahaha!"

He also saw that it was impossible for Li Yun's sky thunder to fire continuously, and the magical 
weapons in the hands of this group were not good, so why not let him go!

"Hidden Sacred Valley? Ha ha, no."

Li Yun took out a pill again, shook his head and said, "You probably only have the hidden sacred 
valley and the six magic gates. The world is so big, how can you know it?"

Venerable Heimei frowned with anger, and said coldly, "Are you from Haimen's school?"

As far as he knows, there are indeed some practitioners in overseas countries, but they have not 
endured even more, and they dare not enter the boundaries of Huangxuan country at all!

"You don't understand what you said, so you can go to **** with peace of mind today to find your 
boss, what **** man?"

Li Yun smiled softly, ate the enhanced skill pill, and silently said: "System, upgrade my Nine Suns 
Heavenly Scripture to God level!"

"Ding, the host takes the enhanced skill pill, and the Nine Suns Heaven Jing has been upgraded to 
the **** level!"

"Ding, the enhanced skill Dan has failed to comprehend higher-level skills."

Li Yun wanted to scold the system. Is this enhanced skill pill a scam?



But he didn't have time to scold him now, because the Nine Suns Heavenly Scripture, which had 
risen to the **** level, finally caused a drastic change in his body.

There are hundreds of limbs, viscera, blood, 36,000 pores all over the body, every hair, every part of 
the body seems to be cheering, countless hot currents gushing out, it actually made Li Yun blew up 
a small piece of body. Whirlwind.

"what?!"

Everyone was shocked, thinking that Li Yun had been attacked by a black-brow Taoist. Fortunately, 
Alice responded in time and said unsurely: "Is this a breakthrough from a trainee knight to an 
official knight?"

"The big bad guy is going to be born?" Jin Liuli was also surprised, but also very confused.

From acquired to innate is indeed a qualitative change, but Li Yun is too exaggerated, right?

His whole body was soaring, and there was an incomparably pure innate qi escaping from the 
surroundings, which made people envious of it!

"not good!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow was taken aback, and cried out strangely, "This kid is actually an 
acquired perfection. No wonder he can use such a powerful sky thunder!"

Chapter 595: Venerable Fudo Mingwang

"The day after tomorrow is perfect!?"

Guo Xun, Yang Jie, Jin Liuli, Rong Liang and others were all shocked innately. Although Codiff 
and Alice didn’t understand well, they all guessed that this is an extremely advanced realm of the 
acquired realm, which is not what ordinary people can. Achieved!

"Li Yun, how can I let you break through as you please!!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow finally officially called Li Yun's name, and it is worthy of him to take a 
look at Li Yun after the day after tomorrow.

It is said that five hundred years ago, one of the six demon gates also entered the Tao with martial 
arts. First, the acquired great perfection, then the congenital fetal movement, and finally turned to 
cultivating immortals, soaring into the sky, thirty years, and became a member of the six demon 
gates. The lord, it can be said to be stunning, unparalleled in the world!

Therefore, Venerable Black Eyebrow will never allow Li Yun, who holds a powerful spell in his 
hand, to break through under his nose!

He glared at Li Yun viciously and took out a piece of black lacquered rune paper with golden lines 
on it, which was radiant and mysterious.

Hell Ming Wang Fu.

This is a charm obtained by Venerable Black Eyebrow after killing a fellow door. It is rumored that 
this charm can summon the Buddha's Fudo Ming Wang Zun, and the Fudo Ming Wang will show 



the image of anger, so that the evil spirits that invade all living beings are afraid and far away. The 
effect is extremely powerful.

Now no one can make such a powerful charm, one less one is used, it is extremely precious, and it 
is not a last resort. Venerable Black Eyebrow doesn't want to use this stuff at the bottom of the box.

But now, it has reached the point where the arrow is on the string and I have to send it!

"Venerable Fudo Mingwang, please come to this world, to conquer all ghosts and evil spirits, to 
promote the mysticism of Buddhism, Fudo to respect the Bodhisattva, the light of wisdom..."

He muttered a word in his mouth, after injecting mana into the spell, he threw it into the air, and the 
next moment, a bright Buddha light appeared in front of everyone.

"Amitabha."

The compassionate Buddha's name spread throughout the small palace, everyone stopped their 
movements, and everyone stared blankly at the immovable King Ming phantom floating in the air.

The light of the Buddha shone on every zombie, making the originally hideous and terrifying 
zombie's face all show a serene expression, one after another with a low roar, knelt down in front of 
the bodhisattva.

At this moment, Li Yun was in the critical period of his breakthrough. He stared at the immovable 
shadow of the immovable King Ming that was almost invisible, and he was extremely puzzled.

Why can the Venerable Black Eyebrow, who represents the evil, be able to summon the Fudo Ming 
King of the Buddhist school?

Could it be said that this King Fudo Ming is fake, does not really exist, but is just a form of power?

But the next sentence of Venerable Black Eyebrow made Li Yun understand immediately.

"Give it all to me, kill everyone here!"

As Venerable Black Eyebrow screamed, the Buddha statue dispersed, and all the zombies took up 
their weapons and stood up again, but this time they no longer killed each other, but aimed at Li 
Yun!

It turns out that this Hell King Talisman is only used to deter zombies from wronged souls, so that 
the Black Eyebrows can control them!

The remaining zombies dragged their stiff steps and walked slowly towards Li Yun. The crowd 
gathered together in fright. Jin Liuli hurriedly cried: "Li Yun, think of a way...Ah no, you break 
through. Let's stand it up first!"

She habitually seeks Li Yun's protection, but now Li Yun is in a critical period of breakthrough, and 
she can only rely on them.

"..."

Li Yun was also very depressed. He felt that his body was almost burnt, but he was so short that he 
could not completely step into the innate realm.

"It seems that I can only continue to take medicine!"



Chapter 596: Ding, colorful gift bag

Li Yun gritted his teeth and decisively took out the medium-sized Peiyuan Pill he had just obtained, 
and ate it without hesitation.

But it was still not enough, he took out another enhanced skill pill, eat it!

But-what skills do you need to upgrade to improve your cultivation?

"Reinforced iron bones: advanced

Zhanfeng Sword Technique: Advanced.

Misty footwork: God level.

Risk perception, master

Spiritual resistance, master class.

Boxing method: advanced, one positive punch.

Nine Suns: God-level..."

Li Yun quickly browsed his martial arts skills, and finally set his sights on a master-level passive 
skill. The zombies around began to besiege. There was no time to think about it, so he could only 
grit his teeth and fill it up!

"Ding, the host takes the enhanced skill pill, and his mental resistance is elevated to the **** level!"

"Ding, the enhanced skill Dan successfully comprehended higher-level skills, and obtained an 
evolutionary new skill: Divine Mind."

boom--!

Li Yun only felt that his mind exploded, and his mental power surged like a wave. In an instant, his 
thinking entered a mysterious realm.

With my eyes closed, I can see everything around me, which is clearer and more subtle than when I 
look at it with my eyes.

It is as if a person with myopia of 800 degrees suddenly undergoes laser surgery, his eyes are clear 
and clear, and his eyes are piercing.

"It turns out that this is the practitioner."

Li Yun suddenly understood that so-called practitioners, their magic power is actually the same root 
as true qi, and they are all derived from the life force of the person itself, but the magic power 
becomes under the blessing of spiritual power or divine mind. More powerful, able to display more 
mysterious skills.

"Divine Mind, Elementary (Passive effect: makes the host's spirit more tenacious. Active effect: You 
can use Divine Mind to perceive the outside world.

Divine Mind is not divine soul leaving the body, nor primordial spirit coming out of the body, but it 
is also very powerful!



Under the stunned gaze of everyone, Li Yun once again took out the Nine Heavens Thunder 
Talisman, injected the innate true energy into it, and threw it upward.

"Boom!!"

The blue sky thunder fell from the top of everyone's heads, frightened Codiff's toothpick and the 
others, their legs weakened, and they sat directly on the ground.

Fortunately, this sky thunder was split into hundreds of thousands, scattered and hit around 
everyone, like raindrops, killing all the zombies.

That's right, the remaining five hundred zombie soldiers were all killed by this powerful sky 
thunder!

For a long while.

"Oh my God!"

When Codiff came back to his senses, he took a pee and looked at Li Yun's eyes as if he was 
looking at a god, frightened and terrified.

Others were also extremely surprised. On the contrary, Jin Liuli was so excited that she clapped her 
hands violently, patted her tender palms red, and her little face smiled and bloomed. If she was not 
worried that Li Yun would not be able to get close, she would have stepped forward. Go hug his arm 
and act like a baby.

"Ding, congratulations to the host for completing the hidden choice event (breaking through the 
innate when the physical body and mental power reach the Dzogchen realm at the same time), 
reward detoxification pill*1, recovery pill*1, peiyuan pill*1, foundation pill*1, additional rewards 
colorful Gift bag*1 (There is a small chance that a peerless gift will be issued)."

Li Yun took a deep breath.

As the saying goes, people don’t make money and don’t get rich, and horses don’t get fat. The 
system hides the rewards of the choice event this time, making Li Yun suddenly swell.

Four elixirs are four golden gift bags, plus the colorful gift bags that you won for the first time, a 
proper super prize!

A peerless gift that is better than a colorful item, I'm excited to think about it.

"Ah, Li Yun!" Alice suddenly pointed to the distance, "Venerable Black Eyebrow is going to run 
away!"

Chapter 597: Golden Temple

Everyone looked in the direction of Alice's fingers, and saw Venerable Black Eyebrow sneaking up 
to the gate of the Golden Luang Temple sneakily, with an expression of surprise and inexplicable 
expression on his face, a sense of joy that he has finally succeeded in a plan for many years.

"The deity finally succeeded!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow stood in front of the gate of the Golden Luang Temple and looked back at 
Li Yun from a distance. He couldn't hide his triumphant smile: "Boy, I admit that you are very 



strong. In the end, the Hidden Sacred Valley is the Hidden Sacred Valley, which has cultivated you 
like this. Freak!"

"But today, your ancestors are better than you!"

Having said that, he pushed open the gate of the Jinluang Temple without hesitation, and at the 
same time, reached out and took out a cone-shaped magic weapon.

Everyone was shocked. Although I don't know why Venerable Black Eyebrow could still laugh at 
this time, he always felt that it was definitely not a good thing to be opened by this guy at the gate 
of the Golden Luang Temple!

"Finally, finally opened!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow laughed loudly, "My ancestor, I have worked hard for 20 years. The 
purpose is to destroy the 28-star formation of the sun and moon, so as to enter the Golden Luang 
Temple and completely control this tomb. It would take some time. Only to open the Jinluan 
Temple, but I didn’t expect that your kid’s sky thunder would actually blast away the Jinluan 
Temple’s formation. God helped me!”

Li Yun: "..."

Is there a formation guardian at the Golden Luang Temple? No wonder Venerable Black Eyebrow 
couldn't get in.

After a pause, Venerable Black Eyebrow looked at the'moon' above his head, and said with emotion: 
"This twenty-eight star formation of the sun and the moon is truly a good fortune, taking the 
essence of the sun and the moon. In the era of declining spiritual energy, It can actually keep the 
things inside from being corrupted, even 3,000 zombies have been raised, and 28 corpse kings are 
guarding the tomb!"

"The person who built this tomb at the beginning must be a senior man, but unfortunately, today, 
my Venerable Black Eyebrow will offend this senior and take away all the things here with my own 
hands and occupy this incomparable tomb. With the constant supply of aura, I will surely become 
the supreme lord! Hahahaha!!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow entered the Golden Luang Temple with a wild laugh, as if an emperor 
was accepting the bows of the officials and ascended to the throne of the Ninth Five-Year 
Venerable.

"No! I have to stop him!"

Li Yun acted decisively and immediately took out the newly obtained Recovery Pill and swallowed 
it directly. Suddenly, most of his original innate qi that had been emptied was fully restored, and 
even the mental energy he had consumed was filled.

"I also said a pity, because you have no chance!"

Li Yun held the Sky Lei Talisman in his left hand and the Shirvin pistol in his right hand, using god-
level ethereal footwork, and his figure flashed across like a bolt of lightning.



With a bang, Li Yun shot directly, and everyone reacted. Jin Liuli and others hurriedly followed.

"Huh, it's late!"

Venerable Black Eyebrows flashed in and wanted to insert the cone-shaped artifact in his hand into 
the coffin in the Golden Luang Hall, because he had already inferred that the center of the 28th Sun 
and Moon Star Formation must be in the Golden Luang Hall, and it might even be Xu. The coffin of 
the general!

As long as he inserts the reincarnation cone in his hand into the coffin, he will be able to seize the 
control of the twenty-eight sun and moon formations!

but!

After seeing the situation in the Jinluan Temple, Venerable Black Eyebrow was stunned, even Li 
Yun didn't even bother to come in.

Similarly, Li Yun was also stunned when he saw the furnishings in the Jinluang Temple.

This seems... different from what you imagined?

The Golden Luang Temple is still the Golden Luang Temple, magnificent and gleaming, under the 
protection of the formation, it looks like a newly built one, without a trace of dust.

The emperor’s dragon chair is placed in the middle of the Jinluang Temple, sitting north facing 
south, and the armrest is engraved with a true dragon group, golden light, symbolizing the majesty 
of the royal family.

Chapter 598: My ancestor is miserable today

There are also expected coffins, and even as many people imagine, the coffins are placed in front of 
the dragon chair, and they are golden yellow. They are not as weird and gloomy as ordinary coffins, 
but reveal a royal majesty atmosphere.

"Huh? Why are there two coffins in the Jinluan Hall?" Jin Liuli who rushed to the back asked 
surprised.

Yes, under the dragon chair, where the officials were standing, there is actually a coffin!

This coffin is like the emperor's only courtier, accompanied by his lord alone.

But this is not right at all!

In general tombs, I have only heard of husband and wife being buried together, that is, the emperor 
and the queen are buried together, and the husband and wife are buried together at the same height, 
and the status of the wife may be lower. After all, it is ancient It is a patriarchal society.

Everyone has never heard of monarchs and ministers being buried together, which is totally 
unreasonable!

Unless the emperor is intimate and his love is extraordinary, there have been many stories full of 
love, which caused the emperor to hate the queen and be buried with his courtiers.

"This Nima!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow wants to scold his mother, what the **** is this? That's ridiculous! !



With these two **** coffins, he didn't have time to carefully analyze where the center of the 
formation was, and where should the reincarnation metamorphosis cone in his hand be inserted?

Cheating!

"Venerable Black Eyebrow, don't you still surrender?"

Li Yun calmly raised his pistol and pointed it at him.

Li Yun didn't want to use the Nine Heavens Heavenly Thunder Talisman. The second time he issued 
the Heavenly Thunder and didn't drain his blood, it was purely due to the skyrocketing true energy 
during the breakthrough. Now I use it again. .

"you!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow had a sullen face, and finally gritted his teeth and decided to throw the 
reincarnation cone toward the golden coffin in front of the dragon chair.

With a swish, the speed of the reincarnation metamorphosis cone was incredible, and Li Yun 
hurriedly shot a shot to intercept, but the bullet couldn't hit it at all!

Reluctantly, Li Yun had no choice but to point the muzzle at Venerable Black Eyebrow immediately 
and fired three shots in a row, causing him to scream again and again. The black aura on his body 
once again dissipated a lot, and his body almost became transparent!

Venerable Black Eyebrow’s current body is just the Law Bodies. Once he dies, his soul will be 
scattered, and the gods will not be able to save it!

The only thing that can reverse the situation now is to control the formation of the twenty-eight 
stars of the sun and moon, and use the aura of the formation to replenish the mana he has 
consumed!

"The dragon chair must be the center of the formation, it can't be!"

Venerable Black Eyebrow screamed wildly in his heart, staring fiercely at the golden coffin on the 
high platform. The next moment, a sudden change that shocked everyone happened.

"boom!!"

A coffin exploded and sawdust flew in the Jinluan Temple. Jin Liuli was shocked. She vaguely saw 
a tall and mighty figure standing in the dust. She was shocked again and screamed:

"Ah! It's Zongzi, the corpse has changed, the big Zongzi!!!"

Along the way, the toothpicks kept talking about zongzi, which made Jin Liuli now call the zombie 
zongzi.

"Roar!!"

With a roar of the big zongzi, the soul of Venerable Black Eyebrow was roared away.

He wanted to cry without tears, fucking, the corpse turned into a courtier under, and the golden 
coffin on the dragon chair did not change in the slightest!



It can be seen that the center of the formation is the coffin of the courtier, not the emperor.

After the big zongzi roared, his body swelled up like an inflatable. In a flash, he changed from an 
ordinary 1.8-meter-high man to a three-meter-high giant.

Venerable Black Eyebrow saw his face pale suddenly: "My ancestor is miserable today!"

Chapter 599: Zombie with IQ

He was so anxious that he could even speak the ancient vernacular. Venerable Heimei used this 
ancient vernacular when he was young.

Li Yun's eyelids jumped. He didn't need to understand the formation method, he could see that this 
ancient tomb was continuously sending power to the giant zombie, making it full of horror and 
powerful aura, enough to make everyone look at it. Those who arrive are terrified!

Li Yun even wondered if he could kill the giant zombie by shooting five consecutive sky thunders!

"Ding, trigger the option event, please choose from the host:

Option 1: Kill General Xu, reward experience value + 2 million, all attributes + 8000, golden gift 
bag*3, reward random master-level martial arts skills.

Option 2: Kill the Black Eyebrow Venerable, reward experience value + 1 million, all attributes + 
3000, golden gift bag*2, justice value + 10000, reward random advanced martial arts skills.

Choice 3: I want them all, rewards all attributes + 15,000, justice value +1 thousand, colorful gift 
bags*1, random god-level martial arts skills.

Option 4: Do it on the sidelines, no reward. "

Li Yun was taken aback. Option 3 had all attributes of 15,000, plus a colorful gift bag, as well as a 
god-level martial arts skill. No matter which reward, it was enough to make him drool.

But I can only look at it. Li Yun won't think the system is so easy to give him a good reward.

Relating to the rare choice four given by the system, Li Yun could immediately infer the strength of 
the zombie.

"do not move."

Li Yun remained silent, only gestured not to act rashly to Jin Liuli and Alice behind him, and slowly 
backed away.

Jin Liuli also quickly realized that the strength of this giant zombie was far beyond imagination, and 
Li Yun couldn't beat it, so she told them to retreat.

A steady stream of power converged into the giant zombie's body, and everyone was shocked to see 
that the zombie's original shriveled skin swelled up, his figure slowly restored to the plumpness of 
the living person, and his face was rosy and shiny.

In the end, except that all the hair had fallen off, the appearance of this giant zombie turned out to 
be exactly the same as a living person!

"This……"



Li Yun and the others were very surprised, but Venerable Black Eyebrows had fiery eyes, as if he 
could not wait to replace him, let himself accept the power feedback of the 28-star formation of the 
Sun and Moon, and restore his youthful body!

Sure enough, as he inferred, the twenty-eight stars of the sun and the moon, gathering the spiritual 
energy of the heavens and the earth, can keep the human body alive, and even immortal!

The giant zombie took a big step forward, and a red light flashed in his eyes, as if scanning 
everyone present, opening his mouth and saying:

"Who are you?!"

Toothpick, Guo Xun, Codiff and others are directly dumbfounded. This giant zombie, no, is this 
person a man or a ghost? The giant can still speak!

"General!"

Li Yun's heart moved, and he hurriedly stood up and arched his hands, saying: "My name is...Uh, 
my name is Li Yun. I came here to trace the doorman of the Six Demon Gates, that is this one. 
Venerable Black Eyebrow!"

Li Yun scolded cheating in his heart, the ancients were so eloquent, he really couldn't get used to it!

"Venerable Black Eyebrow?"

The giant zombie, no, should be called General Xu, his red eyes looked at Venerable Blackbrowed 
indifferently.

"good!"

Li Yun said positively: "He has been lurking in your tomb for twenty years. His purpose is to **** 
the tomb and even manipulate the zombies here. He wants to break the Golden Temple. Fortunately, 
we stopped it!"

Chapter 600: General Xu

Jin Liuli couldn't help but smile straight on the side. She was able to speak these gentle dialogues, 
but she didn't know that Li Yun would actually talk to this zombie. It was strange.

"Is it as he said?" General Xu, who was three meters high, looked at Venerable Black Eyebrow with 
sharp eyes.

"Do not."

Venerable Black Eyebrow also saw Li Yun's plan. He wanted to kill someone with a knife. How 
could he let this kid's conspiracy succeed!

Moreover, with his current weak state, he can't beat the three-meter-high stupor at all!

The two sides started a verbal debate. Venerable Heimei argued that it was Li Yun's heavenly 
thunder that caused the gate of the Golden Luang Palace to be opened, and Jin Liuli called him a 
shameless villain, a mischief, and so on.

When General Xu didn't know anything about the previous events, he didn't know who to trust.



"You despicable fellow!" Jin Liuli pointed a slender finger to the front of the dragon chair, and said 
angrily: "Look, General Xu, this guy inserted an awl into your monarch's coffin, and even sophistry 
said he was a good man. , It's really hateful!"

"what?!"

General Xu turned his head to look, he was furious, his body rose up into the sky, extremely 
frightening.

Coupled with the bullet holes shot by Li Yun's pistol, General Xu became more and more angry.

"You all get out of here!"

General Xu screamed, "Whoever dares to escape, I will kill anyone, and let you guard the emperor's 
mausoleum!"

It turns out that General Xu Tiande didn't want to rebel, nor did he overstep the rules to build a tomb 
comparable to the emperor, but the emperor's tomb guard... well, tomb guard zombie.

Toothpick's entire face was black. It seems that what Sanye knew was not all true. This tomb was 
not called General Xu's Tomb at all, but rather an Emperor's Tomb.

Including Venerable Black Eyebrow, everyone did not dare to resist, and walked under the dragon 
chair of the Golden Luang Temple together. General Xu's aura now is as powerful as the demon 
king, so powerful!

"You wait, don't you get down on your knees!?" General Xu shouted again.

But this time, except for Venerable Black Eyebrow who immediately knelt down, the others looked 
at each other and stood still.

"Haha, did you see the general?"

Venerable Black Eyebrow immediately pours dirty water on Li Yun, "This group has no one, no 
king, no father, lawlessness, rampant behavior, death is not a pity!"

To bow and kneel is a great shame for a Venerable, but Venerable Black Eyebrow can only grit his 
teeth in order to survive.

Fortunately, a hundred years ago, he had met many high-ranking officials in the feudal era, and even 
the princes, knowing that these powerful and powerful people liked compliments.

"No, it's wrong!"

Li Yun quietly took out the Heavenly Thunder Talisman, and said faintly: "General Xu, are you 
from the Ming Dynasty? It has been more than 500 years since the Ming Dynasty. Times have 
changed and there is no monarch in the world. Do you understand what it means? "

"A joke!" Venerable Heimei immediately mocked: "The world cannot be ruled for a day. How dare 
you say such bold and reckless words? This is the death crime of the Jiu Clan!"

Alice gave a weird smile.



She actually agrees with Huang Xuanguo's old saying, because she is the princess of the royal 
family of Y country. Of course, she hopes that the royal family will be passed on forever.

"Ding, trigger the option event, please choose from the host:

Option 1: Kneel, reward skill: Slave face on knees.

Option 2: Do not kneel, reward justice value +1000, purple gift bag*1. "

In Li Yun's heart, Gu Jing is not waved. This is an event that does not need to be chosen. With his 
character and personality, he can never do such a slavery thing!
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