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Country M, Flanger Airport. 

Nora, who had exactly the same appearance as Evelyn, wore a light-colored 
short skirt, a sunglasses, and was dragging her luggage to board the plane. 

The destination on her ticket was  country Z of Jingzu. 

Yes, she planed to return, but she still wanted to be in secret. 

“Without notice, my return will not affect our plans.” 

She said to John with her mobile phone. 

“Okay, everything is up to you.” 

John would naturally agree with his daughter’s words with every conceit. 

Nora curved corner of her mouth, she was in a good mood. 

“That’s it, I’ll board the plane first.” 

John nodded and said, “Pay attention to safety. When you are arrived, I’ll pick 
you up.” 

Nora nodded and immediately hung up. 

And all this, Evelyn did not know, nor did she know she was being followed 
again. 

When she got home, she took out the business card that Freya gave her and 
thought about it. 

She wanted to say that at this time hit the iron while hot, and then accepted a 
few interviews, no doubt that it would be very helpful to her future design. 

In particular, these magazines who wanted to submit to her were not small 
companies, they all had a certain reputation in the industry. 



Because of this, she was hesitant and would not know who to choose. 

Finally, she decided to ask Lucas at night. 

That’s it, she put this aside and turned into the design draft. 

After all, if she accepted an appointment, she also needsedto come up with a 
good design draft. 

She waited until the evening, Lucas came back from work, and saw Evelyn 
still working. 

The slender back was especially warm under the setting sun, making him feel 
stuffed in his heart. 

“Not finished yet?” 

He stepped forward and h.ugged her into his arms. 

Evelyn was affected by his breath, so she calmed down. 

“Your work is done?” 

She said, scanning the alarm clock on the table, exclaimed: “Oh, it’s six 
o’clock. I haven’t changed my clothes yet, wait for me.” 

In a word, she struggled from Lucas’s arms and hurried to the bathroom. 

Lucas did not stop her, looking at her panic, his face was tender. 

Immediately he glanced at Evelyn’s book, his eyes flashed with astonishment. 

He saw that the book was painted a modified daily the Han-style clothes, very 
beautiful, suitable for the taste of young girls nowadays. 

At the same time, he couldn’t help sighing, always feeling that Evelyn had 
gone to school to study finance, and some of her talents were buried. 

 

He thought wildly, and Evelyn was almost ready there. 



She wore a light blue dress, and her long dark hair was arbitrarily held in her 
head, leaving only a few strands of hair floating randomly on both cheeks. 

Because she didn’t have enough time, she didn’t put on any exquisite 
makeup, but she was even more beautiful. 

“I’m ready!” 

She reappeared in the room with a fresh look. 

Lucas looked at fresh her, his eyes flashed. 

“Very beautiful.” 

He praised with a smile, making the smile on her face brighter. 

“Let’s go, I’ve already booked the restaurant.” 

She took the initiative to hold Lucas’s arm and walked towards the door. 

Mo Li saw the two of them going downstairs and immediately got up from the 
sofa. 

She glanced at the bright Evelyn, and jealousy flashed in her eyes, but she 
quickly converged and turned to look at Lucas. 

“Sir, are you going out?” 

Lucas gave her a cold glance, and nodded: “Yes, you are at home, you don’t 
have to follow us.” 

Mo Li compressed her l!ps and disagreed. “How is this possible? In case …” 

“Ok?” 

Before she finished speaking, she was frightened by a nasal sound from 
Lucas and couldn’t say any more. 

“Let’s go!” 

Lucas saw that she was no longer talking and turned his head to Evelyn. 

Evelyn nodded and left with Lucas. 



Mo Li looked at the back of the two people leaving, her eyes full of 
unwillingness. 

Especially when she glared at Evelyn’s back, she can’t wait to make two holes 
on her body. 

Evelyn was aware of it, but didn’t care, followed Lucas to the car and walked 
towards the booked restaurant. 

As the two left, the man who had been silently monitoring outside, frowned 
slightly, followed them. 

Lucas and Evelyn did not know what happened around them, and they got off 
at a fine restaurant in the urban area. 

After a good meal, the two chatted. 

Speaking in a whisper, Evelyn thought of the interview, so she said it to 
Lucas, and wanted him to give her an idea. 

“Tell me, which one should I choose to be interviewed, I feel that their 
strengths are similar.” 

She told out the simple information of several magazines and hesitated, then 
she looked at Lucas. 

Lucas was not surprised. After knowing that Evelyn was famous, he had 
expected such a situation. 

He gr0aned for a moment and gave an objective answer: “These magazines 
are all good. If it is for long-term development, I personally suggest that 
Fashion Master is good. Its cost-effectiveness is higher than the other ones. In 
addition to its popularity, behind it is the international brand LADL as a 
background. If the cooperation is good, this is also a relationship. “ 

Evelyn heard the words, she thought it carefully. 

“Okay, then I agree this interview.” 

She said with a smile, Lucas nodded, and then the two talked about the other. 

Being happy, Evelyn drank some wine. 



By the time they left, she’s already a little drunk. 

Lucas looked at the drunk Evelyn, his eyes were filled with helplessness, and 
he was even used to her capacity for liquor. 

He helped Evelyn get on the car. This time she was not so noisy as before, 
but was more sticky. 

Her entire body was like an octopus, clung to Lucas tightly. 

Luckily fortunately, Lucas was not driving when he returned, otherwise the two 
would have an accident. 

“No more trouble.” 

Although Lucas liked the drunk Evelyn’s enthusiasm, it’s limited to the room. 

In the car at this time, he could only look at the delicious food in front of him, 
but couldn’t eat it, and a sleeping beast on his body had been fully awakened 
under Evelyn’s continuous teasing, making him very uncomfortable. 

“No.” 

Evelyn clutched Lucas’s c.hest tightly, rubbing her pink cheeks constantly, not 
even knowing that she was on the verge of death. 

Lucas took a breath of air, and coldly ordered to the driver in front of him: “Go 
back quickly!” 

The driver heard the words, did not dare to neglect, immediately stepped on 
the accelerator to speed up. 

He originally had a ten-minute journey, and it only took him about five 
minutes. 

After arriving, Lucas directly got off the car with Evelyn and strode toward their 
room. 

Mo Li heard the movement outside and ran out of the living room happily. 

“Sir……” 



She called him with a smile, but Lucas ignored her and walked upstairs while 
h.ugging Evelyn. 

At this time, all his thoughts were on the woman in his arms, and he just 
wanted to return to the room as soon as possible, and punish the woman who 
had disorder his thoughts. 

Evelyn didn’t know that the danger was near. She teased him and laughed 
‘Giggle’. 

Mo Li looked at the two people’s departures and squeezed her fists, her face 
twisted to the extreme. 
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The next day, Evelyn slept until the next noon of the day before waking up, 
but her body seemed to be crushed by a car. She felt very uncomfortable. 

However, before she could react, the expression froze on her face. 

Because the memory of last night rushed to her, making her anxious, she did 
want to dig a hole to bury herself. She was so embarrassed. 

Sure enough, drinking’s a mistake. It seemed that in the future, she must not 
drink in front of Lucas, otherwise she didn’t know what else she can do. 

She rested in bed for a while, and when the soreness in her body eased, she 
got up and went downstairs. 

Mo Li saw Evelyn getting up late, especially the bare traces on her body. Her 
eyes were full of jealousy, and she couldn’t help being ironic. 

“Sure enough to be Lucas’s wife is good fortune, unlike Mr. Hawk, he has to 
get up and go to the company at dawn, and he doesn’t have enough time to 
relax after returning from work at night.” 

When Evelyn heard this, she paused slightly. 



She looked at Mo Li, her eyes narrowed, and sneered: “Miss Mo, I know your 
opinion, I will tell Lucas at night.” 

After that, she stopped paying attention to Mo Li and turned into the 
restaurant. 

And Mo Li changed her expression slightly because of her words, and she 
was worried that the woman really told it to her husband. 

She walked behind Evelyn in a few steps and could not speak any words to 
apologize. She could only grit her teeth and say, “What can you do, woman, 
besides complaining?” 

Evelyn sneered: “Miss Mo, I can complain to him, and it’s my ability. If you 
have the ability, you can do it too.” 

Mo Li did not expect that Evelyn would argue with her like this, and could not 
find anything to refute for a while. 

Evelyn looked at her blushing face, she chuckled a little, stopped paying 
attention, and started dining. 

Twenty minutes later, she finished her meal and planned to go to the 
company to report on her decision to be interviewed. 

In the company, Freya learned that Evelyn agreed to the interview and smiled: 
“So, what kind of cooperation do you need, just tell the company, I will let 
them cooperate with you.” 

Anyway, if Evelyn was interviewed, and it’s also good to be with the company, 
which can better build the company’s reputation. 

Evelyn naturally knew this, so she was willing to agree that. 

Ji Yi knew that Evelyn had agreed to the interview, and when she was so 
angry that the good design drafts were scrapped. 

 

She was filled with unwillingness and anger. 

“What kind of damn lucky has Nora got, and she has taken up all the good 
things!” 



Evelyn didn’t know the anger in her heart. After reporting with Freya, she 
contacted the person in charge of the Fashion Master. 

The two decided on the interview time, scheduled for tomorrow afternoon. 

In the evening, Evelyn also reported the incident to Lucas. 

“Then I will let Cater free the afternoon time to accompany you.” 

Lucas frowned slightly, he’s responding. 

Evelyn shook her head: “No, I can do it myself, you can do your business.” 

Lucas wanted to say something more, but before being said this, he was 
interrupted by her: “You have so many things to do, don’t worry about me. 
Besides, don’t you say that those people are gone? There should be no 
danger to come back, and Miss Mo will follow me. “ 

After hearing her words, he never insisted. 

He could not wait until the meal was over, and he called Mo Li to the studying 
room. 

“Sir, are you looking for me?” 

Mo Li walked into the studying room with joy. 

Lucas saw her and stared: “Tomorrow Evelyn is going to do an interview. I will 
not allow any more accidents, otherwise you will leave the country yourself!” 

When Mo Li heard this, the smile on her face instantly became stiff. 

She bit her gums and her hands tightly held around her legs. 

“Yes!” 

It took her all strength to not let her emotions erupt, and she responded. 

Lucas seemed to have heard nothing unusual in her tone. After the 
explanation, he waved his hand directly to let her leave. 

Mo Li turned and left, and the expression on her face was gloomy as she 
turned. 



Uh … 

The next day Lucas went to the company early. 

Because of an interview in the afternoon, Evelyn had been preparing at home 
in the morning. 

She waited until the appointed time, and then she led Mo Li towards the 
Fashion Master Magazine . 

Within half an hour, the two arrived at an office building. 

Compared with the mighty office building of the Hawk Group, this office 
building was very common. 

“Miss Davis, this way.” 

After the two got out of the car, an assistant came to greet them and took 
them into the company. 

As their figures disappeared at the gate of the magazine, a black car slowly 
drove out of the street. 

The man in the car was the one who had been staring at the Hawk family a 
few days ago. 

“It looks like today is a good opportunity to get started.” 

He glanced at Evelyn’s situation with a telescope, and curved the corner of 
her mouth. 

And all these, Evelyn did not know. 

After entering the building with the assistant, she met the interview editor. 

After a brief greeting, the two entered today’s topic. 

One questioned, one answered, plus the experience that had been once, 
Evelyn can handle it with ease. 

Even so, when she finished the interview, it was too late. 

“I’m sorry, it did take a long time, Miss. Davis.” 



The editor finished the interview and smiled apologetically at her. 

“It’s okay, then I’ll go back first.” 

Evelyn did not care about it, she showed the smiling and responded. 

The editor nodded and sent her out of the company: “Miss Davis, see you. 
After the finalization, I will inform you the date of publishing the magazine and 
also send you samples.” 

“Thank you.” 

Evelyn didn’t refuse, after saying goodbye again, she left with Mo Li. 

After the two left, Mo Li went to the parking lot to drive the car, and Evelyn 
stood alone at the intersection and waited. 

Seeing this, the man who had always been outside, only felt that the time had 
come. 

He was driving in the car opposite her, immediately opened the door and got 
out of the car, headed straight to her. 

Evelyn didn’t notice the danger approaching her. 

She lowered her head and replied Lucas’s text message. 

“The interview has been completed and I am going to go back.” 

He just didn’t respond after the news was sent, which made her extremely 
frustrated. 

Just when she was planning to put away her cell phone, her body was 
suddenly hit and her cell phone fell off the ground. 

“Sorry.” 

The man picked up the phone with an annoyed face and apologized in a j.erky 
tone. 

Evelyn looked at him, he was like a good-looking guy, but she didn’t care 
about it, took the phone, “It’s okay, I was playing the phone, it’s my fault, I 
can’t blame you.” 



She said so, and turned away, intending to let the man pass. 

When the man saw this, his eyes flashed cold light. 

He glanced around, and no one noticed it. Just when he was going to drug 
her, and a b.rake sounded behind him, let him stop. 

He heard the woman beside him said in a surprised voice, “Lucas, why are 
you here?” 

Lucas Hawk? 

The man narrowed his eyes, glanced behind his back, his eyes without 
leaving a trace, and saw that Lucas Hawk was sitting in the car, looking at 
Evelyn with a gentle look. 

“Just off work, so I come down to pick you up.” 
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Evelyn Davis heard this and the smile on her face got bigger. 

That time, Mo Li drove here and saw Lucas Hawk. Although her face was 
flashed with joy, her smile became farfetched when she thought that Lucas 
Hawk was here for Evelyn. 

“Sir.” 

She greeted in a low voice. 

Lucas Hawk did not care. He nodded and said in a deep voice, “I’ll take lady 
back first. You drive yourself back.” 

He led Evelyn Davis to the car. 

Mo Li clenched her fists and watched them leave. She was not willing to go 
back alone. 

By this time, a man had come to the corner of the street and pretended to 
answer a phone and observe them. 



Even though his movements were very secretive, Mo Li still noticed him. 

She had a sharp sight and looked at the direction of where the man was. 

Naturally, the man felt her sight and was surprised. However, he did not 
escape. Instead, he pretended to call with his phone. 

She couldn’t see anything wrong with him, then looked around 
subconsciously, but she still did not find anything. In this case,  she had more 
doubts in her eyes. 

She had just realized that someone was peeping, just like someone was 
following, but there was nothing around. Was it her feeling wrong? 

She glanced through her eyes again uncertainly, but still found nothing. With 
that, she had to give up and drive to chase Lucas. 

However, she did not catch up. Lucas Hawk and Evelyn Davis arrived first. 

When they got home, they went upstairs to wash. 

Mo Li did not see the two people so she asked the housekeeper. 

When she learned that the two were back in the room, her l!ps tightened. 

Especially when she thought about their close relationship during the day, she 
went upstairs directly. 

“Sir.” 

She stood up at the door and knocked respectfully. 

After a while, the door was opened by Lucas Hawk. 

“What’s up?” 

He frowned and asked. 

Mo Li looked at Evelyn Davis behind him. 

Evelyn Davis also noticed her sight, rolled her eyes then lay down to rest. 



Lucas Hawk was dissatisfied with Mo Li’s att!tude. He wanted to say it directly 
but he did not know what to say. He whispered, “Go to my study and wait for 
me.” 

Mo Li heard that and her eyes splashed with joy. 

Mistakenly, she thought Lucas Hawk and Evelyn Davis did not have that good 
relationship as she thought before. 

If they were good enough, Sir wouldn’t keep something away from that 
woman. 

She turned away. 

Lucas Hawk watched her leave and turned to Evelyn Davis. 

“I’ll go to my study. You sleep first.” 

Evelyn Davis nodded without looking back. 

Lucas Hawk did not care. He turned around and left. 

When Evelyn Davis heard the door closing, she turned and looked at the door. 
Her eyes were full of complexity and her heart was full of discomfort that could 
not be ignored. 

Although she was not the real Nora Davis, this kind of feeling was still bad. 

In his study, Lucas Hawk did not know what Evelyn Davis was thinking. He 
looked at Mo Li flatly and asked, “What’s the matter?” 

Mo Li heard the impatience in his tone and hurriedly said the strange thing 
she left when she came back just now. 

“Sir, I think there may be some fraud in it. Maybe those people did not leave. 
They act so to catch off guard.” 

Lucas Hawk said nothing and frowned as if he was thinking. 

If she wanted to say that Yao Si’s man did not leave, he might not believe it. 
After all it was a foreign affair. He asked Mo Zhui to make moves. He must 
went back to deal with them in person, or the consequence would be that they 
lost, even if they were rich but they would be broken once. 



He believed that Yao Si had left but he could not exclude the other tricks Yao 
Si left. 

“I know about this. These days, you should protect the young lady closely. If 
you have any problem, please contact me at any time.” 

He seemed to have an idea in his mind, then waved to Mo Li to leave. 

She did not want to leave. But, she did not have any excuse to stay. Finally, 
she left unwillingly. 

As she left, Lucas Hawk did not immediately returned to the room, but sat 
alone at the study and meditated. 

It was a long time before he moved. 

“Cater Wood, go investigate this. After you leave Yao Si, investigate what 
suspicious people appear at Jingdu and check the road momitor. I will see the 
results tomorrow morning.” 

Although Cater Wood was confused, he still acted according to the orders. 

*** 

The following day, Lucas Hawk accompanied Evelyn Davis to have breakfast 
and went to the company. 

Evelyn Davis stayed at home to draw and design because there was nothing 
to do at the company. 

On this side, as soon as Lucas Hawk arrived at the company. Cater Wood 
immediately took the investigated information and made a serious report. 

“Sir, I checked last night after they left Yao Si, it seems that some unidentified 
forces have infiltrated the city. At present, they are unidentified.” 

When Lucas Hawk heard this, his heart sank. 

He did not interrupt Cater Wood and signaled him to continue reporting. 

“As for Hawk Company, these past two days, there were no suspicious people 
found.” 



After Cater Wood finished, he looked respectfully at Lucas Hawk and waited 
for instructions. 

Lucas Hawk’s eyes narrowed dangerously. His fingers were clenching. 

Cater Wood took the lead. 

When Lucas Hawk came back last night, he thought of the unidentified forces 
and asked Mo Li. 

She did not expect that sir looked for her still  for Nora Davis again. The 
jealousy in her heart was surging. 

It took her a lot to keep her sane. 

“Don’t worry, Sir. I’m sure I won’t let your wife make any mistakes this time.” 

Lucas Hawk did not believe all her promises. He replied coldly, “Remember 
what you said today.” 

Mo Li quitted the study. 

She stood outside the door. Her eyes were full of grievance and unwillingness 

She didn’t understand why he could do so. 

It was clear that they knew each other for more than ten years. Couldn’t she 
compare with that woman? 

She thought angrily. Her eyes were full of hatred and looked at the room 
where Evelyn Davis was. 

Sooner or later, she would let the b!tch leave her sir. 

She did not deserve the care of her sir. 

Evelyn Davis did not know about Mo Li’s idea. 

She was a little absentminded in that room. 

She did not know what was wrong with her. From yesterday, Lucas Hawk left 
her to his study with Mo Li. The bad feeling in her heart grew bigger. Her 
breath was blocked and her work was not in order. 



What were they discussing about? 

Why did he avoid her? 
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Evelyn Davis took a paintbrush and stood on the balcony for a half day 
without drawing. Her mind was all about Lucas Hawk. 

A cool breeze came, which made her shiver. At the same time, she also 
calmed her mind from her own thoughts and let her head got light. 

She found that she cared more about Lucas Hawk than her own safety. 

She bit her l!ps and constantly warned herself that she could not go on like 
this or she would lose herself. 

When she persuaded herself, she heard the sound of opening door behind 
her. 

She was stiff and knew who came in, she did not turned around immediately. 

However, when she did not turn around, he soon put a warm embrace on her 
back. 

“Why haven’t you rest yet?” 

He asked Evelyn Davis. 

Recently, they had become closer to each other, which made him hold her 
often, feeling that she belonged to him. 

Evelyn Davis just froze and soon returned alive. She said with a smile, “The 
painting is going to be finished. You go to take a rest first.” 

After that, she struggled out of Lucas Hawk’s arms and turned to work. 

Lucas Hawk saw it and chuckled and did not disturb her anymore. He turned 
around and washed and lied on the bed. 



Evelyn Davis was standing on the balcony. She did not know whether it was 
because the person in the room or something else that she could not focused 
on here work anymore. 

Especially, when she heard the gentle breath, her heart was full of ripples and 
complexity. 

In the end, she gave up her work to divert the attention. After a while, she 
went to bed with him. 

But just as she got in bed, Lucas Hawk naturally carried her into his arms. 

She leaned against Lucas Hawk’s c.hest and his warm breath was beside her 
ear. Her heart, which was not easy to calm down, beat faster again, even felt 
uncomfortable and at a loss. 

Obviously, at present, they were more and more in line with each other that 
she was reluctant to leave. 

She even kept dreaming that Nora Davis would not come back. 

But, she knew that it was impossible. 

It was impossible for Nora Davis not to come back. She was doomed to leave. 

When she thought about it, she felt so sick that she could not leave anymore. 
She turned over and looked at the man in front of her. She touched his 
eyebrows, eyes and his nose. 

 

Not knowing how long Evelyn looked at him, she finally felt sour in her eyes 
and closed her eyes and rested. 

The following day, Lucas Hawk got up and found that Evelyn Davis’s eyes 
were black and blue. His eyebrows frowned. 

“Didn’t you sleep well last night?” 

Evelyn Davis was stupefied and nodded slowly. She concealed it, “Hm. I could 
not find a good way to deal with last night’s design and it made me upset.” 

When Lucas Hawk heard this, his brows tightened even harder. 



Knowing how terrible a block was for a designer, he suggested, “If you don’t 
have the inspiration, don’t punish your body, I will ask Freya Lee to suspend 
your work.” 

Evelyn Davis listened to his tone with obvious concerned. Her heart was 
moved and a bit sour. 

She knew that the concern was not for her. It was for Nora Davis. 

But, now she played Nora Davis. 

It could be said that the contradictory reality made her fall into a dead end. 

“Yes, I know. I’m going out today too.” 

She responded to Lucas Hawk and really wanted to go out. 

It seemed that she had not seen her mother for a long time since her last 
birthday. 

She wanted to see her mother and talk about her pain. 

At this time, only her mother could understand her. 

Lucas Hawk did not know what she was thinking. When she told him she 
wanted to go out, he said, “Take Mo Li with you. If you need anything, tell me.” 

Evelyn Davis could not take Mo Li to see her mother. She just hooked a smile, 
pretended to agree. 

After Lucas Hawk went to the company, she went back to her room and called 
John Davis. 

“I want to see my mother.” 

She said and John Davis was silent for a while, “Well, do you want to come 
over or let me pick you up?” 

Evelyn Davis had prepared that she might be rejected. Unexpectedly, he 
agreed. 

“Send someone to pick me up.” 



She thought of Mo Li and said with her l!ps surpressed. 

John Davis replied coldly and hung up directly. 

Evelyn Davis did not care either. She got up to clean herself. 

After half an hour, she went out. 

Mo Li saw that she was going out. Although she was dissatisfied, she followed 
her from behind. 

“I come back home today. You don’t have to follow me. My father doesn’t like 
to have an outsider at home.” Evelyn Davis said with a smile. 

“You think I like following you? Mr. Hawk let me follow you, that’s what I do.” 

Evelyn Davis could only let her follow. 

Later, they waited at the door for the driver. 

About ten minutes later, the driver arrived. 

Evelyn Davis took the lead in getting inside the car, but when Mo Li was about 
to get inside, Evelyn Davis stopped her. 

“You drive your own car. So that my father doesn’t need to take me back at 
night.” 

Mo Li heard what she said and although she was confused, she did not say 
anything. She turned around and walked towards the garage of the house. 

Evelyn Davis saw her leaving and ordered the driver to drive. 

Mo Li heard the car and came out. 

At that time, she did not know that she was fooled by Evelyn Davis once 
again. 

For a while, she was angry. But she dared not to keep it from Lucas, so she 
immediately called Lucas Hawk. 

After all, she was left by Evelyn Davis. If something happened to Evelyn, sir 
would never spare her. 



Lucas Hawk was puzzled when he received Mo Li’s call. 

He did not understand why Evelyn Davis had to leave Mo Li when she was 
only going back to the Davis’ house. 

Evelyn Davis did not know that she raised his suspicion. She and her driver 
went straight to the hospital. 

She went straight to her mother’s ward. 

She saw an unexpected person at the door of the ward. 

“What are you doing here?” 

She saw John Davis standing at the door, dressing like a successful person. 

Before he could answer, there was a charming voice behind John Davis. 

“Dad, I’m ready to go in.” 

Nora Davis walked out from behind John Davis, as if she did not see Evelyn 
Davis. 

Evelyn Davis saw her as if she had just seen a ghost. 

“Nora, why are you here?” 

As if she thought of something, her face became ugly, she asked with fear, 
“When did you come back? Why didn’t anyone tell me?” 

When Nora Davis heard the words, there was a flash of unhappiness on her 
face. 

She raised her chin slightly, stared at Evelyn Davis from a higher position and 
said loudly, “Who are you? Why should I inform you when I come back?” 

Evelyn Davis’ face got even uglier, her l!ps moved as if she was about to say 
something. 
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Before Evelyn Davis could say anything, she was interrupted by Nora Davis. 

“Do you think that you can order me easily as the lady of Hawk’s family? Don’t 
forget, Evelyn, everything you have now is what I gave you. You are not 
qualified to ask questions, so when I come back, you have to serve me a good 
place.” 

When Evelyn Davis heard this, her heart thumped and her face turned pale. 

She thought that Nora Davis was coming back to get all this back. 

At this moment, she thought of Lucas Hawk and his gentleness and suddenly, 
she was reluctant. 

In particular, she thought that she would never see this person again. Her 
heart was like being cut into pieces with a dull knife. It hurt so much that her 
breathing even ached. 

“How could it be so fast? The appointed time hasn’t arrived yet.” 

She forced herself to be calm, but her hands were shaking uncontrollably. 

Nora Davis did not know that Evelyn Davis misunderstood her. When she 
heard this, she thought it was weird. 

She said with a cold voice, “Who has set the rule that I can’t get back before 
the appointed time?” 

Evelyn Davis was shocked to hear this. 

She brightened up. 

She knew from Nora Davis’ words that she did not come back to take away all 
this things. At the same time, she could not help thinking. 

“Why do you come here today if you’re not coming back to conclude the 
transaction?” 

She stared at Nora Davis wearily, her eyes were full of precautions. 

Nora Davis did not care and sneered and said, “Naturally, like you, I come to 
see the useless woman who gave birth to me!” 



Evelyn Davis listened to her rude words and her anger rose. 

“Useless woman? She is your mother anyway!” 

She clenched her teeth and scolded Nora Davis. 

Nora Davis looked at Evelyn Davis ironically, as if she had just heard a bad 
joke. 

“Mother? She did not raise me for a day except for giving birth to me. She is 
not my mother!” 

Evelyn Davis was very angry when she heard that words. 

“Is this how you act at home?” 

Nora Davis looked at her angry looks and her eyes were full of disdain and a 
trace of dissatisfaction. 

“You don’t deserve to say our Davis family. As for that woman, I feel ashamed 
to be her daughter!” 

 

Evelyn Davis’ face became gloomier with emotion. She swept the two people 
in front of her. Her c.hest fluctuated. 

“Well, since she is not worthy to be your mother, you are not worthy to visit 
her. Now, you leave immediately. You are not welcome here!” 

She pointed to the elevator and shouted at Nora Davis. 

Nora Davis looked at her and her face was full of mockery. 

“Dad, she’s urging me to go.” 

Along with her words, John Davis who had never spoken before, coldly 
lowered his face and warned, “Evelyn, how dare you speak to Nora like that? 
Do you forget where it is? If you two are acting up again, you may leave!” 

Evelyn Davis heard the words and looked at John Davis in disbelief while 
trembling all over. She was obviously angry. 



Nora Davis saw that she was so angry and could not speak. She snorted and 
went directly to the ward. 

John Davis also went in. 

Evelyn Davis responded and rushed after her. She was worried that Nora 
Davis would harm her mother. 

In the ward, Katherine Browne was still lying in coma on the bed, but her face 
was much better than before. She was very thin. 

She said, “For so many years, this woman has not changed at all. She’s still 
useless. She even made herself half-dead.” 

Nora Davis looked at Katherine Browne on the hospital bed with a disdainful 
look. 

Evelyn Davis listened to her sarcastic words and was so angry that her brows 
tightened. 

“Nora Davis!” 

She snapped and her eyes were burning at Nora Davis. Nora Davis was not 
afraid at all. She glanced at her contemptuously while holding her c.hest in 
both hands and said, “What? Do you think I’m wrong?” 

She continued to satirize, regardless of Evelyn Davis’s difficulty in seeing her 
face, “If she was useful, she will not lead you to live like this. She rely on her 
daughters to trade to survive. Which part of her is useful?” 

After hearing that, Evelyn Davis was furious and shivered. 

She stared at Nora Davis coldly, while biting her teeth, “Her good is that you 
mercenary people don’t realize at all. Maybe, she’s useless to you, but in my 
heart, she’s the priceless treasure of my life.” 

Nora Davis looked at her red eyes. There was no reason for her discomfort. 

She sneered, her eyes were full of disdain, “Priceless treasure? Then, you 
should keep your priceless treasure.” 

She turned around and left the ward. John Davis followed her. 



Evelyn Davis looked at the back of their departure while holding her hands 
tightly. She did not understand what they were doing at the hospital. 

At the same time, she felt unworthy for her mother. 

Over the years, she lived with her mother and she always heard her mother’s 
nagging about Nora Davis. 

If she let her know that Nora Davis thought of her like this, she did not know 
how hard it will be for her mother. 

At this time, she was very glad that her mother met Nora Davis while she was 
in coma. 

She looked at her mother painfully and gave her water to wipe her body. 

She whispered, “Mom, Nora came to see you today, haven’t you been talking 
about her? Mom, I’ve been famous in the industry lately. People like my 
drawings. When you wake up, we can open a shop and live a happy life.” 

“Mom, when will you wake up?” 

Evelyn Davis was sad. 

She did not know that Nora Davis was at the door listening to her words with 
disdain. 

“Only you who have no ambition yearn such an ordinary life.” 

She murmured and was disgusted by the scene in front of her. 

In other words, she thought that a dying was not worth caring about and better 
off dead. 

She thought about some ideas and without the dying woman, Evelyn Davis 
could not cooperate with their plan. 

She was more comfortable, she thought but she did not want to stay any 
longer. 

“Dad, I have something else to do. Let’s go.” 

She turned and was about to leave. 



Seeing this, John Davis hurriedly paced up. 

“Nora, wait for me.” 

He walked a few steps to Nora Davis’ side and suddenly thought that Nora 
Davis did not tell him when she came back this time. He could not help but 
frowned and asked. 

“By the way, Nora, you haven’t told Dad what are you going to do when you 
come back this time?” 

Nora Davis heard the question and stepped slightly, “Dad, I have something to 
do and anyway, you don’t care.” 
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John Davis frowned, with obvious disapproval in his eyes. 

“What do you mean I don’t care? In case something goes wrong, all we have 
done before is in vain.” 

Evelyn Davis knew that John Davis was worried about and frowned slightly, “I 
know what you mean, but I have my purpose. You can rest assured that I will 
not trouble Evelyn this time.” 

John Davis chuckled, “What a fool. How can I worry about you making trouble 
for her? I just worry about you.” 

Nora Davis listened and deeply moved. 

Not knowing what she thought of, she touched her belly secretly. 

If someone looked carefully, he could see that her belly was slightly raised. 

But, nobody could not see it because she was in a loose skirt. 

“You don’t have to worry. In a few month, I’ll be back and take everything that 
belonged to me.” she said, her eyes shined with light. 



John Davis did not find out her difference. When he heard this, he did not ask 
more questions for fear of causing Nora Davis’ impatience. 

“Okay. Just say what you need me to do.” 

Nora Davis nodded and said a few words to John Davis before leaving the 
hospital. 

John Davis looked at the back of her leaving and the ward where Evelyn 
Davis was at. His eyebrows were slightly frowned. He did not go in to say 
anything. He also left. 

After Nora Davis left, she went directly to the underground garage. 

She was going to drive away. 

When she came to the side of her car, a dark shadow came out from the other 
side. 

“Who is that?” 

She asked in a stern voice. 

In response, however, the cold barrel of a gun was pointed against the back of 
her head. 

“Be honest…” 

The mercenary man who had been following Evelyn Davis, was now standing 
behind her. 

Obviously, he took Nora Davis as Evelyn Davis and warned in a cold voice, 
“Get in the car, don’t think of any small action or don’t blame my gun for fire!” 

Nora Davis shivered. Her heart sank. At the same time, she was full of doubts. 

She had just returned home. How could these people catch up so quickly? 

Although she was uneasy, she still tried to bear the panic in her heart and 
pacified the people behind her. 

“Don’t do it. I will cooperate with you.” 



 

Then, she raised her hand and opened the door at the man’s beckon. 

Seeing her cooperate him, the man didn’t look for any troubles. He followed 
her to the car. 

But he never withdrew his gun. 

Later, he gave an address to Nora Davis to drive to. 

Nora Davis did not resist. She could only follow his advice. 

Within half an hour, they came to an abandoned building in the suburb. 

The man ordered Nora Davis to get out of the car. 

Nora Davis looked at the wilderness and was worried, she wanted to help 
herself but her communication equipment was collected by the man. 

She could only be obeident and listen to the man. 

After that, they went into the abandoned building. The man took out a stool 
and asked Nora Davis to sit on it. Then took out the rope and tied her up. 

“What do you want to do?” 

Nora Davis was furious but she seemed to be afraid so she did not resist. 

The man glanced at her coldly and ignored her. 

After he tied Nora Davis, he put away his gun and drew a dagger from his 
boot and laid it across her neck. 

She was shocked and her face became ugly. 

The man did not care. 

He took out his phone and dialed the president office of Hawk Group. 

Lucas Hawk was working on his job when his phone rang. 



He looked at the strange number and hesitated to pick it up. When he 
received the call, the picture on his screen made him horrible. 

In the video, a strange man held a dagger against Nora Davis’ neck. 

“What do you want to do?” 

He asked. He was angry. 

However, Nora Davis did not notice the screen and her eyes were full of 
surprised. 

She thought that she had been caught by those people but now that was not 
the case. 

“What do I want do? Shouldn’t Mr. Hawk be clear about it?” 

The man smiled at Lucas Hawk and responded in a cold voice. 

Lucas Hawk’s face was heavy and he had already guessed the ident!ty of the 
man. 

He was the unknown force. 

“I think Mr. Hawk should guess my ident!ty. If you don’t want your wife to die, 
please hand it over!” said the man. 

With his words, Nora Davis’ neck was cut by the dagger. Red bl00d was 
dripping down. 

Lucas Hawk looked at it and his eyes were full of grumpiness. 

Nora Davis was also angry. 

From the conversation of the two, she had understood what was going on. 

Obviously, all that the suffering now was for that b!tch. How could she not be 
angry? 

If she was hurt, she would never let go of that b!tch. 

In her gloomy thoughts, Lucas Hawk at the other hand had gradually calmed 
down. 



He stared at the phone with dim eyes and there was a surprise in his eyes. 

Although Nora Davis was shown on the phone, he found that she dressed 
different with earlier today. 

But he didn’t know why it was different. 

He started to deal with the man. 

“I can give you what you want, but I want the hostages to be unharmed.” 

He said while looking at the place where Nora Davis was scarched by a 
dagger. 

When the man saw this, he raised his mouth coldly, “As long as Mr. Hawk is 
honest, the hostage will be safe naturally.” 

He left a trading address and hung up directly. 

After the phone was hung up, Lucas Hawk held the mobile phone tightly and 
his face was extremely dark. 

He took his phone and immediately called Mo Li. 

“Sir.” 

She was so glad to hear from him. 

Lucas Hawk listened to her cheerful voice and his anger rose. 

“How about the lady?” 

When she heard this, she noticed something wrong and the smile on her face 
was not so bright anymore. 

“The lady is not with me.” 

She pressed her l!ps, making Lucas Hawk squinted dangerously. 

“Not with you? Didn’t I let you to follow her?” 



Mo Li immediately felt wronged and complained, “Sir, I’d like to follow the lady 
but I don’t know if she had any objection on me. When I go out, she 
deliberately set me aside. When I came to see her again, she was gone.” 

When Lucas Hawk heard this, he frowned tightly. He was sullen and confused 
at the same time. 

What did the woman hide from him, even risking to get rid of his people? 

Although Lucas Hawk was curious, he did not think of that at this moment. 

But, Mo Li also found something wrong. She asked carefully, “Sir, is there 
something wrong with the lady?” 
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Lucas was extremely gloomy when he heard this. 

He sneered and commanded: “Now immediately gather our people together, 
go to the Southern District and wait for me!” 

After a while, he hung up the phone. 

Mo Li looked angrily at the phone. 

This Nora really couldn’t have a peaceful life for a day, knowing that there’s 
the danger and still causing trouble to Mr. Hawk. 

Although she was angry, she didn’t dare to neglect in action, and immediately 
took her men to the place designated by Lucas. 

But all of these Evelyn didn’t know. She was with her mother in the hospital, 
took care of her mother’s personal hygiene, and then gave a massage for a 
while before planning to leave. 

When she just got out of the hospital, she received a call from John. 

“Evelyn, where are you now?” 

On the phone, John’s tone was very impatient and anxious. 



Evelyn frowned, but still answered honestly: “Just got out of the hospital and 
ready to go back.” 

John heard her words and wanted to order directly, “Now back to the hospital 
immediately, and you must not appear outside, especially in front of the Hawk 
family.” 

Evelyn was startled, her eyes flashed with confusion. 

“Why!” 

She questioned with a trill, thinking that Nora was going to take everything 
back. 

John did not hear the difference in her tone, he said coldly: “Nora is 
kidnapped. At this time, two Noras must not appear at the same time, so you 
must hide and not let anyone discover your existence, otherwise, everything 
will stop ! “ 

After he finished speaking, it seemed that he was in a hurry to rescue Nora, 
he hung up the phone directly. 

Evelyn took a cell phone and stood at the door for a long time before calming 
down from the news he gave. 

Nora was kidnapped! 

She looked pale, and also understood why John arranged this way. 

Because Lucas got the news, he would definitely go to rescue “her”. 

She thought and was worried. 

She was not worried about that Lucas and Nora would meet, but she was 
worried that Lucas would be injured. 

After all, she still remembered the previous abductions! 

The more she thought, the more panic she felt, and she felt that she couldn’t 
sit here waiting for the news. 

At the moment, she had a decision in her heart, went directly to the nearest 
clothing store, and modified herself. 



When she came out of the shop again, her appearance had changed a lot. 

Her original bright appearance was very ordinary now, and her clothes were 
replaced with simple t-shirts and jeans. 

 

She was very satisfied with the appearance of herself, as long as she did not 
appear in front of Lucas and looked at him from a distance, it was impossible 
to recognize her. 

In this way, Evelyn took a taxi to the Hawk Group. 

A few minutes later, she arrived at the Hawk Group. 

When she was about to go to the company to inquire about Lucas’s 
whereabouts, a familiar car sped out of the underground garage. 

She saw Lucas sitting in the driver’s seat, driving fast. 

Evelyn looked at him, her face paled slightly, and she was going to follow him 
subconsciously. 

However, how could she catch up him with only two legs. 

Seeing that Lucas’s car disappearing, she immediately ran to the street to 
stop a taxi to follow him. 

However, she did not stop a taxi, but instead met Joseph. 

“Evelyn!” 

Joseph downed his window and looked at Evelyn in surprise, his eyes were 
full of joy. 

“I haven’t seen you for a long time, this time you finally let me get back a little 
bit of you before.” 

“Joseph, why are you here?” 

Evelyn was very surprised to see him too, but also had a headache. 



“I was passing by, but I saw you need the taxi, so I came here. Are you going 
to take a taxi? I’ll send you there.” 

Joseph clearly saw the anxiety of Evelyn and offered to propose. 

“No, you don’t need to care about me. I’ll take a taxi by myself.” 

Although Joseph had met Nora and knew that their ident!ty had changed, she 
did not want him to know more. 

After all, the secret inside was serious, if there’s anything wrong, what was 
waiting for her was the hell. 

After she said, she would turn around and leave. 

Joseph wanted to chase her, so he got off the car. 

“Evelyn!” 

He grabbed Evelyn’s wrist, his eyes were full of worry. 

“I know you have a secret and don’t want to tell me, but we are friends, and 
when you obviously need help, I hope I can help you!” 

Evelyn looked at him with anxiety in her heart. 

She knew it would become like this when she met Joseph. 

She was anxious, especially Lucas’s car had disappeared. 

Joseph naturally also saw the anxiety on her face and her look in front of her. 

“Evelyn, although I don’t know what you are looking for, but if you disagree, 
the car in front of us will disappear.” 

Evelyn could not help but agree to accept his help. 

“Help me catch up with the Maybach in front!” 

She quickly got into the car, pointing at the car, and eagerly said, “After 
catching up, don’t let him find us.” 



Joseph looked at the direction she was pointing, narrowed his eyes, let her sit 
firmly, and then started the car to speed up. 

Although his car was a little worse than Lucas’s, its performance was still 
good. 

They chased for a few minutes, and they were only 100 meters away from 
Lucas’s car. 

“Evelyn, this distance is good, if we are close, I’m afraid that the other party 
will notice us.” 

Joseph said his thoughts, and Evelyn thought so too. 

Ahead, Lucas was worried about Nora, and he didn’t notice that someone was 
following him. 

He hurriedly hurried to that place. 

Uh … 

At the same time, the man who was waiting for Lucas to trade in the Southern 
District received a call from his employer. 

“I heard you have caught her?” 

Yao Si’s somber voice sounded on the phone. 

The man glanced at the woman tied to his chair and chuckled, “Yes, I can 
complete your task from a distance. Now Lucas Hawk should rush to me with 
something.” 

Hearing his words, a bl00dthirsty smile appeared in the corner of his mouth. 

“Very good! However, I don’t want to trade with him now.” 

He moved his mouth fiercely, his eyes were full of anger. 

Hearing this, he frowned slightly, and asked with a dangerous aura: “What? 
You want to cancel the order?” 

“No, I want you to bring her back!” 



Knowing that the man had misunderstood, Yao Si countered: “Just letting him 
hand over things seems to be too easy for him!” 

He said this, could not help but grit his teeth. 

It was only because of the trouble that Lucas caused for him this time that he 
lost hundreds of millions dollars.His anger could not be quenched. 

The man didn’t know what was in his mind, and knew that he wasn’t going to 
cancel the order, so he eased his att!tude. 

“Why didn’t you say this early? Now I’m afraid that Lucas Hawk must be bring 
someone over. You want me to take her away, unless you send me support, I 
can’t do it alone.” 

Yao Si also understood that, so he responded: “Rest assured, I will let your 
partner go there. You just need to keep your eyes on her, and must not let 
Lucas rescue her.” 
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The man heard this, and said with a smile: “As long as you give me support, 
no one can rescue her from me!” 

When Yao Si heard this, he hung up the phone with satisfaction. 

The man put away his mobile phone, looked down at the woman who was 
staring at him with anger, and said indifferently, “Ma’am, sorry, my employer 
doesn’t want you to be rescued in this way, so you have to go with me.” 

When he finished speaking, he untied Nora, the dagger threatened her and 
made her follow him obediently. 

“Who is your employer?” 

Nora did not dare to resist and did not want to give up self-help. 

Although she didn’t hear the phone call of the two just now, she probably 
guessed it. She was so angry that her heart and stomach were hurt. 



Obviously the person who wanted to revenge Evelyn didn’t want to let her go 
so easily! 

For a while, she had the thought to k!ll Evelyn! 

It’s all because of this b!tch. Evelyn must offend someone, causing her to be 
implicated. 

The man seemed to not hear her words, and when he untied the rope, he 
signaled Nora to follow him obediently. 

She had no other ways, Nora could only leave with him. 

When they just left here, Mo Li arrived with her men. 

As a result, when they carefully lurked into the abandoned building and 
searched the entire floor, they couldn’t find Nora and the kidnapper. 

“No one’s here?” 

After listening to other’s report, Mo Li’s eyes were full of disbelief and doubt. 

“Yes, we searched both inside and outside the building. No suspicious people 
were found.” 

Her man respectfully reported it again. 

Mo Li’s expression sank, and felt a bad hunch in her heart. 

Wasn’t their action discovered by the other party and then the other party took 
Nora away? 

She was thinking so, but didn’t have an answer. 

In the end, she could only report this situation to Lucas. 

“Sir, I’m already in the Southern District, but I haven’t found Mrs and the 
kidnapper!” 

When Lucas heard this, he stepped on the b.rakes suddenly. 

“You didn’t find her? What’s the matter?” 



He asked in a deep voice, his voice was full of anger. 

Mo Li dared not hesitate, and immediately reported the situation here. 

“Sir, would it be the kidnappers found us and left with Mrs?” 

Then she talked about her guess. 

Lucas did not refute because he felt it was possible. 

After all, the other party could enter Jingdu silently under his eyes, and take 
Nora away, which was not easy. 

Thinking, his eyes darkened, and he said coldly, “Don’t move in place and 
wait for my order.” 

 

… 

At the same time, in an ancient castle with a long history abroad. 

This old castle was full of luxury feeling everywhere, the walls were full of 
famous paintings, and the long corridors were extravagantly covered with 
good wool blankets. 

There’s a young man in a steward’s costume hurriedly appeared in the 
corridor and walked towards the room at the end. 

“Boss, Miss Nora was kidnapped in Z Country!” 

He knocked on the door and entered the room, reporting respectfully at his 
desk. 

As he spoke, a cold voice sounded in this room. 

“What’s going on? Who did it?” 

He lowered his head and responded: “The specific information has not been 
found. Miss. Nora went back in secret this time. Our people didn’t follow her 
closely.” 



The man heard the words, and the cold spirit was released from him, causing 
the subordinates to change his expression slightly, and his eyes flashed with 
fear. 

“Boss, you can rest assured, I have sent someone to rescue Miss Nora.” 

He quickly said his own arrangements, which made the man snorted softly, 
and slowly regained the coercion of the whole body. 

“Remember, I want her and her child to be safe. If there is any accident, you 
don’t have to come back again, just get the suicide and confess your sins!” 

Lucas did not know that someone else had inserted this kidnapping incident. 

He hung up Mo Li’s call and immediately found out the number that before the 
kidnapper contacted him before. 

However, when he dialed it, the robot prompted that it’s an empty number. 

For a while, a storm gathered in his eyes! 

“Damn it!” 

He slapped the steering wheel violently, and knew that he was being trapped 
by others. 

The other party didn’t really want to deal with him, just to test him. 

Thinking of this, he took a hard breath and made himself calm down. 

He picked up his phone and contacted Mo Li again. 

“Let your people back.” 

Mo Li was surprised and asked, “You don’t save Mrs?” 

However, Lucas did not respond to her, he hung up the phone directly. 

He did want to save her, but now he can’t contact the kidnapper at all, how to 
save her, he didn’t know! 

It can be said that he was very passive now, unless the other party appeared, 
he could not make a plan at all. 



But he was not willing to be fooled like this. 

In particular, Nora was still trapped by them. 

From that man could threaten her with a knife, he knew that this time the 
person was the tough guy. 

He was worried that those people would hurt Nora. 

After a few moments of silence, Lucas gradually got an idea in his mind. 

He took out his phone and contacted Cater directly. 

“Cater, Nora has an accident, immediately let someone to investigate the 
surveillance after coming out of the Hawk family, check their whereabouts, 
and the Southern District, check if any suspicious people came over these 
days.” 

Cater heard the words, his expression changed greatly. 

Knowing that the situation was urgent, he did not dare to neglect, and 
immediately did so. 

Just as he was about to hang up, Lucas seemed to have thought of something 
again, and commanded again: “Yes, greet the police and ask them to a.ssist 
in the investigation, investigate the airport, the highway intersection, and the 
main exits. If they find any suspicious people, notify us immediately! “ 

Cater nodded and hung up the phone. 

Lucas took back the mobile phone with a calm face. He squinted his eyes and 
did not plan to go to the Southern District anymore. he went back to the 
company and waited the news. 

Joseph looked at the direction in which he was turning and walked towards 
the way they came, looking at Evelyn in doubt. 

“He seems to be going back, shall we follow?” 

Evelyn looked at Lucas far away, she was puzzled too, but she still nodded: 
“Follow him.” 

Joseph heard the words, and then turned around and chased after. 



The two followed Lucas back to the Hawk Group. 

Evelyn watched Lucas enter the underground garage, and the doubts in her 
eyes grew deeper. 

Why did Lucas go back? 

Had Nora been rescued? 

Joseph did not know what she was thinking. He was surprised when he saw 
the car entering the parking lot of the Hawk Group. He immediately 
remembered that the man who stood with Evelyn at the banquet before was 
the president of the Hawk Group. 

For a moment, he was full of doubts. 

He moved his mouth several times and wanted to ask Evelyn what happened 
to her, but when he saw Evelyn’s apparent absent-minded appearance, and 
she had hidden several times before, apparently she didn’t want to tell him. 

Eventually he surpressed the curiosity and broke the silence and asked: 
“Evelyn, he’s in the underground garage. Do you still want to follow him?” 

Evelyn reacted, glanced at Lucas’s direction of disappearance, she frowned 
slightly. 

“I want to see him again, if you have something, go first.” 

How could Joseph leave her alone, so he refused immediately. 

“I’ll stay with you.” 
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Evelyn looked at his expression that could not be rejected on his face. She 
couldn’t reject him, so she gave up directly and nodded. ” Okay, thank you.” 

In this way, the two waited from day to night, but Lucas did not return. 

And Evelyn did not receive any news from John. 



Lucas didn’t know these at all, he was working on the doc.uments while 
waiting for news of the kidnappers. 

However, after a long time, the kidnappers still did not contact him. 

This made him angry again. 

As soon as he was about to break out, news finally came from Cater. 

“Boss, the police found suspicious guys at Southeast Station.” 

“Did anyone be caught? Did you see Mrs?” 

Lucas immediately asked. 

Cater apologized: “The man was very smart. When the police man appeared, 
he noticed and left. As for Mrs, the police said that no one saw her, but it is 
certain that the man is still in the city. 

Lucas heard the words, his whole body aura became gloomy. 

“Send more people there, and take the station as the center, carry out a 
carpet-like search, and find them out!” 

Cater nodded and went to do this thing after the phone was hung up. 

Lucas put away his mobile phone, at this time he had no intention to work. 

He had a somber face and left the company. 

Evelyn saw him leave, she immediately let Joseph follow him. 

The two followed behind Lucas and saw him return to the Hawk family. 

Evelyn looked at him and frowned. 

She thought of her own guess in the afternoon. 

Did Nora come back? 

Joseph didn’t know her thoughts. When he saw that Lucas returned to the 
Hawk family, he asked. 



“Evelyn, do we still need to stare at him?” 

Evelyn reacted, she was not sure. 

“Wait a minute, I’ll make a call.” 

In a word, she called John directly. 

“Is Nora back?” 

The call was connected, and she asked directly. 

She didn’t know if it was because Nora had no news yet, John’s tone was very 
cold: “You shouldn’t ask me about this, now what you should do is hide in 
somewhere quietly, don’t let anyone find you!” 

After he said, he hung up directly. 

Evelyn looked at the phone that was hung up, and frowned. 

From John’s words, she obviously could know that Nora had not been 
rescued yet. 

Why did Lucas have not actions? 

She didn’t think that Lucas didn’t care about her, she just felt confused. 

 

But she was quickly suppressed this doubt. 

She thought that there should be something unexpected here, so Lucas did 
not take any actions. 

Thinking this way, she was relieved. 

If Lucas not act, it meant there’s no danger. 

“Evelyn?” 

After seeing Evelyn hanging up the phone and did not speak for a long time, 
he reminded again. 



A pair of dark eyes stared curiously at her cell phone, wanting to see who she 
was calling. 

Unfortunately, the mobile phone had been blanked, and Evelyn had reacted, 
she didn’t give him any chances, took up her phone directly. 

“Sorry, I was thinking about things just now, let’s go back, we don’t need to 
stare at him longer.” 

She looked up at Joseph with a smile, and immediately apologized, “Oh, I 
have delayed you so much time today, we haven’t eaten yet. I want to treat 
you tonight.” 

When Joseph heard this kind words, the smile on his face became far-
fetched. 

“Evelyn, we shouldn’t need to be so welcome, right?” 

He looked at Evelyn, then started the car to leave, “Where do you want to 
eat?” Evelyn saw this, she knew that it’s not good to say more, so she 
reported to a slightly remote restaurant. 

After a while, the two arrived at the restaurant. When Joseph finished 
ordering, he looked at Evelyn and moved his mouth several times as if he had 
something to say. 

Evelyn naturally knew what he was going to say, and said, “Joseph, can you 
still do the same as before, don’t ask anything.” 

Joseph froze, a bitter smile aroused in the corner of his mouth, and said 
helplessly: “Well, I don’t ask, tell me when you want to.” 

Evelyn heard the words and looked at him gratefully. 

Then the two talked about the situation one after the other. 

Until it’s getting late, the two were separated. 

Because she was unable to return to the Hawk family, Evelyn had to go to the 
rental room in the old town. 

She took a bath briefly, but couldn’t sleep in the deserted room. 



Her mind was wondering what Lucas was doing at this time? Who arrested 
Nora? 

Even she was embarrassed and didn’t know if she could go back. 

Uh … 

At the same time, Cater’s investigation had finally got news. 

“Boss, our people found suspicious guys at the station.” 

After hearing the news, Lucas flashed a red light in his eyes. 

“Tell them, let everyone keep the exit and wait for me to come over.” 

After he finished speaking, he hung up the phone immediately and left with 
the car key on the table. 

Less than half an hour, he arrived, Mo Li followed tightly behind him. 

When Cater saw him, he immediately stepped forward to report: “Boss.” 

“Where’re they?” 

Lucas looked at him and asked immediately. 

Cater heard the words, his complexion became embarrassed. 

“They ran away …” 

Like an erring man, he stood with his head bowed in front of Lucas. 

When Lucas heard this, he was not as irritable as before, he’s calm as he was 
during the day. 

“What’s the matter, explain to me carefully!” 

He squinted dangerously, glancing around the station. 

Cater did not dare to conceal, and immediately reported. 



“Originally, our person found that guy and was about to arrest him. He 
seemed to notice something. After entering the bathroom, he seemed to 
evaporate and disappeared.” 

When Lucas heard this, his face was so cold. 

And Mo Li, she couldn’t help secretly expecting it. 

She can see that the other party obviously did not want sir to save Nora. 

She really hoped that those people can take this opportunity to k!ll Nora. 

Lucas didn’t know what was in her mind, he thought without speaking. 

These two mistakes in a row made him have to think more. This was a 
warning given to him deliberately, so that he should not act lightly. 

Obviously, the other party wanted to control sovereignty. 

“Tell them, everyone withdraws.” 

Lucas felt that he had thought of the truth, and there was a glimmer of light in 
his eyes. 

Cater was surprised, “Boss, what about Mrs?” 

Lucas just glanced at him coldly, Cater stunned for a second, and immediately 
understood. 

At this moment, he and Lucas were thinking about the same thing. 

“Yes, I’ll let them leave.” 

Lucas withdrew his men, and the other man got the news, he curved his l!ps. 

Of course he wouldn’t really believed that Lucas would really let his men 
away. He even didn’t need to think about it, he knew that as long as he 
showed up, what was waiting for him was the hell. 

After all the information that the employer gave him said that this Lucas’s a 
super cunning man. 
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The next day, Jingdu Airport. 

On the airport exit, a very sweet couple came out from the entrance. 

The man’s tall, tight-fitting leather jacket showed his slender figure and 
overbearing momentum. 

The woman next to him, although she’s pet!te in front of the man, she was 
very tall with golden curly hair and a sculpted figure, which was a combination 
of angel and devil. 

Many people were attracted by their appearance, but the two turned a blind 
eye to it and left directly. 

They went to a hotel, and when they entered the room, the two separated 
from the roles of the loving couple. 

“Go get in touch with Tianlang. I’m a little tired, I want to rest for a while.” 

After the woman finished speaking, she lay on the bed. 

However, anyone who had practiced kung fu can see that her casual lying 
posture was actually the best defensive posture, so she didn’t need to worry 
about any sneak attack. 

The man saw this and did not make a noise, he took out the connector on his 
body to send a signal. 

After a while, he heard a cold male voice on the phone. 

“Tianlang, we are here. Where are you and the hostage?” 

The man in leather jacket sat on the sofa and asked with his feet across the 
coffee table. 



Tianlang, that was, the mercenaries who kidnapped Nora, chuckled: “I’m in 
the demolition house in east city, come here, pay attention when you coming, 
this time the goal is very cunning.” 

The man in the leather jacket hummed, glanced at the woman on the bed, and 
hung up after decided the specific time with him. 

Until the afternoon when the three met at the east city demolition house. 

“Tiansha, Tianhu.” 

Tianlang saw the two and greeted. 

Tiansha was the man in leather clothes, and Tianhu was that cold and 
gorgeous woman. 

“What about the hostage?” 

Tiansha saw him and immediately asked about Nora. 

“She quarreled with me one night last night and she was gagged and tied 
inside.” 

Tianlang said, and took them into the abandoned building. 

After a while they stopped in an abandoned old building. 

They saw in the middle of the room, Nora was tied and lay on the ground very 
embarrassedly. 

When she heard the movement, she opened her eyes from closing her eyes. 

When she saw Tianlang, her anger was raised in her eyes. 

If it wasn’t for her mouth being blocked, she would have scolded. 

Even though, she was struggling to scream ‘wow’. 

Maybe it’s the same se.x repulsion. Tianhu listened to the noise made by 
Nora, and she was agitated. So she strode over, before Nora reacted what 
happened, she slammed her. 

 



“Be quiet!” 

She reprimanded coldly. 

Nora stunned. 

Especially her left face was swollen, and the five fingers were very obvious. 

“Slut, how dare you hit me!” 

Nora now reacted, and the rag in her mouth had just been knocked out 
because the slap, so she screamed in anger. 

“Noisy!” 

Tianhu narrowed her eyes dangerously, and slapped her face again. 

This time, the force was even stronger than before, and the bl00d was flowing 
in the corner of Nora’s mouth. 

Nora felt hurt to the extreme, but also hated the extreme. 

When did she suffer such humiliation. 

“Slut, don’t wait for me to go out, otherwise I will let you die!” 

She gritted her teeth and stared darkly at Tianhu, her eyes were full of k!lling 
meaning. 

Tianhu noticed her hate, her eyes narrowed, and the bl00dthirsty light flashed 
under her eyes. 

As she was about to start to slap her again, her wrist was tightly held. 

“Tianhu, enough, if she is crippled, we can’t explain to the employer.” Tiansha 
warned in a loud voice. 

Tianhu snorted coldly, glanced at Nora, who was still resentful, then 
threatened: “If you are noisy, I will cut your tongue off!” 

After this, she broke free of Tiansha’s restraint and walked aside. 

Although Nora was angry, she was scared by the look before she left. 



She didn’t dare to speak for a while. 

Tianlang looked at her and couldn’t help laughing, “What’s the matter, such a 
great anger.” 

Tiansha reluctantly responded: “You know, she doesn’t get enough sleep, and 
the most annoying thing is noisy.” 

Tianhu listened to the conversation between the two, rolled her eyes, and said 
angrily, “Do you want to talk about business or not?” 

Seeing this, the two looked at each other and walked towards Tianhu. 

“What did your employer say when you came here?” 

Tianlang glanced at Tiansha and asked Tianhu. 

Tiansha didn’t conceal it, and said it simply: “The employer asked us to take 
her back, and Tianhu stayed here to pretend to be a hostage and deal with 
Lucas Hawk. He would then send someone to cooperate with us.” 

Tianlang agreed. 

Nora’s face changed suddenly when she heard their words. 

“Where are you taking me?” 

She sternly questioned, but it was Tianhu’s gloomy eyes that responded to 
her, scaring her that she didn’t dare to speak. 

Because she can see that this woman was not easy, and what she said 
before was never a joke. 

She can’t be hurt! 

She kept calming herself in her heart and couldn’t help praying. 

She’s been missing here for almost a day and night, and that man should 
have gotten the news. 

She hoped he can find here before these people take her away. 

And the facts did exactly what she thought. 



The Davis Group. 

John waited for a day and a night without any news of his beloved daughter. 
He was so anxious. 

At this moment, the assistant hurried in. 

“Boss, the front desk downstairs said someone wanted to see you.” 

John refused without thinking about it, “No, no …” 

Before he finished speaking, he was interrupted by the assistant’s surprised 
voice. 

“Who are you? Who allowed you to come up?” 

He saw a few black men pushing the assistant aggressively and went into the 
office. 

“Who are you?” 

John looked at them with a frown, and he could obviously feel that these 
people were not ordinary people, because they were all with k!lling feeling. 

“Mr. Davis, it doesn’t matter who we are. What’s important is do you want to 
save Miss Nora?” 

The sunglasses man stared at John expressionlessly. 

John squinted, his eyes filled with doubt: “What do you mean?” 

The man in black heard the words and did not waste the time, and said 
frankly, “Our boss sent us to help Mr. Davis save Miss Nora.” 

John suddenly felt confused, “Who is your boss? What is your relationship 
with Nora? Why should I believe you?” 

Man in black seem to know that what John would ask, he’s still with the same 
complexion, and responded: “Mr. Davis, I can’t answer these questions. If you 
want to know, you can wait for Miss Nora to come back and ask her.” 

When John saw this, he knew from these people that he could not get useful 
information. 



In addition, he thought that the ident!ties of these people were not simple, and 
he was anxious for Nora’s safety. He forced the dissatisfaction in his heart to 
discuss with them how to save her. 

“Okay, you can’t tell me, I won’t ask it again, just now you said to help me 
save her, can you tell me, do you have news about Nora now?” 

The man in black bowed his head: “Yes, but we also need Mr. Davis’s 
cooperation to rescue Miss Nora.” 

 


