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Chapter 3721 

At that, Fisher froze. 

“What on earth do you mean?” 

“Surely they can figure out just how many assets I have in Flutwell.” 

“Do they honestly think the Indians can buy me with just a hundred and fifty 
million?” 

“What a joke!” 

“Besides, I already took Cody out of the picture. No matter how you look at it, 
the Indians would never take me in, even if I’m stupid enough to accept their 
offer.” 

“It may look like they’re trying to get me on their side, but it’s all just a heinous 
trick.” 

“They only said that it was risky for me to fight because there’s someone 
behind the scenes trying to suppress me.” 

“After Amber and all the young talents defeated the top talents from India, the 
Indians came to realize they weren’t as strong as we initially thought.” 

“On the one hand, they don’t want me to be involved in such a crucial time so 
I don’t have a chance to become the final victor. That way, I wouldn’t have a 
chance to be appointed as the young master of Longmen.” 

“Out of the fourteen fighters, there are probably spies from their side.” 

“Say one of their men crushed the Indians and became the young master of 
Longmen. It would benefit them a lot more, wouldn’t it?” 

“Them saying that the Indians bought me off is just an excuse.” 

“They’re actually planning on using the situation to suppress me.” 



Fisher froze. Then, he let out a huge sigh. 

“You’re right about that.” 

“Out of the fourteen fighters joining the fight, there’s a man by the name 
Melvin Kennedy. He’s the vice master’s nephew.” 

“There’s another one from the Osborne family as well.” 

“If we’re looking at it in another way, it’s not that they don’t trust you-they just 
want their own people to rise instead.” 

“After all, the person with the most contributions would have a chance to 
become the young master of Longmen and inherit the organization in the 
future.” 

“Since there’s a chance the young talents won’t wake up for the rest of their 
lives, those people have finally found their opportunity to strike.” 

“The status and authority as the young master of Longmen is incredibly 
powerful! In the future, that person will govern one of the four cornerstones of 
the country!” 

Fisher, enraged, gritted his teeth. 

“Those b*stards!” 

“They’re still trying to reap the benefits while the country’s fighting against its 
enemies! This is simply heinous!” 

“But… Why would Elder Steele support them too?” 

“In his eyes, it doesn’t matter if I poisoned Amber and the young talents. They 
all got in trouble while they were with me, and that’s a fact.” 

“So long as this fact still troubles him, he won’t speak up for me.” 

“I won’t blame him for this, though.” 

“As for the others…” 

Harvey revealed a faint smile. 



“It doesn’t matter where they’re from. Things are never as simple as fighting 
and killing.” 

“This whole thing may seem like a war between countries, but the real battle’s 
hidden behind the scenes.” 

“Everyone involved has their own goals.” 

“The Indians are planning to reclaim their reputation while crushing mine. At 
the same time, they’re making their move inside Country H.” 

“After the fall of the three young masters of the Bauer family, Longmen wants 
to use the chance to break off from the family and rise on their own.” 

“The Osbornes and Golden Palace have their own plans as well. Safe to say, 
there’ll be a big show coming up!” 

“It’ll be a right spectacle when the fight begins, both in and out of the ring…” 

“So, I won’t take this to heart.” 

“Rather, I’ll make them understand and bear the consequences for their 
actions!” 
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Chapter 3722 

Harvey quietly left Flutwell’s Peak soon after. 

For him, Rhea and the others to come out at such a crucial time wasn’t 
something so bad. 

At the very least, he finally found some time to save Amber and the young 
talents. 



The Life Elixir was a strange medicine, but it couldn’t be considered poison. 

The best way to save the three was for them to wake up naturally. 

According to Harvey’s deductions, even if the woman soaked her fingers in 
the Life Elixir for an entire day, the effects would be minimal. 

But since there was time now, Harvey would naturally try to wake up Amber 
and the others on his own. 

And so, he got Rudolph and his team to empty the three talent’s stomachs 
before providing them with IVs. 

He then poked at various parts of their bodies to stimulate their vitality. 

A whole day passed. 

Harvey left the young talents, completely exhausted. Just then, Rachel, who 
was still in Flutwell’s Peak, called him. 

The call didn’t matter; Harvey already knew what was going to happen. 

Rhea and Bryce handpicked the fighters for the next three matches with the 
Indians. 

Yet, they were still beaten to a pulp by Zoe, Danny, and Ryland. 

Longmen had completely lost their reputation once again. 

This comeback boosted the Indians’ morale; they boasted about how they 
would take down Longmen and Country H once and for all. 

Harvey hung up. Then, he looked at the comments online. 

The internet was in an uproar. 

Some believed that Longmen was playing the long game to secure their 
victory. Others thought that they were only trying to have the fighters gain 
experience in the fights. 

Others speculated that the young talents had a conflict with Longmen; that 
they demanded a large number of benefits. Otherwise, they wouldn’t fight for 
Longmen. 



There were those who managed to figure out the truth, claiming that all of 
Longmen were fighting for their own interests and reaping their own benefits 
without regard for the chaotic situation at hand. 

Ultimately, there were endless comments about the situation from many, 
many people. 

That said, both Longmen and the Indians kept quiet on the matter. 

It was as if they were all waiting for what would happen next. 

Four days had passed in a blink of an eye. 

Longmen had lost twelve matches in a row. 

The provincial champions were all completely beaten up. 

People Bryce and Rhea sent were all slapped around like dead dogs against 
India’s three top talents. 

Because of this, the netizens were ruthlessly insulting the fighters. 

Bryce and the others felt immensely pressured. 

It’s said that even Longmen’s temporary offices in Flutwell were all swarmed 
by angry mobs. 

The people couldn’t bear to see their country humiliated. 

They demanded the young talents take action as soon as possible. 

It got so bad, the police had to bring many officers to deal with the situation. 

At this moment, someone online revealed that the young talents weren’t able 
to fight because they were poisoned. 

Footage of Harvey and Zoe’s meeting was exposed to the public soon after. 

Pictures of a hundred and fifty million dollars transferred to Harvey’s bank 
account were revealed, along with the conditions of the Indians’ offer to him. 

Some even drew out a timeline to explain the entire situation. 



And so, without any solid proof, Harvey was branded a traitor to his country. 

Everyone believed that he was a despicable man who conspired with the 
Indians and sold out his people just for glory and riches. 
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Chapter 3723 

In just an hour, Harvey’s reputation plummeted and he became no different 
than a street rat. 

Many people gathered around Martial Hall, throwing rotten vegetables and 
eggs all over the place. 

If it wasn’t for Ansel summoning the police, the entire place would’ve been 
trashed. 

Even so, Harvey was still insulted relentlessly. 

People were either threatening to rip him to shreds, or demanding him to 
leave Country H immediately. 

Safe to say, Harvey was blamed for every single loss since the last four days. 

The provincial champions who had been beaten up and were insulted before, 
were now dubbed as the real heroes by the people. 

They believed the champions knew they were completely powerless against 
Zoe and the others… 

That the champions knew Harvey poisoned the young talents… 

Yet, the champions still fought with all their might against such odds! 



This was the unyielding courage everyone wanted to see! 

Layne, Kayden, and Harvey’s people were infuriated; they turned on their 
laptops just to argue with the comments online. 

Unfortunately, they were completely outnumbered. Their efforts were futile. 

Mandy and Xynthia called Harvey to ask what was happening; they were 
naturally worried about him. 

Harvey skimped past the subject and simply told them to stay safe. 

Lilian, on the other hand, was pestering Harvey about money; as always. She 
demanded to keep the money if Harvey actually took the bribe from the 
Indians. 

She wanted to prevent the Indians from going back on their word and taking 
the money back. 

With this, Harvey managed to understand a little more about just how 
shameless Lilian could actually be… She had no bottom line, as it turned out. 

Despite that, he remained calm as he faced such a turbulent situation. 

Explaining the situation would do him no good, especially when everyone was 
verbally abusing him online anyway. 

As long as he could crush the Indians, the insults would naturally disappear 
soon after. 

Right as he was thinking of calling Bryce for an opportunity to fight the 
Indians… 

The angry mob outside fell into dead silence. 

Many people in Longmen uniforms suddenly showed up. 

They exuded a fierce and arrogant aura that intimidated all. 

A few police officers tried stopping them, but were all kicked aside. 

A beautiful woman was leading the newcomers. Seeing her, the inspectors 
sealed their mouths shut, their expressions horrible. 



The woman looked like she was in her twenties; she had a slender body and a 
face as beautiful as a painting. Her clothes fluttered in the wind, and an 
enchanting yet distant aura could be felt on her. 

Upon seeing how fierce she looked, the mob couldn’t help but feel a sense of 
dominance. 

There were a lot of people following her as well, and most of them were 
women. 

All of them were extremely beautiful in their own right; they were obviously 
trained experts as well. 

“Huh? Aren’t they from the Longmen Warband?” 

“Oh my god! That must be the second senior, Regan Green!” 

“She’s the goddaughter of the head of the Longmen Warband!” 

“Be quiet! Do you have a death wish? Don’t you know how temperamental 
she is?!” 

“What’s she doing here?” 

“Don’t you know? One of the young talents, Philip Steele, is actually her 
junior!” 

“They have a pretty good relationship too…” 

“Regan’s a tough woman. Maybe she’s here to…” 

The furious crowd was shocked by Regan’s arrival. They started gossiping. 

At the same time, they were pleasantly surprised. 

Someone was finally here to stand up for the young talents and take out 
Harvey! 
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Chapter 3724 

Regan narrowed her eyes without saying a word. Suddenly, she kicked the 
door of the Martial Hall open. 

Two beautiful female disciples stood beside her. They immediately spotted 
Harvey. 

“That’s him, Senior Green! That’s Harvey York!” 

“He’s the one who poisoned our junior and the other two young talents!” 

“Our reputation is completely ruined because of him!” 

“If we keep losing, Longmen will become the traitor of the entire nation!” 

“This b*stard is the one who caused all this!” 

The disciples kept insulting Harvey while gritting their teeth; they wanted to rip 
Harvey to shreds so badly. 

The crowd outside was showing glee upon seeing what was happening. 

‘How dare this b*stard conspire with the enemy for his own gains?! He 
deserves to be dealt with by the Longmen Warband!’ 

The inspectors in charge of maintaining the order were watching with bright 
eyes; they didn’t bother stopping the entire commotion. 

Harvey could be seen sipping his tea in the middle of the large hall. 

He put down his phone before looking curiously at Regan. 



He thought the Longmen’s higher-ups would come for him, but Philip’s very 
own senior showed up first. 

Harvey found that Regan was quite impressive. She was able to maintain a 
clear head in the face of the nation’s public enemy. 

Other people wouldn’t be able to do anything other than lash out online. 

“Interesting.” 

Regan froze upon seeing Harvey calmly sipping his tea. She glared coldly at 
him. 

“Even if you’re the provincial champion, you’re still too naive to be showing off 
in front of the Longmen Warband!” 

“Since you know Longmen, you should at least know that the Eight Inner and 
Outer Halls surpass the thirty-six branch leaders.” 

Regan strutted toward Harvey with her subordinates. 

She pulled out her sword fiercely and stuck it right on the table next to Harvey. 

“You better give me an explanation about my junior!” 

“If you don’t give me a satisfying answer, I’ll kill you right now!” 

The crowd gasped; the Longmen Warband were usually quite discreet… 

Thus, nobody expected Regan to be so straightforward. 

She was ready to cut Harvey down if he didn’t give a proper explanation. 

It was natural for her to be furious; she was Philip’s senior, after all. 

Besides, as a member of the Longmen Warband, she had all the right to be 
angry with the experts around her. 

Shockingly, Harvey ignored Regan completely and kept sipping his tea. 

“Don’t get too cocky, Harvey!” Regan yelled, a horrible look on her face. 

“Don’t think that I wouldn’t dare!” 



Harvey didn’t even raise his eyes to look at Regan. 

Regan’s face darkened in an instant. 

“Are you deaf? Or are you mute?!” she exclaimed coldly. 

“Are you trying to piss me off?!” 

“Kneel and explain yourself!” the female disciples of the Longmen Warband 
screeched. 

“You’re not getting out of here unscathed until you tell us how you got our 
junior this way!” 
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Chapter 3725 

Harvey looked curiously at the disciples infuriated for their junior, not giving a 
straight answer. 

It was a good thing for them to stand up for Philip. At least they were full of 
spirit… 

However, it was enough to show how stupid they were for being so easily 
used. 

Regan’s expression worsened after seeing Harvey’s mocking look. 

“If you don’t want to die here, then you better explain everything properly!” she 
exclaimed after taking another step forward. 

“If not, you won’t get a chance to get out of here alive!” 



“Let me tell you something! Only the Longmen Warband would be this 
reasonable right now!” 

“The Dark Hall and the Five Outer Halls will just take you out without a single 
word!” 

“We’re giving you a chance to explain yourself! Do you understand me?” 

“That said, it doesn’t mean that you’re allowed to show off!” 

“Stop pretending to be deaf and mute already! Fess up!” 

“Kneel and explain yourself!” 

“If you still won’t do it, then don’t blame us for what happens next!” 

Regan was completely infuriated; normally speaking, anyone else would 
respect her because of her identity. 

She also believed that she was being nice enough to warn Harvey over and 
over again. 

Yet, he had been quietly sipping his tea the entire time. 

‘Is the Longmen Warband not that well-known? Or is this conspiring b*stard 
just a little too cocky?’ 

Harvey calmly put down his cup. 

“For Philip’s sake, young lady, I won’t blame you.” 

“Pay for the table and leave.” 

“You…!” 

Regan let out an angry laugh upon seeing Harvey’s calm appearance. 

Not only did Harvey not explain the situation, but he even told Regan to 
compensate for the table. 

Regan slammed her hands furiously on the table and pulled her sword out. 
She grabbed the handle tightly, planning to cut off Harvey’s arm before 
anything else. 



“You can’t, Senior Green! You can’t just cut off someone’s arm without 
figuring out the situation!” 

A female disciple quickly stopped Regan. 

“Right! You should at least wait till you know everything before you do 
something like this.” 

“This man’s a huge suspect, but we can’t be reckless! We belong to Longmen; 
we should give him a chance to explain himself!” 

“Spill the beans already! Do you have a death wish?!” the other disciples 
exclaimed in unison. 

“Senior Green’s extremely angry right now! We won’t be able to stop her if this 
continues!” 

“Kneel and start talking already! Senior Green will start piling up dead bodies 
if you don’t!” 

The disciples were being extremely respectable even as they yelled at 
Harvey, but they were still demanding him to kneel and explain the situation. 

That way, Regan would be able to calm down. 

A few disciples walked out and slammed the door shut. 

They didn’t want anyone looking or taking pictures in case a fight were to 
break out. 

“Who are you? Leave!” another disciple screamed at Layne, who had 
appeared from the back. 

“If you’re not involved in the situation, then stay out of the way!” 
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Chapter 3726 

Layne ignored the disciple and walked calmly toward Harvey. 

“Do you not understand me?!” 

The disciple was furious. 

Longmen Warband had a reputation to uphold! 

Yet, this many people were disrespecting them. 

“Senior Green! This woman is a disciple of the Golden Palace’s outer circle, 
Layne Naiswell. She’s that b*stard’s bodyguard!” 

“Layne Naiswell?” 

Regan chuckled coldly. 

“The legendary disciple of Golden Palace’s outer circle?” 

“Impressive! I’ll make sure to cripple you for being on Harvey’s side!” 

“Sir York.” 

Layne poured Harvey a cup of tea, still ignoring Regan and the others 
completely. 

“We’ve investigated the situation. These young’uns came here of their own 
volition.” 

“The master of the Longmen Warband might not know about this.” 

“At the end of the day, they’re only standing up for their junior. They’re a bit 
reckless, but it’s not their fault.” 

“We should just let them go.” 

Layne tried persuading Harvey. She admired Regan and the others coming 
here for Philip’s sake. 

That said, they were being used because of their recklessness. That was why 
Layne hoped that Harvey could be the better man and spare them. 



Harvey nodded. 

“Since they’re only being used, we’ll let them off the hook.” 

“Tell them to leave.” 

“Of course.” 

Layne nodded. Then, she glared coldly at Regan. 

“Sir York gave you a chance and won’t hold you accountable for this. You 
should leave now.” 

Regan froze. A split second later, she burst into anger. 

“Do you know who we are, you b*stard?!” 

“You won’t hold us accountable? You want us to leave?” 

“Who do you think you are?!” 

“Let me tell you something!” 

“In Flutwell, only the head of Longmen’s Law Enforcement can keep us 
down!” 

“You’re nobody!” 

“If you don’t give me an explanation right now, I’ll…” 

Before Regan could finish her sentence, Harvey casually flipped through a 
bunch of junk on the table before throwing out a golden badge. 

“What is the meaning of this? How dare you throw things right in front of me!” 

“You think you’re…” 

Regan’s eyes twitched frantically before she could finish her sentence. 

The golden badge was labeled… 

“Longmen’s Law Enforcement!” 



The badge carried the same authority as the head himself! 

Regan went limp right there and then; her tongue was instantly swollen, and 
her breathing grew rapid. Even her legs were starting to wobble; the prideful 
look on her face was now replaced with a look filled with fear. 

The other disciples were sweating profusely; their limbs had gone completely 
numb. They didn’t even have the courage to stand up straight. 

Their pride and arrogance were replaced by a sense of horror. 

“I didn’t expect this badge to have a better reputation than myself.” 

Harvey took a sip of his tea, still calm. 

“Take this and send word on my behalf: all of Longmen will not interfere with 
the situation to prevent being used by the enemy.” 

Layne nodded. 

“Understood. I’ll contact the vice head immediately.” 

“Heh!” Regan suddenly screamed. “Enough acting!” 

“What’s the point?” 

“Do you think I’ll let you go just for having a fake badge like that?” 

“You’re making yourself look worse!” 
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Chapter 3727 



Regan gritted her teeth.She didn’t want to believe that Harvey actually had the 
Longmen Law Enforcement Badge. 

“You actually think this is fake?” 

Harvey smiled calmly as he flicked his teacup to the badge. 

The badge then slid right toward Regan with a dazzling glare. 

“I suggest you take a close look, young lady.” 

“Don’t misunderstand me.” 

Regan shot him a stern look and then glanced over. Her mind exploded the 
instant she saw a few hidden marks to authenticate the badge. She 
immediately knelt, slamming her knees to the ground. 

She couldn’t remain calm any longer. The badge was undoubtedly real! 

Even a dominant woman like Regan couldn’t help but shiver. 

She didn’t know who Harvey actually was, but the badge was enough to prove 
his powerful status; Harvey was not someone Regan could afford to go 
against. 

If she didn’t kneel, she wouldn’t be the only one in trouble-the entire Longmen 
Warband would be dragged down as well. 

“I’m sorry, Sir York. This is all just a misunderstanding…” 

“Please give us a chance to redeem ourselves!” 

Not just Regan, even the other disciples were groveling on the ground. Their 
faces had completely lost all color. 

Harvey narrowed his eyes at them for a moment. 

“This was your first mistake-you came with good intentions…” 

“You were clearly being used because of the situation.” 

“I’ve decided to punish you by making you keep an eye on the young talents 
in the backyard for a day. You can leave after that.” 



“Ah!” 

The disciples froze. They soon came to their senses. 

Though Harvey said that he was punishing them, he was actually giving them 
time to stay with their junior 

He was repaying them with kindness. 

The disciples looked at Harvey with odd expressions. 

‘Did a man like this really conspire with the enemy for the sake of his own 
glory?” 

Harvey didn’t take another glance at Regan as he stood up. 

“Layne. Give Vice Branch Leader Benett a call.” 

“Tell him that I’ll fight the Indians tomorrow.” 

“Regardless of the higher-ups’ decision, I’ll go!” 

“Ah!” 

Regan and the others were completely shocked. 

“He’s planning to crush the Indians and turn the tides?” 

“He’s only thinking of taking action instead of lashing out at the comments 
online! This is a true man!” 

At six o’clock in the evening, inside the meeting room of Longmen’s Budokan. 

“Harvey! You’re here!” 

Fisher and Damian welcomed Harvey in with open arms. 

Rhea and Bryce didn’t speak up, they only greeted Harvey with a nod. 

Harvey glanced at the people around him and said, “Vice Branch Leader 
Benett, Elder Steele. I told people to send word that I’ll be fighting tomorrow.” 

“Do you not agree with me?” 



“Are you planning to lose the fight completely?” 

Fisher’s eyes twitched, as if he could feel the rage in Harvey’s words. 

He took a deep breath and replied, “I’m sorry for what happened a few days 
ago, Harvey. We’ve wronged you completely.” 

“We didn’t think you’d still fight despite what happened!” 

“We feel terribly guilty!” 

“We asked you to come here to apologize and to discuss crushing our 
enemies tomorrow!” 
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Chapter 3728 

Damian nodded repeatedly. 

“I misunderstood you, Sir York.” 

“We know how you treated Regan and the others.” 

“I was being narrow-minded!” 

“How could a man like you conspire with the enemy for such small benefits?” 



“On behalf of the Eight Inner and Outer Halls, I apologize to you. I hope that 
you’ll do your best tomorrow!” 

Harvey smiled. 

“You’re too kind.” 

“I have responsibility for the young talents as well. I didn’t take care of them as 
promised.” 

“It’s only natural for all of you to doubt me and stop me from joining the fight. 

“After all, we all have to look at the bigger picture. It’s not just about personal 
gain.” 

“But since we’re in a peculiar situation right now, I’ll take the initiative once 
more.” 

“I hope you all will trust me this time.” 

“At the end of the day, we’re all people of Country H. There’s no need for us to 
fight among ourselves. Our enemies will laugh at us if they know about this!” 

“As long as nobody’s dragging me down, it’ll be easy for me to crush those 
Indians.” 

Fisher and Damian kept nodding after hearing the words of a big-hearted 
man. 

Harvey’s broad mind was not something ordinary people could have. 

Normally speaking, even top talents would have their own pride to uphold. 

Who would still be willing to lend a hand if they were doubted and wronged to 
this extent? 

And since Harvey was still joining the fight after all the commotion, this was 
already enough to prove that his love for the country was unparalleled. 

Fisher and Damian looked at each other. 

“Please do! Nobody will drag you down. You have our word!” 



“Hold it!” 

Rhea, who had been sitting in her chair, suddenly put down her teacup. 

She straightened her back and looked at Harvey with narrowed eyes. 

“As the representative of the northwest Martial Arts Alliance, I still think that 
Harvey cannot be allowed to join the fight!” 

Damian stared at her with an expression as cold as ice. 

“I know you have an extraordinary status, Representative Osborne.” 

“However, this is war!” 

“We’ve already lost twelve matches in a row!” 

“What’s more, the young talents can’t do anything right now!” 

“We only have three matches left!” 

“If Harvey doesn’t fight, we’ll be finished after losing two more!” 

“Why are you still trying to cause trouble?” 

“Do you actually want Longmen and Country H to lose against the Indians?” 

Fisher scoffed coldly at her.. 

“If it weren’t for you getting in the way, we wouldn’t be yelled at by the 
netizens in the first place!” 

“We would’ve crushed them and started our celebration by now!” 

“Why are you still causing us trouble at this point?” 

“What’s the meaning of this?!” 

“As the representative, I’m responsible for monitoring all martial arts forces,” 
Rhea said, picking up her teacup once again. 

“What do you think I’m doing right now?” 



“I’m just being cautious!” 

“It’s because we have three matches left that we can’t allow such a suspicious 
man to fight!” 

“What if he admits defeat as soon as he gets in the ring?” 

“I’d rather watch our people be beaten down than see that.” 

“At least people would know that we tried!” 

“Besides, everyone on the internet is blatantly cursing Harvey as of this 
moment.” 

“We’ll be dragged down if we let him fight!” 
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Chapter 3729 

Rhea flashed them a deep look. 

“At this point, it doesn’t really matter if we win the fight or not.” 

“But if we’re branded traitors of the country after letting Harvey in the ring, 
we’ll be finished!” 

“You people should know better than me about what’ll happen after that!” 

Fisher and Damian’s faces darkened in an instant. 

Bryce, who had remained quiet the entire time, finally spoke up. 

“That’s right. It looks like we’re about to lose, but we still have hope!” 



“That said, Harvey asked to join the fight even when he’s such a huge 
suspect.” 

“To put it simply, I just don’t trust him!” 

“I’d rather the remaining two champions lose…” 

“…than to let him fight.” 

“I believe he won’t turn the tides; he’ll surely embarrass every single one of us 
too.” 

“I’d choose to let Longmen lose than for him to show up.” 

Harvey narrowed his eyes; he glared at the stubbornly righteous Bryce and 
Rhea. 

To protect their own reputation… 

To prevent outsiders from turning the tides of battle… 

To suppress Harvey and stop anyone else from having the position of 
Longmen’s young master… 

Those two spared no effort to accomplish just that! 

At that moment, the door of the meeting room was pushed open. 

A calm yet dignified voice could be heard. 

“I too think Harvey should join the fight!” 

Harvey instinctively turned around, and saw someone walking over. 

It was the princess of the Wright family, Sienna Wright herself! 

“Princess Wright!” 

Bryce and the others immediately stood up after seeing Sienna’s arrival. 

Naturally, they all knew who she actually was. 

Even the high and mighty Rhea stepped up to give her a warm welcome. 



“I’ve been watching the fights in person for the past few days. I’ve reviewed 
the entire process as well.” 

Sienna glanced calmly at the people around her before turning to look at 
Harvey. 

“I came here to talk to Representative Osborne and Vice Master Kennedy 
about tomorrow.” “But since you’re already discussing it, I’d like to express my 
opinions about it as well.” 

Sienna walked beside Harvey before revealing a warm smile. 

“I believe that Harvey should fight for the country!” 

Sienna’s white dress and hair fluttered in the air, as if she was a young and 
innocent lady who just fell in love. 

Harvey glanced at Sienna before flashing her a faint smile. 

“Thank you for trusting me, Princess Wright.” 

Safe to say, Sienna was quite the patriotic figure. 

She knew that standing up for him would give her and her family a bad 
reputation. 

Yet, she still did it anyway. 

Harvey was a little more impressed by Sienna’s actions. 

“I know that the losses for the past few days have you worried, Princess 
Wright” 

“This is war, after all. If we lose, not only will Longmen’s reputation be ruined, 
but so will Country H’s!” 

“However, you need to trust us! We’re hoping for our country to win as well!” 
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Chapter 3730 

“Other than him being extremely weak…” 

“There’s another reason we didn’t let him fight. He’s simply too suspicious!” 

“We cannot bear the risk of putting him on the front lines.” 

“If he makes a single mistake, every single one of us will be dragged down 
with him!” 

“You included, Princess Wright!” Rhea exclaimed bitterly. 

At the same time, there was a different meaning in her words; she was putting 
on a helpless look, as if nobody would take responsibility for the situation if 
anything were to go wrong. 

Sienna smiled and waved her hand, gesturing to her subordinates to close the 
door.She then glanced at Rhea. 

“Since we’re all smart people here, I’ll just make everything clear.” 

“I need to make sure of something first…” 

“You didn’t stop Harvey from fighting because of your family affairs, did you?” 

Bryce and Rhea froze immediately. 

They didn’t think Sienna would actually say something like this. 

The two took a deep breath before replying, “Of course not!” 

“Good.” 

Sienna smiled. 



“Since that’s the case, let’s talk logically.” 

“Maybe you don’t know much about Harvey, but I can tell you all about him.” 

“He owns Sky Corporation in Buckwood.” 

“He has the Kaizen Group in Mordu.” 

“He has Mordu’s Casino-Palace in Hong Kong and Las Vegas.” 

“He also has the Hatchet Gang and the Martial Hall here in Flutwell.” 

“I don’t know how much the companies are actually worth in the market, but 
I’m sure you can look that up online.” 

“Why would someone like Harvey even accept a hundred and fifty million 
dollars from the Indians. if that’s the case?” 

“I have to admit, those people are really stingy; it doesn’t matter if they’re 
actually trying to get Harvey to their side, but that tiny amount of money is 
simply too insulting!” 

“If Harvey can win this fight, he’ll become the young master of Longmen.” 

“He’ll have the chance to become the master of the country’s cornerstone in 
the future.” 

“Someone like that is on par with the masters of the five hidden families and 
the top ten families. Maybe even better!” 

“Why would someone like that conspire with the enemy and become a 
Brahmin?” 

“What’s the point?” 

“Their delicious food?” 

Bryce and Rhea’s eyes kept twitching after hearing Sienna’s words. 

On the one hand, they didn’t know that Harvey’s background was actually so 
impressive. 



On the other hand, they didn’t think that Sienna was this biased toward 
Harvey. 

Sienna calmed herself and continued speaking in a tender voice. 

“The accusation about him having a relationship with Zoe is just slanderous.” 

“No matter how much he wants to do something like that, he wouldn’t pick 
such a bad time to do it, right?” 

“You say that he was the one who poisoned the young talents? That’s just 
absurd!” 

“All Harvey needed to do to take all the credit was to lead those three to 
victory! His status and identity will skyrocket without a doubt!” 

“Do you honestly think he’d actually poison them and ruin his future?” 

“If we judge based on public opinion, Harvey clearly isn’t suspicious. There’s 
no need for us to even talk about this!” 

Fisher and Damian looked at each other and exclaimed, “That’s right!” 

Harvey showed a faint smile. 

“Thank you for trusting me, Princess Wright.” 

After hearing those words, Bryce painstakingly opened his mouth for a weak 
retort. 

“We want to believe that he’s innocent, but everyone online is saying 
otherwise!” 

“We’re forced in a corner. We can’t go against the people!” 
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