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41 I haven’t asked for your name yet 

The security guard immediately released Shi qinglan. 

The girl looked up and sized up the man. Shi qingyao’s dark and deep eyes were cold. 
He was arrogant, cold, and domineering. He exuded an aura of arrogance as he stood 
alone. 

“Oh, it’s you.” Shi qinglan’s lips curled up. 

Shi qingxuan glanced at her indifferently, but it was just a fleeting glance. The throbbing 
feeling from that day in the hospital came back. 

“I was just asking what you were doing.” His thin lips parted slightly, and his slightly 
deep voice was still a little cold. 

The security guards looked at Xu Cheng, not knowing what to do. 

Xu Cheng frowned. After adjusting his posture, he walked up to Shi qingqiao. master 
Sheng, this girl grew up in an orphanage. She didn’t have the right to attend this dinner. 
The invitation was stolen. 

Hearing this, Shi qingxun’s eyes rippled. 

He looked at Shi qinglan indifferently. Indeed, he had not expected such a beautiful girl 
with such medical skills to grow up in an orphanage. 

“This young lady is an honored guest of our Shi family.” 

Shi qingxuan squinted at Xu Cheng. I was the one who invited her to the banquet. Do 
you have any other questions? ” 

“What ... What?” Xu Cheng’s expression changed. 

He clenched his fists tightly and looked at Shi qinglan with a pale face. He could not 
believe what she had said. 

How could Shi qinglan be familiar with the Shi financial magnate? 

“Master Sheng, you don’t have to speak up for her ...” Xu Cheng was unwilling. she’s 
just an orphan! 



Shi qinglan’s eyes turned cold when she heard this. 

Just as she was about to flare up, Shi qingxiao stood in front of her. Her voice was cold 
and full of warning. young master Xu, are you doubting the truth of my words? ” 

It was obvious that he was determined to protect this girl. 

Although they did not know the truth, since the onlookers were able to establish 
themselves in the wealthy families, they must be very observant. Naturally, they did not 
dare to offend the Shi family, one of the top corporations in the imperial capital. 

“Naturally, I wouldn’t dare.” Xu Cheng gritted his teeth. 

Although he still did not believe it and was extremely unwilling, he did not dare to go 
against Shi qingshang. He could only give up and leave after glaring at Shi qinglan and 
snorting coldly. 

“Thank you,” she said. Shi qinglan’s Red lips parted. 

She thanked him nonchalantly and turned around to pick up the chocolate-flavored 
macarons, continuing to eat them as if nothing had happened. 

Shi qingxiao’s eyes were still fixed on her. When she saw that she had a special 
preference for chocolate, her expression froze and her heart throbbed even more. 

“Miss godly doctor.” 

He pursed his thin lips and hesitated for a long time before finally opening his mouth. 
you left in a hurry the last time, so I haven’t asked for your name. 

Shi qinglan wiped the corner of her lips with her finger. 

She tilted her head slightly to glance at the man, and she could detect a faint smile from 
his beautiful side profile. shouldn’t you introduce yourself before asking for someone’s 
name? ” 

Shi qingshang’s lips curled up slightly. 

He then handed his palm to the girl. Shi qingyao. 

Upon hearing this, Shi qinglan’s smile froze for a moment. She suddenly remembered 
the White list bounty that he had given to the pure world Pavilion and the crescent 
birthmark on her right butterfly bone ... 

“So it’s master Sheng from the Shi financial magnate of the capital.” 



She retracted her smile and turned to look at Shi Qing with a complicated expression, 
as if she was looking at a pervert. 

It was just a perverted hobby ... 

He even studied the birthmark on the girl’s back! 

Shi qingxuan’s brows rose slightly. Seeing that the girl didn’t seem to have any intention 
of shaking his hand, he didn’t feel embarrassed. 

He retracted his hand very naturally. so, may I ask for miss godly doctor’s name now? ” 

42 That girl, what’s her name? 

Shi qinglan licked her lips as she pondered. 

At this moment, although Shi Qingyun looked like a decent man, in her eyes, he was a 
dignified beast in human clothing. In private, he might play with wax drops, small whips, 
and so on ... 

“Hehe.” Shi qinglan sneered, “master Sheng, actually, I think the title ‘miss godly doctor’ 
sounds pretty nice. If we meet again in the future, you can continue to call me that. 

Hearing this, Shi qingxuan’s brows furrowed. 

Of course. he was aware of the girl’s vigilance and rejection of him. He suppressed the 
inexplicable feeling of his heart beating and looked at her with a deep gaze. you ... 

“That, master Sheng!” Shi qinglan interrupted him, ” I suddenly remembered that I still 
have something to do. I’ll take my leave first. 

As soon as she finished speaking, she picked up another chocolate macaron, then 
slipped away and disappeared in an instant. 

Shi qingxuan’s dark eyes gradually turned cold. 

He stared at the girl’s back, and his heart that had been frozen for years seemed to 
gradually become hot. A strong but inexplicable emotion spread in his heart, making 
him unable to control it. 

who the hell are you ... Shi qingqiao mumbled. 

He felt that he must have seen this girl before. Moreover, this petite figure was almost 
overlapping with the LAN ‘er in his memory! 

He remembered that LAN ‘er also loved chocolate. 



Shi Qing’s eyes darkened. His cold eyes scanned the banquet hall. When he found Xu 
Cheng, he strode over without hesitation. young master Xu. 

“Master Xiao?” Xu Cheng turned around in surprise. 

He had not expected Shi qingxuan to come to him of his own accord. He was wondering 
if master Sheng had discovered Shi qinglan’s true colors, but he did not dare to express 
it directly when he recalled his cold anger. 

Shi qingxuan pursed his thin lips, his tone cold. do you know that girl? ” 

Xu Cheng nodded and said, ” we were high school classmates. 

Shi qingxiao clenched his fists tightly. He probably did not notice that his palms were 
already covered in cold sweat. 

“You just said that she grew up in an orphanage?” 

yes, it’s at the Lin city welfare Institute. I was sent there when I was very young. What’s 
wrong? ” Xu Cheng answered honestly. 

Shi qingqiao continued to ask, ” very young, how old are you exactly? ” 

Xu Cheng frowned slightly. He remembered that Shen ruxue had mentioned to him 
before that she had taken Shi qinglan away from the welfare home when she was eight 
years old. She had probably stayed there for five years. 

“Three years old, I guess.” Xu Cheng answered after making a guess. 

Shi Qingyun’s long and narrow eyes suddenly narrowed. All the blood in his body 
seemed to have been stirred up and was boiling. 

He had lost LAN ‘er when she was three years old, and this lady miracle doctor had 
been sent to the Ying city welfare house when she was three years old! 

“Then ...” Shi qingxuan’s Adam’s apple moved slightly, and his voice was a little tight. 
what’s her name? ” 

The cold sweat on the man’s palm became even more dense. 

While waiting for the answer, his heart seemed to be clenched by an invisible hand, and 
it beat faster uncontrollably. 

Xu Cheng looked at him suspiciously. her name is Shi qinglan. 



It was as if fireworks had exploded in his mind. Shi qingxiao froze as an ecstatic and 
agitated feeling spread in his heart and wrapped him up tightly! 

Shi qingxuan’s voice trembled slightly, and even his eyes gradually turned red. say that 
again ... What’s her name?” 

“Shi qinglan,” Although Xu Cheng noticed that master Sheng was acting a little strange, 
he didn’t dare to contradict or ask more questions. He only answered truthfully. 

Upon hearing this, Shi qingqiao turned around and ran in the direction that the girl had 
left in like a mad woman! 

43 Chapter 43 LAN ‘er! 

The night was quiet, and the moon hung on the Willow branches. 

Shi qinglan ran outside the banquet hall to get some fresh air. She leaned lazily against 
the White jade pillar in the pavilion in the courtyard and looked up at the crescent moon 
in the night sky. Suddenly, someone wrapped her shoulders. 

“Why are you outside, huh?” 

Bo Yicheng placed his suit jacket over the girl. He frowned slightly as he watched her 
wearing a thin evening gown. 

Shi qinglan smiled. I’m just getting some air. 

When he saw that there were still traces of chocolate on the corner of the girl’s lips, he 
smiled and wiped it for her with his fingertips. Then, he handed her a small box. I 
brought it out for you. 

Shi qinglan took the small box and opened it. 

Inside were all kinds of pastries from the banquet hall, most of which were her favorite 
chocolate flavor. 

“You know me the best.” Shi qinglan’s right eye blinked. 

A flirtatious look was thrown into Bo Li Cheng’s heart, and he even had the idea of 
moving all the dessert tables in the banquet hall home ... 

“How much longer until the banquet ends?” 

Shi qinglan and Bo Li Cheng sat side by side in the pavilion, a slight breeze caressing 
their faces and a few strands of hair covering their eyes. 



The man reached out to help her smooth her hair. you want to go home? ” 

Shi qinglan’s Red lips twitched slightly. I thought it was really a charity dinner, but it 
turns out to be just a social event for you rich families. Other than using donations as an 
excuse, I don’t see any charity at all. 

Upon hearing this, Bo Yucheng laughed in a low voice. 

In order to show off their status, the rich and powerful often held banquets under the 
guise of charity. In fact, it was just an occasion for the aristocratic families to win over 
people’s hearts, and the main topic had become secondary. 

“If you want to go home, then we’ll go.” Bo Li Cheng indulged her unconditionally, his 
arm around her shoulder. 

Shi qinglan pursed her lips. but I still want to buy an orphanage. 

“I’ll go talk to the Dean alone, okay?” The man coaxed her affectionately, then he took 
the girl and prepared to leave. 

At that time, Qing Xiao had just left the banquet hall. 

His palms were still covered in cold sweat. When he realized that it was very likely that 
he had found his sister, the intense excitement and anxiety clenched his heart, and he 
even felt a little panicked and at a loss. 

LAN ‘er ... LAN ‘er!” 

Shi Qingyun had shed his usual coldness and aloofness, but he still looked a little 
embarrassed at this moment. When he saw Shi qinglan’s back, he chased after her 
without hesitation. LAN ‘er! 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng’s footsteps suddenly stopped. 

When he heard this excited and warm call, the aura around him instantly turned as cold 
as an ice cellar. The cold aura swept over the world and the arm holding the girl could 
not help but tighten. 

“LAN ‘er ...” Shi qingshang’s voice tightened. 

Shi qinglan’s beautiful eyes blinked as she looked up at Bo Li Cheng. Her watery eyes 
were clear and bright, full of innocence. 

Bo Li Cheng retracted his cold aura. 



He moved his hand from the girl’s shoulder to her waist and pulled her into his arms 
even more intimately. He turned around. 

“Young master Shi.” He narrowed his eyes and opened his thin lips. 

Indeed, he didn’t expect his potential love rival to be someone from the Shi financial 
magnate. 

Shi qingxuan’s brows furrowed. young master Bo? ” 

The Bo Corporation and the Shi Corporation, the two major financial magnates, had 
equal status among the wealthy families in the imperial capital. There was not even a 
third family that dared to call themselves the top. Both of their heirs were existences that 
had to be called ” master. 

Now, they were at loggerheads with each other, and no one was willing to call the other 
‘master’. 

Shi qinglan’s Red lips parted slightly. you two know each other? ” 

Two cold gazes collided in the air. The two men examined each other and said in 
unison, ” we’re not close. 

44 LAN ‘er is the young lady of our Shi family! 

Shi qingxun’s dark eyes were deep and indifferent. 

He squinted his eyes and sized up the man in front of him. His gaze finally fell on the 
arm around the girl’s waist. 

“May I know why young master Shi is looking for my wife?” 

Bo Zicheng placed his large palm on the side of Shi qinglan’s waist and held her tightly 
in his arms. The words that came out of his thin lips were like ice shards that smashed 
onto the ground. 

Shi qinglan was speechless. 

She had just been fiancée, and now she had leveled up. 

Shi qingxiao’s heart sank. He glared at the man beside the girl coldly and clenched his 
fists tightly. you guys ... You’re already married?” 

He had even missed his sister’s wedding! 



Bo Yicheng’s Red lips curled up slightly, the smile on his lips dark and proud. so what if 
you’re not married? ” 

As he spoke, he looked down at the girl in his arms and lifted her face with his Jade-like 
fingers. as long as Lan Lan is willing, I can move the Civil Affairs Bureau over right now. 

Shi qingxiao stared intently at Bo Yucheng. 

His dark eyes seemed to be burning with anger. In the man’s eyes, this was the anger 
of a love rival, but he didn’t know that the so-called love rival was actually thinking that 
the sister he had been looking for for fifteen years had been slept with by a stinky man! 

if there’s nothing else, young master Shi, I’m going to take Lan Lan home first. My 
family is still urging me to have a grandson. 

Bo Zhicheng laughed hoarsely, his laughter filled with endless adoration, and the eyes 
that fell on the girl were also full of tenderness. 

Shi qinglan was speechless. 

I’m going to listen to you continue to make up bullshit. 

She did not expose him in front of outsiders and obediently stayed in Bo Li Cheng’s 
embrace. Then, the two of them turned around and prepared to leave. 

But Shi qingxuan’s cold and angry voice rang out. wait! 

The smile at the corner of Bo Zhicheng’s lips instantly disappeared, a chill added to his 
ink-black eyes as he stopped in his tracks. 

“Lan Lan, it’s easy to catch a cold at night.” 

He leaned over slightly and rubbed against the girl’s ear, his posture looking intimate 
and ambiguous. wait for me in the car first, okay? ” 

Shi qinglan pursed her red lips and nodded obediently. 

She didn’t want to get involved in a man’s fight, and she really didn’t know why Shi 
Qingyun was looking for her all of a sudden and even calling her so intimately. then 
come back quickly. 

“Alright,” he said. Bo chicheng’s lips curled up slightly and he pecked her face. 

Shi qinglan raised her eyes to look at Shi qingxuan. Then, she picked up her evening 
gown and turned to leave, her cheeks still warm. 



“LAN ‘er!” Shi qingqiao wanted to chase after him. 

However, a tall figure suddenly blocked his way. 

Shi Qingyun suddenly raised his eyes in cold anger, and his slightly deep voice was 
cold and sonorous. Move aside!” 

“On what basis?” Bo Yicheng’s thin lips parted slightly, slowly and unhurriedly. 

Shi qingxiao’s eyes were bloodshot as she stared at the girl’s back. because I’m her 
biological brother! 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng’s long and narrow eyes narrowed. 

After a moment of shock, he sized up Shi qingyao and found that he did look a little like 
the girl. 

“What did you just say?” Bo chicheng’s voice deepened. 

The girl’s back view had already faded out of sight. Shi qingxiao looked back at the 
man, her eyes bloodshot. 

He clenched his fists so tightly that his knuckles turned white. LAN ‘er is the young lady 
of our Shi family. I’ve been looking for her for 15 years! 

Bo ye Cheng’s eyes darkened. 

His dark eyes seemed to have stirred up a stormy sea as he looked at Shi qingyao 
coldly and angrily. Suddenly, he threw a punch! 

“Bang!” 

45 I’ll punch you twice, you owe her 

Caught off guard, Shi qingqiao’s head was slanted. 

He turned his head slightly, his cold eyes covered with a layer of ice. He raised his hand 
and slowly wiped the blood from the corner of his lips, then looked up at Bo Li Cheng. 
what do you mean? ” 

“Ha ...” Bo Yicheng’s lips curled into a cold smile. 

He suddenly reached out to grab Shi qingxun’s collar, but the latter dodged to the side 
and raised his arm to block the attack. 

The two noblest men in China were in a stalemate. 



Shi qingxuan’s gaze turned even colder. Bo Yucheng, if you want to fight, I don’t have 
time to accompany you. I’m going to look for LAN ‘er now. 

As his voice fell, he lifted his feet and prepared to leave. 

But Bo Yicheng’s slightly cold voice suddenly rang out. Shi qingxiao, what right do you 
think you have to look for her? ” 

Shi qingxuan’s footsteps paused, and his body stiffened. 

His slightly narrowed eyes were deep and unfathomable, and he glanced coldly at Bo Li 
Cheng from the corner of his eye, not saying anything for a long time. 

‘Shi qinglan ... Shi Qing ...” 

Bo Zhicheng’s lips curled up slightly as he slowly read out the two names, his smile a 
little sarcastic. 

Although the Shi family and the Bo family were both top wealthy families in the imperial 
capital, the two families rarely interacted. Bo Zhicheng had never cared about the 
disappearance of the young lady of the Shi family, nor had he ever associated her with 
these two names. 

The smile on Bo Zhicheng’s lips gradually disappeared, his dark eyes deep and cold. 
you recognized her as your sister just by her name. Now you want to acknowledge her, 
but what were you doing earlier? ” 

He suddenly reached out and grabbed Shi qingyao’s collar. 

This time, Shi qingxiao did not avoid him. She pursed her lips tightly and said after a 
while, ” I’ve been looking for her ... 

“Bang!” 

Bo Li Cheng threw another punch without mercy. 

He opened his mouth coldly. you’ve been looking for it? ” 

This time, Shi qingxiao did not even wipe the blood from the corner of his lips. He 
closed his eyes to hide the red streaks in them. 

Bo Li Cheng looked at him with a deep gaze. He suddenly let go of his collar and 
pushed him back. when Lan Lan was thrown into the orphanage and tortured, where 
were your Shi financial magnate? ” 

“Where were you when she almost died in the fire?” 



Shi qingxuan’s Adam’s apple moved slightly, and he was actually speechless for a 
moment, not knowing how to answer Bo Zicheng’s increasingly cold questions. 

Ever since he had accidentally lost her, he had already committed unforgivable crimes. 

Even if the disaster back then was not what he wanted, even if he had been searching 
like crazy for the past 15 years, he had still lost his most precious sister in the end. It 
was irrefutable ... 

“Thin mist city.” Shi qingxuan suddenly opened his mouth. 

He slowly opened his eyes and licked the blood at the corner of his lips. first, tell me if 
she has a Crescent birthmark on her right butterfly bone. 

Hearing this, Bo Li Cheng’s eyes narrowed. 

He remembered that night when Shi qinglan had been in the bathroom after school. 
When she had barged in, he had caught a glimpse of the birthmark ... 

at LAN ‘er’s birthday party, my father gave her a necklace with her name and birthday 
engraved on it. 

Shi qingxiao looked at Bo Li Cheng. Her indifferent eyes were filled with both despair 
and anticipation. have you seen him before? ” 

Bo Li Cheng clenched his fists tightly. 

There was no need for a DNA test. These two clues alone were enough to confirm Shi 
qinglan’s identity. 

“I have no right to interfere in the matters between you siblings. The two punches I gave 
you today are what you owe her.” 

Bo Zhicheng did not answer her directly. He looked at Shi qingqiao with a clear gaze. as 
for these questions, you can ask them yourself. 

Shi qinglan had never mentioned to him that she wanted to find her family, and Shi 
qingxun’s appearance was also out of his expectations. He had no right to answer these 
questions on behalf of Shi qinglan. 

46 Young master Bo, you should be more polite to your brother-in-law 

Shi Qingyun suddenly chuckled softly. 

Even though he had been punched twice by Bo Zhicheng, tonight was the happiest 
night he had experienced in the past 15 years. I know. 



Even though Bo Li Cheng did not answer his question directly. 

But from his attitude, Shi Qingyun could almost confirm that the godly doctor was the 
sister he had been searching for for 15 years! 

“Young master Bo, please be careful when we meet next time.” 

Shi Qingyun raised his hand and slowly tidied up his collar. Even though there was an 
obvious scar on the corner of his lips, he still looked as proud and aloof as ever. you 
should be more polite to my brother-in-law. 

Bo Yicheng,....” 

He looked at his so-called brother-in-law with a cold expression. He glanced at him 
indifferently, then turned around and left with his hands behind his back. 

Shi Qingyun raised his hand and wiped the blood from the corner of his lips. 

He looked down at the blood on his fingers and was thinking about how to take revenge 
in the future when his phone suddenly rang. 

Shi qingxuan picked up the call, and Ji Lin’s anxious voice came through. young master, 
Sir is in critical condition! 

The man’s eyes darkened. 

He gripped his phone so tightly that his knuckles turned white. He immediately rushed 
to the hospital. I’ll be right there. 

.. 

Bo Li Cheng elegantly adjusted his sleeves and neckline. His well-ironed suit and 
elegant face made it impossible for people to tell that he had just beaten someone up 
before he walked towards the parking lot. 

But the girl almost ran into his arms. 

Shi qinglan still had his suit draped over her shoulders. The man immediately wrapped 
his arms around her waist and asked, ” why didn’t you wait for me in the car? ” 

“I was afraid something would happen to you.” The girl raised her pretty face slightly, 
and her clear and charming eyes flickered with a little nervousness and anxiety. 

She had waited for too long, and the atmosphere between the two of them was 
extremely strange when she left. She was worried, so she wanted to come and take a 
look. 



Bo Yicheng’s large palm caressed her head and he pulled her to the place where he 
parked his car. it’s fine. Let’s go home. 

At that time, Xu Cheng had just left the Yun ding banquet hall. 

He had made all the connections he needed and had also entertained the people he 
needed to socialize with. After donating some money to the Lin city welfare Institute, he 
went to the parking lot and prepared to go home. However, his eyes suddenly stopped. 

“Master Bo?” Xu Cheng’s eyebrows furrowed. 

Although the wealthy families of ye city were far from the imperial capital, or even had 
almost no right to get close, the Xu family was a distant relative of the Bo family, so Xu 
Cheng naturally knew what he looked like. 

“Master Bo!” He immediately chased after her. 

Bo xiaocheng’s footsteps paused. When he heard the man’s voice again, he first 
covered the girl in his arms with extreme vigilance. 

He didn’t even turn around. say what you have to say. 

Xu Cheng’s heart beat like a drum, and his palms were covered in sweat. master Bo, 
I’m the heir of the Xu family in Ying city. I’m your distant cousin. My name is Xu Cheng 
... 

Shi qinglan’s eyes flickered and she pinched the man’s waist. 

“You know him?” Bo Yucheng hugged her even tighter. Sensing her slight displeasure, 
his thin lips curled up slightly. 

Shi qinglan pursed her lips in disdain and nodded in response. 

The Xu family usually didn’t dare to interact with the Bo financial magnate. Xu Cheng 
only dared to look at Bo Zhicheng from a distance. He could only vaguely see that there 
seemed to be a woman in his arms, but he couldn’t tell what she looked like. 

Bo Zhicheng’s eyebrows raised slightly. He could tell that the girl probably had some 
grudges with this young master in the past. distant cousin? ” 

“Yes.” Xu Cheng smiled. actually, I happened to meet you this time because I have 
something I need your help with. 

I have a friend in the police station who has been slandered. Master Bo must have 
some connections in Lin city, I wonder if you can ... 



Upon hearing this, the girl in Bo Yucheng’s arms could not help but chuckle. 

encountered slander ... Who slandered you?” Shi qinglan turned back and looked at Xu 
Cheng with her red lips curled up. me? ” 

47 Lan Lan is mine, and I’m the only one in her heart 

Shi qinglan turned around. 

She gently raised her rose-like red lips. Even though she was smiling, she was like a 
red spider lily with hidden poison and thorns. 

“You ... How could it be you!” 

Xu Cheng’s eyes widened in shock. He looked at Shi qinglan in disbelief, and his entire 
body was as stiff as a stone. 

He did see a woman snuggling in master Bo’s arms. 

However, he did not expect it to be Shi qinglan! 

“You guys ... You guys ...” Xu Cheng’s brain was blank. 

He could not figure out how an orphan like Shi qinglan, who had been adopted from a 
welfare home, could be associated with the successor of the Bo Financial Group! 

young master Xu, the police have already reported Shen ruxue’s incident to the school, 
but you still think that I’m slandering her. 

Shi qinglan took light steps and slowly approached Xu Cheng. you said ... Should I look 
at your low IQ and ask your distant cousin to give you a lighter punishment?” 

Xu Cheng pursed his lips tightly. 

He had naturally seen the criticism in the notice, but he did not want to believe that the 
White moonlight in his heart would have a stain on it. 

“Shi qinglan, you don’t have to say such things.” 

Xu Cheng clenched his fists. I know what kind of person ruxue is. Don’t try to drive a 
wedge between us. 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng’s long and narrow eyes narrowed. 



The man’s cold aura burst out in an instant, and his deep, cold eyes looked at Xu 
Cheng. from what I’ve heard, young master Xu, is it that I don’t know people well and 
have a problem with my judgment? ” 

Xu Cheng’s heart instantly sank. 

Indeed, he had not expected that the Foxy and seductive Shi qinglan would dare to 
seduce the head of one of the top noble families in the imperial capital. Otherwise, he 
would not have been so impulsive earlier and pleaded for mercy from thin mist city. 

“Master Bo, I ...” Xu Cheng’s face was pale. 

Bo Li Cheng’s expression was cold. His white shirt made him look noble and elegant, as 
if he had a refined temperament like an orchid or Jade Tree, but his eyes were deep 
and unfathomable with a chill. 

“Xu Cheng,” His thin lips parted slightly. 

The man’s eyes drooped slightly as he slowly adjusted his sleeves. I remember that the 
Xu family’s rapid rise in status in Ying city these years should be due to the Bo financial 
magnate’s credit. 

Xu Cheng’s face turned even paler when he heard this. 

He regretted his arrogant words, but he didn’t feel that he was wrong. The only mistake 
he made was that he dared to question and ask for the truth, and he didn’t hesitate to 
offend the top aristocratic families. 

“Master Bo, don’t be deceived by this woman!” 

Xu Cheng’s brows furrowed. In the end, he decided to fight for justice against the evil 
forces in his heart. just now in the banquet hall, she was still entangled with master 
Sheng of the Shi financial magnate. She ... 

“Enough!” Bo Li Cheng suddenly shouted. 

Xu Cheng’s voice came to an abrupt end, and his neck was grabbed in the next second. 
There was no room for him to escape. 

Bo Li Cheng’s ink-black eyes were dark and deep, his cold gaze filled with displeasure 
and warning. Lan Lan is mine. She can only have me in her heart, understand? ” 

Even if Shi qingxun was her biological brother, he would still be jealous! 

He would never hand over the girl whom he had doted on for so many years so easily, 
and he would never allow anyone to say anything bad about Shi qinglan! 



“Bo ... Master Bo ...” 

Xu Cheng’s throat was clutched. His face swelled and turned from white to red due to 
breathing difficulties. He looked at him with wide eyes in horror. 

If Bo Zhicheng wanted to strangle him to death, it would be as easy as stepping on an 
ant. He narrowed his eyes and stared at the young man in front of him. and ... 

– 

The next update is before noon ~ 

48 I don’t want to dirty Lan Lan’s eyes 

“Shi qinglan is one of my people.” 

Bo Zhicheng’s eyes were suffused with an evil and dark light, and the strength of his 
palm gradually increased. if you want to slander her, you’ll have to first consider 
whether the Bo Financial Group agrees or not! 

Xu Cheng opened his mouth and made some strange sounds, but he couldn’t say 
anything because he was being strangled. 

Bo Li Cheng suddenly released his grip and pushed him back. 

His red lips were slightly upturned, and a dark smile bloomed between his brows. He 
was no longer as gentle as Jade, but now like a devil, staring at him with a death-like 
expression. 

“Xu Cheng, I won’t touch you today ... She doesn’t like the smell of blood on me the 
most, but that doesn’t mean I’ll let you go.” 

Xu Cheng’s throat was finally free. He panted heavily and raised his hand to touch his 
neck. 

“Master Bo, but ... But I’m not wrong!” 

He raised his eyes to look at Bo Li Cheng unwillingly, his face red as he argued, looking 
unrepentant. 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng could not help but sneer. 

“Ha ...” He slowly approached Xu Cheng, as if he was afraid that touching him would 
dirty his hands. He looked down and slowly wiped his hands with a handkerchief. you 
said you were not wrong? ” 



“Yes, I’m not wrong!” Xu Cheng straightened his back. 

Initially, he could not figure out how a girl from the slums like Shi qinglan could collude 
with the police. Now that he knew that she had such a powerful backer, it was not hard 
to understand! 

Xu Cheng said indignantly, ” if I’m wrong, it’s my fault for standing on the side of justice 
and telling the truth! 

Shi qinglan was speechless. 

He was starting to pity young master Xu, who was being brainwashed by Shen ruxue. 

Bo Yicheng paused in his actions of wiping his hands, his well-defined fingers casually 
folding the handkerchief. since that’s the case, let the entire Xu family pay for your 
mistake. 

He would never allow anyone who dared to provoke his Lan Lan to have a good end, 
nor would he leave any way out. 

“Master Bo!” Xu Cheng’s eyes widened in shock. you can’t do this. You can’t do such a 
ridiculous thing for a woman! 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng lowered his eyes and chuckled. 

He suddenly reached out his arm and wrapped it around Shi qinglan’s waist, pulling her 
into his arms and looking down at her affectionately. 

it seems like you still don’t know where you went wrong ... 

Bo Zhicheng’s lips parted slightly, his voice cool. your biggest mistake was to make our 
Lan Lan unhappy. 

Xu Cheng took two steps back in disbelief. 

He had heard that the master of the Bo financial magnate was not interested in women. 
Even if he was ruthless in business, he was usually a graceful and gentle person, but he 
did not expect that he was a fatuous ruler who was tempted by women! 

“Xu Cheng, you really should know the truth first, and then swear that you are on the 
side of justice.” 

Shi qinglan’s Red lips were pursed, and her charming eyes were filled with sympathy. 
poor thing. His little brain isn’t working well now. 

Xu Cheng looked at Shi qinglan with some indignation. 



However, compared to being calculative with her, he was more worried that the Xu 
family would encounter some setbacks. However, the sense of justice and dignity in his 
bones made him not allow himself to plead and yield to Bo Xincheng. 

“Master Bo, I’ll take responsibility for my mistakes.” 

He clenched his fists tightly. you can withdraw the funds of the Bo Financial Group in 
the Xu family, but you can’t deliberately suppress them. If I can win this war, you can’t 
make things difficult for the Xu family anymore. 

Bo Zhicheng’s brows raised slightly. He was about to say something when the young 
lady beside him stuck her head out. what if we lose? ” 

49 Do you want to find your family? 

Xu Cheng’s expression changed slightly. 

When he made his bold declaration, he did not think about the consequences of losing. 
He could only bite the bullet and say, ” if you lose, you can do whatever you want. 

“Alright,” he said. Shi qinglan’s Red lips curled up slightly. 

There was a faint light in her beautiful eyes. She seemed to be sizing up the young man 
in front of her. if you lose, the Xu family will bear the business losses that you deserve, 
and you ... Go to the police station and ask for the truth.” 

Upon hearing this, Xu Cheng suddenly looked up at Shi qinglan. 

He had originally thought that such a vicious woman would definitely whisper Pillow Talk 
to Bo Li Cheng, asking him to make the Xu family bankrupt, but he did not expect things 
to be so simple! 

“Just ... Just like this?” He couldn’t believe it. 

The smile on Shi qinglan’s lips became even more radiant. that’s all. I just don’t like to 
be wronged. 

Xu Cheng pursed his lips and nodded. okay. 

He looked deeply at Shi qinglan, nodded to Bo Li Cheng, and turned to leave. 

Bo Yucheng lowered his gaze to look at the girl, his fingers gently caressing her face. 
he slandered you and you let him off so easily, huh? ” 



Shi qinglan lifted her pretty face slightly, and there was a hint of sympathy on her 
delicate face. it’s not easy for someone with such an IQ to live until now. Shen ruxue 
even made him go crazy. Don’t you feel pity? ” 

we should take care of the disadvantageous group. Otherwise, people will say that we 
are bullying the weak. That is very immoral. 

Shi qinglan’s expression was solemn and serious. 

Bo Zhicheng chuckled softly and indulgently. He had originally wanted to help the girl 
punish Xu Cheng, so at this moment, he naturally let her have her way. Lan Lan can do 
whatever she wants. I’ll listen to you. 

.. 

The Bo Financial Group withdrew all the funds they had placed in the Xu family. 

The Xu family had been planning to go public, but they didn’t expect to encounter such 
a disaster. The current situation was chaotic, and the Board of Directors was quite 
dissatisfied with this. The status of this century-old family in ye city plummeted, 
becoming the topic of idle gossip. 

“Xu Cheng can’t beat you at all.” 

Shi qinglan’s Jade-like fingers pinched a small tea bowl. She sat in The Glass Room, 
basking in the sun, and looked at the man with a smile. 

Upon hearing this, Bo Li Cheng looked up nonchalantly. 

He moved the documents on his lap away and pulled the girl into his arms. if everyone 
is my opponent, what right do I have to have you as my wife, huh? ” 

Shi qinglan’s Red lips were slightly pursed, but her ears were slightly red. 

She had never even thought about marrying a man, but the other party’s mind was filled 
with this and a pile of obscene rubbish ... 

“I don’t have a family. Who are you going to ask for it from?” Shi qinglan mumbled softly 
as she lifted the teacup to her lips and took a sip. 

Upon hearing this, the expression in Bo Li Cheng’s eyes dimmed slightly. 

He took the teacup away and placed it on the table. He pursed his thin lips and thought 
for a moment before he said, ” Lan Lan, have you ever thought about getting that 
necklace back? ” 



Shi qinglan’s fingertips were slightly cold, and she could not help but pinch the corner of 
her clothes. 

The necklace that Bo Li Cheng was talking about was a world-class tafey stone 
necklace. Shi qinglan’s name and birthday were engraved on the gem, and she had 
been wearing it since before she was sent to the orphanage. 

However, Shi qinglan was later adopted by the Shen family, and the necklace was 
snatched away by Shen fengzhen and sold at a low price. Even though she had 
casually sold it, she had still earned a huge sum of money, which allowed the Shen 
family to move from the slums to the villa! 

“I have to get that necklace back.” 

Shi qinglan clenched her fist gently, but her hand was covered by the man’s warm palm. 
Then she heard him whisper in her ear, ” do you want to find your family? ” 

50 Shi qingxuan wants you to help him investigate Shi qinglan 

Shi qinglan’s delicate body stiffened slightly as she looked at the man. 

Before Bo Li Cheng had asked her, she had never thought about this question. After all, 
she had lived in an orphanage for as long as she could remember and was used to 
living under someone else’s roof. 

The girl’s Red lips smiled slightly, but her smile was a little cold. Then, she shook her 
head gently. since they abandoned me back then, why should I be so self-deprecating 
as to go back and find them? ” 

Even if she wasn’t abandoned, she was probably really an orphan. She had lost her 
parents a long time ago, so there was no need to find them. 

Bo Zhicheng pursed his lips into a thin line. 

He held the girl tightly in his arms and gently rubbed the top of her head with his chin. 
okay, then we won’t look for her. 

Bo Zhicheng thought to himself that it would probably be difficult for Shi Qingyun to 
acknowledge his sister, but this had nothing to do with him. He was even secretly happy 
that he could monopolize Lan Lan for a while. 

.. 

Bo chicheng had bought the Ji city welfare home and gifted it to Shi qinglan. 



Shen ruxue was finally released after being detained at the police station for half a 
month. However, her classmates in Pi City High School avoided her like she was the 
plague, and they kept talking about her. 

I heard that Shen ruxue went back to school ... 

she actually didn’t get fired? after all, she burned down an entire building. Is half a 
month of detention considered as punishment? ” 

after all, she has the Shao family and the Xu family behind her. The school wouldn’t 
dare to touch her. She’s pretty, so she has a man to back her up. 

Shen ruxue had never thought that she would end up like this. 

She bit her lip and looked pitifully at the people around her who were talking about her. 
Then, she lowered her head and quickened her pace to her class. 

Seeing her like this, some of the people around her who were talking about her began 
to change sides and sympathize with her. 

actually, it’s quite pitiful that she’s suffering from leukemia. Besides, she didn’t 
deliberately set the fire. It was just an accident. 

that’s true. She’s really unlucky to be caught in an accidental fire. 

Shi qinglan heard the comments the moment she walked into the school. Her eyes 
narrowed slightly. It was indeed time for Shen ruxue to be released. 

Her red lips curled up slightly, and she casually put her bag on her shoulder. Then, she 
walked briskly to the teaching building, but as soon as she entered the classroom, she 
heard a faint sobbing sound ... 

“Actually, I really don’t blame Lan Lan.” 

Shen ruxue’s face was as fair as porcelain, but she looked a little Haggard at the 
moment. Her lips were also bloodless. She looked so pitiful, crying like a Pear Blossom 
bathed in rain. 

She bit her lower lip and said, ” after all, I was the one who caused Lan Lan to almost 
die in the fire. Even if she went to the police station to report me, she should do so. I 
really don’t blame her. 

Shi qinglan was speechless. 

I’m so grateful to you. 



She threw her bag on the seat as if nothing had happened. Then, she put on her 
headphones, sat down, and started to play with her phone. 

“Ruxue, you’re too kind.” 

it’s not like Shi qinglan was burned to death. The Shen family has raised her for so 
many years, but she’s ungrateful and cruel. She even went to the police station to report 
you for an accidental arson. She’s too much! 

that’s right. I think you should blame her ... 

Shi qinglan could not be bothered with these strange views. She lowered her eyes and 
fiddled with her phone lazily. As usual, she entered the code to enter the SVIP system 
of the pure world Pavilion. 

The conversation window popped up again. brother, Shi Qingyun has posted a reward 
on the White list again. He still wants to take S’s order. He wants you to help him find 
out everything about Shi qinglan. 

Shi qinglan hesitantly replied, “? 

Her brows furrowed slightly as her fingers rapped on the table, not understanding what 
Shi qingqiao was trying to do. 

 


