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C1017 Trace 

As the car pulled away, they began to race toward the harbor. 

Long Yun had been actively contacting the nation, and Security Team were also 
carefully investigating which ships were leaving this port. 

It was a pity that Wu Group Corporation didn't have any direct trade with Britain right 
now. Otherwise, they might have been able to use their own ships to carry Wu Tian and 
the others away. 

After tossing and turning for a long time, Long Yun finally received good news. 

"President Wu, there's a ship leaving the port. We've been coordinating with him and 
told him to wait for us for half an hour." 

Of course, having a ship leave was for the best, so Wu Tian wasn't worried. 

"Great, whose ship is it?" If they could return successfully, Wu Tian hoped that he could 
personally pay a visit to express his gratitude. After all, if it wasn't for this ship, they 
might not have a good future. 

"This is the ship of Time Company, Cui Yongji and we are in the middle of coordinating 
this matter." 

Long Yun slowly said. Although Wu Tian was surprised by this result, this Time 
Company was still one of his allies. 

If it was someone else's company, Wu Tian would be worried about himself, and maybe 
something would leak out. 

"That's great, but it looks like I'll have to owe him a favor this time." Wu Tian let out a 
sigh of relief. For a big boss like them, favors were more important than money, but he 
couldn't care less right now. 

As long as he could escape from England and return to China, Wu Tian would not have 
to worry. 

His mission this time around could also be considered to be not bad. He had thoroughly 
understood the relationship between the biochemical gene transformation human and 
Brilliant Company, and even clearly understood the underground facilities of this Brilliant 
Company. 



There was also this unexpected gain from the girl who had always been beside Wu 
Tian. One must know that this kind of result was already considered to be over the top. 

"Should I inform the upper echelons …" Long Yun had dealt with most of the matters, 
except for the fact that the military had yet to notify them. 

If he didn't inform them, Wu Tian would have intentionally let him do so. They were in 
the UK, so all communications might have been intercepted. 

Long Yun contacted the domestic company directly. This was not a big deal, so she 
might not be eavesdropped on. 

But if Long Yun went to contact the military directly, that would be hard to say. The 
British secret service must not be a fool. Furthermore, Tieh Jun and the others were far 
away in the country, so they wouldn't be able to provide any help to Wu Tian. In fact, 
they might even put them in danger. 

As the car drove on steadily, Wu Ting and the others could feel the commotion outside. 
The mission of the men in black was also very heavy. Perhaps the higher-ups issued a 
death order, requesting them to find Wu Tian and the others as soon as possible. 

Strangely, the other party had been looking for three people, as if they didn't know 
anything about the girl. 

Wu Tian was a bit confused, but at this moment, he also didn't understand why. 

"We're almost there!" At this moment, the manager of the clothing store shouted 
towards the back as he drove. They could already see the harbor in front of them. 

However, not long after he said that, a few cars caught up and drove to the front of the 
truck. 

He stopped the manager of this clothing store. 

"Stop, get off!" 

The man in black took out his gun and pointed it at the manager of the clothing store. 
He was so shocked that he immediately stepped on the brakes. 

Wu Tian and the others, who were behind them, immediately realized that the situation 
wasn't good. However, since this place was so small, there was no way for them to hide 
in the space behind it. 

All of them held their breaths, feeling anxious as they tried to detect any movement in 
the conversation outside. 



"What do you do? Have you seen these three people? " 

As the man in black said, he put away his gun and took out a photo. It was probably a 
portrait of Wu Tian and the other two. 

"No, no. I'm just going to the port to pick up the goods. I'm the manager of the clothing 
store." This manager's mouth was quite tight. He didn't tell Wu Tian and the others out 
just because the man in black had a gun. 

"Is that so?" The man in black was skeptical. He looked at the truck and walked around 
it. The manager of the clothing store followed closely behind. He was starting to get 
nervous and his palms were drenched in sweat. 

On the surface, he still pretended to be very calm. It really wasn't something that an 
ordinary person could do. 

"Open your car and take a look." The manager was relieved when he saw that they 
were about to leave. He didn't expect them to suddenly turn around and say that they 
wanted to check their goods. 

The clothing store manager quickly shook his head, "That won't do, this is our 
company's secret, it's the latest model. If you guys were to see it, wouldn't it be 
troublesome …" 

"Why are you blabbering so much, I'm asking you if you can open it!" The man in black 
was also very aggressive. He didn't think that the manager of the clothing store would 
dare to go against him. 

"No, no, I'm just a manager. If the boss finds out, he'll fire me. You shouldn't make 
things difficult for me like this." 

The clothing store manager was so anxious that he was on the verge of tears. Looking 
at his appearance, it did not seem like he was faking it. 

It was also at this time that Azure Dragon accidentally touched something in the coach 
due to his nervousness and made a sound. 

The men in black had already started to relax their vigilance when they suddenly heard 
the noise and immediately raised their pistols. 

This time, no matter what the manager said, he would probably open the trunk and see 
what was going on inside. 

"Open!" 



The manager had no other choice but to take out his key. He was already starting to 
imagine, when I heard that a few of them had been found out, would they have died 
under those random bullets? And what sort of fate would he have to accept? 

As the car door was opened, the sunlight shone in. A few men in black came over to 
take a look, then left as if nothing had happened. 

Inside, Wu Tian and the other clothing store managers widened their eyes as they 
couldn't believe the reality in front of their eyes. 

They had clearly been exposed, but why did it seem like no one saw them? 

"Alright, you can leave now!" The man in black raised the pistol in his hand. Without 
looking back, he returned to his car and drove away. 

Leaving the manager of the clothing store, Wu Tian and the others in a mess on the 
street. 
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C1018 A Man in Black Who Couldn't Get Rid of Him 

Until the car drove into the port, Wu Tian and the others still didn't understand what 
happened. 

What happened just now? Were their disguises too good? 

"Sir, you have arrived. I will pretend that I have never seen what happened before." The 
clothing store manager nodded his head seriously. No matter what, although he had 
made a lot of money, he still had to do something no matter what. 

He was a pure businessman on this point. 

"Thank you!" Wu Tian came back to his senses and quickly thanked him. The four of 
them stood on the dock and looked around. There was a huge cargo ship in the 
distance that was preparing to leave this port. 

The manager of the clothing store drove away as if nothing had happened, while Wu 
Tian and the others also prepared to leave the place. 

Loong Yun had contacted the captain of the cargo ship, and saw several people waiting 
for them from afar. 

"Hurry, we're about to leave!" 



The captain and the crew stood by the side of the ship and put down a rope ladder. At 
this moment, the boat started to rumble and the engine began to start. 

Wu Tian and the others quickly ran. At the last moment, they grabbed the rope ladder 
and boarded the ship. 

After reaching the deck, Wu Tian and the others let out a sigh of relief. With the 
exception of the little girl, the three of them sat on the deck and let out a sigh of relief. 

To be honest, these guys almost thought they were done for. 

"Mr Wu, I'm really sorry. Come over quickly." 

The captain brought a group of people over to greet Wu Tian. They only knew that he 
was a senior management officer of Wu Group company, but they didn't know who 
exactly he was. 

"Mm, hello, hello. This time, I really must thank all of you. " 

Wu Tian scratched his head. Looking at this captain, he didn't seem to be a bad person. 
He should be someone that Time Company sent to England to purchase goods. 

"What are you talking about? Our two companies are partners, aren't we supposed to 
do these things?" 

The captain did quite well in this aspect, Wu Tian was impressed. 

"Captain, how long do we need to go back?" 

Loong Yun did not have the time to argue with them about the family's affairs. What she 
cared about the most was when they would be able to escape this place. 

Returning to the China was the safest option for them. Although they had boarded the 
ship, they were still in the British waters. 

"If I'm fast, it'll take me two to three days. However, the situation at the sea isn't very 
good these two days. It might be delayed for a day or two even if the weather is bad." 

The captain told him the truth. There was no need to hide such things. 

When Wu Tian heard this, he immediately frowned. If they were to delay it for so long, it 
would be bad for them. 

"Thank you. By the way, there's something I hope you can help us with. Can you help 
us find a few rooms to hide in?" 



Wu Tian nodded and pulled the captain to him. 

Of course, this was not a big deal for the captain as the space on this cargo ship was 
too big and there were many rooms. 

It wasn't difficult for him to give Wu Tian one or two rooms. 

"No problem, we are brothers. Your business is my business." 

The captain quickly arranged for this to go down and entertain Wu Tian and the others. 

However, it would be a huge mistake if they thought that just because they were on a 
boat, they would be able to get everything done. The group of men in black quickly 
extended their hands to the surface of the sea. 

It seemed like they weren't idiots. They searched the ground for a long time but couldn't 
find a single hair. Then, they started to suspect if Wu Tian and the others had already 
left the land. 

They had already sent people to block the airport from the very beginning, so it was 
impossible for Wu Tian and the others to go to the airport. The only viable way left was 
to escape by sea. 

Thus, very soon, a few fast boats appeared on the surface of the sea. They were 
constantly heading towards their cargo ship. 

The captain was somewhat puzzled, because he had never seen such a scene before. 

"What is this …" 

After looking through the telescope for a long time, the captain still couldn't figure it out, 
but when he thought back to Wu Tian and the others' appearances, he immediately 
realized that it probably had nothing to do with him. 

Thus, he quickly informed Wu Tian about the news and told them to hide. 

Very soon, the black-clothed man's leg reached the side of the ship. They used a rope 
to quickly climb onto the cargo ship. 

The captain originally wanted to rush over and berate them, but he didn't expect that 
these men in black would actually take out their guns and stop them. 

"Let me ask you a few questions! Have you ever seen three people! Two men and one 
woman! " 

The man in black took out the photo and interrogated the captain. 



"I've never seen this before, I'm the captain. I'm busy with many things, how would I 
have the time to look at such a mess?" 

The captain spoke with confidence, the truth was indeed like this. It was just that Wu 
Tian and the others specifically greeted them, otherwise the captain wouldn't have 
personally gone to receive them. 

The man in black frowned. They had gone through great difficulty to catch up with the 
cargo ship, and if there was no result, then it would be hard for them to report back. 

"If you say no, then no? Then I shall ask your crew! " 

The man in black rolled his eyes and immediately thought of a new method. 

He walked around the captain and went straight to the sailors on the ship. 

"Have you seen these three?" 

Many sailors shook their heads. They had been busy inside the warehouse all this time, 
so they had not seen it. 

The captain looked at his sailors and let out a long breath. 

However, he never expected that the man in black would not be able to get anything out 
of them, so he vented his anger on these sailors. 

The sailors didn't dare to fight back because of the guns in their hands. The man in 
black attacked as soon as he moved, and the deck was filled with the sound of wailing. 

Many sailors were wounded and bleeding profusely, but no one let go of their teeth to 
reveal the real secret. 

Wu Tian and the rest hid in the cabin, watching everything that happened outside. 

They hadn't thought that these people would fight to this extent just to protect 
themselves. 

"I have truly let you down …" 

Wu Tian didn't know what to say anymore. To be honest, he felt that he did something 
wrong this time and shouldn't be so reckless. 

Fortunately, these men in black clothing couldn't get anything out of the ship, so they 
could only give up and leave the ship one by one. However, these people were too 
mischievous, actually polluting the drinking water on the ship before they left. 
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C1019 Naval Vessel 

Without drinking water, the people on this boat would only be able to drift for two days 
before they had to return. 

However, this amount of time was far from enough for them to reach the destination for 
Korea. 

And in the middle was the vast sea, there were very few islands that they could dock 
and resupply. 

Looking at the results, the captain's face could be said to be filled with frustration. The 
entire ship was under his command, so he was naturally the one with the most 
responsibility. 

After such a huge incident had occurred, the company would definitely criticize him 
harshly if he were to return. 

Although this was the price he paid to help Wu Tian, the captain didn't know if the 
company would understand him like this. 

Seeing the medical staff on the deck running back and forth, Wu Tian and the others 
couldn't sit still anymore. They all walked out of the cabin and helped out together. 

Wu Tian walked to the captain's side and patted his shoulder. 

"Thank you so much, I really don't know how to thank you." 

The captain gave a wry smile, sighed softly but said nothing. 

After all, that was their own choice. However, they did not disappoint their expectations, 
and they still kept it a secret. 

"It's nothing, that's what we should do. However … I'm afraid there's going to be some 
change... The water on our ship is contaminated. Perhaps after a day, I will choose to 
return … " 

The captain was also helpless. Without water, there was no way for them to live. 
Furthermore, when they left the ship, they even contaminated the water production 
equipment on the ship. 

Although they could still use some methods to dilute the seawater, it was too little and 
simply could not satisfy their needs. 



"How could something like this happen …" 

Wu Tian frowned. As expected, these men in black were not easy to deal with. 

However, since the captain was in trouble, he should think of a way to help him. Wu 
Tian quickly found Loong Yun and told her to arrange for people to come over for 
supplies. 

If they were to return to the shore, then Wu Tian and the others would have wasted their 
time. 

"Don't worry, I'll arrange the plane right now!" 

Although the weather wasn't very good right now, Loong Yun felt that she had no other 
choice. 

Wu Group companies didn't have their own exclusive aircraft, because they normally 
didn't need to transport things like this. 

It was a good thing that Wu Group Corporation's reputation was out in the open. It was 
very easy to borrow seaplanes from other enterprises. 

Someone loaded a large amount of fresh water and then quickly flew towards them. 

"Captain, you don't have to worry, I've already arranged for people to come and save 
us." 

After receiving Loong Yun's affirmation, Wu Tian went to comfort the captain. This was 
the best they could do now. 

"If there's really fresh water, I'm not going back!" 

The captain was also very excited, because it was very important for him to return home 
on time. If he delayed it by one more day, it would be a huge loss for the company. 

"Rest assured, I will definitely do this!" 

Wu Tian still patted his chest with certainty. The speed of the plane was much faster 
than that of the cruise ship. The cargo ship needed to travel for a few days, but the 
plane would only need a few hours. 

Sure enough, after half a day, a seaplane really did appear in the horizon. He shakily 
rushed out of the clouds, and not far away were dense dark clouds. 

It looked like the storm the captain had mentioned was about to arrive, and the bad 
weather would become their first obstacle. 



"Coming, coming, really coming!" 

The pilot of the seaplane, with great skill, maneuvered the plane to land near the cruise 
ship, and then quickly approached the cruise ship. 

They first brought the few tons of water they had on the plane to the cruise ship. 
Although it was only two or three tons, it was still temporarily enough to meet their 
needs. 

As long as he could survive for a few days, that was enough. 

After receiving the water, the captain's mood immediately became a lot better. He 
excitedly came to report this situation to Wu Tian, at the same time expressing his 
gratitude. 

However, Wu Tian wasn't as optimistic as him, because there wasn't much water this 
time. 

"I had booked this water transport plane without stopping, but now that there's a storm, 
what should I do …" 

The captain chuckled. This storm was both a challenge and an opportunity for them. 

"You don't know that. It is raining, so we can collect all of the rain. They are fresh water, 
so after heating it up, we can use it." 

Hearing what the captain said, Wu Tian was suddenly enlightened. Why didn't he think 
of this before? 

It seemed that the experience gained by the captain after so many years of trekking on 
the surface of the sea was not just for show. 

"With your words, I'm relieved!" 

Wu Tian and the captain were talking and laughing. At this moment, the sailor who was 
in charge of watching from the bow suddenly ran over with a flustered look on his face. 

"Captain, something is wrong. Several boats are coming towards us from behind. They 
are speedboats!" 

The sailors were flustered, and it was obvious that the black clothed men had given 
them quite the psychological trauma. 

"Another speedboat?" 

The captain was also stunned, his first reaction was also to see the black-clothed men. 



Before they could speak, the ship's radio suddenly remembered. 

"Yanping Mountain, we are the British Navy, we want you to stop moving immediately 
and accept our inspection!" 

"…" 

This kind of notification went on three times. The captain and Wu Tian looked at each 
other in dismay. No one expected that they would actually provoke the navy … 

"Are you sure you didn't see wrong? Is it really just a speedboat?" 

The captain looked at the sailor in disbelief. He started to mutter under his breath as he 
heard the captain's words. 

"I'll go back and take another look at this …" 

The sailor hurried out again, and this time the captain followed him. 

They looked outside a few times, and only then could they see that there really was a 
warship not far behind the speedboat. 

This was going to be troublesome. Although they could deal with the man in black, he 
wasn't a proper organization after all. Using a gun to threaten them was still considered 
a crime. 

However, this was a warship, a proper British navy. If they said they wanted to intercept 
this freighter, they would definitely succeed. 

If they were unwilling to listen, the enemy would aim their cannons at them, and their 
entire ship would die. 

Wu Tian started to get nervous after hearing the news. 
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C1020 Storm Attack 

Wu Tian started to get nervous after hearing the news. 

Before this, he had been able to think of other ways to deal with it, but now that the 
army had come over to obstruct them … 

Not to mention Wu Tian, even if he was the richest man in the world, so what … 



By this time, the captain was already sweating profusely. If they had broken any law in 
the face of the army, none of them would have been able to escape. 

"Mr Wu, what do we do now?" 

His voice was already trembling, and it was obvious that he was extremely afraid. 

It began to rain, and the rain made a noise on the deck. 

Not far away, the dark clouds had already slowly covered the sky. Lightning would 
occasionally flash within the clouds. 

The storm was coming. 

"Let's go in and hide first … If they want to conduct a search, just let them come! " 

Wu Tian gritted his teeth. No matter what, he couldn't kill everyone on this ship. At 
worst, he could just jump into the sea and wait for them to leave before coming back up. 

"How about this, I'll find a box and a bucket for you. If that doesn't work, you can just 
hide in here for now …" 

The captain's thoughts were similar to Wu Tian's. In any case, he had no choice but to 
do so in case. 

Soon enough, the warship caught up with them. The giant searchlight was constantly 
shining back and forth at the ship. The captain quickly ran to the side of the ship and 
stopped the entire ship. 

The sailors stood with the captain on the deck, then raised their hands to show they 
were unarmed. 

The storm was getting stronger and stronger. The wind was getting stronger and 
stronger. It was so strong that no one could stand on the deck. 

The rain quickly soaked their clothes and they could no longer see clearly. 

Although this freighter was huge, it was just a drop in the ocean. 

Wu Tian and the others had already reached the bottom of the warehouse. There was a 
small cabin door nearby, and it was very close to the Redwater Line. If there was any 
problem, they could jump into the sea from there. 

As of now, the outside light was very dim. The dark clouds had completely covered the 
area as if it was night. If no one was paying attention, then no one would be able to see 
what was happening over there. 



Soon, a few small boats were dispatched from the warship, and they boarded the 
freighter with ease. These Navy soldiers were really worthy of being able to roam the 
sea all year round, and although the freighter was swaying back and forth, they were 
still able to move as if they were walking on flat land. 

"You are the captain?" Several soldiers ran to the captain, looking at him with serious 
expressions. 

The captain nodded as he faced the guns in front of him. 

"That's right, that's right …" 

"We have received orders from our superior to inspect your ship!" 

The soldier took out a document, showed it to the captain, and then rolled it up. 

No one knew whether this document was real or fake, and the captain didn't dare to 
inquire too much. After all, his life was more important, if he were to ask, he might even 
lose his life. 

"I'll cooperate." 

This was completely different from facing those black-clothed men. These soldiers were 
armed to the teeth, and there was no way they could defeat them. 

Soon, the soldiers began their investigation of the entire ship. 

There were more than a dozen of them, but this cargo ship had over a hundred 
thousand tons. 

The interior of the ship was extremely large and was filled with goods. 

It was almost impossible for them to investigate all of this in just ten days or half a 
month. 

An officer in charge of the investigation was on the deck, making a unified plan. At that 
moment, a soldier ran over and whispered into his ear, "Sir, the storm is getting bigger 
and bigger. If we continue to stay here, there might be a problem." 

"Is it that serious? It's not like we've never experienced a storm before …" 

The officer obviously didn't believe him, but a bolt of lightning struck down right in front 
of them, hitting the deck. The officer was only a few meters away, which almost scared 
him to death. 



Just a moment ago, he was only a little bit off, but now, this military officer was about to 
bid farewell to these people. 

"Sir, it's really dangerous. This is probably a storm that only happens once every ten 
years, let's not waste time here. " 

Hearing this, the military officer was so scared by the lightning that his entire body 
trembled and he nodded repeatedly. 

The power of nature was not something a human could contend with. Even if it was 
equipped to the teeth, even if his body was strong to a certain degree, a single lightning 
strike would still turn him into charcoal. 

"Hmm, inform the people below that if there aren't any big problems, we should hurry up 
and pack up!" 

The officer was too lazy to speak any more nonsense at this time. He panicked and 
prepared to escape, getting on the boat and returning to the warship. 

The nervous group of the captain could be said to have experienced ups and downs as 
they watched the soldiers arrive and leave quickly. 

However, they did not have the chance to experience such happiness afterwards. It was 
because the storm had come and everyone was hiding in the cabin. 

The cargo ship was swaying on the surface of the sea as the waves washed over the 
bulkhead of the cargo ship again and again. 

He pushed the ship from the left to the right, then from the right to the left. 

It was Wu Tian's first time going through such a test. He had been tormented to the 
point where he couldn't even stand properly at the bottom of the cabin. 

Those experienced sailors had already fixed themselves in one place and moved with 
the boat. 

Not only were they laughing and chatting, they could even eat. 

Comparatively, Wu Tian and the other two had vomited who knows how many times. 
When this commotion died down slightly, the three of them were so weak that they 
couldn't even get up. 

Only the little girl remained indifferent, as if the whole thing had nothing to do with him. 
From the beginning to the end, she didn't feel any faint. 



Wu Tian looked at the little girl. At this moment, he suddenly felt envious from the 
bottom of his heart. 

"If only we could be like him. You see, she's perfectly fine. " 

Loong Yun and Azure Dragon couldn't help but nod as they followed Wu Tian's gaze. 

This was because this little girl was not only happily eating, she was even alive and 
kicking. 

"President Wu, how did you find this guy? Who exactly is she?" 

Loong Yun had wanted to ask this question for a long time, but she hadn't had a 
chance. Now that they didn't have any more obstacles, she was able to ask this 
question. 

 


