
Hidden Billionaire Chapter 1051 - Complex Situation  

C1051 Complex Situation 

Wu Tian didn't know why not, but he just didn't like loans. 

If he could, he would rather narrow down the scope of his business than let himself owe 
others money. 

Back then, in order to save the Wu Group company, Wu Tian and the Nanhe Securities 
Corporation had to be pawned. 

Even though he had spent billions of dollars, Wu Tian was worried for a long time. He 
was afraid that he would not be able to pay up to that amount. 

Everything Wu Tian had now, strictly speaking, wasn't something he started from 
nothing. 

Therefore, Wu Tian was very afraid that if he did not have the money and Wu Group 
company, would he be able to return to that poverty-stricken life of his? 

"Then we can think of a way. Don't worry, I'll go discuss it with someone else and see if 
I can get more movies onto our website." 

This was all Huang Lan could do now. The key was for Wu Tian to have confidence in 
himself. 

As soon as Huang Lan left, Wu Zaiyao came in from the other side. This time, she 
brought a summary of the public opinion on the internet. 

The situation was both good and bad for Wu Tian. It was really hard for people to see 
what would happen next. 

"President Wu, take a look." 

Wu Zaiyao would bring something like this every once in a while, as it would allow Wu 
Tian to make an accurate judgment of the current market. 

"Half of them are cursing us, while the other half are praising me?" 

When Wu Tian saw this result, he couldn't believe it. He originally thought that he would 
be scolded miserably by others for doing this. 

"We are indeed like that. Right now, we are almost half right." 



Wu Zaiyao nodded affirmatively and said, "Our way of doing this is not against the law, 
and according to the theory, it's also a basic principle that good works have to be paid 
for." 

From this point of view, the web circle which was itself their China was far behind them. 

"So I did a good thing?" 

Hearing this, Wu Tian also slowly started to have confidence in himself. Half of them 
were willing to believe that they could naturally make Seafood TV's data gradually 
recover. 

"But you still need to pay attention to this. Those people who are scolding us, are 
basically all people with Yingdi Entertainment." 

After Wu Zaiyao's reminder, Wu Tian took a look at some of the more conspicuous 
articles and found that the authors of this article were indeed all proxies of Lee Zhan. 

The opponent obviously used this method to frame Wu Tian and frame them. 

"We seem to have touched their cake …" 

"Serves him right. Why can't we touch their cake?" 

Wu Tian laughed coldly at this moment. When he thought about it carefully, it seemed to 
be true. 

His introduction of these high-quality film resources from abroad had a huge impact on 
the traditional entertainment industry in and of itself. 

Today, he even started to pay a fee to watch copyrighted movies and TV dramas on the 
internet. One had to know, this was originally a piece of good news for the 
entertainment industry. 

However, to Lee Zhan, that might not be good news. 

His company had always made money by making cheap, low-quality movies and TV 
dramas. 

This kind of money was like a pie falling from the sky. It didn't require much effort to 
earn a large sum. 

If a new force like Wu Tian were to enter, it would easily have a huge impact on the 
circle. 



If any director or author saw Wu Tian and the others, it would bring them a better 
income and they would naturally leave Lee Zhan. 

At that time, the resources and circle Lee Zhan relied on would have no meaning. 

It was no wonder that he would be so flustered and exasperated at this time. 

"Wu Zaiyao, quickly post a few essays and don't attack them directly. If you're going to 
mock them from the side, the most important thing is to recruit a group of directors or 
actors. Then, we'll set up a new film and television company and use foreign technology 
to make movies and TV dramas." 

It didn't matter whether this matter would continue or not, Wu Tian would definitely take 
part in the filming. As long as this news was leaked, people would definitely pay 
attention to it. 

At that time, those who didn't have a good time with Lee Zhan might feel that Wu Tian 
could be their next choice. 

Besides, movies that were previously so crudely made were becoming more and more 
unpopular. The audience's standards were also constantly rising. If they continued to 
provide those crudely made works, gradually no one would buy them anymore. 

This time around, Wu Tian had made the right bet. Not even two days had passed since 
Wu Zaiyao had sent out the written draft, and the number of visitors to Seafood TV and 
the number of people on it had risen exponentially. 

The number of people paying to watch also increased rapidly. 

Gradually, no one went to the movie theater anymore. Even the television station's 
broadcasting capacity had fallen by a lot. 

Under Wu Tian's guidance, the Kaleidoscope and the Seafood TV were linked. Through 
the Kaleidoscope, one could directly experience a movie using brainwaves. This kind of 
feeling was more exciting than any movie theater. 

The appearance of this new technology had ignited the entire country's internet in an 
instant, and everyone on the streets was discussing about this mode of viewing the 
future. 

The sales of the Kaleidoscope that was initially stuck in a stagnation, suddenly 
increased dramatically. 

In the past, the people who bought Kaleidoscope only used it to play games. But now, 
they developed the function of watching movies, which instantly expanded the 
audience's population by countless times. 



The sudden reversal of the situation made Wu Tian extremely happy. However, what he 
didn't expect was that he was actually overjoyed. 

On the morning of the new day, Wu Tian got up early and prepared for the day's work. 

But at this moment, he realized that there was not a single person in the company … 

Once they heard the news, they found out that everyone was stuck at the bridge over 
the island where Flower Island was located. 

The reason was that a group of people were currently demonstrating, blocking the 
entrance to prevent employees from going to work. 

Wu Tian quickly called Loong Yun, and the Security Team staff also quickly drove over. 

When he arrived at the scene, he saw that the scale was indeed not small. 

There were more than 500 people blocking the entrance, not to mention the 
demonstrators who were making a ruckus elsewhere. 

"What's going on?" 

Wu Tian looked at Su Cancan beside him with a puzzled expression. 

Why did so many people suddenly appear? But they didn't react at all. 

"They arrived an hour ago and were taken down by several buses. They immediately 
came to block us at the entrance." 

Su Cancan was also helpless, which made it impossible for him to have any time to 
react. 

Just by looking at these people, he could tell that they were very experienced. 
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In the past, there had been a demonstration in this place. 

It was just that that that time, Chang Zairong had hired someone to put on airs, and they 
were scared off by Wu Tian. 

However, these people were not the least bit professional in comparison. They all 
looked like thugs and old thugs with just their gestures. 



Furthermore, they did not listen to anything and were not afraid of threats like the police. 
For this reason, the Security Team Guests guarding this place had thought of all sorts of 
methods. 

"I say, what's the use of all this? I'll just directly blow out the smoke, and they'll all have 
to scram." Seeing this, Su Cancan became confused. Her people were mixed up with 
the people who were protesting, and there was no way to separate them out. 

With her way of doing things, she was just going to be a bit more violent and give them 
a taste of her power. 

"Don't, please don't, once this poison mist is out, everyone here will die." 

Wu Tian quickly stopped Su Cancan. If she really made a move, it wouldn't just be a 
simple demonstration but a terrorist attack. 

"It's okay, I have a recipe that won't kill you. It's just that it will make people feel pain. 
Usually, the poisoned people won't die." Su Cancan wasn't joking this time. She was 
truly considering this question. 

Seeing that, Wu Tian quickly pulled her down, preventing her from leaning too far 
forward. 

What if she really attacked? Wu Tian couldn't afford the consequences. Even the entire 
Wu Group company would have to pay for it. 

"You don't have to worry about that. I'll take care of the rest." Wu Tian had no choice but 
to let Su Cancan go back first while he dealt with this matter himself. 

Needless to say, these mob people in front of him were also hired. It was just that they 
were a bit more professional. 

"President Wu, I say, why don't you let Yin Rumeng's men come over. These people 
definitely won't dare to act rashly in the face of a real underground power!" Azure 
Dragon felt that sometimes it was necessary to use violence to suppress violence. 

"No, I can't make it in time." 

It was already morning, so he couldn't ask Yin Rumeng's men to come in public. The 
police weren't blind either. Moreover, there were many reporters who were recording 
and broadcasting live. If they did anything extreme, they would be immediately 
magnified, and the whole country would be misled into thinking that Wu Tian and the 
others were bad people. 



"We can't not start work here. How about this, Azure Dragon, organize a few people and 
take out the explosion-proof shield to create a gap for me. Although they have a lot of 
people, we have a lot of people as well!" 

Wu Tian couldn't do anything about the deadlock. It was a big deal that his people 
couldn't come to work. 

When necessary, he wanted to use a slightly more forceful method. This was something 
that he had no other choice. 

"Yes!" Azure Dragon replied. He immediately turned around and called for people to 
prepare to move out, all the Security Team practitioners were wearing white uniforms, 
like a white torrent. They raised their shields to form a wall and started pushing towards 
the crowd of demonstrators step by step. 

Sure enough, the other party started to move after seeing this. They all ran to the 
nearby area to pick up a lot of stones and similar things, and threw them towards the 
Security Team Practitioners. 

At the same time, the group of thugs in front of them started to crowd towards the Shield 
Wall. They had no intention of retreating. 

Because they could not make a move, this time the Security Team users placed the 
huge shield in front of them. This shield was two meters tall from top to bottom, so 
blocking people would not be a problem. When it was pushed out, it almost became a 
moving wall. 

However, there were quite a few people in front who started to crowd towards this 
place. The two sides clashed into each other like a battling army. 

The walls of the Security Team did not move at all, they were completely unmoved. The 
frontmost member was dressed in a exoskeleton Battle Mecha. They were extremely 
powerful and could push more than a dozen people backwards by themselves. 

Due to the absolute difference in strength, very soon, the Flower Island entrance that 
everyone was surrounding with was forcefully pushed open at this moment. 

"Quick, quickly enter!" Azure Dragon saw that the opportunity had come, and quickly 
shouted at the employees of Flower Island. For a moment, the entire place was in 
chaos. 

Wu Tian heaved a sigh of relief. At least his own employees had arrived at Flower 
Island. 

As long as the employees were on the island, there was no point in pestering them. 
They wouldn't be able to get in anyway. 



"Azure Dragon, you just stay here and watch. If there's nothing important, it's best if you 
don't have any conflicts with them." 

After Wu Tian gave his instructions, he turned around and prepared to leave. 

Just as he turned around, a loud sound came from behind him. Wu Tian turned his head 
and saw that the shield wall behind him had suddenly shattered, and the crowd had 
broken out from the obstruction of the Security Team. 

Moreover, these thugs had gotten some Molotov cocktails out of nowhere and were now 
throwing them towards the bridge over the island. 

Although these flaming bottles looked small, their power wasn't weak at all. The entire 
passage was instantly filled with a sea of flames and the shield wall formed by the 
Security Team members had no choice but to collapse at this moment. 

Although Azure Dragon was shouting, he still couldn't contain the situation. Seeing that 
these people were about to reach the bridge, Wu Tian also had no choice but to get up 
and rushed over in a few steps. 

He kicked a thug in the face, sending him flying. The crisp sound of breaking bones 
could be heard from his chest. 

"All of you, get down!" Wu Tian yelled and picked up an iron rod from the side and 
guarded the bridge deck by himself. He waved the stick back and forth, preventing the 
thugs from getting close. 

"Quick, protect President Wu!" Azure Dragon saw that Wu Tian was surrounded by 
more than a dozen people and immediately became extremely anxious. He ran over 
immediately and wanted to rescue Wu Tian. 

The Security Team s quickly gathered around him, a few of them mustered up all their 
strength and rushed towards Wu Tian. They were carrying so much equipment, like a 
tank. 

They just directly destroyed those ten over people. 

Although they had broken through the shield wall of the Security Team practitioners 
from before, they were still unable to climb onto the bridge. 

These people wanted to reach the island from this place and cause even more damage, 
but this was obviously impossible. 

At this moment, the siren of the police also sounded out. These thugs were well-trained, 
and they immediately scattered in all directions. 



As Wu Tian looked at the devastation, especially the stones that were scattered all over 
the ground, he sat down on the ground and couldn't say a word for a long time. 
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For a moment, the shore seemed to be playing Eagle Catch the Chicken, and the police 
were making arrests everywhere. 

Wu Tian finally felt relieved, but he didn't relax at all. 

This was because the television stations nearby were still continuously filming the film. 
Without even thinking, one could already tell that these people would definitely come up 
with a bunch of false accusations. 

However, since what had happened had already happened, there was no point in Wu 
Tian thinking about it any longer. 

"What the hell did you guys do? How did you suddenly become like this?" Sunn 
Hongsheng walked over with a puzzled expression. His underlings were already in the 
process of being arrested, so he might as well go and find Wu Tian to understand the 
situation. 

"How would I know? Suddenly, so many people came running over. I feel like they're all 
sick …" Wu Tian's tone was very depressed. This was quite understandable. After all, 
nobody would have thought that such a thing would happen. 

"Sigh, I've met these people before. They're not easy to deal with. It seems like you've 
offended someone." Sunn Hongsheng already had some idea of what was going on 
after just a few glances. 

These people were all professionals and there wasn't much of a difference between 
them and the underground powers. It was just that their names were different. 

"Don't mention it …" Wu Tian also wanted to complain, but the situation at the scene 
was a bit chaotic and wasn't a good place to talk. 

Just as he was about to call Sunn Hongsheng over to talk about Flower Island, a few 
officers ran over nervously and whispered something into Sunn Hongsheng's ears. 

Sunn Hongsheng's expression immediately changed. It was obvious that he was a bit 
nervous. 

"President Wu, you can't leave now!" Sunn Hongsheng quickly stopped Wu Tian. 



Azure Dragon felt something was wrong at this moment, so he quietly stood in front of 
Wu Tian. If anything was wrong, he could immediately protect Wu Tian's safety. 

"What's wrong?" 

Wu Tian signaled Azure Dragon not to get agitated first. It would be better to wait for 
this guy to finish his words first. 

"The wounded at the scene accused you of intentionally harming others, so you must 
come with us to the police station!" Sunn Hongsheng was doing business, of course, he 
could understand that this matter actually had nothing to do with Wu Tian. 

However, if the other party said that he had broken his bones, then it was Wu Tian who 
did it. This was indeed a suspicion of intentionally harming others, so Sunn Hongsheng 
couldn't let Wu Tian leave just like that. 

"Let's see who dares!" At this moment, Azure Dragon was standing in front of Wu Tian 
in annoyance. He wasn't joking when he said this. 

Azure Dragon said as he rolled up his sleeves. He used this method to express that he 
was serious now. The policemen originally wanted to take Wu Tian away, but seeing 
this, they didn't dare to go up. 

Seeing this, Wu Tian quickly pulled Azure Dragon behind him. This guy was simply too 
ferocious, and could easily cause trouble. 

"Officer Sun, since you need my cooperation, of course I'll listen to you!" With that, Wu 
Tian walked towards Sunn Hongsheng and the others. 

Azure Dragon wanted to follow along, but he was glared at by Wu Tian. 

"You have to stay here. I'll make a trip to the Police Station and I'll be back very soon. 
Officer Sun is following the rules and won't make things difficult for me." 

"But …" Azure Dragon felt that as Wu Tian's subordinate, he had completely failed and 
let him into the trap. 

Wu Tian looked very calm at that time, as if he wasn't too emotional about this. 

"This place needs someone to guard it for me. I don't want to see the Flower Island 
become like this when I return!" Wu Tian looked at Azure Dragon, who was still 
hesitating. He also started to become serious. 

Azure Dragon saw that Wu Tian was serious, so he didn't say anything else. In the end, 
he nodded and stayed where he was. 



Wu Tian then walked in front of Sunn Hongsheng, ready to follow him. 

The policeman on the side pulled out the handcuffs with a "ka la" sound, and Sunn 
Hongsheng hit him hard on the back of his head. 

"This is President Wu, what are you thinking about!" 

The little policeman didn't know that the houses in the police station were all given to 
them by Wu Tian. He deserved to be beaten. 

Sunn Hongsheng courteously invited Wu Tian into his car. This was probably the 
biggest suspect in their police department. 

Of course, Sunn Hongsheng wouldn't be too lenient towards those people who were 
causing trouble. He captured all of them, and there were a total of three carts of people. 

Basically, not a single one of the stubborn ones or the leader of the group ran away. 

But it was common for them to go to the police station, so no one was afraid. 

Even when Wu Tian arrived at the police station, he wasn't detained. On the contrary, 
other than walking out of the Police Station, no one else cared about where he wanted 
to go. 

However, Wu Tian didn't have much time to dawdle here. He still had a lot of important 
things to do. 

"How's the interrogation going over there? When can I leave?" 

Sunn Hongsheng said helplessly, "President Wu, I'm afraid you won't be able to leave in 
a short time. That person is currently undergoing emergency treatment, but fortunately, 
his life is not in danger. Otherwise, you might face a lawsuit." 

Wu Tian didn't expect the situation to be this serious. He did kick a guy, but wasn't this 
supposed to be a form of self-defense? 

"You should have been able to investigate the situation at that time. He attacked me 
and I counterattacked …" 

Sunn Hongsheng could only helplessly reply to Wu Tian's explanation: "It's useless to 
say all these. You'll know after you read the news." 

After Sunn Hongsheng's reminder, Wu Tian turned his head to watch the TV on the 
wall. Sure enough, there were some related matters on the news. 



Wu Tian's conflict seemed to have become the headlines of the entire country. He didn't 
know who it was, so he accurately captured Wu Tian's kick and it was repeated on TV. 

The key point was from that angle, the video did indeed show Wu Tian making the first 
move. 

"No, it can be like this, can it …" Wu Tian was stunned. He immediately realized that he 
was being targeted. 

The enemy was waiting for his chance to make a move. He was waiting for a good 
show, but Wu Tian actually took the bait himself. 

Thinking about this, Wu Tian was so angry that he wanted to slap himself a few times. 

If he had been able to hold it in, then everything would have been fine. He was truly 
bringing suffering upon himself. 

All of a sudden, public opinion was criticizing Wu Tian one-sidedly. 
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C1054 Broken Bridge 

All of a sudden, public opinion was criticizing Wu Tian one-sidedly. 

No one cared about what was going on, and why those people had come to 
demonstrate. 

The pressure from this matter soon reached the police station. 

In this kind of situation, if they just released Wu Tian, public opinion would just drown 
them in saliva. 

Wu Tian was extremely anxious in the police station, but at this moment, Sunn 
Hongsheng not only dared not let Wu Tian go, he even wanted to follow him closely. 

Wherever Wu Tian went, Sunn Hongsheng would go. Although he was still very polite to 
him, the nature of his actions had completely changed. 

Seeing that, Wu Tian knew he wouldn't be able to leave for a while. He directly reached 
out to get his phone. 

"Give me my cell phone. I don't plan to leave now, but I can't delay my company's 
business!" 



Sunn Hongsheng originally wanted to refuse, but when he saw the way Wu Tian looked 
at him, he immediately shivered. After thinking for a while, he decided to follow Wu 
Tian's instructions. 

"I can give you my phone, but you can stop causing trouble for me. Don't worry, what 
relationship do you have with me? I'll definitely help you. Wait for this limelight to pass." 

Sunn Hongsheng didn't forget to praise Wu Tian on the side. He wanted to reassure him 
a little. 

However, it was already too late for him to say anything. Wu Tian just wanted to know 
what his company looked like now. 

He quickly called Loong Yun. When Wu Tian wasn't around, Loong Yun could support 
part of the situation, so the company's operations weren't affected that much. 

"President Wu, there are no major problems on the island now, but there are still a lot of 
people gathered here on the Island Bridge. The number of people is even more than 
before." 

Hearing this, Wu Tian's face immediately darkened. This group of people were really 
like bugs that couldn't be beaten off even if they were chased away. It seems like this 
Lee Zhan and Zhang Zerui are going to give Wu Tian a hard time. 

"You must hold on! You absolutely cannot let them get onto the island!" 

Wu Tian didn't really understand the situation, but he knew that if he couldn't take the 
pressure now, then everything they did before would be in vain. 

"Yes, President Wu, what's going on over there? Do you want me to call the Security 
Team over?" 

"It's fine. I need to delay some time. I will take care of it. Just give me the company." 

With Wu Tian's assurance, Loong Yun didn't ask any further questions. Actually, no one 
would be worried about Wu Tian's ability to handle matters. Since he said that, he would 
definitely do it. 

After hanging up the phone, Loong Yun looked at the situation in front of her and was 
speechless. 

"Azure Dragon, take your people and retreat. Don't confront them anymore!" 

At this time, Azure Dragon was bringing people from Security Team with him, planning 
to guard the entrance and not let these demonstrators block the way. 



However, the results were not very good. The other side continued to throw fireballs and 
rocks at them. From a distance, it looked like a battlefield. 

Meanwhile, the television stations and reporters in the vicinity turned a deaf ear to these 
people, and focused on the people from Security Team who were using violence to film. 

If this continued, Wu Group Corporation's reputation would definitely be ruined. The 
makers of these opinions are the real trouble. 

"That won't do, if this place is blocked, our people won't be able to reach the island!" 
Azure Dragon still didn't want to give up. He had already failed once just now, so he 
didn't want to fail a second time. 

"Listen to my orders, hurry up and come back!" Loong Yun looked at the several buses 
that were approaching in the distance. The number of people demonstrating was 
constantly increasing. 

There was no use in calling the police, the police couldn't do anything to these 
hooligans. 

"But …" Azure Dragon still wanted to persist, but he was scolded a few more times by 
Loong Yun. In the end, he was helpless and could only choose to retreat. 

Seeing that her people had already returned to the bridge, Loong Yun decisively 
ordered the staff to disconnect the floating bridge. 

In this way, the Flower Island and the shore became completely devoid of any direct 
communication channels. Even if the other party was to gather at the shore, it would be 
meaningless. 

Azure Dragon was puzzled by Loong Yun's actions. 

"You broke the pontoon! How can the staff go back!? " 

This was not a small matter, there were close to one or two thousand Flower Island 
employees. 

"It's an emergency. We can't worry about that now." Loong Yun was well aware of what 
was at stake right now. There was nothing she could do about it, even if she had to give 
up some things. 

However, her courage was indeed great. 

At this moment, the gangsters and thugs by the shore were also stunned. They had not 
expected the other party to have such a move. Flower Island had really become an 
island now, and these people definitely could not swim there. 



For a time, the people who had nothing to do on the shore hesitated for a while before a 
large number of them walked away. 

However, there was still a group of people who were specifically watching from the 
shore. They were probably certain that Wu Group company wouldn't not go ashore. 

Loong Yun had also expected the other party's conjectures and quickly transferred over 
a dozen or so barges over. 

The Flower Island had a special port. Without a bridge, one could use a boat to 
transport people to the shore. 

However, the hooligans on the shore probably wouldn't leave for a short period of time, 
and their ships might be obstructed by them. 

After some thought, Loong Yun decided to set up temporary residences with Azure 
Dragon. 

"Can this work?" Azure Dragon was a bit confused. Although the living quarters in 
Flower Island are very complete, they don't have many rooms. 

If there were only a hundred of them, there would not be much of a problem. However, 
there were more than 2000 people here, so the logistics supply was not a small matter. 

"Sure, let's just take it as if we're having a staff assembly. Usually, we haven't 
organized anything related to the event. Let's take advantage of this!" Loong 
Yun's brain was very active, so she quickly thought of a way. 

Needless to say, this method was quite good. Loong Yun even built a small stage near 
the seaside, seemingly to make a concert. 

On the other side, the people on the shore saw that the Flower Island was bustling with 
activity. They looked at each other, unable to speak. 

Seeing that there was nothing suitable for them to shoot, the television station's 
reporters also began to retreat. 

After nightfall, they had finally passed this crisis. 

The Flower Island staff were all happy and bustling with noise and excitement. Wu Tian, 
on the other hand, had a prison meal in the police station. 

 


