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"Hello!" Wu Tian slightly smiled, which could be considered a greeting. 

Lin Tao didn't seem to care. He coldly asked, "I see that you're a little unfamiliar. Which 
school are you from?" 

"Luzhou Polytechnic University." 

"You were originally an industrial university student. You're several grades lower than 
us." Lin Tao curled his lips in disdain. He kept asking, "What are you doing in my 
school?" 

"I'm here …" 

Wu Tian was interrupted by Lin Tao before he could finish, "If you want to woo Lin 
Weiwei, I advise you to give up on this idea. The students of your Polytechnic University 
are not qualified." 

It was obvious that he was interested in Lin Weiwei. It was obvious that he considered 
Wu Tian to be a love rival, which was why his words sounded so bad. 

Lin Weiwei, who was beside him, quickly explained, "President Lin, don't 
misunderstand, Wu Tian is here to attend Professor Fu's lecture." 

"He attended lectures?" 

"Right." 

Lin Tao grinned and said sarcastically, "You want to attend Professor Tao's lecture with 
just a few words?" 

"Right." 

"I say, fellow student, don't you want to see your own strength? You want to participate 
in a lecture with this level of strength?" Lin Tao seemed to have heard the funniest joke 
in the world and a smile could be seen on his face. 

This kind of smile made Wu Tian very unhappy. He asked, "What's wrong with me 
coming to attend Professor Tao's lecture?" 



"Professor Tao is a top student in Jiangnan. Normal people don't have the right to listen 
to his lecture, only special guests have the right." After Lin Tao said this, he took out an 
invitation letter from his pocket and boasted, "Do you know what this is?" 

"Professor Tao's invitation to lecture." 

"That's right, only an invitation letter is qualified to enter, do you have it?" 

"Yes." 

"Keep bragging!" Lin Tao was the president of the Student Council. It took a lot of effort 
for him to obtain this invitation letter through his connections. 

He didn't believe that this kid from another school would be able to get an invitation. 

He raised his head and said in a loud provocative manner, "You said that you have an 
invitation, but you're willing to show it to me." 

"Here." Wu Tian took out his phone and downloaded the electronic invitation from his 
mailbox. 

Upon seeing the invitation letter, Lin Tao was dumbfounded. The smile on his face 
became even uglier than that of a pig's liver. He didn't think that this kid would actually 
be able to take out an invitation letter. 

He took a closer look and was immediately dumbfounded. He couldn't help but exclaim, 
"This is a VIP letter." 

The invitations to Professor Tao's lectures were divided into two categories. One type 
was a normal invitation, and the other was a very good VIP invitation. 

Only those who were particularly powerful and had financial influence could become 
distinguished guests and receive a VIP invitation. 

However, he hadn't thought that the kid in front of him would actually hold a VIP 
invitation, and was several levels above him. 

To think that he was mocking this brat just now. He didn't expect that the invitation letter 
this brat took out was even stronger than his own. 

Suddenly, he felt his entire face burning up, as if someone had slapped him a few times. 
He felt extremely uncomfortable. 

"VIP invitation." Lin Weiwei, who was standing at the side, couldn't help but exclaim. 



She didn't expect Wu Tian to have an invitation letter, and it turned out to be a VIP 
invitation letter. The two words, VIP invitation letter, were particularly eye-catching. 

"According to the information on the face of the ticket, this invitation letter of mine can 
bring someone in. Weiwei, would you like to go in with me?" Wu Tian asked. 

"Alright!" Lin Weiwei nodded vigorously. She naturally wished for such a good 
opportunity to listen to Professor Tao's lecture. 

"Then let's go!" Wu Tian pulled Lin Weiwei's arm and squeezed his way through the 
crowd towards the multimedia center. 

This was the first time Lin Weiwei had been pulled by the arm by a boy. She felt a little 
embarrassed, but she did not withdraw her arm. 

Standing on the spot, Lin Tao stared at the back of the duo as they walked further and 
further away. He was so infuriated by the sight before him that he was on the verge of 
going insane. 

Watching the boy from another school take Lin Weiwei away from him, he could only 
grumble and feel helpless. 

After gnashing his teeth for a long time, he quickly walked towards the two of them. 

The multimedia center was full of people, most of them famous scholars or professors, 
some of them business celebrities. 

Wu Tian brought Lin Weiwei to the front row VIP seats, followed by Lin Tao, who 
coincidentally had his seat behind them. 

Seeing the two of them talking and laughing in front of him, Lin Tao was so angry that 
his ears turned red, thinking about how to embarrass Wu Tian. 

At 4: 30 PM, Professor Tao arrived. 

All the guests stood up one by one to express their respect and love for Professor Tao. 

Even though Professor Tao was in his sixties, he did not look old at all. When he wore 
glasses, he looked like a sage. 

With a smile on his face, he walked to the chairman's seat and waved to the others, 
"Good afternoon everyone. Thank you for attending my lecture. Take a seat!" 

Having said so, he sat down in the chairman's chair, and the guests in the audience 
also took their seats. 



"I've come today to give everyone a talk on a few administrative topics. Time is limited, 
let's start now …" 

After a few simple opening words, Professor Tao went straight to the point and began to 
explain a few of the major topics of economics and management. 

Everyone in the audience listened with rapt attention, fully immersing themselves in the 
lecture, afraid that they would miss out on the highlights. 

Wu Tian was also very serious, it was rare for him to hear such a good lecture, he was 
more attentive than anyone else. 

Professor Tao lectured on three topics consecutively and won continuous applause 
from the audience. Everyone loved Professor Tao's lessons very much. 

After listening to these lessons, Wu Tian benefited greatly. He felt as if his ears had 
been baptized and nurtured. 

The content of Professor Tao's lecture was very little, but it was very exquisite. After 
hearing it, he felt much more full. 

After the lecture, Professor Tao smiled and said, "There is a lot of economics and 
management learning. I will randomly choose two guests to express some different 
opinions." 

When these words came out, the guests below the stage were all inexplicably nervous. 

In this case, everyone wanted to be selected. 

After all, this was a professional lecture, and there were many school leaders and elites 
of all levels present. No matter who it was that came up to express their views, they 
would still have a lot of face. 

Moreover, in such a big occasion, for ordinary students, there was rarely anyone who 
wasn't afraid of being on stage. 

Under the anxious waiting of the crowd, Professor Tao picked a person from the invited 
guests and immediately shouted, "Please come up to the stage and explain to 
everyone." 

Upon hearing this, the others secretly let out a sigh of relief. All eyes fell on Wu Tian as 
they waited for him to explain it to them on the stage. 

On the other hand, Lin Tao, who sat at the back, could not help but secretly gloat. He 
looked at Wu Tian as if he was watching a good show. He wanted to see how this brat 
would lose face. 



Under the watchful eyes of the crowd, Wu Tian slowly stood up and walked towards the 
VIP stage. 

Honestly speaking, he was also very nervous. After all, this was the first time he had 
come to such a big occasion to speak. Without any preparation, anyone would be 
nervous. 

Below the stage, Lin Tao couldn't help but laugh gleefully. 

Seeing that Wu Tian was so nervous, Lin Tao was very happy. He couldn't help but put 
his head close to Lin Weiwei's ear and mocked in a small voice, "Weiwei, do you think 
that brat will be scared to the point he piss his pants?" 

"What's so funny? Even if you were called over, you would still be nervous." Lin Weiwei 
rolled her eyes at Lin Tao. She hated him the most. He only knew how to make fun of 
others. 
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"I just thought it was funny." Lin Tao could not help but gloat, "Weiwei, if this kid can't 
even say a single word, that would be really embarrassing. He's shamed the entire 
Industrial University." 

"Alright, stop talking." Lin Weiwei said. She couldn't be bothered to respond to Lin Tao. 

To be honest, she also broke out in a cold sweat for Wu Tian. 

If Wu Tian was unable to say it out in a moment, or his words were trembling in 
nervousness, wouldn't he become the laughingstock of the entire venue? 

"Let's wait and see a good show!" Seeing how Lin Weiwei was ignoring him, Lin Tao did 
not say anything else. 

All he had to do now was wait for a good show. 

When Wu Tian became nervous and embarrassed, he was going to ruthlessly humiliate 
this brat. 

Under the crowd's gaze, Wu Tian walked up to the podium. When he saw the warm 
smile on Professor Tao's face, all the nervousness in his heart instantly disappeared. 



Recently, he had experienced a lot. He served as the owner of the restaurant, investor 
in Technology Company, and also the live broadcast platform. 

Having contacts with big bosses and big clients had given him a lot of practice. 

Furthermore, he had also read many books. His mental strength was at least a hundred 
times stronger than before. 

Therefore, he was able to calm his heart down and calm his nervous heart. He slightly 
bowed towards Professor Tao and said: "Thank you, Professor Tao, for giving me this 
opportunity." 

Then, he faced the crowd and said in an open manner, "Respected leaders, guests, and 
my dear classmates." 

"Professor Tao is one of my most respected scholars. I have benefited greatly from his 
lessons. Next, I will express some of my insights about Professor Tao's lesson just now. 
If there's anything wrong with it, please forgive me." 

Just a few short sentences, and it was clear that he was capable, powerful, and a 
gentleman. His opening phrase, Zhang Chi, was very forceful and did not have the 
slightest bit of fear. 

Such a perfect opening scene couldn't help but make the guests in the audience look at 
each other in a different light. 

The guests below the stage were originally worried that the student would be nervous 
when he got on the stage, but at this moment, they realized that his performance was 
very good. 

Even Lin Weiwei was shocked by Wu Tian's temperament. 

She didn't expect Wu Tian to be so young, but he had a strong temperament and had a 
bit of the prestige of a leader. 

Lin Tao, who was originally waiting to see a joke, was also dumbfounded. 

He thought that Wu Tian would tremble and be unable to utter a single word due to his 
nervousness. However, it turned out to be the opposite. 

This kid was generous and spoke with a sonorous and forceful tone, showing the 
elegant demeanor of an orator. 

It was really hard to believe that a university student could be so calm on stage without 
any fear towards his superiors and guests. He performed well. 



Under the watchful eyes of the crowd, Wu Tian went straight to the point, "Regarding 
economics and management, this is a proposition worth pondering over." 

Following that, Wu Tian talked about a lot of things. He spoke aloud some of his insights 
and perceptions of economics and management. 

In this period of time, he had read quite a few books on economics and management. 
Combined with the records of the Wu Family and his recent investment, he could 
naturally publish some views that were different from the masses. 

When he spoke, he was full of passion, like a general commanding a great army. Every 
word was filled with emotion. 

Below the stage, Lin Weiwei was completely dumbfounded. 

She stared at Wu Tian dumbly. Listening to Wu Tian's deep understanding of 
economics and management, her heart felt as if it was being slapped by heat waves. 

She had never thought that a young student could talk about economics and 
management in such a mysterious and emotional manner. 

Especially the passionate style of Wu Tian when he was giving his speech, it could 
move all the cells in her body. 

Handsome. 

Too handsome. 

At this moment, Wu Tian, who was on the stage, was so handsome that it was 
suffocating. 

She had never used this kind of gaze to admire a man before. This time, she was 
deeply attracted to Wu Tian and her eyes were filled with infatuation. 

She didn't expect the boy in front of her to be so outstanding. 

Not only Lin Weiwei was attracted, but all the guests were deeply influenced by Wu 
Tian's speech. 

In everyone's eyes, Wu Tian's way of narration was unique and interesting. His words 
were filled with a love for economics and management, which was why his content was 
so deeply imprinted into people's hearts. 

Although Wu Tian's explanation is not as professional as Professor Tao's, but the ability 
to express language is more attractive. 



After all, all the girls present were deeply captivated by Wu Tian's explanation. Looking 
at the passionate Wu Tian on the stage, everyone felt that they were in love. 

Of course, the boys were also infected by this explanation, their bodies burning with 
passion. 

Even the leaders and experts present couldn't help but nod quietly. They 
wholeheartedly agreed with Wu Tian. 

Lin Tao was stunned. He did not expect Wu Tian to not have the slightest bit of 
nervousness and was even able to explain things so well. 

He couldn't help but wonder if this kid was a student or an orator. 

It was a little too powerful. 

The one who was the most shocked was Professor Tao, he never thought that this 
student called Wu Tian would be so calm on stage. 

He listened to Wu Tian's views and perceptions of economics and management. The 
expression on his face kept changing, but it was mostly a mixture of gratification and 
joy. 

Someone began to lead the applause. 

After the speech ended, the audience burst into warm applause, which lasted for a long 
time. 

The guests were deeply impressed by this speech. They felt admiration from the bottom 
of their hearts and applauded with all their might. 

After the applause, the guests couldn't help but whisper to each other. They all wanted 
to know Wu Tian's detailed information. 

Some people recognized Wu Tian as a student of an industrial university. They all gave 
him a thumbs-up, praising him for bringing honor to the university. 

Many of the leaders of Lu University even talked about transferring Wu Tian to another 
school, with the intention of poaching him into Lu University. 

"These are some of my sketchy ideas about economics and management. They only 
represent my personal point of view. I would like to ask everyone to understand my 
shortcomings." Wu Tian bowed towards the crowd and got off the stage. 

Many girls in the audience stood up and quickly shook hands with Wu Tian. 



Wu Tian waved politely towards everyone and returned to his seat. 

Lin Weiwei stared at Wu Tian and kept swallowing her saliva. After a long while, she 
asked sillily, "Hey, are you really an industrial college student?" 

"Of course!" Wu Tian nodded forcefully. He felt embarrassed when he was stared at by 
Lin Weiwei's fiery gaze. 

"Wow, your industrial university is too awesome. Even I can't help but be jealous of you 
for teaching such an outstanding student." Lin Weiwei held her face like a charmed 
sister. 

To be precise, she looked more like an idiot. 

"I'm not as good as you say." Wu Tian scratched his head in embarrassment and turned 
to look at Lin Tao, "President Lin, what do you think?" 

"I …" Lin Tao wished he could find a hole to hide in. 

At this moment, he was no longer qualified to evaluate Wu Tian. 

Originally, he wanted to see Wu Tian make a fool of himself in front of everyone. In the 
end, this brat's performance was outstanding and immediately became the focus of the 
entire stadium. He was sought after and loved by countless people. Even the school 
leaders praised him well. 

Especially when he saw the infatuation in Lin Weiwei's eyes towards Wu Tian, he was 
extremely jealous. 

"President Lin, please advise me in the future." Wu Tian smiled humbly. These words 
were obviously meant to slap Lin Tao's face. 

Lin Tao lowered his head, unable to say anything. 

 


