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"I can't accept this." Bai Sha quickly waved his hand and refused: "It's my 
honor to be able to do something for you." 

"Cut the crap. If I tell you to take it, then take it." Wu Tian shouted loudly and 
forcefully stuffed the cheque into Bai Sha's hand. 

"Thank you, brother." 

Bai Sha could only take the cheque. When he saw the sum, he was shocked: 
"20 million." 

Although Bai Shatang wasn't short of money and he had several hundred 
million in assets, those were the money his brothers earned by risking their 
lives. 

However, he never would have thought that Wu Tian would be so generous. 
Just because he helped Wu Tian, Wu Tian directly gave him 20 million. 

"Don't be happy too early, I still have things that I need you to do for me." Wu 
Tian walked over, patted Bai Sha's shoulder and said with a smile. 

"Brother Wu, if there's anything you need, feel free to tell me." Bai Sha put the 
cheque away and said with a smile. 

Even if Wu Tian didn't give him any money, he was still willing to work for Wu 
Tian, not to mention that Brother Wu was so generous. 

"Take a seat!" 

Wu Tian walked over and sat down, then pointed at the sofa opposite him, "Sit 
down and we'll talk." 

"Alright." Bai Sha sat down on the sofa and said in a loud voice, "If there's 
anything you need, just tell me. No matter how dangerous it is, I won't refuse." 

"It's not that serious." 



Wu Tian took out a cigarette and lit it up. He then took out two cigarettes and 
passed them to Liu Jun and Bai Sha, "Come, you two smoke a cigarette first." 

"Thank you, brother." Bai Sha took the cigarette and lit it up. 

"Pavilion Master Bai, have you heard of Huang Jinzhou?" 

"Of course I've heard of him." Bai Sha exhaled a breath of smoke, then 
laughed and said: "He is the Jinzhou Group's boss, Luzhou's number one real 
estate agent." 

"What I told you to do has to do with him." 

"Could it be that you want me to kidnap him?" 

"No, I never do anything illegal." Wu Tian shook the ash from his cigarette and 
warned him in a deep voice, "You have to abide by the law when you work 
with me." 

"I understand." 

"Huang Jinzhou has more than ten projects on his hands, I want you to send 
someone to create some trouble for his site." 

"Causing trouble?" 

"Right, you should think of a way to disrupt their work and make it difficult for 
them to carry out their work. Let Huang Jinzhou be troubled by trivial matters." 

"I understand. Simply put, it is to create all kinds of troubles for Huang Jinzhou 
and Jinzhou Group." 

"Yes, that's what I meant." Wu Tian nodded. Then, he changed his tone and 
instructed again, "I only want you to cause damage, but you must not do 
anything illegal. You must not touch the matters of murder, arson, and 
robbery." 

"Don't worry, I understand." 

"That's good. After you succeed, I will give you all some benefits." 

"Then I'll thank you, brother." 



"Alright, you guys go back to your work first. I'll wait for your good news." With 
that, Wu Tian extinguished the cigarette in his hand. 

"Don't worry, I won't let you down. Goodbye." Bai Sha took the last drag from 
his cigarette, then turned around and left with his people. 

After Bai Sha left, Liu Jun couldn't help but give Sun Tie a thumbs up. "Tian, 
let Wu Tie Hall deal with Huang Jinzhou — this move is indeed a brilliant one." 

"This is called returning a tooth for a tooth." 

Wu Tian stood up from the sofa and walked to the window. He looked at the 
construction site downstairs and said as if to himself, "Huang Jinzhou brought 
thugs to destroy our construction site, so I will do the same thing and hinder 
all of their projects at the same time." 

"I'm afraid that Shengshi Group will encounter big trouble like this, and Huang 
Jinzhou will also be very troubled." 

"I just want Huang Jinzhou to be exhausted, then we can hurt their core 
project." 

"Tian, it seems like you have already thought of a plan to deal with Huang 
Jinzhou." 

"I'll go all out." Wu Tian coldly spat out two words, turned around and faced 
Liu Jun, "Uncle Liu, right now you are in charge of the Fragrant Honey Lake 
project, you cannot make any mistakes. I will handle the matter regarding 
Huang Jinzhou." 

"Alright, I promise that nothing will happen to the Fragrant Honey Lake." 

"That's good." Wu Tian once again turned his head to look out the window, 
then looked up at the black cloud, "It's time to remove the tumor called 
Jinzhou Group." 

If he wanted to completely eliminate Shengshi Group, he had to cut off the 
branches of Shengshi Group. This time, he chose to start from Jinzhou Group. 

He believed that it wouldn't be long before he would be able to eliminate 
Jinzhou Group — Luzhou's number one real estate company. 



It was already eight o'clock when he walked out of the Fragrant Honey Lake 
Project Department. 

Wu Tian got on a car and rushed to school as fast as he could. However, he 
was still half an hour late. Teacher Mu Ran was still in class. 

He had expected Teacher Mu to scold him a few times, but contrary to his 
expectations, Teacher Mu didn't scold him. Instead, she showed him a gentle 
smile. 

Wu Tian returned a smile and quickly returned to his seat. 

He was very serious during the morning classes. He was called out of the 
classroom by Teacher Mu after school at noon. 

"Tian, you drank a lot last night. Are you alright?" Mu Ran asked in a caring 
tone that she had never used before. 

"I'm fine." 

"I told you to drink less yesterday, but you didn't listen to me. Do you feel 
dizzy today?" 

"Thank you for Teacher Mu's concern. I'm fine." Hearing such a gentle voice, 
Wu Tian felt extremely warm. 

Speaking of yesterday's meeting at Aifei Castle, he did indeed drink quite a 
bit, with a total of one and a half kilograms of white wine, and even drank a 
few cups of red wine. 

If it was in normal times, he would probably get drunk after drinking so much. 
He would inevitably have a headache and a dizzy spell the next day. 

However, this time was different. After drinking the wine, he felt that nothing 
had happened after he had slept. His spirit was still exceptionally good, and 
his physical strength was also exceptionally vigorous. 

Maybe this had something to do with the Blood Ganoderma Herba. After 
consuming the Blood Ganoderma Herba, his body had become stronger and 
his energy had improved. Even if he was drunk, he would be able to quickly 
wake up. 



"Come, let's go to my apartment. I'll cook some sobering soup for you and 
help you with your supplementary lessons." Having said so, Mu Ran carried 
her textbook down the stairs. 

"Then I'll be troubling Teacher Mu." Wu Tian smiled sweetly and followed 
closely behind Teacher Mu as they walked down the stairs. 

They went up to the apartment building. Before they entered, Mu Ran couldn't 
help but suddenly ask, "Oh right, have you done some external maintenance 
recently? Your skin and aura has improved a lot compared to before." 

"Did Teacher Mu think I was more handsome than before?" 

"Something like that!" Mu Ran nodded. 

Mu Ran had not seen Wu Tian for more than ten days. This time, she felt that 
Wu Tian's skin was more exquisite and his temperament had changed. He 
was more charming than before. 

Yesterday, when she saw Wu Tian at the Aifei Castle entrance, she couldn't 
help but be attracted by his face and was slightly entranced at the time. 

"Teacher Mu is really amazing. I have been doing external care abroad 
recently. It's a kind of medical treatment." Wu Tian lied immediately. 

In fact, the reason for the change in his expression and temperament was 
because he had consumed the Blood Ganoderma Herba, which had nothing 
to do with medicinal treatment. 

"Medicine treatment?" 

"Right." 

"That powerful?" 

"Yeah, does Teacher Mu want to try?" 

"Forget it, I don't have time for external maintenance." Mu Ran opened the 
door and made a welcoming gesture. "You can go in first. I'll make you some 
sobering wine." 

Having said so, she went to the bedroom to change clothes, then went into 
the kitchen to start cooking the soup. 
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Wu Tian had already woken up from the alcohol last night and was now more 
awake than anyone else. However, Teacher Mu had spent a lot of time and 
effort to make this soup, so he had no choice but to drink two big bowls. 

Wu Tian licked his lips after finishing the soup and praised, "Teacher Mu is so 
awesome, even the soup is so delicious." 

"You really know how to talk." 

Mu Ran grumbled, then pushed her textbook over. "I'll help you with your 
supplementary lessons now, so listen carefully." 

Mu Ran lectured seriously for the next two hours. Wu Tian was also very 
focused and quickly learned all the knowledge within this period of time. 

After the tutoring session, Wu Tian tried to curry favor with Teacher Mu, 
"Teacher Mu, it's been hard on you to help me with my tutoring class. I'll treat 
you to a meal." 

"There's food at home, so we don't need to go out and eat. Just wait for me, 
I'll go cook now." With that said, Mu Ran turned around and walked into the 
kitchen with the bib in her hand. 

"Mu …" 

Wu Tian was afraid that Teacher Mu would be tired, so he wanted to take her 
out to eat. Before he could stop her, he found that Teacher Mu was already 
busy in the kitchen. 

Seeing this, Wu Tian didn't say anything. He followed behind Teacher Mu to 
help her, hoping to lighten the burden on her. 

However, the more he helped, the worse the situation became. Soon, Teacher 
Mu chased him out of the kitchen. 

It took more than half an hour for Teacher Mu to cook. 



After bringing the dishes to the table, Mu Ran smiled and greeted Wu Tian, 
"Come and sit here, come and eat." 

"Teacher Mu, this dish makes me hungry just by looking at it." He continued, 
"The smell makes me drool." Wu Tian couldn't wait to eat it with his hands. 

* 

Mu Ran patted Wu Tian and scolded him softly, "You've grown up. You can't 
eat with your hands." 

"Teacher Mu, I'm just a child." 

"You're not blushing at all!" Mu Ran slightly rolled her eyes, picked up the 
chopsticks and gave it to Wu Tian, "Don't use your hands to grab it, eat it with 
chopsticks." 

"Ok!" 

Wu Tian took the chopsticks, picked up a few pieces of Red Braised Meat, 
stuffed them into his mouth and started chewing. 

After eating the Red Braised Meat, he could not help but extend his thumb to 
praise her, "Teacher Mu's cooking skills are amazing. The food you make is 
really delicious. The Red Braised Meat is fat but not greasy — it has a sweet 
and sticky taste." 

"This dish is not as delicious as you said. I'm far worse than Chef Shen Xue." 
Mu Ran waved her hands humbly. 

Yesterday, she had eaten Shen Xue's cooking, that was the real delicacy, 
even now thinking about it made her feel delicious. 

"Xue is a professional chef and Teacher Mu is an amateur chef. I can't 
compare the two of you together, that would be unfair to Teacher Mu." 

"You talk too much, hurry up and eat. The meal will be cold later." Mu Ran 
served the dishes to Wu Tian, then she picked up the bowl and chopsticks 
and started to eat. 

Just as the two of them were talking and laughing, loud noises came from 
outside the door, accompanied by the sound of the door being knocked. 



Mu Ran put down her chopsticks and said to Wu Tian, "You eat first, I'll go out 
and check the situation." 

She got up and opened the door. 

Outside the door was Professor Teacher Yang, who was in the fourth year of 
the Finance Department, fighting with his wife. 

The couple often fought and had a terrible reputation. This caused many 
teachers and students to feel a little annoyed. 

This was especially true for the teachers and their families who lived upstairs 
and downstairs. They were often woken up by the sounds of fighting in the 
middle of the night, which affected their normal rest. Mu Ran suffered greatly. 

At this moment, Teacher Yang was dragging his wife by the hair, dragging her 
onto the ground. His wife was not someone who was easy to deal with, so she 
desperately tore at Teacher Yang with her two hands. 

"Teacher Yang, stop fighting. This isn't good." In such a situation, Mu Ran 
could only try her best to persuade him. 

"This has nothing to do with you, stop wasting your breath here." Teacher 
Yang was angry and did not give Mu Ran any face as he continued to fight 
with his wife. 

He had his wife's head firmly under control, obviously in an advantageous 
position, but he didn't dare to use too much strength. 

He understood a principle. If his wife was hospitalized, he would have to pay 
for the medical expenses. The one who was in trouble was himself. 

"Teacher Yang, stop fighting, if you continue, something will happen." Mu Ran 
advised, preparing to step forward and stop them. 

"Bitch, don't stand in the way." Teacher Yang pushed Mu Ran away. He 
cursed. 

* 

Mu Ran was pushed back a few steps and fell heavily to the ground. 



Seeing this, Wu Tian couldn't continue eating. He put down his chopsticks and 
hurried over to help Mu Ran up from the ground, "Teacher Mu, are you 
alright?" 

"I'm fine." Mu Ran forced herself to endure the pain and shook her head as if 
nothing had happened. 

The fall from just now had made her back hurt. However, she was too 
embarrassed to say it out, so she could only pretend that she was fine. 

"Teacher Mu, step back and let me handle this." Wu Tian protected Mu Ran 
behind him, then pointed at Teacher Yang's nose and scolded, "You hit your 
own wife, are you still a man?" 

Originally, Wu Tian didn't want to talk about other people's family matters. 

This incident happened because Teacher Yang didn't know what was good for 
him. Not only did he push Teacher Mu down, he even verbally insulted 
Teacher Mu. 

"This is my family matter, what does it have to do with you?" Teacher Yang 
pulled his wife's hair and warned Wu Tian, "Brat, you'd better not meddle in 
other people's business." 

"I have to deal with this matter today." After Wu Tian said this, he pulled 
Teacher Yang's wife's arm. He tugged at the woman. He forcibly snatched the 
woman away. 

Teacher Yang's wife was in her twenties, had a pretty good appearance and a 
slim figure. She had been married to Teacher Yang for less than half a year. 

Despite her petite and delicate appearance, her temper was not small. She 
was like a tigress with disheveled hair as she pounced towards Teacher Yang, 
"I'll fight it out with you." 

"Don't be rash." 

Wu Tian grabbed the woman's arm and reminded her with good intentions, "If 
you go over like this, you will definitely suffer a loss." 



"Little bro, help me teach him a lesson. The jewelry that I have on me is all 
yours." After saying that, the young woman took off the gold earrings, gold 
necklace and gold ring on her body and handed them to Wu Tian. 

"Big Sis, you keep the things, I must help you teach him a lesson today." Wu 
Tian didn't take her gold jewelry. 

Wu Tian taught Teacher Yang a lesson not to help this young woman, but to 
help Teacher Mu vent her anger. 

"You should know your limits. With your frail appearance, you still want to 
teach me a lesson? What a joke." After Teacher Yang said this, he started 
laughing loudly. 

* 

Wu Tian raised his leg and kicked Teacher Yang in the crotch, causing 
Teacher Yang to cry out in pain while bowing. 

"Hubby, are you alright?" When the young woman saw that her husband's 
private parts were injured, she rushed forward to take care of him. 

The couple fought because of a fit of anger, but if her husband was really hurt, 
the wife would worry. 

"Scram!" 

Teacher Yang pushed the young woman away and pointed at Wu Tian's nose, 
provoking him, "What kind of ability do you have for a sneak attack? If you 
have the ability, then let's have a good fight and see who is stronger." 

"Alright, then I'll fight seriously with you." Wu Tian shook his arm and walked 
in front of Teacher Yang. 

This time, Teacher Yang's punch was very fast. When Wu Tian wasn't paying 
attention, Teacher Yang swung his fist and mercilessly punched towards Wu 
Tian's chest. 

The one screaming was not Wu Tian, but Teacher Yang. 

Teacher Yang landed a heavy punch on Wu Tian's chest. He felt as if he had 
hit a steel plate, causing his entire arm to go numb from the intense pain. 
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Ever since Wu Tian had taken the Blood Ganoderma Herba, his body had 
become a hundred times stronger than before. Not only did he have strength, 
his bones also became tougher than before. 

The punch from Teacher Yang did not make him feel any pain. On the 
contrary, it made Teacher Yang miserable and his face contorted in pain. 

"Now it's my turn." Wu Tian stretched his arms and legs and slowly raised his 
big fist. 

"I won't fight you." Teacher Yang finally noticed that the man in front of him 
was a powerful person. He quickly waved his hand and said, "We won't fight 
anymore." 

"That won't do. We have to fight." 

"Don't attack, I'm a teacher …" 

"Cut the crap." Wu Tian didn't want to waste his breath. He formed a fist with 
his right hand and punched towards Teacher Yang's face. 

Teacher Yang was so scared that he shrunk his body and tilted his head to 
the right, barely dodging the punch. 

Wu Tian's fist brushed past Teacher Yang's ear and smashed onto the 
opposite wall. 

* 

Along with a muffled sound, a big hole was made in the wall behind Teacher 
Yang, and gravel flew everywhere. 

* 

The young woman screamed in fear as her body collapsed to the ground like 
mud. Her entire face turned the color of a pig's liver. 



After staring at the broken wall for a long time, she slowly raised her head and 
looked at Wu Tian. That look in her eyes was as terrifying as if she was 
looking at a monster. 

Never in her dreams did she expect that the guy in front of her had such 
amazing strength. Wu Tian looked extremely weak, but she never expected 
him to punch a big hole in the wall. 

She couldn't help but secretly suspect the identity of this kid in front of her. 
How could he have such strength? 

Teacher Yang was also scared silly. He also didn't expect that the weak 
looking brat in front of him would be so strong that he could punch through the 
wall. 

Fortunately, this punch had hit the wall. If it had hit his head, wouldn't his head 
have been smashed? 

Thinking of this, he unconsciously shivered. Cold sweat dripped down his 
forehead and his heart shivered. 

Even Mu Ran was dumbstruck. She didn't expect Wu Tian to punch so hard to 
the point that a hole was punched in the opposite wall. 

She already knew that Wu Tian was strong and had a lot of strength. 
However, she didn't expect Wu Tian to have such strength. This was too 
scary. 

Wu Tian retracted his fist, turned around and looked at Teacher Yang, "You 
dodged fast just now, but you can't escape now." 

After Wu Tian said this, he clenched his fists and prepared to make his move. 

"Don't hit me, I admit defeat." Teacher Yang raised his hands in shock and 
made a gesture of surrender. 

"You admit defeat?" 

"Right, I admit defeat." Teacher Yang did not dare to take his life as a joke, so 
he could only admit defeat. 



If Wu Tian punched again, he couldn't guarantee that he would be able to 
dodge. At that time, even if he wasn't beaten to death, he would probably be 
bleeding from the head. 

"Fine." Wu Tian then retracted his fist and said to Teacher Yang, "You just 
insulted Teacher Mu, apologize to her quickly." 

"Yes, yes, yes." 

After Teacher Yang answered, he rushed to Mu Ran, "Teacher Mu, I'm sorry, 
it was my fault just now. I apologize to you." 

"Forget it, I'll forgive you." Mu Ran forced a smile. They were both colleagues, 
so she didn't want to ruin their relationship. 

"Teacher Mu is magnanimous. Thank you, Teacher Mu." After Teacher Yang 
thanked him, he looked at Wu Tian in fear, "Can you let me go now?" 

"You two are husband and wife, do you dare to fight in the future?" Wu Tian 
asked coldly as if he was interrogating a criminal. 

"We don't dare to fight anymore." Teacher Yang was so scared that he quickly 
waved his hand and promised, "I will never hit my wife again." 

"If I ever see you hit your wife again, I'll blow your head off." 

"I won't dare to do it again." 

"In addition, keep your voices down. Don't disturb Teacher Mu's rest." 

"Yes, yes, yes." Teacher Yang and the young woman nodded like chickens 
pecking rice. 

"Here!" 

Wu Tian took out a cheque from his pocket and handed it over, then said 
coldly, "I'll give you guys the money, you guys go and repair the wall." 

"No need …" Teacher Yang was so scared that his legs went soft. How could 
he have the courage to accept that cheque? 



"Don't waste your breath, take it." Wu Tian forcibly stuffed the cheque into 
Teacher Yang's hands and ordered, "Don't just stand there. Go and find 
someone to repair the wall." 

"Yes, yes, yes." After Teacher Yang replied, he quickly took the cheque and 
walked downstairs. The young woman also quickly followed. 

The couple were especially afraid of Wu Tian right now. It was as if they saw a 
wild beast and wanted to get away from it as soon as possible. 

The couple only collapsed powerlessly on the ground after they ran 
downstairs. 

The young woman held her chest as she gasped: "I was scared to death! 
Never have I thought that there would be such a strong and powerful person 
in the world." 

"Wu Tian is indeed powerful. That punch of his could easily kill two oxen." 
Teacher Yang still had a lingering fear. 

"By the way, how much did he give you?" 

"I haven't seen how much yet." 

"Let me see." The young woman snatched the cheque from Teacher Yang's 
hands. When she saw the amount on it, she could not help but exclaim, "Five 
hundred thousand." 

"Oh my god, it's really five hundred thousand." Teacher Yang snatched back 
the cheque and exclaimed even more exaggeratedly. 

"We're rich." Seeing so much money, the panic in the young woman's heart 
gradually disappeared. She excitedly said: "I didn't think that not only would 
that kid have so much strength but also so much money. He actually gave us 
500,000 yuan! Isn't he too generous?" 

They only needed two thousand yuan at most to repair the wall, but Wu Tian 
gave them five hundred thousand yuan so they were going to be rich. 

"Wife, we're rich now. Let's go, I'll treat you to a big meal." Teacher Yang 
pulled the young woman and ran out. Both of them were overjoyed. 



Five hundred thousand wasn't a lot, but for the two of them, it was like 
providing charcoal during a snowstorm. 

They owed more than 200,000 yuan in usury money and were fighting over 
the lack of money to repay the debt. However, after a fight, someone sent 
500,000 yuan over to them to solve their desperate situation. 

When Wu Tian saw them leave, he followed Teacher Mu back to the living 
room to continue eating. 

"Tian, is your hand alright?" After returning to her room, Mu Ran couldn't help 
but worry about Wu Tian's arm. 

"I'm fine." Wu Tian passed his right hand over and smiled, "I'm not hurt at all." 

"You really aren't hurt." Mu Ran stared at Wu Tian's arm for a long time before 
she finally exclaimed, "You just broke through the wall, how come you are still 
unharmed?" 

"My skin is thick." 

"Your fists are too strong, how can you have such strength?" 

"This is a long story, I'll explain it to Teacher Mu in the future." 

"Alright!" Mu Ran didn't pursue the matter any further. She sighed emotionally 
and said, "It's all thanks to you today. Otherwise, the couple would have 
continued fighting." 

"Listening to their conversation, it seems like it's because they're still fighting 
over the loan. I just gave them five hundred thousand yuan, they won't be 
fighting again for a short period of time." 

"You're giving them five hundred thousand?" 

"Yeah." 

"You're so generous, you actually gave them five hundred thousand." 

"I gave them the money because I hoped that they would stop fighting in the 
future, so as to not disturb Teacher Mu's rest." Wu Tian said with a smile. 



"Thank you!" Mu Ran's heart warmed. She did not expect Wu Tian to think for 
her at all times. 
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After dinner, Wu Tian said goodbye to Teacher Mu and left the apartment. He 
arrived at the University City Electronic Street. His mobile phone had fallen 
into a ravine, so he was ready to buy a new one. 

Walking into a phone store, Wu Tian pointed at the latest model phone behind 
the counter and asked the sales clerk, "Beauty, how much is this phone?" 

"Even if you ask for the price, you can't afford it." The sales clerk looked up at 
Wu Tian, then lowered his head and continued to play with his phone. 

"How do you know I can't afford it?" 

"I've seen many bumpkins like you. You just want to hook up with us 
salespeople when you have nothing better to do." 

"You're thinking too much." Wu Tian glared at the salesperson and retorted 
coldly, "With your looks, I can't find the slightest bit of interest in you." 

"You …" 

The salesman was so angry that his mouth twitched. She put down the phone 
and looked at Wu Tian with disdain, "Do you know how much this phone 
costs?" 

"I don't know." 

"This is the latest model of the Huawei machine. It's more than 10,000 yuan. 
Do you have money?" 

* 

Wu Tian took out his bank card and slapped it on the counter, "Don't talk 
nonsense, I'll pay now." 

"Gold card?" 



Looking at the gold card on the counter, the sales clerk's eyes lit up. She 
changed her attitude and smiled to please him. "So you are an esteemed 
guest." 

She knew this kind of gold card, only those with at least one million yuan in 
savings would be qualified to receive this. Therefore, this brat in front of her 
had at least one million yuan in savings. 

"Hurry, I'm in a hurry to use my phone." Wu Tian didn't have the mood to 
waste words with this woman and urged her urgently. 

"Here." 

The sales clerk immediately became more enthusiastic. She quickly took out 
her phone from behind the counter and handed it to Wu Tian, "Boss, take a 
look at your phone first. If there's no problem, then you can pay the bill." 

"Alright …" 

Wu Tian was about to receive the phone, but someone snatched it away first. 

The person who took away the phone was a middle-aged man. He had a 
paunch and looked like a rich man. 

The middle-aged man looked at the phone and said to the sales clerk, "This 
phone is not bad, I want one too." 

"This is the latest model of Huawei, this is the last one in our store." The 
salesman explained with a smile. 

"Then I'll take it." After saying that, the middle-aged man took out his bank 
card from his pocket and prepared to pay the bill. 

The salesperson didn't take his bank card, and said with an embarrassed 
smile, "I'm really sorry, this phone has already been bought by this mister." 

"Then I'll raise the price. I'll give you fifteen thousand, okay?" 

"This …" Hearing about the increase in price, the salesperson was 
immediately tempted. 

Before the sales clerk could reply, Wu Tian raised a finger, "I'll give twenty 
thousand, I'm sure I'll buy this phone." 



"Thirty thousand." The middle-aged man shook his suit, looking like he was 
rich. 

"Forty thousand." Wu Tian did not back down and continued to raise the price. 

"Fifty thousand." The middle-aged man was naturally unwilling to lose to a 
brat and continued to raise the price. 

"Sixty thousand." 

"Seventy thousand." 

"…" 

"One hundred thousand." 

Just like this, the two of them, for the sake of a phone, refused to give in and 
eventually raised the price to a hundred thousand yuan. 

"I don't want this phone." Wu Tian didn't add any more money, it wasn't worth 
it to spend 100,000 yuan to buy a phone. 

Since he spent so much money to buy a phone, he might as well add a few 
more million and buy the entire phone shop. 

"Silly boy, with your ability, you can't beat me." The middle-aged man seemed 
to have won a battle as he raised his head and was extremely complacent. 

He pushed the bank card over and arrogantly ordered the sales clerk, "I'll 
pay." 

"You're really too rich, I'll take the money now." The salesperson was so 
excited that she couldn't speak properly. She felt as if she had gone through 
an auction. 

In just a few minutes, they had already raised the price to 100,000 yuan. 

To tell the truth, she had never sold such an expensive phone in all her years 
as a salesgirl. 

Just as the salesperson was about to check out, Wu Tian suddenly said: "Wait 
a moment, I'm going to buy your entire phone shop." 



* 

Hearing this, the potbellied man threw his head back and laughed loudly. 

She laughed for a long time before she could not help but mock Wu Tian. 
"You really know how to put on an act. You want to buy a mobile phone store? 
Do you have the ability to?" 

The sales clerk couldn't help but laugh. She also felt that this brat in front of 
her was just acting cool. 

The total price of the shop and its products was at least 5 million. How could 
Wu Tian take out 5 million in one go? 

Even if he could take out that much money, he would have to negotiate and 
sign the contract. This process would take at least half a month. 

"I never joke with strangers." After saying that, Wu Tian took out his phone 
and dialed Loong Yun's number. He spoke into his phone, "I want you to help 
me buy the Huawei flagship mobile phone store in University City within ten 
minutes." 

He just said that and hung up. 

"Kid, you really know how to act cool." The middle-aged man sat back in his 
chair. "I want to see how you're going to end this." 

"Then this phone …" The salesman froze, and for a moment she didn't know 
what to do. 

"No rush, let's watch the show first. We'll see how this brat will end in ten 
minutes." The middle-aged man said to the sales clerk. 

"Alright." 

The salesman looked at the time and waited patiently. 

Time passed silently, and ten minutes went by quickly. 

The middle-aged man looked at the time and mocked Wu Tian, "Didn't you 
say you could buy this shop within 10 minutes? Why is there no movement 
after ten minutes? " 



"Don't worry, there's still the last 30 seconds." Wu Tian's expression was as 
calm as still water. 

"I'll wait for another thirty seconds. I want to see how long you can keep it up 
for." After saying this, the middle-aged man looked at the time and counted 
down silently. 

When there were only ten seconds left, a man in a suit walked into the phone 
shop with a few young men and women. 

Seeing the man in a suit, the sales clerk went over from afar to greet him: 
"President Zhao, why are you here?" 

The man in the suit in front of him was none other than the big boss of 
Huawei's flagship store. 

"Get out of the way." 

Without even taking a glance at the salesperson, President Zhao quickly 
walked in front of Wu Tian and tried to curry favor with him with a respectful 
smile, "You must be Mr Wu, right?" 

"Yes, it's me." Wu Tian nodded and looked at the man in a suit with a smile. 

"Hello." President Zhao quickly stretched out his right hand and introduced 
with a smile, "I'm the owner of this phone shop, you can just call me Little 
Zhao." 

"Hello, President Zhao." 

"Right, this is the authorization letter and the contract text for the mobile 
phone store." President Zhao quickly took out the contract from his pocket and 
carefully handed it over. 

Just now, he received a notification from the regional headquarters asking him 
to transfer the flagship store to Mr Wu. After that, he had more than five 
million yuan in his bank account. 

This kind of thing happened too suddenly, causing him to be caught off guard. 

However, he quickly thought of the fact that Wu Tian was able to gain the 
approval of the regional headquarters within a short period of time. From this, 
it could be seen how powerful Wu Tian was behind the scenes. 



Without another word, he quickly cooperated with the regional headquarters to 
make the transfer agreement. 
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"Very good." Wu Tian took the contract text and looked at it for a moment. 
Then, he instructed President Zhao: "You should arrange it properly." 

"Yes sir!" 

After President Zhao answered, he gathered all the managers and 
salespeople in the store and announced loudly, "From now on, Mr Wu is the 
new owner of Huawei's flagship store. Let us applaud and welcome him." 

* 

After hearing this, the potbellied man coughed a few times and almost choked 
to death on his own saliva. 

He didn't expect Wu Tian to become the owner of this flagship store in such a 
short time. 

If he didn't see it with his own eyes, he would never have dared to believe it. 
This brat really bought this phone shop within 10 minutes. 

Previously, this brat said that he wanted to buy the phone shop within ten 
minutes. At that time, he couldn't believe it and thought it was a joke. 

However, what happened humiliated him. The brat in front of him had indeed 
bought this flagship store in a short period of time. 

To be able to purchase a flagship store in such a short period of time, it 
proved that this brat not only had money, but also had great power. 

The person who was the most shocked was the salesperson. She had never 
dreamed that this phone shop had really been bought by this brat. 

It was unbelievable. She didn't expect Wu Tian to disagree with others when 
he came to buy a phone. That's why he suddenly bought the store. 



She didn't dare to imagine — to be able to buy this phone shop in such a short 
period of time, just how much wealth and strength did this kid in front of her 
have? 

At this moment, the salesperson stared at Wu Tian as if she was looking at a 
monster. Her eyes were filled with surprise and shock. 

"President Zhao." 

Wu Tian walked over and patted President Zhao's shoulder. He asked with a 
smile, "Do you know why I want to buy this phone shop?" 

"I don't know." President Zhao scratched his head in embarrassment. He 
didn't know what happened at all. 

His mobile phone store had been bought for no reason. He couldn't help it, 
because he didn't have a choice. 

"For this phone." Wu Tian pointed at the newest phone on the bar, "I bought 
your entire store just for this phone." 

"Mr Wu is so generous." President Zhao couldn't help but stick out his thumb. 
He grinned to curry favor with Wu Tie. 

"Can you sell me this phone now?" 

"Yes, all the phones in the store are yours. You can have any one you want." 
After President Zhao said this, he turned around and ordered the sales clerk, 
"Don't just stand there in a daze, help Mr Wu pack his phone." 

"Yes sir!" 

After the sales clerk answered, she hurriedly put away her phone and handed 
it to Wu Tian with both hands, "Mr Wu, your phone." 

"You're a disqualified salesman." Wu Tian took over the phone and said 
coldly, "Deduct all of your bonuses for this month." 

"Mr Wu, I …" The salesman was on the verge of tears. 

She had thought that selling her phone this time would earn her a lot of 
money. Not only did she not make any money, even all the bonuses she 
earned previously were deducted. 



She had never dreamed that such a thing would happen. She thought Wu 
Tian was just a passerby, but she didn't expect him to become the owner of 
the flagship store all of a sudden. 

"If there's nothing else, I'll be leaving first." Wu Tian walked out of the store 
with his phone. When he walked past the potbellied man, he suddenly 
stopped. 

Wu Tian waved his phone in front of the man and smiled proudly, "You can't 
beat me." 

"You..." 

The man still didn't say what he wanted to say. He just swallowed his saliva 
and obediently closed his mouth. 

He knew that Wu Tian was very powerful. He was rich and powerful, he was 
definitely not someone he could bully. 

Thus, he no longer had the courage to fight over the items with this kid. 

"The thing I'm least afraid of is to fight over things with someone else." After 
Wu Tian said that, he took his phone, turned around and quickly left. 

To be honest, even he didn't expect to buy the entire store just to buy a 
phone. 

Although the rich people are willful, but he seems to be a little too willful. 

There was no helping it, right now he was too rich and had the right to be 
willful. This little bit of money was not even worth mentioning to the current 
him. 

After buying the phone, he went to the neighboring business hall to get his 
original phone number. 

After he was done with all this, he left the Walking Street with his phone and 
prepared to return to school. 

When he walked up to the entrance of the Walking Street, he saw a familiar 
figure. It was his junior high school classmate, Lee Qiang. 



Although they hadn't met for many years, he still had a deep impression of 
Lee Qiang. Lee Qiang was his best classmate in junior high school. At that 
time, Lee Qiang often helped him out when he was bullied. 

Many times, when he caused trouble, it was Lee Qiang who took responsibility 
for him. Previously, Lee Qiang had been beaten up a lot for him, so to be 
honest, he was very grateful to Lee Qiang. 

However, they hadn't seen each other for so many years, Lee Qiang hadn't 
changed at all, and he was still covered in fat like before. He looked a little 
scary. 

"Qiang …" 

Wu Tian waved at Lee Qiang and shouted. 

"Tian?" Lee Qiang was stunned for a few seconds before recognizing Wu 
Tian. He ran over with his fat body swaying and he said excitedly, "We haven't 
seen each other in a long time." 

"Yeah, we haven't seen each other in more than a year." 

"You're getting more and more handsome, I almost didn't recognize you." Wu 
Steel circled around Wu Tian, looking left and right as if he was admiring 
antiques. 

Wu Tian felt his entire body go numb from Lee Qiang's gaze. He joked, 
"Qiang, long time no see. You couldn't have a change in your sexual 
orientation, right?" 

* 

Lee Qiang spat on the ground, grinned and said, "Don't worry, I'm not 
interested in you at all." 

"I was joking." 

"We haven't seen each other in a long time. Let's go, I'll treat them. Let's have 
a good drink." 

"It's better if I treat you …" 



"Why are you being so courteous with me? There's a restaurant across the 
street that's not bad. I'm their regular customer. Come, let's go drink." After 
Lee Qiang said this, he walked towards the university city with his fat body. 

Wu Tian quickly followed. Looking at the excess flesh on Lee Qiang's body, 
he was a little scared and didn't dare to be too close. 

He had too much fat on him, if his flesh fell and smashed his feet, he would 
definitely be in great pain. 

He didn't know how Lee Qiang's meat grew. After so many years, Lee Qiang's 
meat had not decreased at all and had instead grown a lot more than before. 

Under Lee Qiang's lead, the two of them arrived at the Chinese restaurant 
opposite them. 

Just as they entered the restaurant, a cute waitress took the initiative to 
welcome them. She smiled and said, "Brother Qiang, you're here." 

Obviously, Lee Qiang was a regular customer and was familiar with the 
waiter. 

Her voice made Lee Qiang's bones tingle, and his vanity burst forth. He used 
all his strength to prop up his fat belly and threw his hands behind him. 
"Weiwei, help us find a better seat." 

Hearing that, Wu Tian didn't know whether to laugh or cry. 

Fatty was really good at acting cool. In such a small restaurant, there were 
only a total of six tables. How could there be a good table? 

The dining room was very small. There was no private room, and all the tables 
were near the windows. All six tables were about the same. 

He really didn't understand what Lee Qiang meant. 

"Okay, Brother Qiang, please come in." This beautiful waitress called Weiwei 
was quite cooperative and quickly welcomed the two of them in. 

 


