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All of a sudden, Wu Tian felt a bit uncomfortable with the number of beauties around 
him. 

"You called Shen Xue over. Did you know Yueyao was sulking for a long time alone?" 
Huang Lan whispered something about Liu Yueyao at the side, causing Liu Yueyao to 
feel embarrassed. 

"Sister Huang, why are you saying this?" Liu Yueyao's face instantly turned red. 

"Right, I really should go back and see you guys more. However, since you've come, 
that's good too. You might as well not leave anymore. " 

Wu Tian was happy about this. He had been working so hard during this period of time 
that he didn't even have time to relax. 

It had been a long time since he had a good talk with these great beauties of his. 

As they were walking, Wu Tian took them into the room to enjoy the happy life they had 
been separated from each other for a long time. He even called Shen Xue over to have 
a meal with him. 

However, not long after he left, he saw Su Cancan excitedly walking over with a few 
people. 

"Wu Tian, I had something to ask of you …" Su Cancan suddenly stopped talking as if 
she had reached the end of her sentence. 

She opened her eyes wide and looked at Wu Tian in disbelief. It was unknown when 
two great beauties had appeared beside him. 

The key was that in terms of looks and temperament, these two were definitely one of 
the best in terms of China. Even Su Cancan was shocked by them. 

"This is?" Su Cancan pointed to Liu Yueyao and Huang Lan. 

"Tell me, let me introduce the two of them to you. This is the famous Huang Lan, a 
superstar." As for this, it's Liu Yueyao, she's one of my most capable generals at 
Luzhou, so she's basically in charge of all Luzhou matters right now. " 

Wu Tian didn't notice anything wrong, but he was still talking enthusiastically. He didn't 
notice that there was something wrong with the atmosphere at the scene. 



Su Cancan was looking at both of them in a strange way, and Liu Yueyao and the 
others were looking at Su Cancan in a rather strange way. Only Huang Lan gripped Wu 
Tian's arm. 

"Wu Tian, didn't we say that we are going back to our room to eat? Let's hurry up and 
go. " 

Huang Lan quickly changed the topic. Since this matter had been interrupted, she had 
to end it as soon as possible. 

"Right, right, right. We'll leave now." Wu Tian nodded and prepared to leave. 

However, the moment he moved, he could feel a strong aura coming from Su Cancan's 
side, which almost made Wu Tian unable to breathe. 

"I told you that I have something to talk to you about. It's related to the company's 
security, come over quickly." Su Cancan's outburst surprised Wu Tian, but he didn't 
dare to move again. 

"About that, may I ask what is the matter?" 

Wu Tian asked carefully. He felt like he had fallen into some kind of hell. 

"It's the two people we brought back last time. Didn't they want to take your life!? If I 
hadn't come to save you, you might already be dead. " When Su Cancan said that, she 
purposely emphasized the words "I'll go save you" as if it was meant for the people 
around Wu Tian. 

Liu Yueyao was obviously not to be outdone, "Wu Tian, it wasn't easy for us to get here, 
but you still aren't willing to accompany us. You said that you have been away from the 
Luzhou for such a long time, and you still haven't returned since. It's not like you can't 
run this company without it. " 

Wow, the smell of gunpowder between the two of them is very strong. 

Loong Yun stood to the side and looked at the Xiu Luo arena. She heaved a long sigh 
and left while covering her forehead. 

It would be better for her not to participate in this sort of thing. If she was caught in it, 
things would become troublesome. 

Wu Tian didn't know how to please the both of them anymore. What they said made a 
lot of sense. Moreover, both sides could be said to be evenly matched. On one side was 
Liu Yueyao and Huang Lan, who were already on good terms with each other while they 
were at Luzhou. 



On the other side was the ice beauty Su Cancan. Forget about others, just the number 
of times she had saved him was already more than enough. She was now an 
indispensable part of Wu Group company. 

"About that, don't argue anymore. That Loong Yun, didn't you say that I have a meeting 
to hold? I will go with you now." 

When Wu Tian saw that Loong Yun was about to run away, he quickly stopped her just 
as she was about to disappear. 

In the end, Loong Yun had an astonished smile on her face. 

She had already sensed that something was wrong, so she wanted to escape. In the 
end, she didn't expect Wu Tian to drag her into it. 

"I didn't say that …" Loong Yun started to feign ignorance, but at this time, Wu Tian had 
already walked over without saying anything. He didn't linger, nor did he try to persuade 
any of them to stay. 

"Why didn't you say anything? Of course you did." With a big smile on his face, Wu Tian 
turned his back to Su Cancan, Liu Yueyao, and the others, and winked at Loong Yun 
with all his might. 

Loong Yun could only sigh. What kind of evil did I suffer? Why did I have to be this bad 
guy in the end? 

But forget it, since things had come to this, Loong Yun had no choice but to listen to his 
request. 

The hostile gazes of both sides fell upon Loong Yun and she immediately felt 
Alexander's presence. 

Wu Tian, on the other hand, took the lead and ran off, leaving the girls hopping around. 

"I almost thought I'd die there." After finally escaping, Wu Tian heaved a sigh of relief. 

Originally, he had thought it would be a good thing. Why did the two of them start acting 
like this the moment they met? 

If a person's eyes could kill, then that place would have already become a battlefield. 

"Isn't the Shura Field just like that? What's there to be surprised about?" Loong Yun still 
had that calm expression on her face, as if she had long been an expert in this kind of 
thing. 



"Let's not talk about this for now. I don't have time to play around with them, so I might 
as well get back to business." 

Wu Tian sighed, and hurriedly tidied up his clothes. According to the agreement that he 
made, Wu Tian was going to go see the school principals of S City. 

He had made an appointment early in the morning. Previously, Wu Tian had wasted all 
of his efforts to gather talents, but the result was still not very good. 

Thus, he shifted his attention to the university. 

He had directly trained the talent he needed from the source. 
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Basically, this was the only way to solve this problem. 

There were many universities in S City. Some were relatively better, but there were also 
some that were relatively worse. 

This difference between good and bad refers to their hardware, not their teaching level. 

As for the ability of a student, it was a mix of good and bad. 

"They are already waiting in the conference room." Loong Yun had long since arranged 
this matter. 

"Have you given them any fruits or snacks? Arrange a massage or hot spring or 
something like that." 

Wu Tian quickly added, "These principals are very important, we must leave a good 
impression on them." 

"Are we going to do these things?" Loong Yun was a little surprised. Why did this feel 
like Wu Tian wanted to bribe them? Wu Tian was actually treating them to a hot spring 
… 

Wu Tian nodded, "Don't think too much into it. Just do as I say." 

As the two of them were talking, they also arrived at the meeting room. 



At this time, the principals were seated around a large round table. They were chatting 
and it seemed very lively. Basically, it was not easy to gather so many principals 
together. 

"Hello fellow principals, I'm really sorry that I came a little too late." Wu Tian hurriedly 
said politely, even though he wasn't late at all. 

"President Wu is too polite. You said ten o'clock, but it's only 9: 50." Of course, the 
principals were straightforward too. They were all research workers, so they did not pay 
too much attention to etiquette. 

"Alright, let's start now, I won't beat around the bush. This time our Wu Group Company 
needs a large number of people with high technology skills, so I hope to be able to work 
together with the university." Wu Tian went straight to the point. If this thing worked out 
well, it would be a good thing for both sides. 

The school hoped that their students could get good jobs as soon as they graduated, 
and Wu Tian hoped that he could get good employees. These professors obviously 
hoped that they could do some research and produce some results in some key areas. 

"You're being too polite, Wu Group Corporation is now a famous company in the entire 
country, you must already have a lot of outstanding employees." Actually, not only did 
some principals think this way, even some capable people felt that they did not dare to 
imagine being able to join Wu Group company. 

Wu Tian's face immediately revealed a troubled expression. They weren't him, so they 
didn't know the difficulties he was facing. 

"You may not know this, but the major recruitment websites are all refusing to cooperate 
with our company. We have no way to post our recruitment information online. As for 
the reason behind this, even if I didn't say it, everyone would probably understand. 
Therefore, I wanted to start nurturing some students from school, so that they would 
come here to work as soon as they graduated. " 

Hearing Wu Tian's words, many of the principals slightly nodded their heads. This 
request was not too much, and it was also the wish of many universities. 

However, there were also those who were unwilling. 

For example, the Principal of Southern City University. He had been frowning the entire 
time. 

"President Wu, I have to mention something. Although you want our students, but the 
knowledge we teach them is general knowledge. Their abilities should be unable to 
match the things you do for the time being." 



What this South City University Principal said was the truth, because the thing he had to 
do was, one of them was space, which was a high-end knowledge that ordinary 
universities would not be able to provide. There was also the virtual currency, which 
required financial knowledge, as well as expertise in computers and the internet. 

"Of course I know about this, so I have a suggestion for everyone this time." 

Wu Tian was already prepared. He nodded towards Loong Yun. Loong Yun turned on 
the projector in the meeting room and displayed a planned real estate project on it. 

"Attention, everyone. Our company has decided to build a talent reserve institute here. 
On one hand, it is to do some research in science and technology. On the other hand, it 
is to provide pre-service training for the students." The scale of this project wasn't very 
small, and its geographical location was considered to be in the middle of each 
university in S City. So basically, the distance to any place was about the same. 

"You want to use us to build a school district here?" Some of the principals immediately 
frowned. No matter how they saw it, this project seemed to be very commercial. 

"You misunderstood me. This institute is my future talent storage." Of course, Wu Tian 
denied it, but it was impossible to say that this project did not have any business 
components. 

"Of course, I won't let all of you train the students for free. This institute will set up some 
laboratories in the future. If the professors from each university are willing to come here 
to conduct research, we won't charge any fees." 

Wu Tian gave them an olive branch at the right time. This news was very attractive to 
some schools. 

Lab construction was very important to every school, but the cost of construction was 
very high, so most schools didn't have enough laboratories. 

Many professors could only queue up or think of ways to do their own experiments. 

However, the school still did not care about this matter that much. For example, this 
Southern City University. 

"Do you want to use this method to get our school's professor to leave the school? I'm 
sorry, but I can't agree to this matter." The expression of the Principal of Southern City 
University began to become somewhat unhappy. 

After all, he would not give up on his professor, because the things in the laboratory 
were all confidential. If this information were to be leaked, it would be the work of others. 



"You think too much. We had no intention of doing so. But I understand your concern. 
Our Wu Group company has only made one proposal this time. If you are unable to 
accept it right now, then it doesn't matter, you can just wait and see. " Wu Tian said with 
a smile. He didn't seem to be angry at all. 

Although the Principal of Southern City University did not agree, many people did. 

In the future, as long as his research institute was successful, the principal would 
definitely change his attitude. 

He had to ask for the right to join. His isolation was the end of his career. 
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This time, Wu Tian's preparation could be said to be very thorough. He even completed 
the construction documents for the institute. 

Loong Yun gave everyone a copy of the document. 

Just this alone was not enough, so Wu Tian had even prepared a trump card. 

"If your students can successfully enter Wu Group Company and take jobs, we will set 
up a fund in your school, and each student will receive ten thousand dollars." 

Wu Tian smiled as he looked at the principals of these schools. It was important to know 
that none of them didn't wish for their money to increase. 

Only if the school had the money would they be able to make some scientific research 
achievements. Only then would they be able to get more students to come to the 
school. 

The more grants and donations the school could receive, the more it could be said to be 
a cycle. 

However, most of the schools present did not do very well, because the first key to 
activate it had never been found. 

Since no one had invested in them in the first stage, the cycle after that naturally did not 
exist either. 

"10,000 yuan?" Many of the principals were already muttering to themselves. If what Wu 
Tian said was true, then it would be more suitable for universities like theirs. 



10,000 yuan per person, that would mean that as long as there were 100 people, that 
would be a million yuan. 

With so much money, you can buy some better equipment, and the school can have 
better development. 

"Sign, of course we'll sign." Several of the principals could no longer care about that. 
They signed their names on their documents. 

The president of the Southern City University looked at the other principals. They looked 
at each other with eyes full of worry. 

To be honest, they didn't think much of it, but of course, they weren't really in need of 
money. 

Therefore, it can develop very well without Wu Tian's support. 

They even somewhat disliked this condition. 

"President Wu, that's not good. After all, we are still university, a lofty institution. How 
can we be linked with the business in such a serious manner? If this gets out, the 
students will say that we work specifically for the business." 

The President of the Southern City University did not sound friendly, but what he said 
was not without reason. 

This was a risk that Wu Tian had to face this time. 

"I know. There is indeed such a risk, so I hope that you all will think it over carefully. Do 
you all want to participate in this matter?" 

Wu Tian wasn't in a hurry. He slowly came over. In any case, this was something that 
the person he wanted to take the bait on. 

When some people truly gained benefits from this matter, the remaining people would 
naturally charge forward like hungry wolves. 

It was just like a bank. Other than charity, there was basically no other bank that wished 
to lend money to those who truly needed it. Their method of doing so would always be 
superfluous. 

These university principals were the same. If they weren't really forced into a corner, 
they probably wouldn't choose to join Wu Tian's plan. 

The principal who signed the documents with Wu Tian was only one of the five 
universities. 



This number was less than a third of the number of university principals present at the 
scene. 

One must know that S City was probably the city with the largest number of students in 
China University. This number was much less than Wu Tian had expected. 

The meeting went on for a long time, but some of the principals left early. 

"Ladies and gentlemen, you are all interested in my plan. If possible, I would like to 
invite you all for a meal. Consider it as us communicating a little more with each other." 

Wu Tian looked at the principals that signed the contract with him and invited them over. 

"Um, President Wu, I'm really sorry. I'm going back now. There are still a lot of things in 
the school, and we principals can't just hang out outside." 

What Wu Tian didn't expect was that all the principals actually chose to refuse. 

"This... You guys really don't need to be courteous to me. " Wu Tian felt that they might 
be embarrassed. After all, they were only in the academic field, so it was normal for 
them to not be very good at it. 

"No, we really can't socialize outside. Our biggest hope is that your plan can be 
implemented as soon as possible." This was the real deal. To the principals, everything 
else was useless. 

"Rest assured, I will definitely do this. If nothing unexpected happens, these projects will 
already be completed. "As long as the scale increases, we might be able to build a 
research city there." 

Wu Tian said confidently, but he still sent the principals out of the door. 

He could not help but sigh with emotion. Indeed, those who truly wanted to do good 
things were usually those who did not fare well. 

The conversation ended here. After Wu Tian went back, he didn't have the time to enter 
his office. 

He was dragged away by Su Cancan. 

"I caught you, why didn't you listen to me just now?!" Su Cancan's ferocious look made 
Wu Tian feel guilty. 

"You know about the situation then. If I didn't run, then it would have been troublesome." 
Wu Tian felt wronged, because he really shouldn't blame it all on himself. 



"Alright, follow me. What's the situation over there? Go ahead and make a decision." Su 
Cancan said coldly as she walked in front. 

Wu Tian immediately reacted, it seemed to be true, they caught Wu Yingqiu and Zheng 
Taiwen earlier. 

The two of them had to think of a way to deal with the situation. Otherwise, leaving them 
be wasn't an option either. 

Since both of them were powerful warriors, in order to ensure that they didn't escape, 
Su Cancan locked them up in the small dark room. She sent guards to guard them 24 
hours a day and kept them in a powerless state. 

Even so, Su Cancan was still a little worried and she didn't dare to leave for too long. 

When he walked in, he saw that Wu Yingqiu and Zheng Taiwen were tied up like 
dumplings. This alone was not enough, there was a thick layer of cages outside. 

The steel bar on it was almost as thick as Wu Tian's arm. 

Even so, she was still worried. There was even a layer of transparent bulletproof glass 
on the outermost layer of the cage. 

"If you don't know, you must be suspecting whether you have an alien locked up inside." 
Wu Tian almost burst out laughing. This Su Cancan didn't expect her to be so timid. 

"It won't do if I don't do that. It'll be troublesome if they run out." Even if she was 
ridiculed by others, Su Cancan did not want to take a step back in this matter. 

Wu Yingqiu's head, which had been lowered, slowly lifted when she heard the two of 
them talking. 

"Why didn't you kill me …" Her voice was very weak, as if she could die at any moment. 

"Why should I kill you?" Wu Tian asked back. He never thought about killing Su 
Cancan. 

 


