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C841 Explosive Events 

Wu Tian swallowed his saliva and took a deep breath. 

Since he was already here, he had no other choice. He had to complete this task. 

"Good evening everyone …" 

He had just mentally prepared himself, but Wu Tian immediately said the wrong thing … 

"Just kidding. People like me have meetings every day. How could I possibly be afraid?" 

Wu Tian realized this and immediately started teasing himself. On the contrary, he 
made the people below laugh. 

"I've invited everyone here to announce a very important matter!" Wu Tian cleared his 
throat. The surrounding lights also went out at this moment, leaving only Wu Tian's 
spotlight. 

"Everyone probably hasn't received any news yet. Now, I want to tell you all an 
explosive piece of news!" 

Just as he was speaking, a loud explosion came from another direction and the scene 
suddenly became filled with screams. 

Wu Tian was stunned on the spot. What's going on? Just as he said the explosive 
news, the scene exploded? 

"Amazing, as expected of the Wu Group Corporation, even the press conference is so 
cool!" 

"That's right, this explosion looks very real. I was really shocked just now …" 

For some unknown reason, the people below were not frightened by this matter. 
Instead, they all started to cheer and cheer, and even clapped. 

Wu Tian looked nervously towards the backstage. He saw Loong Yun gesticulating at 
him, telling him not to worry about what was happening outside. 

Su Cancan and the rest had already rushed over to deal with the situation, so it was 
better if he continued holding the press conference. 

He watched as everyone worked so hard. If this press conference was interrupted by a 
terrorist attack, it wouldn't be worth it. 



Wu Tian gritted his teeth and continued explaining. 

"I believe everyone should know about this fanhua device that Shuangxing Company 
Corporation previously introduced. This is indeed a revolutionary invention. It's just that 
this price is too expensive, so our Wu Group company hopes for everyone to 
experience this kind of future gaming style, and also a brand-new way of life … " 

Wu Tian raised his cup and took a sip of water, lifting the audience's appetite to a high 
level. 

"That's why we developed a brand-new brainwave game device — — Kaleidoscope!" 

As he said that, the spotlight landed on a display stand beside Wu Tian, exposing the 
Kaleidoscope to the public for the first time. 

"Its performance is definitely reliable, and its experience is definitely top-notch! The 
price is definitely to the satisfaction of everyone! " 

The price of this thing was only three thousand yuan, which was the price of a phone. 

To be honest, Wu Tian basically did not make money selling this Kaleidoscope. 

In order to gain market share, he could not focus too much on profits. As long as he 
could nurture a large number of users, he would naturally be able to reap the benefits 
later on. 

The press conference was not the end. The most exciting thing had yet to happen. 

This was also Wu Tian's most detailed point. 

"This time, we will also randomly bestow upon us the game our Wu Group company has 
developed, the Strange World! Anyone who buys our first product can get this game for 
free and enjoy the game world with the gamers of the entire country and even the entire 
world! " 

After finishing the introductions, Wu Tian hurried off the stage. As for the rest of the 
matters, he dragged Wu Zaibin up and told him to continue explaining them to the 
masses. 

Loong Yun knew what Wu Tian wanted to do. When she saw him come down, she first 
brought him something and then brought him to change into a black suit. 

This dress is also the latest product. This piece of clothing was barely reflecting in the 
dark – it was very hard to find any traces of it. 



"What happened just now?" Is it Tianying Sect? " Wu Tian's face was grave. Even now, 
people of Tianying Sect were unwilling to show their heads, yet they still used this kind 
of method to harass him. It was truly annoying. 

"Director Su and the others are currently investigating, so we don't know the reason 
right now." 

Loong Yun didn't have much information either. It was just that this matter happened too 
suddenly and nobody knew what was going on. 

When he arrived at the scene of the explosion, he found that the place they had blown 
up was a garden of Wu Castle, which had just been refurbished. 

It was already a mess, but luckily there were no casualties. No one was nearby when 
the explosion took place. 

"How is it?" 

Wu Tian quickly ran over and asked Su Cancan. 

"I checked the monitor but did not find anyone. I suspect that this is a timed bomb... " 

No one appeared to indicate that the bomb had not been placed here just now — it had 
been set up in advance. 

"Oh my god, then do we still have bombs in other parts of this courtyard?" 

Wu Tian immediately started to doubt it. Since the enemies could place bombs in the 
garden, logically speaking, they should be able to place them in other places as well. 

It was fortunate that they didn't set up the bomb at the press conference, otherwise, 
many people would have died along with Wu Tian … 

"We are in the middle of an investigation. Let's not enter any rooms for the time being 
and wait until the investigation is complete." 

Su Cancan and the others were still working efficiently, and many people with Security 
Team were already dressed in mine clearance equipment as they scanned every nook 
and cranny. 

The press conference was still in a heated state, and quite a few trucks had come to 
deliver goods. Everyone in the media who attended the event was given a 
Kaleidoscope. 

This is one of the simplest ways of promoting it. 



By doing so, he could easily get them to write a lot of articles for him. 

Whether it was good or bad, as long as everyone knew that such a thing existed, there 
was no need to worry about the sales. 

Sunn Hongsheng also participated in the investigation. When the sun was about to rise, 
he finally found some clues. 

They were using all of the S City's surveillance videos to search for the person from the 
Wu Family who had committed suicide back then — They had actually found some 
clues. 

"You are all here, just in time, look and see if this person is the one who attacked us 
earlier." 

Sunn Hongsheng brought a few photos, which showed the person from Wu Family 
walking on the street. The few photos in front were all very normal. 

There was only one photo that seemed a little abnormal, because when that person 
from Wu Family was standing by the side of the road, a person dressed in black was 
currently walking towards him. 

Wu Tian knew the look in the eyes of this man in black, he had seen it on Wu Yingqiu 
and Zheng Taiwen. 

He was definitely someone from the Tianying Sect! 
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C842 Take the Initiative 

Wu Tian arrived at this conclusion without any hesitation. 

He just didn't point it out in front of Sunn Hongsheng. 

"How about this, give me these photos, I'll go ask my people if they know him." 

Wu Tian asked for these photos with just a few words. 

Sunn Hongsheng didn't have anything to be suspicious about, so he casually stuffed it 
into Wu Tian's hands. He quickly ran to the location of the explosion and prepared to 
investigate it together. 

Wu Tian waved at Loong Yun and the others with the photos and led them back to the 
room. 



He gave Loong Yun the photo he had noticed and told her to deal with it as soon as 
possible. 

"This person must have made contact with him before. If there's no doubt, this man in 
black must be someone from Tianying Sect." 

Wu Tian swore solemnly. He was beginning to have some new ideas. 

"We will investigate now! And then, what's the use of knowing a person's identity? " 

Su Cancan was a little puzzled. They basically wanted to carry out defense at the 
current stage. 

The other side hadn't shown up at all, so it would be very disadvantageous for them to 
keep fighting guerrilla warfare. 

"F * ck, f * ck him, since these Tianying Sect people aren't coming out, then we'll take 
the initiative to find out their positions!" Wu Tian waved his fist and said while clenching 
his teeth. 

His patience had already been worn out by these people. Compared to his current 
passive state, he might as well take the initiative. 

"I found it!" Loong Yun's voice immediately sounded from somewhere else. She was 
very excited as she jogged over. 

"I checked the monitoring system for the S City and found out that the last place this 
person appeared in was here!" 

Loong Yun pointed at an area on the map. This place was a chemical factory, so it was 
easy to produce some explosives here. 

If nothing unexpected happened, this place would probably be the hiding place for these 
Tianying Sect! 

"Can our people leave now?" Wu Tian stared at Su Cancan with burning eyes. This 
mission could be said to be very crucial, he had to ensure that there were no mistakes. 

Su Cancan didn't say anything. Instead, she just turned on her walkie-talkie silently. 

"Please take note of the Security Team. Go to the open area in front of the castle and 
gather all our equipment!" 

She had already proven her attitude with her own actions. 



Wu Tian nodded in satisfaction and then turned around to look at Loong Yun, "Arrange 
a car for me!" 

"President Wu, you can't go!" 

Loong Yun was straightforward. She didn't even raise her head. 

"Why? How can I not go? " 

Of course, Wu Tian didn't want to give in like this. 

However, Loong Yun did not intend to back down either. 

"Your back is still injured, so you can't participate in the battle!" 

If Loong Yun hadn't said so, Wu Tian would have almost forgotten about the wound on 
his back. 

At this moment, he couldn't help but to mention that Loong Zaian's treatment method 
was too powerful. Until now, Wu Tian still didn't feel any pain. 

He waved his arm and even jumped a few times. He felt that his body was in good 
condition. 

"It's fine. I will be leading from nearby. I promise not to get involved. If you are worried, 
you can follow me." If you don't agree, I'll drive there myself, so what do you think you 
can do? " 

Wu Tian kicked the ball back to Loong Yun. This was indeed making things difficult for 
her. If she didn't agree, or if Wu Tian acted recklessly and something happened to him, 
no one would know. 

After some thought, Loong Yun finally agreed to Wu Tian's request. 

"Fine, but you have to guarantee that you won't join the battle." When Loong Yun said 
this, she was slightly skeptical. 

Seeing Loong Yun let go, Wu Tian smirked. He then secretly took a set of exoskeleton 
Battle Mecha that was equipped by everybody with Security Team and placed it in the 
trunk of the car before Loong Yun came out. 

The convoy was quickly ready, and stealthily set off under cover of the night. Just like a 
poisonous snake waiting for the right opportunity in the dark night, he directly pounced 
towards the group of people with Tianying Sect. 



"Can we tell how many people they have?" Wu Tian was already getting excited while 
driving this car. 

A fight was about to break out, and even his heart was starting to thump loudly. 

"I'm not sure yet, but what I'm sure of right now is that there are about 20 people inside 
this factory." 

Loong Yun relied on the surveillance cameras nearby to make some guesses. Being 
able to come up with such a conjecture was already the limit of what she could do under 
such circumstances. 

The rest could only be determined after they reached that place. 

The team had only traveled for half an hour and they had already reached the factory 
area. 

In order to not attract attention, the caravan began to disperse from a very far distance 
away. Most of the Security Team practitioners were from the army, so their movements 
and arrangements were very standard. 

A few people and a small group quickly seized some of the nearby high points. 

This time, they seemed to be carrying the latest model of a weapon, a sniper rifle 
crossbow. Although the ammunition used was still the kind that did not have any killing 
effect, the power of the crossbow was still not to be underestimated. 

As long as they hit from such a distance, they would definitely be unable to get up. 
Then, they would be electrocuted and faint. 

There was no doubt about that. 

Su Cancan and Wu Tian were in an alley opposite the factory, looking inside with 
binoculars. 

Loong Yun simply took out an infrared observation device and clearly saw what was 
going on inside. 

"There are less than 30 people inside, most of them are probably resting in this room of 
the factory. There are three people patrolling at the gate, two on the roof and two at the 
back. " 

The other side's deployment was exposed in front of Wu Tian and the others without 
any concealment. 



"What are you going to do?" Wu Tian looked at Su Cancan. Security Team was 
something she had trained herself, so she should be clear about how to make use of it. 

"That depends on you. Do you want to cause a big commotion or do you want to cause 
a small commotion?" 

Su Cancan gave Wu Tian an option, it seemed like she could do both. 

"What do you say?" Wu Tian was confused. 

"A lot of noise can be heard. I'll have someone set up a few bombs. They are very 
skilled and can guarantee that they will only blow up this factory and not spread to other 
places." 

Su Cancan said indifferently, but was immediately denied by Wu Tian. 

"How can that be? When the time comes, the police will be even more suspicious. If it 
involves us, it will be very troublesome." 

"Then do something small and capture them all!" As she spoke, Su Cancan waved her 
hand towards the distance. The two patrolling men on the rooftop in the distance 
suddenly fell to the ground at the same time. 
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It happened so suddenly that Wu Tian couldn't believe it. 

Just as the two of them were about to fall, two Security Team people stood on one side 
and supported them. 

The whole process could be said to be as smooth as the moving clouds and flowing 
water. Not even a single sound could be heard. 

"Incredible." Wu Tian immediately gave a thumbs up. He had to be convinced that they 
were really that powerful. 

It seems that these Security Team guys still have some skills. 

Soon after, there were already a dozen or so people climbing up the walls of the factory. 
Instead of alerting the sentry at the door, they went up to the roof. 

This angle could be said to be very tricky and ordinary people would definitely not think 
of it. 



Since there was no response from the sentry at the door, the people inside would not 
suspect anything. 

Although Wu Tian couldn't get close to watch, Loong Yun's infrared camera could 
clearly display what was happening inside through the screen. 

Su Cancan was also staring intently at the screen, watching the scenes transmitted by 
the cameras the Security Team users brought with them. She could direct them from 
here through the walkie-talkie. 

The situation inside was a mess. There were chemical ingredients everywhere, and the 
quantity was huge. 

There were even plastic jars on the ground, with holes sealed in them. It seemed to be 
a finished explosive package. 

Wu Tian looked at these things and immediately recalled when he was at the door. That 
person from the Wu Family had these jars tied to his body. 

It seemed like they really did have connections. 

The situation seemed to be progressing smoothly. At this time, a dozen or so Security 
Team practitioners had already infiltrated, silently capturing a dozen or so people. 

Most of them were asleep, and some of them were still talking, but they were easily 
knocked down by the crossbow bolts. 

Just when everyone thought that things would continue like this, all of a sudden, the 
lights in the factory suddenly lit up. 

Wu Tian immediately exclaimed, this is bad. 

Su Cancan was even faster than Wu Tian. Her own strength was already very strong, 
and now that she was still wearing the exoskeleton, she had completely exceeded the 
limits of a human's body. 

With a slight jump, she crossed a street, which could be said to have widened Wu Tian's 
horizons. 

The Security Team users in the workshop also reacted very quickly. Although they had 
fallen into the enemy's trap, the crossbow arrows in their hands were extremely 
accurate. 

The dozen men formed a circle, shooting at the approaching attackers. 



Even though the people from the Tianying Sect all had some abilities, they were still 
unable to resist these high-tech weapons. 

After all, no one would specialize in cultivating how to resist an electric shock. 

With just two flashes, Su Cancan had already rushed to the entrance of the factory. 

However, there were two people standing by the door, blocking Su Cancan's path like 
two tigers eyeing their prey. 

"I've been waiting for you guys for a long time. You've finally come." A voice filled with 
energy came out from the depths of the factory. Wu Tian immediately frowned. 

This voice must be the Tianying Sect's Sect Leader! 

Wu Tian couldn't care about that anymore, he took out the exoskeleton he prepared 
from the trunk. 

He quickly put it on. However, Wu Tian didn't head directly towards the factory. Instead, 
he went around to the back. 

Loong Yun stared at Wu Tian coldly without saying a word. 

Wu Tian didn't dare to look into Loong Yun's eyes. He had clearly agreed to it when he 
came, but it had only been a short while and he had already given up on his promise. 

But he couldn't just leave Su Cancan and the others alone either. Wu Tian couldn't 
watch those Security Team members become prey for Tianying Sect. 

The battle at the door was extremely intense. Although Su Cancan was alone, the 
improvement brought by the exoskeleton on her could be said to be a qualitative leap. 

Before the two of them could understand what was going on, Su Cancan had already 
rushed in front of them. With a punch and a kick, the two guards fell to the ground. 

They couldn't get up immediately. 

Su Cancan didn't have the time to care about the two of them and rushed inside. 

In the workshop, although the Security Team were surrounded, their defense was 
impregnable. For a moment, those people with Tianying Sect were unable to do 
anything. 

Just as Su Cancan was about to break through the door, a muscular man walked out 
from the shadows. 



His entire body was covered in firm muscles. The muscles on his face made him look 
extremely strong. When he stood up, he was at least two meters tall. He looked just like 
a humanoid tank. 

This person twisted his neck, releasing creaking sounds, and then, step by step, he 
walked towards Security Team. 

The team members immediately realized that this person was the greatest threat to 
them, so they aimed their crossbows at the burly man. 

Although the crossbow bolts continued to shoot out, the moment they hit the brawny 
man's body, it was like scratching an itch and there was no reaction at all. 

It only stopped him for a moment. 

The robust man emitted a powerful pressure, instantly making the people from the 
Security Team understand that they couldn't defeat this person just by relying on 
themselves, so they too were straightforward and directly chose to retreat. 

However, since they wanted to leave, the other party did not want to let them go. 

Immediately, everyone from the Tianying Sect rushed up and attacked them like a 
swarm of bees. 

Their speed and strength were originally stronger than the average person's, and their 
Security Team were in complete disarray. 

Fortunately, all of these members were wearing exoskeleton s, so they did not sustain 
any serious injuries. 

"All of you, retreat!" At this moment, Su Cancan's voice came from behind. 

However, what came faster than her voice were the two smoke bombs. 

Within two to three seconds, the entire factory was shrouded in a thick layer of smoke. 
Adding to the darkness of the night, it was almost impossible to see one's hand in front 
of one's eyes. 

At this time, the Security Team Enforcers quickly supported each other and ran outside 
with all their might. 

Su Cancan helped them gain some time. The Smoke Bomb was not an ordinary item, it 
had the unique effect of being anesthetized by Wudu Sect. 

If a person was unprepared and were to inhale in, they would lose all their strength in 
less than a minute. 



However, the people from the Tianying Sect were naturally well-informed, and the 
moment they saw the smoke, they immediately covered their own noses. 

When Security Team had just rushed out, Su Cancan saw that she was planning to 
follow closely after him. 

Who would have thought that at this time, a huge gate would suddenly fall down, 
completely sealing off the entrance. 

Su Cancan was only a second or two away from leaving. 

 


