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Chapter 1399

Ke Qi frowned. He was very disgusted with George Han’s attitude. Even a true master
shouldn’t be arrogant and boundless, and George Han is only a child, shouldn’t he have
a heart of awe? ?

“Little friend, your attitude will pay a heavy price sooner or later. As someone who has
passed by, I would advise you that there are mountains outside the mountains, and
there are people outside the world. In this world, there are many people who are better
than you.” Ke Qi said coldly. Said.

George Han knew that his attitude caused Ke Qi’s dissatisfaction, but for him, it was a
matter of course.

For George Han, there is no such thing as a mountain outside the mountain, and
someone outside the person.

On the earth, George Han’s strength is the representative of the peak, because the
realm he possesses is no longer the realm that mortals on earth can reach, even in the
world of Xuanyuan, George Han is also the strongest!

“I can also tell you that in this world, no one can be better than me, even the old Yi Lao
and He Qingfeng from the Four Gates and Three Halls of the Apocalypse.” George Han
said indifferently.

When George Han said the Four Gates and Three Halls of the Apocalypse, Yi Lao and
He Qingfeng, Ke Qi’s expression changed significantly.

How could this little guy have such a deep understanding of Tianqi? How could he even
know Yi Lao and He Qingfeng.

Seeing the change in Keqi’s expression, George Han smiled on his face. He actually
said that on purpose, just to see Keqi’s reaction.

Judging from Keqi’s reaction, it seems that he also knows these things, which can
explain Keqi’s identity.

He is a man of apocalypse, and it is precisely because of a man of apocalypse that he
has more powerful methods than ordinary people.

I just don’t know why he went to live in seclusion in places like Tongyang County. Why
did he break away from the Apocalypse?

“It seems that you are also a person of apocalypse.” George Han said.



Ke Qi looked at Xiao Guan and Mo Yang.

The secret of Apocalypse cannot be disclosed to the worldly people at any time.
Although Ke Qi has left the Apocalypse now, he will always remember this taboo.

“Please follow me.” Ke Qi said to George Han.

The two walked to a no-man’s land, and at such a distance, Xiao Guan and Mo Yang
couldn’t hear their conversation.

This made Xiao Guan feel a little inexplicable. How could this old man suddenly change
his attitude towards George Han? He was very disgusted with George Han’s arrogance
just now.

“You brother, who is it?” Xiao Guan asked Mo Yang.

Mo Yang doesn’t know who is, but George Han’s strength can already be called a god in
Mo Yang’s eyes.

“For the enemy, he is an absolute devil, but for friends, I think he should be an angel.”
Mo Yang said with a smile, this is the most appropriate description he can think of,
because George Han’s strength is right. For his enemies, it was definitely a nightmare.

“Is he really that powerful?” Xiao Guan asked in confusion.

“Xiao Guan, don’t say I didn’t persuade you to offend him, there is only one dead end,
no matter where this is, no matter who you are, it makes no difference to him.” Mo Yang
smiled.

In front of George Han, there is no difference between a snake and a dragon. If anyone
dares to make trouble for him, there is only one dead end. There is no dragon and
snake.

Xiao Guan was very suspicious of Mo Yang’s remarks, but seeing Mo Yang’s
confidence, he couldn’t help feeling a little nervous, his eyelids jumped.

If George Han was really as strong as Mo Yang said, it would definitely be a big trouble
for the Xiao family.

Although this is Tongyang County, and it is also the site of the Xiao family, he can call in
many helpers, but before these helpers come, he has no ability to compete with George
Han.

After Ke Qi called George Han aside, he asked George Han, “Why do you know
Apocalypse so much? Are you also a man of Apocalypse?”

George Han shook his head and said, “I am not a person from the apocalypse, but Yi
Lao, he has to call me Uncle Master.”



This is not what George Han said casually. Although he had fabricated a bizarre story to
convince Yi Lao, the title of Master Uncle was indeed shouted from Yi Lao.

Ke Qi looked at George Han in shock, Uncle Shane!

Yi Lao called him Uncle Master, how could this be possible? He was just a child, so how
could he come from such a seniority?

And now Tianqi, Yi Lao is one of the masters of the house. In Tian Qi, even He Qingfeng
can only sit on an equal footing with him. Who can have Yi Lao’s seniority.

“What are you kidding me? How could Yi Lao call you Uncle Master?” Ke Qi said
sharply.

“You are also a man of apocalypse, although I don’t know why you lived in Tongyang
County for what reason, but if you have questions about my identity, you can ask Yi Lao,
I believe he will give you a correct answer “George Han said.

Ke Qi is indeed a person of Tianqi. The reason he left Tianqi is that as one of the top ten
masters of Tianqi, he has almost dedicated his life to Tianqi. At the end of his life, Keqi
wants to feel some real ordinary life, so Will choose to leave.

Moreover, Ke Qi’s departure from Apocalypse was approved and blessed by Yi Lao and
He Qingfeng, which is enough to show how high Ke Qi’s position in Apocalypse is.

But he had never heard of George Han, and he had never heard of the fact that Yi Lao
had a master uncle.

“I will not go to Apocalypse, nor will I seek to verify this answer. As for whether what you
said is true or false, I don’t care, as long as you don’t make trouble in Tongyang
County.” Ke Qi said.

“It seems that you intend to intervene in the affairs of the Xiao family.” George Han said
lightly.

Ke Qi took a deep breath and said slowly: “I came to Tongyang County to have a quiet
old age, and Xiao Guan can guarantee this to me, so I won’t let you mess around.”

“Even Yi Lao has to call me Uncle Master, do you think you can stop me?” George Han
said.

Ke Qi sneered and said: “You don’t think I really believe your nonsense, do you?
Although I don’t know how you understand the message of the Apocalypse, I know how
ridiculous the Arabian Nights you are talking about. “

“Is it ridiculous?” George Han shrugged helplessly, and said, “Since you think it is
ridiculous, you can try it.”



At the moment when George Han’s voice fell, Ke Qi’s expression instantly turned pale,
and he felt a huge gravity suddenly hit his body, as if he was carrying a thousand
pounds on his back.

boom!

Ke Qi knelt on his knees, unable to support his body, shaking uncontrollably.

George Han stood in front of Ke Qi and said condescendingly: “Even Yi Lao has to call
me Uncle Master, what should you call me?”

Ke Qi looked at George Han in horror. He thought he didn’t need to put George Han in
his eyes at all, but until this moment, he didn’t know the gap between himself and
George Han.

Chapter 1400

The scene of Ke Qi kneeling down also made Xiao Guan extremely shocked.

In Xiao Guan’s heart, Ke Qi is a hidden master. Under his plain surface, he must hide a
very amazing identity. It is for this reason that Xiao Guan dare not trouble Ke Qi, and he
is in Tongyang. The county has also been secretly helping Ke Qi solve some minor
problems.

I thought that the trouble I encountered today could be solved by Ke Qi, but who would
have thought that Ke Qi would kneel in front of George Han.

“You know how powerful he is now. The helper you called can only kneel and beg for
mercy.” Although Mo Yang didn’t know what had happened, Ke Qi knelt down, which
seemed reasonable to him. Things in China, after all, George Han’s level of skill is
beyond ordinary people’s imagination.

Xiao Guan’s heart was a little chilly, Mo Yang was the boss of Basin City, and he was
still a little afraid of this identity.

And he didn’t expect that the identity of the little kid next to Mo Yang seemed to be even
more powerful. Otherwise, how could Ke Qi kneel down?

“Who is he?” Xiao Guan asked tremblingly. He had a hunch that if the Xiao family
provokes this person, he will definitely not end well.

“You don’t have the right to know who he is, but you want to know what will provoke him.
You can try it. I will never stop you.” Mo Yang said.

Xiao Guan didn’t put George Han in his eyes before, but now, he would never dare to
underestimate George Han. After all, Ke Qi would kneel down for him, which already
showed that his identity was not simple.



Once he angered him, it might lead to the destruction of the Xiao family. This was not
something Xiao Guan dared to try easily.

on the other hand.

The power that Keqi can feel is gradually getting stronger, so that even if he kneels, it is
a situation of hard support. He knows that if this power continues to grow stronger, he
can only lie on the ground in the end, and The internal organs in his body will inevitably
explode because he can’t bear the pressure. At that time, he will die very ugly.

“Who are you, how can you have such power?” Ke Qi gritted his teeth and asked
George Han. The release and suppression of this power is impossible in Ke Qi’s view,
even though he was once One of the ten powerhouses of Apocalypse has never met
anyone with such power.

“Do you know why Yi Lao wants to call me Uncle Master?” George Han said lightly.

Ke Qi was sweating cold on his forehead, and his body was almost at the limit of his
tolerance. He was speechless and could only shook his head.

“Because, I’ve been to Xuanyuan World and retreated all over,” George Han said.

For Ke Qi, the name Xuanyuan World was very unfamiliar, because apart from George
Han, no one knew where the space tunnel of the Apocalypse Forbidden Land led.

“By the way, you have never heard of Xuanyuan World, but you should know that there
is a space tunnel in the forbidden place guarded by the top ten masters, and the place
where this space tunnel leads is Xuanyuan World.” George Han was right. Koch
explained.

These words made Ke Qi suddenly look up, looking at George Han in horror.

At this moment, his fear is more than just fear.

He has actually been to another world in the space tunnel, and he can come back from
there!

As one of the top ten powerhouses, Ke Qi is very aware of how many people
Apocalypse has sent into the space tunnel, but no one has ever been able to come out
of it alive, but the child in front of him, he did it, how is this possible!

“I know you don’t really believe what I said because of my age, but more explanations
are not what you are qualified to know. Since I used to be a man of apocalypse, I will not
embarrass you. This matter today, you Don’t interfere, let’s go.”

When George Han’s words fell, the huge strength Ke Qi had endured disappeared
instantly, as if nothing had happened, which made Ke Qi, who was relieved, instantly
paralyzed on the ground.



With cold sweat all over, like rain, Ke Qi, who was almost exhausted, said to George
Han, “I’m sorry, I’m sorry.”

George Han shook his head, did not speak, and walked towards Mo Yang.

Xiao Guan was walking on thin ice, and he didn’t even have the courage to look at
George Han directly. If you look closely, this guy’s body still trembles slightly.

Having been in Tongyang County for so many years, Xiao Guan never felt fear, but at
this moment, he knew he was afraid.

“How about, when will Xiao Fu go home?” George Han asked Xiao Guan.

Xiao Guan trembled all over, and quickly took out his mobile phone and said to George
Han: “Immediately, I will let him go home immediately.”

After speaking, Xiao Guan called Xiao Fu.

Xiao Fu was playing with a group of friends, friends, friends and friends. After receiving
the call from Xiao Guan, Xiao Fu showed a very unhappy expression on his face.

“Dad, I’m busy, can I wait until I get home and talk about it?” Xiao Fu said.

“I want you to go home immediately, immediately, otherwise, I will break all your bank
cards.” Xiao Guan said with gritted teeth.

Usually he can let Xiao Fu go, but today, facing the survival of the Xiao family, Xiao
Guan dare not let Xiao Fu come to chaos.

Upon hearing this sentence, Xiao Fu realized that the matter seemed a bit serious,
otherwise, Xiao Guan would never be able to talk to him like this.

“Dad, what happened?” Xiao Fu asked cautiously.

“Give you ten minutes, let me get home immediately.” Xiao Guan finished speaking and
hung up the phone.

Xiao Fu had an inexplicable expression on his face.

“Xiao Fu, what’s the matter, we are having fun, you won’t be leaving now.”

“Don’t be disappointed, this wine is just the beginning. Once you’re drunk, you won’t
want to run away.”

“If you leave, these two sisters will be so disappointed.”

The two girls hugging left and right immediately looked at Xiao Fu with pity.



“Brother Fu, you can’t go.”

“It’s me, the two of us haven’t had a drink with you.”

Xiao Fu directly pushed the two of them away. Under normal circumstances, he would
definitely not leave, but today is different. Xiao Guan’s attitude is obviously different.
Xiao Fu is worried that he will not go home and his bank cards will be broken. It will be
over in the future.

“I have something to do. You play it first, and then come back when I solve it.” Xiao Fu
said.

“That can be said, we are waiting for you here, if you don’t come back, you will admit it.”

“Go and come back quickly, these two little sisters, we keep them for you, and no one is
allowed to touch them.”

Leaving the clubhouse and on the way home, Xiao Fu seemed a little nervous. After all,
Xiao Guan had never treated him with this attitude, and Xiao Fu had an intuition that
what happened today is probably not easy, but he has not caused trouble recently. I
really can’t figure out why Xiao Guan suddenly came to him.

Chapter 1401

Back home, when Xiao Fu saw George Han and Mo Yang in his living room, his
expression immediately turned gloomy.

He didn’t expect that he hadn’t found time to trouble these two people, but they would
send it to the door automatically.

But Xiao Fu was a little strange, why would they come to the door? Could it be that Xiao
Guan wanted to help him solve this problem?

Thinking of this, Xiao Fu’s mood improved a lot. He thought that Xiao Guan was looking
for him because he got into trouble. Now it seems that this is not the case at all.

“Dad, I didn’t expect you to find them for me. How do you know that I have an enemy
with these two guys?” Xiao Fu asked Xiao Guan with a smile.

Xiao Guan looked at Xiao Fu coldly and found them, revenge?

Isn’t this a f*cking joke?

Xiao Guan’s fear of George Han now far surpasses anything. Let alone revenge, he is
fortunate that George Han can forgive Xiao Fu.

“Kneel down.” Xiao Guan said.



“Yep?”

Xiao Fu was stunned, how could he kneel down in front of outsiders.

And since childhood, Xiao Guanke has never punished him, how could he kneel down
so badly?

“Let you kneel down and sit still.” Soon, Xiao Fu reacted pretentiously. It was impossible
for him to kneel. Naturally, it was for George Han and Mo Yang to kneel down.

When Xiao Fu looked at the two of them proudly, Xiao Guan walked to Xiao Fu furiously,
kicked his butt, and said, “I made you kneel!”

“Dad, what’s the matter with me?” Xiao Fu gave an inexplicable expression.

“What have you done yourself, do you still want me to explain that you can offend these
two people?” Xiao Guan said sharply.

These two?

Looking at Xiao Guan’s attitude, these two guys are not ordinary people?

But in Tongyang County, are there any people the Xiao family dare not offend?

Xiao Fu is also a face-saving person, how could he kneel down in front of his enemy and
still underestimate the enemy?

“Dad, I don’t kneel. This guy robbed me of women. I was not wrong. Why should I kneel
down?” Xiao Fu said.

wrong?

This matter is no longer measured by right or wrong, and who is right or wrong has no
meaning. After all, with the abilities of the Xiao family, George Han can’t be dealt with at
all.

Xiao Guan knew better than anyone, in front of power, there was no distinction between
right and wrong.

Take the people who Xiao Guan had previously oppressed, how did those people miss it,
but in the end, wouldn’t they be forced to death by the Xiao family?

Xiao Guan raised his hand and slapped Xiao Fu’s face heavily, saying, “You don’t even
listen to me? Do you believe it or not I will let you get out of Xiao’s house.”

Xiao Fu was so embarrassed that he, who had never been beaten since he was young,
was beaten in front of outsiders, and he was still so embarrassed.



“Dad, are you hitting me?” Xiao Fu looked at Xiao Guan in surprise.

Xiao Guan raised his hand again, and slapped Xiao Fu’s face without hesitation again,
saying: “If I don’t beat you sober, the entire Xiao family will be killed by you.”

The entire Xiao family?

After Xiao Fu heard these words, he finally noticed something was wrong.

In the past, Xiao Guan would protect the calf no matter what he made, but this time he
didn’t. It means that only when he kicked the iron plate would Xiao Guan react so
drastically.

But, who are these two guys from outside?

At this time, Mo Yang got up from the sofa and said to Xiao Guan, “It’s not necessary to
kneel down. I want him to apologize to Liu Fang and tell Liu Fang that starting today, he
won’t bother Liu Fang anymore.”

Liu Fang is Xiao Fu’s long-time goal, and she is also the only woman Xiao Fu has not
used special means to deal with. Because he wants to enjoy this process of conquering,
it can be said that Liu Fang is Xiao Fu’s most caring woman over the years. , Asking him
to give up now is definitely not what Xiao Fu wants.

But now even his father doesn’t help. Besides giving up, Xiao Fu seems to have no
other choice.

“Did you hear what Boss Mo said? Go and apologize to Liu Fang. Starting today, if you
dare to approach her again, I will never let you go.” Xiao Guan said.

Boss Mo!

This title is familiar to Xiao Fu. Before, Xiao Guan often told him about the situation in
the Dao, including Mo Yang, the boss of Basin City.

Is this boss Mo Yang the boss of Cloud City?

But Xiao Fu was still a little strange, even if he was really Mo Yang, the boss of Basin
City, but Tongyang County here was the Xiao family’s own territory, so he wouldn’t be
so afraid of Mo Yang.

“Dad, I really like Liu Fang. I can compete fairly with him, so why should I withdraw.”
Xiao Fu said with an unconvinced expression.

Mo Yang felt very upset when he heard these words.

fair competition?



In front of him, what competition is there to talk about, and what fairness is there?

“Are you going to compete?” Mo Yang walked to Xiao Fu and asked with a frosty face.

Xiao Fu took a step back subconsciously. Compared with the aura of Mo Yang, Xiao Fu
must be incomparable. Moreover, the murderous intent in Mo Yang’s eyes was formed
after years of walking in the rivers and lakes, not like Xiao Fu. The second generation
can be compared.

“Difficult… Isn’t it possible?” Xiao Fu said tremblingly.

“Of course, I will give you a chance. Is there an underground boxing ring in Tongyang
County?” Mo Yang asked.

Although Xiao Fu didn’t know why Mo Yang asked such a question, there is an
underground boxing ring in Tongyang County, so he nodded subconsciously.

“Go to the ring, fight with me, who loses, who quits, how about?” Mo Yang grinned.

Go to the ring?

Fight with Mo Yang!

Xiao Fu shook his head subconsciously. He was just a person whose body was
hollowed out by alcohol. Why is he compared with Mo Yang, who beats the world with
his fists, and even if there is no comparison, Xiao Fu knows exactly what he will end up
with. .

In the ring, how could he be Mo Yang’s opponent?

“Don’t dare? I’ll give you a chance to compete fairly. You should cherish it. Of course, if
you don’t want to go to the ring, you can do it here.” Mo Yang said.

Xiao Fu stepped back two more steps and opened a certain safe distance from Mo Yang.
He was afraid that Mo Yang would suddenly attack him. The suffering of flesh and blood
was uncomfortable.

“Dad, even if he is Moyang, this is Tongyang County, we don’t need to be afraid of him.”
Xiao Fu said to Xiao Guan.

Xiao Guan was not afraid of Mo Yang, but George Han who could make Ke Qi kneel.
This humble child was the source of Xiao Guan’s fear.

“There is so much nonsense, do what you ask you to do.” Xiao Guan said.

Xiao Fu still looked unconvinced, because he had too many things he couldn’t
understand, and he had always been arrogant and domineering, how could he endure
being wronged?



“Tomorrow before sunset, if you didn’t apologize, I will come again.” Mo Yang said.

Chapter 1402

After Mo Yang and George Han left, Xiao Guan sat on the sofa as if lost his soul.

I have been strained for so long, and I can finally relax, to Xiao Guan, it is like a heavy
load.

“Dad, why are you afraid of Mo Yang, this is our place.” Xiao Fu asked Xiao Guan
suspiciously.

Xiao Guan waved his hand and said, “Do you think it’s Mo Yang that I’m afraid of?”

“Otherwise?” Xiao Fu was even more confused, not afraid of Mo Yang, why would there
be such a performance.

“That kid is the one I’m afraid of.” Xiao Guan explained.

“Why… why?” Xiao Fu didn’t understand even more, a kid, what’s worth fearing.

“You know Ke Qi,” Xiao Guan said.

Xiao Fu nodded and said, “It’s the old man you didn’t let me provoke. I remember you
said that his identity is very difficult and his skills are very powerful. He also said that our
family’s thugs are all added together. None of that old man’s opponent.”

“Yes, I’ve always been in awe of the identity of this old man, but you know that Ke Qi
kneeled down in front of the kid today.” Xiao Guan said with a wry smile, he has never
dared to provoke someone , But would kneel down for a child. Thinking about Xiao
Guan now, it feels ridiculous, and even an unbelievable feeling, but this just shows that
George Han’s identity is even more difficult.

“No!” Xiao Fu showed a look of consternation. How could a child be worthy of Ke Qi
kneeling?

“I saw it with my own eyes. Can there be fakes? So I warn you that I must apologize to
Liu Fang before tomorrow. Otherwise, my Xiao family will be over. You don’t want to be
on the street and be laughed at by those friends. “Xiao Guan said.

For a person like Xiao Fu who is extremely face-conscious, this situation is naturally
something he doesn’t want to see. Even if he just thinks about it, Xiao Fu feels ashamed
to see people.

Compared to everything he owns now, a woman in Liufang’s district is obviously not
important.



“Dad, I know what to do.” Xiao Fu said.

That night, Xiao Fu could not sleep, he really wanted to make Ke Qi kneel down without
who George Han was.

Xiao Fu got up early the next morning. For him, a night owl, this was an unprecedented
situation.

And after getting up, Xiao Fu went out before he could have breakfast. He was worried
that he would miss the time to meet Liu Fang.

Coming downstairs to Liu Fang’s house, Xiao Fu is already very familiar with this place.
He has blocked Liu Fang here more than once. Thinking about it now, he wasted so
much energy for Liu Fang, but he didn’t get any benefits. To give up and apologize to Liu
Fang, Xiao Fu was still somewhat unconvinced.

However, thinking that he might live on the streets as a beggar, or even be laughed at
by former friends, these are not convinced, Xiao Fu can only hide in his heart.

When Liu Fang, who was going to work early in the morning, appeared downstairs,
when she saw Xiao Fu, her good mood was instantly destroyed.

It was not the first time that Xiao Fu was blocked here, but it was the first time that Xiao
Fu appeared so early.

“Dad, Xiao Fu is here again.” Liu Fang said to his father beside him.

Liu Yanjun’s expression is quite complicated. Although the Liu family has a certain
reputation in Tongyang County and its social status is not low, there is still a certain gap
compared with the Xiao family. Faced with Xiao Fu’s stalking, Liu Yanjun is also a bit
different. There is no way, for fear of offending Xiao Fu.

However, as a father, Liu Yanjun did not let Liu Fang agree to Xiao Fu. After all, he knew
what kind of person Xiao Fu was. To let Liu Fang and Xiao Fu be together was to push
Liu Fang into the fire.

“Hey.” Liu Yanjun sighed, really don’t know what to say.

At this time, Xiao Fu stepped forward.

Liu Fang said impatiently: “Xiao Fu, I can’t be with you, can you stop harassing me.”

“I’m sorry.” Xiao Fu said sincerely, lowering his head.

Liu Fang was stunned.

Liu Yanjun was stunned!



This Xiao Fu, shouldn’t he have taken medicine, how could he come to apologize?

“You…what are you doing?” Liu Fang said in a panic.

“I’m here to apologize to you. Starting today, I will not harass you again, please rest
assured.” Xiao Fu said.

Liu Fang felt like she was dreaming.

Xiao Fu apologized to her and would not harass her again.

This is good news, but Liu Fang has an extremely unreal feeling.

When Xiao Fu left, the father and daughter were still stunned, with a dazed expression.

“Daughter, what is going on?” Liu Yanjun asked Liu Fang.

Who is Xiao Fu? He is a notoriously domineering boy. Even if he gave up his pursuit of
Liu Fang, he couldn’t apologize.

Liu Fang shook his head subconsciously and said, “I don’t know either.”

“Tongyang County, is there someone who is more powerful than the Xiao family, so he
will be asked to apologize to you?” Liu Yanjun guessed.

Originally Liu Fang didn’t know what was going on, but Liu Yanjun’s words reminded
her.

Could it be that the person yesterday, he helped himself?

But he was just an outsider, how could he be able to deal with Xiao Fu?

“What’s wrong?” Seeing Liu Fang seemed to think of something, Liu Yanjun asked
curiously.

“Dad, there was someone yesterday, but…but he is just an outsider.” Liu Fang said.

Liu Yanjun looked thoughtful. If Liu Fang said that, he was a foreigner, which further
explained that the foreigner’s identity is amazing. Otherwise, it is impossible for Xiao to
be softened. After all, Tongyang County is the land of the Xiao family. .

“Do you know who it is, what does he want to do?” Liu Yanjun asked.

“I don’t know. Yesterday he went to the cram school and said he was taking his brother’s
counseling course. I don’t know what happened.” Liu Fang said.



In Liu Yanjun’s view, this is definitely not as simple as a counseling course. After all, he
knows very well that his daughter is very attractive to men, and the purpose of the other
party is probably not simple.

But being able to overwhelm the Xiao family is not something Liu Yanjun dared to guess
at will.

“Dad, will the Xiao family really be subdued?” Liu Fang still felt incredible and asked Liu
Yanjun.

“I’m afraid Xiao Guan has already come forward for this matter. Xiao Fu will only
apologize if he can’t solve it. After all, Xiao Guan used to wipe his butt before Xiao Fu
got into trouble.” Liu Yanjun said.

Liu Fang took a deep breath. In that case, that person’s identity was really terrifying, and
Liu Fang had an instinct that he could still see him.

Perhaps, just today!

“Daughter, this person, I am afraid you will also have ideas, be careful, he is more
difficult to deal with than the Xiao family.” Liu Yanjun reminded.
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