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And there was another news that made Lily Jiang even more surprised. Wilson Su
actually stood up in the Su family and was also responsible for a very large project. Now
the future of the entire Su family lies on Wilson Su’s shoulders.

Once a waste.

Hope today.

This kind of change was something Lily Jiang never expected, which caused her a little
worry.

In the past, she was not afraid of quarreling with Wilson Su, and she often flattened
Wilson Su as worthless, because she knew that this waste could only swallow in front of
her.

But now it is different. Wilson Su’s status has changed, which means that he will
become rich, and after a man has money, what kind of woman can’t get it.

Lily Jiang didn’t want to be robbed of other women by the good life she had waited for
most of her life.

Therefore, Lily Jiang went back to Basin City by herself regardless of face.

At the gate of Su’s company, Lily Jiang was stopped by security, because there are too
many people wanting to get a share of the matter in the new city. If they can’t find a way
in Fengqian, they will come to Su’s company to seek cooperation, so Su The company
had to strengthen the screening of people entering the company.

Lily Jiang, who was stopped at the door, was furious. How could she be Wilson Su’s wife,
so how could she be stopped by a security guard?

“Do you know who I am? You dare to stop me.” Lily Jiang shouted at the security guard
with hands on hips.

The security is new. He doesn’t know who Lily Jiang is, but the company has already
spoken. Those who have not made an appointment or have a company work permit are
forbidden to enter. No one is allowed to have privileges, so he just follows the
company’s rules. The system does nothing more.

“This is the company’s regulations. If I let you in, I will lose my job, so don’t make it
difficult for me.” The security guard said to Lily Jiang.



Lily Jiang snorted coldly, and said, “From the moment you stopped me, you have lost
your job. I am Wilson Su’s wife. If you stop me, you are seeking death.”

When the security guard heard this, he was surprised.

This bitch turned out to be President Su’s wife, and she must be over now.

But this is the company’s regulations, and he has done nothing wrong.

Just as the security guard was at a loss, Wilson Su walked out of the company and
planned to go to the new city to see the situation.

Seeing Wilson Su, Lily Jiang immediately walked up to Wilson Su angrily, pointing
angrily at the security guard, and said, “What dog you hired, you didn’t even know me
and stopped me at the door.”

The security guard said to Wilson Su with a look of fear: “Su, I’m sorry, I didn’t know that
she was your wife, I just acted in accordance with the company’s system, she did not
have an appointment, and did not have a company work permit.”

Wilson Su waved his hand and said to the security guard: “Don’t worry, you have done
nothing wrong, and I will not punish you.”

“What do you mean by doing nothing wrong? He stopped me, isn’t it wrong?” Lily Jiang
became even more angry when she heard this. She, who was used to being
domineering in front of Wilson Su, even raised her hand.

The current Wilson Su is not a waste of the past.

He is now the boss of the company, how could he be beaten by a woman in front of
employees?

Grasping Lily Jiang’s wrist, Wilson Su said coldly: “You have no appointment or work
permit. He stopped you, just doing his own duty. Such employees should not only be
punished, but also rewarded.”

Lily Jiang is an extremely face-conscious person. If the security guard is not fired, she
can’t live by her face.

But she didn’t expect Wilson Su to say such a thing.

“Wilson Su, do you really think your wings are hard? Even if I want to see you, I still
need to make an appointment?” Lily Jiang said with a grim expression.

“You?” Wilson Su smiled coldly and said: “Didn’t you have left the Su family, what are
you doing now?”



Lily Jiang once ran away from home, and when Amelia Su was very young, she returned
to her family irresponsibly, resulting in no one to take care of Amelia Su. At that time,
Wilson Su had to ask Lily Jiang to come back. For this reason, Lily Jiang left angrily after
the conflict, because she knew that if Wilson Su begged her once, there would definitely
be a second and third time.

But this time, it was indeed an accident. Amelia Su has grown up and does not need
special care, and Wilson Su is in charge of the company’s core rights, and there is not
so much energy and time wasted on the woman Lily Jiang.

Career has become the most important thing for Wilson Su. As for women, especially
Lily Jiang, this woman is no longer necessary for Wilson Su.

This is not Wilson Su’s abandonment of the chaotic wife, but no longer accustomed to
her arrogance and brutality.

After Lily Jiang heard Wilson Su’s words, her face was pale and said: “Wilson Su, you
are really good, now that you have money, you can leave me out, right?”

“You are right, I don’t need to be bullied by you anymore. If you are more interesting, go
home by yourself and do what your housewife should do.” Wilson Su said.

Lily Jiang’s scalp exploded with anger and told her to go home and do what she was
supposed to do.

What should she do?

In the past, Wilson Su did the laundry, cooking, and mopping. Lily Jiang was like a
young woman who was chasing drama except for playing mahjong.

“Wilson Su, I have been fortunate enough to have been with you for so many years, but
you have treated me like this, do you still have a conscience?” Lily Jiang said.

“Fortunately, suffering?” Wilson Su smiled indifferently, and said: “Lily Jiang, you are
really shameless to say this kind of thing from your mouth. For so many years, what
have you done? You have even the most basic mother responsibility. If you didn’t do it
well, how dare you say that you are lucky?”

Since Amelia Su was born, before the full moon, Lily Jiang has been at the mahjong
table all day long. It can be said that she gave birth to Amelia Su and did not fulfill any
responsibility for taking care of her. Even if Wilson Su is very busy with company affairs,
Lily Jiang will Bringing Amelia Su to the mahjong table doesn’t matter what kind of
impact it will have on Amelia Su.

In Amelia Su’s infant years, Lily Jiang said the most thing is to make her cry, and she fell
asleep when she was tired.



Such a person is indeed not worthy of talking about the word happiness, so Wilson Su
was not unfeeling at this time, but gave Lily Jiang the end she should have.

“I didn’t do anything. Did Amelia Su grow up by himself?” Lily Jiang roared hoarsely.

“Lily Jiang, if you really want to entangle with me here, we will divorce, otherwise, you
should go home quickly.” Wilson Su does not want to entangle with Lily Jiang anymore,
because there are too many family ugliness to mention at the door of the company.

How Amelia Su grew up, only Wilson Su knows.

And even Amelia Su doesn’t have much affection for Lily Jiang, which is enough to show
how much Lily Jiang’s mother role has failed.

Chapter 1420

Hearing the word divorce, Lily Jiang panicked instantly.

Now that Wilson Su has just obtained a position in the company, her good days are
about to come. If you divorce at this time, will all the hardship you have suffered will be
wasted?

Lily Jiang did not want to exchange for such a fate. She also knew in her heart that
naturally she could no longer treat Wilson Su with the same attitude as before, after all,
Wilson Su is now different.

After a while, Lily Jiang said: “I’m going home to cook, you go home early for dinner
today.”

Although this is a very faceless remark, Lily Jiang is willing to be soft in order to live a
rich life in the future. This is her character, although face is important. But for the sake of
money, you can also lose face.

Wilson Su was a little surprised, because he did not expect Lily Jiang to say that. In his
heart, Lily Jiang was an arrogant and domineering vixen, and nothing made sense. Just
take it easy.

And now, Lily Jiang actually swallowed.

Wilson Su did not respond to Lily Jiang. He got in the car directly. He had to rush to the
construction site in the new city to see the situation. As for what Lily Jiang was going to
do, he didn’t care so much.

Lily Jiang has never been to the vegetable market since marrying Wilson Su, and has
never personally cooked. Today is the first time for her, but in order to live a rich life in
the future, Lily Jiang repeatedly reminded herself to Swallowed. As long as you can get
the money, everything is a cloud.



New town area.

The initial wasteland reclamation is already in progress, and countless old factories
have been pushed to it. Although this is still a wilderness, in the next few years, it will
become the economic core of Cloud City and the largest shopping center in the entire
Asia-Pacific region.

In the eyes of others, this is an impossible thing, but as long as George Han said a word,
this is a very simple thing.

All the new luxury products are on sale. Once you get the cloud city, this alone is
enough to attract countless rich women.

When George Han came to the new city, he also happened to meet Wilson Su.

Facing George Han. Wilson Su does not have the slightest posture of the Su family’s
high-level company, and is more like a subordinate, because of the prospects he and Su
family have. It was all given by George Han, and a word from George Han could also
shatter the Su family’s dream.

So anyone can provoke. But only George Han needs the Su family to be careful.

“George, I didn’t expect you to come here to have a look.” Wilson Su said to George
Han with a smile.

“Listening to you is like sarcasm,” George Han said.

“No, no.” Wilson Su waved his hand again and again, and quickly explained: “I didn’t
mean it, I just said that you are very busy and came to inspect your work. It’s really
dedicated.”

Upon hearing this, George Han wanted to laugh. His hand-handling shopkeeper is so
simple, there is no dedication at all.

But what Wilson Su said is very interesting. It seems that he should have guessed
something.

But this is no exception. After all, he is not a fool. It is true that he can provide such a
great help to the Su Family through the relationship of friends, and he will not believe it
for anyone.

“Given your status in the Su family, you don’t need to visit the construction site yourself,
right? Just send someone over and take a look?” George Han said.

“For some things, you still have to personally intervene, just listen to the news. There
are inevitably errors. I don’t want to make the slightest mistake in this matter.” Wilson Su
said.



George Han nodded. Wilson Su finally turned over in Su’s house. He naturally didn’t
want any accidents. After all, it was not easy to come by, he would surely take good care
of it.

“Three thousand. I…I have something I want to verify with you.” Wilson Su said
hesitantly.

George Han smiled, he knew what Wilson Su wanted to ask. So he said one word:
“Yes.”

Wilson Su took a deep breath. As expected, George Han was Fengqian’s
behind-the-scenes boss. Otherwise, how could the Su family easily obtain cooperation?

However, his young age and the energy he possesses is really scary. It is not just a
question of funds, but also world-class luxury goods. This is all handled by George Han.

With Wilson Su’s imagination, it is no longer possible to imagine how powerful George
Han is.

“One more thing, can I ask more?” Wilson Su said again.

This time. George Han still guessed what Wilson Su wanted to ask, but he did not say
the answer, but said: “What is it.”

“This matter is about Amelia Su. You help me because of Amelia Su, isn’t it? You like
her?” Wilson Su said, this matter is to a certain degree of danger to him, because once
George Han denies it, this This feeling has changed.

“It’s not just like that, she will definitely become my wife. Are you satisfied with this
answer?” George Han said with a smile.

Wilson Su was dumbfounded.

He will definitely become his wife. This shows that the relationship between the Su
family and George Han has been firmly fixed, but he can’t figure out how such a young
George Han would consider a woman to be his wife?

If he was replaced by Wilson Su, he was so rich and powerful, and still so young, that he
would not be able to spend the world.

With a large forest in front of us, who is willing to give up for a tree?

Chapter 1421

In the middle of the night two days later, the alert George Han suddenly opened his eyes
in his sleep, with a faint smile on the corner of his mouth, and after getting dressed
calmly, he sat on the sofa in the living room.



In the dark, George Han did not turn on the lights, but he could sense how many people
had broken into the Villa. And these people’s skills are absolutely beyond reach.

George Han knew that people from the Black Sheep Organization finally came to the
door.

I have to say that their movements are quite fast. They have already investigated
themselves clearly after just waiting for two days, and this is in the absence of any clues.

“You guys are a bit late.” When George Han felt that a few people had entered the door,
he said.

Several people in the dark were stunned.

They have a lot of experience in assassinations, and they have never missed it. But this
time, it seems to have been discovered by the target mission, which they never
expected.

“You know we are here.” Someone said.

George Han smiled faintly and said, “From the first time you entered my house, I knew
what was so strange about this?”

“Is it just me?” the man said with a smile. This time, he was not the only person who
carried out the purpose. In order to ensure that nothing went wrong, the organization
arranged a total of five people.

“Yes, only you are left.” George Han said.

The man frowned, and this sentence seemed to have other meanings.

He is the only one left, so what about the others?

“Brothers, show up, the target already knows that we are coming.” The man said,
summoning his companion.

But after the voice fell, he did not get the response he wanted.

“Didn’t I speak clearly enough? You are the only one left.” George Han said helplessly.

The man suddenly felt a chill, and the five of them broke into the Villa together. In the
absence of any movement, how could the other four people be killed silently? This is
absolutely impossible.

Just when he felt a little strange, the light in the living room suddenly turned on, and the
sudden light made him feel blind instantly.



When he could see things in front of him clearly, the man’s eyes almost fell to the
ground.

The other four companions were already lying neatly on the ground, without any
movement. They seemed to have died. As George Han’s target, they stood beside the
four with a faint smile.

Such a scene instantly made him feel his scalp tingling. As a strong assassin, his
perception of the environment is very sensitive. But he didn’t feel any movement just
now, how did these four companions get killed?

“You…how did you do it!” the man asked George Han in horror. He thought it was a very
simple assassination mission, but he didn’t expect that the four companions would just
fall.

“Didn’t your organization tell you. The goal you have to face is the strongest in this
world?” George Han said with a smile.

The strongest in the world?

In his opinion, such remarks are only used when bragging, because no one would claim
to be that way.

But in the face of George Han, he couldn’t find any reason to refute it, because the four
of his companions were indeed dead, and they died inexplicably. If he was not strong
enough, how could he have done this? ?

He began to look at the surrounding environment. Hope to find a way to escape,
because his companion is dead, he has no courage to attack George Han.

“Want to run. You don’t really think you can run away?” George Han saw his intentions
and said with a smile.

“You…who are you!” the man asked obviously scared.

“Hey.” George Han sighed, then shook his head helplessly, and said, “It seems that your
memory is really bad. Didn’t I just say that I am the strongest in the world.”

Finished. George Han walked towards the person.

Although he has not formally fought against George Han, the death of four of his
companions has already caused tremendous pressure in his heart.

Killers are desperadoes. But desperadoes are not afraid of death.

“What do you want, what do you want!” the man asked in a panic.



George Han couldn’t laugh or cry, and said: “You broke into my house in the middle of
the night and wanted to kill me, but now you ask me what I want to do. Don’t you know
what you are going to do?”

The man gritted his teeth. Rather than sit and wait for death, it is better to fight, at least
there is still a ray of life. So he decided to start first.

But when this idea was born in his mind, he suddenly realized that he couldn’t move his
whole person, and he seemed to be bound by an inexplicable force.

“What’s the matter, what did you do to me, why can’t I move.” There was a strong panic
in his eyes, and he could do nothing but talk.

“Such power, you have never seen it before.” The moment George Han’s voice fell, he
had already appeared in front of the killer, and the blink of an eye was like a
teleportation.

The killer had a numb scalp, and he had seen many strong men. But George Han is
unheard of, he seems to have abilities that ordinary people simply don’t have.

“About the Black Sheep Organization. How much do you know?” George Han asked.

The killer knew that facing such a person, he had no way to survive. And he seems to
want to know more about the Black Sheep Organization from his own mouth.

“You will face the endless pursuit of the Black Sheep Organization. Sooner or later, you
will die in their hands.” The man said.

“Tsk.” George Han said with a face of dissatisfaction, “The answer is not what I asked,
this is not the answer I want.”

After speaking, George Han slashed his shoulder with one palm, seemingly not exerting
any strength, but this palm had already broken the killer’s entire right arm.

The severe pain made the killer scream.

George Han turned his head and looked at Qi Yiyun’s room, and quickly blocked the
sound with his own power to avoid waking Qi Yiyun who was still sleeping.

“Since you don’t tell me, I can only find the answer in my own way.” George Han
behaved very reluctantly.

Next, George Han’s pupils began to turn white, as if covered with a layer of mysterious
power.

The killer could no longer use words to describe his fear of George Han. He didn’t know
what George Han wanted to do, but even though he exhausted all his strength, he



couldn’t break free from the invisible shackles, he could only be like a lamb to be
slaughtered. general.

George Han entered the killer’s mind and explored the black sheep organization
information he knew, but what disappointed George Han was that he didn’t know
anything except the information and orders he received.

None of these five killers really understands the Black Sheep Organization!

Chapter 1422

The restless night did not bring any useful information to George Han, but George Han
was not in a hurry. Since the Black Sheep Organization already knew where he lived, it
would definitely continue to send people.

And under the circumstances that these fringe characters cannot kill him, there will
inevitably be the core masters of the Black Sheep Organization. George Han didn’t
believe that they could really be airtight, and no one knew about the Black Sheep
Organization.

The next day, after Qi Yiyun woke up, she didn’t notice any abnormalities. She couldn’t
imagine that five killers came to the house last night, and they were all killed by George
Han silently.

At noon, Dao Twelve finally returned to the mountainside Villa.

George Han didn’t ask him what he did in the past two days. After all, this was the
private matter of Dao Twelve, and George Han considered him a brother. Will also leave
him a certain amount of privacy.

“I haven’t come back late.” Dao Twelve asked George Han.

The meaning of what he said was very obvious. It was to ask George Han if there were
any assassins from the Black Sheep Organization. It only took two days. In his opinion,
it shouldn’t be so fast.

“Five came last night, but it’s a pity that they are the same as you. They don’t know
anything about the Black Sheep Organization.” George Han said helplessly.

Here are five!

Sword Twelve’s eyelids twitched, and he subconsciously looked at the environment in
the living room. There were no signs of fighting, and the five people would definitely not
leave for no reason.

“Where are they?” Dao Twelve asked.



George Han pointed to the backyard and said, “The flowers in the back garden next year
will definitely bloom very brightly.”

Sword Twelve’s hands and feet were stiff, George Han said, which meant that the
bodies of the five people had been buried in the back garden.

But without any traces of fighting, how did George Han solve the five killers?

To know the killer of the Black Sheep Organization, even the most marginal ones, they
are definitely masters. Don’t they even have the ability to resist a little bit in front of
George Han?

Seeing Dao Twelve in a daze, George Han knew what he was thinking, and said: “In
your eyes, these people may be very powerful, but to me, they are just a pile of rubbish,
and they don’t even have the right to resist.”

Knife Twelve took a heavy breath and said: “The Black Sheep Organization will not stop
until it reaches its goal. If it can’t kill you once, it will continue to send people.”

“Will it be too slow, I hope they can appear as soon as possible.” George Han asked.

This question made the Dao Twelve dumbfounded. No one can still talk and laugh after
being targeted by the Black Sheep Organization. George Han is the first one he has
seen, and I am afraid he is the only one in his life.

“They will evaluate your strength. Then they will send more powerful people. Since
these five people have not completed the task, the next time they will come. There will
definitely be more and more powerful, according to the efficiency of the Black Sheep
Organization. There should be no more than three. Heaven.” Dao Twelve explained.

George Han nodded and said, “It’s okay. Three days is not too long. I hope that people
who come next time can bring me some information about the Black Sheep
Organization.”

Although George Han had already told Dao Twelve that he had mind-reading skills, Dao
Twelve did not believe it very much, because this ability was beyond the scope of
ordinary people’s understanding.

“You want to know the secrets of the Black Sheep Organization from them, I am afraid it
is not easy. The more powerful the killer, the more loyal to the Black Sheep Organization,
they will never betray the Black Sheep Organization.” Dao Twelve said.

“Hey. You still don’t believe that I have mind-reading skills. It seems that I have to show
it to you next time.” George Han said.

Today, George Han has nothing special. He originally planned to study how to allow
ordinary people to practice this matter. Because George Han planned to take some
people from the earth to Xuanyuan World, and these people. It must be able to cultivate,



because Xuanyuan World is a world where the weak can eat the strong, if they enter as
ordinary people. In the future, they will not even have the ability to protect themselves.

But it didn’t take long for Mo Yang to call George Han, and he seemed very excited on
the phone.

“Three thousand, I am back to Basin City, do you have time now, come to Mullins.” Mo
Yang said.

“Are there any concerns?” George Han asked in confusion. He had already felt
something unusual from Mo Yang’s excited tone, but George Han still couldn’t guess
what happened to him.

“Liu Fang followed me to Basin City.” Mo Yang said.

“f*ck!” George Han blurted out these two words subconsciously. He didn’t expect that in
just a few days, Mo Yang had already abducted Liu Fang, which made George Han
unable to imagine the process.

Liu Fang comes from a scholarly family, and she is also a teacher. Logically speaking,
she is very repulsive to people with Mo Yang’s status. How could she follow Mo Yang to
Basin City?

Could it be that Mo Yang concealed his identity?

If this were the case, George Han would think Mo Yang was quite stupid, because he
was fooled for a while, but he couldn’t fool the whole life, when Liu Fang knew the truth.
It is very likely to turn his face against him.

In George Han’s view, the best way between the two of them is to confess. Only when
Mo Yang confessed his identity and Liu Fang could accept it, could they really be
together.

“Liu Fang. Do you know who you are?” George Han asked.

“I know, I have told her everything.” Mo Yang said.

This answer completely exceeded George Han’s expectations.

Could it be said that there is still a restless heart hidden in Liu Fang’s heart, so she can
accept Mo Yang’s identity?

The face of a good girl hides a little Taimei’s heart?

George Han shook his head subconsciously. This kind of thing may exist, but it is
absolutely impossible to happen to Liu Fang. After all, her family is unique, and she is
destined to be impossible to become a little sister.



“Okay, let me come here first.” George Han stopped guessing by himself, and was going
to visit Mullins.

When he was about to leave, George Han looked at Dao Twelve. Before he was reborn,
he and Mo Yang were also very good brothers. The two took care of Basin City together
and continued to expand their power outside the city. Among them, the twelve swords
are indispensable.

“You go with me and introduce a friend to you.” George Han said.

Dao Twelve did not refuse, his entire life now belongs to George Han, so naturally he
would not refuse any arrangement of George Han.

When the two came to Mullins, George Han saw Liu Fang, dressed in a white dress,
which was incompatible with Mullins’ environment, because at first glance, she didn’t
look like someone who would play in a nightclub.
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