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Chapter 1667

George Han was frightened and shivered, his body stepped back subconsciously, but
he caught some strange things in the process of retreating his hands. He lowered his
head and saw that it was a bone.

Losing his bones in a panic, George Han looked at the monster with scary eyes in fear.

But the more I look at it, the more familiar it becomes. The more I look at it, the stranger
it becomes.

He is not dead!

The one in front of him was not a monster, but Zhu Ying.

However, this time Zhu Ying is far more terrifying than before.

Most of the white hair on the whole head had fallen on the stone platform at this time,
revealing a head full of scars. Without the concealment of the hair, the entire face of that
head became clearer. It has only half a face. The anti-Buddha is something someone
deliberately pieced together with half skeletons and half withered corpses.

Seeing George Han scared like that, Zhu Ying consciously turned her head away, trying
to show only the fleshy face.

Seeing this action, George Han felt a little guilty. He wanted to get up and apologize in
embarrassment, but just tried hard. George Han shot directly towards the top of the
mountain!

Yes, it is shooting, even catapult.

He just tried to stand up with a slight force, but the end result was that his head was
slammed against the rock wall above the cave.

Had it not been for George Han’s physical fitness, otherwise, George Han would be able
to smash himself to the head with this collision.

Once he landed, George Han’s feet were half a foot in the mud!

“This…” George Han looked at his body incredible.

He felt that his body was filled with an extremely powerful force, which he had never
seen before, but it made his spirit very excited, and even his five senses had very
obvious changes.



Because he could even see clearly what was in the darkness in the distant cave.

“Try aiming at the wall of the cave!” Zhu Ying said softly.

George Han nodded. Aiming at the cave stone wall, he struck it directly without
hesitation.

“boom!”

With a loud noise, George Han’s entire arm penetrated the cave wall directly.

What kind of amazing ghost power is this, George Han himself felt a little unbelievable. If
his arms were not long enough, George Han felt that he could just punch his hands out
of the hole.

“Madam…this…” George Han looked at his arm in surprise.

“Don’t be surprised, I have helped you get through the seven meridians and eight
meridians for a while, and transferred my life’s skills to you. However, you still don’t
understand the cultivation methods, so you can’t use them until you master them in the
future. , At that time you only knew what the real power is, today, it’s just the foot of the
iceberg.” Zhu Ying said softly.

Hear what Zhu Ying said. George Han was stunned for a while, and Zhu Ying passed all
the skills of her life to herself.

“Madam, you…” George Han finally understood. Why would Zhu Ying be totally different
in a short period of time.

Remembering that he was scared when he saw her just now, George Han felt very guilty.
She made it for herself to lose her hair, but she actually…

Thinking of this, George Han knelt heavily on the ground.

“Hehe, three thousand, get up, as the saying goes, the husband and wife are birds of the
same forest, but I don’t want to fly separately, since your master has become a waste.
Then I, a wife, must live and die with him.”

After that, she touched George Han’s head: “Your master cannot teach you the practice.
Naturally, your wife should do her duty as a master for her husband, so son, get up.”

George Han was moved inside and stood up slowly.

“Three thousand, after you inherit most of my skills, you must sneak in to practice.
Coupled with the peculiar power in your body, once you find the trick, I believe you will
have a great achievement in the future.” Zhu Ying is unable to face it. There are
expressions. But obviously, the tone was quite gentle.



“Yes, Three Thousand must practice hard and will never disappoint his wife.”

Zhu Ying nodded, and then pointed to her behind: “You carry the innocence. Then
carefully look at the patterns on the wall, and remember, you must carry the innocence
that I instilled in you. Otherwise, Those patterns will make you insane.”

“Yes!” George Han nodded, not daring to neglect, and with his true energy, he carefully
looked at the patterns on the wall.

From the initial incomprehension, George Han gradually discovered that he could
understand the meaning of the picture. These were some very strange cultivation
methods.

Although George Han can be considered a person who has experienced two worlds, the
cultivation method on the picture is unheard of, unseen, and even in all of George Han’s
cognition. This method of cultivation is self-harm.

George Han even abandons these ideas, but after practicing. Still feel that the meridians
and power are completely reversed, which is very strange.

“These cultivation methods are called Tianyin Method. It is a forbidden technique that
has disappeared in ancient times. I also practiced this, and I practiced it like this.
Therefore, I shouldn’t teach you, but I found that there is something in your body.
Strange power, capable of yin and yang, and extremely powerful, can just make up for
some of the shortcomings of the Tianyin Method.” Zhu Ying saw George Han’s
confusion and took the initiative to answer questions.

And outside the cave at this time!

Chapter 1668

Qin Shuang sighed, turned around and went back.

Above the main hall, Lin Mengxi was sipping tea. Seeing Qin Shuang’s return early, Liu
frowned slightly: “Shuang’er, it looks like. You shouldn’t return early?”

Lin Mengxi asked Qin Shuang to help George Han get through the basics, she shouldn’t
have returned so early.

“George Han went to Ciyun Cave.” Qin Shuang returned calmly.

Hearing Ciyun Cave, the tea cup in Lin Mengxi’s hand fell to the ground and the cup
broke.

“What? He went to Ciyun Cave?” Lin Mengxi’s face was a little pale.



“Zhe Xuzi said, George Han went to work in the vegetable garden in the morning, but he
violated the ban privately, looking for a place to be lazy, and finally strayed into the
cave.” Qin Shuang said coldly.

Qin Shuang obviously didn’t believe Zhe Xuzi’s words. Ciyun Cave is some distance
away from the vegetable garden, so how can you stray into it?

Lin Mengxi nodded heavily, glanced outside the temple, and murmured and shook her
head: “Entering the Ciyun Cave is just entering the mouth of death. You will punish
Zhexuzi for life.”

“For a slave. Is it too trivial to punish a novice disciple?” Qin Shuang was a little
dissatisfied.

She didn’t believe in Zhexuzi’s words, but she didn’t pursue it much, it was because
Zhexuzi was a student of Four Peaks after all, and George Han was just a slave.

“Ruoyu!” Lin Mengxi shouted.

For a moment, Ruoyu walked in quickly and respectfully said: “Master.”

“Tie Zhexuzi to the main hall!”

Ruo Yu glanced at Qin Shuang and nodded, “If Yu, do it now.”

Zhe Xuzi was playing chess with Xiao Heizi in the thatched hut. At this time, George Han
must have been killed with only a pair of bones left, and it was flashy. Quietly in the
grass behind the thatched hut, he took a set of George Han’s change of slave clothes
and buried it in a mound.

“Hey, set up a burial mound for you, and cast a good fetus in the next life!” Putting a
stick of incense on, the glitzy got up and went back.

Next to George Han’s clothing mound, there are seven or eight small soil bags.

Slaves are just a tool for hard work, and once they fail to do this, no one cares about
their life or death. Even if someone cares, they definitely will not offend a non-slave
person because of them.

People are human, but slaves are dogs. Who would offend people for dogs? !

At the time when Zhe Xuzi had to be happy in life, Ruo Yu was leading people. Brought
this goods back to the main hall of the peak.

Zhe Xuzi was quite scared at first, after all, he never expected that he killed a slave
casually. But the master and her elders actually wanted to send someone to arrest her,
but after thinking about it, it didn’t matter if she was a child.



at most. It’s just being scolded. How could the master be cruel to himself for being a
slave?

When he arrived in the hall, he saw Lin Mengxi. Although Zhe Xuzi called Master
respectfully, he didn’t care about his face. Ruo Yu kicked the boy on the foot, causing
the boy to kneel on the ground.

“Let them all come in.” Lin Mengxi said softly, and Ruoyu nodded. To the airborne voice
outside the hall.

Soon, the four peaks disciples walked in neatly one by one, standing on both sides.

And the slave in the peak. They gather and stand outside the temple.

Seeing this posture, Zhe Xuzi was a little panicked: “Master, what are you doing?”

“Zhe Xuzi, George Han entered Ciyun Cave. Do you have anything to explain to your
teacher?” Lin Mengxi asked with a cold face.

Ordinarily, Zhe Xuzi is nothing more than playing prestige. The lives of slaves in the
Bafang world are indeed not fortune-telling. This is almost the consensus of this world,
so many times, the Xianzi kills the slaves. She who is a master can only open one eye
and close one eye.

It’s not that Lin Mengxi is cruel, but that there are certain things that really can’t be
managed. Once you manage it, you will be accused by thousands of people. Sometimes
too sympathy for slaves will make many people feel embarrassed. In the end, he
became the wrong person.

Challenging what is common in society, sometimes it is.

But this time. Lin Mengxi must manage.

Although George Han was a slave of the Four Peaks, it was arranged by the leader
himself. As a result, George Han died in Ciyun Cave less than a week after entering the
four peaks. How did she explain to the leader? !

Lin Mengxi knew that the boss must have his reason for doing this, so Qin Shuang was
asked to teach George Han some basic introductory skills, but now she is dead in her
four peaks, Zhe Xuzi does not carry this pot. , Who else can recite.

“Master, George Han…he…he is very rebellious. When I said a few words, and then
planned to fix him, he was scared. So I ran, and I chased him. Who knew he ran into Ci
in a panic. Yundong.” Zhe Xuzi knew. Since the Master intends to pursue it, the previous
perfunctory words can no longer be used, so he fabricated a relatively credible lie.



“At this time, you still lied to me.” Lin Mengxi was very angry: “Ruoyu, inform all the
disciples, Zhexuzi is arrogant and arrogant, with no respect and respect. At the same
time, violent, he will kill his life. Relegated to waste.”

In fact, Zhexunzi didn’t know. Even if he gave any reason, Lin Mengxi would not believe
it. She was just looking for an excuse to punish Zhexunzi. Killing slaves cannot be an
excuse, but others will!

Just when Ruoyu was about to do something, Zhe Xuzi was panicked. At this time, a
disciple who was in charge of patrolling the peak suddenly rushed into the hall.

Chapter 1669

“Report to Master, towards Dongfeng, there was a strange loud explosion just now!”
Seeing Lin Mengxi, the patrol disciple hurriedly knelt down, because he was in a hurry,
his face was pale at this time, and the whole person was breathing quickly.

“Explosion?!” Lin Mengxi frowned strangely, and the entire Void Sect was in the void. It
is difficult for outsiders to invade in the defensive array created by the founding father of
Nothingness. Where did the explosion start? !

A group of disciples also looked at each other, so good, how could an explosion
happen? !

“Do you know what’s going on?” Lin Mengxi frowned and asked.

The patrol disciple said nervously: “Report to Master that the explosion point is near
Ciyun Cave, and the disciple dare not approach it.”

Ciyundong? !

Lin Mengxi was shocked: “Ciyun Cave has a special defense formation. How can the
good-natured erupt? Could it be…”

Hearing Lin Mengxi’s words, the disciples’ faces became even more pale. Could it be
the monster in Ciyun Cave that ran out? According to the legend of the Ciyun monster,
the disciples of the Four Peaks had heard about it for a long time, and they all knew that
there was a restricted area where the disciples of the Four Peaks could not set foot.
Once you accidentally approach the neighborhood, you will be skinned by monsters in
the hole.

Now that the Ciyun Cave exploded, could it be the monster inside that broke the
prohibition of Ciyun Cave and escaped?

If this is the case, the Four Peaks are also dangerous.



Lin Mengxi also knew the seriousness of the consequences and got up immediately. He
took out a jade card from his waist and moved it to Ruoyu’s hand: “Notify all the disciples
of Sifeng to rush to Ciyun Cave to gather immediately. If there is any violator, kill me!”

With a cold drink, Lin Mengxi hurried away, suddenly turning her silver sword into her
hand.

The disciples of Sifeng followed closely behind.

After a while, Lin Mengxi’s phantom flashed a hundred meters away from Ciyun Cave,
and the four peaks’ disciples flew here one by one. For a while, the four peaks sky was
densely packed with flying people.

In the distance, the huge stone gate at the entrance of Ciyun cave had crashed to the
ground.

The long-lost light passed through the entrance of the hole, slowly illuminating the hole,
and under the dim light, George Han’s upper body clothes were broken. Showing
perfect muscle lines, a purple-black light on the back of the body slowly disappeared
after walking around in a strange pattern.

George Han exhaled comfortably, looking back at the light outside the cave, but he was
quite uncomfortable.

“Sky Yin technique requires a dark to dark environment. Therefore, something with a
little yang will make you uncomfortable. However, there is a very strong power in your
body. Although you cannot use it, it can Play a suppressive role.” Zhu Ying reminded.

George Han nodded. Although when practicing this technique, he always felt strange,
but when he was familiar enough to understand it, he found that it did have many
secrets: “Thank you, Madam.”

“But you must be very careful in the future. Don’t expose it at will when your Sky Yin
technique is not high enough. Otherwise, it may cause you unnecessary trouble.”

In the Octagonal world, although the weak eats the strong, there are still good and evil
points. Tianyin technique is a cult technique, and speaking out, it will only make the
righteous people who covet it find better excuses to take advantage of it.

“I see. Madam.”

“Okay, it’s too early, you go.” Zhu Ying said softly.

The evil spirit in the cave is too heavy. If George Han stays for too long, it will inevitably
make him too heavy. Zhu Ying is worried that he will not be able to control himself by
then and fall into the magic way like himself. Therefore, let him learn all the heart After
the law, smash the stone gate at the entrance of the cave and leave here.



What George Han didn’t know was that he went down with this punch. It has caused the
spirit of the entire Sifeng to collapse.

“By the way, three thousand, come here.”

George Han got up and went over. At this time, Zhu Ying took out a jade-colored ring
from her arms and gently placed it on George Han’s hand. The ring is very delicate, with
auspicious clouds printed on it.

“Madam, this is…”

“This is my ring. I have preserved it for a lifetime. To me, it is extremely precious, but
some things are not brought with you when you die. You are my apprentice, passing it to
you, it is the most suitable choice. “

“Sister, don’t you go out with me?” George Han asked in confusion.

The environment in this cave is really bad, and George Han can’t bear to have Zhu Ying
live in this place.

Zhu Ying shook her head indifferently: “You think it’s me who is not a human being. Can
a ghost or a ghost still survive outside?”

“But…” George Han was about to speak.

Zhu Ying interrupted: “You want to say, the environment here is terrible, don’t you? I
think it’s good here. Although there are skeletons here and won’t speak with me, they
will never be the same as those outside. The organs are exhausted. Dangerous and
cunning.

Zhu Ying’s words are very reasonable, and George Han agrees very much. Compared
with all the evils in the world, the human heart is the most poisonous.

“Don’t worry. I’ll be fine. Besides, Lin Mengxi’s bitch will never let me die. She would like
to let me live like this. Life is better than death.” Speaking of this, Zhu Ying suddenly
haha laughing out loud.

Seeing that Zhu Ying was like this, George Han no longer forced her. Her old man had
her old man’s decision. The best way to be a junior is to respect her.

“Then Madam, I won’t force you, but I promise you that as long as I have time, I will
come to see you.” George Han said.

Zhu Ying waved her hand: “It’s enough for you to have this heart. As for visiting me, you
don’t need it. My dignified face is really nothing for you to see. You just need to
remember that one day you will be strong enough. At that time, we must carry forward
Qifeng. By the way, kill the bitch Lin Mengxi and avenge me!”



George Han smiled bitterly, killing Lin Mengxi? Elder Four Peaks. When he can beat the
group of disciples in the Void Sect is a problem, let alone the length of these peaks.

At this time, outside the cave, the Four Peaks disciples had surrounded the entire Ciyun
Cave.

A group of disciples each held a long sword and made preparations as if they were
facing an enemy. Lin Mengxi stood in front, Ruo Yu and Qin Shuang on the sides.

However, although the posture is full, no one of the group dared to cross the thunder
pond for a long time, for fear of some accident.

“Master, what should I do now?” Ruo Yu urged softly at this time.

She could not wait to rush directly into Ciyun Cave. She was too eager to prove herself,
so sometimes she didn’t even consider the consequences. Besides, in her eyes, how
fierce Ciyun Cave was, she had so many. The younger sister and younger brother are
here, are you still afraid of it?

“The order continues, everyone is ready to attack!” Lin Mengxi said.

After all, waiting for death is not a way. Ruo Yu got the order and waved at all the
disciples excitedly. A group of disciples suddenly surrounded Ciyun Cave, but at this
moment, Lin Mengxi suddenly frowned. , Shouted: “Wait!”

Chapter 1670

With a sudden shout, the timid apprentice threw the sword and ran back, Ruo Yu and
Qin Shuang also drew their swords to attack at the same time.

At this moment, the Ciyun Cave in the distance suddenly moved.

Lin Mengxi was like a big enemy, with traces of sweat on her forehead, maybe. The
disciples didn’t understand, but she knew very well in her heart that once she came out
of Ciyun Cave, Sifeng was likely to usher in a new bloody storm.

“All disciples, get ready to attack!” Lin Mengxi gave a soft yell, just as the cat got up and
ready to do it, but suddenly froze in place.

When everyone was trembling, a shirtless man suddenly appeared at the entrance of
Ciyun Cave. Qin Shuang soon realized that the man in front of him was very familiar.
When she fixed her eyes, she was stunned.

Isn’t this George Han?

Why did he come out of Ciyun Cave? !



As surprised as her, there are all the disciples of Sifeng, even Lin Mengxi.

“Ciyun Cave is the place of death of our Four Peaks. In the past few decades, I don’t
know how many disciples have died in the cave. Master and his elderly have also said
many times that there is a murderer who lives in Ciyun Cave. The blinking monster, and
the cultivation base is extremely high, George Han is just a slave, how could he come
out alive.”

“Yes, in Ciyun Cave, strangers don’t enter, and they can’t leave. It’s impossible for him
to come out alive.”

“This is incredible. Is it possible that George Han is too lowly as a slave, and even
monsters look down on him?”

“That’s right, only this possibility can be explained. Why George Han, a slave, can come
out alive.”

Lin Mengxi listened to the discussion of the disciples, and she was puzzled.

With her character, it is absolutely impossible to let the people of Four Peaks go. Even if
George Han is only a slave, it is not about whether George Han will tell who he is, but
she is always unreasonable. , And very impulsive, as long as George Han entered, she
would kill George Han involuntarily.

This has always been the case for decades.

In her eyes, the four peaks disciples, not a single snowflake in the avalanche is
innocent.

How could she let George Han go.

Could it be that George Han beat her?

But after another thought, Lin Mengxi felt that this conjecture was ridiculous. George
Han was just a slave. How could he beat her!

But the reality is. George Han came out indeed.

Looking at George Han who was in Chiguo’s upper body, Qin Shuang was not shy at all,
because her mind was full of questions like everyone else.

How did he come out? !

George Han walked out of the cave. I was also taken aback by the four peaks’
formation.

Back in the hall, George Han’s return caused Quan Feng’s commotion, except that Ruo
Yu continued to guard Ciyun Cave with some disciples. The other disciples all gathered



in the hall. Outside the hall, a large group of slaves also squeezed their heads and
wanted to go inside. For them, George Han was their hero. As a slave, he could never
go from Ciyun Cave. It is a miracle and a feat to come out of it. It is the light of their
slaves.

“George Han, can I ask you a question?” Lin Mengxi’s beautiful head was full of doubts.

“Master wanted to ask me. How did you get out of Ciyun Cave?” George Han smiled at
this question.

A large group of disciples couldn’t wait to lengthen their ears and listen to how George
Han came out.

“Yes, George Han, tell us your legendary experience, we really want to know.” At this
time. The excited slave shouted out boldly.

With this shout, he immediately mobilized all the slaves: “Yes, George Han. Speak out.
From now on, we will all follow you as an example.”

“Haha, after going in, after a dark battle, finally. The monster in the Ciyun Cave lost to
you.”

Seeing the slaves getting more and more booing, Zhe Xuzi glared at George Han with a
complicated expression, and then rushed to the door of the palace a few steps. Angrily
said impatiently: “Go and go, all leave me aside, George Han can beat the monster in
Ciyun Cave, it is obvious that the monster thinks his status is too low, and even kills him.
I feel dirty with my hands.”

The slaves immediately fought back at Zhexuzi with hiss, and was so angry that Zhexuzi
yelled: “What’s the matter, do you want to rebel?”

Normally, when these slaves dare to do this, it’s all this damn George Han.

However, the disciples in the temple, including Lin Mengxi and others, were not
interested in this. Instead, he stared at George Han, hoping to get the answers they
wanted from him.

George Han smiled and nodded: “It is indeed what Senior Brother Zhexuzi said. It
thought that killing me would only dirty her hands, so after I went in, she let me out.”

He didn’t want to cause more troubles, and just happened to help him think of a
particularly good excuse.

Moreover, he didn’t want to explain more, because, in terms of poor status, this group of
disciples would doubt him what George Han said, so it’s better not to say it.

No one wants to believe that a person who is lower than their own identity can do what
they can’t do.



“Really?” Lin Mengxi asked with a frown.
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