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Chapter 1415: 

...

"Lu Lang....."

Immortal Spider Marketplace, Meng Xiaochan saw Lu Changsheng return, and 
immediately called out.

She then reported information about Lu Quanzhen and Ghost Demon True Master, 
stating that her master had gone out to find Ghost Demon True Master a few days ago.

"I already know."

Lu Changsheng spoke, indicating that he had already found Lu Quanzhen and just 
parted ways with Nangong Mili.

"Xiaochan, is there a Second Rank Alchemy Room here..."

He inquired aloud, intending to open a furnace to refine pills for Lu Quanzhen to 
address the situation.

"There is."

Meng Xiaochan didn’t know why Lu Changsheng was asking this, but still nodded in 
response.

Immediately, Lu Changsheng asked Meng Xiaochan to help him gather some spiritual 
medicine, then released Lu Quanzhen from the Tianyuan Lotus to continue nurturing 
and healing his body.



Lu Quanzhen’s vitality was stabilized now.

The only problem was his Sea of Consciousness Soul being corroded by Blood Fiend, 
which was very troublesome.

Even if Lu Changsheng wanted to resolve it, he had to be extremely cautious.

Several days later.

Nangong Mili arrived at the Immortal Spider Marketplace and was somewhat 
surprised to see Lu Changsheng practicing alchemy.

Although she had previously read the information and knew Lu Changsheng was a 
Second Rank Alchemist,

she noticed that Lu Changsheng’s technique was unlike ordinary Second Rank 
Alchemists.

However, thinking of Lu Changsheng’s various methods, having such alchemy skills 
seemed unremarkable.

"This is ’Bloodlight Gu’ and ’Flesh White Bone’, they only need simple refinement 
before they can be implanted into him."

Nangong Mili, dressed in a purple skirt, gracefully tossed two Gu jars to Lu 
Changsheng, her expression cold and beautiful.

"Thank you for your hard work, Mili."

Lu Changsheng smiled faintly and opened the Gu jars.

Then, with a subtle mental movement, a pink peach blossom mark appeared on his 
forehead, refining the Gu insects in his hand.



During this process, the disguise on his face also automatically disappeared.

"Hmm!?"

Nangong Mili saw the peach blossom mark on Lu Changsheng’s forehead, feeling an 
inexplicable tremor in her heart, and the Gu insects inside her quivered.

"So this is the Gu insect of this awful man..."

Nangong Mili had long known that Lu Changsheng harbored a powerful Gu insect 
within.

But she didn’t know what kind of Gu insect it was.

Now, seeing the pink peach petal on Lu Changsheng’s forehead, she realized that this 
was his Gu insect.

"What kind of Gu is this?"

"Yet it really is like him, like a peach blossom spirit..."

Nangong Mili saw that his handsome face had an added touch of wicked charm, 
internally cursing.

But for some reason, she found this appearance unusually pleasing to the eye.

Even more than the previous look, resembling a banished immortal descending to the 
mundane world.

Lu Changsheng didn’t pay attention to Nangong Mili’s gaze, refining the two Gu 
insects in his hand.

These were merely Second Rank Gu insects.



With the will of the Peach Blossom Gu suppressing them, combined with his Yin Yang 
Magic Power and Taiyi Divine Soul, they were refined in a moment.

Then, with a slight mental gesture, he infused the two Gu insects into Lu Quanzhen’s 
body.

"Buzz——"

As soon as the Bloodlight Gu entered Lu Quanzhen’s Sea of Consciousness, it began 
to absorb the blood fiend intent within.

This Blood Fiend Qi was extremely troublesome.

Even Lu Changsheng had to be cautious in dispersing it.

Yet this Bloodlight Gu was able to absorb the blood fiend aura from his Sea of 
Consciousness without harming Lu Quanzhen’s soul.

At the same time, ’Flesh White Bone’ began to flow with medicinal power, constantly 
nourishing Lu Quanzhen’s condition.

"These Gu insects indeed have their merits."

Lu Changsheng nodded silently.

He thought to himself that among the Hundred Arts of Cultivation, Gu insects could 
form a distinct path, and there were indeed many Gu cultivators with some substantial 
capabilities.

Immediately afterward, he placed a Peaceful Spirit Talisman on Lu Quanzhen’s 
forehead.

"Puff——"



Several days later, under Lu Changsheng’s treatment, Lu Quanzhen suddenly coughed 
up a spurt of foul blood and regained consciousness.

"Father!?"

He opened his blood-reddened eyes, looking at the Lu Changsheng in front of him, 
appearing somewhat dazed and confused, almost believing he was dreaming.

"Quanzhen."

Lu Changsheng looked at the pale complexion, gray-white hair, and blood-red eyes of 
Lu Quanzhen, filled with blood fiend intent, feeling a heaviness in his heart.

"Father, is it really you?"

Lu Quanzhen was still somewhat incredulous.

Although before losing consciousness, he seemed to have seen Lu Changsheng.

But he vaguely remembered falling into the hands of the Earthshaking Old Demon.

This person’s name was known to him, even stronger than the Ghost Demon True 
Master.

How did Father save him from the Earthshaking Old Demon?

"It seemed like there was a golden light?"

He recalled the situation at that time, only remembering a brilliantly dazzling golden 
light spreading, and...a majestic demon aura.

Then the Earthshaking Old Demon seemed to let out a tragic wail?



"It is me."

Lu Changsheng nodded, then asked in a deep voice, "How did you end up like this?"

"I...."

Lu Quanzhen felt his entire situation, then calmed his mind and spoke aloud.
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