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Chapter 601: Infinity VS. Infinity!

It was Yuei Vu's turn for action again.

But this round, Yuei Vu was not in a hurry to draw cards, but his eyes fell on a skill button in his 
field of vision.

It had been a long time since he had needed to use this power again.

But that time has now come.

Taking a deep breath, Yuei Vu clicked the button directly with his mind.

Duel Skill: God's Anger, activate!

Once per duel, when your LP is below 1000, during your Draw Phase, instead of conducting your 
normal draw, add 1 "Obelisk the Tormentor" (original) from outside the deck to the hand!

The energy formed an invisible cyclone and moved around the venue, and the ultra-high 
concentration of divine power gathered into Yuei Vu's raised right hand.

He closed his eyes briefly, and when he opened them again, it seemed as if there was some great 
soul residing in his pupils, just waking up from a long sleep. The surging blue cyclone gathered in 
his hands, and the abundant power rushed through his veins, as if igniting all the blood in his body, 
accompanied by the urge to destroy everything in sight.

He stretched out his hand, and touched the card deck with his fingers, and the ancient and majestic 
images flashed quickly in his mind. His pupils contracted, and for a moment he felt that his hearing 
and vision were a hundred times clearer. A card draw that was full of unknown variables instantly 
became inevitable, and a powerful interference led the duel to the inevitable future.

"Draw!"

The card was pulled out, the space rippled, and a blue arc was clearly drawn.

The drawn card was, of course Obelisk the Tormentor!

"I always feel that Yuei Vu's momentum has changed a bit" Anzu whispered.

"Is he getting serious?" Honda said.

Without saying a word, Yuei Vu added the drawn card to his hand and then drew another card.

"The Spell Card A Hero Lives'." He said, "If I control no face-up monsters: Pay half my LP; Special 
Summon 1 Level 4 or lower Elemental HERO' monster from my Deck.

Come on, Elemental HERO Stratos! "

Yuei Vu, LP 1000 LP 500

A beam of light flew from the deck, and the turbulent airflow and white whirlwind carried the hero 
wrapped in blue armor down.

[Elemental HERO Stratos, ATK 1800]



"Very good, that's the momentum! Just launch a counterattack in one breath!" Honda encouraged 
him.

But Jonouchi is not as optimistic as his good brother: "No. The effect of the Continuous Trap 
Summon Limit' is two-way. The other party has successfully dealt with the restrictions brought by 
the Summon Limit', so now the problem is thrown back to Yuei Vu.

Now he can only perform two summons at most in one turn. Under such restrictions, there is no 
way to counterattack. "

"Ah, is there such a thing?" Honda finally realized, "Damn it, his own card has actually become an 
obstacle"

Of course, Yuei Vu also had a countermeasure: "Chain! Quick-Play Spell Emergency Provisions'. 
Send any number of other Spell/Trap Cards on my field to the Graveyard; gain 1000 LP for each 
card sent to the Graveyard this way.

I sent the activated Spell Card "A Hero Lives" and the Continuous Trap "Summon Limit" to the 
graveyard to restore 2000 LP. "

Yuei Vu, LP 500 LP 2500

"Oh, very good!" Jonouchi said, "This way not only did he avoid the side effects of the Summon 
Limit' but also restored his LP!"

"Next is the effect of Stratos." Yuei Vu said, "When this card is Normal or Special Summoned: Add 
1 HERO' monster from my Deck to my hand. The one I chose is, Elemental HERO Solid Soldier'."

A card popped up from the deck. Yuei Vu pulled it out and displayed it briefly. The deck was 
automatically shuffled at the same time.

"Activate Spell Card The Warrior Returning Alive' Target 1 Warrior monster in my GY; add that 
target to my hand. The one I want to return to the hand is Elemental HERO Shadow Mist'."

The Shadow Mist's card popped up from Yuei Vu's GY area, and he took it back.

"Then I normal summon Elemental HERO Solid Soldier'!"

[Elemental HERO Solid Soldier, ATK 1300]

"The effect of Solid Soldier When this card is Normal Summoned: I can Special Summon 1 Level 4 
or lower HERO' monster from my hand. Appear again, Elemental HERO Shadow Mist!"

[Elemental HERO Shadow Mist, ATK 1000]

"The effect of Shadow Mist If this card is Special Summoned: I can add 1 Change' Quick-Play Spell 
Card from my Deck to my hand. I added Mask Change' to the hand."

Yuei Vu took another pop-up card from the deck, displayed it, and immediately inserted it into the 
Duel Disk.

"Quick-Play Spell Mask Change'!" Yuei Vu said, "Send 1 HERO' monster I control to the 
Graveyard, then Special Summon 1 Masked HERO' monster from my Extra Deck with the same 
Attribute!"



Jonouchi was surprised: "Could it be that he has a second copy of the powerful Masked HERO 
Dark Law'"

"No, even if the Masked HERO Dark Law' is summoned here, it is no match for God." Yugi said, 
"Yuei Vu must have other ideas."

Indeed, Yuei Vu waved his hand and pointed at the solid hero in armor in front of him.

"I send Elemental HERO Solid Soldier' to the graveyard, transform! Here I summon a hero who 
shines like a diamond

Masked HERO Dian! "

The light surrounded Solid Soldier's body, transforming into solid metal armor and wrapping his 
whole body. The silver sword body flashes with white light, the sword light flashes, and the blue 
cloak flutters behind the hero.

[Masked HERO Dian, ATK 2800]

"At this moment, the effect of the Elemental HERO Solid Soldier' who was sent to the graveyard!" 
Yuei Vu said, "When Solid Soldier to the GY by a Spell effect: I can target 1 HERO' monster in my 
GY, except Elemental HERO Solid Soldier'; Special Summon it in Defense Position.

What I want to resurrect is, Destiny HERO Disk Commander! "

So the Disk Commander who just left the game last time went into the cemetery and was dragged 
back to continue working overtime before he could lie down for a full round.

[Destiny HERO Disk Commander, DEF 300]

"At this moment, the effect of Card of Safe Return'." Yuei Vu waved his hand, "Because there are 
monsters resurrected from the graveyard, I draw three cards from the deck!"

The golden glow of the "Card of Safe Return" card emerged, and powerful magic power surged 
from the Spell Card.

But before it had time to take effect, the Pharaoh waved his hand and said coldly: "You have 
triggered my trap Dust Tornado!"

Dust Tornado (Trap Card): Target 1 Spell/Trap your opponent controls; destroy that target, then you 
can Set 1 Spell/Trap from your hand.

A black tornado rose from the ground, lifting the floor tiles along the cracks. The field was filled 
with flying sand and fallen leaves, which were swept along with the storm. The "Card of Safe 
Return" card was rolled high into the air, and was torn into pieces by the strong wind pressure.

It seems that this drawing engine has finally made the Pharaoh feel intolerable if Yuei Vu was 
allowed to continue the combo of "Destiny HERO Disk Commander" and "Card of Safe Return", he 
could draw five more cards.

"Then with the effect of Destiny HERO Disk Commander'" Yuei Vu said, "I draw two cards from 
the deck."

But it was also a good thing to force the opponent to use this typhoon in advance. Now the Pharaoh 
wouldn't be able to interfere with Yuei Vu's next move.



After adding the two newly drawn cards to his hand, Yuei Vu immediately took out another card. 
This time, he placed it in the field area on the side of the Duel Disk, and was absorbed into the Duel 
Disk with a "click" sound.

"Field Spell Temple of the Kings!"

With an earthquake-like movement, the terrain in the golden palace was quickly transformed. The 
stone steps made of gold protrude, and at the end of the steps is the sealed sarcophagus.

"As long as the Temple of the Kings' is on the field, I can activate Trap Cards the turn they were 
Set." (Animation effect)

Yuei Vu waved his hand.

"I set a card on the field, and then activate it immediately according to the effect of Temple of the 
Kings'! Continuous Trap Ultimate Offering!"

The trap card in front of Yuei Vu was turned over, and the card artwork looked like it was dripping 
with blood.

"The effect of this card can be activated during my Main Phase or the opponent's Battle Phase." 
Yuei Vu said, "Pay 500 LP to get an additional chance to normal summon!"

"Add the chance to normal summon " Yugi Muto shouted, "Yuei Vu also wants to"

"I pay 500 LP, and the effect of Ultimate Offering' is activated!" Before Yugi finished his speech, it 
was covered by Yuei Vu's voice.

[Yuei Vu, LP 2500 LP 2000]

"I take three monsters, Elemental HERO Stratos', Elemental HERO Shadow Mist', and Elemental 
HERO Disk Commander', as sacrifices!"

Yuei Vu raised his arms high, his eyes seemed to have blue mad currents surging, and the divine 
power seemed to be fused into a part of the blood, like ten thousand horses galloping in his veins.

"The scorching wind blew the earth, and suppressed all things with absolute divine power! Come 
down

The God of Destruction, Obelisk the Tormentor! "

The floor tiles of the Temple of the Kings were broken, dust was everywhere, and the blue giant 
broke through the ground, bursting out from the ground with supreme power!

Obelisk the TormentorUnit No. 2!

[Obelisk the Tormentor, ATK 4000]

The God of Destruction's footsteps smashed the floor tiles, Wei Ran stood behind Yuei Vu, and met 
the eyes of another Obelisk on the Pharaoh's field, facing each other tit for tat!

"Obelisk can there be two of them!?" Jouchi swallowed his heart.

In fact, when they saw Yuei Vu calling the sky dragon, they had already guessed that Yuei Vu had 
three other Spell Cards in his hand. But even with mental preparation, seeing these two indomitable 
blue giants confront each other, the shock and impact on the soul of that scene was still 
indescribable.



On the Pharaoh's field, Osiris's attack power is now 0, and the giant soldier with an attack power of 
4,000 will attack, and this duel will be brought to an end with one punch!

"As expected of Yuei Vu, he pulled it back right away!" Honda clenched his fist, "Go up, Yuei Vu, 
let's get it done cleanly and immediately!"

But Yuei Vu hesitated for a moment, but he was not in a hurry to pick off the fruits of victory but 
turned his attention to the last stone slab covered on the Pharaoh's field.

That cardis there to defend against attacks? Or a counterattack trap?

Or is it a card used to resist the 4,000 points of damage Obelisk gave the opponent?

Seeing that Yuei Vu hadn't moved for a long time, Honda became anxious: "What is Yuei Vu doing? 
Wouldn't he win if he directly attack?"

Yugi said: "No, Yuei Vu is still hesitating. Although God can be immune to most effects, it is not 
absolutely invincible. Both sides have tried their best in the duel. Any moment of carelessness, even 
the slightest mistake may directly lead to irreparable defeat."

"Ah? Is that so?" Honda was taken aback when he heard that.

Yuei Vu thought for a moment.

Although Ultimate Offering was a Continuous Trap, its effect could only be activated during one's 
own Main Phase or the opponent's Battle Phase.

So before entering the Battle Phase, he decided to play it safe first.

"I used the effect of the Continuous Trap Ultimate Offering' again." He said, "I paid 500 LP to gain 
an additional chance to normal summon."

Yuei Vu, LP 2000 LP 1500

"Summon Elemental HERO Sparkman'!"

A showdown of this level was naturally indispensable for the electro-optical hero. Sparkman made a 
gorgeous leap to the ground, with electricity crackling all over his body.

[Elemental HERO Sparkman, DEF 1400]

"Battle!" Yuei Vu no longer hesitated.

A real man can't say no, just do it and be done with it!

"Obelisk the Tormentor, attack Osiris the Sky Drgon'!" Yuei Vu shouted, "God Hand Crusher!"

The giant god behind Yuei Vu raised his giant fist, and the dazzling blue light gathered, shaking the 
entire temple as if it were on the verge of collapse!

The noble body of Osiris was trapped in the swampy ground, no matter how hard it struggled, it 
couldn't get rid of it, instead, it made itself look like a red loach. Facing the divine fist, it could only 
roar unwillingly, but it had no power to fight back

The audience's heart was in their throats, and their breathing seemed to be cut off.

Can Yuei Vu defeat the Sky Dragon and win this hard-won victory?



However, Yuei Vu himself did not have such violent emotional ups and downs and seemed to be 
mentally prepared for the direction of things.

After allthe Pharaoh still had a set card.

Although it was said that traps did not work on gods, if you thought about it carefully, how could 
the protagonist have a useless card?

At this last moment, the last stone slab on the Pharaoh's field was activated!

"The trap has been triggered!" Pharaoh said in a deep voice, "Pinpoint Guard!"

Yuei Vu's pupils contracted slightly.

Pinpoint Guard: When an opponent's monster declares an attack: Target 1 Level 4 or lower monster 
in your Graveyard; Special Summon it in Defense Position. It cannot be destroyed by battle or card 
effects this turn.

What the Pharaoh special summoned here was "The Rock Spirit" that entered the graveyard in the 
first round!

[The Rock Spirit, DEF 1000]

The heavy fist of Obelisk blasted out, and the divine light was so powerful that it was like a long 
river hanging from the sky, annihilating all things!

"Summoning this kind of monster can't stop Obelisk's attack!" Honda shouted excitedly, "Yuei Vu 
really won this time!"

"That's not right!" Yugi Muto suddenly became nervous, "This is"

Sure enough, the pharaoh's arm was raised high: "Obelisk the Tormentor's ultimate ability! Hyper 
God Energy!"

When Obelisk the Tormentor was extremely angry, sacrifice two monsters on your field, and 
Obelisk's attack power became infinite until the end of the turn.

And if this effect was activated during the battle phase of the opponent's turn, all monsters on the 
opponent's field must attack Obelisk!

The sky dragon and rock elf on the Pharaoh's field turned into blue light spots respectively, merged 
into the clenched fist of the God of Destruction, and turned into a steady stream of power to fill his 
solid and huge body!

[Obelisk the Tormentor (The Nameless Pharaoh), ATK 4000 ATK ]

The situation was reversed in an instant!

The power of the Obelisk controlled by the Pharaoh soared to infinity, and the domain of the God of 
Destruction encompassed everything in the world, completely suppressed Yuei Vu's Obelisk in an 
instant. The latter struggled in this powerful field, and his body was so stiff that he couldn't even 
raise his fist.

"It's over!" Jonouchi showed despair, "In this case, Yuei Vu will"

But Yuei Vu has prepared for this unexpected situation!



"Obelisk the Tormentor's ultimate ability!" Yuei Vu shouted hard against the might of the gods and 
the strong wind, "Take the Masked HERO Dian' and Elemental HERO Sparkman' on the field as 
sacrifices

Hyper God Energy! "

[Obelisk the Tormentor (Yuei Vu), ATK 4000 ATK ]

The two heroes also turned into light spots all over the sky and were absorbed by the God of 
Destruction, and the ability value of the Giant God Soldiers on Youyu Field also soared out of 
control, breaking through the sky in just a moment!

Infinity vs. Infinity!

Chapter 602: God of Destruction VS God of Destruction

Infinity vs. infinity!

The two Tormentors punched at the same time, and the punches collided fiercely!

The domains of the two Obelisks collided with each other, and everything in the domain was 
constantly being impacted, crushed, and broken. The gravel on the temple floor was thrown into the 
air and crushed into powder by divine power.

The moment the divine power exploded, the image of the whole world seemed to become blurred, 
and no one dared to look directly at the dazzling light. The huge body of the god abstracted into a 
phantom in the wave of light until it completely disappeared.

At the same time, the confrontation of two giant gods who used the "Hyper God Energy" ability had 
a natural end they died together.

After the impact was over, the light curtain gradually dissipated, and the onlookers were blown to 
the ground in all directions. Jonouchi raised his head from his good brother Honda's stomach with 
difficulty: "What's the matter? Are we both hurt?"

Yugi rubbed his swollen head: "It looks like so"

Is this round of confrontation a draw again?

Honda swallowed his saliva: "You are right, if anyone is careless for a moment in a battle of this 
level, he will be torn to pieces"

And that's not even over yet!

The two giant gods disappeared at the same time, and the fields of both sides became empty, 
without any monsters to fight again. It seemed that the Battle Phase could only end here.

But Yuei Vu didn't end the Battle Phase, he quickly took out another card: "At the end of the Battle 
Phase, activate the Quick-Play Spell Surprise Attack from the Darkness!

Select a monster that was Normal Summoned or Special Summoned this turn, conduct a second 
Battle Phase and only that monster can attack again. " (manga card)

"Eh?" Anzu said, "But now neither side has any monsters on the field"

"If the target monster exists in the graveyard," Yuei Vu added, "the target monster can be Special 
Summoned!"



Naturally, this was another generous gift from Mr. Ma in Battle City. To be honest, as the early boss 
of DM and the world's number one counterfeit card dealer, Mr. Ma really had a lot of good things in 
his hands.

In the decisive battle between Yami Marik and Yugi in the animation, after an attack with "The 
Winged Dragon of Ra", it was this "Surprise Attack from the Darkness" that resurrected the Sun 
God in the GY and launched the phoenix attack again.

"Nani!?" Jonouchi was pleasantly surprised, "Doesn't this mean"

"That's right." Yuei Vu raised his hand, "According to the effect of Surprise Attack from the 
Darkness', I revived the Obelisk the Tormentor' in the GY, and started the Battle Phase again!

Come again! The God of Destruction, Obelisk the Tormentor! ! ! "

A pitch-black vortex opened, blue beams of light pierced through the sky and the earth, and a giant 
with a solid body reappeared from the divine light!

[Obelisk the Tormentor, ATK 4000]

"This time it really worked!" Jonouchi shouted, "There is nothing on the opponent's field, if this 
blow passes"

The giant god clenched his fists and raised them high above his head. Although he hadn't received 
instructions from his master yet, he could not wait to gather momentum, preparing to bring the duel 
to an end with his destructive fist smash.

Even Yuei Vu couldn't help but frown.

It should really succeed this time, right?

There are no monsters, there are no ser cards in the back row, and the invincible Kuriboh has 
already entered the graveyard

Can you still print another card to escape this?

Then the Pharaoh, with an expressionless face, raised his hand again and hit the stone slab in front 
of him.

The monster spirit sealed in the stone slab

was Kuriboh!

It's just that this time the invincible Kuriboh changed into a new vest. What Pharaoh activated from 
his hand this time was the effect of "Kuribohrn"!

Kuribohrn: At the end of the Battle Phase: You can discard this card, then target 1 monster in your 
GY that was destroyed by battle and sent there this turn; Special Summon it.

Then it was self-evident what monster the pharaoh wanted to call back to the field.

Pharaoh's eyes were sharp, he slowly raised his hand, and spoke in a low voice, but his voice 
seemed to have an irresistible penetrating power, penetrating all the way into the underworld.

"Resurrection! Obelisk the Tormentor!!!"



The beam of light soared into the sky, and a huge giant drilled out of the ground, with red eyes, 
tearing a gap in the divine domain of the giant god on Yuei Vu's side!

[Obelisk the Tormentor (Pharaoh), ATK 4000]

Yuei Vu gritted his teeth.

Its really confusing

"Let's fight again!" Yuei Vu shouted, "Obelisk the Tormentor, attack Obelisk the Tormentor!"

The two giant soldiers completed their momentum at the same time, and the destructive divine 
power formed two vortexes on the left and right respectively, gathering on the fists of both sides. 
Two huge divine fists blasted out at the same time, with a thunderous sonic boom, the shadows of 
the fists disappeared in the turbulent blue waves, and all the air in the space was pushed outward.

"God Hand Crusher!!!"

The two fists clashed, and there was another devastating movement like landslides. The divine light 
burned the retina, and the thunderous explosion hurt the eardrum. For a brief moment, Yuei Vu felt 
that he could neither see nor hear, so he staggered back a few steps, half-kneeled on the ground, 
panting uncontrollably.

The black smoke cleared, and the figures of the two giants disappeared from the field again.

It's the same end again.

But when the strong light and black smoke dissipated again, although Yuei Vu's side was empty, 
there was another cute and fluffy Kuriboh in the court area of the nameless Pharaoh.

[Kuriboh, DEF 200]

Yuei Vu was taken aback for a moment, and then quickly figured it out.

The second effect of Kuribohrn: When an opponent's monster declares an attack: You can banish 
this card from your GY, then target any number of "Kuriboh" monsters in your GY; Special 
Summon them.

At the moment when Yuei Vu's Obelisk declared the attack, the nameless Pharaoh used the effect of 
"Kuribohrn" to resurrect the "Kuriboh" in his graveyard to the field.

Yuei Vu pursed his lips, feeling a little dizzy.

MD, who designed this ancient Egyptian AI Bot? It's also ridiculously strong.

Yuei Vu was even thinking, after going back, that he would vigorously recommend this AI Bot to 
President Kaiba. It was much better than the various versions of AI Bot that the president has played 
so far

It's too dangerous to end the turn like this. Yuei Vu had no choice but to activate the blood 
compensation effect again.

"The effect of the Continuous Trap Ultimate Offering' Pay 500 LP to gain an additional chance to 
normal summon."

Yuei Vu, LP1500LP1000



"I summon the Elemental HERO Clayman' in defense position."

The clay hero appeared on Yuei Vu's field. Although it was a little hasty, at least it managed to build 
a new line of defense, so as not to usher in the next round naked.

[Elemental HERO Clayman, DEF 2000]

"Set a card, I end my turn."

Chapter 603: Different Dimension Reincarnation

With Yuei Vu's End Phase declaration, this round of fierce offense and defense between the two 
gods of destruction also came to an end.

"It's amazing, it's amazing" The only local NPC girl, Mana, was frightened and acted badly, like a 
small repeater.

"It's scary just thinking about it. What kind of battle is this" Honda also swallowed.

Yugi Muto was silent, but he only paid attention secretly, taking notes in his heart while observing.

"To me."

The initiative of the duel was transferred back to the Pharaoh's hands again, and a stone slab fell in 
front of him.

"The spell Spell Reproduction'." He raised his eyelids, and his pupils seemed to emit a dim light in 
the shadow of the main hall. "By using two spell tablets as a sacrifice, you can recycle the stone 
tablets with spells recorded in your graveyard."

Spell Reproduction (Spell Card): Send 2 Spells from your hand to the GY, then target 1 Spell in 
your GY; add it to your hand.

The two stone slabs in front of the Pharaoh both turned into countless golden powders and 
dissipated, and another stone slab rose from the black vortex and lay horizontally in front of him.

The Spell Card he recovered here was, of course, the most powerful card-replenishing spell ever 
buried in the cemetery!

"Spell Card of Sanctity!"

With this unreasonable way of replenishing cards, the ammunition of both sides was replenished 
again in an instant, and new stone slabs fell one after another, hitting the Pharaoh one by one.

The ancient king's sharp gaze quickly swept across, as if he had finalized a new strategy after only a 
brief moment of thought, and then raised his hand and hit the new stone slab.

It seemed that he felt that the troublesome temple that Yuei Vu had summoned had to be solved 
first. Pharaoh said: "The magic removal spell, cancel the magic power existing on this field!"

De-Spell (Spell Card): Target 1 face-up Spell, or 1 Set Spell/Trap, on the field; destroy that target if 
it is a Spell.

The one chosen as the target was, of course, the Field Spell "Temple of the Kings". The majestic 
and towering temple instantly cracked under the magical power, the huge sarcophagus was sunk 
into the ground, and the pillars in the hall collapsed, smashing into pieces on the floor.



The sacred site gradually turned into an illusion, and under the effect of that magic, it seemed like 
the tide receded, revealing the walls and floors plated with gold luster.

The Pharaoh's counterattack was just about to begin: "The spell of time and space Different 
Dimension Reincarnation! From the other side of the dimension, call the servants who have been 
exiled from the battle to come back again!"

D.D.R. Different Dimension Reincarnation (Equip Spell): Discard 1 card, then target 1 of your 
banished monsters; Special Summon it in Attack Position, and equip it with this card. When this 
card leaves the field, destroy that monster.

"Monsters that are removed from the game?" Anzu tilted her head and began to think, "The monster 
which is banished in this duel is"

"God!" said Yugi with a solemn expression, "It is the supreme god, The Winged Dragon of Ra!"

The expressions of the rest of the people changed suddenly.

"Oops!"

The space is like a thin layer of cloth being torn apart, and golden light shines out from the crack. 
The light was so dazzling that it was like the hot golden sun hanging in the sky in summer, but it 
shone on the human body but was extremely soft.

The pharaoh closed his eyes, folded his arms, and began to chant.

A faint golden light enveloped his whole body, flowing gently like a stream of water. The ancient 
priest's words were slowly spit out from his mouth. The ancient syllables contained supreme power. 
The words and words penetrated the space, calling out the name of the god who was exiled to the 
other side of the dimension.

The dome was violently torn open, and the golden bird appeared in the distorted time and space! Its 
body was still as solid as steel, golden streamers flashed on the huge spread wings, and its eyes 
were scarlet like blood.

The Winged Dragon of Ra, descends!

[The Winged Dragon of Ra, ATK 0]

Then everyone present also knew that the "The Winged Dragon of Ra" who was specially 
summoned to the field would evolve into the invincible posture of "God Phoenix"!

The flames of the distorted space turned into armor and covered the body of the sun god, and the 
scorching air waves cracked the ground and exploded the floor tiles. The Sun God panted heavily, 
and the airflow from the corner of his mouth turned into a golden flame visible to the naked eye.

But even if the Winged Dragon was summoned now, its attack power was still 0. Although God 
Phoenix could convert the master's LP into attack power, The Nameless Pharaoh's remaining LP 
was only 1700, thus the total converted attack power was only 1699, which was not enough to 
penetrate the Clayman's defense.

So here there was no doubt that he would use another effect of Ra: Pay 1000 HP, and send all 
monsters on the opponent's field to the Graveyard.



"The Winged Dragon of Ra's special ability activated!" Pharaoh's voice was not too loud, but full of 
majesty, "God Phoenix!"

The golden firebird soared into the sky, and when it swooped down, it looked like an immortal 
phoenix!

The Nameless Pharaoh, LP 1700 LP 700

The scorching tornado swept the audience, and the solid body of the clay hero had no room to resist 
the great divine power. In just an instant his body was shattered and burned to death in the flame 
storm.

The aftermath of the flames swept towards Yuei Vu. His arms were crossed, and the hem of his 
windbreaker was undulating. Although he was only affected, he felt that every drop of water in his 
body seemed to be evaporated.

His throat was so thirsty that it seemed to be smoking, and he couldn't even control his tongue. For 
a moment, Yuei Vu couldn't help but wonder whether the opponent would just use the Winged 
Dragon with zero attack power to face-slap him like the six-year-old in Battle City, and rely on 
mental attacks to force the opponent to disconnect

Of course, neither the real Pharaoh nor the AI Bot in the trial would use such an indecent trick.

"Spell A Feather of the Phoenix." He said lightly, "Discard a stone slab and send back any stone slab 
in the cemetery."

A Feather of the Phoenix (Spell Card): Discard 1 card, then target 1 card in your GY; return that 
target to the top of your Deck.

Pharaoh discarded a slab in his hand, chose the invincible "Card of Sanctity" again, and returned it 
to the top of the deck.

Yuei Vu raised his eyebrows.

Return Card of Sanctity to ensure that there will be no lack of resources in the next round?

"At this moment, the special ability of the monster Skull-Mark Ladybug' sealed in the abandoned 
stone slab is activated." The Nameless Pharaoh said, "One's own soul power will be replenished."

Skull-Mark Ladybug: When this card is sent to the Graveyard, increase your Life Points by 1000 
points.

The Nameless Pharaoh, LP 700 LP 1700

"In this way, even the life points paid for the Winged Dragon's effect are replenished." Jonouchi 
clenched his fists, "Damn it, it's so strong, so ridiculously strong, it's almost like another Yugi is 
really dueling here! "

"More than that," said Yugi Muto, "Through A Feather of the Phoenix', Card of Sanctity' has been 
recovered, so that the available cards in the next round are still at the maximum value"

But even Yugi Muto didn't expect that the pharaoh didn't want to wait until the next turn at all.

"Spell Pot of Greed'." The Nameless Pharaoh summoned the big green pot, "Get two more stone 
slabs."



Two new slates fell in front of himeveryone knew clearly that one of them was the "Card of 
Sanctity" that had just been put back to the top of the deck!

"Place a stone slab on the field." Obviously in order to avoid wasting resources, the Pharaoh first 
clicked on the extra stone slab to set it, and then immediately clicked on the other one, "Spell Card 
of Sanctity!'"

Both parties drew cards from the deck until the hand was full of six cards.

Of course, because Card of Sanctity has already been activated once this round, Yuei Vu already had 
six cards in his hand, so he could only watch helplessly as the opponent drew cards like a flowah 
no, it's like running water.

The six cards in his hand were replenished, and The Nameless Pharaoh could make a move again.

"Spell Monster Reincarnation!"

Monster Reincarnation (Spell Card): Discard 1 card, then target 1 monster in your GY; add it to 
your hand.

Another slab was discarded, and the slate sleeping in the cemetery slowly rose from the dark vortex. 
The murals of the ancient giant were clearly engraved on the solid earth-brown slab, and every deep 
line seemed to be burning with a light blue flame.

That's Obelisk!

The God of Destruction returned to his hand, and the Pharaoh continued to show the slate in his 
hand.

"Spell Sacrifice of Grave Goods." (manga card)

Here, the Pharaoh equipped this card to the "Kuriboh" on the field. In this way, if he performed a 
Tribute Summon, he could treat Kuriboh as 2 Tribute Monsters for the Tribute Summon.

If counting the Winged Dragon, the number of monsters on the Pharaoh's field would be three!

Jonouchi panicked: "Hey, is he going to!?"

"The Kuriboh equipped with Sacrifice of Grave Goods', plus The Winged Dragon of Ra, is 
equivalent to three sacrifices!"

The nameless Pharaoh's voice was as low-pitched as a bell, and his majestic name resounded loudly 
in the hall.

"The burning wind blew wildly across the earth, suppressing all things with absolute divine power

Obelisk the Tormentor! ! ! "

Three rays of light rushed to the sky surrounded by the whirlwind, and the azure beam of light 
rushed into the dome in the endless storm. The blue giant came again in this sacred duel!

[Obelisk the Tormentor, ATK 4000]

"It's Obelisk again!" Jounouchi gritted his teeth in the strong wind and hissed, "Because the Sun 
God's attack power is insufficient, so use Obelisk to complete the final blow?"



Honda also said: "Damn it, the monsters on Yuei Vu's field have been eliminated by the power of 
God Phoenix"

"Obelisk the Tormentor, attack directly." The nameless Pharaoh's cold voice was like the God of 
Death urging death, "God Hand Crusher!"

The giant god punched again, bringing with it the divine wind that wiped out everything!

Yuei Vu has already reached this point, of course, he couldn't be willing to let it go: "Open the set 
card: Trap Card Iron Resolve! Pay half of the HP, all Battle Damage done to me in this turn 
becomes 0, then end the Battle Phase!" (Animation card )

Yuei Vu, LP 1000 LP 500

The copper wall and iron wall exchanged for half of the health points firmly blocked the giant god's 
divine fist, and the force caused the transparent wall to tremble violently.

Everyone breathed a sigh of relief.

"Okay, okay, he blocked it again" Jonouchi let out a long sigh.

Seeing this duel now gave him the feeling that he had to keep at least ten boxes of quick-acting 
heart-rescuing pills at hand, and he had to take three or five pills every turn, otherwise, his heart 
would really be overwhelmed

As the warring parties played offense and defense, the mood of the onlookers was like a roller 
coaster, going up and down, and they were afraid of myocardial infarction even if they took a 
breath.

"Then set up three more stone slabs and the operation is over." The Pharaoh said.

"Very good, this round's attack is also blocked." Yugi said, "Yuei Vu also has enough cards in his 
hand, he can summon his gods to counterattack again this turn

But before he finished speaking, he saw the Pharaoh turning over another stone tablet.

"The trap is activated."

The stone slab was flipped open, and a hideous ugly face like a skeleton popped out on the field at 
the same time, with two black eye sockets, one side was big and the other was small, and there was 
a big "seal" character on top of the head.

Continuous Trap Mask of Restrict!

"Oops." Yugi's expression suddenly darkened.

"What? What's going on? What's going on now?" That came from Honda, who couldn't understand 
the situation but was extremely concerned about the situation.

"As long as Mask of Restrict exists on the field, neither player can Tribute cards," Yugi said with an 
ugly expression.

"In other words," Jonouchi also looked gloomy, "Yuei Vu can no longer summon the Egyptian God 
by conventional means."

Chapter 604: Egyptian Gods VS Egyptian Gods



Looking at the ferocious black mask that popped out from the field of the nameless Pharaoh, Yuei 
Vu couldn't help but frown.

Indeed, the Egyptian God had to be Normal Summoned with three sacrifices, and if it was Special 
Summoned, it must be sent to the graveyard at the end of the turn.

Unable to Tribute was indeed a big disturbance if one wanted to summon the gods.

but

"Draw!" Yuei Vu drew out the card at the top of the deck.

If an obstacle of this level could make him helpless, then he was unworthy of such a high Rank.

"Spell Card Graceful Charity. Draw 3 cards, then discard 2 cards."

After drawing three cards, Yuei Vu only glanced at them quickly before picking out two cards and 
discarding them in the graveyard.

"Activate a Spell Card from the hand Fusion Deployment." Yuei Vu said, "Reveal 1 Fusion Monster 
in my Extra Deck and Special Summon, from my hand or Deck, 1 of the Fusion Materials whose 
name is specifically listed on that card."

He revealed a Fusion Monster card.

"The card I am showing is, Elemental HERO Wildedge'. According to the effect of Fusion 
Deployment', I special summon the fusion material Elemental HERO Bladedge' from the deck!"

The Spell Card took effect, and a beam of golden light flew out from the deck, transforming into a 
metal hero with a shining golden light and landing lightly on the ground, with the fire behind it 
advancing.

[Elemental HERO Bladedge, ATK 2600]

"I banish the LIGHT-attribute Elemental HERO Sparkman' and the DARK-attribute Elemental 
HERO Shadow Mist' in the GY!"

Yuei Vu raised his arms high and took another card on the Duel Disk.

"Heaven and earth are opened! The souls of light and darkness come into the gate of chaos as 
sacrifices, and call for the legendary strongest warrior

Black Luster Soldier Envoy of the Beginning! ! ! "

The golden light was scattered, the sword energy was vertical and horizontal, and the blue armor 
covered the whole body of the swordsman. The powerful warrior's eyes reflected the cold and stern 
light of the sword, and he descended with the majesty that did not lose to the gods.

[Black Luster Soldier Envoy of the Beginning, ATK 3000]

"Oh, the legendary warrior was summoned here in one breath!" Honda shouted, "That's how 
powerful he is!"

"Black Luster Soldier Envoy of the Beginning has a powerful effect that can banish the monsters on 
the opponent's field, and after destroying monsters in battle, he can attack additionally." Yugi Muto 
said solemnly, "But his level is only 8, so this monster's effect doesn't work against gods. None of 
his effects can create a breakthrough."



"Hey, is that so?" Honda was stunned.

"Spell Card Miracle Fusion!" Yuei Vu took the Spell Card in his hand, "Fusion Summon 1 
Elemental HERO' Fusion Monster from my Extra Deck, by banishing Fusion Materials from my 
field or GY.

I banish Masked HERO Dark Law' and Masked HERO Vapor' from the graveyard!

From light to darkness, and then from darkness to light, using the power of awakening to create the 
world

Contrast HERO Chaos! "

The images of the two masked heroes both appeared, turning into black and white swirling 
tornadoes that shot straight into the sky and merged into one place. The wind roared, and a new 
hero was shaped in the wind.

Black and white armor, fang-like decorations, two-color streamers flying behind the neck, blue light 
flashing in the eyepiece.

The anti-hero of chaos was summoned!

[Contrast HERO Chaos, ATK 3000]

"Although Chaos is Contrast HERO, he is also treated as an Elemental HERO' according to the 
rules, so he can be summoned according to the effect of Miracle Fusion."

Yuei Vu explained and waved his hand at the same time.

"Then the effect of Contrast HERO Chaos is activated!" he shouted, "Once per turn, during either 
player's turn: I can target 1 face-up card on the field; negate that target's effects until the end of this 
turn.

I negate the effect of Mask of Restrict'! "

A blue glow flashed in Chaos's eyes, and he tapped lightly on the equipment around his waist with 
his left hand. An electric current suddenly popped out of his belt, and the two-color energy visible 
to the naked eye was transmitted from the belt to the palm of his hand and exploded along the air 
with his outstretched right palm. The two-color storm hit the hideous mask through the air, and the 
latter followed a crackle of electricity and went limp.

"In this way, the restriction on sacrifices will disappear." Yuei Vu waved his big hand, "I take 
Elemental HERO Bladedge, Black Luster Soldier Envoy of the Beginning, and Contrast HERO 
Chaos as sacrifices!"

The three top fighters turned into golden lights and flew into the air. The flames in the air churned, 
and the burning brilliance condensed into an incomparably huge sphere as if the blazing sun had 
been summoned to this field.

"The ever-changing flames of heaven and earth will turn into eternal brilliance to shine on the 
earth!"

Yuei Vu raised his hand to meet the brilliant light.

"Advent! The Winged Dragon of Ra!"



The golden sphere began to deform and disintegrate, the power hidden in the depths of the sun burst 
out, and the shining golden light illuminated the entire hall.

The shell of the ball stretched out into golden wings, with rounded and perfect arcs. The noble 
divine bird raised its head, its eyes shone with divine light, and the golden light covered the sky and 
covered the earth.

"The Winged Dragon of Ra's attack power is the total value of the three monsters sacrificed."

[The Winged Dragon of Ra, ATK 8600]

"8600 ATK!"

The two good brothers Jonouchi and Honda have embraced each other with joy.

This was more than double of Obelisk, more than enough to OTK!

But Yuei Vu still did not launch an attack on this, but then raised a card in his hand: "Spell Card 
Monster Reborn! Target 1 monster in either GY; Special Summon it!

The monster I want to revive is

Osiris the Sky Drgon! "

The sky thunder churned, the thunder flashed, and the red dragon twisted its body and flew out. The 
high-pitched dragon chant seemed to break through the dome of the temple!

[Osiris the Sky Drgon, ATK 2000]

Although Yuei Vu had thought about using Monster Reborn to NTR the Egyptian God in the 
opponent's graveyard, he knew his own limit. The reason he could control his three Egyptian God 
cards was the help of the system and the bond he had accumulated over time. If he forcibly captured 
other people's Egyptian Gods, the gods may not listen to him.

"Then I activate the Spell Card Spider Web' from the hand! Select 1 card in the opponent's 
Graveyard that was sent there the previous turn, and add it to my hand." (Animation card)

The milky white spider silk flew straight into the Pharaoh's golden alchemy Duel Disk, and when it 
flew back it carried a heavy stone slab.

Fortunately, Yuei Vu once again performed the unique skill of "turning a stone slab into a card".

"What I added to my hand is the Spell Card Card of Sanctity'. Then I activate Card of Sanctity', and 
both players draw until they have 6 cards in their hand!"

With the replenishment of cards in the hand, the combat power of the sky dragon soared 
accordingly!

[Osiris the Sky Drgon, ATK 1000 ATK 6000]

"So strong" Jonouchi was stunned, "Is Yuei Vu already this strong? In such a situation, he can still 
summon two Egyptian Gods with an attack power of 8400 and 6000 respectively

No matter which Egyptian God's attack passed through, it was enough to instantly determine the 
victory!



"Battle!" No more hesitation, Yuei Vu directly issued an attack command, "The Winged Dragon of 
Ra, attack the Obelisk the Tormentor'! God Blaze Cannon!"

The golden divine bird opened its mouth, and energy condensed behind it, gradually forming a ball 
of light No, that was a burning sun!

The space was distorted by the high temperature, and streams of golden light converged into the 
mouth of the Winged Dragon, ready to go at any time!

But the nameless Pharaoh seemed to have been waiting for this moment!

"Turn the slab!" His voice was cold and powerful, "Instant spell Dark Spell Regeneration!"

Dark Spell Regeneration (Quick-Play Spell): When an opponent's monster declares an attack, select 
1 Spell Card from either player's Graveyard and activate it. Afterwards, send that card to the 
opponent's Graveyard. (animation effect)

The card that Pharaoh chose from Yuei Vu's graveyard was quickly determined.

It was the Monster Reborn which just entered the cemetery!

A huge resurgence symbol appeared behind the nameless pharaoh, and the ankh representing life 
was quickly ignited, burning cracklingly under the wrapping of the fire of heaven and earth.

The monster he wants to resurrect was

The Winged Dragon of Ra!

The ankh disappeared, replaced by a pair of wings made of flames. The immortal firebird soared 
into the sky with a shrill cry, and the heat wave brought by the dancing firestorm dominated the 
entire scene!

[The Winged Dragon of Ra (The Nameless Pharaoh), ATK 0]

"You actually called out the Winged Dragon at such a moment!?" Jonouchi was dumbfounded, and 
soon came back to his senses, "Could it be possible to use the power of God phoenix again to 
destroy the two Egyptian Gods on Yuei Vu's side ."

But the pharaoh didn't do that, instead waving his big hand immediately: "Turn the slab Super Team 
Buddy Force Unite! According to the type of servants I have on the field, call the servants of the 
same race to come!"

Super Team Buddy Force Unite (Trap Card): Target 1 face-up monster on the field; Special 
Summon 1 monster from your hand or GY, with the same original Type as that monster's, but with a 
different original name.

"Monsters of the same Type?" Honda wondered.

Yugi's eyes widened: "The only Type of monster on Pharaoh's field now is Divine-Beast!"

In other words, the monster that the Pharaoh wanted to summon could only be god!

"Return from the underworld!" The golden light of the Millennium Puzzle on the Pharaoh's chest 
shone, and the cloak behind him fluttered, "Osiris the Sky Dragon!"

The thunder falling from the sky penetrated reality and the underworld, and the red divine dragon 
soared into the air, letting out a high-altitude dragon roar!



[Osiris the Sky Dragon (The Nameless Pharaoh), ATK 6000]

Five Egyptian Gods, red, gold, and blue lights collided and intertwined on the field, and the storm 
that burst out made several people in the audience unable to stand upright.

"Are you kidding me?" Honda couldn't open his eyes, but he still yelled at the top of his lungs in the 
storm, "Did he just gather three Egyptian Gods during the opponent's turn?"

Yuei Vu narrowed his eyes and waved his hand: "But at this moment, my sky dragon's effect was 
also triggered. Summon Thunder Bullets!"

Two thunderbolts turned into lightning balls erupted from the mouth above Yuei Vu's sky dragon, 
split into two groups, and flew towards the sky dragon and winged dragon that had just appeared on 
the Pharaoh's side.

The Pharaoh's Sky Dragon ate the Summon Thunder Bullets head-on, grunting and losing its divine 
power equivalent to 2000 points of attack power. But although the Winged Dragon in the state of 
God Phoenix had 0 attack power, it could easily defend against the thundering sphere by just 
closing its wings.

The Winged Dragon in God Phoenix state was unaffected by any card effects.

[Osiris the Sky Dragon (The Nameless Pharaoh), ATK 6000 ATK 4000]

In terms of attack power, Yuei Vu's two Egyptian Gods still had the upper hand, but everyone knew 
that this was not the purpose of this ancient king.

Even if he used the Phoenix's effect to clear the field, he couldn't directly win the duel. Yuei Vu 
could still continue to operate this round, and at the end of the turn, the two gods Special 
Summoned by the Pharaoh would return to the cemetery.

So here he was aiming at something else!

"Obelisk the Tormentor's final ability!" The nameless Pharaoh snapped, "I use Osiris the Sky 
Dragon, and The Winged Dragon of Ra as sacrifices, unlimitedly enhancing Obelisk's power and 
forcing the opponent to fight!"

The sky dragon and the winged dragon landed on the arms on both sides of Obelisk respectively, 
and the red and golden lights wrapped around the body of the giant god, causing a surging divine 
power in the body of the God of Destruction!

[Obelisk the Tormentor (The Nameless Pharaoh), ATK 4000 ATK ]

Chapter 605: Meteor Stream

"It's over!" Jonouchi's heartbeat stopped again, "This time the battle is established, Yuei Vu will"

He did not continue, and no one spoke.

Everyone felt that at this point no one could blame Yuei Vu for anything.

He has shown great strength beyond common sense, and his duel skills were beyond imagination. 
It's just that the opponent was even more ridiculously strong, that's all.

He already tried his best

but would there still be some unwillingness?



Due to the change in the number of monsters on the field, the Battle Replay occurred. At this time, 
the attack power of the Pharaoh's Obelisk soared to infinite, and the battle resumed.

Not to be outdone, Yuei Vu's The Winged Dragon of Ra roared, and in his mouth was the God Blaze 
Cannon with churning golden light. The Pharaoh's Obelisk carried the Sky Dragon and the Winged 
Dragon on the left and right respectively. The three gods merged into one. Their power was 
combined into one place, superimposed on the God of Destruction's divine fist.

Facing the divine power that was so vast that it could shake the world, Yuei Vu could hardly feel his 
own existence.

This is the feeling of loss?

There seems to be no shame in losing to this pharaoh, the Yami Yugi from three thousand years ago.

After all, he is the protagonist, the true master of the Three Egyptian Gods, and is known as the 
strongest duelist in history. It's normal if you can't beat him, right?

wrong!

After closing his eyes briefly, Yuei Vu opened them again and looked directly at the world-
destroying divine power and the figure towering under the exciting light without fear.

What was standing there was not Yugi after all, nor the protagonist of this story.

Even if he completely copied everything about Yami Yugi, he was still stuck in the illusion of three 
thousand years ago.

After recovering from modern times and experiencing so many battles and hardships, Yami Yugi at 
this time was no longer the same as he was back then.

What was fighting Yuei Vu at this time was just the afterimage of a king who failed to defeat the 
great evil god Zorc three thousand years ago.

Maybe this trial does make sense.

If you can't even beat this afterimage that stayed three thousand years ago how can you have any 
hope to defeat the great evil god Zorc!?

Yuei Vu didn't intend to be stopped here!

"The battle will resume." The nameless Pharaoh's voice fell, "Infinity God Impact"

"Don't worry, I haven't run out of cards yet!" Yuei Vu interrupted him, "I activate the effect of 
Makyura the Destructor' that goes to the graveyard at the beginning of this turn! During this turn, I 
can activate Trap Cards from my hand!

So I activated the trap card Graverobber'! "

When that mean little tomb robber popped out of Yuei Vu's field, Jonouchi almost took off in 
excitement and shouted

Fuck, I'm familiar with this move!

"The effect of Graverobber is to select a card in the opponent's graveyard and I can activate it 
anytime you want during this round!" (animation effect)



Yuei Vu pointed straight at the Pharaoh's alchemy duel disk.

"The card I chose is the Trap Card Super Team Buddy Force Unite'!"

Yugi couldn't help but say: "The effect of Super Team Buddy Force Unite' is to select 1 face-up 
monster on the field; Special Summon 1 monster from your hand or GY, with the same original 
Type as that monster's, but with a different original name"

"The only Type of monsters on Yuei Vu's field now is Divine-Beast!" Jonouchi was excited.

"Return from the cemetery!" Yuei Vu shouted, "The God of Destruction, Obelisk the Tormentor !"

As if carrying everyone's hopes and prayers, the blue beam of light crashed down again, and the 
solid body of the God of Destruction returned!

[Obelisk the Tormentor (Yuei Vu), ATK 4000]

"Obelisk the Tormentor, activate your final ability!" Yuei Vu raised his hand, "Use the Sky Dragon 
and the Winged Dragon as sacrifices to increase your power to infinity!!!"

Yuei Vu's sky dragon and winged dragon also fell on the arms of the giant god, one on the left and 
the other on the right. The red, gold and blue colors merged into one, causing Obelisk to transform 
into a unique form of three gods in one!

[Obelisk the Tormentor (Yuei Vu), ATK 4000 ATK ]

The battle resumed, and then according to the effects of both sides' Obelisk, they must be forced to 
fight each other again!

"Infinity God Impact!!!" x2

In the ultimate conflict, the six Egyptian Gods unleashed their full force at the same time. With an 
impact that seemed to annihilate all light and sound, the three colors of light that squeezed and 
collided with each other seemed to gradually turn into pure white, dyeing the whole world into 
white

In that very brief moment, Yuei Vu felt like he was blown high into the air by a tornado and thrown 
into space beyond the dimension.

In a pure white world, where nothing seemed to exist, he vaguely sawa face?

It was a face that was abstracted to the extreme, its texture seemed to be carved out, and it looked a 
bit feminine.

A name flashed in Yuei Vu's mind for a brief moment.

He saw that the corner of the other party's mouth seemed to twitch slightly for a moment, like a 
smile.

The world spun for a while, and the huge gravitational force seemed to suck his body away. When 
he came back to his senses, the person had already fallen back to the floor of the temple.

Yuei Vu was half kneeling on the ground, sweating profusely, panting heavily uncontrollably.

Could that image just now be

Holactie the Creator God of Light?



Does this duel have anything to do with that creator god?

Yuei Vu turned his gaze back to the field. At this time, a total of six Egyptian Gods on both sides of 
the field have been wiped out and no longer exist.

But the duel was not over.

"The effect of Makyura the Destructor', I can activate the trap card from my hand." Yuei Vu stood 
up straight and drew a card from his hand again.

"Trap Card Damaged Mask! Special Summon 1 Masked HERO' monster from my GY, ignoring its 
Summoning conditions, but it will be destroyed at the end of the turn." (manga card)

The dark vortex in front of Yuei Vu opened up, and the hero with armor shining like diamonds and a 
blue cloak came back magnificently.

[Masked HERO Dian, ATK 2800]

Jonouchi's pupils constricted, Honda didn't dare to make a sound, Anzu also covered her small 
mouth and her heart stopped.

The nameless Pharaoh's remaining LP was 1700, and the Battle Phase was not over yet. If Masked 
HERO Dian completed the final blow

But the Pharaoh still had methods.

The last slab was turned over on the field of Pharaoh.

Sealed on that slab was the power of a trap, its name was High Speed Aria!

High Speed Aria (Trap Card): Send 1 Normal Spell Card from my hand to the Graveyard; this card's 
effect becomes that Normal Spell Card's effect when that card is activated. You cannot activate 
Spell Cards during your next turn. (animation card)

Here, the card discarded by the Pharaoh from his hand to activate the effect was

Soul Charge!

Soul Charge (Spell Card): Special Summon any number of monsters in your Graveyard, after which 
you lose HP equal to the number of summoned monsters x 500 points. (animation effect)

Everyone in the audience was stunned and stayed in place.

"Noit can't be?" Jonouchi felt his throat dry.

Now that the Pharaoh had 1700 LP remaining, a maximum of three monsters could be summoned.

As for which three he would summonneedless to say.

"In the name of the Pharaoh, return to my field once more

Osiris the Sky Dragon! Obelisk the Tormentor! The Winged Dragon of Ra! "

Lights of red, blue, and gold flew into the air, and then fell down. Three-color beams of light shot 
up into the sky, the winding red dragon, the towering blue giant, and the flaming undead firebird all 
came back in the same instant!

[Osiris the Sky Dragon, ATK 5000]



[Obelisk the Tormentor, ATK 4000]

[The Winged Dragon of Ra, ATK 0]

[The Nameless Pharaoh, LP 1700 LP 200]

"Why it will turn out like this?" Anzu covered her mouth, staggered back two steps, and sat down 
on the ground.

The atmosphere was terribly gloomy.

The failure itself was not the most terrible thing. What was terrible is that after so much hard work 
and so many reversalsbut in the end, it was still nothing.

The enemy was so powerful it's hopelessly powerful.

"Are you kidding me" Jonouchi said weakly, "At this time, in this situation, can he still summon the 
Three Gods?"

"Obelisk's ability can be obtained by sacrificing two other Egyptian Gods to gain unlimited attack 
power and force the opponent to fight him." Even Yugi Muto felt that there was no hope for the first 
time, "This time Yuei Vu must

!? "

The words of Yugi stopped abruptly, and he raised his head in surprise.

Because he found that Yuei Vu was smiling?

"Sure enough, in the end, do you still choose to use the power of the Egyptian God to end the battle 
this round? Because the Egyptian God is the strongest servant of the Pharaoh, it is natural to choose 
to end it in this way But at the same time, It laid the groundwork for the real direction of the script."

Yuei Vu waved his hand.

"But this is the real ending!" The card in his hand was quickly inserted into the Duel Disk, 
"According to the effect of Makyura the Destructor', I activate the trap card Meteor Stream' from 
the hand!"

"Meteor Stream!?" The audience was amazed.

"This card can only be activated when a monster is Special Summoned during the turn it was sent 
from the field to the Graveyard as a Tribute. Inflict 1000 damage to the opponent!" (anime card)

"NaNani!?" Everyone was shocked.

Jonouchi suddenly realized: "The sky dragon and the winged dragon were revived after they were 
Tributed for the effect of Infinity God Impact', in other words"

Honda hugged his good brother tightly: "A thousand points of damage!"

Yugi's eyes widened: "Did Yuei Vu have already calculated that the other party might call the 
Egyptian God again?"

But anyway, this was the last of the last.

Meteorites rained down from the sky with long tail flames trailing from the sky, as if burning fire 
rained down on the sky.



It's just an ordinary trap, a shower of meteorites and fire, a mere thousand points of damage, but it 
ignored the three invincible Egyptian Gods on the field. With an indomitable momentum, it marked 
the end of this game of gods.

The nameless Pharaoh looked up at the rain of fire falling from the sky, and at the countless 
churning meteors streaking across the sky. His expressionless and tense face seemed to finally relax 
at this moment.

He chuckled slightly, as if with a sense of serenity and relief.

[The Nameless Pharaoh, LP 200 LP 0]

Chapter 606: Nothing Is Written On The Card

Waiting for the result of this battle in this huge temple was not only a few people present but also 
thousands of friends watching online.

As the representative of screwball players, the only one who was lucky enough to be able to watch 
this duel from the front row was Heart Gone With The Wind.

But heres the problem, this guy was an autistic player who didnt go to forums, didn't watch live 
broadcasts, and didn't talk to other players. It was after he met Yuei Vu that he became more 
sociable and started to contact the player forum.

When the duel started on Yuei Vu's side, he just took a screenshot, opened a thread and threw it into 
the forum, then stopped popping up. The ensuing duel was full of excitement, with the six Egyptian 
Gods on both sides jumping back and forth repeatedly, and big monsters emerging one after another.

Heart Gone With The Wind has to take screenshots every once in a while. Every frame of the 
conflict between gods and gods could be called a world-famous painting. Just pull out a frame and it 
would be a high-quality wallpaper.

However, this guy took a few screenshots and threw them in the forum. This was a pain for 
countless screwball players who were itching and screaming.

"Holy shit, shit, shit!"

A large group of screwballs and uneducated speeches came and went in the forum.

Dont underestimate these two simple words.

"Holy" pronounced in a 4-octave and "shit" in a 4-octave can express surprise; "holy" in a 4-octave 
and "shit" in a 2-octave can express doubt; "holy" " in a 4-octave and pronounced "shit" softly can 
express fright; "holy" " in a 4-octave and pronounced "shit" loudy can express appreciation

This was the charm of language.

But the screenshots were just screenshots after all, and there were pictures but no process, which 
only made the players in the forum hungry and thirsty. It's as cruel as there was a naked beauty in 
front of you, but you were blind.

There were a lot of screwballs who couldnt stand it anymore.

"10000 signs written by blood, begging for a live broadcast!"

"Only a seedless man can post pictures but not videos"



"I have a life-and-death friend who asked me to ask if there is a live broadcast."

"Coincidentally, a friend of mine also asked me to ask if there is a live broadcast."

"The one above, I want to make friends with your friend."

""

However, Heart Gone With The Wind ignored all the replies that followed.

Apart from throwing the screenshots on the forum, he has been engrossed in watching the gods 
fighting.

Live streaming? What is that? Is it edible?

Not fun, not interesting.

However, he did record the whole process of the duel. Although he was just a simple player and had 
no interest in broadcasting or anything, he didn't mind posting this video on the forum later for the 
benefit of the public.

One after another reversal, wave after wave of earth-shaking collision of divine power, after a long 
time of fierce fighting, this duel finally ushered in the end.

[The Nameless Pharaoh, LP 200 LP 0]

Accompanied by the fire rain of meteors, the Pharaoh's LP finally dropped to zero. But his back was 
still straight, his feet didn't move, and he just calmly suffered the impact of the meteor stream.

The corners of his mouth were raised, and he smiled lightly, and his figure turned into an afterimage 
and disappeared.

A white radiance burst out from the opened door, flooding everything in the entire hall for a brief 
moment. Yuei Vu felt the sharp pain in his retina, and his eyelids closed uncontrollably.

When it was opened again, the temple had returned to the appearance when they came.

The splendid hall was like a palace paved with gold. The walls were so bright and reflective that 
they clearly reflected the gestures of the group of people like a brilliant golden mirror.

Collapsed columns, cracked walls, and floors were all restored, as was the hieroglyphic tablet 
sitting squarely at the far end of the room. The place where the "Pharaoh's True Name" should have 
been engraved was still leveled.

It was as if the war that just happened was just a dream, not real at all.

"What's the situation now?" Jonouchi was a little confused, "Did you win?"

"It should be right?" The tone of Yugi Muto was also a little hesitant.

Mana was still sitting on the ground, looking around blankly, her cute little face was filled with the 
classic philosophy of "Who am I? Where do I come from? What am I going to do?"

Anzu cast her eyes on the figure standing in front of the stone slab, and asked tentatively, "Yuei 
Vu?"

Yuei Vu turned around slowly, and several people held their breath at the same time.



Did we make it?

At least on the surface, Yuei Vu should have passed the Trial of the Pharaoh. He proved that his 
strength surpassed that of the Pharaoh three thousand years ago, and according to the process, he 
should have obtained the "Pharaoh's True Name".

Yuei Vu walked slowly down the golden steps and came to a few people without saying a word. He 
stopped, took out a card, and handed it over.

Yugi reached out and took it, and his friends quickly came over.

But they were all disappointed to find that it was just a blank slate. Empty, like a piece of white 
paper that hasn't had time to be inked, with nothing on it.

"I see, this is the only thing I can get through the trial" Yugi couldn't hide the disappointment in his 
expression.

I originally thought that I would finally know the real name of my other self.

I thought I could finally help him

In fact, Yuei Vu also felt a little confused.

This trial should probably have been prepared for the Pharaoh three thousand years later that was, 
Yami Yugi. Yuei Vu thought that if Yami Yugi himself was here instead of himself, he would be able 
to understand it quickly after getting such a blank card.

Nothing is written on the card = let there be effect.

When the time comes for the decisive battle with Zorc, all he needed to do is take out this blank 
slate and shout, "I'll banish the three Egyptian Gods from hand, deck or GY, and Special Summon 1 
"Holactie the Creator God of Light" from the deck, ignoring its Summoning conditions! Because of 
the effect of Holactie the Creator God of Light, I win!"

So the great evil god Zorc died.

Anyway, it was conservatively estimated that the villain who died due to the power of BISS could 
circle the earth, so adding one more great evil god made no change.

After going to hell, the Great Evil God might be able to communicate and share his experience of 
defeat with his fellow seniors when he was bored.

Zorc: The Pharaoh was really shady at that time. He took a blank card on the spot and said that 
although it was not written on the card, he could summon Holactie the Creator God of Light. I 
didn't even have time to say anything.

Dartz: Coincidentally, so am I. At that time, the Pharaoh also took a blank card, saying that although 
it was not written on the card, he could special summon three Legendary Knights. My snake god, 
not only it's not written on the card, but he doesn't have those three things in his deck at all

It's a pity that it was not Yami Yugi who passed this test, but Yuei Vu, the false protagonist of the 
world. The blank in his hand was just a blank, which is useless.

But the harvest of this trial seemed to be more than just this blank card.

Yuei Vu opened the skill panel, and was surprised to find that there was a new skill



Call The True Name!

No skill description, no trigger conditions. Although there was such an extra skill, the skill button 
was still grayed out, and it looked like it had not been unlocked yet.

This was a bit confusing.

Here Yuei Vu could only guess based on the usual routine of the card player.

This skillmay still have to be unlocked by playing cards?!

Chapter 607: The Great Evil God Who Seeks The Stone Tablet

When Yuei Vu finished playing cards and led a group of people out of the trial ground, Heart Gone 
With The Wind had already pressed the video and thrown it on the forum.

At this moment, a stone stirred up a thousand waves.

The number of clicks on the video soared, and a large number of comments came in, instantly 
making this video a hot spot.

Especially in the last round, the six Egyptian Gods destroyed each other with full force, and then the 
pharaoh miraculously pulled out his Egyptian Gods again to prepare for the final blow, but in the 
end, he missed a step and lost to the " Meteor Stream".

The discussion in the video's comment section was full of enthusiasm and admiration for Yuei Vu. 
At the same time, the players on the palace side of the royal capital also learned about Yuei Vu's 
progress through this video.

"As expected of Yuei Vu-san, you're sure to win!" Several players in the support team thought one 
after another.

Even stronger than they had imagined before.

NPC's upgrade speed is faster than their group of players, can you believe it?

And it seems to be much, much faster.

Like Miss Yuehua, a small tool person who entered the pit relatively early and had been hanging out 
with Yuei Vu since Battle City, at this time, there was actually a sense of pride in her small chest.

As expected of Yuei Vu-san! The protagonist of the world is so unreasonable.

Miss Yuehua now felt more and more lucky. Ever since she got into Yuei Vu-san's car, her 
popularity as a streamer has skyrocketed like a rocket.

Sure enough, being the people under Yuei Vu-san is so moist.

Although there were some unexpected situations on the side of the palace, they were finally settled 
without any danger. Thanks to the intervention of a few screwball players who had received the 
mission from Yuei Vu, the High Priest of Darkness's scheme finally failed, and Kisara did not die 
like she did three thousand years ago.

It's just that the Priest Mahad finally fulfilled his long-cherished wish and became the eternal 
guardian of the Pharaoh. At the same time, the corresponding memory of Yami Yugi who witnessed 
this scene also awakened, and at the same time further unlocked the true power of the "Dark 
Magician" in his deck.



The turmoil caused by the High Priest of Darkness seems to have come to an end.

Is that really the case?

After all, Akhenaden was just an NPC, a pawn in this large RPG. The players who were really 
facing each other in this game were still Yami Yugi and Bakura, and any NPC in this game was a 
pawn between the two of them.

Although his attempt to rebel seems to have failed, as a pawn, his role has actually been achieved.

While the pharaoh, the priest, and the players were all fighting underground, Bakura had once again 
sneaked into the palace without anyone noticing it.

Anyway, maybe Priest Seto was in charge of the guards of his Pharaoh's palace, because they were 
not much different from the security of Kaiba Corp. Not to mention the king of bandits, anyone 
could come and go in and out of the palace just based on his mood.

For example, now, Bakura sneaked in while the High Priest of Darkness was causing trouble and 
the palace was in chaos

find the stone tablet he was resurrected from.

Thinking of this, the great evil god couldn't help but curse in his heart.

NND, that Duel KingYuei Vu was so sinister, he actually stole the tablet that I need for my 
resurrection.

Of course, while a certain evil god was yelling curses, he intentionally or unintentionally ignored 
the fact that he also obscenely scratched off the true name of the pharaoh

But at the same time, Bakuea also felt very grateful. Fortunately, the Tablet of the King's Memories 
and the seven Millennium Items had a special bond. They were invulnerable, invincible, and 
absolutely indestructible by conventional means.

Otherwise, he had no doubt that with Duel King Yuei Vu's shamelessness, he would definitely 
smash this tablet until not even a scrap was left.

Thinking of this, Bakura couldn't help but want to laugh.

Yugi, Yuei Vu!

Your ultimate prop "Pharaoh's True Name" has been scratched off by me! How can you fight me 
now?

Muahahaha! ! !

While thinking about it, Bakura nimbly bypassed all the guards along the way and quietly groped 
his way into the palace's treasure house.

Yes!

My tablet!

Bakura was overjoyed, ignoring the golden treasures everywhere, and strode towards the stone 
tablet that was tightly tied with alchemy chains.



However, just after taking a few steps, Bakura suddenly felt a cold and hot wind blowing by his 
ears. His pupils shrank and he rolled back almost instinctively. The scorching wind wrapped the 
burning pillar of fire and flew forward, and the ruddy feeling exploded in the corner of the secret 
room.

"What?"

Bakura frowned, turned his head, and saw a golden evil dragon in the treasure house at some point, 
with golden bone wings and spikes all over his body, and a looming flame was exhaling from the 
corner of his mouth.

Curse of Dragon!

An old man stood there with a golden Duel Disk in his hands. Although he was not tall, his back 
was straight. His eclectic hair and beard were snow-white, and the alchemy Duel Disk shone with a 
light golden luster in the dark secret room.

That was Pharaoh's loyal servant, Priest Simon.

"Sure enough, I felt something was wrong." The old man narrowed his eyes, "The power obtained 
by Priest Akhenaden is very similar to the darkness on your body.

Coupled with this coincidental timing, it is really impossible not to make people think. "

"Oh?" Bakura stood up, turned his head to him, and sneered, "It seems that the priests around the 
Pharaoh are not all full of useless rice bags. Tell me, how did you notice it?"

"What you want is the tablet over there, right?" Simon continued, "The young man named Yuei Vu 
said that it is a very important thing to you, and it may even play a great effect in the next battle."

"Fuck." Bakura curled his lips, "It really is the most damned guy."

When the name was mentioned, Bakura's arrogant expression obviously restrained a little, and this 
detail also did not escape the eyes of Priest Simon.

"Sure enough, I knew that young man had a lot of background. You are afraid of him, aren't you?"

"Shut up!" Bakura muttered, "Afraid of him? Why should I be afraid of him? The true name of the 
Pharaoh has been eliminated by me from this Shadow Fame. Even if that guy is really what I think 
him to be, he is helpless now! Wait until I am fully resurrected"

He stopped here, squinted at Simon, and sneered again: "Hmph, it's meaningless to tell you this. 
After all, you're just an NPC"

He looked around as if to make sure that no one else was around.

"Old guy, you came here alone, don't you think you can stop me by yourself?"

"Don't underestimate me." Simon shook the Duel Disk in his hand. "Although I am old and no 
longer serve as a priest for the time being. But I am still more than enough to deal with a mere 
thief."

"Hmph, don't be so sure."

Bakura took a step forward, raised his arm, and also opened the alchemy Duel Disk in his hand.

"Then let me test the skills of the former priest!"



Chapter 608: Priest Simon

"Then the battle will start with me."

Priest Simon's small body stood in front of the only entrance. He opened his hand and the stone 
slabs descended following his guidance.

"Spell Graceful Charity'!"

The magic power in the stone slab was released, and the white-robed angel had a halo above her 
head, flapping his white wings and flying out in a circle, and the feathers fell like snowflakes.

Quickly changing the cards in his hand, Priest Simon glanced at his slabs, and his purple pupils 
revealed a deep and elusive light. With a wave of his long sleeve, he hit the two stone slabs in front 
of him and turned them into powder.

"Did you just change your hand at the beginning?" Bakura raised the corner of his mouth and 
smiled, "It looks like your starting hand isn't good, is it?"

But Priest Simon was completely unmoved and continued in a deep voice: "The spell Pot of Greed'! 
Get two new stone slabs."

Two more new stone slabs fell, and Bakura's eyebrows moved involuntarily, paying a little 
attention.

Another card that speeds up the draw?

Not that there's anything special about this. After all, Pot of Greed and Graceful Charity were the 
most common types of magic. There's nothing surprising about using these two cards.

But the problem was that the old man started checking cards like crazy and changing hands to 
accumulate resources. This kind of behavior made Bakura involuntarily think of a certain Duel 
King who made him forget about food and drink

Damn, Yuei Vu!

Ever since he came up with the idea that "this person might be Holactie's avatar", Bakura felt that 
something was a little abnormal about him.

Even when he slept at night, all he dreamed about was that uniquely handsome but particularly 
annoying face.

But now this old priestto be precise, the old former priesthas prepared any special tactics?

"Come on, the monster I want to summon is Featherizer!"

The green-robed magician landed lightly in front of Bakura, with long green ribbons undulating 
beside him.

[Featherizer, DEF 1100]

"With two stone slabs set on the field, this round is over!" Simon said.

"Just this?" Bakura licked the corner of his mouth, "If you are only at this level, you will be ruined 
by the darkness soon."

Simon's face was determined, and the wrinkles on his face were like knife carvings.



"Hey, this old man looks the same as Yugi's grandfather, so he must be someone with a special 
relationship with him. If he is taken hostage, it will definitely interfere with Yugi in the future."

Thinking of this, Bakura couldn't help but smile more sinisterly, and raised his arm: "My turn, 
draw!"

A stone slab fell, and his gaze flickered across the stone slab.

No matter what tactics or decks he uses, it doesn't matter. After all, he is just an NPC, what threat 
can he pose?

There is no one who can defeat this Zorc!

well, except Holactie.

But that doesn't matter either!

"The first is the Spell Card Pot of Greed, and then get two stone slabs."

Two new slates fell, and then he opened his palm and the slates turned over in front of him.

"I summon Zombino'!"

A quiet zombie boy came out slowly, with empty eyes, small leather shoes with round toes, patches, 
and stitches all over his body, and a shocking ax stuck in his head.

[Zombino, ATK 2000]

This Level 4 monster had an attack power of 2,000 points, which was enough to make this quiet 
zombie boy stand out among the lower-level monsters. However, what attracted most players to this 
card was not its attack power or practicality, but its unique card description.

"The two are so close

They die and return to life

Inseparable. "

At first glance, it looked like a monster with a backstory.

Of course, the Great Evil God was obviously not interested in these.

"Equip Spell Fairy Meteor Crush!"

A stone slab moved forward heavily in front of Bakura, turned over, and equipped on the boy. A 
faint stream of light covered his whole body, amplifying the zombie's abilities.

"Battle!" Bakura snorted, "Zombino, attack Featherizer!"

The boy jumped forward, his small round leather shoes making a crisp sound on the ground. He 
raised his hand pulled out the ax stuck in his forehead, and struck the magician elf hard with the ax.

Simon, LP 4000 LP 3100

The aftermath of the black impact penetrated and swept over Priest Simon, causing him to retreat 
slightly.



"Ha, are you okay, old man? This is just a welcome gift." Bakura sneered, "The effect of Fairy 
Meteor Crush' If the equipped monster attacks a Defense Position monster, inflict piercing battle 
damage to the opponent."

The old man only took two steps back slightly, his face remained resolute, and he said to himself: 
"When Featherizer was defeated, his special abilities were also activated!"

Featherizer: When this card is destroyed by battle and sent to the Graveyard, you can send 1 Gemini 
monster from your Deck to the Graveyard and draw 1 card.

Gemini monster was also a special monster type that appeared in the early days of Yu-Gi-Oh. Their 
characteristic was that they were treated as Normal Monsters while face-up on the field or in the 
GY. Only by being Normal Summoned again they could become Effect Monsters and gain the 
corresponding monster effects.

Here Simon sent the Gemini monster "Lucky Pied Piper" to the cemetery and obtained another 
stone slab.

"The old guy is quite capable of fighting." Bakura curled his lips, "Then I will also set two cards, 
and I end my turn."

"It's my turn again!"

The new slab fell. The old man glanced at it and summoned the monster inside the slab without 
much thought.

"Summon Witch of the Black Forest'!"

The witch in black robes stood on the field, her eyes closed and her long eyelashes drooped, as if 
praying for blessings.

[Witch of the Black Forest, ATK 1100]

"The next thing I'm going to use is the spell Card Destruction!"

Card Destruction: Both players discard as many cards as possible from their hands, then each player 
draws the same number of cards they discarded.

Bakura raised his eyelids.

Another card that changes the hand What on earth does this old man want to do?

Why does it feel like looking for a needle in a haystack? Are there any specific components he want 
to get from the deck?

Bakura had doubts in his conscience and frowned. As he waved his hand, the several stone slabs in 
front of him had all turned into golden light spots, and soon new stone slabs fell down.

The old man kept moving, Immediately afterward, he chanted a series of complex mantras, 
activating another stone slab covered on the field.

His pupils shrank and his arms were raised high.

"Activate the slab!" he shouted, "Spell Dwimmered Path!"

Dwimmered Path: Target 1 Spellcaster Effect Monster in your GY; add it to your hand.



Priest Simon quickly revealed the stone slab he wanted to retrieve into his hand.

The phantom of the stone slab appeared in the air, and the sacred six-pointed star magic circle 
appeared along with it. A head poked out from the sealed magic circle, and that face grinned, with 
scarlet and vicious eyes, although there was only one head, the majestic eyes still made people feel 
terrified.

That was

Exodia the Forbidden One!

Bakura: "!?"

This old manactually used Exodia against me!?

Chapter 609: Exodia Is Coming!

Exodia was well-known to everyone in the world of duel monsters. Regardless of modern times or 
ancient times, anyone who played cards must have heard of the name of this guy.

Exodia was also known as "the Legendary Defender of Egypt". Only five of its parts needed to be 
collected in the player's hand at the same time to forcibly rewrite the victory rules of this game and 
win the duel from the rules level.

As mentioned before, the strength of the effect of the cards in Duel Monsters directly reflected the 
strength of the monster spirit. The stronger the effect, the stronger the spirit.

If we used this criterion, Exodia, who could forcibly rewrite the rules of the game and directly 
achieve victory, was undoubtedly equivalent to god-level strength among duel monster spirits in all 
dimensions.

Given his tyrannical strength, the great evil god Zorc despised almost all spirits. But when he saw 
the lone head appearing in Simon's field, and the momentum that could not be concealed even 
though it was sealed, even Zorc couldn't help but feel a little afraid.

Fortunately, Simon didn't attack the five elders and gave him a good second. Otherwise, if he hadn't 
lost to Yugi or to Yuei Vu, and he would have been beaten by a mere NPC in this RPG, the great 
evil god would be really ashamed and never had the courage to meet anyone ever again.

Of course, under this worldview, it was practically impossible to start with five parts of Exodia.

Even if the protagonists and villains in the animation used a partial deck with only one core monster 
and the rest were all spells and traps, people have never seen anyone get a brick hand.

Especially for those final BOSSes, the whole deck had only three cards which were used over and 
over again, and the starting hand had to rely on the combination of a few fixed cards to start, but 
they could always touch it every time they started, relied on the high Duelist Rank to bully the 
opponent.

But even so, among all the big shots including the first-generation grandmaster of divine draw Yugi 
Muto no one has ever accumulated all the parts of "Exodia" purely by luck in the first two rounds.

The reason was also very simple, Exodia was too strong.



There was a reason that Exodia was called "The Forbidden One". The duel itself was actually a 
ceremonial process, a fighting ceremony to lift the seal. During the duel, trying to gather five 
sleeping Exodia parts from the deck was itself a ritual.

Although the character Amon in "Yu-Gi-Oh GX" has acquired the entire deck of Exodia, he still had 
to go through a duel to lift the seal. In the process, he even had to sacrifice the soul of his most 
beloved person before this powerful ancient mage would come.

Exodia was absolutely invincible, as long as it was unsealed in a duel, it would bring the victory of 
the controller. But for duelists, the biggest difficulty was actually the process of lifting the seal. If 
your LP returned to zero before the ritual could be completed, it would all be in vain.

The more powerful a spirit was, the higher the cost of appearing.

It was precisely because he understood this that Bakura calmed down quickly and revealed a 
sinister smile at the corner of his mouth.

"Humph, Exodia? Interesting." He licked his lips, "Old guy, you successfully attracted my attention. 
It seems that you are indeed an opponent worth fighting. But"

He paused, narrowed his eyes, and sneered softly.

"With your old bones, can you really support Exodia's appearance?"

Simon still ignored him. The old man received the stone slab with the head of "Exodia" sealed in his 
hand, then continued to cast the spell.

"Hereby calls with magic, the weapon of the magician Wonder Wand!"

Wonder Wand (Equip Spell): Equip only to a Spellcaster monster. It gains 500 ATK. If you control 
the equipped monster and this card: You can send both to the GY; and draw 2 cards.

There was only one monster on Simon's field, so the wand was naturally equipped to the Witch of 
the Black Forest. The witch closed her eyes tightly, and her slender white hand reached out from 
under her wide black-sleeved robe. She gently held the staff, and her magic power increased.

[Witch of the Black Forest, ATK 1100 ATK 1600]

"I activate the hidden magic of Wonder Wand!" Simon continued, "By sacrificing the witch and the 
wand together, I can obtain two new slabs!"

The witch and the wand both turned into golden light and dissipated. The golden light spots in the 
sky paused briefly in mid-air and then condensed into heavy stone slabs, which crashed down with 
a muffled sound.

"Witch of the Black Forest will also trigger magical abilities when entering the cemetery!"

Witch of the Black Forest: When this card is sent from the field to the graveyard, you can add 1 
monster with 1500 or less DEF from your Deck to your hand.

If the defense power was below 1500, then the monster Simon wanted to choose here was of course

"The slab I want to call is"

Numerous iron chains shot out from the void, and a huge stone slab was hanging from the sky.

" Right Arm of the Forbidden One'!"



Seeing the opponent drew so many cards in two rounds, recovered an "Exodia the Forbidden One" 
from the graveyard, and accurately retrieved a "Right Arm of the Forbidden One" from the deck, 
even the Great Evil God Zorc couldn't help but feel a little anxious at this time.

After drawing two cards and accurately searching Exodia's right arm, Simon's hand will reach a 
terrifying seven cards. Facing Exodia without seeing the contents of the opponent's hand at all was 
very terrifying.

Bakura's mentality at this moment was a bit like walking a tightrope. He seemed to have felt that the 
death was hanging invisibly above his head. The powerful momentum was so overwhelming that it 
was breathless. It was not surprising that a move would suddenly come out every moment and kill 
him for a second.

Bakura couldn't hold it any longer. At the moment when the effect of "Witch of the Black Forest" 
was activated and the "Right Arm of the Forbidden One" was about to join Simon's hand, he 
chained it with a big wave of his hand.

"Open the set card: Trap Card Multiple Destruction!" (animated card)

Bakura narrowed his eyes and hummed: "This card can only be activated when both players have 
three or more cards in their hands. Both players discard all cards in their hands, and receive 100 
points of damage for each card discarded this way. After that, we each draw five cards from the 
deck.

Hey, I don't know how many Exodia parts you've got, but at least one of them is Exodia the 
Forbidden One', right? Please throw them all away! "

Priest Simon's face changed slightly, and he looked at Bakura in surprise with a somewhat cold 
gaze.

This Bandit Kinghas such a strong survival instinct!

The timing of Bakura's "Multiple Destruction" was really perfect.

Because at this moment, the number of "Exodia" parts in Simon's hand has reached four!

Exodia the Forbidden One, left arm, left leg, and right leg, all four parts have been gathered in his 
hands.

Now Simon only needed to finish processing the effect of "Witch of the Black Forest" and add the 
last remaining "Right Arm of the Forbidden One" from the deck to his hand. At that moment, the 
ultimate seal would be lifted, and the invincible Exodia would appear. By that time, no matter how 
powerful Zorc was, he would not be able to escape the sanction of the Legendary Defender of 
Egypt.

Priest Simon was famous for controlling Exodia when he was young, and his strength was indeed 
powerful. Being able to gather the five parts of Exodia in just two rounds was already proud enough 
for a summoner.

It's a pity that there was only one last step left.

Despite his helplessness, the old priest could only watch the four slabs of the Egyptian envoys 
disappear one by one in front of him, dissipating along with the other two cards in his hand.

[Simon, LP 3100 LP 2500]



Bakura, LP 4000 LP 3700

The six cards were discarded to the graveyard, and five new cards replaced them. Then the effect of 
"Witch of the Black Forest" continued to resolve, and the "Right Arm of the Forbidden One" stone 
slab fell from the air to Simon's side.

It's a pity that it's already one step behind. The other four stone slabs of Exodia had already entered 
the cemetery, and now he only had the last one left in his hand.

However, this old priest's strength was not limited to this.

"Sure enough, you won't let me defeat you so easily." Simon snorted, "It's expected. Then summon 
the Right Arm of the Forbidden One'!"

The iron chain was hanging from the stone slab and fell, and the chain rubbed against the surface of 
the slate making a clear rattling sound. A golden magic circle emerged, and a right hand suddenly 
emerged from the magic circle and stayed on the field.

[Right Arm of the Forbidden One, ATK 200]

"Hey, is your brain broken?" Bakura sneered, "What's the point of summoning Exodia parts?"

Could it be that the old man was really angry because the unsealing ceremony was destroyed, but he 
decided to call the right hand to slap me?

But he soon knew the answer.

Simon closed his eyes and began to mutter something like an ancient spell.

Bakura: "?"

He began to have a bad feeling.

What is this summoning? Why does it look like a golden crispy chicken (The Winged Dragon of 
Ra)? Still want to recite a mantra?

Immediately afterward, Simon stared and raised his arms violently. A stone slab flew high into the 
air as if pulled by an invisible force.

"I use the Right Arm of the Forbidden One' as a sacrifice! The seal is lifted!

Show up, The Legendary Exodia Incarnate! ! ! "

Chapter 610: The Unsealing Ritual Failed!?

"The Legendary Exodia Incarnate, descend!"

Priest Simon's voice sounded like a bell but was soon drowned out by the louder wind.

The entire treasure house was shaking, and golden air currents swirled in the space. An oversized 
golden magic array appeared behind the priest, and a golden body as golden as wheat emerged from 
the huge magic array with the sound of a pinging chain.

A huge figure got out of the magic circle, the lines of his body seemed unreal. He dragged eye-
catching golden chains all over his body, and the friction of the chains gave off brilliant sparks of 
magic power.

[The Legendary Exodia Incarnate, ATK ?]



At that moment, even Bakura was almost frightened and ran away.

"Exodia!?" he exclaimed, "How!?"

Doesn't this thing require all five parts to be in the hand to unseal?

"No, it's not Exodia." Bakura quickly regained his senses.

Although it looked very similar in posture, and the oppressive force of the aura was also 
suffocating, it was still different from the real Exodia himself.

"The Legendary Exodia Incarnate is the afterimage of Exodia's power." Priest Simon said solemnly, 
"He possesses part of Exodia's power, and he draws magic power from the sealed parts sleeping in 
the cemetery!"

The Legendary Exodia Incarnate: Must be Special Summoned (from your hand) by Tributing 1 
"Forbidden One" monster, and cannot be Special Summoned by other ways. This card gains 1000 
ATK for each "Forbidden One" monster in your Graveyard.

Now all five parts were sleeping in Simon's graveyard, so the attack power of The Legendary 
Exodia Incarnate would soar by 5,000 points in one breath!

[The Legendary Exodia Incarnate, ATK ? ATK 5000]

"Attack power5000!?" Bakura's expression was like biting his tongue after eating garlic.

"Die under the magic power of Exodia!" Simon shouted, "The Legendary Exodia Incarnate, attack 
Zombino!"

The golden Egyptian defender waved his arms, and the iron chain embellished with golden light 
flew in front of him. A magic circle emerged between his staggered palms. The magic circle rotated, 
and the burst of golden light was like a cannon bombardment!

The zombie boy was instantly annihilated under the magic bombardment and was turned into ashes 
without a chance to resist.

"Uhhhhh!!"

This bombardment came from the power of Exodia, even the Great Evil God couldn't stand the pain 
of the magic power hitting the body. Bakura was blown away with an exaggerated expression 
(commonly known as face art), and rolled several times on the ground like a rag.

Bakura, LP 3700 LP 700

Bakura rolled a few times, and there was a muffled "bang" when the spine and a gilded pillar 
collided. He was lying on the ground and raised his hand before he could get up.

"Open the set card: Trap Card The Grave of Enkindling!" Bakura shouted, "When a monster I 
control is destroyed by battle and sent to the GY: Each player targets 1 monster in their GY; each 
player Special Summons their monster in Defense Position, but those monsters cannot change their 
battle positions!"

Simon frowned and quickly selected the stone slab to be revived from the cemetery.

"I resurrect the Witch of the Black Forest'."

Bakura said: "I choose Zombino'!"



The witch in a black robe and the zombie boy with an ax on his head each returned to their master's 
field, adopting defensive postures.

[Witch of the Black Forest, DEF 1200]

[Zombino, DEF 0]

"Set another slab, and this round ends."

Simon paused, followed by a sudden rise in tone, and raised his hand to point at the huge golden 
mage in front of him.

"The ability of The Legendary Exodia Incarnate is activated! The seal is lifted the first level!"

The image of the golden right hand bound by the iron chain flashed briefly, and as the stone slab 
flew out of the black vortex underground, it returned to Simon.

"Nani?" Bakura's pupils shrank and he quickly figured out the situation, "So that's the case, no 
wonder it's called Exodia Incarnate' This monster was made for the ceremony to lift the seal of 
Exodia, right?"

The Legendary Exodia Incarnate: Once per turn, during your End Phase: Add 1 "Forbidden One" 
monster from your Graveyard to your hand.

What Simon recovered from the cemetery here was the "Right Arm of the Forbidden One".

[The Legendary Exodia Incarnate, ATK 5000 ATK 4000]

"I see, as the number of Exodia parts in the cemetery decreases, his power will also decrease." 
Bakura sneered, "As Exodia's seal is further lifted, the power of the incarnation will also become 
weakeris that the case?"

Once I know the details, there is nothing to be afraid of.

All I have to do is win before the parts of Exodia are gathered!

"My turn!"

The LP value dropped sharply to only 700 in one breath, but Bakura remained stable and did not 
panic at all. He sneered, and hit a stone slab again.

"Activate the Spell Card from my hand Monster Reborn! Resurrect a monster in the graveyard!"

Simon frowned: "There should be no monster in the cemetery that can defeat the The Legendary 
Exodia Incarnate'"

But at this point, the old priest's words stopped.

Many cards were discarded through the trap card "Multiple Destruction", as well as the "Card 
Destruction" activated by Simon Until now, a large amount of resources have been accumulated in 
the Bakura's GY, so it was not surprising that there was something sleeping in it.

Sure enough, Bakura's pupils suddenly dilated and he shouted loudly: "Resurrection from the 
underworld, swallowing up the heaven and earth and wiping out all things

The Wicked Eraser! ! ! "



The pitch-black frenzy surged, and the entire palace was suddenly as black as ink. The Wicked 
God's silver-white claws tore through the darkness, and his hideous and huge body came out. His 
flicking tail was like a long steel whip breaking the golden stone pillar.

The Wicked Eraser, summon!

The dark field full of evil aura opened up, and it collided with the magic domain of The Legendary 
Exodia Incarnate, and it seemed evenly matched for a while.

"This is the Wicked God." Even the well-informed priest Simon was a little lost.

"Eraser's attack power is equal to the number of cards on the opponent's field x 1000 points. Now 
you have four cards in total on the field!"

[The Wicked Eraser, ATK 4000]

"The same attack power as The Legendary Exodia Incarnate." Simon looked solemn, "Do you want 
to die together?"

"Who wants to die together with you?" Bakura sneered, "Don't be too complacent, old guy! I want 
to activate this Spell Card from my hand, the secret of immortality, the forbidden book that records 
the forbidden spell

Book of Life! "

It was a thick ancient book with a hard green cover, decorated with exquisite patterns, and the cover 
was engraved with various ancient patterns and shapes.

"The first effect of Book of Life' I can Special Summon a Zombie monster from the GY. I 
resurrected Skull Conductor'!"

The uniformed zombie conductor revived on the field under the power of forbidden magic. His face 
was withered, but he grinned with a frightening smile and waved an ink-colored baton in his hand.

[Skull Conductor, ATK 2000]

"Then there is the follow-up effect recorded in the Book of Life'. This card can select a monster in 
the opponent's graveyard and remove it from the game!" The corner of Bakura's mouth raised, "The 
one I want to choose is of course this guy ..

Exodia the Forbidden One'! "

Simon: "!"

The old priest's face trembled, and sweat began to ooze from his forehead.

He knew exactly what that meant.

This meant that the head part of Exodia would be directly exiled from this game by this forbidden 
spell, and would no longer have anything to do with this game.

It also meant that he may never be able to complete the ritual of unsealing Exodia in this game.

Bakura raised his head and laughed.

"Farewell, Exodia!"
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