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Chapter 681: Who Is The Villain?

If he hadn't seen it with his own eyes, it might be hard for Yuei Vu to believe what President Kaiba 
did in the past thirty minutes.

Thirty minutes ago, President Kaiba was still looking attentively at the computer in the space station 
which was rebuilding Millennium Puzzle.

Yuei Vu clearly remembered that the computer said it would take six hours to put together this 
puzzle, so he had no doubt that President Kaiba might have really stood there with his arms folded 
for six hours, without even taking a sip of water or going to the toilet.

Until the computer stopped just before the Millennium Puzzle was about to be completed, and then 
brought Kaiba the bad news that one of the pieces had been replaced.

It was then that President Kaiba began to concentrate on studying how to deal with Aigami.

Yuei Vu heard that he made several phone calls, gave some instructions, called up surveillance 
cameras in an entire city, and also mobilized all the police in Domino City, dispatching a bunch of 
people from the Kaiba Corp's Special Forces.

Yeah, that's right, Special Forces, not bodyguards.

After all, it was normal for a game company to have its own professional special forces.

It may be hard for you to imagine that a few seconds ago the president was still saying, "Aigami is 
none of my business." A few seconds later, when the president discovered that Aigami had taken 
away one fragment, he immediately wanted to dig up the entire Domino City to look for him.

In particular, the way he gave orders on the phone reminded Yuei Vu more than once of the way 
those powerful villains in the movies looked when they ordered "Bring him back to me, dead or 
alive".

But finding the Aigami was certainly not enough.

Kaiba, who had already had an experience of fighting with Aigami, already knew the weirdness of 
his opponent. He knew that Aigami had some kind of spatial ability and could achieve some kind of 
instantaneous movement.

And Aigami also has the knack of being able to make a living person disappear. Kaiba saw with his 
own eyes that his entire bodyguard team, except Isono, was sent to another dimension by Aigami in 
the blink of an eye, and no one knew where they were now.

Originally, it might have taken a little more effort to find a way to restrain these abilities, but thanks 
to the extremely arrogant Aigami, he pretended to be cool while caringly explaining about Prana to 
Kaiba, and explaining the Quantum Cube's operating principle in detail.

Aigami may have thought that no one couldn't understand him anyway, so showing off a bit would 
make him look more impressive, but it's a pity that he picked the wrong person.

Who is President Kaiba?



Even someone who died 3000 years ago could be brought back to life by the president. How could 
Aigami's little trick give him trouble?

At that time, while Aigami was explaining his metaphysics, the president activated his brain, which 
looked human-like on the surface but was probably a supercomputer, and simultaneously translated 
the operating methods of the "Quantum Cube" into the scientific language he was familiar with.

So Yuei Vu watched in bewilderment as Kaiba tinkered in the laboratory of the space station for half 
an hour, and in an instant, he came up with a set of three pieces of equipment for countering 
Aigami.

First of all, it was some kind of obstacle device. Yuei Vu, a science scumbag, couldn't understand its 
principle, but he at least understood that this thing could prevent Aigami from calling for help 
within a certain range.

Kaiba seemed to have discovered that every time Aigami uses special abilities, he has to shake 
people first and move out all his friends called "Prana". Only by synchronizing the consciousness of 
all companions could the effect of their abilities be maximized.

This obstacle device could interfere with his communication with other Prana and weaken his 
power.

Then there was a set of protective armor that covered the wearer from head to toe. Although Yuei 
Vu was just as confused about how this thing worked as he was when he listened to the teacher's 
lecture, he also understood that if you wore this thing, Aigami couldn't send you to another 
dimension.

The last one was a mask, which was used after catching the Aigami. According to the president's 
idea, this mask could suppress people's brain waves and reduce the wearer's consciousness 
frequency to the lowest level. As long as Aigami wore this thing, all of his special abilities would be 
disabled, and his "Quantum Cube" would become a useless toy.

Yuei Vu: What else can I say?

President is awesome!

These three pieces were designed in just half an hour. Even if he didn't want to, Yuei Vuu was still 
in awe of President Kaiba's black technology ability.

In fact, he felt that the president was a bit like Mr. Stark from the studio next door. They were both 
super rich, and used to be arm dealers before changing their careers midway.

The important thing was that their black technology talents were indeed somewhat similar.

For example, if Iron Man wanted to fight the Hulk, he created the "Hulkbuster" armor; if he wanted 
to fight Thor, he created the "Thorbuster" armor.

And our President Kaiba wasn't inferior. He just needed 30 minutes to come up with this "Aigami-
buster armor".

Although the main thing that made the president unusually different from ordinary people was his 
superhuman body that was unscathed even after jumping out of a jet, but now Yuei Vu suspected 
that he may have a superhuman brain with extremely abnormal computing power and could use 
mental arithmetic to dig Bitcoin.



With the design completed, Kaiba planned to complete the production of his first batch of samples 
today.

Seeing President Kaiba's attitude of fighting to the death with Aigami, Yuei Vu even felt sympathy 
for Aigami for a moment.

In fact, although Aigami played the villain role in the movie, according to what the author Mr. 
Takahashi himself conveyed in the interview, he believed that Aigami was definitely not a bad guy.

On the contrary, Prana was set up as the side with justice. The main purpose of Aigami was nothing 
more than to prevent the president from digging the Pharaoh's grave and take his friends to ascend 
to the ideal world to create a better future.

During this period, although he was once blinded by hatred and thought about seeking revenge for 
Shadi on the host of the Great Evil God Zorc, Ryo Bakura, but when he caught Bakura, he still 
relented and did not take action.

If you looked at it from another angle, the movie probably told such a story

Seto Kaiba, the kingpin of Domino, was not satisfied with his current dictatorship and power and 
insisted on dragging the dead who had rested in peace to play cards.

The brave young man Aigami stood up to stop the kingpin's conspiracy. He experienced the 
experience of being blasted by Kaiba's shameless card-printing technique, being captured and 
kidnapped alive, being interrogated, falling into the dark side, going on a rampage, and being 
blasted again. In the end, he still failed to stop the kingpin's conspiracy and was lost forever. 
Without their own abilities, he and his friends never have been able to see their ideal world.

It seemed to be a tragedy.

To a certain extent, Kaiba was actually fitter to the image of a villain than Aigami. Even in the 
movie, when Kaiba and Aigami were facing each other at that station, no matter how you looked at 
the president's aura, he was more like a boss whose power level was as high as 530,000.

While watching the president work, Yuei Vu's Duel Disk suddenly rang. He clicked on the option to 
connect. It seemed that the call was from Chika.

That's right, not only could smart Duel Disks now basically have all the functions of mobile phones, 
but there was even a mobile signal in the president's space station.

"What's wrong?" Yuei Vu asked.

"It's Judai." Chika's hesitant voice came, "He seems to have fainted."

Chapter 682: You Are Done!

When Yuei Vu returned to Domino from Kaiba's space station, Little Judai had already been taken 
to the hospital by everyone.

Fortunately, the doctor said after examination that he was in very good health and had no problems. 
He just needed to stay for a little more observation just to be safe.

When Yuei Vu rushed to the ward, Little Judai had already regained his energy and was jumping 
around the room. He seemed to have endless energy to vent, and it didn't look like he had just been 
in a coma.



At this moment, Chika was holding his hand and teaching him: "You can't run around when you go 
out from now on. Do you understand?"

"But I want to go to the toilet."

"Then you must tell me." Chika said, "If you need to go to the toilet, I will take you with me. You 
can't just run around without saying a word."

When she discovered that Judai was missing, perhaps no one was more anxious than Chika. She felt 
as if she had lost her own child.

Fortunately, nothing went wrong in the end. Jonouchi, who came with Yugi, found Judai 
unconscious on the second floor.

Judai tilted his head: "But Yuei Vu-sensei said that Sister Chika got lost on the way back from 
school one time."

Chika: ""

Because it is indeed true, there seems to be no way to refute it.

"The point is, you can't run around by yourself anymore. Then everyone will be worried about you, 
do you understand?"

"Oh." Judai whispered, "I'm sorry, sister."

Seeing the little jellyfish acting so well-behaved, Chika said nothing and only rubbed his head 
gently.

Judai was the first to notice Yuei Vu who opened the door and jumped out of bed as soon as his eyes 
lit up: "Yuei Vu-sensei!"

With that said, he swept the floor and jumped on Yuei Vu.

First, after confirming that Little Judai was fine, Yuei Vu asked about the specifics of the matter. 
Soon he roughly figured it out. It seemed that Judai ran out to find the toilet without saying hello to 
anyone, and somehow he was found unconscious upstairs.

What was interesting during this period was that after everyone found out that Judai was missing, 
they separated to look for him. In the process of looking for him, Chika-chan also got lost.

When he heard this, Yuei Vu couldn't help but glance at Chika. And Chika-chan had already 
covered her face and turned her head away as if saying:

Its so embarrassing, dont watch QAQ

Yuei Vu let out a breath. Considering that Chika-chan must have been having a hard time when 
Judai ran away, he didn't say much and just patted her shoulder to express comfort.

Yuei Vu thought of anecdotes he had seen a long time ago.

Someone found a dead whale on the coast of East Yorkshire, England. There were no injuries on its 
body, but it was a full 800 meters away from the nearest coastline.

It is speculated that it may have been stranded on the coast and wanted to roll back into the sea. 
Unfortunately, its sense of direction was too bad and it rolled in the wrong direction.



It was enough to show that having no sense of direction was not an individual problem or even a 
human problem.

For example, Miss White Dragon girl, a spirit that was said to be comparable to three Egyptian 
Gods, didn't she have a sense of direction too?

Judai has narrated his experience to everyone more than once. But until now, he still couldn't 
explain exactly how he passed out and what he experienced during that period.

"I remember that I seemed to have met a big brother." Judai tried to remember.

"Big brother?" This caught Yuei Vu's attention, "What kind of person is he?"

"Well, he was wearing the same clothes as Mr. Yugi. He was a bit dark, and yes, he had a strange 
cube thing in his hand. He wouldn't let me touch it, saying that it was given to him by a very 
important person."

Judai's little eyebrows were knitted together. He tried to remember for a long time, and finally 
scratched his head and chose to give up: "Ah, I can't remember. I don't even remember the rest of 
it."

But these have already provided Yuei Vu with a lot of information.

Does this description sound like Aigami?

What did Aigami do to my students?

Judai seemed to remember nothing, but Yuei Vu felt that someone should know what exactly 
happened.

A person who was inseparable from Judai at all times and played the role of personal bodyguard.

"Then you guys stay here for a while." Yuei Vu stood up and said, "Take care of Judai. I'll go find 
the doctor to ask about the situation, and call his parents to inform him."

However, when he exited the room, he did not do what he said. Instead, he avoided the eyes and 
ears, found an empty utility room, and slipped in.

Yuei Vu closed the door with his backhand and said calmly to the empty room: "Okay, I know you 
are here. No one else is here now, we can talk."

Broad black wings spread out from the shadows, and beautiful heterochromatic pupils lit up from 
the darkness. Yubel walked out slowly with her arms crossed.

"What happened?" he asked.

"You already heard it from Judai," Yubel replied.

"Not all." Yuei Vu paused and asked, "Did you defeat the person Judai mentioned and protect 
Judai?"

Yubel didn't speak, but his expression became a little subtle.

"Wait, you didn't do it?"

This surprised Yuei Vu a little.



He was pretty sure that the man Judai met was Aigami. If Aigami took action against Judai, whether 
it was trying to erase his memory or kick him out of this dimension, Yubel would definitely not sit 
idly by.

But Judai was still here fine, he had not disappeared to another dimension, and the memory of 
Aigami had not disappeared either.

Since it wasn't Yubel who defeated the Aigami, who else could it be?

It cannot be

Yuei Vu's eyes changed and he thought of something: "Judai defeated his opponent by himself, 
didn't he? Or should I say the other guy hidden in his heart?"

This time it was Yubel's turn to be surprised: "You! How much do you know?"

"Enough." Yuei Vu frowned and asked, "But how could this happen? Has his other personality 
woken up?"

"No."

Yubel did not ask how Yuei Vu knew so many details for the time being, but she was only more 
curious about Yuei Vu in her heart.

There were many secrets hidden in Yuei Vu. He was a man that she could not see through no matter 
what. There were not many such people in this world.

More than once, she thought about sneaking in while Yuei Vu was sleeping, tying him up and 
studying him thoroughly, but unfortunately, she couldn't defeat him.

"We call the sleeping personality of Judai The Supreme King'. He shouldn't have woken up so 
early." Yubel said, "It's far from that time, and there's no opportunity yet."

"Then why?"

"I don't know either." Yubel was a little irritated, "Maybe it's because of the influence of that boy. 
He has a strange cube in his hand. That thing can affect people's consciousness and touch things 
hidden deep in your mind. I think it was that thing that disturbed the sleeping Supreme King."

Fuck you Aigami, not only are you not good at playing cards, but you are also really talented in 
making trouble.

Yuei Vu muttered in his heart.

But since Aigami was so unfortunate to mess with Supreme King, one of a few people on the planet 
that he probably shouldn't mess with the most, wouldn't it be

"That boy, is he still alive?" Yuei Vu asked.

Playing cards with the Supreme King and losing, wont even his ashes not remain?

"No," Yubel snorted, "The Supreme King's power was not fully awakened, and he fell back to sleep 
immediately after the duel. The guy was probably seriously injured, but at least he barely survived."

When Yubel said this, her strange eyes narrowed.



"But he is a hidden danger." She said, "That guy is aware of the existence of the Supreme King and 
knows the potential hidden in Judai's body. And he is not an ordinary human being. He has some 
extraordinary powers that I can't understand.

He may come back, maybe there are other powerful companions behind him, maybe they have 
already targeted Judai."

"Don't worry." Yuei Vu said calmly, "I will handle it."

Yubel moved his eyes: "Do you have a clue? Do you know who the other party is?"

"So be it."

Originally, the goal of Aigami and the others was just to stop the president from digging his grave 
and trying to ascend. It was not an evil plan and it had no bad consequences. As long as their Prana 
didn't mess with anything and peacefully ascended, Yuei Vu had no intention of taking the initiative 
to cause trouble for Aigami.

But now, this guy actually dares to touch his lovely student.

Then he's done playing with Aigami.

Kaiba Corp, headquarters.

"Brother!" Mokuba said, "The test results of the first batch of equipment to counter Aigami have no 
problems. Theoretically, they should achieve good results.

Moreover, the new generation of Duel Disks is also equipped with an Anti-Dimension Duel system. 
As long as this new system is used, Aigami will not be able to use his ability to overwrite the rules 
and force a Dimension Duel'! "

"Hmph, very good." Kaiba crossed his arms, thought for a moment, and said, "Inform Yuei Vu to 
come get a new model of Duel Disk. He may also need it next."

"Okay, brother!"

Mokuba immediately went aside to dial the phone.

He knew that Brother Yuei Vu liked Duel Disks the most, and he would definitely be very happy to 
hear this news.

Kaiba turned his head and glanced silently. A group of well-trained agents stood behind him, all 
loaded with guns and ammunition. They were wrapped in blue exoskeleton suits from head to toe, 
and the eyepieces of their helmets lit up with a dark red flash.

A whole team of the most elite agents under the Kaiba Corp, equipped with a full set of "Aigami-
buster" that made them unaffected by Aigami's weird dimensional ability.

They were all ready to go. Now just wait for the computer to give the location of Aigami, and they 
were immediately dispatched like a police dog that smelled the prey, and accurately captured the 
opponent.

"Aigami." Kaiba's eyes were cold, "You're done!"

"Ahem!"



Aigami, the "villain" who was hunted by Yuei Vu and Kaiba at the same time and was about to face 
a disaster, was currently in a corner of Domino, slumped on the ground with his back against the 
wall, coughing out a mouthful of blood.

Although he managed to escape, he was seriously injured.

He was a little out of strength at the moment, he couldn't control his legs and feet very well, and the 
Quantum Cube was also overused, making it difficult to concentrate for a short period of time.

He leaned against the cold corner, breathing heavily.

"What the hell. Who is that kid?"

Chapter 683: I Won't Be Prana Anymore!

Night falls. Aigami stood on the top floor of an empty building, overlooking this duel city with an 
increasingly technological sense, with a complicated expression.

Prana's power could be influenced by the mind. Thanks to these special abilities, most of the 
injuries suffered by Aigami in the duel with the Supreme King yesterday have been healed.

But at this time his mood had changed.

Originally, when he stood up as a representative of Prana, his whole ego was extremely inflated. He 
had extremely high confidence in his own strength and felt that Yugi was just a Duel King in name, 
and beating up Kaiba was just a piece of cake.

But after repeated defeats and defeats, even the most arrogant person would be hit to some extent.

This was also the question that Aigami was thinking about now.

Master Shadi said that I have extraordinary talents, the kind that just one of ten thousand has. Isn't 
he actually trying to comfort me?

Maybe my dueling skills are actually not so good?!

And what's the situation with that kid? What is the spirit from another world next to him?

He was confident before and felt that even if he faced Duel King Yuei Vu, he would have a good 
chance of winning by taking advantage of the rules of Dimension Duel and the strength of the 
Cubic deck.

Who would have thought that before he bumped into Yuei Vu, he couldn't even beat his young 
apprentice?!

Aigami was now deflated and a little cracked. It was as if his inflated confidence had been violently 
penetrated head-on, leaving a huge gaping hole in his heart.

There were some things that after being broken, there was no way to restore them to their original 
state.

Fortunately, although he didn't win the duel, he secretly swapped a piece of the Millennium Puzzle 
in Kaiba's hand in the underground temple.

Lord Shadi said that the Millennium Puzzle has the highest status among the Millennium Items, 
symbolizing the authority and status of the Pharaoh. Only the chosen ones could assemble the 
Millennium Puzzles, and even then it would take many years.



Aigami has already seen Kaiba Seto's science and technology that are even more metaphysical than 
metaphysics. He has no doubt that Kaiba can use his own black technology to speed up the process 
of putting together the puzzle.

But no matter how awesome his Kaiba's black technology is, it will still take at least ten and a half 
months to put together the Millennium Puzzle, right?

Aigami exhausted his brain and tried to think of exaggerated aspects, but he also felt that it should 
not be possible to go faster. There's no way he, Kaiba, can put the Millennium Puzzle together in 
one day, right?

If he can, I'll eat the Quantum Cube in my hand on the spot.

Since Atem left this world, Prana has been preparing for the dimensional ascension for a whole 
year. Now that that time was finally coming, of course, it was impossible to let Kaiba ruin their 
goal.

To be safe, Aigami did not keep all the Millennium Puzzle fragments in his own hands but gave one 
of them to his sister Sera. In this way, even if he accidentally fell into Kaiba's hands, Kaiba would 
not be able to get the last fragment from him.

As steady as an old dog!

However, if Aigami knew that after he gave the fragment to his sister, his sister turned around and 
handed the fragment to Muto Yugi

"Diva." A gloomy voice sounded from behind Aigami, "What are you doing?"

In fact, Aigami was not his real name. His name was actually Diva. It was very easy to think of a 
cute girl who sang and played games and occasionally drove a mecha to fight monsters.

Aigami turned around and saw his good brother Mani behind him.

Mani was his closest friend among all Prana's companions besides his sister Sera and one of the 
people he trusted most.

"I'm thinking about my next move."

"Thinking?" Mani whispered, "We don't have much time."

"I know. But Seto Kaiba is not a person who gives up easily and cannot be easily persuaded."

"Maybe you are too indecisive, Diva." Mani interrupted, "Maybe there are some things that 
someone should have made up their minds about long ago. You should have killed Seto Kaiba a 
long time ago!"

This decision may be a bit extreme, but it may indeed be the last option they face now. After all, 
there was not much time left before the dimensional door opened. Perhaps drastic measures were 
indeed the best solution to the problem.

It's not that Aigami didn't agree with this decision, but the problem now was

He couldn't beat Kaiba!

That damned Kaiba could draw cards from the floor! The one who is so cute when he draws is 
Zhang Jushenbing!



Who can beat this guy?!

"In addition, there is the host of the great evil god, the one who personally killed Lord Shadi." Mani 
said solemnly, "You haven't sought revenge from him yet, have you?"

Shadi, who was equivalent to an adoptive father and mentor to these orphans, died in front of all of 
them five years ago and has existed in the form of a soul ever since.

And the murderer was none other than Bakura, or to be more precise, Bakura who was possessed by 
the great evil god Zorc.

Although technically the murderer was Zorc, after all, he borrowed the hand of Tapi Liang to kill 
him. This scene cast a huge shadow on the young Aigami and other Prana companions. Aigami has 
not given up the idea of revenge to this day.

But Mani never shared the same view.

Mani was not as impulsive as Aigami, nor was he as easily drawn into the vortex of hatred. It wasn't 
like what he would normally say.

There's something wrong with him.

"Mani? What's wrong with you?"

Only then did Aigami notice that his companion was abnormal. He found that Mani's face was as 
gloomy as dripping water, and there was an unknown darkness in his eyes. Looking at him was like 
staring into the abyss or being stared into by the abyss.

As a companion who had grown up together, Aigami had never felt that Mani was as strange as he 
was now.

Their Prana consciousnesses were highly synchronized, and they could sense each other's existence 
even if they were far apart.

But now he couldn't feel Mani's consciousness. Staring at the other person and listening to those 
heavy and muddy words, he only felt darkness.

"Your successive setbacks and repeated defeats have made me realize one thing, Diva." Mani said, 
"That is, Prana also has its limits."

"What do you want to say, Mani?"

Mani laughed ferociously: "I won't be Prana anymore, Diva!"

He suddenly raised his arm and made a grabbing motion with his right hand. Countless pitch-black 
particles converged towards his hand, transforming into a shining golden alchemy ring.

Millennium Ring!

Aigami's expression suddenly changed: "Impossible! This thing"

"I found it, Diva! It's in the temple where you dueled with Kaiba!" Mani's voice was hoarse and 
twisted, "It showed me new possibilities, ways to transcend limits!

Now I can destroy everything, no one can stop me! "



Aigami realized that it was the deepest darkness in the Millennium Ring. The evil thoughts residing 
in this circle tainted Mani's consciousness, emptied his brain of anything that was originally there, 
and filled it with anger, hatred, lust, and everything else.

The person standing here now was no longer Mani.

This was a brand new personality that was possessed by the evil thoughts of the great evil god Zorc.

Aigami immediately activated the Quantum Cube, trying to resist the power. But before he could 
release his mental power, he was already hit by the dark vortex.

That was a powerful force that he had no way of counterattacking. He felt like his ribs were 
cracked, his body felt like he was hit by a car, his head was violently dizzy when he landed, and it 
felt like thousands of people were whispering in his ears.

"Mani"

He saw that his friend's body was possessed. The demon who killed their adoptive father seemed to 
have returned again, occupying a different host this time, and showed its fangs ferociously, as if 
mocking his weakness and incompetence.

There was nothing he could do.

He didn't have the power to defeat this demon, nor could he save his best friend from the darkness.

In a daze, Aigami felt as if he had gone back many years ago, losing all his extraordinary power and 
turning back into that helpless child, kneeling next to Master Shadi's cold body and crying.

"Disappear, Diva." Mani raised the Millennium Ring towards him and sneered, "I will complete 
your unfinished business and what you lack the courage to do."

But almost as soon as the words fell, Aigami saw Mani being shot away, followed by a long series 
of screams.

The Millennium Ring was struck from Mani's hand and flew far into the air, making a series of 
metal collision sounds in the air.

Then it fell steadily into the hands of Yuei Vu on the side.

Yuei Vu raised his hand and held the Millennium Ring: "Tell me, why are you so capable of causing 
trouble even after death?"

Chapter 684: Be Quiet!

"Ahhhh!!!"

Yuei Vu held the Millennium Ring in his hand, and a roar that seemed to come from the void 
sounded in his ears. The voice sounded full of fear, unwillingness, and rage.

Considering that this was something lodged in the Millennium Ring, Yuei Vu thought that this 
should be the Great Evil God Zorc or at least something related to him.

To be more precise, this was not the Great Evil God Zorc himself. After all, Zorc has died and was 
blown to pieces by Holactie the Creator God of Light. There was no trace left, just like the filth in 
the toilet that was washed away by the power of the Toilet Cleaning Spirit.



It's just that a powerful existence like Zorc transcended the concept of ordinary creatures. Its body 
was destroyed and its soul was crushed to pieces, but there was still some evil obsession left.

Just like the stubborn Legendary C.

A little bit of obsession has lost its original power, and it is impossible to resurrect the great evil god 
Zorc from this bit of obsession. But even so, it was the dark resentment of the Great Evil God. 
Combined with the powerful divine power of the Millennium Ring itself, it was still a force that 
could not be underestimated.

If you left it alone and let it taint the hearts of others with its deepest evil thoughts and find a new 
host, it still had the potential to become a terrible disaster, just like what it did to Aigami in the final 
battle in the movie.

It's a pity that it now fell into the hands of Yuei Vu.

Yuei Vu heard the thunderous voice blasting unwillingly in his ears, roaring with fear. He felt that 
the beast trapped in this golden ring was desperately attacking the cage that bound it again and 
again, and his reaction was like saying

Fuck, why are you here again?! !

Holactie, you are so boring! I'm already dead. Why are you still so stubborn about me?

It seemed that the remaining consciousness in the Millennium Ring retained the memory of the 
Great Evil God Zorc during his lifetime.

That's why it reacted so violently when it encountered Yuei Vu.

Yuei Vu straightened his arms and moved the Millennium Ring in his hand a little further away 
from him.

A mass of darkness visible to the naked eye was released from the ring and twisted into a dark 
abstract entity. It was not big in size, but it vaguely bore the burly outline of the former Great Evil 
God Zorc, and even the black dragon capital under its crotch was lifelike.

Aigami behind him sat down on the ground, raised his head, and froze when he saw the black 
figure.

How could something so dark and evil exist in the world?!

Only then did he realize that he had underestimated the evil thoughts in the Millennium Ring and 
the power of the great evil god. Even though the main body no longer existed, it still had this hellish 
and terrifying power.

This was the full force that Zorc's evil thoughts could unleash. It bared its teeth and claws, showing 
its evil fangs, as if it was going to use up everything it had left to fight its old enemy to the death.

"It's so noisy." Yuei Vu said impatiently, "You were very noisy when you were alive, but now that 
your ashes have been scattered, you can still jump around like this. Aren't you tired? Be quiet!"

The twisted black shadow in mid-air froze instantly.

It was angry, full of hatred, and wanted to tear Yuei Vu into pieces. At that moment, it did have the 
idea of "going up and fighting until death."



But as soon as Yuei Vu's voice sounded, his mind was filled with images of the infinitely powerful 
posture of the Creator God of Light in the memory world, the "Light of Creation" that dispelled all 
darkness in the world. Immediately afterward, it relived in its mind the moment when its own body 
was reduced to ashes and the miserable appearance of the dragon's head and neck vertebrae under 
its crotch being broken and cracked.

The Great Evil God Zorc was fearless and would never back down.

Unless absolutely necessary.

The black shadow froze for a while, then quickly disappeared and disintegrated, then shrank back 
into the corner of the Millennium Ring, as if it was dead and no longer moved at all.

In fact, there was really nothing Yuei Vu could do to deal with the remaining evil thoughts in the 
Millennium Ring. This thing was invisible and intangible, and the Millennium Ring could not be 
destroyed. It was really impossible to deal with it if it just shrank into the ring like a turtle.

The ancients used only one method to deal with such things, and that was sealing.

Either dig an unprecedented deep pit in a remote place and bury it, or seal it with some 
indestructible sealing technique. However, as we all know, the villains who were dealt with in this 
way would sooner or later come out by various chances and continue to cause trouble, and they 
would usually be even more awesome than when they were sealed.

So Yuei Vu decided to keep the Millennium Ring with him and watch it first. It was much more 
reliable than sealing it in any corner.

But in this way, the big crisis at the end of the movie should no longer exist.

At the end of "Dark Side of Dimension", Aigami was swallowed up by the darkness of the 
Millennium Ring and went berserk, triggering a large-scale disaster. But now that the Millennium 
Ring was in Yuei Vu's hands, naturally, nothing could happen.

Now there was one problem left to deal with.

Mani had fallen to the side unconscious. Yuei Vu put away the Millennium Ring and turned his gaze 
to Aigami beside him.

When Aigami met his gaze, the alarm bells in his heart rang loudly, and he held his breath for a 
moment.

He personally felt the power of Zorc's evil thoughts and saw with his own eyes that just one look or 
one word from Yuei Vu scared the shit out of him, causing him to retract into the Millennium Ring 
and shut himself up.

Duel King Yuei Vu was so terrifying!

"Aigami, right? I'm looking for you." Yuei Vu said, "I heard that my student received a lot of care 
from you before."

Aigami: "?"

Is this because the younger one is beaten so the older one comes out?

But the problem is



I was the one who got beaten!

The apprentice beat the man up outside and went back to report to the master. The master shook his 
head and said your posture was wrong and not harsh enough, let me show you the correct posture 
for hammering.

How can this be true?

"I heard that you are very powerful, a rare strong man. Even President Kaiba seemed to have almost 
been defeated by you."

Aigami: I'm not, I didn't, don't talk nonsense.

He pulled out the Obelisk from the floor. How can I beat him?

"Anyway, you've piqued my interest."

The Duel Disk on Yuei Vu's arm unfolded, the system was activated, and all the indicators were lit 
in sequence.

He agreed to Sera's conditions and would do his best to prevent President Kaiba from digging 
graves and disturbing the sleep of the deceased, so that their Prana could successfully ascend, and 
the Millennium Item "Quantum Cube" would be left to Yuei Vu.

Yuei Vu didn't intend to kill Aigami, but just taught him a lesson.

In the movie, Aigami failed at everything he did except causing trouble. Without him, there 
wouldn't have been so many troubles. Moreover, this guy was suspected of still harboring hatred for 
Shadi's death back then, and he might even cause harm to Bakura in the future.

So in order to prevent the next series of possible mishaps and teach Aigami a lesson, Yuei Vu 
decided to confiscate his crime tools directly.

In layman's terms, the Cubic deck.

In the world of Yu-Gi-Oh, how can he continue to play without a deck?

"Bullying a ten-year-old child is something only a coward could do. Do you dare to try it with me?"

Aigami felt that he should refuse. The recent continuous blows made him feel a little unconfident 
when facing the legendary duel king.

However

"It's what I asked for." Aigami began to say harshly, "Then I'll let you see how terrifying the Cubic 
monsters are!"

Chapter 685: Please Start Your Performance

"Duel!" x2

Yuei Vu, LP 4000

Aigami, LP 4000

"At the moment when the duel begins!" Aigami raised his right hand high, and the Quantum Cube 
was spinning in mid-air, "Our domain has also been expanded!



This duel will be fought in our Prana way, our Dimension Duel! "

Yuei Vu curled up his lips and smiled softly.

"That's not necessarily true."

"Nani?"

Aigami was surprised to find that things did not unfold as he imagined. The expansion of the 
dimensional domain stopped stiffly as if it encountered some obstacle. The rotation of the Quantum 
Cube was stopped, and its power seemed to be interfered with.

"What!?"

Aigami quickly discovered the Duel Disk worn by Yuei Vu, the source of this interference.

"Sorry, but the village rules end here." Yuei Vu chuckled, "I have no intention of following your 
rules."

Even Yuei Vu had to admit that President Kaiba was really reliable in some aspects. "Dimension 
Duel" was such a metaphysical thing, yet he actually analyzed it completely in such a short time. 
It's simply outrageous.

Obviously, Aigami also felt that this was outrageous. His eyes were wide open at this time, and he 
looked straight at the Duel Disk in Yuei Vu's hand.

"Impossible!" he exclaimed, "Does this Duel Disk actually have a system that can resist the power 
of Prana?"

"Don't tell President Kaiba that it's impossible, you will be surprised." Yuei Vu shrugged, "That's 
probably it. You have to follow our rules this time."

"Hey." Aigami clicked his tongue and continued to speak harshly, "Such details don't matter, my 
Cubic monsters will not be blocked just because of this level!

My turn, draw! "

The first move started from Aigami's side. He glanced at the six cards in his hand and quickly 
finalized the strategy in his mind.

"Activate the Continuous Spell Cubic Dharma!" he said, "Send 1 Cubic' card from my hand to the 
GY and draw 1 card!"

He picked a card and sent it to the graveyard, replacing it with a new card in his hand.

"Then I summon Vijam the Cubic Seed' in attack position!"

One eye emerged from the churning black mist, and the flying golden light spots transformed into a 
dark and twisted body. The core of the Cubic monsters and the starting point of the strategy, Vijam 
came to the field.

[Vijam the Cubic Seed, ATK 0]

As soon as he saw this guy, Yuei Vu couldn't help but want to say: Are Vijams stuck in your hands?

"Set a card, I end my turn!" Aigami said, "If you can, just come and defeat me, Duel King! Then 
you will see how terrifying the Cubic monsters are!"



What a strange request. Yuei Vu said in his heart.

"Then it's my turn, draw."

Yuei Vu showed two cards in his hand.

"Summon Elemental HERO Solid Soldier'."

[Elemental HERO Solid Soldier, ATK 1300]

"The effect of Solid Soldier." Yuei Vu said, "When this card is Normal Summoned: I can Special 
Summon 1 Level 4 or lower HERO' monster from my hand. I summon the Elemental HERO 
Stratos'!"

[Elemental HERO Stratos, ATK 1800]

"The effect of Stratos." Yuei Vu said, "When this card is Normal or Special Summoned, add 1 
HERO' monster from my Deck to my hand. I will add this card from the deck to my hand."

A card popped out of the card slot of the Duel Disk, and was drawn into Yuei Vu's hand, flipped 
over, and displayed.

"Destiny HERO Plasma!"

Aigami: "!"

He has investigated Duel King Yuei Vu and learned about the characteristics and abilities of some 
powerful monsters in Yuei Vu's hands. Among the monsters that particularly attracted his attention 
was the "Destiny HERO Plasma".

A hero who could seal all the special effects of all monsters on the opponent's field as long as he 
was on the field was so powerful that it was almost unreasonable.

This thing was simply the natural enemy of his Cubic deck!

Almost his entire deck relied on monster effects. Vijam, which had 0 attack power, could only stand 
on the field because of its special effect of "not being destroyed by battle and making the opponent's 
monsters de-dimensionalized'". There were other powerful beatsticks such as Indiora Doom Volt the 
Cubic Emperor and Buster Gundil the Cubic Behemoth, but their original attack power was all 0, 
and they had to rely on their own monster effects to increase their attack power.

Destiny HERO Plasma stood on the opposite side of the field, and oh, the Cubic monster was turned 
off directly.

Then he might not have a chance to let Yuei Vu see the horror of his Cubic monsters, because all his 
Cubic monsters have become zero-attack blanks.

Aigami looked at Yuei Vu with fear.

Could it be that this guy already knows the characteristics of my deck, so he specially prepared this 
kind of thing to deal with me?

But Aigami quickly calmed himself down.

Wait, Plasma is a big monster with a very high appearance cost. It is not so easy to get three 
sacrifices in one turn. I still have a chance.



"Quick-Play Spell Mask Change." Yuei Vu said, "Send 1 HERO' monster I control to the 
Graveyard, then Special Summon 1 Masked HERO' monster from my Extra Deck with the same 
Attribute.

I sent the Elemental HERO Solid Soldier' to the GY, transform!

Masked HERO Dian! "

The diamond-like shining armor covered the solid hero's body, the silver-white sword drew bright 
lines, and the azure gemstone shone in the center of the hero's belt.

[Masked HERO Dian, ATK 2800]

Aigami also recognized this Masked HERO. But what puzzled him was why Yuei Vu didn't attack 
with Solid Soldier first and then use the transformation effect.

After all, the advantage of Mask Change was that it was a Quick-Play Spell that could be used even 
in the Battle Phase. In this case, why not use Solid Soldier's attack to test Aigami's trap first, and 
then use Mask Change to attack additionally?

And Yuei Vu quickly gave the answer. He slowly drew another card from his hand.

"Equip Spell Rainbow Veil! I equip it to Masked HERO Dian'." Yuei Vu said, "When the the 
equipped monster battles an opponent's monster, while that monster is on the field, its effect is 
negated during the Battle Phase only!"

Aigami: "!!!"

WTF, is this kind of thing usually included in the Duel King deck?

Does it mean that all the effects of the monsters battled with "Masked HERO Dian" are negated? 
This means that this "Masked HERO Dian" can cut through my entire square deck with one sword!

As mentioned before, the original attack power of his Cubic monsters was basically 0, all of which 
are increased by the effects of his own monsters.

This meant that if any Cubic monster fought against a Dian equipped with "Rainbow Veil", they 
would not only lose their monster effect, but all their attack power would be reduced back to 0 at 
the moment of the battle.

Aigami had a strong delusion.

He felt as if he was being targeted.

"Battle!" Yuei Vu said, "Masked HERO Dian, attack Vijam the Cubic Seed'."

After a pause, he smiled slightly.

"Vijam cannot be destroyed by battle, and can "de-dimensionalize" the monsters it has fought by 
moving itself to the S/T area. However, if it is negated by Rainbow Veil, all these abilities will be 
ineffective."

Aigami gritted his teeth.

Indeed, under that rainbow light, Vijam the Cubic Seed was just a fish with zero attack power. Dian 
raised the sword and slashed Vijam into two pieces, then it exploded on the spot.



The impact of the explosion swept toward Aigami's front door, but the golden glow of the 
Continuous Spell "Cubic Dharma" in his back row erupted, forming a protective layer to resist the 
damage.

"The effect of Cubic Dharma'." Aigami said, "As long as this card is on the field, I take no battle 
damage from attacks involving my Cubic' monsters."

"Then the effect of Masked HERO Dian'." Yuei Vu said, "When this card destroys an opponent's 
monster by battle and sends it to the GY: I can Special Summon 1 Level 4 or lower HERO' monster 
from my Deck.

I Special Summon Elemental HERO Shadow Mist! "

[Elemental HERO Shadow Mist, ATK 1000]

"The effect of Shadow Mist If this card is Special Summoned: I can add 1 Change' Quick-Play Spell 
Card from my Deck to my hand."

Yuei Vu drew another card from the deck and displayed it.

"Add the Quick-Play Spell Mask Change' to my hand."

Followed by a wave of his hand.

"Elemental HERO Stratos, attack directly!"

The hero of the sky jumped up, his metal armor humming low, the two turbines behind him turning 
at full speed, and a milky white whirlwind erupted in front of him.

"Open the set card!" Aigami's defense line has not been broken, "Trap Card Pinpoint Guard! When 
an opponent's monster declares an attack: Target 1 Level 4 or lower monster in my Graveyard; 
Special Summon it in Defense Position!

The monster Special Summoned by this effect cannot be destroyed by battle or card effects this 
turn. "

A card that entered Aigami's graveyard just a few seconds ago was ejected.

"Resurrect from the graveyard! Vijam the Cubic Seed!"

[Vijam the Cubic Seed, DEF 0]

Stratos's whirlwind encountered an obstacle, and the deformed Cubic monster jumped out and lay 
across the attack route.

"Due to changes in the situation on the field a Battle Replay occurred, and my attack was 
suspended." Yuei Vu said.

This made Aigami feel a little relieved.

The resistance of the Pinpoint Guard prevented Vijam from being destroyed in any way during this 
turn. There was no point even if he continued to attack.

"Then my Battle Phase is over." Yuei Vu said, "Then I activate the Quick-Play Spell Mask Change' 
from my hand! Send 1 HERO' monster I control to the Graveyard, then Special Summon 1 Masked 
HERO' monster from my Extra Deck with the same Attribute.



I sent the Elemental HERO Shadow Mist' to the GY, transform!

Masked HERO Dark Law! ! ! "

The jet-black mist erupted, and dark black armor with wild curves emerged from the abyss, looking 
like a hungry wolf!

[Masked HERO Dark Law, ATK 2400]

"When Dark Law is on the field, any card sent to the opponent's GY is banished instead.

Set a card, I end my turn."

After finishing the declaration, the black Masked HERO crossed his arms and stared at Aigami with 
cold and sharp eyes. There was a set card at his feet, and Yuei Vu then made a "please" gesture, 
which meant "please start your performance."

Aigami: ""

Chapter 686: Isn't It Common Knowledge That There Is Fiend In HERO Deck?

Masked HERO Dark Law, a hero who held the power of (un)friendship. Just by standing there, he 
could make the villain's blood surge, making them unable to restrain the urge to take action.

For example, the current Aigami, at this moment, really wanted to send this black eyesore to 
another dimension.

"My turn."

Aigami took a deep breath and tried to calm down.

Fortunately, his Cubic deck was not the kind of deck that relied heavily on graveyard resources. 
Most Cubic monsters were Special Summoned by overlapping themselves on top of "Cubic Seed 
monsters". Although the graveyard blockade could not be said to have no impact, it was not too 
fatal.

"Activate the Spell Card Pot of Greed'." Aigami said, "Draw two more cards from the deck."

Two new cards were drawn from the deck, and Aigami unfolded the two cards. Before he could see 
clearly, he saw the pitch-black hero on the opposite field suddenly flash out, and the pitch-black 
claws shot through the air and grabbed him without saying a word. Then the black hero hit a card in 
his hand.

Aigami was shocked to see the cards in his hand being knocked away and sucked away by the dark 
vortex until they disappeared out of thin air.

It's like going to another dimension.

He suddenly raised his eyes to look at the dark Masked HERO opposite, and then remembered: "By 
the way, this guy has another effect."

"That's right, when the opponent adds cards from the deck to the hand outside the Draw Phase, 
Masked HERO Dark Law can banish 1 random card from the opponent's hand." Yuei Vu said.

"Hey, there are all these troublesome effects, then I activate the effect of the Continuous Spell Cubic 
Karma' in the GY!" A card popped up in the strange Duel Disk constructed of cubes by Aigami, 
"Banish this card from my Graveyard; add 1 Cubic' monster from my Deck to my hand.



I added "Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast" from my deck to my hand! "

This monster was based on the Indian divine bird "Garuda" that many people were familiar with.

"Then I'm going to summon it from my hand! The second Vijam the Cubic Seed'!"

[Vijam the Cubic Seed, ATK 0]

"When there are two Cubic Seed' monsters on the field, overlap those two monsters below, and this 
guy can be Special Summoned from my hand!"

Aigami raised the card he had just retrieved, and an endless red light bloomed on the card.

"Special Summon! Appear, Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast!!!"

The gathered golden light spots expanded rapidly, like golden bubbles bursting themselves one by 
one. The fiery red divine bird appeared bathed in the shining light. It waved its sharp wings like 
steel knives, and the wings cut out dazzling arcs.

"Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast's attack power will increase by 1000 points for each monster 
overlapping below it." Aigami shouted.

[Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast, ATK 0 ATK 2000]

With an attack power of two thousand points, this value barely surpassed Stratos, but it was not 
enough compared to the two Masked HEROes.

But Aigami obviously also had a countermeasure: "Activate the Spell Card Cubic Wave! The attack 
power of a monster on my field is doubled, and the attack power of a monster on the opponent's 
field is halved!

I doubled the attack power of Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast'! Halve the attack power of Masked 
HERO Dian'! "

Domineering golden waves were quickly released from the Spell Card, and the power of the red 
bird increased rapidly, while the Masked HERO in diamond armor was also weakened.

[Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast, ATK 2000 ATK 4000]

[Masked HERO Dian, ATK 2800 ATK 1400]

"Then there's that annoying Equip Spell." Aigami took out another card, "Quick-Play Spell Mystical 
Space Typhoon! Destroy that damned Rainbow Veil'!"

The black whirlwind with lightning rolled up, broke through the rainbow light in one breath, and 
tore the Equip Spell into pieces. The layer of rainbow light that was rippling around Dian's body 
dimmed instantly.

"In this way, the obstacle will no longer exist." Aigami sneered and waved his hand, "Come on! 
Blade Garoodia, smash the Masked HERO Dian' to pieces!"

The crimson firebird soared into the sky, its steel wings swung in the air. The arc drawn by the sharp 
blade turned into two flying golden rings that shot through the air.

"Open the set card: Trap Card Battle Simulation!" Yuei Vu said, "When a monster battles another 
monster: Halve the ATK of both those monsters during the damage calculation only, also they 
cannot be destroyed by that battle." (Animation card)



[Masked HERO Dian, ATK 1400 ATK 700]

[Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast, ATK 4000 ATK 2000]

The trap released a transparent protective layer, and the golden blade impacted violently. The 
collision between the light blade and the energy shield created endless sparks, and the spilled 
damage was halved by the buffer and then swept past Yuei Vu.

[Yuei Vu, LP 4000 LP 2700]

"But the attack power is only halved at the moment of damage calculation. Blade Garoodia' can 
attack twice per turn!" Aigami said, "Then the target of this attack is Masked HERO Dark Law!

[Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast, ATK 2000 ATK 4000]

In the second attack, the golden blade cut through the space and flew forward. The sharp light blade 
broke through the Dark Law's armor, and the dark hero's body was split into two parts.

[Yuei Vu, LP 2700 LP 1100]

"Ha, the Duel King's Masked HERO is nothing more than that."

After breaking through the two obstacles of Dark Law and Rainbow Veil, Aigami seemed to feel 
that he had regained his confidence, and couldn't help but chuckle.

"The effect of Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast'!" Aigami continued, "If this card destroys a monster 
by battle, I can return this card to my Deck to Special Summon all the Cubic Seed' monsters 
underneath this card!

The golden divine bird's body glowed with golden light, and then disintegrated like endless golden 
bubbles. It split into two and re-transformed into two distorted "Vijam the Cubic Seed".

[Vijam the Cubic Seed, ATK 0] x2

"After that," Aigami drew a card from the deck and said, "Add 1 Buster Gundil the Cubic 
Behemoth' from the deck to my hand."

Buster Gundil the Cubic Behemoth had a powerful offensive ability of 3000 attack power and could 
attack three times in one turn. But it required three "Cubic Seed" monsters on the field to meet the 
summoning conditions. Obviously, Aigami still lacked one.

"At the end of the Battle Phase, I activate the effect of the Continuous Spell Cubic Dharma' again!" 
Aigami said, "Once per turn, send 1 Cubic' card from my hand to the GY and draw 1 card. "

He sent a card from his hand to the graveyard, drew another card, glanced at it, and immediately 
inserted it into the Duel Disk.

"Set a card, I end my turn."

Yuei Vu glanced at the opponent's formation on the field.

There were two Vijam the Cubic Seeds left, and one set card.

Aigami must know that he had the "Destiny HERO Plasma" in his hand, and Vijam couldn't stand in 
front of the power of Plasma.



In other words, could the set card in the backfield be used to protect Vijam or to defend against 
attacks?

Or maybe it's a trap specifically prepared to deal with Plasma?

"My turn, draw! Activate the Spell Card Graceful Charity'. Draw 3 cards, then discard 2 cards."

Yuei Vu selected the two discarded cards without much hesitation and then inserted the remaining 
one directly into the Duel Disk.

"Spell Card Card of Demise! I can draw cards until I have 5 cards in my hand."

Yuei Vu didn't even bother to emphasize the side effect of "sending all the cards in his hand to GY 
in his 5th Standby Phase after activation". Saying it made him feel like he deserved a beating.

After replenishing the cards in his hand, Yuei Vu's eyes moved when he saw a newly drawn card.

Oops, I drew another interesting thing.

"I Tribute two monsters on the field, Elemental HERO Stratos' and Masked HERO Dian'!"

The two heroes on the field were enveloped by a white whirlwind.

Aigami: "?"

Two monsters as sacrifices?

Isn't it Plasma?

A card in Yuei Vu's hand was slapped onto the Duel Disk, "Perditious Puppeteer!!!"

The hero's body disappeared from the field, replaced by a ferocious demon whose figure was as 
erratic as mist, with intricate puppet threads wrapped around the sharp claws of his hands.

[Perditious Puppeteer, ATK 2700]

Aigami: "??"

Is this thing a hero?

Why is there such a thing in the hero deck of Duel King?

This question was interesting.

Knowing that he was going to play with Aigami's Cubic deck this time, as usual, Yuei Vu naturally 
made a few targeted adjustments before the game.

As we all know, the Cubic deck liked to keep "Vijam the Cubic Seed" on the field. Although this 
thing had 0 attack power, it could not be destroyed by battle and could "de-dimensionalize" any 
opponent it fought with, which was very insignificant.

But Vijam the Cubic Seed was only a Level 1 monster.

This was why Yuei Vu had such a thing in his pure HERO deck.

"Perditious Puppeteer's effect is activated!" Yuei Vu stuffed a card in his hand into the graveyard, 
"Once per turn, I can discard 1 card; gain control of all face-up Level 3 or lower monsters the 
opponent controls, until the End Phase!

According to this effect, all the two Vijam the Cubic Seed on your field belong to me! "



Aigami: "???"

Chapter 687: Wouldn't Your Conscience Hurt?

Aigami: Repeatedly cracked.JPG

Damn it, what weird things are you bringing in the hero deck?!!

Why do you still have such a thing!?

Aigami stared blankly as the abstract demon waved his fingers, and ten transparent silk threads flew 
out and entangled the two "Vijam the Cubic Seed" on his field.

Vijam's standing ability could be completely ignored in the face of an indiscriminate force of the 
puppeteer from hell. The two Vijams bound by silk threads were scattered into light spots all over 
the sky and dissipated. Then they condensed and reorganized on Yuei Vu's field as if they were 
being pulled over.

It's just that they have all become string puppets in the hands of the devil.

In this way, Aigami's front row became empty and undefended.

"Battle!" Yuei Vu said, "Perditious Puppeteer, attack Aigami directly."

The devil laughed ferociously, waving the thread in its hand as if wielding the devil's authority. The 
two Vijams flew forward but not of their own free will.

The two bound Cubic monsters were like two huge lead balls, turning into two black afterimages 
and smashing into Aigami's body. They have become weapons of the devil.

Aigami gritted his teeth, and he could almost hear the sound of his own teeth grinding. But he did 
not sit back and wait for the dead, he still had the means to resist.

"Open the set card!" Aigami said solemnly, "Trap Card Quaking Mirror Force!"

"Oh?" Yuei Vu raised his eyebrows.

"It can be activated when the opponent declares an attack." Aigami said, "Change all the opponent's 
Attack Position monsters to face-down Defense Position. Monsters changed to face-down Defense 
Position by this effect cannot change their battle positions.!"

The golden sand dust rolled up and formed a hemispherical shield to protect Aigami. The two Cubic 
monsters hit the sand shield like meteor hammers, quickly causing the shield to backlash.

The sand and gravel formed a golden tornado soaring into the sky. The two Cubic monsters were 
the first to bear the brunt. They were unable to resist and were forcibly turned over by the 
sandstorm, turning into two covered cover cards and covering them on Yuei Vu's field.

Then the devil was not spared either. Hell's puppet demon screamed sharply, and the abstract face 
hidden in the fog twisted ferociously, and then disappeared into thin air, turning into a covered card 
lying across the field.

All three monsters on the field flipped over under the power of the sandstorm, but Yuei Vu was not 
surprised: "So that's it. It seems that this is the method you originally prepared for dealing with 
Plasma, right?"

Aigami's lips pursed into a slit, his face gloomy and he did not say a word.



"Indeed, Plasma's ability perfectly restrains your Cubic monster, but he would be powerless if he's 
turned inside out. It's a pity that you have to use this trap in advance."

At the end of the Battle Phase, Yuei Vu slowly pulled out a card in his hand, the fateful hero who 
had always been feared by Aigami.

"Take the three monsters on the field as sacrifices." The hero's card fell onto the duel plate with a 
snap. "The power of destruction brings the end of the fate of all things, and turns into the ultimate 
hero.

Destiny HERO Plasma! ! ! "

The quality of the air seemed to suddenly increase, and a bloody swamp appeared on the ground. 
The ferocious claws poked out, and the gloomy-blooded hero rose slowly, dripping blood flowing 
along the strange lines, and the dark bone wings spread out like a cloak, covering the sky and the 
sun.

[Destiny HERO Plasma, ATK 1900]

"When Plasma is on the field, the effects of all monsters on the opponent's field will be negated. Of 
course, I believe you already know this part." Yuei Vu smiled.

Aigami gritted his teeth, sweat dripping down his face.

He clearly knew that the hero in front of him had the ability to deal a devastating blow to his deck. 
Plasma's terrifying ability could turn all of his flashy Cubic brothers into harmless Chihuahuas.

But he still tried to force himself to regain his composure.

Plasma was not absolutely invincible. Although this was another ultimate killer weapon against 
Cubic decks to be honest, Aigami feels that all Yuei Vu has taken out during this duel were killer 
weapons he also had weaknesses.

Generally speaking, the biggest weakness of Plasma was that its attack power was only 1900, which 
made it easy to defeat. However, it is still a bit too high for Cubic monsters whose attack power is 
basically piled up by monster effects.

Fortunately, apart from the effect of blocking the monster's effect, Plasma itself had no resistance to 
Spell and Trap cards. Aigami thought that he still had a chance.

"You are thinking that there is still hope for you to get rid of the Plasma, right?" Yuei Vu said 
suddenly.

Aigami: ""

He said nothing and did not dare to look directly at Yuei Vu.

It was as if he was afraid that eye contact would reveal his true thoughts.

"It's not wrong to think so. Although it may be difficult for you, it is not impossible to get rid of the 
Plasma." Yuei Vu shrugged, "So let me be more cautious."

He said, slowly pulling out another card in his hand.

Aigami's eyes widened as he looked at the card he was about to play, and for a moment, alarm bells 
rang in his heart, and he suddenly had an extremely ominous premonition.



"Continuous Spell Prohibition." Yuei Vu said, "Declare a card name, and the declared card cannot 
be used in this duel!

The card that I want the declare, of course

Yuei Vu smiled kindly and strangely.

"Vijam the Cubic Seed."

Aigami: "!!??"

Vijam the Cubic Seed's name appeared, and the picture of that card was posted on the card picture 
of the prohibition order like a wanted order. This meant that there was an absolute ban in this duel. 
The declared card cannot be summoned, activated, used as material for any summoning method, or 
even appear on the field.

As mentioned before, "Vijam the Cubic Seed" was the starting point of the Cubic deck strategy and 
the core of the system. Vijam could not be used, which meant that all other Cubic monsters would 
be stuck in his hand, and he could not summon any of them.

Checkmate.

Aigami stood there dumbfounded, with a look of disbelief on his face.

No, how could someone play cards like this?

This is not a duel at all!

As a duel king, wouldn't your conscience hurt from a duel like this??

"Ahem, I'll set one more card and my turn is over." Yuei Vu coughed lightly.

Seeing that Aigami was still standing there motionless for a long time, he even reminded him 
"intimately": "Okay, it's your turn, draw the card.

But its okay if you want to think about it more, Im a very generous person and can wait.

Aigami was brought back to reality by the sound of being beaten. He gritted his teeth and raised his 
hand.

"My turn"

Chapter 688: Cubic Ban

Aigami was in a bad situation now.

Having grown up under the guidance of Shadi since childhood, with the power of Prana as his 
backing, and now with a Millennium Item in hand, Aigami was originally quite confident in his 
own strength.

He classified himself on the same level as Yugi and Kaiba. Against the so-called Duel King, even if 
he wasn't guaranteed to win, he should at least be able to get away with it, right?

Yes, that's right, he felt that he had a 60% chance of winning, and the Duel King had a 40% chance 
at most.

Duel King? Thats because I didnt participate in the competition at the time!



If I did, I could be the Duel King too!

But now he found that that didn't seem to be the case.

The Duel King was completely different from what he imagined.

Against Kaiba, and even against the jellyfish-headed kid last time, Aigami simply felt that the 
opponent was very strong, with meticulous tactics and strong aggression. The entire duel felt 
impeccable.

But at least the battle between the two sides was a collision of strength between duelists and 
monsters.

But Duel King Yuei Vu was different from any opponent he had ever encountered.

Aigami now felt that Yuei Vu's duel simply exceeded his imagination. There were no passionate 
clashes between monsters, no head-to-head confrontations between duelists' auras.

From beginning to end, Aigami felt like he was in an invisible shackles. He couldn't attack, couldn't 
deploy tactics, and couldn't implement any ideas or plans smoothly.

Now it looked like he may not even be able to play his cards.

Aigami felt that he suddenly understood why such a powerful evil thought in the Millennium Ring 
was so frightened when he saw Yuei Vu, why did this man have the title of "Duel King" and was 
worshiped by countless duelists like gods.

This person's power was not at the same level as that of ordinary duelists!

Of course, Yuei Vu didn't know what he was thinking, otherwise he might have laughed out loud.

What are you talking about? Your Cubic deck only has three combos in total. Its too easy to target 
them.

Aigami's eyes narrowed.

It's not over yet, I can't just give up, I can't fall down here!

He thought of his sister, his friends, the countless irreplaceable Prana companions he had grown up 
with, and the teacher Shadi who had passed away but had entrusted everything to them.

As long as his life points didn't return to zero and there were still cards left in the deck, he's not 
done yet!

A golden light bloomed on Aigami's forehead, and his eyes were filled with passion that seemed to 
belong to the protagonist. He roared "Ahhhhh", his momentum soaring to an unprecedented level.

"Draw!!!"

He drew a card, his eyes flashed, and then he threw it out.

"Spell Card Roll of Fate!" he shouted, "Roll a six-sided die. Draw cards equal to the result, then 
remove an equal number of cards from the top of my Deck.

Yuei Vu: ""

Hey, did you actually steal the God of Gamblers' card?



Well, strictly speaking, except for the rare cards he won from others, the entire deck of Jonouchi 
was full of cheap cards from the street, so this was not surprising.

But is it really okay for you, a Prana, to pin your hopes for a new world on dice?

Aigami's eyes widened and he held his breath. The air seemed to be still, and the world seemed to 
be frozen. Only the dice that determined fate were spinning at high speed in mid-air.

The dice fell.

The number was "5".

Maybe it's because his luck has exploded, or maybe it's because Aigami was originally a European. 
In short, he had the demeanor of the God of Gamblers back in the heyday.

"Based on this effect," Aigami said, "I draw five cards from the deck, and then the top five cards in 
the deck are banished."

First, the problem of resource shortage was solved, which was a good start for Aigami. But even so, 
the grim situation he faced has not changed.

As long as he can't get rid of Plasma and Prohibition, his invincible Cubic deck would still be a 
dozen pieces of waste paper.

"I activate the effect of the Continuous Spell Cubic Dharma' on the field. Once per turn, send 1 
Cubic' card from my hand to the GY and draw 1 card."

Aigami drew a card and then waved his hand: "Then I activate the effect of the Super Buster Gundil 
the Cubic Behemoth' that I just discarded to the graveyard.

I can banish this card from my Graveyard to add 1 Vijam the Cubic Seed' from my Graveyard to my 
hand. " (anime effect)

Aigami quickly drew the Vijam card in the graveyard from his weird Duel Disk made of cubes.

I return a Vijam to my hand!

"But as long as the Prohibition' is still on the field, Vijam cannot be summoned or activate its 
effects." Yuei Vu said.

"I know." Aigami snorted, "So let's deal with this troublesome thing first. I activate the Spell Card 
Double Cyclone' from my hand!

Target 1 Spell/Trap I control and 1 Spell/Trap the opponent controls, and destroy both cards at the 
same time! "

He pointed to the Continuous Spell that had always been by his side.

"I destroyed the Cubic Dharma' on my field and your Prohibition'!"

The red and golden tornadoes both rolled up, focusing on the "Cubic Dharma" and "Prohibition" 
respectively. The Spell Card was rolled up into the sky, and the wanted paper was torn into pieces 
by the whirlwind.

The ban was lifted, the restrictions disappeared, and Vijam the Cubic Seed gained the authority to 
return to the stage.



"In this way, Vijam' can be used again." Aigami shouted, "And, I will activate the effect of the 
Cubic Dharma' that was just sent to the graveyard!

Banish this card from my GY, then target 1 Cubic' monster in my GY; add it to my hand. "

Aigami showed another "Vijam the Cubic Seed".

"Use the Double Cyclone to destroy the Prohibition, and use the effect of the Cubic Dharma' to 
recover resources. Good job." Yuei Vu crossed his arms and nodded with an expression of "A good 
child can be taught"

Aigami couldn't help but have the word "angry" appear on his forehead again. But he ignored it and 
continued: "Equip Spell Premature Burial! Pay 800 LP, then target 1 monster in my Graveyard; 
Special Summon that target in Attack Position and equip it with this card!"

[Aigami, LP 4000 LP 3200]

"Awaken from the graveyard!" Aigami took out a card from the graveyard and took a photo of it, 
"Resurrection! Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast!!!"

Dark golden light burst out from the darkness, forming deep black steel armor. The monster had a 
single eye on its forehead, which was the common feature of all Cubic monsters, and its ten fingers 
were like metal tentacles.

[Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast, ATK 0]

"But there is no Cubic Seed' monster overlapped below the Cubic monster resurrected from the 
graveyard, so its attack power is 0." Yuei Vu said, "Other than that, as long as the Destiny HERO 
Plasma' is present, all the effects of your Cubic monsters are still ineffective."

"I know!" Aigami forcefully stuffed a card into the Duel Disk, "So I want to activate this card! Spell 
Card Herald of the Abyss!

Pay 1500 LP and declare 1 Monster Type and 1 Attribute; the opponent must send 1 face-up 
monster with the declared Type and Attribute from their field to the GY, if possible! "

Yuei Vu: "!"

Is there such an operation?

[Aigami, LP 3200 LP 1700]

"What I want to declare, of course, is the DARK attribute and Warrior type!" Aigami curled his lips 
and sneered, "And now there happens to be a DARK Warrior monster on your field, and there is 
only one.

So please send Destiny HERO Plasma to the graveyard! "

Chapter 689: We Are Dumbfounded

Herald of the Abyss was also one of the violent problem-solving tools discovered by card players.

This card was very powerful. The cool thing about it was that the user was only responsible for 
declaring the monster's Attribute and Type, and the action of "sending the monster to the graveyard" 
must be performed by the opponent himself.



In other words, this Spell Card's effect did not affect the monsters on the opponent's field. The text 
description of this card's effect clearly stated, "The opponent player must choose 1 face-up monster 
with the declared Type and Attribute and send it to the graveyard." It targeted the opponent player 
rather than the monsters on the field.

Whether it was a monster that could not be the target of the effect or unaffected by the effect at all, 
it could be eliminated by this Spell Card.

Even the Egyptian Gods were no exception.

What Aigami declared here was the DARK attribute and Warrior type, which was obviously aimed 
at the Plasma on Yuei Vu's side. Then there was no other choice. Yuei Vu could only silently take 
the Plasma's card from the Duel Disk and send it to the GY area.

The image of the bloody hero gradually blurred. His body seemed to be grabbed by invisible hands 
and dragged into a dark and deep cave, even the shadows were eaten away.

"Oh, that's pretty awesome." Yuei Vu couldn't help but say.

To be honest, he really didn't expect that Aigami actually got rid of both Plasma and Prohibition in 
one turn. No matter which one of these two cards was left on the field, it would be a devastating 
blow to the Cubic deck.

It could only be said that although Aigamis performance as the BOSS of the movie was a bit eye-
catching, he still had some strength. With extraordinary strength and a Millennium Item in hand, 
Aigami's Duelist Rank was definitely not low. It was not surprising that he could make a comeback 
under adversity.

It seemed that even Aigami himself felt that he was a bit awesome for even breaking through this 
blockade.

He panted for a moment, wiped his mouth, and hummed: "That kind of thing can't stop me at all! 
Keep your eyes wide open, from now on it's the scary thing about the Cubic monsters!"

"But even if Plasma disappears, without other Cubic Seed monsters overlapping below it, the attack 
power of Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast' will still be 0." Yuei Vu reminded.

"I know." Aigami snorted, "Activate the Continuous Spell Cubic Karma'! Stack all Vijam the Cubic 
Seed' from your hand underneath a "Cubic" monster on your field!"

He showed three Vijam the Cubic Seed' cards in his hand, two copies that were just recovered from 
the GY, and the third one was already in his hand.

"I stacked all three cards of Vijam the Cubic Seed' underneath the Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast' on 
the field!"

The three Vijams emerged one after another under the effect of the Spell Card, each deforming like 
a mechanical accessory, just like three gears were respectively embedded in the body of Dark 
Garnex.

"Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast's effect This card gains 1000 ATK for each monster stacked 
underneath it!"

[Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast, ATK 0 ATK 3000]



"This is the power of Cubic, my power! With this power, I'll make you disappear to the other side of 
the dimension!" Aigami shouted, "Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast, attack directly!"

The energy accumulated by the Cube Beast condensed into a golden cube above its head. The cube 
rotated at high speed, and blue fluorescence shot out from the arm of the Cube Beast, forming a 
long energy chain as if waving a dark meteor hammer and crashing down on Yuei Vu's head!

Yuei Vu, LP 1100

Checkmate!

Aigami felt as if his breathing had stopped, and every cell in his body was jumping for joy. He felt 
that he had never wanted to win as much as he did now.

This was also a matter of course.

This was undoubtedly a duel with many obstacles, and even winning this round was a difficult 
victory. Aigami managed to break through all the blockades and overcome the almost desperate 
obstacles set by the enemy and finally opened a gap at this moment.

From that narrow gap, he finally saw the dawn of victory.

Of course, it's not that easy.

"I banish Kiteroid' in the graveyard from the game." Yuei Vu picked up a card that popped up from 
the graveyard and showed it, "Only once, reduce the battle damage I take from a direct attack to 0."

The robot with the Q version image appeared in the form of a phantom, and its steel glider blocked 
the blow of the Cubic monster like a shield. The jet-black hammer exploded violently the moment it 
hit the glider, and black smoke was blown away along with the burning ashes.

Aigami's eyes moved slightly, but he quickly regained his composure. He curled up the corner of 
his mouth and sneered softly: "You actually blocked it? But even if you block it like this, it's 
meaningless.

You have been caught in the most terrifying series of attacks by the Cubic monsters, and no one can 
escape from it! "

As he spoke, the "Dark Garnex" on his field had begun to deform and disintegrate. Countless 
golden particles rose and fell like bubbles, detached from the huge steel body, gathered and 
reorganized, and gradually transformed back into three "Vijam the Cubic Seed".

Yuei Vu could also foresee what would happen next.

After "Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast" attacked, all three "Vijam the Cubic Seed" embedded in it 
would be Special Summoned on the field. Afterward, it would return to the deck itself, and Aigami 
could add "Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast" to his hand from the deck.

Then "Blade Garoodia" could be embedded by two "Vijam the Cubic Seed" on the field, and the 
effect of special summoning could also be used in the Battle Phase.

The Blade Garoodia summoned in this way had an attack power of 2000 and could attack twice in 
one turn. As long as one of the attacks passed, Yuei Vu's LP would return to zero.

Although that was almost impossible, if even these two attacks could be miraculously resolved by 
Yuei Vu, then Aigami would activate the effect of Blade Garoodia.



It would return to the deck, and all the "Vijam the Cubic Seed" embedded in it would return to the 
field. Then Aigami could add "Buster Gundil the Cubic Behemoth" from the deck to his hand, and 
special summon it in the same way.

The "Buster Gundil the Cubic Behemoth" summoned in this way has an attack power of 3000 and 
can attack three times in one round.

In other words, Aigami still has two attacks with 2000 ATK, and three attacks with 3000 ATK. A 
total of five attacks, with a total output of 13,000. As long as any one of them hit, Aigami won.

This was the characteristic of Cubic monsters. Separate, then overlap, and repeat this process to 
carry out continuous attacks. It only took an instant to tear the enemy to pieces.

At this moment, Aigami has reached the starting point of this invincible chain.

"Return Dark Garnex the Cubic Beast' to the deck, and add Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast' from 
the deck to my hand." Aigami sneered, "At the same time, all three Vijams embedded in Dark 
Garnex the Cubic Beast' are Special Summoned on the field!"

Three Vijams appeared one after another. Aigami took out the Garudadia that he had just acquired 
and raised his hand to take the shot.

He was full of confidence.

Even if Yuei Vu can catch one or two shots, can he still block five attacks in a row?

But Yuei Vu only smiled.

Aigami: "?"

"Rainbow Veil, Perditious Puppeteer, Prohibition, Plasma I didn't expect you to actually solve them 
all. Maybe I did underestimate you a little."

After a pause, Yuei Vu chuckled meaningfully.

"But what are you going to do about this?"

He slowly raised his hand.

"Open the set card: Trap Card Chain Disappearance!"

Aigami: "!?"

This card is

"This card can only be activated when a monster(s) with 1000 or less ATK is Summoned." Yuei Vu 
said, " Banish that monster(s), then the opponent banishes all cards with the same name as that card 
from their hand and Deck! "

"Monster with 1000 or less ATK"

Aigami looked at his field blankly.

[Vijam the Cubic Seed, ATK 0] x3

The three Vijams looked as dumbfounded as their masters in their current state.

Chain Disappearance released chains!



The three Vijams were captured by the power of the trap at the same time, and the dimension they 
were in was distorted and disappeared at the other side of the dimensional rift.

Aigami stared blankly at the "Blade Garoodia the Cubic Beast" that he had just retrieved in his 
hand, but he didn't make any move for a long time.

He couldn't summon this monster.

In fact, all three Vijams were sent to another dimension in one go, and now there are almost no 
monsters that could be summoned in his entire deck.

Aigami exploded on the spot.

WDNM, are you still playing cards unpleasantly?

Do you dare to not play nether cards?

He didn't move for a long time, and Yuei Vu didn't urge him. He just folded his arms and waited 
patiently.

There is no way, I was born as a person who is more kind-hearted, more tolerant, and more patient 
than others.

Yuei Vu felt that there was no duelist more caring than himself.

When the timer expired, Aigami still made no move. The system automatically handed over the 
operation rights to Yuei Vu.

"Then it's my turn." Yuei Vu drew a card, glanced at it, and played it directly.

"Spell Card Miracle Fusion. Fusion Summon 1 Elemental HERO' Fusion Monster from my Extra 
Deck, by banishing Fusion Materials from my field or GY.

I removed the Masked HERO Dian' and Masked HERO Dark Law' from the graveyard and fused 
them!

The fusion condition 2 Masked HERO' monsters! Fusion Summon!

From light to darkness, and then from darkness to light, creating the world with the power of 
awakening!

Contrast HERO Chaos! "

The hero's slender figure emerged from the two-color storm. He wore half-black and half-white 
armor. The completely opposite colors were perfectly symmetrical on the armor. He was as noble as 
a paladin and as ferocious as a demon.

[Contrast HERO Chaos, ATK 3000]

"Contrast HERO Chaos is also treated as an Elemental HERO' according to the rules, so it can be 
summoned through Miracle Fusion'"

Yuei Vu tried to explain that this was not a BISS but a formal summon, but he found that Aigami's 
face was completely lost at this moment, and he looked like he had lost his soul and was not paying 
attention at all.

So he simply stopped talking nonsense.



Be happy Aigami, I'm here to bring a smile to your face.

"Then let's fight. Contrast HERO Chaos, attack the player directly."

A two-color storm rolled up, carrying lightning and thunder, sweeping past Aigami.

[Aigami, LP 1700 LP 0]

Chapter 690 - We Have To Play Cards!

Aigami’s body was hit from the front by the chaos hero, and his body was knocked away from his 
back. He fell heavily to the ground and rolled continuously, his head was smashed to pieces, and 
every bone in his body was in pain.

He didn’t know how long he rolled before he stopped, and all his strength seemed to be exhausted 
in this difficult process. The pain was like countless sharp thorns provoking the nerves in his body, 
and fatigue came over him like a tide.

When he came to his senses, his clothes were soaked with sweat and his whole body was cold.

Yuei Vu put away the Duel Disk and walked forward slowly.

“How are you?”

Aigami let out a painful and vague groan, and seemed to have trouble even turning over.

“You said it’s okay? That’s great. But just to be cautious, let me check it for you.”

Yuei Vu leaned over and stretched out his hand towards him.

“You know, playing cards is a physically demanding and energy-consuming activity. 
You may get injured if you’re not careful. Come on, let me check you out…”

Aigami looked like he wanted to struggle, but he was too weak.

His injuries were not fully healed to begin with, but after going through the ordeal just now, he was 
even weaker.

However, he still clearly felt that the deck was being pulled out of the Duel Disk, and he only yelled 
something vaguely twice while struggling hard.

“Dueling is a very dangerous activity, and children should not imitate it easily. Let’s do 
this, I will keep your deck for you first.” Yuei Vu stood up and shook the Cubic deck he 
pulled out from his hand, ” You see, if you continue to be so arrogant, the next 
person you mess with may not be as caring as me.

Alas, the world has been deteriorating recently, and many duelists are becoming less and less good 
at playing cards. Young people like you are the most likely to suffer.

Anyway, didn’t you Prana say that you wanted to ascend to a new dimension where there would be 
no disputes and everyone’s consciousness would be highly aligned?

Since you’ve gone to that kind of world, you definitely don’t need a deck or something like that, 
right?”



Aigami’s ambiguity became more intense, and his words were incoherent and unclear. Yuei Vu 
guessed that he might be talking about “sneak attack”, “come prepared” and so on…

“It’s for your own good to take away your deck. At least think about your sister. If you 
die outside, what will happen to Sera? After all, she and I have an agreement… ”

Hearing this, Aigami, who was lying on the ground, reacted even more intensely.

His lovely sister actually went to find Yuei Vu secretly behind his back!

And he actually said there was an agreement!?

What agreement? Why didn’t I, the older brother, hear about it?

Sure enough, this man’s at his rock bottom. Aigami’s current situation was really a disaster. He was 
hit one after another, and he lay on the ground like a salted fish.

A Prana who lost his dream. JPG.

While he was having a “friendly” exchange with a card friend he had just met to enhance 
friendship, Yuei Vu suddenly heard a loud commotion behind him. The heavy sound of the 
propellers made his ears ring, and the hurricane made his windbreaker flutter.

Yuei Vu turned his head, and a beam of incandescent light stabbed down like a sword, stabbing him 
so hard that he could hardly open his eyes.

When he took a closer look, President Seto Kaiba appeared behind him at some point. The president 
had a straight face as always, his complexion was ashen, and his mouth was pursed into a straight 
line.

Then Yuei Vu saw several heavily armed agents jumping off the armed helicopter with the KC logo 
on it – saying “heavily armed” here was really not an exaggeration. Those agents were quite burly 
and muscular, and their bodies were wrapped from head to toe in the exoskeleton armor that Kaiba 
had just developed. The eyepieces on their helmets flashed, and their bodies also had high-tech 
indicator lights on.

A group of big men were skilled and quick in their movements. They swarmed forward and pushed 
Aigami to the ground with all their hands and feet. Some people grabbed hands, others grabbed feet, 
and someone put on a weird mask and slapped it on Aigami’s face. Aigami’s eyesight went dark, 
and he couldn’t see anything at all.

He struggled as hard as he could, but his mental power was cut off by the “Aigami-buster Armor” 
worn by these agents (that’s what Yuei Vu called it), and his extraordinary power was restricted by 
this weird-looking mask on his face. He couldn’t even exert his physical strength.

Aigami who has lost his metaphysical power was just an ordinary handsome boy. How could he be 
a match for such a group of big men? He was immediately pressed down and unable to move, and 
his body was limp as if he had gone through a multi-person exercise and was escorted in front of 
President Kaiba by the big men.

But President Kaiba still held his head high, looking at people with his nostrils, full of villain aura.

Kaiba took the “Quantum Cube” from Aigami’s hand, looked at it in his hand, and snorted softly, as 
if to express his disdain for this metaphysical creation.



Millennium Item?

The president went back and broke it into a scientific shape within minutes!

“You guys are late.” Yuei Vu shrugged, “I’ve already taken care of him.”

President Kaiba’s lineup is indeed eye-catching, but it’s just too ink-painted. Yuei Vu and Aigami 
had already finished their work before others arrived. It felt like the police in Hollywood 
blockbusters, who always waited for the individual heroes to raid the villain’s base before arriving 
belatedly.

Kaiba glanced at him, his eyes lingering on the deck of cards in Yuei Vu’s hand, and then he 
glanced at Aigami, who was half-dead like mud, and he immediately understood the situation.

Hmph, you overestimated your ability, you dare to challenge Yuei  Vu , this is your ↑ ↓

fate!

But he didn’t expect that Kaiba would suddenly take the Cubic deck from Yuei Vu’s hand without 
saying a word, slowly walk up to Aigami… and then stuff his Duel Disk back inside.

Aigami: “?”

Yuei Vu: “?”

Hey, President, where are you making such a fuss? Why are you touching my deck?

Okay, although it may have been Aigami’s deck a few minutes ago, haven’t you heard that it just 
changed its surname to Vu?

“You took the fragments of the Millennium Puzzle, right?” Kaiba said.

Aigami pursed his lips and said nothing.

“You are just an ignorant fool, Aigami. And challenging Yuei Vu is the stupidest move 
you have ever made.”

Kaiba said, pausing, and then his tone suddenly changed.

“But! The end between you and me is not over yet!”

Yuei Vu: “…”

Aigami: “…”

Yuei Vu probably understood. Because the last card game between the president and Aigami was 
unfinished, the president could not allow others to rob him of his game.

If Yuei Vu pulled out Aigami’s deck, Kaiba wouldn’t be able to catch Aigami and continue the duel 
he didn’t finish last time…

“The press conference for the new Duel Disk is about to begin. Aigami, I will defeat 
you through a duel at the press conference!” Kaiba shouted, “At that time, you must 
hand over the piece of Millennium Puzzle to me!”

Yuei Vu: “…”



President, he has been tied up by you now! You can knead him to any shape you want!

Why do we have to play cards…

Developing so much equipment, organizing such a big battle, and taking everyone home, we still 
have to play cards…

…Why don’t you take off your pants and fart!

President: I don’t care, anyway, you have to play this card today whether you want to or not!

At this time, Aigami’s heart was in despair.

After these successive blows, Aigami now almost had psychological trauma from playing cards.

He even wanted to say: Why don’t you just take it out of my deck? I really can’t play anymore…

“Take this person away!”

The president waved his hand and motioned to his subordinates to drag Aigami down.

Then he turned his head and glanced at Yuei Vu.

“And Yuei  Vu ! You have to be present at the press conference for me too!”↑ ↓

Yuei Vu: “…”


	I Play Yu-Gi 681

